
              
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

jkti=] fgekpy izns'k 

fgekpy izns'k jkT; 'kklu }kjk izdkf'kr 
'kfuokj] 23 flrEcj] 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945 

 
fgekpy izns'k ljdkj 

 
 

fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

fnukad 21 flrEcj] 2023 
 

 la[;k fo0l0&fo/kk;u&fo/ks;d@1&52@2023-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa dk;Z 
lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e&140  ds  vUrxZr  Hkkjrh;  LVkEi  ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 

 

131—jkti=@2023&23&09&2023   ¼7723½  



 7724        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
2023 ¼2023 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 17½ tks vkt fnukad 21 flrEcj] 2023 dks fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa 
iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZ&lk/kkj.k dks lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr fd;k tkrk gSA 
 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
 

lfpo] 
fg0 iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 

 
&&&&&&&&&  

 
2023 dk fo/ks;d la[;kd 17 

   
 

Hkkjrh; LVkEi ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2023 
 

 [k.Mksa dk Øe 
 

[k.M% 
 
 1- laf{kIr ukeA 
      2.   vuqlwph 1&d dk la'kks/kuA 
  
  

&&&&&&&& 
2023 dk fo/ks;d la[;kd 17 

 
Hkkjrh; LVkEi ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2023 

 
¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfIkr :i esa½ 

 

   fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw Hkkjrh; LVkEi vf/kfu;e] 1899 ¼1899 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 2½ 
dk vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA  
 

 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds pkSgÙkjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;er gks%& 
 

 1- laf{kIr uke-&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke Hkkjrh; LVkEi ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ 
vf/kfu;e] 2023 gSA  
 

 2- vuqlwph 1&d dk la'kks/ku-&&fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw Hkkjrh; LVkEi vfèkfu;e] 
1899 dh vuqlwph 1&d esa]&  
 

 ¼d½ vuqPNsn 3 esa] ß,d lkS #i,Þ “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ß,d gtkj #i,Þ “kCn j[ks tk,axs( 
 

 ¼[k½ vuqPNsn 4 esa] ßnl #i,Þ “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ßchl #i,Þ “kCn j[ks tk,axs( 
 

 ¼x½ vuqPNsn 5 esa] ßipkl #i,Þ “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ß,d lkS #i,Þ “kCn j[ks tk,axs( 
 

 ¼?k½ vuqPNsn 23 esa]& 
 

  ¼i½ ßlEifÙk ds cktkj ewY; ;k dz; ewY; dh jde dk efgykvksa ds fy, 4-00 izfr”kr rFkk 
vU; O;fDr;ksa ds fy, 6-00 izfr”krÞ “kCnksa] vadksa vkSj fpUg ds LFkku ij ßipkl yk[k 



 

 

7725jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
rd ds lEifŸk ds cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy jde] tks Hkh vfèkd gks] dk efgykvksa ds 
fy, 4-00 izfr”kr rFkk vU; O;fDr;ksa ds fy, 6-00 izfr”kr vkSj ipkl yk[k ls vf/kd 
cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy jde dh lEifŸk] tks Hkh vf/kd gks] ds fy, 8-00 izfr”krÞ “kCn] 
vad vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axs( 

 
  ¼ii½ nl #i, ds fudVre rd iw.kkZafdr “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ßAß fpUg ds LFkku ij ß%Þ fpUg 

j[kk tk,xk vkSj mlds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr ijUrqd vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
    ßijUrq] ;fn foØ; foys[k ds jftLVªhdj.k dh rkjh[k ls ,d o’kZ ds Hkhrj ogh 

Øsrk vkSj foØsrk] foØ; foys[k] ftldk cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy jde iwoZrj foys[k 
¼foys[kksa½ dh jde lfgr] ipkl yk[k #i, ls vf/kd gks] ds jftLVªhdj.k ds fy, 
vkosnu djrs gSa rks iwoZrj ekeyksa  lfgr leLr ekeyksa esa 8 izfr”kr LVkEi “kqYd 
izHkkfjr fd;k tk;sxkA 

 

 ¼³½ vuqPNsn 31 ds LFkku ij, fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
  ßlEifÙk dk fofue; ¼vknku&iznku½ foys[kA 
 
 ¼d½ jDr laca/kh O;fDr;ksa ¼,d gh iwoZt ls votfur½ vkSj ifr vkSj   iRuh ds e/;A 
 
  U;wure lkS #i, vkSj vf/kdre ,d gtkj #i, ds v/;/khu fofue; dh xbZ lEifŸk ds 

fuEurj ewY; dk 0-05 izfr”kr( 
 

 ¼[k½ ,sls O;fDr;ksa] tks jDr-laca/kh ugha gSa ds e/;A 
 

  U;wure lkS #i, vkSj vf/kdre ,d gtkj #i, ds v/;/khu, fofue; dh xbZ lEifŸk ds 
fuEurj ewY; dk 0-05 izfr”kr( vkSj vuqPNsn 23 ds vuqlkj lEifŸk ds mPprj ewY; esa ls 
lEifŸk ds fuEurj ewY; dks ?kVkdj izkIr ewY;AÞ( 

 
 ¼p½ vuqPNsn 33 esa]& 
 

  ¼i½ ßlEifŸk ds cktkj ewY; dk ^^efgykvksa ds fy, 4-00 izfr”kr rFkk vU; O;fDr;ksa ds fy, 
6-00  izfr”krÞ “kCn] vad vkSj fpUg ds LFkku ij ßipkl yk[k rd ds lEifŸk ds cktkj 
ewY; ;k izfrQy jde] tks Hkh mPprj gks] dk efgykvksa ds fy, 4-00 izfr”kr rFkk vU; 
O;fDr;ksa ds fy, 6-00  izfr”kr vkSj ipkl yk[k ls vf/kd cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy 
jde dh leLr lEifŸk ds fy, 8-00 izfr”krÞ “kCn] vad vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axs( vkSj 

 

  ¼ii½ vuqPNsn 33 ds vUr esa fuEufyf[kr ijUrqd j[ks tk;saxs] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ßijUrq ;fn nku foys[k ds jftLVªhdj.k dh rkjh[k ls ,d o’kZ ds Hkhrj ogh iznkrk vkSj 

vknkrk nku foys[k ftldk cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy jde iwoZrj foys[k ¼foys[kksa½ dh 
jde lfgr] ipkl yk[k #i, ls vfèkd gks] ogh iznkrk vkSj vknkrk, vkosnu djrs gSa 
rks iwoZrj ekeykas lfgr leLr ekeyksa esa 8-00 izfr”kr LVkEi “kqYd izHkkfjr fd;k 
tk;sxk% 

 
   ßijUrq ;g vkSj fd bl vuqPNsn ds iz;kstu ds fy,] jDr laca/kh O;fDr;ksa ¼,d gh iwoZt 

ls votfur½ vkSj ifr vkSj iRuh ds e/; U;wure ikap gtkj #i, vkSj vf/kdre nl 
gtkj #i, ds v/;/khu varfjr laifŸk ds cktkj ewY; dk 0-05 izfr”kr izHkkfjr fd;k 
tk,xkA **(  



 7726        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
 ¼N½ vuqPNsn 35 esa ß5-00 izfr”krÞ vadksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij] 6-00 izfr”kr vad vkSj fpUg j[ks 

tk,axs( 
 
 ¼t½ vuqPNsn 40 esa(&  
 
  ¼i½  [k.M ¼d½ esa ]&**lEifÙk ds cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy jde dk 4-00 izfr'kr efgykvksa 

ds fy, vkSj vU; O;fDr;ksa ds fy, 6-00 izfr'kr vadksas] fpUgksa vkSj 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij 
ipkl yk[k rd ds lEifÙk ds cktkj ewY; ;k izfrQy jde] tks Hkh mPprj gks] dk 
efgykvksa ds fy, 4-00 izfr'kr rFkk vU; O;fDr;ksa ds fy, 6-00 izfr'kr vkSj ipkl 
yk[k ls vf/kd cktkj ewY; lEifÙk ;k izfrQy jde dh lEifÙk] tks Hkh mPprj gks ds 
fy, 8-00 izfr'kr** 'kCn vad vkSj fpUg j[ksa tk,axs(  

 
  ¼[k½  ßnl #i, ds fudVre rd iw.kkZafdrÞ “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ fpUg ßAÞ ds LFkku ij ß%Þ fpUg 

j[kk tk,xk vkSj mlds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr ijUrqd vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ßijarq ;fn ,d o’kZ ds Hkhrj] ogh ca/kddrkZ vkSj caèkdnkj ca/kd foys[k ftldk cktkj 

ewY; ;k izfrHkwr jde iwoZrj foys[k ¼foys[kksa½ dh jde lfgr ipkl yk[k ls vf/kd gS] 
ds jftLVªhdj.k ds fy, vkosnu djrs gSa] rks  iwoZrj ekeyksa lfgr] leLr ekeyksa esa     
8-00 izfr”kr LVkai “kqYd izHkkfjr fd;k tk,xk( vkSj  

 
  ¼ii½ [kaM ¼[k½ esa] ßU;wure ,d lkS #i, vkSj vf/kdre ,d gtkj #i, ds v/;/khu rFkk 

“kqYd nl #i, ds fudVre rd iw.kkZafdrÞ “kCnksa dk yksi fd;k tk,xk( 
 
 ¼>½ vuqPNsn 48 ds [k.M ¼d½] ¼[k½ vkSj ¼x½ esa ß,d lkS #i,Þ] ß,d lkS ipkl #i,Þ vkSj Þnks 

LkkS #i,Þ “kCnksa ds LFkku ij Øe”k% ß,d gtkj #i,Þ] ß,d gtkj ikap lkS #i,Þ vkSj Þnks 
gtkj #i,Þ “kCn j[ks tk,axs( vkSj 

 
 ¼´½ vuqPNsn 58 ds [k.M d esa ßU;wure ,d lkS #i, vkSj vf/kdre ,d gtkj #i, ds 

v/;/khu** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ßU;wure nks gtkj #i, vkSj vf/kdre ikap gtkj #i, ds 
v/;/khu** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

 
&&&&&& 

 
mn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku 

 
 fgekpy izns”k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw Hkkjrh; LVkEi vf/kfu;e ds v/khu fofHkUu fy[krksa dh ckcr 
LVkEi “kqYd dh njsa fiNys nl o"kksZa ls la”kksf/kr ugha dh xbZ gSaA iwoksZDr vf/kfu;e ls layXu        
ifjf”k"V 1&d esa fofHkUu vuqPNsnksa dh “kqYd&njksa dks la”kksf/kr djuk le; dh vko”;drk gSA 
 

 bl izdkj fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ykxw iwoksZDr vf/kfu;e ls layXu vuqlwph&1 d dks la'kksfèkr 
djds nŸkd xzg.k] gLrkarj.k i=] lEifÙk dk fofue;] nku] iV~Vk] ca/kd] eq[krkjukek vkSj cankscLr dh 
ckcr LVkEi 'kqYd dh fo|eku njksa esa vko';d ifjorZu djus dk izLrko fd;k x;k gSA blfy, iwoksZDr 
vf/kfu;e esa la'kks/ku djuk vko';d gks x;k gSA 
 
  ;g fo/ks;d mi;qZDr mn~ns';ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gSA 

 
¼txr flag usxh½ 

izHkkjh ea=hA 



 

 

7727jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
f”keyk% 
 
rkjh[k% -----------------------------------] 2023 

 
foŸkh; Kkiu 

 

&”kwU;& 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
 
 

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu 
 

&”kwU;& 
 

&&&&&&&&&&& 
 
 
 

 Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu jkT;iky dh flQkfj'ksa ¼ufLr la[;k%& ½                         

 

  fgekpy izns”k ds jkT;iky] Hkkjrh; LVkEi ¼fgekpy izns”k la”kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2023 dh fo’k; oLrq 
ds ckjs esa lwfpr fd, tkus ds i”pkr~] Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu foèks;d dks fo/kku 
lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir djus vkSj ml ij fopkj djus dh flQkfj”k djrs gSaA 
 
 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
 
 
 

Hkkjrh; LVkEi ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2023 
 
 fgekpy izns”k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw Hkkjrh; LVkEi vf/kfu;e] 1899 ¼1899 dk vf/kfu;e      
la[;kad 2½ dk vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA  

 

 

         ¼txr flag usxh½ 

          izHkkjh ea=hA 

&&&&&&&&&& 

 

 

¼'kjn dqekj yxoky½ 

         lfpo ¼fof/k½A 
 
f”keyk% 

 

rkjh[k% ---------------------------------------------] 2023 



 7728        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT 

 
        BILL NO. 17 OF 2023 

 
 

THE INDIAN STAMP (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023 
 

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES 
 
 
Clauses : 
 
 1. Short title. 
 2. Amendment of Schedule 1-A. 
 
 

_________ 
 
 

   
BILL NO. 17 OF 2023 

 
THE INDIAN STAMP (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023 

 

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY) 
 

 A 
 

BILL 
 

 further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (Act No. 2 of 1899), in its application to the 
State of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-fourth Year 
of the Republic of India as follows:— 
 

 1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Himachal Pradesh 
Amendment) Act, 2023. 
                              
 2. Amendment of Schedule 1-A.—In the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, as applicable in the 
State of Himachal Pradesh, in Schedule 1-A,— 
 

 (a) in article 3, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words “One thousand rupees” 
shall be substituted; 

 

 (b) in article 4, for the words “Ten rupees”, the words “Twenty rupees” shall be 
substituted; 

 

 (c) in article 5, for the words “Fifty rupees”, the words “One hundred rupees” shall be 
substituted;    

   

 (d) in article 23,—  
 
  (i) for figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other persons, of 

the market value of the property or of the amount of purchase money, whichever 



 

 

7729jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
is higher”, the figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other 
persons, upto Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of the property or of the 
consideration amount whichever is higher; and 8% for all above Rupees fifty lakh 
of the market value of the property or of the consideration amount whichever is 
higher” shall be substituted; 

 

  (ii) after the words “rupees Ten” for the sign “,”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and 
thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:— 

  

     “Provided that if within one year from the date of registration of the sale 
deed, the same purchaser and seller apply for the registration of sale deed, having 
market value or consideration amount more than Rupees fifty lakh including the 
amount of the earlier deed(s), 8% stamp duty in all cases including earlier cases, 
shall be charged.”; 

 

 (e) for article 31, the following shall be substituted, namely:—  
           
              

   “Exchange of Property, Instrument of. 
 

(a) between persons of blood 
relation (common ancestors) 
and between wife and husband; 
 
     
   

0.05% of the lower value of the 
exchanged property, subject to the 
minimum of Rupees one hundred and 
maximum Rupees one thousand; 

(b)   between persons not related by 
blood relations. 

0.05% of the lower value of the 
exchanged property, subject to the 
minimum of Rupees one  hundred 
and maximum Rupees one thousand; 
and as per article 23 on the value 
arrived at after deducting the lower 
value of property from the higher 
value of the property.”. 

 
 (f) in article 33,— 
 
  (i) for the figures, signs and words “4.00%   for women and 6.00% for other persons, 

of the market value of the property”, the figures, signs and words “4.00% for 
women and 6.00% for other persons, upto Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of 
the property or of the consideration amount whichever is higher and 8% for all  
above Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of the property or of the amount of 
consideration amount whichever is higher” shall be substituted; and 

 
  (ii)  at the end of article 33, the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
    “Provided that if within one year, the same donor and donee apply for the 

registration of gift deed, having market value or consideration amount more than 
Rupees fifty lakh including the amount of earlier deed(s), 8% stamp duty in all 
cases including earlier cases shall be charged:  

 

      Provided further that for the purpose of this article, 0.05% of the market value of 
the transferred property in between persons of blood relation (common ancestors) 
and between husband and wife, subject to minimum Rupees five thousand and 
maximum Rupees ten thousand shall be charged.”;  



 7730        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
 (g) in article 35, for the figures and sign “5.00%”, the figures and sign “6.00%” shall be 

substituted; 
 
 (h) in article 40,— 
 
  (i)  in clause (a),— 
 
   (a) after the figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other 

persons, of the market value of the property”, the figures, signs and words 
“4.00% for women and 6.00% for other persons, upto Rupees fifty lakh of 
the market value of the property or of the consideration amount whichever is 
higher and 8% for all  above Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of the 
property ” shall be substituted; 

 
   (b) after the words rupees Ten for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted 

and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
     “Provided that if within one year, the same Mortgagor and Mortgagee 

apply for the registration of mortgage deed, having market value or secured 
amount more than Rupees fifty lakh including the amount of earlier deed(s), 
8% stamp duty in all cases including earlier cases shall be charged; and 

 
  (ii) in clause (b), the words “subject to the minimum of rupees one hundred and 

maximum rupees one thousand and duty rounded off to the nearest rupees Ten” 
shall be deleted;  

 
 (i)   in the article 48, in clauses (a), (b) and (c), for the words “One hundred rupees”, “One 

hundred and fifty rupees” and “Two hundred rupees” the words “One thousand 
rupees”, “One thousand and five hundred rupees” and “Two thousand rupees” shall be 
substituted respectively; and 

 
 (j)    in article 58, in clause A, for the words “subject to the minimum of rupees one hundred 

and maximum rupees one thousand”, the words “subject to minimum of rupees two 
thousand and maximum rupees five thousand” shall be  substituted.  

 
 

_________ 
 
 
 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 
 
 The rates of Stamp Duty in respect of various instruments under the Indian Stamp Act as 
applicable in the State of Himachal Pradesh have not been revised for the last 10 years. It is the 
need of the hour to revise the rates of duties of different articles in the Schedule 1-A appended to 
the Act ibid.  
  
 As such, it has been proposed to make necessary changes in the existing rates of stamp duty 
in respect of adoption, conveyance, exchange of property, gift, lease, mortgage,  power of attorney 
and settlement by amending Schedule-1A appended to the Act ibid, in its application to the State of 
Himachal Pradesh. This has necessitated amendments in the Act ibid. 



 

 

7731jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives. 
 
 
 

                            (JAGAT SINGH NEGI) 
             Minister-in-Charge. 

SHIMLA : 
 
The................................, 2023   
 

__________ 
 
 
 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 
 
 

—Nil— 
 
 

_________ 
 
 

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION  
 
 

—Nil— 
 

 
_________ 

 
 

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE                                            
207 OF THE CONSTITUTION OF INDIA  

 
(File No. Rev. Stamp(F)1-1/2005-V) 

 
 The Governor of Himachal Pradesh having been informed of the subject matter of the 
Indian Stamp (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Bill, 2023, recommends, under article 207 of the 
Constitution of India, the introduction and  consideration of  the  Bill  in  the  Legislative 
Assembly.  
 
 

_________ 
 
 

THE INDIAN STAMP (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT) 
BILL, 2023 

 
A 
 

BILL  



 7732        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 23 flrEcj 2023@01 vkf'ou] 1945         
 further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (Act No.2 of 1899), in its application to the 
State of Himachal Pradesh.  
 
 

(JAGAT SINGH NEGI) 
Minister-in-Charge. 

____________ 
 
 
(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)                                     
Secretary (Law). 
 
 
SHIMLA : 
          

THE .................................., 2023 

____________ 
 
 
 

fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

fnukad 21 flrEcj] 2023 
 

 la[;k fo0l0&fo/kk;u&fo/ks;d@1&50@2023-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa dk;Z 
lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e&140 ds vUrxZr fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk lsok ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 
2023 ¼2023 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 15½ tks vkt fnukad 21 flrEcj] 2023 dks fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa 
iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZ&lk/kkj.k dks lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr fd;k tkrk gSA 
 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
 

lfpo] 
fg0 iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 

 
&&&&&&&&&  

 
2023 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 15 

 
fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk lsok ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2023 

 
[k.Mksa dk Øe 

 
[k.M % 
 1- laf{kIr uke vkSj izkjEHkA 
 2- /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/kuA 
 3- /kkjk 4 dk la'kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 5 dk la'kks/kuA 




