
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment) Act, 2015

Act 25 of 2015

Keyword(s):
Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants, Inams, Cash Grants, Hyderabad

Amendment appended: 7 of 2025



MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XXV OF 2015.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor
in the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 17th August 2015).

An Act further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and
Cash Grants Act, 1954.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of
Inams and Cash Grants Act, 1954, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it
is hereby enacted in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash
Grants (Amendment) Act, 2015.

Hyd.
Act No.
VIII of

1955.

Short title.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 1, +ÆEò 49] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, +ÉìùMÉº]õ 17, 2015/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 26, ¶ÉEäò 1937 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 3 ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 91

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉvÉÒ ´É xªÉÉªÉ

Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment)
Act, 2015 (Mah. Act No. XXV of 2015), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation)

to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--91--1
(1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`öú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 17, 2015/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 26, ¶ÉEäò 1937

2. In section 6 of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
Act, 1954, for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(3) (a) On or after the commencement of the Hyderabad Abolition
of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment) Act, 2015 (hereinafter, in this
sub-section, referred to as “the commencement date”), the occupancy of
Madad Mash Inam lands held on the new and impartible tenure
(Occupants-Class II) may be transferred by the occupant for agricultural
purpose, and no previous sanction or no objection certificate from the
Collector or any other competent authority shall be necessary for such
transfer. After such transfer, occupancy of such land shall be continued
to be held by such transferee occupant on new and impartible tenure
(Occupants-Class II), in accordance with the provisions of the
Maharashtra Land Revenue Code, 1966 :

Provided that, any such occupancy held on new and impartible tenure
(Occupants-Class II) may, on or after the commencement date, be
converted into Occupants-Class I by the occupant, by making payment
of fifty per cent. of the amount of the current market value of such land
to the Government as Nazarana, and after such conversion, such land
shall be held by the occupant as Occupants-Class I, in accordance with
the provisions of the Maharashtra Land Revenue Code, 1966:

Provided further that, on or after the commencement date, if any
occupancy, held on new and impartible tenure (Occupants-Class II) has,
without the prior sanction of the Collector or any other competent
authority and without payment of the amount equal to fifty per cent. of
the current market value of such land, been transferred by the occupant
for non-agricultural use, such transfer may be regularised on payment
of an amount equal to fifty per cent. of the current market value of such
land as Nazarana, and an amount equal to fifty per cent. of such sum as
a penalty, and on such payment, the occupant shall hold the land as
Occupants-Class I, in accordance with the provisions of the Maharashtra
Land Revenue Code, 1966.

(b) Before the commencement date, if any occupancy of Madad Mash
Inam lands, held on new and impartible tenure (Occupants-Class II) has
already, without previous sanction or no objection certificate from the
Collector or any other competent authority, been transferred by the
occupant, for agricultural purpose, such transfer may be regularised
without payment of any sum as Nazarana, on the production of registered
instruments such as sale deed, gift deed, etc., as a proof thereof, for such
transfer. After such regularisation, the occupancy of such land shall be
deemed to be held by such transferee occupant as an Occupants-Class
II, in accordance with the provisions of the Maharashtra Land Revenue
Code, 1966 :

Provided that, before the commencement date, if any such occupancy
of Madad Mash Inam lands, held on new and impartible tenure
(Occupants-Class II), has already, without prior sanction of the Collector
or any other competent authority, been transferred by the occupant for
non-agricultural use, such transfer may be regularised on payment of an

Hyd.
Act No.
VIII of
1955.

Amendment of
section 6 of Hyd.

Act No. VIII
of 1955.

Mah.
XLI of
1966.

Mah.
XLI of
1966.

Mah. XXV
of 2015.

Mah.
XLI of
1966.

Mah.
XLI of
1966.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`öú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 17, 2015/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 26, ¶ÉEäò 1937 3

amount equal to fifty per cent. of the market value of such land on the
date of the order of regularisation as Nazarana, and an amount equal to
ten per cent. of such sum as a penalty, and on such payment, the land
shall be deemed to be held by such transferee occupant as Occupants-
Class I, in accordance with the provisions of the Maharashtra Land
Revenue Code, 1966, with effect from the date of such order.

(c) The provisions of clauses (a) and (b) shall not be applicable to,—

(i) the property permanently dedicated as waqf which is
administered under the provisions of the Waqf Act, 1995 ;

(ii) the Khidmat Mash (Service Inam) lands ;

(iii) the Madad Mash Inam lands, part of which is given for
Khidmat (service) of devasthan subject to the terms and conditions
of muntakhab (sanad) ;

(iv) the original Government lands granted by the then
Government :

Provided that, the Collector shall verify that the muntakhab (sanad) of
the Madad Mash Inam land does not fall in sub-clauses (i) to (iv).”.

Mah.
XLI of

1966.

43 of
1995.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 1, 2025/{ÉÉè¹É 11, ¶ÉEäò 1946 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VII OF  2025.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 1st January 2025).

An Act further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and
Cash Grants Act, 1954.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
Act, 1954 for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated
the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment) Ordinance,
2024 on the 24th September 2024 ;

Hyd. Act
No. VIII
of 1955.

Mah.
Ord.

VIII of
2024.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö-7--1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 11, +ÆEòú 1(7)] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 1, 2025/{ÉÉè¹É 11, ¶ÉEäò 1946 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ 2,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 7

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment)
Act, 2024 (Mah. Act VII of 2025), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH  WAGHOLE,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 1, 2025/{ÉÉè¹É 11, ¶ÉEäò 1946

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance, by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-fifth Year of
the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and
Cash Grants (Amendment) Act, 2024.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 24th September
2024.

2. In section 2A  of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
Act, 1955 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), to
sub-section (3), the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“ Provided that, where in exceptional cases, upon complaints
regarding legality of decision of officer under sub-section (1), the State
Government is satisfied that it is necessary to examine the legality,
propriety or regularity of such orders even after expiry of the period of
one year, the State Government or the Divisional Commissioner
authorised by it, may exercise such powers after expiry of the said
period.”.

3. In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

(1) in clause (a),—

(a) in the first proviso, for the words “fifty per cent.”,  the words
“five per cent.” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “fifty per cent. of the
current market value of such land”,  at both the places where they
occur, the words “five per cent. of the current market value of such
land” shall be substituted ;

(2) in clause (b), in the proviso, for the words “fifty per cent.”, the
words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.

4. (1) The Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2024, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 2A

of Hyd. Act
No. VIII of

1955.

Hyd. Act
No. VIII
of 1955.

Amendment
of section 6 of
Hyd. Act No.
VIII of 1955.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.

VIII of 2024
and saving.

Mah.
Ord. VIII
of 2024.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


