The Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 1989

Act 10 of 1989

Keyword(s):
Beer, To Bottle, Denaturant, Excisable Article, Excise Duty, Export, Import, Intoxicant, Liquor,
Manufacture, Pachwai, Place, Sale, Transport

Amendment appended: 4 of 1994, 20 of 1994, 28 of 1998, 11 of 2000 ,10 of 2005, 11 of 2005, 12
of 2005, 39 of 2006, 1 of 2010, 8 of 2010, 8 of 2017, 9 of 2017, 2 of 2020, 4 of 2020, 17 of 2020
4 0f 2023

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research
(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These
contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the
accuracy, completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be
available. Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please
contact the relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette
notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting
on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any
liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way
responsible for any loss, damage, or distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the
basis of this document.




- THE ANDERP pREDESH #4CISE BCT:
o ¥o. 10 OF 1989
[20th aprils 1989.‘3
an Bet gurther Lo ad: the Andhrad
pradesh E cise BCte 1968, )
pe it na py the 1e9 slaﬁ}ve
hssembly of gyate ¢ Andhrad pradesh’
in the rortiet Year £ the Kepublic of
jndia @ £o01l0WE:"

- = jecerved the & r 'Ehé'wt'h pprils
198%« For ement jects onss g sat the
andhrs pra gazeties art-1¥ 13 traord‘\nary. dsted the
‘ \_gth parchs 989 ges 16 12

1611



Short title
and com-
@encepent.

Amcndognt
of sectfon
2, Act 17
of 1968,

Substizu-
tion of new
section for
seetion 5.

62

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra
Pradesh Exclse (Amendment} Act, 1989.

(2) (a) section 6 shall be deemed: ' to
have come Intc force on the 1st December_,
198); ’ : ’

{b) ‘_sections 17 and " 18 shall be
deemed to have ¢ome Inte force on the 1st
January, 1987; and

{¢) the remaining provisions shall
be deemed to have come inte force on the 16th
September, 1988,

2, 'In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1988
{hereinafter referred to .as the principal Act);
in section 2, to clause (31), the  words "and
Includes, to move from a place outside the
State to any other place outside it through
the intervening area lying within the State®
shall be added at the end.

3. For section 5 of the principal Act, the
follo_wlng section shall be supstituted, namely:=

*sppointment 5. (1) The Government may appoint

of ecrtatn an Additional Commissloner of
officers and Exclse, Director of Distlilleries and
stalf. Brewerles, as many Deputy Com-

mlssioners of Excise, . Assistant
Commissloners of Exclse and such other officers
as they think fit for the purpcse of perform-.
ing the ifunttions respectively coriferred on
them by or under this Act. ’
(2) The Government may sanction thel
appointment of as many Exclse Superintendents,
Assistant, Exei=< Superintendents and other



63

Subordinate Staff ‘as they think (fit for the

purpose of performing the functlons respec-

tively conferred on them by or under this Act.

{3) The appointment to the posts san<
ctioned in sub-section (2), shall be made by
such authorlty as may be prescribed.’

(4} All such officers shell perform the
sald functions within such area or areas or
-in. the whole of the State as the- Government
or the Commissioner may assign to them.’.

_-4. Sections & and 7 of the principal Act
shall be omitted.

S, In sectlon 1t of the principal Act, for
sub-sectlon (1}, the follewing sub-section
shall -be substituted, namely:-

u(1) The Governmerit may, by notifica=
tlon, prohibit or regulate the transport of an
intoxicant or any kind of Intexicants from
any area Inte any other area within the
State or froem any place oubtside the State to
any other place outside it through the inter-

vening area lylng within the State, ‘except

‘under ~a permit lssued under section 12,'.

- . 6. In section 12 of the princlpal Act, for
sub-sectlon (1), the following sub-section,
shall be substituted, namely:-

(1) Any officer not below the rank of
an Assistant Exclse Superintendent authorised
by the Commlssioner may lssue a permit for
theé transport of intoxicants.”. :

7. In section 24 of the principal Act, sub-
sectlon (3) shall be omitted.

gaission of
sections 6
and 7.
Anandaent

of section
11.

Amendmént
of section
12.-

paandment
of section
2&.



- 64

% Amendnent ‘8. In sectlon 26 of the principal "Act, the

of section  wnrda “"which shall not exceed the duty paya-=
6. ble therefor, under this Act” shall be omitted,
‘Amepdeent " 9. In sectlon 27 e: the princlpal Act,

of section :

. (a) the words "belgnging to the Govern-

ment" shall be omitted;

(b) in the marginal ‘heading, the word
"Government” shall he omitted.

Amenduwant 10.- In sectlon 31 of the principal Act, in
"af section  sub-sectlon (1),-- .
n.

(a) in ]:hé cpening poertion,  after the
words "muy"qancel or suspend it", the words
"irrespective of the period teo which the licence
or permit relates” shall be inserted;

(b]'ln- clause (dj.-‘

- {1} for tha expression “the Dangerous'r
Drugs Act, 19307, the expression "the Narcotics
Drugs and Psychatropic Sabstances Act, 1985"
and for the expression "Customs Act, 1952' or”
the -expression "Customs Act, 1962 irraspective
&L the fact whether such- conviction relates to
the perlod earliér or subsequent to the. grant
of licence or permit; or”-shall be substituted;

(14} in ‘the margin : fo:r the expression
“Central Act 2 oI 1930", the expraasion "Centra].
Act 61 i‘.\f 1935“ 'shﬂll be subst-ltute;l

Asendmant 11, In section 3% of the princi’pal Act, In
of saction clause (1), for the-words Tless than two years '
M. but which ahall not axceed five yvears and with -

" fime - which may ext-nd to tive thousand Tupees™,



65

the words "less than six months and with
fine which shall not be less than five times
the value of the duty payable but shall not
exceed ten' times of such value in case where
the value of duly Is assessed, and in other
.cases, with fine which shall not be less than
five theousand rupeas" shall be& substituted.

12. In section 37 of the principal Act, in
clayse (d), for- the words "shall,- on convie-
tion, be purished with Imprisonment for a
term which may extend to three months and

Amendeent
of section
37..

with fine which may extend to. five hundred -

rupeas”, the following shall ke substituted,
namely:- ’

"shall, on conviction, _be punishéd with
imprisenment,--

(1} in the case of first- offence, for a
term whlch shall not be less than six months
and with fine which shall not be less than
five times the amount of duty payable but
shall not exceed ten times of such duty; and

(ii) in the case "of continuing offence
for a term which shall not- be less than two
years, and with fine which shall not be less
than ten times tha amount of the duty
payable.”.

13. In sectlon 40 of the prinecipal Act,=

- {a) for the words "be punished for
.each such offence with . imprisonment for a
term which may extend to six- months and
‘withe fine which may extend to one thousand
rupaes.”, the following shall be substituted,
.namely:- . : o

hmendmént
of saction
a0.



a3

fasndment
of section
4.

Aoondmant

of section
43.

lnsertian
of now soc-

‘t1an 43A.

66
"be punished with imprisonment,--

({) in the cmse. of first offence, for a
texrm which shall not be less than three

‘months and with fine which shall net be léss

‘than one thousand rupees; and.

{11) i the case of second end sub-
sequent offences for a term which shgll not
be less than six months and with fine which
shall‘ not be less than two thousand rupees.”™;

‘{bJ in the marginal heading, the word
"Government” shall be omitted.

14, 1In sectien 41 of the principal Act, for
the words "two hundred rupee:", the words
"five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

15. In ‘section. 43 of ‘the princlpal Act,
the privise shall be omltted.

16. After secHon 43 of the principal Act,
the followlng so&ction =hall be Iinserted,
namely:-

*punishmert:  43A. Whoever being a lcensee
for allawing under thls Act and having the
prevlses etc., control of use of any house, room,
to be vsed - enclosure, space, animal, convey-
for comaission ance knowingly permits 1t ta ba
of z2n offence, used for the commisslon hy any
othier Derson of an offence punlahic-
bie vuynder any provision of ¢hls
Act, shal' he punisheble in (he
- » manner a5 i he P2 himselfl commitied

» 2214 offenca.".



67

endment
section

17. In sectlon 47 of the principal Act,-- Ar
of
{1} in sub-section (i),—- 47,

{a) for the werds “The Cnmmisﬂbner,
the Collector or any Exclse Officer", the words

"The Collector or any Excise Officer" 5hall be

substituted;’

{b) for the expression "clause (b},
clause {c¢], Clause (d)., clause {g), or claise

{h) of section 34, section 35", tha exprossion -

"clause (c), clause (d}, clause (g) or clause
{h) af section 34" shall be substituted;

{c) for the ‘w;ords ‘"five thousand
rupees”, the wozrds "ten thousand ropees®
shall be substituted;

-{11) in sub-section (2}, after the words
"as the case _ma.y'be", the expression "in
accprdance with the provislons of sub-section
{1) or section 47A" and after the words
*shall be instituted™, the words'or continued"
shall be Inserted:

18, After section 47 of the principal aet,
the following section shall be inserted,
namely:-

*Speelal A7h. (1) Arny person whe  is

powers of the Xeasonably -suspected of having

Coomissirner Committed zn offunce falling uncde.

in regard 1o Cintse (a) of section 34 or sectionh

compeounc’s FLomay awply Lo e Comm:.s loner

of pffgre: - oo eempounaing L ofrencc belore
‘3 convizi- -

Inszrtlen
of new secc-
tign 47A.



&2

Anendmant
of sectign

53,

hoendrent
pf section
56,

68

{2) Dn receipt of such application, the
Commissioner having regard tothe circumstan-
ces of the case, may in his discretion order
for compounding the offence on payment of a
sum of money by way of compdunding fee eor
compensation for the offence dn such terms
and conditions as he deems flt:

Provided that the sum of money fixed as
compounding fee or compensation by the Com-
mlssioner under this sectlon shall not he less
than five times but not more than ten times
the duty involved and where no duty 1is
involved nat less than rupees flfteen thousand
but not mare than rupees one lakh:

Provided further that in all <cases in
which any property has been seized as liable
to confiscation under this Act, may be ordered
by him to be released on payment' of the
vajue thereof as estimated by him eor by an
officer authorised by him ln thls behalf:

Privided also that -where the-property 50
seized 1s a liquor manufactured in contraven-
tion of this Act, such 1llguor shall not be

‘released hut shall be disposed of in such
‘manner as may be prescribed.”

19. In section 53 -of the principal Act, in
sub-sectlon (1), in clause (a) for the expres-
sion  "section 34", the expression "sectlon 27
or section- 34 or" shall be substituted.

20. In section 56 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), for the axpression "section
34", the expressiomn "section 27, section 34"
shall be substituted.



69

2. In the Schedule to the principal Act,=- amendaent
' . of the
. (i) against item I, In the entry under Schedule.
column * (4}, for the words "Rupees elght', the
"words "Rupees twenty" shall be/ substltuted;

(1) against item 2, in the entry -undex
column (4), for the words "Rupees three", the
words “Rupees [ive" shall be sub%tltutad;

(ii1) against ltem 3, d.n the entry under
column (4), for the words "Rupeas forty", the
words “"Rupees eighty" shall be substituted;

{(1v) against item 4, in the entry under
colump (4), for the wourds "Rupees forty", the
words "Rupees elghty" shall he sukstituted; .

{v) for item 5 and the antries ruiatlllag
thereto, the following shall be substituted,-’

uy (@ (3) : 4y

"5, Toddy On each variety
of the. following
_exclse trees:-

Date or Sendhi .. Rupeas twenty
' per tree.
Palmyrah +. Rupees thirty
. per tree,
Coconut .» Rupees fifty

per tree,
Sagoe «« Rupeas sixty

per traoe,
Datepalm +» Rupees Fifty

per tree,”

J. 1998/6



Validation,

70

22, Where, .before the 16th September, 1988
any permit has been lssued for the transpor-
tation of intoxicants and any speclal powers

. were exercised,” In regard to compounding of

Repeal of
ordinance -

. 12 of 1968.

offences, by the Commissionér, the permit so
issued . and: the special power: so aexercised,
shall be deemed to have been validly isaued
or exercised In accordance 'with the provisions
of the prlpcipal Act as amended by this Act,
as if the amendments made te the principsl
Act,. by sections ‘6,17 and 18 of this Act head
been In force at’ all materlal timas and accor-
dingly, all' acts, proceedings or thlngs done
or taken by the Government or by any officer
of the Government or. by any other aunthority
in connection s, ith the 1ssue of such permit
or compounding of offences shall for all put-
poses, be deemed to be and to halle always
been dane or taken in accordance with law,

. 23, The Andhra Pradesh Exclse (Amendment)
Ordinance, 1988 1s hereby rapealed.



THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENWT) ACT,
1994,

ACT No. 4 OF 1994,
[15th January, 1994.]

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH
EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it epnacted by the Legmlntiw.rp
Assembly of the State of Andhra Pradesh in
the Forty-fourth Year of the Rf-"publ:c of
India as followsi~-

1. (1) This "Act may be callad thesShart
Andhra Pradesh Exclse (Amendment) Art, titie ane
19%4. “'Commen ce-

‘menk,
.{2) It shall be deemed to have come
into force on the 26th Novemnber, 1993,

~fegaived the asseat of the Governogr on the 15th
January, 1454+ For Statement of pbjects and Reasons,
Please sge the Andhra Pradesh Gazette, Port IV-A, Extra-
prdinary, dated the Z3rd December, 1993 at Pane 3~ 1'1.

43



44

srmendment of 2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act,

seetion 2, ‘1868 (hereinafter referred to as the
Act 17 of _principnl Acc) in section 2, -
1963. (i} for clause 3, the following shall

bz substituted, namely:-

“(3) "bottle" means to transfer licuer
from one cask to another cask or from a
cask or vessel to a bottle, jar, flask,
pot, closed packet, basket, tin, Barrel,
casa, receptacle, bay, sack or wrapper
or any dther receptacle in any form in
which any intoxicant is packed for the.
purpese of sale whether or net any
process of manufacture is employed and
includes -re-bottling;™;

{(ii) in clause .(5) for the words "the
Distrfict Revenue Officer", the words "the
Joint Collector" shall be substituted.

Subsvitution 3. For . section 34 .of the principal
of nev scetion Act, the following section shall be sub-
Iorsecr1un34 sL;tutea, namely:—

“Penaities | 34- whoaver, in ¢<ontravention
for illegal | ©f this Act or of any rule,
icport, etc.; Dotification or order made,

‘issued or passed thereunder or
of any licence or permit granted or.
issued under this Act,-

{a) imcorts, exports, transports,
mapufactures, collects- or 'possesses O
sells any intoxicant; or

() taps any excise tree; o

(c) draws toddy from any excise tree;
or -

{d} constructs orworksany dastillery
or brewety; or

(e) uses, keeps or has in ais posse-
sion any materials, stills, utensils,
;nplementsor auparatus whatsoever for the



A5

f purposse of - manufaccuring any intoxicant
athar than voddy; or
T

{f)] bottles any liguor for purposes
of szle; or

(g} buys any intoxicant; or

{h} possesses any material or filn
either with or without Sovernment loyo-of
any district in +he State of 2Ancdhra
pradesh or any other State er wrapper ox
‘any other thing in which intoxicants can
he packed or any apparatus, or implement
or machine fgr the purpose of packing any
intoxicant;

(i) ramoves any intoxicaat from any
distillery, brewery or wara hous2 licen—
sed, estapilished or continued undexr this
Aok

- shall on conviction ke punished,-

{1} in the case cf an offence félling
vnder clause (a),-

{i) where the intoxicant invelvad in
the'offence is less than such qusncity as
may be notified “in this behalf with
imprisonment for a term which shall nct
be less than six months bui 'which may
extend upto thres years and with fine
which shall not be less than rupeaes fiye
thousand but which may extend upto ;uans
twenty thousand; ’

{(ii) where the intoxicant invelved in
the offence is not less than the ou aﬁtlt"
notified as aforgsaid ‘with- mrrlconmew+
for a term which shall not he less than
che ¥ear and which may extend vgpto five
years and with fine which shall not b
less than rupees ten thousand put which
may extend upto rupees one lakh; and



.

Apondzent of
spetion 36.

Anendeent of
seeripd 37. -

_such cork of capsule,.”;

46

{2) in the case of zn offenca -athe:
vhan an cffencs falling under clause (a;
with imprisonment which thall no- be less
than six months bus wnlch mev extend to
one year and with fine which may extend
upto rupeas ten thousand.”

4. In section 36 of tke principal Act,
in clawse {g) for the words "chilgd.appa-
rently under gightesn years of age or
permits or suffers such child", the words
"person apparently under twenty oneg ycars
of ag2 or.permizs or sufliars such parson”
srall be substiicuted. ’

5. In secuien 37 wof the principal
Act,—

{a} aftes clause (4}, the Iollowving
clause shall be ingarved, nanrgly:

nte) maxes any block for printing
counterieit excise adhesive lable, photo
copies of such lable for couwnterfeiting.
~ints any counterfelt xcise pdhoasive
lakble, makes counterfeit cork or capsule,
te pe used on bottles, packages or other
receptacles containipng Indian ligquor or
Foreign licguor or Air pessession  of
counterfeit excise edhesive lable, cork.
capsule, block or any other materizl to
Be used for princing such lable or making

[b)} For items (i) and (i3}, the follow-
ing items shall be substitubed, namely:-

"{i) in case of first offence for a
term whick shall not be less than one
year but which may extené upto three
years and with fine which shall not be
less \than rupees ten tiousand but which
may eéxtend upro rusees thirty thousandi

1ii)y in the case of a second or sub-
guent oifenecg For @ tzrm which shall
be less +<han w0 years but wnich may

-
=



47

extend upto thres years and with Iine
which shall net be less than rupeess Iifty
thousand but which may extend upto rubpees
one lakh". ’ )

6. Afrer section 37 of the principal
Act, tre following szction shzll  be
inserced, nanesly:i-

“Penzity for| 37 A. (1} Wiuocever mixes or
"dultELatiOB pernits to be mixed with any
resulting ialliguor or intoxicating drug
ceath ete. any noxious substance or any
substancc which is likesly to
cause disszbility or grievous hurt or
dmath vo human beings, shall, ou coavie-
tion, be punishable,-—

(i) if, 25 a result of such an acs
sability or grieveus hurt or d&eath is
caUSﬂd to any persan, with imprisonment
for a term which shall not ke less than
two years -but which may extend upto
imprisonment for 1life, and with fine
which may extend upto rupees one lakh;

(it} in any other case, w1th imprison-
nent for a term which shall not be less
than one year, but which may extend upto
ten vears, and.with fine which may extend
uoto fifty thousand rupess.

Explanation: For the purposes oI this
section, the expression "grievous hurt"”
shall have the same meaning as in section
320 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860.

(2) Whoever omits to take reasonable
preceutions o prevent the mixing of any

.ioxlous substance or any substance which

is likely to cause disability or grieveous
hurt or death +to human beings, with any
liguor or intoxicating drug shall, on
coavictice, b2 punishable,-

Insertion of
new scotion
37 Al

Central Art 45
of 1860.



Joserrion <f

few Yectiun
[AI

48

{i) if as a result of such omissien,

diszabilify or grievous hurt is caused o
any person, with impriscament for a terz
which shall not be less than two years
Dut which may extend vpto imprisoument
for life, and with fioe which may eoxitend
upto rupees one lakh;

{ii) if as a result of such omission,
death is caused to any person;  with
norisonment £or a term which shall not
be less than three years but which nay
extend upto imprisonment for 1ife, and
with fine which may extend upte rupess
one lakh;

{ii1i) in any other case, with impri-
sonment of a term which shall not be lecs
than ore year but which™ may extend upto
ten yezrs and with fine which may extend
upto ruoe=s [ifty thousarnd.

{3) Whoever possesses any liguor or
intoxicating dvug in which any substance
referred ©o in sub-section (1} is mixed,
knowing toat such sybstance is mixed with
such l;quor ar intoxiczting drug shall,
on convicoion, be punichaple with impri-
scnment feor a term which shall not bBo

lesa than anc year hut which may oxtend

doto ten wears, and with fine which nmay
eztend upts rupeces fifty thousand”.

7. Riter section 40 of lhe principal
Act, the following sSectiug shall be
ingerted, namely:-

S Penaity for 10". Whosoever in any declara-
false seate-| tien or affidavit made o an
ment zeds inl Zxclise OLficer makes any state-
deelaracion | mene which is false or found

cation or which he helicves to
be falsz or doos mnot bnl~orn
it to be trus, touching apy point materi

to the objechi Ffor which fhe c:claratlon-

or affldavit is made cr used shall be

igavit| to ba false after dus werifi--




(25

4
punished with isprisoument
dascriptinn for o
less then six months but whlch

upto thred years znd snhz2ll alsg be
te fine which may extend upto rupzes.

thousand."

3.
fcr  the

il ef the pri
"be punisned

In section
words

which may extend to five thousand
"be punished with 1nprlscnmen:

the uords

oL
warm which sha

aither
11 not he
extend
liable

way

ncipal Act,
with fine

-,

rupers"”

which may extend unto six months and wvith
fine hhﬂcn may extend upto five thcousand

rupees” shall ke substituted.

9. In secticn 44 of vhe principal kot
in. the rproviso, far the =xpressicn
"Chzpter XXII of &the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1898", the expression "Chapte:z
¥4I of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1273" shall be substituted.

10. In section 45 of the prineial act,

in sub-section (3},
cricted. '

Iin section 47 of
for +the expression

{d}, clause [g) 54
ihe =ien
of

ores

g}

477 % th

(13,
llinc undar clouse {a)
ction 33",

ct'un g

o4
:LCLL n

saccian 507 gf the

{i) Zor the
_QXCEQd six moaths
nct e less than

words “which

“clanse
section

[aEE
for t

the expression
snall e substituted.

the provisc suall be

the principal
"clause
clause

(ci,
of
(b},

34"

{h)

orincipal
2 axpres-
of sectien
"fxlling

principal

shall noc
or witn finevhickh shall
rlve hundred rupees nut

which shall not exceed one Lhouseno rupecs

J. 864-4

ten,

Ampcndnent of
section 4l.

Zreundoent of
rection a4,

Amanderni of
section 45.

Arpndeent of
section 47,

Amondmenl uf
sention 474,

Arpndocnt of
section 54.




Ireernion of

;osaaldlen

monciar 57,

feandianrr of

wmeck of o
PrEeT

the principa

¥ sechion 23 of X
shz1ll be

following  Ss2cuion
namely -~
“gXligeriony $2k. The efiicers of  the
ef eEffiazrs) ; wf  Policz ard
o assist shall, upon notics
taeh otiar.| rciver or recuest madz by an
o — pecise officoy be  legally
pound %o wasieé him in zarrying outbt the
o he fct.".

55 of the principal

aression “"or sactien 31Y,

"section 37 er section

ituted.

ib. In section 6 of che principzal
for “ho.cxpression Yor seccion 177,
evpreesian "seotion 17 or ssciion 37A
gaction 404 for the Oxprossion

s code 2f Criminal Frocedure, 1593"
pxoression "the code of Criminal Fro-

ehure, 13737 shall be substituted.

7. 1In seczion 57 of the wvrincipzl
far the exprass i n "section 1200f the
Code ot Crinical Procedure, 1898" the
i veection 190 of the Code of
1u73" s5iall be sub-

59 of . the Principal
"t Code of Cri-
expression

: the
n¥ Criminal Procedurs, 1873¢

Q

0

el

0.

I

. [
p
I

=

o

-]

Pt

2]

andhra Pradesh Excise (Amend~
1593 is hereby repealed.

K. SAPYANARAYANA MURTRY,
Secretary to Governmanh,

Legislavive Affzirs,
| Law DEFgazbtmanc.




THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE (SECOND AMEND-
MENT) ACT, 1994.

ACT ®n. 20 OF 1984%,
[20th May, 1994.]

AN ACT TURTHER TO AMEND .HE ANDHRA PRADESH
EXCISE ACT, 1968.

BE it enscted by the Legislative Assenm—
bly of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the
Forty-fifuh Year of the Republic of India
a5 follows:-

1. This Act may be called the Andhra
Pradesh Excise(Secondémendment)gct,}994.

2. In the Andhra PFradesh Exeise Act,
1968 <(hereinafter referrad te as the
prineipal Act), in section 2,-

(i) for clause (9), the following
clause shall be svbstituted, namelv:i-

*Received the assent of the Goverrnor on the 13th
fay, 1984, For Statemeat of objects and Reasqus,
Flease sec Rndhra Pradesh Gazétte, Part IY¥-A, Extra-
© ordinary. dated the 12th May, 1994 at Page =,

373

Sners title.

Anendrent of
segtion 2,
Act 17 of 19868,




swendreat of
Eecticn 37A,

Jnsertion of
cew section
37B.

Central Act
2 of 1974.

372

"{9) ‘"excisable article" means. any
alcoholic liqueor for human consumption; or
any intoxicating druy®-;

{ii) in clawnse 20}, in sub-clause {(d)
for the expression "Dangerous Drugs Act,
+930", the expression "Barcotic Drugs and
Esychotropic Substarces Act, 18585" and in
the margin for the expression "Central Act
2 of 1930", the expression "Central Act 61
of 1985" shall respectively be substituted.

3. In section 37A of the principal Act, in
sub~section (1), in the explanation, for
the words “this section®, the expression
"this section and section 37B" shall be
substituted.

4. after section 37A, of the principal
Act, the followinyg section shall be inser-
ted, namely:-

"Order fo |37B. (1} Notwithstanding anythiny
pay Compen—|Ceéntained in the Code of Criminal
sation. Procedure, 1973 the court when
passing the judyement in a case
falling under section 372 may,
if it is satisfied that death or gyrievous
hurt or disability has been caused to. any
person or persons by consumption of liguor
or intoxicating drug sold in any place,
order the persons who sold the liquor or
intoxicating drug, whether or not he is
convicted of an offence under section 37A
to pay, by way of compensation, such
amount : as it deems just, to the legal
representatives of the deceased or to the
perscn or perseons to whom grlevous hurt or
disability has been caused:

Provided that where 'the liquor or into-
xicating drug is sold in a licenced shop,
the 1liability to pay the compensation
under this section shall be on the licensee.




373

{2) Any person aygrieved by an order
under sub-sectien (1) may, within ninety
days from the date of thz order. prefer an
appeal to the High Court:

Provided that no such appeal shall lie
unless the amount ordered to be paid uvnder
sub-section (1) is deposited in the court
which passed such order: .« -

Provided further that the High Court
may entertain the appeal after  the expiry
of the said pericd of ninety days if it is
satisfied that the appellant was prevented
by sufficient cause from preferriny the
appeal in time."-

5. In -section 42 of the principal 2Act; Anenimeast of
after the expression "section 34" the gection 432.
expression "sections 37 and 373" . shall be
‘substituted. :

6. For section 46 of the principal BAct, Substiterii.s

the following sections shall be substituted, of ney sec-

namely:- . - tisms fur
sectiva 5.

"Confisca~ 46. (1) Notwithstanding anything

tion by contained: in this Act or any

Excise Y] other'law for the time being in:

officers force, where anything liable for

in certain| confiscation under Section 45 is

seized or detain=d wunder the

provisions of this Acst, the

Officer seizing and decajining

such. property shall, without any- unreason—

able delay, produce the said reized pro-

perty before the Deputy Commissiocner of

Excise who has jurisdiction over the area.

€35eS8.

{(2) On producticn of the sald seized
property under sub-section (1} the Deputy
Comnissioner of Excise if satisfied that
an offence under this Act has bkeen Commit-
ted, may, whether or .not a prosecution is




374

instituted for the Commission of suchk an
vifance, order,; confiscation ©of swen pro-
perty., ’

{3) wWhtile making an order of confisca~
ticn under suo-section (2), the Deputy Com~
missioner of Excise may also order that
such of the properties to which the order
of confiscation relates which in his opin-
ion cannot ba preserved or are not fit for
human consumption be destroyed.

+ {4) Where - the Deputy Commissioner of
Ixcise after passing an order of canfisca-
tion under sub-section {2) is of the opin-
ion that it is expedient in the public
interest so teo do, he may order the confis-
cated property or any part there of to be
sold by bpublic auction or dispose of
departmentally.

{5) The Deputy Commissicner of Exciso
shall =ubmit a full report of all parti-
culars of confiscation te the Commissioner
of Excise within twenty-four hours of such
confiscation.

(6} The Deputy Commissioner of Excise
shall, for the purposes of this Act have
the same powers as are vested in a Civil

Central Act 5 Court wnder thée Code of Civil Preocedure,

of 1508.

1908 when making enquiries under this
section in respect of the following matters,
namely:~

(a) receiving evidence on affidavits?

{b) summoning and enforcing the atten-

’ -dence of any person and examing him
cn cath; and

(c) compelling the preduction of docu-
ments.




375 .

Issue of 46A. Mo order of confiscation ef
show cause| any property shall be made under
motice. - | cection 46 unless ghe person
from whom the saig property 1is

seized,~ .

(a) is given a notice in writing
informing him of the grounds on wnich it
is proposed to confiscate such property;
and N

{b) is giver an opportunity of meking
a representation in writing within suth

reasonable time as may be specified in the
notice. . .

order of 46B, When an offence under this
confisca~ |Act has been committed, but the

tion in the|offender is not kr'own or cannot’

aboence of |Ee found, or when anything
offepder. [liable to confiscation,K undexr
this Act, and not in the rosses-
sion L of ~ any . person cannct be
satisfectorily acecounted for,
the Excise Superintendent may by order
confiscate such property:

Provided that no such order shall be
made wuntil thke expiration of one ponth,
from the date of seizinyg the goods inten-
ded to be confiscated.

Appeal,’) 46C. Any person aggrieved by
== an order passed by Deputy Com-

missioner of Excise under sec-
tion 46 may, within sixty days from the
date of passing sucn c¢rder, appeal to the
Commissioner of Excise, who may after
¢iving reasonable copertunity to the eppel-
lant pass such orders as ke deems fit.

Order of |46D. The order of confiscation
confizca- |under sub-~section (2) of section
tion not to|46 or section 46B shall not prevent




Act 2 of 1974,

376

iprerfere |from initiation of criminal pro-
with other |ceedings against the accused
punishmental under +his Act. The result of
— criminal proceedings either
acqguittal ur conviction or otherwise under
the provisions of the Act, will have no
kearing on the order of confiscation
pascsed under this Act.

Bar af 46E. Notwithstanding ° anything
jurisdic— | contained in the code of Criminsl
tivn. Procedure, 1973 when the Deputy.

Comnissioner of Excise or ‘the

-appellate authority is seized with the

matter under this Act, no court shall
entertain any application in respect of
excisable articles any package, coverirng,
receptacle, any animal, vehicle or other
conveyance used in. carrying such articles
as far as 1ts release, confiscation is
concerned and the Jjurisdiction of the
Deputy Commissioner of Excise .or the zppel-
late authority with regard to the disposal
of the same shall bhe exclusive.

Property 4€6F. When an order for coufisca-

confiscated|tion of :ny property has been
when to passed under section 46 and such
vest in order has become final in respect
Govermment.|cf the whole or any portion of
such property, such property or,
portion thereof, as the case may be, shall
vest in Government free from all encum-

.brances.™

" Imsertion of
new section -
SDA. T

Central Act
45 of 1860. |

7. After section 50 of tie: principal act,
the following section shall be inserted,
namely:-

_50A.- Notwithstanding anything
contained in the Indian Fenal
Code, 1860 whoever assault or
threatens to assault or obstructs
or- attempts &0 ckstruct any Excise Officer
in the discharge of his official duties in

"Penalty
for
assa&lt.




377

the matter of detection, seizure,.,arrest,
investigation, prosecution of the coffences
under the Act or attempts to gse criminal
force e¢n such Excise Qfficer shall be
punished with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to three years and with
fine which may extend to rupees fifty
theousands.". .

E. In sectiorn 53 of tﬁe principal Act,in
sub-section (l),- .

(i) - for «c¢lause (a}), thg following
clause shall be substituted, namely:-

"{a) arrest without warrant any persecn
for an offence punishahble under section 27
or section 74 or section 35 or section 36
or section 37 or section 37A or section
4CA or section 50 or section 50A";

{(ii} in sub-section (2).  after the
expression “or section 379, the expression
"section 37A or secticn 530" shall be
inserted;

9. In section 60 of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section {4}, for the expres-
sion "sections 499 to 502, section 513,
section 514 and section 515 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1898" +the expression
"sections 441 to 446 and section 449 of
the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973,
shall be substituted;

(ii) after sub-section (4), the fol-
lowing sub=-section =hall be added, namely:-

"(5) Notwithstanding anything contained
in the Code of Criminal Prccedure, 1573,
no person accused of an offence under
clauses {a) and (h) of section 34 or
section 37, section 37A, section 4DA, sec-
tion 50 and section 50A of this Act, the

sméndmeat of
section 53.

Amendment of
section 60,

Central Act 2
of 1974.




378

court shall not grant any bail, unless the
prosecuting officer 1is given an orgportu-
aity to oppose the application, and the
court shall record reasons while granting
the bail".

Azepdment of 10. In section 62 of the rrincipal act,

section 62. for thes expression "section 32 of the Ccde
of Criminal Procedure, 1B98", the expres-
sion Fsection 29 of the Code of Criminal
Frocedure, 1873", shall be substituted.

K. SATYANARAYANA HMURTHY,
Secretary to Government,
Legislative Affairs,
Law Department.




229"
ACT ND. 28 OF 1998

Ten e - T

s

[zlst August, 1998 ]

. AN ACT TO AMEND THE ANDH_RA }?RADESH EXC_IS_E-

ACT, 1963 ‘

R Bé it “ nacted:- by “the Leglslatlve
Assembly of the State‘of Andhra ‘Pradesh.

‘in“the™ Forty—nlnth(Year of- the 399Pb;¥9c

of Indla, as follow5'—' ;f

please see the Andhra
Pradesh f‘azette Part—I'o' -A, Extraordinar_y dated 24.07- ~-1998
at rage 3.:EE054 Afagsgen o

\1



230

Short . ’
title 1. (1) This ,Act may be called the
and Andhra Pradespk Excise (BAmendment) ACt,
commencen 1998, .

{2) It shall come into force at once.

ment.

Amendment ° 2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act,
of sec- . 1968, ih section 32, in sub-section (2),
;::‘1;2‘_ after the words "under sub-saction (ry*, .
. 156g ! 9t the words “or clause (e) of sub-section
; - (1) of section 31" shall be inserted.

.G. BHAVANI PRASAD,
Secretary to Government,
Leg¥slative Affairs & Justice.



ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc. |

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh
Legislative Assembly received the assent
of the Governor on the 27th April, 2000
and the 8aid assent is hereby £first
puhlished on the 28th april, 2000 in the
Andhra Pradesh Gaczette for general infor-
mation:-

} ACT Ho. 11 OP 2000.

AR ACT m'nmn TO AMENRD "TRE ANDHRA
- PRADF'SH mcc:tse ACT, 196% !

‘Re ‘it -enacted by the Legxalative
;Asaemhly of the State of Andhra Pradesh
_in the Pifty-first. Year of, the Republic
: offindia 98- Ffollows:~

1651




Short
title.:

Amendments
of zection
13, Act 17
of 1968.

Amendnent
of seckion
16.

66

1. This Act may be called the Andhra
Pradash Fxcise (Amendment) act, 2000.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act,
1968 -({hereinafter- referred to as the
principal Act) .in section 13, to sub-
section (1) the following proviso shall
be added; namely:-

"Provided that the prov151ons of
this. subh-section, in so far as they
relate to establishing, continuing or
licensing a distillery shall apply only
to those distilleries which manufacture
spirits for potable purpese and regu-~
latory provisions relating to regulation
and supervision, shall be applicable to
all distilleries.".

3. In section 16 of the principal
Act,after sub-section (3) the following
proviso shall he added;: namely:-

nprovided that the provisiens of
this section in so far as they relate to
‘estahlishing, continuing or licensing a
distillery shall apply only to those
distilleries which manufacture spirits
for potahle purpose and other regulatory
provisions relating to regqulation and
Supervision, shall be applieable to all
distilleries."”.

G. BHAVANI PRASAD,
Secretary to Government,
Legislative Affairs & Justica,
Law Department.



67

STATEMERT OF OBJECES AND RERSOHS

Tne State Government have been issuing licenses nnder
sections 13 and 16 of the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968
for all types of Distilleries Sixrespective of the purpose
for which the Rectified Spirxit prodoced by thew is put to
use i.e., for Industrial Furpose or Potable porpose or for

. bath. The Bon'ble Supreme Court of India by an order dated

28-1-1597 'in W.P.M0.322/96 in H/s Bibar Disti)lecies .and
others has held that:--

{i} in the matter of industries where tie manufacture of
Rectified Spirit ig exclusive far the purpose of obtaining or
manufactire potable liquors, such imdustries shal} be nnder
the total and exclasive cmtrol of the States in all

-respects;

{ii) in the patter of indusiries where e manofactore of
rRectified Spirit is for both ipdustrial and potable porposes
permission to establish and regulate the functioning of dis-
tilleries shall be the ezclusive dogain of the Uoion;

{iii} however, even in regard to industries where the
entire Rectified spirit is supplied for indnstrial puarposes
or both for indostrial and potahle porpose, the power of the
Stites to take necessary steps bo ensure against mis-use or
diversion of Rectiried Spirit reant for industrial purposes,
both- during and after oanofacture of Rectified Spirir
continuves unaffected.

In view of the said cbusexvarion of the Aper Cdurt, the
Government have decided to amend sections 13 and 16 of the
Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 196¢ so as to restricting the
power to grant licenses to those. indusiries mannfacturing
Rectified spirlt for potable purpose and empovers the Govern-
ment or offié¢ials of Prohibitice apd Excise Depariment bo
regulate 211 the ipdustries eanufacinring the Rectified
Spirit for potable porpose, or Iodustrial puwrpose or for
both so as ta avoid the risuse or diversios of the Rectified
spirit meant For Industial purpose to. be used for potable
purpose. N




68

Whevaas the Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment) -Bill, 1594
has been introduced in the Legislative Assembly of the State
oo 26th November, 1998 as L.A. Bill Mo. 36 of 1998, the same
has lapsed due to -dissplution of the tenth legislative
Assemphly-

This Bill seeks o give effect to the above decision.

TUMMAYrLA FNAGESWARA RAOQ,
Hinister_ for Prohibition and Excise.




Registered No. HSE/49 [Price: Rs. 0-15 Paise.

o 0BF TeeO@SD

THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART 1V-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
No.11] HYDERABAD, SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2005

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.

Thefollowing Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legidative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 31st
March, 2005 and the said assent ishereby first pulished onthe
2nd April, 2005 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazettee for general
information:-.

ACT No. 10 OF 2005

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968

Beit enacted by the L egidative Assembly of the State of
AndhraPradeshintheFifty-sixth Year of Republic of Indiaas
follows

1.(2) ThisAct may becdledthe AndhraPradesh Excise  Shorttitle,

(Amendment) Act, 2005. extent and
commen-

[ 1] cement.

A-531



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra
Pradesh.

(3) It shall comeinto force on such date asthe State
Government may, by natification, appoint.

Amend- 2. Insection 47 of the AndhraPradesh ExciseAct, 1968,
mentof  jn sub-section (1), for the words “ten thousand rupees’, the

Z‘;C“O” words “onelakhrupees’ shall be subtituted.

Act 17 of
1968.

G.V. SEETHAPATHY,
Secretary to Government,
Legislative Affairs and Justice (F.A.C.),
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING AT
LEGISLATIVEASSEMBLY PRESS HYDERABAD.



Registered No. HSE/49 [Price: Rs. 0-15 Paise.

eoLﬂaas o8BS

THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART 1V-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No.12] HYDERABAD, SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2005

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCESAND
REGULATIONS Etc.

Thefollowing Act of the AndhraPradesh Legidative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 31st
March, 2005 and the said assent ishereby first published on
the2nd April, 2005 inthe AndhraPradesh Gazettefor genera
information.

ACT No. 11 OF 2005.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Beit enacted by the L egidative Assembly of the State
of Andhra Pradesh in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of

Indiaasfollows: [1]
A.532



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

Shorttitle 1. (1) ThisAct may be called the Andhra Pradesh Ex-
commence-  cise (Second Amendment) Act, 2005.
ment.
(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra
Pradesh.
(3) It shall comeinto force on such date asthe State
Government may, by notification, appoint.
Amepdf'th 2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, in the
ment Ol e
Schedule.  Sohedule-
Act 17 of (a) against item 2, inthe entry under column 4, for the
1968. words* Rupessfive’, thewords* Rupessfifteen” shall besub-
dituted,

(b) againstitem 3, in the entry under column 4, for the
words* Rupeeseighty”, thewords* Rupees one hundred and
twenty” shall be substituted.

GV.SEETHAPATHY,
Secretary to Government,
LegidativeAffairsand Justice(FA.C.),
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THECOMMISSIONER OF PRINTING AT
LEGISLATIVEASSEMBLY PRESS,HY DERABAD.



Registered No. HSE/49 [Price: Rs. 0-15 Paise.

eouﬁu&f o DB S

THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART 1V-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
No.13] HYDERABAD, SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2005

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.

Thefollowing Act of the AndhraPradesh Legidative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 31st
March, 2005 and the said assent is hereby first published on
the2nd April, 2005 inthe Andhra Pradesh Gazettefor general
informetion.

ACT No. 12 OF 2005.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Beit enacted by the L egidative Assembly of the State of
AndhraPradeshintheFifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India
asfollows:

1. (1) ThisAct may becaled the AndhraPradesh Excise Shorttitle,
(Third Amendment) Act, 2005. extent and
[1] commence-
ment.

A. 533



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

Amend-
ment of
section 2.
Act 17 of
1968.

(2) It extendsto thewhole of the State of AndhraPradesh.

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by natification, appoint.

2. Inthe AndhraPradesh Excise Act, 1968, in section 2,-

(i) after clause (22), the following clauses shall be
inserted; namdly:-

“(22-A) “materia” includes mol asses, wash and such
other substances asthe State Government may, by notification,
specify;

(22-B) “molasses’ means the heavy, dark coloured
resdua syrup drained away inthefind stage of themanufacture
of jaggery or sugar or Khandasari Sugar Caneor gur containing
solution or suspension, sugars which can be fermented and
includesany product formed by the addition to such syrup of
any ingredient which doesnot substantialy ater the character
of such syrup but does not include any articlewhich the State
Government may, by notification, declare not to be mol asses,
for the purposeof thisAct,”;

(i) after clause (31), thefollowing clause shall beadded,
namdy:-
“(32) “Wash” includes fermented wort or a dilute
solution of sugar fromwhich spiritisdistilled.”.

GV.SEETHAPATHY,
Secretary to Government,
LegidativeAffairsand Justice(FA.C.),
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THECOMMISSIONER OF PRINTING AT

LEGISLATIVEASSEMBLY PRESS,HY DERABAD.



Registered No. HSE/49

Yo o
So(SOAT ToEH B0

[Price: Rs. 0-30 Paise.

THEANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No.50] HYDERABAD, MONDAY SEPTEMBER 25, 2006

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES

AND REGULATIONS Etc,,

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 22nd
September, 2006 and the said assent is hereby first
published on the 25th September, 2006 in the Andhra
Pradesh Gazette for general information:-

ACT No. 39 OF 2006

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State
of Andhra Pradesh in the Fifty-seventh Year of the Republic
of India as follows:

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Excise (Amendment) Act, 2006.

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra
Pradesh.

A.188-1 [1]

Short
title,
extent
and
commen-
cement.



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

Amend-
ment of
section
17.

Act 17 of
1968.

Amend-
ment of
section
22.

Amend-
ment to
Schedule.

Repeal

of Ordi-
nance 5
of 2006.

(3) It shall be deemed to have come into force on
and from the 25th May, 2006.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968 (herein
after referred to as the principal act), in sub-section (3) of
section 17, for the words “for a period of one year or part
thereof”, the words “for a period not exceeding two years
at a time” shall be substituted.

3. In section 22 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for
the words “on the quantity of any excisable article”, the words
the “on the quantity or advalorem of any excisable article”
shall be substituted.

4. In the Schedule appended to the principal Act,-

(i) in column No. (4) against serial No. 2, for the
words “Rupees Fifteen per bulk”, the words “Rupees Fifteen
per bulk or 120% advalorem” shall be substituted,;

(i) In Column No. (4) against serial No. 3, for the
words “Rupees one hundred and twenty per litre of the
strength of proof spirit”, the words “Rupees one hundred
and twenty per litre of the strength of proof spirit or 120%
advalorem” shall be substituted.

5. The Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2006 is hereby repealed.

T. MADAN MOHAN REDDY,
Secretary to Government,
Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING

AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HY DERABAD.



Registered No. HSE/49 [Price: Rs. 0-30 Paise.

e
8o|¢fPA34 comd@dn
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART 1V-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
No. 5] HYDERABAD, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 31, 2010.

ANDHRA PRADESHACTS, ORDINANCESAND
REGULATIONSETC.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature,
received the assent of the Governor on the 29th March,
2010 and the said assent is hereby first published on the
31st March, 2010 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for
general information.

ACT No. 1 OF 2010.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra
Pradesh in the Sixty first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

[1]
J.679-1



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

Short
title

and
commen-
cement.

Amend-
ment of
section 20.
Act 17 of
1968.

Repeal of
Ordi-
nance, 4
of 2010.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Excise (Amendment) Act, 2010.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force
with effect from 24-05-2005.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, in
section 20,-

(i) for the word “licensee” wherever it occurs,
the words “licensee/lease holder” shall be substituted;

(i) for the word “shop”, wherever it occurs, the
words “shop/bar” shall be substituted;

(iii) for sub-section (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely,-

“(3) The licensee/lease holder shall not, on
account of closure of the shop/bar under this section, be
entitled to any compensation or refund of licence fee or
lease amount”.

3. The Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2010 is hereby repealed.

R. RAMA CHANDRA REDDY,
Secretary to Government,
LegidativeAffairs& Judtice,
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING,

AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD, 2010.



Registered No. HSE/49 [Price: Rs. 0-30 Paise.

8o|¢fPA34 comd@dn
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
No. 13] HYDERABAD, TUESDAY, APRIL 20, 2010.

ANDHRA PRADESHACTS, ORDINANCESAND
REGULATIONSETC.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature,
received the assent of the Governor on the 19th April, 2010
and the said assent is hereby first published on the 20th
April, 2010 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information.

ACT No. 8 OF 2010.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra
Pradesh in the Sixty first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh ﬁt‘l(;”
Excise (Second Amendment) Act, 2010. and
commen-
[1] cement.

A.692



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

Amend-
ment of
section

34. Act 17
of 1968.

Amend-
ment of
section
37.

Amend-
ment of
section
37-A.

Amend-
ment of
section
60.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the
State Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968,
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 34,
in item (1), in sub-item (ii), for the words “one year”, the
words “three years”, shall be substituted.

3. In section 37 of the principal Act,-

(1) in item (i), for the words “a term which shall not
be less than one year but which may extend upto three
years”, the words “a term which shall not be less than three
years but which may extend upto five years”, shall be
substituted;

(2) in item (ii), for the words “a term which shall
not be less than two years but which may extend upto three
years”, the words “a term which shall not be less than three
years but which may extend upto six years”, shall be
substituted.

4. In section 37-A of the principal Act,-

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (i), for the words
“two years”, the words “three years”, shall be substituted,;

(2) in sub-section (2), in clause (i), for the words
“two years”, the words “three years”, shall be substituted.

5. In section 60 of the principal Act, for
sub-section (5), the following shall be substituted, namely,-



Registered No. HSE/49. [Price : Rs.0-50 Paise

{ RIGHT TO
1= INFORMATION

.‘« /

SOPHBE Trad (ki
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 8] AMARAVATI, MONDAY, 1% MAY, 2017.

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.,

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the

assent of the Governor on the 28" April, 2017 and the said assent is hereby first
published on the 1% May, 2017 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general

information :-

ACT No. 8 of 2017

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE
ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in
the Sixty-eighth year of the Republic of India as follows :-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise cuir:::rtt::tle an?
(Amendment) Act, 2017. encement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, in section 47, in sub-  Amendment of
section (1), for the words ‘one lakh rupees and subject to such Bctian 4.
minima, as may be prescribed’, the words ‘a sum of money Act No. 17 of
subject to such minima, as may be prescribed and notified by e
the Government from time to time’, shall be substituted.

T. NARAYANA REDDY,
Secretary to Government (FAC),
Law Department.
Printed by the Commissioner of Printing, at A.P. Legislative Assembly Printing Press,
Amaravati.




Registered No. HSE/49. [Price : Rs.1-00 Paise

] RIGHT TO
s INFORMATION

SO(F|NBE oS
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
No. 9] AMARAVATI, MONDAY, 1* MAY, 2017.

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.,

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the
assent of the Governor on the 28" April, 2017 and the said assent is hereby first
published on the 1% May, 2017 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information :-

ACT No. 9 of 2017

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE
ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in
the Sixty-eighth year of the Republic of India as follows :-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise shortite and
(Second Amendment) Act, 2017. Commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, (hereinafter referred Amendment of
to as the Principal Act), in section 2, in clause (10), after the S
words “to the constitution”, the words ‘and includes additional Act No. 17 of

excise duty or additional countervailing duty, as the case may 1968,

be”, shall be added.

3.  In the principal Act, for the Heading in Chapter-V, the following Ami?;’:;ienﬂt g‘;
words shall be substituted, namely - i i

“Excise duty, countervailing duty, additional excise duty and addi-
tional countervailing duty”.



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-B

Amendment of
section 21.

Amendment of
Section 22.

Amendment of
section 23.

Amendment of
Schedule.

4.

In the principal Act, in section 21,

(i) inthe marginal heading, after the words ‘countervailing duty”,
the words “or additional excise duty or additional
countervailing duty” shall be inserted.

(ii) in sub-section (1), after the words, “levy an excise duty”, the
words “including additional excise duty” shall be inserted.

(iif) in sub section (2), after the words, “a countervailing duty”,
the words “including additional countervailing duty” shall be
inserted and after the words, “rates of excise duty”, the words
“or additional excise duty, as the case may be” shall be
inserted.

In the principal Act, in section 22, -

(i) after the words, “The excise duty”, the words, “additional
excise duty” shall be inserted, and the word “and” shall be
omitted and after the words, “countervailing duty”, the words,
“and additional countervailing duty” shall be inserted.

(i) in clause (a), after the words ‘imported into the State.” the
following words shall be added, namely,-

“at such stage or stages and in such manner as may be
prescribed.”.

In the Principal Act, in sub-section (1) of section 23, after the
words ‘to any excise duty’, the words ‘additional excise duty’
shall be inserted.

In the Principal Act, for the Schedule, the following Schedule
shall be substituted, namely ,-



MAY 1, 2017] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3
The Schedule
[See Section 21(1)]
Sl. | Description Mode of levying Maximum Mode of levying Maximum
No. | of Excisable Excise duty rate of Additional Excise rate of
articles Excise duty duty Additional
Excise dut

(1) 2) 3) ) () (8)

- Beer On the quantity Rupees fifteen |On the landed 80% of
issued from the per bulk litre or |cost which is the landed cost
distillery or 120% total of basic
warehouse advalorem price i.e., cost

price + cost of
excise adhesive
labels/Hologram
charges of freight,
handling &
insurance, etc., plus
Excise Duty/
Countervailing duty
of Beer.,

2 Indian On the quantity Rupees one On the landed 80% of
Made issued from the hundred and cost which is the landed cost
Foreign distillery or twenty per total of basic
Liquor warehouse litre of price i.e., cost

the strength price + cost of

of proof spirit excise adhesive

or 120% labels/Hologram

advalorem charges of freight,
handling &
insurance, etc., plus
Excise Duty/
Countervailing duty
of Indian Made
Foreign Liguor.

" 8 Rectified On the quantity Rupees

Spirit issued from the eighty per
distillery or litre of the -— -
warehouse strength of
proof spirit

4. | Toddy On each variety
of the following
trees ;

Date of Sendhi... | Rupees
Twenty per tree
Palmyra........ Rupees thirty -
per tree
Coconut........ Rupees fifty
per tree
Sago............. Rupees sixty
per tree
Date palm...... Rupees fifty
per tree

T. NARAYANA REDDY,
Secretary to Government (FAC),
Law Department.




April 20, 2010] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

“(5) Notwithstanding any thing contained in the
Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, no court shall grant any
bail to any person accused of an offence punishable under
sub-item (i) of item (1) of section 34 and to any person
accused of an offence under clause (h) of section 34 or
section 40-A or section 50 or section 50-A of this Act, unless
the prosecuting officer is given an opportunity to oppose
the application and the Court record reasons while granting
the bail.”

6. After section 60 of the principal Act, the following
new section shall be inserted namely,-

Non-bailable 60-A. The offences punishable under
Offences. | sub-item (ii) of item (1) of section 34 or

section 37 or section 37-A shall be non-
bailable and the provisions of the Code of Criminal

Procedure, 1973 with respect to non bailable offences shall
apply to those offences.”

Central
Act 2 of
1973.

Insertion
of new
section
60-A.

Central
Act 2 of
1973.

R. RAMA CHANDRA REDDY,

Secretary to Government,

Legislative Affairs & Justice,

Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING,

AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD, 2010.



Registered No. HSE/49, : [Price : Rs.1.00 Paise

SOF(XEE TresB| s

THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 2] AMARAVATI, FRIDAY, 3" JANUARY, 2020

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Ete.,

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the assent of the
Governor onthe 2™ January, 2020 and the said assent is hereby first published on the
3 January, 2020 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general information :

ACT No. 2 of 2020. .

ANACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE ACT,
1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the Seventieth
year of the Republic of India as follows:- :

1. (1)  This Act may be called the Andbra Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 2019. Short title and

commence-

(2)  Itshall be deemed to have come into force on and from the 30® September, i

2019.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, in section 22, after clause (d), the following  Amendment
clause shall be added, namely, - of section 22.

“(e) In the form of Retail Excise Tax, Additional Retail Excise Tax, ActNo. 17 of
Manufacture Excise Tax or any other levy, tax, fee or cess, as 1968,
may be notified”.

J-6-2020



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PARTIV-B

Repeal of 3. The Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2019 is
Ulmancs hereb repealed
No. 50f2019. ¥ TR ;

GONTU MANOHARA REDDY,
Secretary to Government,
Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at A.P. Legislative Assembly Printing Press, Amaravati.



Registered No. HSE/49. [Price : Rs.1.00 Paise

RIGHT 0
> INFORMATICON
SOFHES Toasd|Ead
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
No. 4] AMARAVATI, FRIDAY, 3" JANUARY, 2020.

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc., -
The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the assent of the
Governor onthe 2™ January, 2020 and the said assent is hereby first published on the
3 January, 2020 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general information :

ACT No. 4 of 2020.

ANACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE ACT,
1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the Seventieth
year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise (Second Amendment) Act, Short title and

2019. commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on Such date as the State Government may, by notification,
appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, (hereinafter referred to as the Principal ?me’}dmgzt
Act), in section 34, for sub-clauses (1) and (2),the following shall be substituted, namely.- e

“(1) in case of an offence falling under clauses (a), (d), (e), (f), (h) and (i) with ActNo. 17of
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months but which may e
extend upto five years and with fine which shall not be less than rupees two lakhs for

the first offence and which shall not be less than rupees five lakhs for the second

offence; and

(2) In the case of an offence other than an offences falling under clauses (a), (d), (¢),

(), (h) and (i) with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months
and which may extend upto one year and with fine which may extend upto rupees
ten thousand.”.

1-8/2020 : [1]



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-B
Amendment 3. In the Principal Act, in section 36,in sub-section (1),in clause (h),in sub-clause
of section 36. (i) at the end, after the words “ one thousand rupees”, the words “and in respect of
holder of a bar license, the fine shall not be less than two times of the license fee” shall
be added.
Amendment 4. In the Principal Act, in section 37,in clause (¢),-

of section 37.

Amendment 5.
of section 47.
Amendment 6

of section 60.

Central Act 2 of
1974.

Substitution of 7

section 60-A.

@i  insub-clause (i) at the end, after the words “rupees thirty thousand”, the
words “and in respect of holder of a bar license, the fine shall not be less
than two times of the license fee” shall be added.

(i1) in sub-clause (i1) at the end, after the words “rupees one lakh”, the words

and in respect of holder of a bar license, the fine shall not be less than two
times of the license fee” shall be added.

In the Principal Act, in section 47, in sub-section (1), after the existing
proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely,-

“Provided further that in the case of an offence committed by the holder ofa
bar license for the first time, such offence may be compounded for a sum equal
to two times of the license fee along with a warning. In the case of an offence
committed for the second time by the Bar licensee, the bar license shall be
cancelled.”.

In the Principal Act, in section 60, for sub-section(5), the following shall be
substituted, namely,-

“(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973 no court shall grant any bail to any person accused of an offence under
Clause (h) of Section 34 or Section 40-A or Section 50 or Section 50-A of this
Act, unless the prosecuting officer is given an opportunity to oppose the
application, and the court record reasons while granting the bail.”

In the Principal Act, for section 60-A, the following shall be substituted, namely, -

“60-A.Non-bailable offences :- The offences punishable under sub-clause
(1) of Section 34 or Section 37 or Section 37-A shall be non-bailable and the
provisions of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 with respect to non-bailable
offences shall apply to those offences.”.

GONTU MANOHARA REDDY,
Secretary to Government,
Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at A.P. Legislative Assembly Printing Press, Amaravati.



Registered No. HSE/49. [Price : Rs.1.00 Paise

RIGHTTO
= INFORMATION

So|FHBE ToaBBE®

THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 17] AMARAVATI, THURSDAY, 2 JULY, 2020.

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.,

The following Actof the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the assent of the Governor on the
1% July, 2020 and the said assent is hereby first published on the 20d July, 2020 in the Andhra Pradesh
Gazette for general information:

ACT No. 17 of 2020.
AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE
ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in
the Seventy-First Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1 This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise Short title and

(Amendment) Act, 2020. FaSIRERE
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect on and
from the 20" May, 2020.
2. in the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968 (herein after referred to as Amendment of
section 2.

the Principal Act), in section 2,

Act No. 17 of 1968.
(i) after clause (16), the following clause shall be inserted, L ks

namely,-

1.126/20 [1]




ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-B

Amendment of 3.
section 34,

Amendment of 4.
section 46.

(i)

(ii)

(iii)

“(16-A) : “Grama / Ward Mahila Samrakshana Karyadarsgi:
means the persons employed in Village / Ward Secretariat and
Grama/Ward Volunteers belonging to the Department of Gram
Volunteers/ Ward Volunteers and Village Secretariats/AWarg
Secretariats

(i) after clause (28-A), the following clauses shal be inserted,

namely,-

“(28-B) “Special Enforcement Bureau” means the Department
of Special Enforcement Bureay.

(28-C) “Special Enforcement Bureay Officer” means the
Commissioner of Special Enforcement Bureay or any other
officer employed / posted in Special Enforcement Bureau or
invested with powers under the relevant provisions of this Act.”

In the principal Act, in section 34,in sub-clause(1), for the words “five
years”, the words “eight years” shall be substituted.

In the principal Act, in section 46 -

in sub-sections (1), (2), (3) and (4), after the words “the Deputy

C)

(b)

Commissioner of Prohibition and Excise”, the words “and / or
the Deputy Commissioner of Special Enforcement Bureau and
/ or the Superintendent of Police / or the Executive Magistrate”
shall be inserted.

in sub-section (5),-

after the words “the Deputy Commissioner of Prohibition and
Excise” the words “and / or the Deputy Commissioner of
Special Enforcement Bureay and / or the Superintendent of
Police / or the Executive Magistrate” shall be inserted; and

after the words “the Commissioner of Prohibition and Excise”,
the words “and / or to the Commissioner, Special Enforcement
Bureau and / or District Magistrate as the case may be” shall
be inserted.

in sub-section (6), for the words “Deputy Commissioner of
Prohibition and Excise”, the words “District Magistrate / Deputy
Commissioner of Prohibition and Excise and / or the Deputy
Commissioner of Special Enforcement Bureau and / or the
Superintendent of Police / or the Executive Magistrate” shal|
be substituted.



2nd JULY, 2020] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3
5.  Inthe principal Act, in section 46-B, after the words “the Prohibition  Amendmentof
and Excise Superintendent”, the words “and / or the Assistant Cogmlesiones, ~TOAONASS
Special Enforcement Bureau and / or the Executive Magistrate” shall be
inserted.
6. Inthe principal Act, in section 46-C. - Amendment of
section 46-C.
(i) after the words “Deputy Commissioner of Prohibition and
Excise”, the words “and / or the Deputy Commissioner of Special
Enforcement Bureau and / or the Superintendent of Police / or
the Executive Magistrate” shall be inserted; and
(ii) after the words “the Commissioner of Prohibition and Excise’,
the words “or the Commissioner, Special Enforcement Bureau
or the District Magistrate as the case may be” shall be inserted.
7. In the principal Act, in section 48, for the words “Prohibition and Amendment of
Excise Officer”, the words “Executive Magistrate or Prohibition and Excise section 48.
Officer, Special Enforcement Bureau Officer” shall be substituted.
8. In the principal Act, in section 50-A, for the words “Prohibition and Amendment of
Excise Officer” occurred in both places, the words “Executive Magistrate el
or Prohibition and Excise Officer or Special Enforcement Bureau Officer”
shall be substituted.
9. In the principal Act, after section 50-A, the following new section Insertion of new
shall be added, namely,- Section 50-B.
«50-B Penalty for Criminal Conspiracy : When two or more
persons agree,-
(@)  tocommitany offence punishable under this Act, or
(b)  tocommit breach of condition(s) of licence, permitetc., each
of such persons shall on conviction be liable for the
punishment in the same manner as if he had abetted such
offence.”
10.  Inthe principal Act, in section 51,- Astiendinentoh
section 51.

(i) in sub-section (1), in sub-clause (iii) of clause(b),- .

(a) after the words “building is situated”, the words “or the
Grama/ Ward Mahila Samrakshana Karyadarshi employed
in Village / Ward Secretariat or Grama / Ward Volunteers
employed in Village / Ward Secretariat,” shall be inserted;

and




ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-B

Amendment of
section 53.

Amendment of
section 53-A..

Amendment of
section 55.

Amendment of
section 56,

(i)

(iii)

13.

14.

(b)

for the words “Revenue Department”, the words “Executive

Magistrate or Special Enforcement Bureau” shall be
substituted.

in sub-section (2), -

(a)

(b)

after the words “Every Prohibition and Excise Officer”, at
the beginning, the words “and Special Enforcement Bureau
Officer or Revenue Officer” shall be inserted; and

for the words “Prohibition and Excise Inspector”, the words
“a Prohibition and Excise Inspector or to Inspector of
Special Enforcement Bureau or to Executive Magistrate”
shall be substituted.

in sub-section (3), in clause (b), for the words “the Commissioner”,

the words “the Commissioner of Prohibition & Excise and /
or the Commissioner, Special Enforcement Bureau/oran
Executive Magistrate” shall be substituted.

In the principal Act, in section 53, in sub-section (1), for the words

‘Revenue Department”, the words “Executive Magistrate or Special
Enforcement Bureau” shall be substituted.

In the principal Act, in section 53-A, -

(@)

(b)

after the words “Police and Revenue”, the words “and
Department of Gram Volunteers/ Ward Volunteers and Village
Secretariats/ Ward Secretariats” shall be inserted: and

for the words “a Prohibition and Excise Officer”, the words
“an Executive Magistrate or a Prohibition and Excise Officer
or a Special Enforcement Bureau Officer” shall be substituted.

In the principal Act, in section 55 -

(a)

(b)

after the words “a Collector”, the words “or Executive
Magistrate” shall be inserted: and

after the words “Prohibition and Excise Sub-Inspector”, the
words “or any Special Enforcement Bureau Officer not below
the rank of Sub-Inspector” shall be inserted.

In the principal Act, in section 56,-



2™ JULY, 2020] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

()

(D)

(iii)

in the marginal heading, after the words “Prohibition and
Excise Officer”, the words “and Special Enforcement Bureau
Officer” shall be inserted.

in sub-section (1), after the words “Excise Sub-Inspector”, the
words “or Special Enforcement Bureau Officer not below the
rank of a Sub-Inspector” shall be inserted.

in sub-section (2), after the words “Prohibition and Excise
Officer”, the words “or a Special Enforcement Bureau Officer”
shall be inserted.

15.  Inthe principal Act, after section 56, the following new section along
with a proviso shall be added, namely,-

«56-A. Cognizance and trial of offence:- Notwithstanding
anything contained in the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, all
offences under this Act shall be cognizable and the provisions
of the said code with respectto cognizable offences shall apply
to them.

Provided that the offences punishable with imprisonment for a
term not exceeding two years under this Act shall be tried in
accordance with the procedure prescribed by chapter XXl of the
Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973.”

16. In the principal Act, in section 57, after the words “Prohibition and
Excise Sub-Inspector”, the words “or a Special Enforcement Bureau Officer
not below the rank of a Sub-Inspector” shall be inserted.

17. Inthe principal Act, in section 58,-

(i)

(ii)

in the marginal heading, after the words “Prohibition and Excise
Officer”, the words “or Special Enforcement Bureau Officer” shall
be added.

after the words “Prohibition and Excise Sub-Inspector” the words
“or Special Enforcement Bureau Officer, not below the rank of a
Sub- Inspector” shall be inserted.

18. Inthe principal Act, in section 60,-

(i)

in sub-section (1), for the words “Prohibition and Excise Officer”,
the words “Executive Magistrate or Prohibition and Excise Officer
and/ or Special Enforcement Bureau Officer” shall be substituted.

Insertion of New
section 56-A.

Central Act 2 of
1974,

Amendment of
section 57.

Amendment of
section 58.

Amendment of
section 60.



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-B

Amendment of
section 61,

(ii)

19.

shall be inserteq.
In the principal Act, in section 61 -

(i) in the marginal heading, after the words “Prohibition ang
Excise Department”, the words “or to Special Enforcement
Bureau” shall be added at the end.

(i) insub-section {9

(@ inclause (a), after, the words, “the Collector or’, the
words “Executive Magistrate or” shal| be inserted.

(b) inclause (b), after the words “a Prohibition and Excise
Officer or Police Officer”, the words “or Special
Enforcement Bureau Officer” shall be added attheend.

GONTU MANOHARA REDDY,
Secretary to Govern ment,
Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at AP, LegislativeAssembly Printing Press, Amaravati,



Registered No. HSE/49. ' [Price : Rs.2-00 Paise

So|FPBE TreB|FS»
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PARTIV-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 4] AMARAVATI, WEDNESDAY, 19" APRIL, 2023

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
' REGULATIONS Ete., ;

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature received the assent
of the Governor on the 13" April, 2023 and the said assent is hereby first
published on the 19" April, 2023 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information : ; ' :

ACT No. 4 of 2023

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH EXCISE
ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the
Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows : -

1. (1) ThisAct may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Short Titie and
Act, 2023. : _ Commencement.

(2) Itshall be deemed come into force on and 16-05-2020.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, (hereinafter referred to as the Amendment of
' Principal Act), in section 34, for sub-cluses (1) and (2), the following ~ 3°%%°"%*

shall be substituted, namely,- ' ‘ Act No. 11 g?agf

“(1)in fhe case of an offence'faliing under clause (a),;

(i) where the intoxicant involved in the offence committed for first - '
time is non-duty/non-tax paid and is less than such quantity as may be
‘notified in this behalf from time to time, with imprisonment for a term
which shall not be less than six months but which may extend upto three
years and with fine which shall not be less than five times the value of
“such intoxicant : :

J-42/87 [1]



_ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY ; [PART IV-B

Amendment of
section 47.

3.

Provided that where the intoxicant involved in the offence
committed for first time is duty/tax paid and is less than such quantity

~ as may be notified in this behalf from time to time, with imprisonment

for a term which shall not be less than six months but which may extend -
upto three years and with fine which shall not be less than three times
the value of such intoxicant :

Provided further that in case of subsequent offences falling
under Clause (i), with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less
than one year but which may extend upto elght years and with fine
which shall not be less than rupees two lakhs.

(ii) where the intoxicant involved in the offence is more than the
quantity notified as aforesaid, with imprisonment for a term which
shall not be less than one year but which may extend upto eight years
and with fine which shall not be less than rupees two lakhs for the first
offence and which shali not be less than rupees five lakhs for any
subsequent offence thereafter.

(2) inthe case of an offence falling under clause (d), (e), (f), (h)
and (i) with-imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six
months but which may extend upto “eight years’ and with fine which
shall not be less than rupees two lakhs for the first offence and which
shall not be less than rupees five lakhs for any subsequent offence
thereafter : and

(3) Inthe case of an offence other than an offences falling under
clauses (a), (d), (e), (f), (h) and (i) with imprisonment for a term which
shall not be less than six months and which may extend upto one year
and with fine which may extend upto rupees ten thousand.

In the principal Act, in section 47, after second proviso, the followmg
proviso shall be added, namely,-

“Provided ai_so that any Prohibition and Excise officer or officer
of Special Enforcement Bureau specially empowered in that behalf
may accept from any person, other than the holder of a licence or
permit granted or issued under the provisions of this Act or the Rules
made there under, who is reasonably suspected of having committed
an offence for the first time during the period as mentioned in the
Schedule in the Rules falling under Section 34(a) involving less than
the quantlty as notified under clause (i) of sub-section (1) of Section
34, a sum of money equal to the maximum fine leviable under the



191 APRIL, 2023] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

said clause (i), by way of compensation for the offence which may
have been committed and may release any property seized, which
is liable to confiscation under this A'ct,' in all such cases on
payment of the value thereof as estimated by such officer.”

4. In the principal Act, for the words “Prohibition and Excise  substitution of
Superintendent” the words “District Prohibition and Excise
Officer” and for the words “Assistant Commissioner of Special

* Enforcement Bureau” the words “District Special Enforcement
Officer, Special Enforcement Bureau” wherever they occur,
shall be substituted. '

ARAVIND RAMANI,
Secretary to Government (I/C),
Legal and Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at A.P. ngislaﬁveAssembly'Pﬁnﬁng Press, Amaravati.

nomenclature. -





