


-~533

whard, (e, feais 1 wad 19730 12, 9% 1694,

——
ST S—

faftr sitx faamlt s frmr

wft':na fears ¢ wead gawl.

&ﬁﬁﬁﬂ-ﬂ () —wemsdnfaumm qwr @1 frefafon nftfr, form o

_ g&@a*‘aﬂ zmata?r Wﬁ e s‘r @’r %,r;aqzm T &Y

e S e L




gfsmard.

Faedt & dad.

qeredi ay frats -

ara T .mr fiy e sFAAET.

agedta o farfmfm q’fﬁ"ﬂ T A wrfe.

fneir g @ AaT ol ﬁfﬂ-ﬂﬁ,ﬁﬁ@ﬂﬁwmﬁﬁﬁm




qEIHRW U, femip 1 FEA 1973 359

FTHIE © T Q3.
weasEn faum aur @I daF qqQr w4l
pferfmm, g6l
A L SR qeed A weae A wawfa wea gd; wEfy
‘emam avE” (wrararan) § faAiw ¢ weEdr qRel @)
SewATS ST w5y s, ]
faaw wWT ® aEedl § gan aqr wdl & (90 9geew &
AT TS H G99 # qeygaw fravy qeew gror feafafas
7 ag wfufrafee g —
q. 7§ wfafrm wepRy faar avr aaer daT qar wor #fy- dfaw am
qeeR #RT ST WHAL :
R muﬁaﬁwﬁ,mwﬂwﬁmﬁmwmm afvare,
(%) “sfafa” & afvda § faw aar o w1 g afafy
mﬁrma*ma*srfmrﬁqﬂ’ta?szsmrrf‘a-r #1s gfufa
AT FERE AT TS G @ Fagm A v 4% afuta
R gms  (wffa %) seada mﬁ ars, aar e
gt U (g feg w7 9 9w &)
(@) “qaeg” & =fada § vy foaw aurar #IE
forg gas et a——
(ww) welt;
(@) T HE;
(fr)  ww e,
(arz) @wdi wfag; ok
(v/4) wswsdw faam @ T qar gmere aE
T &

() “sa” & =k § ag dpt Fwmafy ﬁwsr TITER
frar awr Y d3w B IOV GF F o § @
‘Ff E}mgv*rmﬁaﬁwﬁamw







L bk lably

‘bl 1% 3k

-bE LBL Ibk3h biBklk] bRk 6 D18 BR) & \bk (B)
‘2B

Rit be 1k 1Bk k2 RIBK & 3 LIR Lk kebi lhw) (%)

.~ iR 12 Bk by b DRJijaaky b Labl) Y ‘b
BlRE BERIK 3h Rkhike | Bijiz bkl L 1boaikl (%)

ekt LLk kbl §
k2 Dballbite Ltk lkiolbE % hbhiRlk B3 240b helx (3) 9

¢ Lihalh bl e bic ki Liky
M bbbk 1e D Lbb 12} bibikd g bl
BRIBR R bikd-Blbbl xle R LiRE Lbhe bh
Lbk hali 10D 22lkk[p 1k RBA b bib blew, (2)
el @
hlibh lsb hil |2 Lol Letw) Rhjltk b D) b
2IRINE GRE U ‘bidbib] 1GBE 2l Ltklls (ki) Bha)
“kjl) 12 iekals & Ltk Lb2 ‘2R & \bislbk & D18
BS ‘b Bb AP Ik Bl 1DB b IRB BB 1% b B 2h
b BiEd R \Bk) lbhis B Bie 10k b kb BE 1e B
RO 4 13 Bhop f2 plk BB B2k Bl bik 2l 13 Lbk
hiEDL B Bb (Blk 1hah HIDD LRYS B BB it Ith Be
%A ‘1t bR BE > b lhb) % 2163 E bold ‘b LB
LRk kol lo badh 2k D Dishyk B A0k 1e b2 50k, (&)
=) t biolkk & 218 B3 (&)
Lix bl B (Bb IBb 1 B (Rlek) bk} & ]
DR B2 lkhi lb 168 10p 16 LY \RRb] b} ® | & DI
L BRID Be Bk %) N2 balh bhlkib) 1e bab bE J
M Jeblle | BIMIGK b Bhisi: ‘bils 2> b 1BE Ltk b JRQE)
L b \RDbb) k3B it ) Lkble) ‘BLL 26 ()

2 30 e bl '@
\pit \t) LARK & hbbik)l BhE ) s 1 21k & kik-Blkk)
L8 Jihb) bl plbk kiRl $BS 1] % DB & (2093 kb Wt
2073 ‘bbills (Ll Lal bbE) IRk Iak k) U N8 L
L2 tebjlis RS bhe Sl Ll blis L) J2 2l % Ini2Bis Lnl bk
tehjl ‘21D & kib-Blob) BO 2k bhe Lblk bl Lhi) b 2k &
Rieaibh L BlhBleb] ki k2] bk & (3) Lisee ()

T &
E

19¢€

€461 Dk 1 Gjkkj ‘khiald 3nihak




Sections

1,

> @ o

(1]

THE MADHY IDF g
VETAN TATHA BHATTA ADHINIYAM 1972

A PRADESH ;

Table of Contents

Short title.

Definitions. = e

Salaries of mi-‘mbe\rs.

Constituency allowance (o members.
Free transit by State Transport.
Travelling and daily allowance.

Medical attendance and treatment etc, to mem-
bers.

Provision for residence, telephone and stafl for
Leader of opposition.

Power to make rules,

Repeal. L oag | =




qeayem oad, faqis 1 v@d 1973

363

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 7 of 1973

MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN ‘SABHA SADASYA

VETAN TATHA BHATTA ADHINIYAM, 1972.

ed the assent of the Governor on the 29th January, 1973 assent

st published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazetle” (Extraordinary)
dated the Ist Fabruary, 1973.]

Act to provide for the salaries and allowances of mem-
bers of the State Legislative Assembly.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature * in
Twenty-third Year of the Republic of India as
WS ;—

. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh
dhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan Tatha Bhatta Adhiniyam,

2. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,—

(a) “Committee” means a Select Committee of the
Legislative Assembly or a Committee consti-
tuted under the rules of procedure of the
Legislative Assembly or a Committee appoint-
ed by the Speaker or the State Government
and includes the statutory Boards and the
Boards appointed by the State Government ;

(b) “Member” meang a member of the Madhya Pra-
desh Legislative Assembly, but does not
include—

(i) a Minister ;

(if) a Minister of State:
(iii) a Deputy Minister ;
(iv) a Parliamentary Secretary; and

(v) the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker of the
' Madhy-a Pradesh Legislative Assembly ;

riod begi

Short title,

Definitions,




364 _ asgvRy aoy, fatn 1 wad 1973 3

 Free transit by 5. Every member shall be provided with one free ngjj

. State Transport. transferable pass of the highest class which shall

ey - him to travel by any motor bus run by a State {ransp
I ! o it Jate hich

Travelling and 6. Every member shall be entitled,” while trave

daily allowance. 5 ublic business, to travelling and daily allowances.
such rates and upon such conditions as may be determ
by rules made by the State Government.

Medical allendan- 7. (1) Subject o any rules made in this behalf b
gfc_at':]dmh"e%t'?e"t the Stale Government, every member shall himself be ent
’ TS led Iree of charge, to accommodation in hospilals mai
tained by the State Government and also to medical tres
ment available in such hospitals as admissible to a Gao)
ernment servant under the rule making control of the Sta
Government drawing a pay of Rs, 225 per month or aboy

personally for himseli.

(2) Until rules are made under sub-secticn (1), rule
relating to medical attendance and treatment made by i
Governor under the proviso to article 309 of the Constit
tion of India shall apply to a member as they apply
aforesaid Government servant personally for himself, su
ject to modification that controlling autherity for the puj
pose of any claim of reimbursement shall be Secreta
Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha.

Provision for resi- 8. (1) The member who is the Leader of opposit
g;gcz'mﬁ“?g;?h"“" shall, in addition to whatever he is entitled tp as such m
Leader of opposi. Per under sections 3. 4, 5, 6 and 7, be entitled,—

tion.
on (a) without payment ¢f rent, to the use of a furnisl

ed residence at Bhopal for the period he is-{f
Leader of opposition and for the period of op
month immediately thereafter and no cha
shall fall upon the Leader of the opposition
respect of the maintenance of such residen

(b) at the cost of the Government, to the provis.
of a telephone at the residence provided to h
under clause (a):




weqgiw owa, feaiw 1 A0 1973

Provided that the charges for trunk-calls shall he
borne by the Leader of opposition;

(c) at the cost of the Government. to service ol a
typist and a peon.

(2) The expenditure to be incurred in respect of fur-
mishing of the residence provided under sub-section (1) and
he annual expenditure to be incurred in respect of upkeep,
nnual repairs and maintenance of such residence shall be
ubject to the same monetary limits as one fixed by section
of the Madhya Pradesh Mantri (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)
hiniyam, 1972 (No. 25 of 1972) and the rules made there-
nder in respect of a residence provided to a Minister under

he said Adhiniyam,

 (3) The date on which a member becomes or ceased to
e the Leader of the Opposition shall be published in the
azette and any such notification shall be conclusive evi-
ence of the fact that he became or ceased to he the Leader
f Opposition on that date for the purposes of this section.

(4) For the purpose of this section—

(a) “Leader of opposition” means that member who
is for the time being the leader in the State
Legislative Assembly of the party in opposi-
ticn to the State Government having the
greatest numerical strength in that Assembly
and il any doubt arises as to which is or was
at any material time the leader in that Assem-
bly of such a party, the question, shall be
decided, for the purposes of this section, by
the Speaker of the said Assembly and his
decision, certified in writing under his hand,

shall be final and conclusive;

365




% 3L&3- zﬁﬁﬂ-sr(m,}wmw fam Wiﬁr fawﬁrﬁﬁ saﬁrfﬁm forar
fei R& A Q@03 F A AT ALART A FT AR &, TG 6 G
sty & fad watfog fear smar 2

WEqWEE F USATIA & AH & qUT HRATIHIT,

3 1. W g9, afyq.




S

|l LAY 17/2002."

p VamdR ¥ gl I
e & TR yoE (e 3w
fee) % aw 3 g, wHE

& 2-22-TEiETg T3 1. .
i, feaiw 30-5-2001."

WIfter i | Wentvta

wAE 102 | TR, AR, &+ 24 3a 2002— ¥R 4, T7F 1924

fafy ik faurt = faum

T, fetie 24 37 2002

T 3104/21- SYURTN/. T./01. — TG A 7o 7 Froferfas sy, fom o Reaiw 18-4-2002 #1 TR
F 3TEf T 8 TH T, TS TR F IR F e yamtee fram wmr d

BHEE & TS & T T 991 AHAR,

203



204, THETG T, T 24 stdet 2002

ST ifuftem

F {(wFHiF 17 T 2002) .
BHIATE TqUrA WuT 9e (499, W auT U9 ) (e )
sfufran, 2002
oty faur v wEw (A9, s awr dw ) afufam, 1972 (= 7111'1973 ) @i

yr T % R A g vt g fratefen w6 o st
&

SR =T =T urty 1. (1) R AU adiwr fGuR oW v (39, T GYE) (FesA) sifufEm.
2002 (. 17 §9,2002) $FAI.

(2) e afufm Tees § yenE i aiE 8 ¥g949 3m.

wraa(m)wrEEE. 2. (TF) Bt faum Qi wew= (I, YA 9 HeA) afyfrem, 97z wuma (M W
wWiEg v I W F R WD e wnfag fFY e

) TG4 (M) F I W I " 37 T 5 T fod aigen faum T & e o mimfe
Ft ¥3Hi § wm A § 3 wfafer TR 250 3 W W wafew T sm ¥ fow g5,

“uzfa&wwﬂmﬁ&ﬁnwmm,m 26 WT=, 2002 & wifea Faam .

T, feTiw 24 37 2002

HHI 3104/21- SVAREIOVS. T1./01,— YA & €A ¥ TR 348 F TVS (3) F 7600 §, g f39m a0 727y
(3=, v o) (FehA) sfufm, 2002 (6. 17 T 2002) 1 SR SHETRE Touwrer & WU § UACER TR
= €.
BUETG & TST & 9 | qY1 SREOEET
. W, IFTET, I9-H{A,



st Tew, i 24 30« 2002

S

204 (1

v

CHHATTISGARH ADHINIYAM
{No. 17 of 2002)

'FHE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA (VETAN, BHATTA TATHA

PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2002,

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pen.«;ion)E Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattiggarh Legislature in the Fifty-third Year of the Republic of
India as follows '~er

1. (D)
@
2. M
@D

This Act may be calied the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2002 (Ne. 17 of 2002).

It shalt come into force from the date of its publication in the Gazette.

In Section 4 (c) of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension) Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973} for the word "three hundred" the words
"two hundred fifty" shall be substituted.

At the end of Section 4 (c) the words "Members shall further be entitled to daity
allowance at the rate of Rs. 250 per day for the days they attend meetings of
Vidhan Sabha or meeting of committees” shall be inserted.

Short title and com-
mencement.

Amendment in Nec-
tion 4 (¢).

Forefores, s e B T, BEOTE S WYY &g [orer, T @ it e wwfea—2002.



»

“Bd e % sl T

o

F TR YA (f =% i of gy 200,
&&2) % W ¥y apm. wAw :
- Sl 2-22-B4mg Ta/38 1R Q.
o, & 30-5-2001."
‘:, _
( TR ) . )

T F e

F? | FFI) TR, dren, R Ismﬁzo{)s—_m-zﬁ, TF 1926
TR, B 15wl 2005

I\u.«‘

FHE 1288/21-3 /916901704, —zﬁﬂmﬁuﬁwmrﬁn%ﬁaaaﬁzﬁmmwﬁmmn 02~ 200%a?t
mﬁmﬁrms‘rﬁfﬁ% Qmmuémﬂmﬁrmrﬁ%%qmﬁmﬁﬁmm%

m&mﬁéﬁmﬁwaﬁs@m,
fawer Rig wqx, v-wfa

61



62 .

sdrang twws, i 15 sl 2005

: | (mzm&zom) : |
mmmmm amam&m mﬁwmﬁﬁw 2004
fawg-gat
2 Em-z;a?résﬁa:r
3. _ﬁm—4$%rl=i?hu=f
4. UTI-4 @ ¥ AT

5. HWi~4 7T 7 G900

6. ON-4.5 F TG

r"»

7. HW-5 % FT gUMA

8. -6 % & TAEA

.

9. UI-6 | &7 v

© 10.9WT-7 1 & goveT



seTe o, Rl 15 Sl 2005

62 (-1) @

FE ' . (W1 27 ¥ 2004)
mﬁmwmm qmam&m,mﬁwaﬁﬁw 2004

mﬁﬁmwm,%m yaT aur Soer Srfuferm, 1912 (amm 78

' 1973)#&@%*@%@&&&#&
t IWW'_%qauﬁaéﬁmﬁmmmﬁm%ﬁaﬁmﬁ’wmﬁaﬁa
1. (1) . uaaafﬁﬁwmﬁma%‘mwmémmw gy e, 2004
- FHESHA,
(2) . =g afufow owe ¥ g & G 8 aweie Qo

2. aeieTg Fram @t wee &, war au AT et (1972 St 3@ 3O v 0

fifrm ¥ T & Pl &) o -4 ¥ v i e T e e e e

fear w13,

3. g AR =g F § TG I e e e e o,

4. qE sifm A am-s @ ¥ 9 C0F g %mw‘;am”wﬁaméﬁ.

5. uW-4 M ITURT (3D ¥ vum W Aafefad 78 Joary ey £ 9, sl -

@y AT o, P a e a6 S o a4 Aaw A 33

- 4 BT A,

WT-4 F HT G,
AHT-4 @ FTHAA.

AR-4 TN,

¥, 3 o Y T U1 I & a7 L) afify ) dow A A ¥ ow Rew

* qd, o ¥% & oF RY AR fousfif A dhoam’ v f @ s
3 R O F e AN

6. e i A4 1 3 qrrq e e s enfia £ T3, s -
“4 9 ST FEr FY RIAG o w0 9w g gimr fear 9.

7. oo e i aw-s F 8,

(Th) mrr( 1) ¥ 92 " quRe é;mmqtm‘q' ‘o @R w=e g
wﬁara:%@rrﬁaﬁz : '

C @) ITT (1) F T TgE F BIH X ﬁn%ﬁaawﬁnﬁamma
:ﬂwﬁi--

g, JNh R FAS GIE, A - aﬁ%am%wwaﬁrwﬁﬁ%m :

mmﬁmwm

af wtr-4 9 F1
TR,

qTT-5 % TG



. FeTe aadE, e 15 sEd-r005

62 (2)

WO-6 & I

-6 W HT @A |

-7 | HTENE

10.

o {aa{ﬁxﬁwaﬁm—sa%mmﬁnﬁs&ﬁwwﬁﬁﬁmﬁ,m;_

() mm(z)ﬁ,m“mm”%mmm"mlm“ wonrfir 20
m@raﬁwmm( %mﬁmﬁf@aw@aﬂtﬁmaﬁm
g b mmm&"mﬁmmaﬁq S-S ) g T
sft gagroad,

ngsaifirﬁwa?rmsmli‘rm fﬁqwmm"%wwm o g S
?&maﬁt .

“MTeE et adum ar s a3 R/ a1 gak v ol A &, W @

( ggra - aﬁmm%{émﬁg@%m%ma&ﬁm%mwm N
- ¥EA) g Eem gRe 4w '

t@saﬁ%{ﬁwﬁw—? linn?q' %mqﬁé”%mq{m“fﬁqm"m

fpmr S,
TR pmtiunT aoehihodr. o

B T - e osaumboonms

mrgt firyms +5 Al 2 2005 oI

ST 1288/ 21- a:/mﬁﬁ/m — YT ¥ VG & AT 348 21;@:3 (3) %Wﬁmﬁww

m%a? wmm(mﬁm)mﬁlﬁw 2004( . 27 B 2004} 1 S I7aR G-I F TIET F UHGERT

@ﬂm%m%mﬁwm
' frer Rie &, sv-gf.

-



62 (3)

CHHATTISGARH VIDHANSABHA SADASYA VETAN BHATTA TATHA PENSION

1

2,

CHHATTISGARH ADHINIYAM
(No. 27 of 2004)

SANSHODHAN ADHINIYAM, 2004

INDEX

SECTION

Short Title and Commencement
Amendrr-ient of section-4
Amendment of Section -4-A
Amendment ef Section-4-B
Amendment of Section -4-C

In Sedition of New Section-4-D
Amendment of Sectio'n -5-A

Amendment of Section -6-A

., Amendment of Section-6-B

10. Amendment of Section-7 1



insertion of new

Section 4-D,

Amendment
Section 5-A.

of

62-{4) B afrTg TeE, B 15 Wl 2005 :
CHHATTISGARH ACT | A,
{No. 27 of 2004) -
| S x*
THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA (VETAN,BHATTA
TATHA PENSION), (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2004 .
An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pensmn), Adhiniyam, 1972 (No 76f1973)
Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Leg:slature in the Fifty-Fifth year of .the Republic of
_ Indiaas follows - . =
Short. title and 1. - i _ This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh than Sabha Sadasya Ventan
Commencement. Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2004,
@)- It shall.come into force from the date of its publication in the gazette.
Amendment  of 2 In Section 4 of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetar Bhatta Tatha Pension)
Section 4. _Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafler referred to as the Principal Act), for the
words “Three Thousand” the words “Five Thousand™ shall be substituted.
.Amendment  of 3 In Sectibn 4-A of the Prirllcipal.Act for the words “ Four Thousand” the words “Five
Sectien 4-A. Thousand” shall be substituted. ~
Amendment = of 4 In Section 4-B of the Principal Aci for the words “One Thousand“ the words “Two
Section 4-B. Thousand” shail be substituted, ;
~ Amendment  of 5 For sub-section (it) of Sectlon 4-C the following sub~sectmn sha!l be subsumted
SCI‘.“'OI‘I 4-(;. nmely -
“(ii) For those days in which a member attend the meetings of Vidhan Sabha/

Committees. In Capital or out of State for such meetings member entitle
additional daily allowance at the rate of Rs. 250/- per day before a day and
after a day of date of such meetings.”

6 Af‘ter Section 4-C of the Pripcipal Act, the followmg Section shall be mscned
namely -
“4.D. There shall be to eve!jf member‘stationery all(')wah'cc of Four Thousand

rupees per mensem.”

=~

*In Section 5-A of the Principal Act, - .

{i) in sub-section {1} for the words “Seventy Five Thousand” the words “One
Lac Twenty Five Thousand” shall be substituted.

(i) - for first proviso of the sub-section (4} thé following proviso shall be subs-
tituted, namely -

“Provided that every member shall entitle for both side Five Alr Journies
with one person accompanying him”,

© (i) In sub-section (2), for the words “Fdrt'y Thousand” the words “Sixty Thou-
- sand” shal! be substituted; and after sub-section (2) the following prowso _
shall be added, namely -

F il



. mwm 15 %E 2005

wqr_ds “three thousand” shall be substituted.

r

Section 7-1.

A, HEU A S\ i, ST {1 e A RAveE, AT § HRE Au g --2005.

62 ()
’5‘ “Provided that such person within limit “Sixty Thousand™ shall eneitie
for Three Air Journies™. ' '
8. In Section 6-A of the Principal Act, for the words “Three'.'l“housand Five Hundred” the Amendment of
: words ** Ten Thousand™ shall be substituted. Section 6-A.
9. For Section 6-B the following Section shall be substituted, namely :- Amendment  of
. ’ . : Section 6-B, ’
“6-B. There shali be paid a penston of rupees five thousand per mensem to
_ the spouse if any or dependent of a member/ex-member for a period of ten .
‘ years from the date of his death”.
10. - .In Section 7-1 of the Principal Act for thc words “ one thousand five hundred” the  Amendmeat  of



LS

|
wela iR & arale e
weow & TG yam (FeT ers
) & T ¥ .
- 2-n-giigne aas R 8,
icfid, fawie 30-5-2001,""

Yt wals BRR AT
W, 114/-009/2003/20-01~03. "

O I B A RN B ¥
i s

fafts afR feremrdt & foarom

WL, fittas 10 T 2007
Bk, 171721305178, 1./07.—wfveg T o w1 P st fiw w s 06-08-2007 B
e ¥ 1 ¥, aEr e 8t SR ¥ R s b R .

Ry 5 T T 2 T AR,
ferwren et gy, wo-ufem.

455



456 | - mwm,mwmzuw .

B?ﬂquaﬁrﬁmr o o«

(mimsmzoon

o mﬁ ﬁwﬁwmm wﬂrmﬁm(wﬂw)
e aifiPrm, 2007

TR U 9T a3 e, ww&maﬂlﬁw 1972 (&WIS 7'«=U973)a€t
mmmm

TN wwuw#mﬁaﬁﬁ%ﬁmmfwmﬁﬁwm
W“WW T () ™ mmﬁmﬂmmﬂqﬁuﬁwméﬁ war g Y9 (H)
| SfuFrm, 2007 YA,
(2) ¥ TeITA 7 P WA ot iR R Waw I,

s w2 adReg T w3, v e SR afbiam, 1972 (s 7 9 1973) (S v v
vyarg ge Afutem & s e 1), & v s-w ¥,

I (2) & A W Rt sl 6 g -

“(2) w6 (%) % anfia S ¥ weReR Wl wafe & 3R Al & sl T aes)
T 090 TR 3R 69 Hay 3 R S, e w T s e % wa o e
o & 9 AT Ay WIS TR 93 RS ¥ e W em i, e i 1@ e
P TR EOR ord" = v F @ v ann A ¥ o v R

TR, Al 10 A 2007

. iR 7028/ 17V -SU/B, TL107.—WIRA 6 P % TR 348 % W0E (3) ¥ sygwew o weey P ww
R AR, Vi e (W) AR, 2007 (AT 8 6 2007) F iR SRR Toaret SRR & Qg W
ooy T ¥
mwtmﬁfmﬂmm
mmw,. T



v - Sy T, fei 10 SRRR 2007

456 (1)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
{ No. 8 of 2007)

THE CMA’ITISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
E PENSION (SANSHODHAN} ACT, 2007

wom, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

ﬁe 1t mqndby the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Fifty-enghm year of the Republtc of India
iqllmws —

|x|

i 1)“ I| This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabba Sudasya Vetan, Bhatta
" Tutha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2007.

(2) ~ It shall come into force from the date of its publication ia the Officlsl Gazette.

tn Section 5-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhetta Tatha Pension)
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), (hereinafter refered o as the Principal Act) .—

- Bt aub-sectmn (2), the following sub-section shall be subsutuwd —

"?ﬁj Every person entitled for pension under section 6 (A), subject to such rules which

~ maybe mede by State Government shall be eatitled to coupons of Rs. Sixty

thousand value during one financial year for journey alone or with one person and

that such persons shall also be entitled to journey by air within the limit of such
coupons of “Rs. Sixty thousand"."

1¢ther to ainend the Chbattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasys Vetan, Bhatta Tatha

Short titte and Com-
mencement.

Ameudment of Sec-
fion 5-A.

e, g wat A T, STy G0 WROAS mm Tt § i T 2007,



fé& o } ) 0
i Ph i ! i
P A R
j ' ! || .
o
Frrwm e ¥ s o iefa w odraTE g

W ¥ TRy (e =
fee) W Syo) 4y STA. FER
= 2-22-BfTg w38 fE. B,
Tirem, fetiw 30-5-2001.”

BETEIE TSI
( TR )
T | yamiyra

FA® 130 ) T, AR, e o of 2008 —Avma 19, ¥ 1930

T, 114-009/2003/20-01-03."

Fafr e Pt st fart

uATE, T oAl R v, T
W, B o w2008

W 4846/135/21 - /91 /. 1. /08.— Sl Rram o av efinfias i fae w RAiE 01-05-2008 81
mﬁwﬁrmﬁgﬂa, @mﬁmﬁmﬁ%h_m%%mt.

BT % T & AW T AROEER,
_ g, ¥. #fear, 39-vfm.

259



260 witamg e, A 9 7f 2008
>
Fiftarg sifufm
. (@7 10 §92008 )
-
ety fravy avir ager a9, war oo 09 (G srfifam, 2008
wftamy frar awr wew Aa, war oy Y s, 1972 (wui® 799 1973)
* st aive we g wii. -
o T TR & JT63 I A S frum-seger g RedeRe o ge ofifafia s .-
L et A
ﬁﬁnﬁammm. 1. (1) il s aitre T oderg Raae s Jaw, w90 aw See (avie)
B ' siyfran, 2008 FEAEW. .
(2) ﬂmﬁﬂ%mﬂmﬁmm.
v, 2. qy ffian & aecd & FevR R g aae 3o, o o e e, 1972
(FH1% 7 89 1973).
AR 54 W WO, 3. (1) o bR RS- e (1) ¥ et T OF @ T e
H [ IR wR A e wuTiie R IR
(2) @ Afufyaw & 90 s-F H I (1) F ARG & 1T |/ Pt
warfee fn T, S -
g T R ST T s e st 3 g o 3 v e
w3, Bt O waTd AR ot 55 o R ad 60 & et & arftres v Al
a’n-QS .
(3) u@ wuPEm 6 urs-F H m(z)ﬁm‘mmm"%mw
X T O I wnfia far
(4) o wRfm & ovrs-F B Iour (2) ¥ oF, T oY WS (F)
T T 30 o I “6-a" Sfererii Rar i,
IFCT -3 Y FR. a. e Sifian A aTw 6-% (1) ¥ fdra v F o) a1 et ¢ we W RERE A TS
QT Y152 “TT B/ TR il 94" 3. 2rig P 114
°T 6-% %1 AWM.

w7 (1) e

5. e wfefam 9 6-1 % v W Peafeian sfrenfia £ s, sty -
“6-11. W SARRT, WY WIT 6-% & efiy 4w 31 T &, P wfogfe &
Peet g & R arv7(2) ¥ WHeY g & maﬁWMmﬁmqﬁm
ﬁfuﬁ?amm‘ﬁ&mm”

6. e ifirfran & arg 7 4 IA (2) ¥ wag ok @ & R A e e s,



sy vaw, R 9 A% 2008 260 {1)

¥

s I s g, Fais 9 v 2008
0 O LT i .
o i(lﬁri%.‘s#o!ns/zl-aﬂm./s. 1./08, —— ¥V ¥ GRIYE ¥ AR 348 F vz (3) ¥ anganor ¥ aframg Rrart e
e 3, W A (Haive) afiFia, 2008 (T 10 €9 2008) B ST SITETE TR 3 TR & GAQERT
foraran . ' .
FETY % RIS & T & T TR,
Cooe . . %. &wifear, W-8ha.

CHHATTISGARH ACT
{No. 10 of 2008)

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA
TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2008

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhian Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Peasion Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legisiature in the Fifty-nineth year of the
Republic of india as follows -

1. ) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sedasya Vetan, Short title snd
Bhatta Tatha Pension {Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008. Commenttment,

| ) It shall come in to force from the date uf its publication in the Official
' Gazefte.

-~

Principal Act means the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Definitions. -
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

3. (4)] In sub-section {1) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act for the words Atsendwent of
“ Rs. One Lac Twenty Five Thousand” the words “ Rs. Two Lac” ghall be ~ Section SA.
substituted.

@) Forfirstproviso of sub-section (1) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act, ihe
following shall be substituted, namely -

“Provided that every member may travel alone or with one more
person subject to the condition that expenditure on the joumeys performed
by rail and air shall not exceed Rupees Two Lac in a financial year.”

(3)  In sub-section (2) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act for the words
“Rs. Sixty Thousand” the words “Rs. One Lac™ shall be substituted.

4) In sub-section (2) of Section S-A ofthe Principal Act for the figure, bracket
: and letter “6 (A)", the figure and Jetter “6-A™ shall be substituted.

4, in the second proviso to Section 6-A (1) of the Principel Act, afier the words * or Amcadmeni of
where a member having boen clected it a bys clection” the words “ orasamember  Section &A-
of Lok Sabha/Rajya Sabha” shall be insarted.



Poo2002) e T, B 9 2008 e

"
LN
{; : \: O) ’\ﬁ
| . v_

Amendmeat of 5. For Section 6-C of the Principal Act, the following shall be substituted. namely -
s 4. Section 6-C, "

- "6-C Every person who is entitled to pension under section 6-A. shall be

ertitled for medical reimbursement similar to claim under sub-section (2) of Seclion

7and shall also be paid medical allowance of One thousand five hundred rupees

per month.™
Amendment of 6. in sub-section (2) of Section 7 of the Principal Act. the words*‘for himsel™ shall ke
Section 7 (2). omitted.

7 thenm, e e At @R, Ty 2R QRARYG defi RO, i & A e ST -2008.



\
Yl i BRI/

o, 114-009/2003/20-01-03.”

e de ¥ ol o
TeF % TR Y (fan e
fewe) & Juor 3g AT, FHIE
R, 2-22-wrang /a8 L Q.
%ﬂé. Teien 30-5-2001."

W 236 ] TR, EaR, i 20 PR 2000— 4@ 29, WH 1931

fafyy o faurdt @ fawm

A, FaAte 20 30 2009

FHE 5689/151/21-3U/H1/B. 71./09.— BTG FIR w1 = Prefrfiam ifufirm frg v fis 17-08-2009 #1
T ITE i AR I € g1 ], COGERI IHEMT St AFRRRT % fa vl e sma
L .
ST % IRl % M QT AR,
YT FUR i, Iv-afE,

471



472 BT Tae, faie 20 SORE 2009

e sfufag
(N 6 W 2009)
A"
oo far qwr wew da, s e Sy (e ) siufm,
2009

el T qu v A, sTAeT Yy s, 1972(m71111973)'
Y o vy = ¥ P
- mmﬁmﬂﬁmmmmmmﬁ%aﬁﬁiﬁy
B — :

TR T . L 1. (1) waﬁﬁmaﬁa’@ﬁaﬂwmﬂaﬂ,wmﬂm(m) afafrm,
: 2009 FHEETA,

(2) g TR ¥ [ ey @t Ik & yaw s,

AT - W v, 2. Feirang faw aw o ¥, v ow e Afufem, 1972 (R 7 @ 1973) $ 8
4-% T 9= “TF TIT” F TH T IR T TR F1 W = ufreenfim fea i,

TR, &% 20 a3 2009

FUE 5689/151/21-F/H1/8. 1./09.— WA F Wfaum ¥ ATDT 348 & WIS (3) ¥ e § guteng faur
T ST AT, M A9 G (A Sfufem, 2009 (M 6 T 2009) T SIS AR TSI § WVHR R GREN
T frn s §.

mﬁmﬁmﬁmm
IAT FER @fean, I9-afea.



Tl T, Rt 20, TR 2000 472 (1) (__}D

CHHATTISGARH ACT
{No. 6 of 2009

_;-THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2009

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No, 7 of 1973) .

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislatire in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

€ ! (1)  This Actmay be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta  Short tile  and
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2009. Commencement.
(2) 1t shall come into force from the date of its publication in the “Official
Gazette”,
2. In Section 4-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Taths  Amendment of

Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) for the words “One Thousand” the words ~ Section 4-A.
“One Thousand Sevan Hundred Fifty” shall be substituted.

T, TRV A R GET, SN BRI Irea el R, TeAE & i T e —2009.



(1)
- * ﬁ ) -
“SarETE09/2010-2012."

-

e YR <l 3w
o & TRy (e e
feF2) ¥ Yoo Y R0, HHH
- 22- BTG e /38 faL A
fum, fei® 30-5-2001."

gt 9 wERTiTa

FUF 138 ] R, Fuar, T 5 7 2010—370 15, 7 1932

fafiy afr faurdt ®rf faum

TR, fefw 3 7 2010

. 5009/104/21-3V9L/B, T./10.— TR faum o ® Prafafas sfufiam fw W) &7 26-04-2010 |
TqA &t afa W 8 g ¥, g weunmRe Y IREd) % fae yeim R e

BARIG F TSI F AT {7 AW,
. R wrovr, s9-afe.

275



276 Y Bty e, fadia 5 7 2010
seramg afafran
> (AT 4 T 2010)
mﬁmwmm STNIT T Y9 ( WY )
ey, 2010
BT faens w5 A9, AT v Yers siufas, 1972 (FuiE 7 89 1973)
W 3 deifim w0 i afifrnr
mm%mﬁaﬁﬁmﬁmﬁ—mmmmﬁwﬁm
Tl '
RIS AAIWN, 1, (1)  ur sfufem odwe fagm |y wew 359, war o ¥3E (ges) sifufm,
2070 FHEEHITL

(2) o% TI9H ¥ S WEEE S 0@ | Y99 o

Ty 3 W Sl 2. TG faum o I dm, v S v sfufem, 1972 (R 7 w1973) (S
T T SO S R we W ARE ) SR 3 F, v ww TR v A #
| W v R T Wi e sl

wnawdwe. 3 o sfufEs § trrmﬁ,mz“qiaﬁrr'%?wm W g oS g Sfeeaf e
eI

WU, 4, @ AMUfN ) 410 4-G B, 1“0 §IR ¥ TW I 9 ger wheedi fe
I, '

URT3-NHIEIGL 5. et SfUfae 9T 4-1 i I9UR (9) H, K uiE W S9rR F W WO
o wurr gigenfia fem 9.

w7 w1 Hyih, 6. T Afufrae w5 g 7 w5 IR (1) F, 1 0w TR 9 @ v F A W IR D

FR i 9y wlerafye fsw ol

TR, fetiw 3w 2010

F. 5009/104/21-3/TL/B. /10— WA % TAuM ¥ 57 348 F wvE (3) ¥ orpwey ¥ wetang faum o
W Ja, v e Yo (Fey) sfufiem, 2010 (i 4 §92010) ® SN SR Tewa ¥ SRR R TEEEN

w1 fea s &,

IR & TS F T | 74 FRUAER,
#. 0. yrovR, Sy-gafa.



TETIg e, A 5 7§ 2010

276 t])

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 4 of 2010)

‘YHE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2010

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
tha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-first year of the Republic of
'ndu as follows :-

{1 This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhaita
Tatha Pension (Sapshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010.

2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication jn the Official Gazette.
In Section 3 of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pensicn
* Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the
words “One Thousand Five Hundred™ the words “Seven Thousand” shall be substituted,

In Section 4 of the Principal Act for the words “Five Thousand” the words “Eight
Thousand” shall be substituted.

In Section 4-B of the Principal Act for the words “One Thousand” the words “Five
Thousand™ shall be substituted.

In sub-section (i)} of Section 4-C of the Principal Act for the words “Five Hundred
Ninety Five” the words “Seven Hundred Fifty” shall be substituted,

In sub-section (1) of Section 7 of the Principal Act for the v}ords "One Thousand Six
Hundred Fifty" the words “Two Thousand Five Hundred” shall be substituted.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Section 3,

Amendrnent of
Section 4.

Amendment of
Section 4-B.

Ameadment of
Section 4-C.

Amendment of
Section 7.

WA, TR 3T S0 W STy SR YRR frdta yEomer, et & i e wefi— 2010,



k

frm R ¥ gwnin I
TEF ¥ PR paa (e =
ﬁ:ﬁ) & Yy Y A, IS
. 2-22-se WA L |
fuem, famiar 30-5-2001."

Witaq wHiE
“FHRITR/ET/09/2010-2012."

A 4

« | ( STETYIOT )
Wit |yt

¥RE 139] - PR, yEaR, feiw 7 v 2010--3ar 17, v 1932

fafy ai faurht wrf faam

AR, R 792010

‘ F. 5080/107/21-V./B. T1./10.—SHTE faer T Frfafar sifufrm ﬁm R &% 30-04-2010 & -
J T ) s R g R, g st 9 s 3 fg, vt Rpa o E,

wior & TR & 19 R A S,
- 3. @ qRwR, 39w,

277



M

78 S  weteg o, R 7 w2010
- I (i 7 99 2010) L M
BETaIRg fauT e wew A, WA Y (i)
- . afufraw, 2010 - |
wﬁwwﬁumwm&aw wmmmﬁxﬁm 1972 (%RI% 7 67 1973)
T IO 5 T o 1 e P e g P w0 7 sffrabi
WL 1. (1) ¢ sl iR WWWWWWW(W)W _
| 2010 FEAT. - | »
(2) 71O, mamm .
oW (1) W 2 'aﬁmﬁaﬁmm%ﬁwmﬁmaﬁﬁuﬁ,mi(mnvmms)ﬁﬁm
| wle - () TR A R & R Fawer ¥ wel v e
!
?\_.
mﬁt’,ﬁﬁimsfﬁi‘mw

. Ow soaonowm—awm.11./10.—%%?%@1%!%mﬁtm%@_(s)a;mﬁ g )
7 A, v e S EiR) RfufEe, 2010 (ot 7 T 2010) 1 SIS TR TR TR | e

Ty 5 T 5 R RO,
%, . wrowm, 9-wiaE.




sHwTg T, faiw 7 W 2010

278 (1)

'CHHATTISGARH ACT
-] : (No. 7 of 2010)

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA YETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2016

An Act further to amend the Chhaitisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasys Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pensnon Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhamsgarh Leglslatu.re in the Sixty-first year of the Republic of
Indla as follows :-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010.

[¢)) It shall come into force from the 15t November, 2000.

_ ‘2 . In the second proviso to Section 6-A (1), of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha S:tasya

Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), after the words “dueto
* dissolution of Legls!auvc Assembly or” the words *“due to resignation or™ shall be
- inserted. . - '

Short title and
commencenent, )

. Amendment of
. Section 6-A (1),

<, T e S A SRR 5 S i YR, T Q i e w2010,



R e & sl B
e & TR g (femr Sk
T ) & Juo 8 SHA. WS
A 22 /38 T, .
fuarg, fesiw 30-5-2001."

o (18)
- BRETRA09/2010-2012."

. WITYERR | WeRTioT

HHIE 166 ] TR, haw, feAiw 6 7 201 1—3W9 16, ¥ 1933

forfer ol furh wrf faum

TR, fediw 7 7 201

T 3336/113/21-3/9./3. /1. —wrwrs faw o w1 Frfafas sifufms g w feiw o3-0s-2011 =1
AT Ft A A A YH R, GG FERmor ) At ¥ fed e e o ¥

BUFE % ToHUIE & A § 76 SIRWIAER,
' &, YR, ol sfefy ufes.

CEY



332

YT T, faArE 6 wE 2017

SR 6-% FE GV,

ST 6~ T Vi,

LY 677 T I,

'i?“'_"

1.

(FH 12 |9 2011)

mﬁmwmaﬂq T AT Y9 ( G9ie )
arfafrem, 2011

FHATE AU W I AAA, W qun 9y sifufrrs, 1972 (&wWiE 7 991973 )

=t Sl syt w3 3 rfufrm,

I TR 3 e Y § weRwg et gro feeteieEn w1 g sfutai

(1) T Hfutas sdareg faum s T B, v e Y (SNeR) siefm, ";:
2011 SFEETTE.,

(2) W T99A H §9E WHNR H 9@ | Wb 1 |

ST T S e 3, S e 9 SfaRm, 1972 (I 7 T 1973) (S

T Tra g sifafem % T S RE §) % o= = 39w (1) § v om e

<+ T T U WAE T wieetid fhe wa.

T AT B G 6T W W 4 T & WA RO S S Wi fea
.

et AfufTam 3 R 6T H ¥ “TF F9R UiE 69 F ™H W R "q'\mmaﬁr
Wit fra TR,

W, faqis 7 73 20m

FAF 3336/112/21-3/L/B, W11 —9RF & HfauM & 7708 348 F WL (3) F wprn § satarg faam
W HEE AT, W e 99 (Eeee) aifufim, 2010 (m1zmzon)mmmw$mﬁ
CEREIT WIfer T e &,

m%m%wﬁmm,
3. . wait, sfafs wfea



e T, A 6 W 2011

332 (1)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No, 12 of 2011)

~~THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA
TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN)} ADHINIYAM, 2013

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
. Tatha Pension Adhinivam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legisiature in the Sixty-second year of the Republic
of India, as follows :—

1. (N This Act may be caited the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazene,

b

In sub-section (1) of Section 6-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan,

Bhatta Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), (hercinafter referred to as the

Principal Act) for the words “*Ten Thousand” the words *Sixteen Thousand™ shall be
substituted.

3. In Section 6-B of the Principal Act, fer the words “five thousand” the words “Eight
Thousand” shall be substituted. :

4. In Section 6-C of the Principal Act, for the words “One thousand five hundred” the
words “Two Thousand Five Hundred” shall be substinuted.

Short title and
commencement,

Amendment of
Section §-A,

Amendment of
Section 6-B.

Amendment of
Sectian 6-C.

-m,mmmmmmmmw,mmﬂmwmﬁm—mu



. , o B,
e ez ¥ ow o
1o F T gEE (9 o
W, 2-22-Fdoe /38 fa. B
firemd, feim 30-5-2001"

EEIDEE TiCT
“FHITE/ST/09/2010-2012.”
Y

wHIE 7-8 ] | T, YEEn, faiE 13 et 2002~ 23, v 1933

fafy v faaml @ fawm
ARG, SIS Hear fe w37, I9R

TR, i 13 s7af 2012

WHIF 254/, 13/21-3V/B. 1!.;12.'—3'1%11#@ T won F Freafafea afufam feg w &t 07-01-2012
F T F AR Ta @ 9§, TgR R # wAedl ¥ forn weifes e or 3.

wdiremg % ToUE ¥ A & a9 IRV,
. . urweR, 3u-wiEa,

1% (1)



14 (2) . SR IR, A 13 e 2012

(mzmzou) ~
aﬁmwﬁumwmém uﬂrawﬁm(wﬁm)
afufrm, 2011

B faum awr mer A, wmmﬁ‘wnlﬁ:ﬁm 1972 ( ®AIE 7 /{1973 ) -
. ol vt o i adufem.

A TR ¥ WA T § S faum e gRy fretftea w9 | ar st
A :

Tifirs W o YR 1. (1) wﬁmﬁlﬁmaﬁwﬁﬂﬂmmw yar a9 (Heie) afufTan,
2011 HEER.

(2) % U99E © 0% YEVA i AR ¥ wEE T
WA THRERE. 2 e faem i age A, war au Yem sifufvas, 1972 (i 7 991973) FUR

4-7 Y 39-uG (D) A, T 9 WOEEET F o R O w6 = wienit
T o,

TR, fie 13 F7a 2012

HURH 254/, 13/21-3VLAB. T./12.—¥RT & Wigye F HTRT 348 F T8 (3) F smo & BHws faum
Y HT o, mwﬁ‘mgmw;aﬁﬁm 2017 (FA 2 W7 2012 ) F1 S AR T=00d F JFHR § g
v e e 2.

SEEG F YU & AH A qH IRWIAR,
. ¥t gragR, ST-ufed.



THIETE TFTS, 157 13 T 2012 14 (3)
W T T T L T L L e e e e e e e e e e —
CHBATTISGARH ACT
iNo. 2ar 2012)
NTHE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA
TATHA PENSION (BANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2011
AnAct further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhao Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Peasion Adhiaivam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).
Be it enacted by the Chkattisgarh Legisizture in the Sixty-second Year of the Re-
pubhic of {ndis as Tollows —
t. (1 This Act may he calied the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhata Short and
Tatha Pension {Sanshadhan} Adhiniyvam. 2011, commencement.
{2y It shall coine o force from the date of s publication in the (Official
Gazette.
. i sub-section {h} of Sectian 4-C of the Chhatsisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sudasya Veraa, Amendment of

Bhatta Tatha Pension Adkiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), for the words “Five Hundred ~ Settion 4-C.

Ninety Five™ the words “Seven Hundred Fifty™ shall be substitwed.

FIRE, TV o SR AR, B‘amvrem—x R T, TR %‘m}q}mﬁ-_ o



AT

f’\ig '

ol wEE S
I T/09/2010-2012."

Masg U ® AT S
TF & TR YA (fsn =@
fee ) & Tow R 9. FHF
i, 2-22-Beteg /38 T A,
4704, R 30-5-2001."

H® 206 1 TR, FHER, fodiE 1 3 2012— 9@ 10, v 1934

fafy afix faurdt =rd faum

TR, faiw 1 3 2012

BHIF 6423/, 170/21-3VWE./B. W12, —wurag faum aw =1 frefafes afufem fg w e 28-07-
2012 B U FI LA I & gt €, CEr wdanmem £ EER ¥ o gt e e

TUIG & TI9E & A9 | 997 ARAER,
&, W, e, stfafam afea.

am



412

TFixw TR AT g,

2T & -9 T AT,

YT 6-<h 2T HeEL

T 6T T YW,

e I ol
BTG T, s 1 3/ 2012 =

b

BT Afufan

(FH® 15 T 2012)

TG FAMPTT WEET 36, TR S (Heie ) A
situfrEm, 2012

e teTE Farerr R W e, SN A A s, 1972 (i 7 91973 )

=t oire vt T g s

R

1

ura 1o & fmed o § sty faurrved R Preafafee wg § 9w sfubfim

(1) Tz sfafrm e faue we wee A9, S e e () sififem,
2012 HEAA, :

(2) &% U9 § 3HF Y9 & aiig @ 999 .

(1)  wiileg faum /W vee a9, W e deA atfufam, 1972 (i 7 w7
© o 1973), (1 Tl 3 TR Ha afulegr % w0 F fide ®) # am s-w w5t
FTI-YRT (1) QN IEF T F{TF H, T TE G T F W W IR T

& e et fran o,

(2) == AfufrEs F) U 5-% F 39-91G (2) ¥, IR TR UE AR F W W

e AuFEa = U 6-F % SU-URT (1) ¥ Y W H, K <3 8 T8 & '|E W
v ot R T wfrefre g iR W <arfaRe deE € i & v e
“3it 7y ot fir afs frdt wfag 3 55 38 @ aifis &6 wemafy ¥ a3 geie w1 F @t
for ), A 3Q 29 o | s F v4F 99 F v R & v wfenw sifafiem dvm &
st @i gl forddt wafi Y v o | ofiren = ety & el peifaa = F el g
T, 1 38 =T 99 € SR & T oy F o o € v wiwe afafea T @ e
e W=,

Tt fafrm %t uw 6-a F WA W frefafes mwﬁaﬁ%aﬁ, JUT :—

«Ferelt Treea 1 ogd wee ¥ afaf afe 9 €, 9 snehe m sws iy =, ing ad
ﬁwﬁu%hﬂ,wwaﬁm%mﬁmmmmmﬁaﬁrﬁr

AR, &7 1 3 2012

T 6423/, 170/21-3/3TE./B. T1./12.— I ¥ TRINH % ST 348 F WUE (3) ¥ Fge § wdtag
fae | W A, s oo v (deem) afufrm, 2012 (FEE 15 §9 2012) 6 SR AR TR ¥ TGFR

& gaegrr wanidm e sm &

mﬂw%mt#ﬁ#wm,

&, . wlt, st g

v



g —m = e

eiteg oA, T 1 STt 2012

412 (1)

CHHATTISGARK ACT
(No. 15 of 2019)

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA

TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012

- An Act further to amend the ChhatﬁsgarkVndhnn SabhaﬁAdmya Vetan, Bhatia

Tatha E‘emnon Adhiniyam, 1972 (Ne. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legistature in the S1xty th1rd Year of the Republic

of India, as follows :—

.

4))] This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan §abh_a Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta

Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012:

2) It shall come into force from the date of its. publication in the Official
Gazette. :

(1} In sub-section (1) and its first proviso of Section 5-A of the Chhattisgarh
Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Adhiniya, 1972 (No. 7
of 1973), ( hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the words
“Rs. Two Lac™ the words “Rs. Three Lac” shall be substituted.

2 In sub-section (2) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act, for the words
“Rs. One Lac™ the words “Rs. One Lac Fifty Thousand” shall be substituted.

In the first proviso to sub-section (1) of Section 6-A of the Principal Act, for the
words “two huadred rupees” the words “three hundred rupees™ shall be substituted
and after the words “in excess of five years” the words “and if any person has served
as aforesaid for a period exceeding ten years there shall be paid to him an additional
pension of four hundred rupees per mensem for every year in excess of ten years and
if any person has served as aforesaid for a period of more than fifteen years there shall
be paid to him an additional persion of five hundred rupees per mensem for every
year in excess of fifteen years:” shall be added.

For Section 6-B of ihe Principal Act, the following Section shall be substituted,

namely :—
“There shall be paid a pension of rupees ten thousand per mensem to the spouse, if

any for life or to a dependent of a member or ex-member for a period of fifteen years
from the date of his death.”

Short title

Amendment
Section 5-A,

Amendment
Section 6-A,

Armendracnt
Section 6-B,

and |

of

of

of .

G, TR 8 K W, ST TR e dndia o, gemienia R ke v wefi—2012.



o & e e (e oes e gi09/2012-2015."
feme) & Saqw 2 . HAIE - :
- Hp-n-odegTzas A R |

?ﬁi, festiar 30-5-2001."

S o | (smm)
| w&lmﬂumrﬁm

TR, m, fein 15, aﬁﬁ_ 2013—85 zs._w _1935

w153 ]

TAR, ﬁ?ians i 2013

L o 3025021 109/21-3/NTE/B., nm—whwﬁwﬁmwﬁv@ﬁaastfuﬁmmqtmos 04—
zmsﬁmaﬂwﬁmﬂﬂﬁ% mmﬁmtmmﬁmmmz - .

L
e 12 7 ST
L

L
. .
et

R



s N mmmwm 2013 o ‘ _ =
. (miﬂi " mzma) - el

-d&ﬂmimmﬁ

AT 2 BT WY,

e swde.

" G 4 W HEAA

ST 4% T WeR.
ROTER L T

C AT 7 AN

mﬁuﬁwm'&aﬂ wmﬁm(wﬂm)

aiﬁxﬁrqtr 2013

mmmmm mmﬂmar&:ﬁm 197z(m 71411973)

A

| ﬁwmma@m

| wm%ﬂmﬂ‘ﬂﬁaﬁmﬁaﬁ mmﬁmﬁh«mﬁﬂzmﬁuﬁa;_

(1) wmmmmmw q‘mmﬁm (m?m) mﬁm

. 2013 m&m

_(.i) wzmﬁﬁ:ﬁmaﬁm%mm

amt‘aerﬁwwm i e U9 SR, 1972 (m7 T 1973), (Sh e

wﬁmmwmﬁwtwﬁﬁﬁzt)m}mz%mm%w

 Freerm s 1, o~

“7) W%aﬁﬁa%‘@mﬁiﬁaﬁﬁww -

Waxﬁaﬁmm’tmaﬁm mmm %mﬁwm Wﬁﬁﬁﬁfw
uﬁmﬁaﬁm‘aﬁ '

qaeaf‘uﬁmaﬁumauﬁm mmm& %mwm agqa"rﬁﬁﬁﬁz* .

Eﬂmﬁmﬁma-ﬁm wmmﬁmmﬁmﬁer ﬁimwm S

o S il e e st v

: qgaafﬁﬁmwﬁamﬂuﬁm mmw&uﬁmuﬁmﬁ"#mm aﬂﬁ%ﬁﬁ‘

| -gaaﬁﬁm#&m:n—nﬁm*ﬁﬁm mﬂtmw&ﬂﬂﬁ"mﬁ%m' :
W= Wﬁﬁﬁﬁrmmm -

-v{aaﬁﬁmﬁmnﬁm—ﬂmmﬂm ﬂmﬁawﬁmﬂw%mwm

mﬁﬁ%Mﬁwaﬁ

.



e

L At i

. _'{ .

vl R s e2on 306 (1)

s "rmaamﬁmwr:aaan&qoaié%maﬁnaﬁﬁaaaéﬁﬁﬁumganafanﬁqz—- L e ow e

PO

w amedmma o
(1) (D 3y

U3 ' el & &M . T 10,000 WRETE

| YRT 4 ' . weEwmfate w0 T 25,000 YR

yT4-% 0 A v w3000 i
TN4w rdedt e T 10,000 e
aTq 47 Heswm oA 7soufafd

' faum s = &= Eﬁxﬁriﬁ't- Ty 750 whafea

B "&aﬁﬁmaﬁmaﬁtﬁm%- o
o7 (1) utﬁfahfaﬁmw L T 4,500 Wi

- mgz, fi 15 a!ia 2013

m.wzs/s'! 1097213V A mn—mtﬁhﬂﬁ%ag@:m%m(a)%mim-._'_ L

ﬁnﬁmmm ot (dﬁuw)’aﬂvﬁm. 2013 (m # 1:12013) Wmaﬁaﬁmﬁ;m'

GWWMW‘!

m%mtmﬂmm
tmmv& aﬁﬁwm ‘ '



36 (2)

Sittg W3, fim 15 ifter 2013

. mensem

- ) e
CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No 1 of 20!3)
~ THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATI‘A TATH‘Q-—
. " PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM 2013
An Actfurtherto amend the Chhatt:sgari'l V:dhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta .
-Tatha Penﬂon Adhimyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). '
"Be it enacted by the ChMisgarh Legislature in the Slxly Fourth Year of the
Re- pubhc of Indla, as follows :— :
_ - ' ' ~
- Short. ftle and |, 4] This Act maybecalled the; Chhamsgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta -
commencemcnt. Tatha Pensmn (Sanshodhan) Acihm:yam, 20!3 :
{2y - Tt shall come into forcc from the date of its pubhcauon in the Official ?
_ .Gazette .
_ Amendment of 2. .  Afterclause (c) of Section 2: of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sé.dasya Vetan, Bhatta -
Section 2. ' Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973} (hereinafter referred to as the Princi-
-pal Act) the followmg shail be added, namely :— :
*(d) “Schedu]e" means a Schedule appended to this Act.”
Amendrent _ of 3. In Section 3 of the Pnnclpal Act, for the words “of Seven Thousand rupees per menseny”
Section 3. * the words “as specified in the Schedule” shall be substituted.
Innmd-unt o 4. In Section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words “of Eight Thousand rupees per mensem™ -
Sectiond. - ' the words “as specified in the Schedule” shall be substituted. ' _ E
. N . !.‘
Amendment of 5. - InSection 4-A of the Principal Act, for the words “One Thousand Seven Hundred
Section 4-A. ' . Fifty per mensem” the words “of an amount as spec:ﬁed in the Schedule” shall be
substituted. L T
Amendment of 6 . InSection4:B of the Principal Act, for the words “Five Thousand rupees per mensem
Section 4-B. - * the words “as specified in the Schedule” shall be substituted. - o
Amendment  of 7 In Sectlon 4-C of the Pnnclpal Act, wherever occure the words “at the ratc of rupees S : }
., Sectlon 4-C. * Seven Hundred Fifty per day” the words “as specifed in the Schedulc" shall be substi- i
wied, e | i
Amesdmient  of g In Sub-section (1) of Section 7 of the Principal Act, for th'e'w;jrds “of Two Thousand SR
Section 7. Five Hundred per nwnsem the words “ag specnf ed in the Scheclule shall be .
subsmulcd o~
- Insertion of Schedule. g After Sacuon 10 of .the Prlnclpal Act, the fo!low:ng Schedule shail be added, _ i
' namely -—
[SeeSection2(d)] - - = - . o e
Section. ~ Pay/Allowance Particular . . Amouni.
-~ Section 3 L Salaries of members o Rupees 'io;mo‘p'e.-
Section 4 - Constitﬁéncy;allowmce for members -Ruj:eé’s 25.000 pcr .



e

o

306 (3)

witang vams; e 15 e 2013

ST

2

_ 3)
L Sect%on 4-A Teiephpne allowance . Rupees 3,000 per
A _ .mensem
' Section 4-B Ardali éﬂowace B . Rupees 10,000 per
v ’ C mensem
Section 4-C Daity Allowance Rupees 750 per day
Additional daily allowances for Rupees 750 per day
attending the meeting of Vidhan .
Sabha or meeting of Comunittees.
- Section 7 (1) Medical allowance to members Rupees 4,500 per
: : . ' merisern”

- TEw, T o At ael, SHheR e weE mmm,-m-ﬂgﬁjwm*;m;; .



, : L T - _M_—‘/{’ ,
“fam e & ol T . 4R FHF

T & R g (e =% et gl/092012-2015."
fewe) % T g 3. FUF
i n-sfeg s fa R,
forené, fet 30-5-2001."

W 183 ) TR, AAR, fiF 6 % 2013—8497@ 16, TF 1935

fafy afk faurht wrf fawm

TR, w6 7§ 2013

WHH 36858, 120/21-A/AK/S. T./13.—wHETE FAEE a1 W Srefaten sfufon fae W e 26-04-
2013 T ORI WY SR TR N Y ¥, WRER Wy 1 A ¥ ferg et fem e &

mtm#mﬂmm
mmﬂa sifufom wiaa.

365



366 wleTg oA, fotiw 6 B¢ 2013

B AfufEm |
(i 16 T 2013) | " N

BHraTg faur @oT WEH A, VT aur 99 (HyinesT )
atfufaam, 2013

BArATG T W T 3, =T oy I, atﬁ.lﬁw 1972(%7#11973)
E‘rsﬂtmﬂmmnaﬁrﬁum

NI TVR % Breed 1Y ¥ ovae faum-uee ora Frefefen w9 d w sfufwatm
o

R T T WL 1. (1) 3% iyl st faue 9w aee &aw, wan aw Yea (denm) afufas,
2013 SEEAA.

(2) 9% T ¥ 39% WHNHA $ a0E ¥ W9 . .

aRT 6-N TSGR, 2 FEaTG AU B S A, e a9 9vF AiYFEm, 1972 (FHE 7 991973 ) F W
: 6-11 % W “F TAR Ui G & T W W W TR Rfeeenfum i o,

m,ﬁaia:ewgzms

! I

HAIF 3685/%. 120/21—@913%3 nns—m%m%aﬁﬁam%m(s)%mﬁmﬁ
forart v w3 9, wwﬁn(mﬁ)m‘uﬁw 2013 (THIF 16 B 20713) i Sl TR THIA & WHER
A Ry et fea o .

T i, Sfafon wiA.



; FarTg Ted, faiw 6 8 2013 366 (1)
_9, - I R ] S
CHHATTISGARH ACT

(No. 16 of 2013)

THE CHUHATTISGARH VIDIAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA
TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2013

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatia
Tatha Pension, Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). :

Be it enacted by the Chhatisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-fourth Year of the
Republic of India as follows —-

t. (1 ‘This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta . Shert Wik smd
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2013, CommTRa—
{2) It shall come into force from the dale of its publication in the officis
saselie,
2. [n Scction 6-C of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Awvenduarat of

Peasion, Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), for the words “Two Thousand Five Sectien €-C.
Hurndred” the words “Ten Thousand™ shall be substituted.,

g o SYeR o, SIS g W i TR, TeAieniE | ika au) wEm— 2015,




£ e e ¥ kI g
R W { R 3w e ) ¥ o
¥ WA FEE d1.2-22-TRIR
TR [ 38 . & fiad, Bem

35-05-2001."
> 4

Gt F
“glverg gt/ 0s/2013-2015."

FRE 175 ] TR, AR, RAiE 29 e, 20t — wma 0, v 1938

fafty ofR foarft wrf

g, i 29 @1l 2016

FHIE 4228/, 144/ 21 -0/9%_ /BN /16 —Wﬁﬁmmwﬁnﬁqﬁa witfrm R e 12-04-2016F
TRI i SR AT @ e &, ST Seranm o A & S weiva e

BETE 3 T I & AT SATAER,
=, &, ¥, afvfe wfeE

349 -



Hipm wWm am

Lic S

sutus,

FaiEs.

R A
gniwe.

-5

-

L

L

w1

50 wedtgng nerT, fasi® 29 9 2016
’-;x P ————— ——= i —_—
i sitfag
(AT 17 7 2014)
i

vt faum awm gew 39w, v qw dyw (dme) sfufam, 2016

o=ty faur oW a2 A9, v gm dua aftifam, 1972 (6.7 €9 1973) W

ot vt Tt 3 st

urH oA ¥ wead o i weiony Rrae v am ReafsRaa e oy afufafea -

() qz it ol FRum A Ty 9w, B a1 e (ewne) afafes, 2016
EXGiluin

(2} T, trrA B 36 WA 6 A A

1 weioere TR T S Fa, War e T afifaam, 1972 (6. 7 E9901973), (e T e
o afrm & wu d faffe &), i um s 9 -
(OF)  IQ-UT0 (1) F 6w AT e AT ol g e W, we s J g
faffie” wirenfoa frr g, am
() 3U-um ) & A e o T TR & e T agEl § o fafaide”
1 e aftsfra i 4 6-F H 709 (1) B v Sl s sr uiaee” FerR T, we wTEE
e Tafabe” giaenim fem sm
4. TR AW F AR 6 - § W en e s ufmre | ¥ e w, v CuEet §ae fafaie
5. farerm et & wm o, Pt wlrenfta fem om, svatA -
[ 4 2(w) 86 )
wE r e aw
faamm
(1) (2) {3) (4)
1 uTa T & 4 wrd 20,000 THRE
1 U 4 wedl % i gt w7 30,000 HfaETR
SER G
3 uw 4-F TARER W T 5,000 wRER
4 upl 4-1 EEaikte TG 15,000 Wl



T 7AuE, e 29 i 2016 350 (1)

) {1 {1) (3} (4)

5 oI 4-7 (vx) i v (FF) T ¢ ooowfafad
@) Bum aw & 231 (31 E 1,000 WA
1 wiEf & FE & wm
A7 ¥ arfafean A

5. U S (1) wet ¥ fordt 71 v v WU 4,80,000 wiEd
AR

7. uRI 5-F (2) Wm%ﬁﬁiaqa' T 2.00,000 WS
AT W

8. YT 65 { 1) o= ST 10,000 WiEwE

9. YT -7 Wy et & ford Fafrem T 15,000 HRETG
W

. a1 7 (1) T ¥ T farfram wn T 1,000 whRmm.”

g, i 29 30 2016

FF 4228/ 144/21-3/9. /8. %./16 . — W F FAUR F 3= 348 F w0 (1) F oo § g\ v it
wrEers Afagen faiF 29-04-2016 T A 3 TS F WTUER H UEgERI Wi frarara g

SIS ¥ RN & AR E TU[ AETHAR.
= & @, wfafrm afaa. ¢



ot WA, i 28 ada 2016

el

Short tide
commencement.

Amendment
Scotinn S-AL

Ameadment
Segtion 6-A.

Amendmenr
Sectiaon &-(.

Amendment
Schedule,

and

of

af

of

of

CHHATTISGARH ACT
{No. }70f 2015}

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINTYAM, 2016

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabhz Sadasya Vetan, Bhattu
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7o 1972),

Be it enacted by the Chhantiszarh Legisfature i the Sixpy-sevemh Year of the Republic
of India, s foliows -

1 (n This Act n.my be called the Chhattisparh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan. Bhaua
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan} Adhintyam. 2016.

(s} tr shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Garetie,

2 I Section 3-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension
Adhinivam, {972 {(No. 7ot 1973, (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Acth.-
{i in sub-section (1), for the words “Rs. Three Lac™, wherever they occur, the
words “as specified in the Schedule™ shall be substituled: and
tii} in sub-section {2), for the words “Rs. One Lac Fifty Thousand”, the words “as
specified in the Schedute™ shall be substituted.
3 I sub-seciion (1) uf Section 6-A of the Principal Act. for the words ~Sixteen thousand
rupecs per mensem”, the words ~as specitied in the Schedule™ shall he substituted,
4, In Section £-C of the Principal Act. (o the words “Ten thousand rupees per month”,
the words “as specificd in the Schedule™ shall be substituted.
5 For the existing Schedule. the followins shall be substituted. namely -
“SCHEDLE
[ See Section 2 (d} !
5. No. Section Puy’Allowance Amount
Particubar
(m ) 3 4
1 Section 3 Salaries of Member Rupees 20,000
per mensem
2 Section 4 Constityency allowance Rupees 30,000
for member. per mensem
A Section 4-4 Telephone allowance Rupees 5,600
per mensem
4. Section J-B Ardali allowance Rupees 13,000

per mensem



GG 1A, ﬁmm 29 c-m}a 2016

0

N - .
(1} @) (3) )
el Section 4-C (i}  Daily allowance (i) Rupees 1.600
per day
{11} Additional daily allowance (i) Rupees 1,000
for atending the meeting of per day
Yidhan Sabha or meeting of
Committees,
6. Section 5-A(1) Rat and Air Travel for members Rupees 4,(0,000
’ per year
7 Section 3-A(2) Rail and Aur Travel for ex- Rupees 2,00,000
members per year
g Section 6-A(}) Pension Rupees 20.000
per mensem
g, Scetion 9-C Medical allowance for ex- Rupees 13.000
members, per mensem
10. Section (1} Medical allow anice to members Rupees 10,004

per mensein,”

HATE, g 1 A5 welt, SR 3wy Rgd, wage & i A i - 2014



BTG Wy, faTiE 24 07 2002 204 ¢
CHHATTISGARH ADHIMIYAM
(No. |7 of 2002}
THE CHHATTISCARE ViDHAN SABHA S£IFASVA (VETAN, BHATTA TAVHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2002.

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya(Vetan, Bhaita Tatho
Pension) Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be I it erpacted by the Chhailiggarh Legislature in the Fily-third Year of the Republic of
India as follows -—
1. (D) This Act may be called the Chhattisgart Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Velan, Bhaua Short tille and com-

Tatha Pension) {Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2002 (No. 17 of 2002). mtncement,

(2} It shall comie inlo force from the'dale of i1s publication in the Gazertte.

2. M In Section 4 (¢) of the Chhaltisgark Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Velan, Bhatta Tatha ~ Amendient du See-
' tion 4 {c}.

Pension) Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973} for the word "three hundred” the words
"two hundred [ifty™ shall be substituted.

() At the-end of Section 4 (c) the words “Members shall further be cotitled o daily
allowance al the rate of Rs. 250 per day [or the days they autend meetlings of
Vidhan Sabha or meeting of commitiees™ shall be inserted.

frdwss, o AeF St B, SRATE TR TREH AN TN R § TS AL S -- 1002



S ——— AT TR Y

A A T
il I

PRSI i n il

e e m e————

Samaae (e, B 15 w2003

ol _(__i_i

CHHBATTISGARF ADHINIYAM
(No. 27 of 2004)

CHHATTISGARH _ VIDHANSABHRA SADASYA VETAN RHATTA TATHA PENSION
SANSHODHAN ADHINTYAM, 2004

INDEX
SECTION:
1. Shert Title a‘1-1d Cummen(,;ement
2. Amendicnt of Scction-4
3. Amendment of Section -4 - A
"4 Amcndmcnt of Section - 4 -.B
5. Amcndﬁ]enl of Section-4-C
6 In Sedition of New Secr_iun;{l -D
T. Amc;r';dr-ﬁer:.t c;f Section -IS -A
8 Amendment of Section -6 --A
.o Amgndmf;nl ;Jf Section-6-1F

10, Amendment of Scetign-7 1



62 (4) - g T, Rt ) s wal 2005

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 27 of 2004}

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHANSARHA SADASYA (VETAN, BHATTA
TATHA PENSION), (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2004

An Act lurther to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhian Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta
TFatha Pcnsit_m), Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 70[]9?3)

Be i cnacted by the Chhatnsgarh Legislawre in the F ifty-Fillhyear of the Republic of

India as follows :-

Short ditle, and ] (]} This Act may be called the Chhattisgath Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Ventan
Commencement. ] " Bhanta Tatha Pensicn (Sansh_odhan) Adbiniyam, 2004.

(2 It shall come inle force from the date of its publication in the pazette.
Amendmeat - of 2 In Scction 4 of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vctan Bhatta Tatha Pension)

© Section 4. _ Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafier _reﬁ_rfrcd 1o as the Principal Act), for the
words “Three Thovsand” the words “Five Thousand™ shaii be substituted.

Ameudment  of 3. In Secnon 4-A of the Principal Act for the words “ Four Thousand the words “Fm.
Section 4-A. - : Thousand" shall be subsuluted ' : :
Al:m:ur.l_i'neni of A4, In- Seclmn 4-B of the an:lpal Act for the words “Onc T'nousand"' the words “Twu
Sectlon 4-8. - S Thousand" sha‘nl be substituted: : :

Amendment  of -5 Far sub-sccnon (u) of Scction 4-C the followmg sub-secuon shall be substlmaed
* _ Section 4-C, - - name!y .
“Gn For lhose days in which a membcr attend the mccnngs of Vidhan Sabha/
. Commiittecs. In Capital or ouf-of State for such-meelings member entitle
addmonaldmlyallowancc-al thc rateof Rs 250/- per day beforea day and

al’lcr a day of date-of such meclmgs

._lrhls‘er_l_'l:'m of Gew 6 . Afiter Section 4’-C' of tc Principal Ac_.t.-ihc"f-'ollowihg.-'Scction shalt:be .inserted,
Section .5"“, : ’ : namc]y- - . | .
' ~ “4-D. There shall be to evcry mcmber stalmnery allowance of Fom “Thousand
npecs per menser.” '

Amendment of 7 In Scction 5-A of the Principal Act, -

Section 5-A.
6} in sub-section (1) for the words “Seventy Five Thousand™ the words “One

Lac Twenty Five Thousand™ shall be 's_ubsﬁlutcd.

(i for first proviso of the sub-section (1} the following proviso shall bc— subs-
tituted, namely :-

"Provided that cvery member shall entitle for both side Five Air Journias
with one person accompanying him". '

{1t} [n sub-section (23, for the words “Fory Thwisand™ the waords "Sik:y Thou-
sand” shall be subsiitsied; and aiter sub-scetion (23 1he following provin

shall be added, namely -

U



fgue Bt

gt U9, s ;s mad naos

“Provided that such person within limit “Sixty Thousand™ shal! engitlc
for Three Air Journies™.

R In Section 6-A ol the Principal Acr, for the words “Three ['housand Five Hundred” the
© ° words * Ten Thousand™ shall be subslltuted

9 For Section 6-B the following Section shall be substituted, namely :-

“6-B. There shall be paid a pension ol rupees five thousand per mensem to
the spouse if any or dependént of a member/ex-meniber for a period of 1en
- years from the date-of his death”.

Amendment
Sectivn 6-A

Amendment
Stction 6-B.

-
e - o S_ection -1 of the Prncipal Act for the words * one thousand five hundred” the Amendment
words “three thousand™ sh'[ll be substituted, Section 7-1.
-_".-;ln'll_c‘_.'._'/ ) N
e i " -
‘ w1
T T Um0 A iR, g i e T A s TRl ania A v Ak T e 1 oG,

all

of

of



R

5 _I"_ISECUODQ-_DOflhﬁ'PHBC‘lpa]Ad, shallbe nm1tlcd'

ﬁﬂww Eqmmrri 2005 192.(1)
- CH]—IAC[TISGARH ACT

(No. 5 of 2005)

-

THE CHHATHSGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA (VETAN, BHA'ITA TATHA

PENSION), (SANSHODHAN) ADH]NIYAM, 2005

s

An Act further to amand the Chhathsgarh Vid]mn Sahha Sadassa (Vetan, Bhaﬂa

s

Bc it ellacted by Lhr.-,Chhatusgathegmlamm m t]]e FLﬁy SlxthwI of the Republ.lc of

IndjaasfollUWS ~"; -

¢

mharensmn), Advisizam, 1972 (No.7of 979). N AR

-.'(1) mgamaybmnedmeamamsgmh(\ﬁdhmsmammam |

TathaPensxon) (Sanshodhan)Adhuuyam,ZOOS '+:_ v_-j -_: o

J-.

a3 [2) It shall gomc mto foroe-fmm thc date of 1ts pubhuatmn in Lhe ofﬁcml gaze.t(c

L msea;ontlﬂoﬁhe Chhamsgarh\ﬁdhanSabhaS Jasyafver 21, BhaualhthaPcnmon)
Adhmryam, 1972 (No. 7-of 1973) (hcremaﬂermfcnedto asthePnnclpal Acl)furthc
wards:“vac Thoumnd" the words “One 'I'hmmnd‘ shall besuhstmncd

I Secuon4-B of the Pnns:rpalA.ct forthc wo:ds “'IWoThm:sand“thewurds Onc
Thousaud”slm]lbe?subsutued o - it

Ili mb-sncuon (1) and (u') oi‘ Swuon 4 of thc Pnnc:pal Acl fm‘ thcwords "I‘wo}{mdmd

_,_,\ R

-'In Sectmn ‘T-l pf the Pnnapal Acl, for the words "T]]Iee Thousand” the wonds "Dnov
: :'_:I'hausnci SleLmdrchlfty’ shaﬂbesubsumd LT |

Commencément.

Sel:llnn 4 A.. .

Kmﬂid-l'n_e_ht "
. S_e:_'l.lbn--i-IB.: R

Amendm:nl. ‘.'o_l‘_ .
_Sr:ﬁon 4-C SRR

Short ttle snd

Amend.me.nt . of _
I'4

. "Dmlsslan j'-.”cll‘f'. o
. Se:t,lnn 4D,

Z'.'-',Amendmcnt e af
. S:cﬂon 7 'l

He, mwm:rm Fdtang Tro TR S50 g, uani&:'ﬁa&q&am:mﬁﬁéw;s{.

|

o4




e T3, fm&zo a“’z-m?zooo _ d4 ¢

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No, 4 of 2006) . .

THE CAHMATTISGARR VIDHAN SABIIA SADASYA (VETAN, HHATTA
VATIIA PEMSION) {SANSHODHAR) ADHINIY AN, 1005

An Aet ferther fo amend the Chhattisgarh Vidher Sabho Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta Tetha
‘ension} Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by tne Chhaiticgarh Legistatues in the Fifty-Sixth ycar of the.Republic of india
s follows 1 — S - ' '

(N This Actmay be called the Chhattisgarh Yidhan Sabba Sadasya (Vel’m Bh.ula Short fitte snd Can-

~ Tatha Pcn ion) (Sanshodhan\ Adhiniyam, 200: ' L . nicngement.
2y ’ 1t shall come into force from the date of ils publlcalion'in the Of{ici-&] Gazele.. :

1

For sub-sectioa {1 of Soction 5-A of the Chhatsgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya{Velan, Bhatta  Amendment of Sue-
TathaPension) Adhiniydm, 972 (No. 7 of 1973), {llcremaﬁcr relerfed Lo as lh... Prmupal Act) rian 5-A.
the foliowing shall be subslinued, namely :— :

"(1) Every member shall be entitled 10 tour within India by rail and ait, free of cost,
within the fare limits of rupees One Lac Twenty five thousand in a financial year,
Such-member shatl also be provided with railway coupdns for raifway journey
which shall subjéct 1o such rules as may be made by the Stale Government in this
behall.”

(23 For first provise of ‘i'llh -section {1}, the following shall -be substituted,
r‘amc]) —_

"Provided thal every member may travel by air 2lone or with any person
ac: ‘o'npanymg with th asc limiis of Rupees Eighty Five Thiousand, The expenti-
turc on the joumey peiformed by tail and air shalt not cxceed Rupees One lac

. Twenty Five Thoeand mn a financial year.

Provided further that ':uc‘t members shall be cntitled for :,uc.h faciliny
from 15-2-2005."

T, nmﬁ‘fw‘-'ﬁiﬁ b‘f’f‘qﬂ”mﬂma #4717 RO, T & kR adl o0 2006




TH g TR, fgaiw 10 amre 2007

456 (1)

CHBATTISGARH ACT
(No. 8 of 2007)

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2007 '

An Act forther to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhsn Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). . '

Be il enacted by the Chhattjsgarh Legislature in the Fifty-eighth year of the Republic of India

as follows —
L. () This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatia
Tatha Peasion (Sanshodhan) Adhmiyam, 2007,
| _ (2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
i 2. In Section 5-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Yeta;n.‘Bhana Tatha Pension)
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973}, (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) ,—

: - For sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted :—

"(2) Every person entitled for pension nnder section § (A).' subject to such rules which
may be mede by State Government shall be entitled to coupons of Rs. Sixty

thatsuch persons shall alse be eatitled to journey by air within the limit of such
coupons of "Rs. Sixty thousard”.”

thousand value durinp ope financial year for journey alone or withone person and .

Skort title pud Com-
wencement.

Amendmen! of Sec-
tion 5~A.

e, T T SEA I, Sy 51 e e TEene, gsiend @ RE Tar vefir—-2007.



&R w99, RAlE 9 7 2008 260 (1)

ayy, R 9 af 2008

U 4846/ 135/21-3T/S1. [F. 7. /08, — MW@ H TR & A3 348 ¥ @vg (3) ¥ Fgerer ¥ wifteg g @
T 3, tﬁnm&m(mﬁm)uﬁrﬁw 2003 (FWi 10 w9 2008) ﬁmwm%mawm
ToraT 7T 2.

ﬁﬂma:%ﬁma%w&amar&mam,'
. F. FrieT, 39-aR

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 10 of 2008)

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN; BHATTA
TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN;) ACT, 2008

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatia
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 972 (No. 7 of 1913).

Be it enacted by the Chhatilsgarh Legiclature in the Fnﬂy-mneﬂl year of' the
Republic of India as foHlows :-

l. (1) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Short tille and

Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008. Commenrement
(2) It shall come in to force from the date of ils publication in the Official
Gazelte. . .
2. Principal Acl means the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha ~ Definitions.
Pension Adh:myam 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). ’ '
3 (D In sub-section (1) of Section 5-A of the Pnncrpal Act for the words Amepdment of
*Rs. One Lac T'wenty Five Thousand™ the words “ Rs. Two Lac" shall be Section $-A.
substituted. ’

2) For first proviso of sub-section (1) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act, the
following shall be substituted, namely - -

“Provided that every member may travel alone or with one more
person subject to the condition that expenditure on the journeys performed
by rail and air shall not exceed Rupees Two Lac in a financial year.”

€)) In sub-section (2) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act for the words
“Rs. Sty Thousand™ the words “Rs. One Lac™ shall be substituted.

{4) In sub-section (2) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act for the figure, bracket
and letter 6 (A)”, the figers and lefes “6-A" shall be substituted.

q. In the second proviso 16 Section 6-A '(1) of the Principal Act, aftcr the words * or Ameagmen of
where a member kaving beeo elected i 2 bye election™ the words “ oras amember Section 6-A.

of Lok Sabha/Rajya Sabha” shall be inserted.




260 (2} wdrag teres, [ 9 1§ 2008
Amendment of 3. For Section 6-C of the Principal Act, the following shall be substituted. namely :-
Sectinp &-0 .

“6-C Every person who is enlitled 1o pension under section 6-A. shall be
entitled for medical reimbursement similar to claim under sub-section (2) of Section
7 and shall alse be paid medical allowance of One thousand five hundred rupees

per month.™ :
Amendment of 6. tn sub-section (2) of Section 7 of the Principat Act, the words™for himself” shall be
Section 7 {2). omitted.

TR, X ST annft, weftes g A S gEemeR, tsridTia d gftn mar s 2008,



T r—— =

BETS T, T 20 ST 2009 ' .

472 (1)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 6_of - 2009)

THE CHIIA'I'I‘ISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA YETAN, BHATTA TATHA
'PENSION (SANSI&[ODHAN) ACI‘ 09

An Act forther fo amend the Chhattbgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Yetan, Bhatta
Tatha Peaston Adhiniyam,’ 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) .

Be it enacted by the Chhattlsgarh Legislature in the Sixtieth Yca.r DF the chubhc of

' Indmas follows :— -

. (1)  ThisActmaybecalled ﬂlcChhatthgarh VldhanSabhaSadasyaVctan, Bhatta'

_ Tatha Pensmn (Sa.ushodhan) Adhmya.m 2009.

@ 7 1t shall come into. force from the date of its Ipublimtiél} in the “Official

2 .In Section 4-A of l:b,e Chhatusga.rh Yidhati Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta "I‘adxa

 Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 {(No.7 of 1973) for-the words “One‘Ihousand” the.twords )

“One Thousand Savan Htmdred Fifty" shall be substitufed:

Sbort fitle. © amd
Commencement,

Amendment of
Section 4-A ’

WA, GE T8 TP WL, g R e i grone, Terikaia  a g weRE—2009.



‘e U ¥ ohid S YRS
TR e (o <@ fewe ) & Tww
¥ oHd. FHIE W1.2-22-SAE
e / 38 . | faaE, fewiw

30-05-2001.”

USitae AT
“Beeltentg [/ 09/2013-2015.”

FHIF 445 | TR, THaR, i 28 FiawR 2020 — e 6, 7 1942

fafer ofie faurh wrf fawm

o1ed R, feeis 24 Ramw 2020

HHIE 7291 /1. 148/21-31 /U [B. . 20. — Selievig faem w1 fRwaforiaa srftrfaem e w feAis 21-09-2020
TuTet it ATH I B el R, TAgERT SR Y SAHFR o folQ Wi e S 2.

BTG & AT & H A qLT ARIIAR,
IAY FAR FteT, sfcierm qfeE.

889



890 Bediante ToTae, i 28 Riawr 2020

BTe AffTw

(FHIH 15.2020)

SRR fauye 9 9g®™ daq, W1 qor due  (SeEE)
erftrfera, 2020

Botwrg faum awr e 399, W= a9 vA afufwEm, 1972 (6. 7 §91973) @
#i "eaa w8 2g sfufeEm.

WRA IR % Shead 99 § Sciae faum Hued g feforfad wu # g sttt gt -

wfgw wm &m0 (1) T2 ATTH B fa= W e 39, snaan iy (S9ieE) atftfeem, 2020
IRA. FHEARNI.

(2) T TSITA | 3 U it AR A T g,

URT 6-® ® WWEA. 2. St T w e Ae, WA i I, 1972 (6. 799.1973), (ST S6H 36 U
o e % wu # ffde ?) | on 6w, 1= ‘v W TR TR F WA W, TR
“oreEt # v fafafde” uforentua frnsm.

aEE w1 wMEA. 3, e i #, ST #, T FHIF 6, 7T 8 AT ING Weliud WA F WH W, HE:

Frmforfaa nfcrenfia fFm I, etafq ;-
(1) (2) (3) (4)
“6. YN 5-F (1) el & ol W S0 8,00,000 Ufcrad
ELRIERIEICI EUESI RO
7. U 5-% (2) AT wEwi & ford 3o w A 4,00,000 fcras
8. 4T 6- (1) Uy T 35,000 WA
8. Ul 6-@ WW&WW% T4 25,000 HfeATE
et /ot T FE &Y,
SATSIIe 1 I AT i
Ugg T4 I wE % ford,
IR H G F s |
Uy & ST,
1A R, feAih 24 Raawr 2020

FHIH 7291/, 148/21-91/UTE. [B. T./20.— HRA F WAUW & ST=08 348 F TUL (3) F JE0l # 39 fawmr =1
TGS AT 1 24-9-2020 F1 SIS SATATE THAU F UUHR H TAGERT TR FhaT et 2.

BAIEITE F THUTA & 10 | 4T SRUER,
INY FAR FHifeA, i wfa.







