The Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation (Amendment) Act, 2003

Act 6 of 2003

Keyword(s):
Director Urban Planning and Development, Record of Immovable Property

Amendments appended: 15 of 2004, 6 of 2019, 19 of 2019, 4 of 2021, 12 of 2023

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




CHRATTISGARE ACH
(e 6 o 2000

THE CHHATFISGARH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2003

An Actluvthey to amend the Chhatiisparh Municipsl Corporation 4.2t 1256 (No. 23 of

1956,

DBe it enacted by the Chhattisgarh I egislature in £a¢ Fifty-fourth yeor of the Republic of India

as Ullows (—

Lt

3

This Act may be called the Chhattisgach Municipal Corporation (Arnendment)

i)
Adhiniyam, 2003 (No. 6 of 2003},

2) h shall come into force from: date of its potification in Gie oflicial Gazelte.

Ta zub-section (1) and (2) of Section 19 of Chhn[iisgarh Municipa! Corporalion Act, 1956

(Mo, 23 of 1936) hereinafier called Principal Act, for words "Divisional Commissions” tha
words "Director Urban Plauning and Development" shall be substituted.

in Sub-secticn (1), (2) and (3) of Section 23 of the Principal Aet, for words "Divisionst
Commissicner™ the words "Director Urbaa Planaing awl Developutent™ shall be substitused.

Ta sub-section {1) and (2} of Section 24 of the Principal Acl, for words "Divisional Compi- -

ssfoner” the words "Pivsctor Urban Planning and Development” shall be substituted,

In sub-seetion (1) nfse,‘:iinn 417-A of the Principal Act, for words "Divisien?:] Commissicner”
shall be omitted and for wrods "Dircetor, Ushain Adnunistation” the words "Director, Urbau
Planning and Developmant” shall be substitutd. '

e Y L T B o O S e r e T P Pl T B I R TUt

Short Titie knd Cern-
glenceeid

Amendment of Sec-
tion 19.

amandazent of Sec.
Itan 23,

Amendment of Seq-
tion 24,

Awmendnient of Sec-
fion A17-A.



6(8)

geertg oo, A 3 e 200s

CHHATTISGARH ACT

No 15 of 2004)

THE CHHATTISGARY MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2004

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Municlpal Carperation Acl, 1956 (No. 23

of 1956).

as l'ollows -

Stort Vlde und I

Commencemnent.

Insertion of pd
Befinliisn.
-\
Amendment of

Seckion M4-C,

tosertion of
Sectlon 1 4‘_1‘.'. -

insertbon ol para
in) in Section 17
1)

Insection of New
Section 170,

(3=

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Leg:sla!urcm the Fifty-fifth year of Repubtic of tndia
{1}  This Al may becalted the Chhamsgarh Munigipal Cerpnration { Amendmeni) Ac,
2004.
2 It shall comne inio foree from the dote of its notification in the offictat Gazene.

ARer Sub-section (10} of Section 5 of the Chhattisgarh Municipei Corporation Act 1956
{No. 21 of 1956) hereinafler rci'-.ned w0 as Principal Act, fullowing new sub-section (10-a)

shali be inserted, pamedy ~ .

"Collector" means the District Collector appainted by the Siate Gauenm..ni under

(10-a)
Section 16 of Chhatisgarh Lund Revenue Code, 1959,

Afier sub-section [52) of Sccuun 5ofthe Pnncma! Act, follpwing new sub-su:tmn (52-A)

Shall be inserted, namely -

"(52-¢) "Recognised Palitical Party" means a political party for the lime being recognized
by the Llection Commitsion of India as Natonal Party or as a Siate Party in the
Siate nfChhmlsgﬁrh under the Elcction Symbo!s {Reservation 8 Aflotment) Order,

1948,

In clause (b) of Section 14-C of the Principa) ACY, for words “merber of the Comporativn” the.
words "Mayor or Councillor" shall be substituted and for ihe words "for 4 perind of ﬁvu

years" the words "for a period nol exceeding five years” shall be substifuted.

Afler Section 14-C of the Principal Act, fotowing Section 14-D shall be insried, namely -

“Section - 14-D-  The Siate Election Commission, on nwaking an application within thirty

Remaval AT days fromibe date of pubfication of the order, passed under clause (b)

ceduction of perfod FSection 14-C, in the official GGazett {forressons 1o be yecorded

of disqushification, O Section 14-C, in the official Gazette may forreasons to be yecorde
in writing remoye any disquaiification or reduce (he period of any

such disquakificaion.”

After para (m) of sub-scedion (1} af Sectien 17 of the Principal Act, the following para {n)
shaif be inscrted, naingly |

"{m) has been disguuhified under Section §4-C.7

After Section 17-2, af the Principat AcL, the fallowing new Section 17-8 shalf be inserted,
namely .- '

“Secilon i7-8. 1 Every Mayorand every Councillor shall before 1aking part in the
nf"“:;l °;;‘m”““"d"“ elmaion of Speaker in the first miccting of the Corporation of
y o ayur i . . ' . .
the Cozncilior belogs eniecing upon bus fl1ce, a5 thy Case may be, shall muke
and subsaribe in the presetice o the Tollentoran oath or attinma:

wion i the foliawing Yo -

Mayure o doomaci b aominated

T S

i g,

Tr——

e o g PSP



el T
e i 3 e’

PR

e

oaETE 9T, RAiw 3 S 2005

6(7)

—— iR

7

8.

voungifler of Munrcipal Corporation.. .

swear ir the name of God/salemnly aann that ] w1l| bﬁar
true faith and allegiance to the Constitution of India as
by taw established, and that T will uphold the sovereignty
and integaty of India, and | will faithfully and impartialty
perform my dulies.

(2} Ifthe Mayor or Councillor does not take an oath under sub-sec-
tion (1), it shall be deemed that such Mayor or Councillor as the
case may be, has not assumed his office :

provided that except with permission of the Director if any
Mayor or Councillor, as the case may bie, does not take an oath
within 30 days fram the date of his election or nomination, as the
case may be, his scat shall be deemied lo have fallen vacant ipso
Jacto.

After Section 18 of the Principal Act, following new seclion 18-A shall be inserted, namely :-

vGeetlon  18-A {1} Subject'to the provl:sioﬁs of the Act, the Speaker shall have the

Powers  an® following powers and functions -

functlons of 1he o )

Spesker.” . . .

- (i) to preside over the meetings of the Corporation and send

the copy of proceedings to the commissioner within seven
days from the date ofmeeling;

(W) to fix the dale of the meeling of the Corporation with the
consent of the Mayor snd arrange [o send the nolice theréof
along, wiih the Agenda as approved by the Mayor, and

(i) to haveadminisfraiive contsol over the officers and sérvants
of his office including the Corporalion Secreiary,

(2) The Speakefshall have power lo call the execution report from the
Commissioner, on the-decisions taken in the meeting of the Cor- -
poration, and may take steps 1o include in the agenda of the next

" meeting of thé Corporation such maiter in which execution has
been delayed beyond three months.”

In s“b-se;':lioﬁ (2)‘0FSecrior. 25 of the Priné:ipal Acl' following words shall be substiuted :-

Fer the wo-ds "the Spukcr the words “such member of‘lhe Mayor-in-Coun-
c1| as may be appomlcd by the Mayor" shall be substituted.

After Section Z5 oT the Principal Act, fallowing new Section 25-A shall be mserted namely -

wsertion - 25-A  Subject to provisions of the Act, every Coundillor shall have the
putles of  the  following duties:-
Cnum_:lllorl."
() 1o be present and take part in the meetings of the Corpora-
tion and on requirement cast vote.

(#) tadraw the altention of the Mayar or Commissioner towsrds
any loss to the Comporztion propeny or any short comings
io any scheme o7 scrwce or any wurk being execuled by the
corporation.

In Section 30 of the Principal A, after the ward “special mestiag” the wards “io discuss
any emergent and buming issues of the down™ shall be inserted,

Afler proviso following shall be inserted.

lasertion

Sectfon 18-4.

Amendment .
Sectlon 25.

Inserilon
Section 25-A.

Amendmend
Sectivn 3¢,

of

of

of




e 93, ﬁm 3 Sah 2005

5 (8)

Amendment
Scetion-37.

Amendmenl
Section 73,

of

of

"Provided further hat such speciul meeting shatl not be more han three iv 4 veer”

11, Sub-section (2) of Sechion 37 ol the Principal Act shall be substiteled by the fullowing :-

(7t “The Mayor-in-Council shail consist of the Mayor and nwenty percent of the tatai
number of elected Councillors. Al the ime of galenlanen of nvenly percent number
fraction less (han kalf skall be ighored and fraclion equal so hall or morc shall be

counled ag one.

provided thai al] the members shall benominaied by the Mayer from
amengst the clecled Councillors of the Corporation and ous of which ai least one
member fram Scheduled Caste or Scheduled Tribes, one member from Other Back-
ward Classes and one member from women category shall be nominated.”

12 Section 73 of the Principal Act, shall be substituted by the Tollowing :-

“Secifon.
Contragis by vr on
behalf of  the
Corporatinn-

2)

o))

Y

(3

73- (1) Contracis by or on behalf of the Carporation shalj be expressed

to be made by the Cammisstoner in accordance with the follaw-
ing provisions -

() every such contract shalt be made on behalf of the Corpora-
tfon by the Conunissioner. :

(b) nosuch conlracl for any purpose which, in accordance with
any provision of this Act, the Commissioner may not
carTyout without the approval or sanclion of some other
reunicipal autharity, shall be made by him unti) or unless

. such approval or sanciion has been duly obtained.

(c) the Mayor-in-Council and the Commissioner may sanction
any estitnate or contract (including technical and adminis-
trative) mvu]\'mg sbich amount, o5 may be prescribed.

(d) all other ustir’gatcs_ or conlracts shall be sanclicned by the
Comoration.  ~ .

rhc maener and procedure for gwmg contract, shall be such as
m..u' be prescnbcd

The Cn_rpomtiun' i order ta take assisiance in techiical or other
matiers, may engage the services of u qualified consultant and
(he procedure [or the appointment of such consultant shall be
subj'e'cl to rules madc ih'this behaif,

The Comara!wn can lake assistance of a tompany, firm, society,
trust or any other agéncy ‘or any Govemment agency tha! is
established under any exisiing rules, to execute any type of project
relating to urban infrastructure related with facifities. The Como-
ration, can also execute warks with the help of such private agency.

Private sectorpamapalmn_ agreements shall be such as may be
prescribed and shall include the following :-

(2} Build-Dwn-Operate-Transfer Agrecment,
(b) Build-Own-Operate-Mainlain Agreeinens,
(c) Build and Transier Agreement,

(d) Build-Lease-Transfer Agreement,

{¢) Build-Operate- Trunsler Agrecmicnt,

(0 Lense aml Management Agreement,

() Marmagemeni Agreement,

{h} [ehabilitase-Opemte-Transler Agrecmerr,

R



Fdlwe a99m, GAiF 3 ==ad) 2005

6(9)

) Réhabililatc-Own-Upcrate-Mainlain Agreement,
() Service Conlracl Agreement, and
k) Supply-Operale-Transfer Agreement,”

Provided that 2l the above agreemems far Private Panivipa-
tion shall be exccuted by the Corporation in such manner as may
be prescribed by the State Government.

"13.  Afler section 82 of the Principal Act, following new Section shall be inserted, namely :-

“Sectlon 82-A Noe property nf the Cerporation such as scheal, tank, play ground
or park meant for public use shall not be allowed (o be used for
any olher purpose ont a permanent basis.”

14.  In Section &3 of the Principal Act, the following Section shall be substituted, namely :

“Sectlon 83-Record (1) The Corperalion shall maintain a register and map of atl immoy-
ol Immovable able property of which it is the proprietor or which vests in it
properiy. othenwise or which it holds in trust for the Government,

(2) the Commissiouer, after having demarcated cﬁery land, Building

_establishment and plant etc. in the ownership of the Corporation,

shall arrange 1o affix there in the boards showing that the said
property is in the ownership of the corporation,

(3) Each year the Commissioner shall, in the budget meeting of the '
Carporation, publish the details of all immovable property of the
Corporation and send its copy along with the agénda to the mem-
bers. '

(4) The Commissioner shall, from time to time, inspect the property of
the Corporation and take action o remove the.engroachment il

any."”
i/

" After Section 83 of the Principal Act, following nrew Sccrion shall be inserted, namely :-
“'Section 63-A- The State Govemment may prescribe the manner in which the record of
Custody ang the Corporalion shali be maintained and kep! in custody and also the
destructlen nf T , . ‘ o
the record. manner and the procedure subject 1o which record shall be desiroyed.”.
Sub-section {5) ofSeclion 131-A ofthe Aet, shall be substin_ﬂed by the followiﬁg -
“Seetlon 131-4 (5} The Municipa! Accounts Comminee shall consider the report of the

audilor, appointed under Section 129, in respect of accounts of the

Corporation and submit the same to the Cerporation along with its

“views.” ' :
Sub-Setion (6) of Section 131-A of the Principal Act, shall be Omiited.

After Section 133-A of the Principal Act, following new Section 133-B shall be inserted,

namely -

"Sectlan 133-0- Whenever it appears to the State Government that the balance of Mu-

Power of the state  pi0 521 Fund of any Comporation or its reveme is insufTiciem for the
Governmenl In

require Corporstlen  Sischarge oFils duties o abligatory funcuens imposed upon 1 under
(o impost Lzres the Actor for meeting the expenditure to be incurred under Section 418
or for the perfonmance of any dutics in respect ol which it shall have
heen declared under Section 419 1o have commitied defile, the Stale
Govemment afier giving o notice of fifteen days to the Corporanan and

Inscridan of New
Section 82-A

Amendrocnl in
Sectlon 83 ’

4
incercflon of
Section-B3-A,

Ametadment in
Stctlon-131-4A,

Omlssisnn of jub-

Section (&) of
Scction 131-A,

lascrtion of
Sectlon 113-B.



e

“ TR [T/09/2013-2015.7

FE G ( 5 2 fEFe ) % uem
B ARG, FHIF W2-22-DHEE
e [ 38 T @ fiaE,
30-05-2001."

(STHTHTOT)
PR | gehIise

FAF 178 | TG, FTAAT, &0 7 78 2019 — 597 17, 9 1941

faft oiie faaeh e fom

HATC, HETE! e, 3ed TR, TR
w1l T, T2 7 A 2019

FTF 4706 /1. 93/21-3 /7T, /. 71/ 19. — el Fev1g Trere @emr o1 Forfariias arftrfras fora W i 15-03-2019 1

TEAETE o T & ATH § T AR,



356 e T3 ST, AT 7 WS 2019

TG Araw
(SFHI 6 99 2019)

Tt TR qifersd e (dwias) srtfas, 2019

gt TR aifas o aftfeem, 1956 (F. 23 §9_1956) F ok wuifod &@
2, wityfaE.

TTRE ORI & Hd 99 1 Sl ians faammued gr1 fetafiaa = 0 o8 sfataataa @i-

whom am, feaw L (1) TE AT EH e F9TE 9 UTTereh FooTe (Somrerm) et 2019 Feam.
a1 HITH,
(2) Zeeh 1 TR ot S eTe = H E .

(3) 7% TSI H 3 TR i T € e g,

YTl 9 FT W 2. T ETE 7T UTTeTah 9T ATeIT=amm, 1956 (. 23 5+ 1956) %t €IR1 9 51 SU-91T (1) |, UL (1)
|, TR TR o T, reerias s e fran 9, s -

"o A @R o af Rl o & o e, i ot T st =@ g s
21, et Tro g, Tt s artores e, St oft e 21, v T st il o e

TSHFRT : 36 e o6 VT F fordl T eater & arfvmm 2w, el st Fafrees am
HET, &0 Ayl vt saf, T e srftmw afafaam, 2016 (FAiE 49 59 2016) Fi
SR A ST Uk A e TeeanTa &, e wvd i 2 (Fifae fmrimn) o 3 (@mfs

HEeN) H Ifodtiad feeamars:”

TA TR, T4 7HE 2019

FHIF 4706 /2. 93/ 21~ /U [, 31 [ 19.— ARA 6 HTU 61 AT 348 F FUE (3) o SFeR01 § 3 faamt 1 e
AT FAT 7-5-2019 F1 SIS ATATE T o WUFHR H TAZER WFIE T S g

WA e o TITE T ATH H A1 SE0ER,



B TawTE T, T30 7 703 2019

356 (1)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 6 of 2019)

CHHATTISGARH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT ) ACT, 2019

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956

(INo. 23 of 1956).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh l.egislature in the Seventieth Year of the

Republic of India, as follows -

o

(D This  Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation
(Amendment) Act, 2019,

) It extends to the whole State of Chhattisgarh.
(3) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

In sub-section (1} of Section 9 of the Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956
(No. 23 0 1956) , in clause (c), after first proviso, the following shall be inserted,
namely :-

“Provided further that if in the general election to the Municipal Corporation,
no person with disability has been elected. then the State Government shall nominate
to such Municipal Corporation, as the case may warrant, a person with disability, and
the members with disability so nominated shall be in addition to the general members
nominated under this clause.

Explanation : Person with disability for the purpose of this proviso shall mean a person,
as duly certified by a Government doctor, to have one or more of the disabilities
included in the Schedule to the Rights of Persons with Disabilitics Act, 2016
(No.49 of 2016 ) except for disabilities mentioned therein against serial numbers 2
{Intellectual disability) and 3 (Mental Behaviour):”

Shoert title, extent
and
commencement.

Amendment to
Seotion @,

TR, TET A1 TR HE, TR B R IO, $EE T, TR 5 g [ i - 2010



“faore URE ¥ oTia T YoR
+i e (o e e ) & g
3 IEE. FHE SN.2-22-TRER
Wz [ 38 fa A faed, feiw
30-05-2001.”

(SrETHROT)
WIthR 9 UhIfsd

- DTz /3 09/2013-2015.7

I 837] YR, AR, Tamies 12 fewwr 2019 — SRIERI™ 21, 94 1941

forfey wet forermeft wred forvmr

aed T, T 12 e 2019

PHHI® 12792 /2. 227/21—31/%./6.11/19.@3%113%%@'411mﬁaﬁﬁamﬁm%ﬂmﬁ%
10—12—2019 P! ASYUTSA B} FFART Il &1 G &, TOGENT AR ) W @ forg wetf far sy

1673

TG ¥ TN & TH | a1 AR,
T FAR g, st |,



1674 TP TeiaH, T 12 o 2019

TR A
(m 19 '\qﬁ2019)

mmm(m)mﬁn 2019

Bﬁﬂﬂ%wﬁﬁsﬁma@ﬁw 1956 (<P 23???{1956)@34#?
e P g efafram |

Wma%wmaéﬁmﬁmmm

W@amﬁ%a@ﬁaﬁﬁa‘r—
1. (1) ?JE’WEW%?BW(W)W, i W W, faar
2019 HEHTYIT | T TR

() Tuw R bl sl v § 89

(@) =& W T ¥ ugw Ol R ST wRe,
sfergeen g1, fRae 3y

3 BT ; TrRufes fomm afdfygm, 1956 (. 23 4R 5 @1 I
] 1956), (G 399 sU@ wearq Ho Rfram @
vy H fifde 2) ¥ g5 4w (u-w) @
o W, f=faleg uﬁwrfhﬁ foma wz?f
JRAfq—
“(B4-%) "meTdR’ @ wfia ® e afdE, o
TROfE &9 B B N a8 @
Wil TRufers foem & faffag andel
| BT welR @ %y ¥ faifya gan 8l
(@4—T) “Trufae &3 @ it o fed
TRufas A o1 uel¥e 843 ot
TSUT gIRT 59 AR @l ey 7
B SY—HRY (2)2531%11?3@?1%6
foar rar 2 _
3. et Gy §) any o §- YT 9 FT G

- ([@F) SH-arr (1) ¥ wus (Eﬁ) T WM U,



Breftaire Toas, T2eiE 12 Rewas 2010

1674 (1)

ghrenfes fvar @I,

(@) TETIR;” =

@) Su-grT (4) & e w)rEfaie
gferenfig e o, aefq —

) ofr Rl TR &% % PR
e, ude @ fElem e A
MBS YEAl B, A W A B
wE B W B R v oA B
FH TGN &R OE 95 SE WE

R WENR,  deme, el

foarfn wfafelt o s wfafqat

¥ ¢ fat & faakm &

qa e ¥ aN 11-% H, SU-uRT (4) B
gearq, fmfaRaa sier o, sfa-

“(4—w) RN o et # ol 3w ouwr

@ SR, WENR &1 uE, B ey

gt & weeaR @ Ry e R

T g, aet Yo B A Praifm o,

W HeTdR Ue &g e gl @1 g,

TENR & 9% ©q ueaEl 89 ol 9%

7% @8, wal ¥ g Maifaw zar &) o9

uaf & f3re auefse 8 ur A8l

8T 11—F &I



1674 (2)

TATeIg UAu, 5 12 B 2019

@ fufam § gt 12 = @vs (@) @ qeem,
Fr=foiaa drer o, st -
\:ﬁ)%ﬁmvﬁlﬂﬂw
TRufes &% A ek Rl
Praferes A # <Rl T8 2,

-‘Ww1:ﬁm$@ﬁ=f%§:

TGS Ygrgd U9 U9 U S

AffFaH, 1993 (6. t TF 1994) & .

R 2 B wus (WFs) ¥ 96e fag
wgaR & |
WEFR-2: 59 °UNT & WA Bq
& wairre  wrutferer sy,
1961 (6. 37 Wg"wm) @ URT 3 P
@vs (18—w) # sve oy waRfde
g1
7 FafFae ¥ arr 14 3-
(U) Su—amer (1) H W “dom HEUR” @)
S frar I,
(@) Sv-aRr @) § w=m aur wEHRe @
T fpar o |
Tel sfRfem 8 unr 147 ¥ Su-awr (1) ¥
T HEORT B vH W, we e
yfcrenfia frar ond | |
T afafm 4 o u-w 8 e ek @
W 07, 7 e afkeriiy e o

gRY 12 &7

gRT 14 @]

HRT 14—P BT

ENT 14— &7
.il‘?! 132!‘ ’f_;f_



(gep) N & wes W WEMERT & @0 fear

cing
@) So-ury (1) ¥ we ar "werR” @ ey
far \_IIT??I; %

(?ﬂ%f) IG-GRT (1) ¥ ©vE (@ @) ¥ v v

TR B A AT S
(R) Su—swr (1) ¥, wos (8) ¥ e “waHR
o e A vl o€ ¥ @F oy oT B
SR BT A fr W
{ai=) su—ary (2) A, ured s ve wam iR
§, T gy ®eMUR F @ fomar o,

() Su-am (3) A, = a1 T B
A e &Y, &1 A fHar 9|

wedlenTg T, i 12 R 2019 1674 (3)
3. I SRR ¥, ORT 16§, WS (@) TR R 14 B
“dy AETER B A AT | - T
10. T i ¥ uwT 15 A | HIRT 15 P
() = an WETRT o @ e o, RRLLS
(@) uge @ W, Frefafa siienfi
R ST, aparfey o
g B A @R e B R
Prafem % to § 9P AR A T
HA |
1, e v §, arr 16 W~ R 16 HF
(0) ST (1) B @S (@) B A Rear o e
@) Su-uRrr (4) T fFar Wy
12 W&%ﬁmﬁ gRT 17 - €RT 17 T
e,



1674 (4)

SeeferTe v, Beis 12 Rawa 2019

13.

14.

| %_*a@ﬁaﬁﬁ,mav—@ﬁ— >
“(q) wu—eRT (1) ¥ T mngmﬁ?am
am fFar w;
(a’l)@—m(q)ﬁw Feae” a%q:cfma
s "AETAR T Saeniud fear W, &R
(e?m) JO-gRT () ¥ veE CwEnR AT st
H& A e 2, B A R o 1
o e § g 18 4 |
(Tp) dde ¥ g Cwsu’ B g, W
ek T’ ol foar W,
@) Su-amr () @ W W PR
ufreenfa w1 9N, g =
“'(1)31'&312«‘131?51?31@#.%22%

e felas o aftREFr @

g fraw @ Wy, ewas @

weriy B PakE B e &
1xg ¥E 6 gl G 4@
HROT  WEMR TAT/;T Seae

‘T e U € e A Ume

e & fax ot w8 8 var B,

Al 3R S W el dedt § QU

frar o b, feg dyel wiar
Rl 22 b oM g &

2Ry

aRT 178 W]

€N 18 BT



FeeltenTe T, i 12 R 2019 1674 (5)

(@) ST () & v W, P
ftrenfie T e, sl —
“(3) Su-aT (1) @ IEhT e,
T Ay ¥ gamn SR, S
& o falws s ewmr
smufRa femr wm R
Jezerem o fratas emam
A | ST B AR
B B 7T T BT e
- T8 B R WO RER B @
T # oRum we Bwr
(ER) Se-am (§) 8w CwwmE d @, we
5. e afPRM Y aRr 20 ¥ wSwOT ¥, U ———
‘HeNF P Oqd, & “HEIR qur sl e

fbar w1/ |
16. g rfafray & anT 237 §- HRT 23~ &I
Up) e § T gem” B yd, we e
R A s R o,

(@) Su-am (1) § T o wE B
A e 8 B Y, U CHEHR are
e o S siv

@) su-umr (@) ¥ @vs (@) ¥ w=w

“mETdRC B T e wE Rk
ey yierenfOs frr w |



1674 (6) FeArerTg Tera, fiw 12 Raer 2019

7 @&@ﬁﬂmamzaﬁmﬁmm! - msze;@
18. o areEE g emi 422 ’% Tq-ay (1) , @v@' €N 422 iﬂ
(@) § W& e ¢ . TR “YgTUR el aas
2 . . ;
i oer 441 3 SU-aw (2) ., WS gqRT 441 Bl
19, T aﬂ%‘l‘i’v’l’uﬂ?ﬁ; | b
(@) ¥ Su—wrs (@F) & WA W) freferRas G
ghrenfa fiem o, seifa—
@) wEdR @ P & T # A
- feifam o 'R |
2. e wRafae rm (@ )sxwréw f’#ﬂﬂ‘—r
. 2019 (. 2 @ 2019) TaggRr PR A s
2 '
WW.%IZ%WZOH

HHIG 12792 /€. 227 / 21— /W6, /B, /19.- ARG & HIALE & 0T 348 B WIS (3) B AFaX0T |
=9 famT @ iR feAld 12—-12-2019 BT SRSH ATAR IFITA S WRIER | TagERT TSI a1 o 2|

SHIERTZ % TIITe & 1 | q97 ALWIAR,



Tl et fam i 12 w2019 _ ‘. 1674 (7)

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 19 of 2019)

THE CHHATTISGARH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT) ACT,
2019

AnActfurther to amend the Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation
Act, 1956 (No.23 of 1956).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Seventieth

Year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Short title, extent
and

Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation
commencement.

(Amendment) Act, 2019.

(2) It shall extend to the whole State of
Chhattisgarh.
(3) It shall come into force on such date
as the State Government may, by
- notification, appoint.
2. In the Chhattisgarh Municipal Amendment of

Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of Section S.
1956), in Section 5, for clause (34-a),
the following shall "Se substituted,
namely:-

"(34-a) "mayor" means such
person who should be an
elected Councilor from
some ward in the Municipal
area, and who is elected
thereafter as Mayor by the
elected Councilors of the
Municipal Corporation;”

(34-b)"municipal area” means the
territorial area of a
municipal corporation as is

notified by the Governor



1674 (8)

Do ieTg T, s 12 Ra=r 2019

under sub-section {2) of

Section 7 of this Act;”

In the Principal Act, in Section 9,—

(1) In sub-section {1}, for clause (ai,
the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

"(a) a Mayor;"

(1) for sub-section (4), the following
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(4) If any ward of any municipal
area fails to elect a
Councilor, fresh election
proceedings shall be
commenced for such ward
within six months to fill the
seat and until the seat is
filled it shall be treated as
casual vacancy: |

Provided‘ that
proceedings of election of
Mayor, Speaker any
departmental Committees
or any of the .Committee
shall not be stayed, pending

the election of such seat.”

In the Principal Act, in Section 11-A,
after sub-section (4}, the following
shall be added, namely:-

“(4-a) In the case of Municipal
Corporations where, in
terms of this Section, the
office of the Mayvor Iis

reserved for candidate from

Amendment of
Section 9.

Amendment of
Section 11-A,



BT TsTaH, i 12 famr 2019 . 1674 (9)

a specific  category, any
elected councilor belonging
to such category for whicH
the office of the Mayor is
reserved, fnay become a
candidate for the office of
Mayor, irrespective of
whether the ward he was
elected from was reserved for

~such category or not.”

In the Principal Act, in Section 12, Amendment of
after clause (c), the following shall be . Beetiod 12,
added, namely:-

"(d) is not registered in any electoral
roll related to a Panchayat or
municipal area of a
municipality;

Explanation-1: __For the purpose
of this section ‘Panchayat’ shall
have the same meaning as
assigned to it in clause (xvii) of
Section 2 of the Chhattisgarh
Panchayat Raj Adhiniyam, 1993
(No. 1 of 1994):

Explanation-2: For the purpose
of this section “municipal area”
shall have the same meaning as
assigned to it in clause (18-a) of
Section 3 of the Chhattisgarh
Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37
of 1961).”



1674 (10)

B e T, ot 12 eww 2019

6.

10.

11.

12,

In the Principal Act, in Section 14,—
{1) i sub-section (1}, the‘words
“and Mayors” shall be omitted;
(1i) in sub-section (2), the words

“and Mayors” shall be omitted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 14-A,
inn - sub-section (1), for the word
“Mayor”, the word “Councilor” shall
be substituted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 14-B,
for the word “Mayor”, the word

"Councilor” shall be substituted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 14-C,
in clause {b), the words "or a Mayor”
shall be omitted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 15,—
(i) the words "or Mayor" shall be
omitted;
(i) for the proviso, the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
"Provided that no person
shall vote more than once in

any election of the Councilors.”

In the Principal Act, in Section 16,—
(i clause (a) of sub-section (1) shall
be omitted;

(i) sub-section (4} shall be omitted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 17,—
(i} in the heading, the words “or

Mayor” shall be omitted;

Amendment of
Section 14,

Amendment of -
Section 14-A.

Amendment of
Section 14-B.

- Amendment of

Section 14-C.

Amendment of
Section 15.

Amendment of
Section 16.

Amendment of
Section 17.



1674 (11}

13.

14.

Seitag TR, oA 12 eawe 2019

(11} In sub-section (1), tlhe words “or
Mavor" shall be omitted;

(iii) in sub-section (1), in clause {bb):
the words “or Mayor” shall be

omitted;

- (v} In sub-section (1), in clause (e),

the words “is less than twenty-
| five years of age in the case of a
Mayor and” shall be omitted.

(v) in sub-section (2), in marginal
heading and body, the words “or
Mayor”, shall be omitted.

{vi) in sub-section (3), the words “or
Mayor” wherever they occur shall
be omitted.

In the Principal Act, in Sections 17-

_ -

(i in sub-section (1), the words
“Every Mayor and” shall be
omitted;

(i) in sub-section (1}, before the
word, “Speaker”, the words
“Mayor and” shall be inserted;
and

(ii) In sub-section (2), the words
“Mayor or” wherever they occur,

shall be omitted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 18,—

(1} in the heading, before the word
“Speaker”, the words “Mayor
and” shall be inserted;

{ii} for sub-section (1), the following

shall be substituted, namely: —

Amendment of
Section 17-B.

Amendment of
Section 18.



1674 {12)

TfterTe T, Fami 12 R 2019

“1)

The  State - Election
Commission  shall, within
fifteen days of the notification”
of election und;:r Section 22'-,“
call a meeting of the elected
Councilors for the purpose of
electing a Speaker and
Mayor:

Provided that if for any
reason the election of the
Mayor and/or the Speaker
cannot be completed in a
single meeting within fifteen
days, the same may be
completed in two or more
meetings but the entire
process must be completed
within a period of thirty days
of the notification of election

under Section 22.”

(ii1) for sub-section (3), the following

shall be substituted, namely:-

"(3) Meeting under sub-section

(1) shall be called in such
manner as may be
determined by the State
Election Commission, which
shall be presided over by the
officer authorized by the
State Election Commission.
The presiding officer shall
not have the right to vote

and in case of equality of



e g T, FaiE 12 R 2019

1674 (13)

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

votes the result shall be
decided by lot.”

(iv) in sub-section (4), before thé
word ‘Speaker’, the words

‘Mayor and’ shall be inserted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 20, in
the Explanation, before the words
“the Speaker”, the words " the Mayor

and " shall be inserted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 23-A,-

(1) in the heading, before the word
“Speaker”, the words “Mayor or"
shall be inserted;

(i) in sub-section (1), before the
word “Speaker” wherever it
occurs, the words “Mayor or" shall
be inserted; and '

(iii) in sub-section (2}, in clause (i),
for the word “Mayor”, the words
"Mayor, Speaker", shall be
substituted.

In the Principal Act, Section 24 shall
be omitted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 422,
in sub-section (1}, in clause (b},
before the word ‘Speéker’, the words

“Mayor and” shall be inserted.

In the Principal Act, in Section 441,
in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for
sub-clause (iii), the following shall be

substituted, namely:-

Amendment of
Section 20.

Amendment of
23-A.

Amendment of
Section 24.

Amendment of
Section 422.

Amendment of
Section 441.



1674 (14} SrTe U, i 12 Rz 2019

“4iii) m thé éase of clection oflMayor;
by any elected Cou.nciior."
20. The Chhattisgarh - Municipal Repeal.
Corporation (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2019 (No. 2 of 2019) is
hereby repealed.

m,wwmm,mmm_ﬁm.w%yﬁamm- 2019,



“fasig A ¥ IRl T I
g M ( faen g e ) & Iy
¥ IHA. FAE T.2-22-TelE
e [ 38 R A R, Rew
30-05-2001."

Usfiae wHi
‘Bl 3/09/2013-2015.”

FHIF 180 TR, AR, i 6 W 2021 — WIS 15, W 1942

farftr st faamft et fawm

U, WEME Wed, &l YR Sfed TR
T R, Fé=i 6 7T 2021

SHHIT 3503/, 35/21-3 /0. /8. 91,/ 21, — Seeliene fvu @ 1 PrafRas sl R R 25-02-2021 %1
ST 1 SHATCT T 81 T &, UeragrT et ) et 3 fore s Rsar s 8,

TRIETG F TR F T & T AR,
I FAR il siffem wha.

359



360

et Teige, i 6 /- 2021

wigw = [an
WY,

T 133-% &1
s,

YTT 293 T HHiEA.

I 300 FT FNIHA.

T 308-F W1
THIE.

T ae AtaTw

(FHTH 4 6 2021)

TR TRUte® fem  (Aauw)  afufeem, 2020

switag FRufas e sfufrm, 1956 (&, 23 %r—usss}aﬁ At wwifa +@

3q, srftrferma,

HIR TR o 3HETA 94 § Sl erTg [umAvSs g1 Fasfoled oo # 7 sfiafa @ -
(1) g Sittifaw BiEIE TRUTic AT (F9eR) siftriam, 2020 FEETE.
(2) TE TG W 36 Wt o6l fet 9 Hae 2.
e Srferforen i R 133-% A, -
(F)  Su-umi (1) &, qut fomw g 1 % v R, e Faee " wferanua e e, i
(@)  3u-aw (1) F e, eatorRea Ser S, s -
i e o o T, - O, TS0 H WeRTTI A RT3, F
i TTaR TR ¥ e B, ST O g ove €, SR s v 4, T @l %
sreaefie, Sa 6 erftrgam # faffde R o, 39 su-awr d safde meaam # g2 3
He arfrias i URT 293 i IU-URT (1) WS (iv ) & IU-TUS () H -
(%) = “Thad” FWFR, TS Dan Aoweniia R om; ok
@) ﬁa“ﬂ@aﬁzﬁmﬁa“aﬁlaﬁqﬁmaﬁ.
‘J@é’lﬁlﬁwﬁ,-

(F)  URI300 % Yidfw o Siqaeg #, 71 “TH AN el Fel Wl 1S H WE W, = Q)
ay” wierenfua foen w; ofit

(@) a3 d, T=m A" F MR, v IR Airai B,

Tt arferfeem Y ST 308-% 1 30- 41 (2) F avend, Feafaiaa sier e, eiq -

“3) 7w s fada o e % 5u W, T s, Sl i agat ww e
& e ST Sifee H, U it |, o forferm 3 et favn s, Foema it i

o, forelt Forarer wrapan #, @11TRvR 1 ot &0 ), 3 1T 3 AU SruarHdl o YA R 3 Toh
T WA HHE

WEHWI-1 ;39 YR & W & o, 7 TS SR § # A Fed Feeoiad @ difta



Bl g TSI, T 6 /i 2021 360 {1)

(@) Rl e, of e i S e, Rt s st
o} arrsiifer it wqTan 37 2 Fiwet Ferere wftneror iferet &, & di= 1 v @,
e e FereaforeTTery srgaT s siit /2 Shesiien <N Tl AR § IEm a2

(@) U SR T SR g, S i T T W I HI AT g, &1 5
w0 A IR R AR i e S wem A

M) i oftaRTHTE e, S e s e e o, T e ot
IR AT B W < mTon | weifer 2, S enavee an e w8,

(@) O, i A O e g e 9 AT g, Qe
o #0E Fa Wi 41799 ot anl | i g, ot s, s
AR S0 | aite =i, uiwe witewd mals aele 3g ssm E
T R &Y.

WETHIOT-2 @ IO W, U TR v W o AR S, S iR
s g A fafr ddfag.”

e R, T 6 W 2021

FHIE 3503/, 35/21-9/WE. /B, 7. [ 21.— AN F AT ¥ ST 348 UL (3) o AR A 39 Frvmr 1 Wi
Aferfram & 6-3-2021 1 SIS TR TSaUTE % UTTORTE © TGERT Maliare 3 ST €.

%ﬁﬂm?; TSI I @ a9 SIWIER,
INY FUR FireAn, Al qfa,



360 (2) Bt TAus, 34 6 1 2021

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 4 of 2021)

CHHATTISGARH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT)
' ACT, 2020

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956
(No. 23 0of 1956).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic
of India, as follows :-

L ) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation
(Amendment) Act, 2020.
(1) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
Z In Section 133-A of the Principal Act,-
(a) In sub-section (1), for the punctuation full-stop *.”, the punctuation colon *;”

shall be substituted; and
() After sub-section (1), the following shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the State Government may, from time to time, by
Notification in the Official Gazette, exempt the transfer of some or all
immovable properties, partly or fully, temporarily or permanently, from the
provision contained in this sub-section, subject to such conditions as it may
specify in the Notification.”

3 In sub-clause (b) of Clause (iv) of sub- section (1) of Section 293 of the Principal
Act, -
(a) For the words “one yeat”, the words “two years” shall be substituted; and

b) For the words “the expiry of” shall be omitted.

4, In the Principal Act,-

Q] In the title and content of Section 300, for the words “one year”, wherever

they occur, the words “two years” shall be substituted; and

(i) In Section 300, for the words “two years”, the words “four years” shall be
substituted. '
5. After sub-section (2) of Section 308-A of the Principal Act, the following shall be

added, namely:-

“3) Notwithstanding any thing to the contrary contained in this Section, the
State Government may, after obtaining approval of the Council of
Ministers, in larger public interest, for reasons to be recorded in writing, on
the recommendation of the Corporation, exempt, in part or whole, the fees for
compounding of offences under this Section, in any particular case:

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Section 133-A.

Amendment of
Section 293.

Amendment of
Section 300.

Amendment of
Section 308-A.



BreeieTe weaE, f2+iE 6 v 2021 360 (3)

Explanation-1: For the purpose of this Section, the term ‘Larger public interest’ is
restricted to the following :-

(a) Institutes or organizations active in the field of education including
training for skills- development for promotion of livelihood of the
underprivileged, for at least five preceding years, and which
receive grants from the University Grants Commission and/or the
Central or State Government(s);

()] Hospitals and healthcare centres which are recognized by the
Central or State Government, and primarily render charitable
services to the poor and underprivileged;

(c) Religious and charitable organizations active in the field of
social service, provided their offences under this Section relate
to construction of buildings other than residential or commercial;

(d) Institutions, duly recognized by the Central andfor State
Government(s), that run orphanages, facilities for physically or
mentally challenged persons, destitute homes for women or senior
citizens, and have been active for a period of preceding five years or
more.

Explanation -2: The above provision shall also apply in any of such cases as may be
pending on the date this provision comes into force.”

FTe®, YE a1 AE S, B g W e, S IRIE S R @ R a0 wEhe - 2021,



“foeTe= TIeE o ST R I &
18 e (foreT = fehe) & T
T IIHA. FHIE W1.2-22-T TR
e [ 38 fa | fies. e

USRI SEHIE
“odtee /571/09/2013-2015.7

30-05-2001.”
(STETYROT)
IR & W
FHI 244] TR, FIAR, T3 31 7 2023 — 2 10, IF 1945

fafer ok faemdl sri fawrT

Jed TR, feid 31 #2023
. 6948 /SI. 56 /2131 /UT®. /B /23. — BT faae 991 &1 f=faRag sifdfrm, [
R e 15—05—2023 B ISUTA HElGY @ AT Ura B gDl B, ORI AR & AFTHRI &
fore arfera forar wimar 21

BRIATG & AU & A ¥ AT MGT9R,
Ared yare wrn, AfaRe @i,

487



488 TeATe TS, B 31 78 2023

BodiaTe e~
(shHTh 12 A 2023)
BwTe T RUTferd e (Fenes) sifef-a, 2023

BTG TRYTT® A8 AT, 1956 (5. 23 |1 1956) BT IR
Henfed a2 Sifdfeae |

frefafaa v 7 I8 fRfrafia e
WA 4 (1) Ur R seiwTe RO Be (@)
qAT YR, g™, 2025 HEART

@) U' v9ed # 39D UHE 3 Al F g s8N |
ORT 292-%F . 2. (1) B« TRUfed R oS, 1956 (@, 23 6
CARCNIIER 1956) I URT 292~ PI SY-GRT (1) & @S (H) b
wF g7, Fefalaa gve uforeniue fear <, stefq—
“ (@) TRuIfers T 8 B GRS ATARIG Pra b,
Framr fFofar (@eMEoR) grr eiies wu 4
FAGR i @ fav gon = ey g & for,
qwmﬁ,ﬁﬁa&—maﬁv/mﬁﬁa
NTIRT / UhTSs, VAl GdT H dT U STeR ¥,
RGAT BT
foy emferag 5 o g Aol y—wvsl
AR/ Fffq sl /yersl @t G e,



TR T, B 31 7 2023 488 (1)

Fea ¥ Rolm g-wvel dR/z FHiHg
JTaRT /Uit B HA T BT 9% T BH AB
2r qen e e it & R T8 6% @ &H 8
BIT:

W TE R ¥ Iy wwm, o gw g
yrauTa ) ge & -enfde w9 ¥ FEaR 91
¥ T P (@ERER), TR g-ave
dr/ar faffq emRy/vere, @Al ¥ =
o e U WM TR SUeR BT wH, S
@IF, 39 G4y ¥ kg el & ofuR w9y B I
@ wU-uRT (1) @ @wvs (M) ¥, v U (P R 128—7T"
P W W, T T4 I "GRT 128—F" wfawenfia fear

SR | | |

()  Su-uRr (2) T A R W

e TR, f&AiF 31 9% 2023

. 6948 /L. 56/21—3 /U, /B /23 — WRd & WAYFE & JTE 348 D WUS (3) &
SRV H 9 [aURT BT FHEES S e 31—05—2023 &1 S 3aE oAU & WSR3
UAGERT UHIRT fasar e 2 |

GG & ITUTe & AR A AT AR,
A yars W, AfaRed |fe.



488 (2) SeieTe TaE, fEE 31 1S 2023

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 12 of 2023)
CHHATTISGARH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2023.

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Municipal
Corporation Act, 1956 (No.23 of 1956).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the
Seventy-Fourth Year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the

CR eI EX R Chhattisgarh Municipal Corporation
(Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force from the date
of ité publication iﬁ the Official
Gazette.

Amendment in 2. (1) For clause (a) of sub-section (1) of

Section 200-1. Section 292-B of the Chhattisgarh

Municipal Corporation Act, 1956
(No.23 of 1956), the following clause
shall be substituted, namely:-

“(a) In every residential colony in
the municipal area, the
colonizer will have to reserve
developed plots and/or
constructed houses/flats,
separately for ‘the

economically weaker sections



Beel 1T, ST, Taia 31 /% 2023

488 (3)

and for the lower income
groups, in such mjmbcr, and
of such size, as may be
prescribed by the State
Government:

Provided that the total
number of the developed plots
and/or constructed houses/
flats, to be reserved for the
economically weaker sections
shall not be less than 9% of
the total number of developed
plots and/or constructed
houses/flats in the colony,
and for low income group it
shall not be less than 6%:

Provided further that
the State Government may,
through rules; provide that for
the economically weaker
sections, the colonizer may
provide developed plots
and/or houses / flats at a
place other than in the

colony, which place must

satisfy the conditions’

prescribed in this.regard.”



488 (4) BTG TSE, TSI 31 7S 2023

- (2) In clause (¢} of sub-section (1), for

the words and figure “Section 128-

C”, the words and figure “Section
128-A” shall be substituted.

(3) Sub-section (2) shall be omitted.

HeTerh, WUl AT oivar ST, eciieTe g1 Aewhia Geoiier, YA 4 Higd a9l Wt - 2023,



	2003CG6.pdf
	2004CG15.pdf



