The Members of Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi
(Salaries, Allowances, Pension etc.) Act, 1994

Act No. 6 of 1995

Amendment appended: 4 of 2023

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research
(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These
contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy,
completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.
Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the relevant
state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette notification. Any person
using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting on any information contained
in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this
document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or
distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




370 DELITGAZETTE: EXTRAORDINARY
DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE & LEGISLATIVE
MFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Mew Dhelhi, the 19th December, 1995

No. . 13(6)45-1.4/2223..- The Gollowing Act of Lepislativern i\sscmh]‘}' received the
assent of the President of India on 15th December, 1995 and is hereby published for
general information —

THE MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL
TERRITORY OF DELHI

(SALARIES, ALLOWANCES, PENSION, ETC.) ACT. 1994
{Ielhi Act No. 6 of 1995)

19-12-1995
(s passed by the Legislative Assembly of the Mational Capital Territory of Delhi)
AN
ACT

o provide for the salaries, allowances, pension ete. of Memhers of Legislative Assembly
of the National Capital Terrstory of Delhi,

Be it cnacted by the Legislative Azsmebly of the Natianal Capital Territory of Delht in
the Farty-fiflh vear of the Republic of India as follows -

L Shorl utle and commencement - (1) This Act may be called the Members of
Legislative Assembly of the National Capita] Terrilory of Delhi {(Salaries, Allowances,
Fension etz.) Act 1994,

[2F It shall come info force on such date as the Lt. Governor may, by notification in
the Official Gazette, appoint.

% Definitions.-In this Act, unless the coumtext otherwise reguires,—

(o) “Committes” means Committes of the Lemzlative Assembly;

e

b} “Cenrolling Officer” meens the Secretary;
(€] “Day” insans a period of twenty-four hours heginning at mid-night;

{d) “Family" mecans the wife, or husband of o Member, i such wife or husband is
residing with such Member and includes Jegitimate children or step children
and parents residing with and wholly dependent on such Member but does
nolinclude in the case of a male Member, mote (hm one wife,

{e) “Government” mezns the Government of the National Capital Temtory of Delhi;
ifl “Membcr” means & member of the Legislative Assembly but, save as otchrwise
expressly provided in this Act, does not includes—
i A Minister 25 defined in the Ministers of the Government of the National
Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) Acr, 1994; and



Dﬂ.meamm'a:ml'tmcfmm}.m 571

(i) The Speaker or Depuly Speaker as defined m the Speaker and Deputy
Speaker of the Legislative Assermbly of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances)

Act, 16949,
() “Mew Member” means a Member who takes his seatin the Legislative Azzembly
alicr the commenceraent of this Act and includes 2 member who s reglected;

(h} “Pengioner” mens a person who is eligible o receive peusion under this Act;
(i} “Secretary” means the Secretary to the Legislative Assermbly,
M “Tenr of Office”™ in relation to a Member means- )

(i) where such member is & Memher elected in a general election held for e
purpose of constimting @ new Legislalive Assembly, the pericd heginng
with the date of publication of the nofificatin ol the Election Commission
under seclion 73 of the Representation of the people Act, 1951 (43 of 19510;
or

{ify where such memher is @ Member elected in a bye-clection to the Legislative
Ags=mbly, the period beginning with the date of this 2lection referred to in
section 674 of the Representation of the Peaple Act, 1951 {43 of 1951] and
ending with, in each such case the date on which his scat becomes vacant,

5. Salary, Daily Allowance, etc.-(1) A Member chall be entitled to receive salary al
the rate of one thousand rupees per month during his term of office and shall also be
cntitled o receive daily allowance at the rate of one hundred fifty mpees for cach day on
which he attends a meeting of the Legislative Asserbly o #ny Committee thereaf or 13
enpaged in any other business connected with his durics as o Member.

(7} There shall be paid to each Member a consituency allowance of yupes one
thiusand per mensem.

{3 There shall be paid to each “ember a convevance allowance of rupees five
hundred per mensem.

() There shall be puid to each Member a sceretarial alfowance of rupees one
fhousand per mensen.

4 Travelling Allowance —In respect of every joumey performed by a Member o a
place ontside Delhi on any business connected with ki dotics a5 a Member, he shall be
eutitled to travelling allowance at the rate apphcable to Group ‘A" officers serving in
connection with the Govermment.

5 Medical Facilities.-A Member and members of his family shall be entitled [ree of
chargs to accomumodation in hospitals maintained by the Government 2nd also to medical
reatment in secordance with the Medical Attendance Rules a5 amended fom time 1o time
as applicahle to Group A" officess of the highest grade of the Guvernment.

i Telephone Facilities-A Member shall e entitled to the nstallabion at Government
cost of ong telephone (withont STD faciliey) within Delhi at his residence or the place
where he ordinarily conducts his work relating 1o Legislative Assembly and o the
reimbursement of full rentals thereal and the Local calls made therezom as admissible o
Ciroup ‘A officers of the Governzmeat.



572 DELHIGAZETTE: EXTRAORDINARY

7 Travelling Facilities.-A Member shall be entitled 1 reimbursement of the expenditire
incurrd d on the joumey undertaken sither by tail, road or air in India alongwith hisher
spouse and dependent children, dependent parents and one companion upto an ameoui
of Bs 15,000 in a year,

4. Motor Car Advance.-A Member shall be entitled to an advance upta Rs. 50,000/
for purchase of Jeep™Motor Cycle or any light vebucle or the actual cost of the vehicle,
whichever is less, recoverable with interest 2t the rate applicable to Members of Parliament
within 4 period not exceeding five years from the date of its sanction or before the expiry
of his ferm as Member of the Assembly, whichever is shorter, subject to the following
comditions :—

@ On the acoeptance of an spplication for advance, the Member shall sxecure 3
deed undertaking o usc the advance for the purpose for which, and o fulfil
the condilions on which, the sdvance i sanctioned and also renderimg himself
and such property as may have been specified in the deed as security, liable
for the repayment of the loas, and irteest due thereon,

(i} No rransfer, assignment or charge made or ereated after the excontion of the
deed under sub-clause (i}, i reiation to the property specified (herein shall be
valid against the President of Tndia unless if has been made or created with his
previous order in writing,

{ury If the mermber having obtained an advance dies during his term as such Member,
the reeovery of putstanding advance fram his heirs, shall be governed by the
Reles applicable to the Members of Patliument,

% Pension.-(1) There skall be paid a pension al tupees three hundred per menzem w
@ Member on completion of four years continuosly or in parts, but of the term of five
¥oars:

Provided that where any person has secved as a Member aforesaid for a period
exceeding five vears, there shall be peid 1o him an additienal pension of seventy
five Tupees per mensent for every completed year in excess of rupees thiee
lmndred subject toa muximem of seven hundred and fifty rupees per mensem.

(2} Where any ex-Member entitled to pension under sub-section (3]

il s appointed o the office of the President or Vice President of India ar
appuinted 1o the Office of the Governer of any State or the L. Governor ar
Administrator of any Union Territory;

i,

E=

becomes a Mernber of the Council of States or the House of the People or of
any Legizlative Assembly of 2 Sate: or Union Territory or any Legislative
Council of a State; or

(i) 15 employed on a salary under the Central Government, or any Corporation
owned by or contiolled by the Cenrral Goverment ar any State Government or
any [ocal authonty or becomes olheraise entitled to any remunesation from
such Governmerd, Comoration or local uthorities, as the cage may be shall
nat be entitled to any pension under sub-clause (1} for the period during which
he continues to hold such uifice or as» such Member or is employed, or
continues 10 be entitled to such remuneration -




DELIIGAZETTE: EXTRAORDINARY 1

Provided that where the salary payable to snch ex-Member for holding such office
ot being such Member or 50 employed, or where the renmmeration veieried 1o
in clause (iii} payabbe to such ex-Member is, in either cases, less than a pension
payable w him pnder sub-secton (1) sudh ex-Member shall be entitled oaly 10
receive the balance as pension umder that sub-section.

{41 Where any ex-Member entitled Lo pension under sub-szction (17 is also entitied
any pension [rom the Ceptral Government or any Stae Gevermment of any Corpuaton
owned ar controlled by the Central Gvoernnment o7 any State Ciovernment, o any [ncal
authority under any faw or otherwise, then—

(a1 where the amuunt of persion o whtich he 1 entitled nnder such law or olherwise
iz equal w or in excess of that 1o which he is entitied under sub-section (L
such ex-Member shall not be cntitled o any pengion under that sulb-seclion;
and

(b} where the amount of pension to which he is enritled under such law or otherwise
is Tess than that 1o which he iz entitled under sub-section (1), such ex-Member
shall be entitled to pension under that sub-section only uf an amount which
falls short of the amaunt of pengion which he is oihersse enfitled under
that sub-seciton

Provided that any pension (whether known a5 Swatantrata Saink Samrman
Pension of by any other name) received by such ex-Member as 2 freedom
fighter shall not be taken into account for the purposes of this sub-section and
he shall be entitled to receive such pension in addition o the pension 1o which

. he iz entitled under sub-section (1)

(4) In computing the number of years. for the purpose of sub-section (1), the

petiod during which a persen has served as & Minister as defined in the Ministers of

the Government of Mational Capital Terrtory aof Delhi (Salaries and Allownces) Act,

1994 or as Speaker or Deputy Speaker as defined in the Speaker and Deputy Speaker

of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Della (3 alaries and

Allowances) Act, 1994 or both by virlue of Tus membership in the Legislative Assmbly
@hall also be taken into account,

. Repeal - The Members ot Legislutive Assembly of the Mational Capital Termitory of
Delhi { Sulanes, Allownces and Pension) Order, 1993 shall coase 1o have effect as from the
date of the enforcement of this Act.



TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99

AT LRI
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Velhi @azette

TGS -31.0cl.-37.-10032023-244 251
SG-DL -E-10032023-244251

STETYTIT
EXTRAORDINARY

TIARTE o THRTTAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 74] faett, AT, AT 10, 2023/ BTR[T 19, 1944 ok € 514
No. 74] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/ PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N. C.T.D. No.514

T 1V
PART IV

TET LT ST &7 fiwslt 9
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

faftr, =g vq fagrft «rd faumr
CIPKCE]
faoell, 9 9/, 2023

|. BT 14(69) / TalU—3030 /dsadvice/112-120.—9IRd & Igufad gRT fHAld 14 HRas), 2023 &l
el |eAfd & uverq ISR el F fSeel @ e &1 FrfeiRed e SemeRer a7 e
YepTfIrd fhar Sirar g—

TS g 87 et faa=aar © 9gw @+, w<d, 99 saf) (Weee) T, 013
(033 @71 feeell FfAfT o%)
4 SJEITs 2022 B TSR RIS &3 faeell $I [erTa+ gRT J21 91ika)

[9" March, 2023]

ISR IO &3 fdoell [eradr & dew (da9, W, UeF 1) AfafFH, 1994 H g GO &) &
o | RT TR & fogaRd ¥ # T o & e fau T g1 98 gy fEfaRad wu # gg
fSfafia & —

1.  dftra e vd gRa—(1) 9 fAfem & I o aF fAeel fauaw @ Aey (dad, W,
U3 ScTfe) (Heire) AfSH, 2023 HET SIRATT |

1604 DG/2023 Q)




2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

(2) IT SURTUTA GRT ATHHII IISUF H ARGAAT gRT Je-raa I 31 uger 8nm |

2. ORI 3 BT AIMET — TS Ao & Reell g & de (a9, w1, e ganfe) srfafem,
1994 (1995 &1 facell IAITH 6) (S Uzamd "o IV & wU H Hafia) & aRT 3 3§ —

(@) SUEIRT (1) # —

(i) "9RE TR ¥U" Y@l & WM W "0 &R 9" &l B ufcrenfya faar S

(ii) TP TOR U VRl & WM W “TH golR Urd Al U oal B ufcrenfia faar S
SUYRT (2) § "“3MORE BOR $UY’ @l & WM R U 89K $U &l b7 yfoRenfud far
SITEET;

SUYRT (3) H "BE TOR B Il & WIFH TR “TH §9IR BU" Iea] &I ufewenfad favar swee;
SWIRT (4) § "T9 BoIR 0" ¥l & WM R UG8 g9R SUU veai $I yfoRenfud foam Smom;
SWIRT 4 & TsATq AfiRad SURT &1 Af=fase faar S, srerfa—

"(5) U® FDHIA & foY IS T DI oiyeiy, AfFaTd ey, fUier, Aasa dede, sanfe @l
ERIT &g VIR 9l & U H Bl Vb g B0 YA fbar e |
3. HRT 6 BT ALNGA —Hc JTIH Pl &gRT 6 H 3T "3 TR IWI” &I & WIH R TH BolR 30"
Y&l BT yfoRenfua e e,

4. ORI 6@ BT GAGT — T AT BT gRT 68 H AU "I BoR IWI" @I & @ R "Th AG
I Wl Bl Gl fdhar SrgEm;

5. ORI 8 ®T WG — T AMAFRH & g_7 8 & IWIRT (1) H MY IR oG R @I & R W

6. ©IRT 9 BT HIIET — Hol JRH BT gRT 9 H Y "Hd &9R U Al 30" &I & WJF W UG8
BOIR TUY" TRl Bl yfoRenfud far smem;

g

~

a4 9 3

~

TRA URRR, yae |fea ([@fd, =ma vd fqurd orf)

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

F.14 (69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/112-120—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 14™ February, 2023 and is hereby
published for general information:-

“THE MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF
DELHI (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES, PENSION, ETC.) AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023”

(DELHI ACT NO. 04 OF 2023)
(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th July, 2022).
[9™ March, 2023]

An Act further to amend the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi
(Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-third
year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint.



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 06 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act), in section 3, —

(@) insub-section (1)-
(i) for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees”, shall be substituted;

(if) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words “twenty five thousand rupees”,
shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “six thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousands rupees”, shall be
substituted,;

(d) in sub- section (4), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, shall be
substituted,;

(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely.-

“(5) There shall be paid to each Member a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of
laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office.”.

3. Amendment in section 6. — In the principal Act, in section 6, for the words “eight thousand rupees”, the words
“ten thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

4. Amendment in section 6A.- In the principal Act, in section 6A, for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the
words “one lakh rupees”, shall be substituted;

5.  Amendment in section 8. — In the principal Act, in section 8, in sub-section (1), for the words, “four lakh
rupees”, the words “eight lakh rupees”, shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 9. — In the principal Act, in section 9, for the words “seven thousand five hundred
rupees”, the words, “fifteen thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  uwosuunr




TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99
HILT GIAhIT

Velhi zette

TH.S.-31.0cl.-37.-11032023-244272
SG-DL-E-11032023-244272

JYTETI
EXTRAORDINARY

TIARTE o THRTTAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 79 faeeft, SphaT, AT 10, 2023/FTRT 19, 1944 [raaafR €. 519
No. 79] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N.C. T.D. No.519

| IV
PART IV

TE T T & et aahe
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELH]I

fafer, =g w9 faumrf +=~f fawmr

FferegaT
faeetl, o #Td, 2023
. W 14(69) / TdAU—3030 /dsadvice/158-166.—IT g ol &3 fieell faumam @
e (dad, W, veH enf]) (Wuee) orfif™, 2023 (2023 @1 ool SR 4) @ aRT 1 @Y

SULRT (2) ERT UG hAT BT TART B 8T, IS GG &7 fdeell & SURISAUTA, 14 HRAR], 2023
Ih AfAEH B vgd B @1l [f¥ed exd € |

facell I ISET & SURTSIUTA
P AR I IR I9b 99 W,

TRA URRR, YL Al

1612 DG/2023 @)



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART V]

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

No. F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/158-166.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the sub-section (2) of
section 1 of the Members of Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances,
Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2023 (Act No. 4 of 2023), the Lieutenant Governor of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi hereby, appoints 14th February, 2023 as the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force.

By Order and in the Name of the Lieutenant Governor
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



	1.pdf
	2.pdf
	3.pdf
	4.pdf

		2023-03-10T22:33:36+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




