
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi, 
(Salaries and Allowances) Amendment Act, 1995 

 
Act 4 of 1996 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Salary, Sumptuary Allowance 
 
Amendments appended: 7 of 1998, 4 of 2003, 3 of 2023



for gcncral informanon . . 

\ THE SPEAKER AND DEPUTY S P E m R  
OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEhlBLY OF TTIE 

I NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF 
DELHI (SALARIES & ALLOWANCES) " 

(AMENDMENT) ACT, I995 

1 (DELHI ACT NO. 3 0Fl996) 

I Dated 14th March, 1996 

I AN q?r$ F+ $T m : ~  u.lk;i ef< qqkt  'i:p?ii ai-7[Wi? 

. ACT - . ntl. 5 &.I kti iri WI&I G m ?i= B =%+ ii 
m; a7 waar & I 

Furll~cr to mcnd  ' T h e  Speaker and DepuLy 

I Spzdrcr of the Legislative ' k t m b l y  of ' chk - - - -- 
Yationd Czpital Territa~y of Dclhi' (Salaries k Nh.:, F.13(4) 196-L.A.-The followiiiS Act of 

- Xllo~vnnc~~')  Act, 1994'. Legislalive Asscmbly rcctivcd 1l1c assent of 11:s 
. . Prcsidenf of India on 7th Mnrcl~. 1996 and rs 

1 Ec i t  enacteil by [he ~ e & l a ~ v e  Assci~bly of 
~ h c  National Capital Tcrriiory of 'Delhi in the  
Forty Sixth Year of rhe Republic oi lndjn as 
iollo!~s :- - 

1 .  Short Title and Cornmencernenl.-(I ) This 
.Act may be called 'The Spcker and Deputy 
Speaker of the Lcgislalivc h c m b l y  of thc 
Xational Capital Tcrfitory of Delhi (Salaries 6: 

(Amcndoienr) AcC 1995'. 

. i2) It shall come into force on such date as 
d ~ e  Lt. Governor may, by notification in the offi- .. 

cinl Gazette appoint. 

hereby published for ge,~eiai inIolil~nlion. 
. - ,  

THE ~ ~ S T E R S  .OF TE GOVERN~IENT 
OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERNTORY 

OF DELIII (SALARIES AND Al,LC)\V- 
ANCES) (AMENDhENT) Act i 995. 

(Delhi Act NO. 4 of 1996) 

(X):t!cd, Ikc I4til M~rcl i ,  19?G 

2. Omission of Section 6.-In [he Spcakcr Further to amend 'The Ministers of the 
nepul); speaker of rile hgislative ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ b l ~  Govcmment of the National, Capital Tcrrizory of 

cf National Capital Tc-~{ory of D,=lhi Dcll~i (Salad= 6r Mlowauca) AcL 1994'- 
E a l a r i w  & Allowances) Act. I994 (Delhi Act Bt i t  enacted by tlle Legislative Assemhly 

of Ihe NaiionaI Capital Territory of Dclhi in the 
Forty Sixih Year of the Republic of India as 

. I ( ~ / G . - I ,  ~ O ~ ~ O L V S  :- 

1. Short Title and C0nlmencement.--(I ) This 
Act may be called T h e  Ministers of h e  Govern- 

mmir  ria R S i  3 F4mi m B qTarrY % k=c ment of the National Capital Terri~ory of D'elhi 
(Salaries & Allawances) (mendmcnl) Act, 
1995'. - - 

( 2 )  Ir shall come in10 force on such datc ns 
( C d { ~ : ~ i ~ a ~ l ~ ~ h o c r r r o m r 6 ~ 1  Ihe-lieutcnantGavemormay,. bynotif icnrionin 

a rnf-TTR rhe oficial Gazette, appoint. 

61m ft k ( i i i t i 4  T+ * m i  h. mr 2. ~mendment  of Section 3.-In 'The Mink- 
- h=qm- i  rii- mCr ~fqw:- lers of .he  Government of Ihe National Capital 

~ i r ~ 4 1  @ rTjri.-(lj q ~ ~ 9  Territory of Delhi (Salaries & AlIowances) Act, 
gmii fia h f l  aim7 % &fi'? h- (k e ~ k j  (f iniaq) 

1994 Inelhi Act 8 01 1995)' (liereianler reEerrcd 
[o as "the principal -Actq'), in section 3, sub- 
scclion (3) shaU be orni~ted. 



2 DELI-II GAZETTE : 
- . . . . 

. . .  , 

. -- 
.. .. 

2.  LJpJ 6 3 ~ ~ ~ ~ - - ~ * m  w:d177 G? 
m-r qm 3 h=i +i (Gm !* YG) ( v F ~ ,  
19:)4)  ( 1 9 9 s  +T F:+-{? xrfirhq a)  a UTTT 

::q'r ( 1 )  <T : q ~  ( 7 )  % r m  l%-?i 

c~rxfl q% gbft71kf imr -:il;?i, :-- 
. . .  

( m %?- ;rn : $ h? .?i.if!a 
d ~ q  ,+fi R-1 2hT!T<i3' 

.. , . 
W . % . TiTiV;, 

' t. 
' 'L 

LAW.  JUSTICE k L E G ~ ~ L A T I V E  AFFAIRS DEFT. 

, NUTlFICATION 

Delhi, rlic 25111 J u ~ u ,  1098 

No. F. I r j 4  /gS-LAD:257.-'l'lic [ollorvinz ACL of 111: 
Lcgislativc Asccmbly rcccivcd 111c aiscnl Ihc Prcsirlcn~ on 
12-6-1 998 :tntl is I:crcby publishcrl for gcncnl inlormalion. 

T l ~ c  h i ; ~~ i s l c r s  of rlic C;ovrmacnt of ~ h c  Nn1iun:ll Cnpilr~l 
Tcl l.iti)l y ui I k l h i  (S;I~:I~ icfi ;~nd r \ l l o i r ~ ~ n c ~ s )  (Amenrlmenr) 
:\cl. 1 *)I1K-A.;\cnl. 

. [Dcll i i  .2cl Nu. 7 111 1998) 

[As p;~shcd by the Lcgislntivs Asscmbly uI thc Nal iun i~ l  
Capitill Tc~ri lory  oi Oclli i  on 3Crh March. 1978). 

Furrher lo a ~ r n J  "~l-ilr: hlinirtcrs ol thc Guvcrnn~cnt of 
Iltc Nntioaal Capita1 Ttr'rirory d r l r l h i  (Salaries nlid Allow- 
:~ncees) Act, 199-! (Dclhi Act 8 or 1995). . ,  

Bc i t  inactcd by -the Lc~i - lar ivc  -4ssrrnb:y of ~ h c  Niliional 
Capital T'erritoi-y of Dcll~i in tltc Ffll.lyrnint11 scar of [lie 
I*cpublic of Tndifi fullo\vs :-- 

I. S11ort titIu iuid Cornmcnccmvnt.-(I) This Act njay bc 
~ i l l l ~ d  [hc h.liiiis[crs uf tlic Govurnnlcnl 01 thc National Capi- 
tal Tcrrilol ;r of Dcll t i  tS:~furics and A1 Iownnccs) (Amend- 

. mcnl) Acl, 1398. 

: , (2J-1t shall co~nc into force on such datc as the L i c t ~ l e  
, . .. 13ant qodcrnor may, by nolifica!ion i n  [hc Oflicial 

. , : 1 : Gnzctte. :inpoint. . , 

2. ~mrndmcAt o[ Seciion 6,-In thc Ministers of the 
Gcv:rnmcr~t of the Nelional Cauital Territory of Bclhi  
!Salaries and Alluhances) Act, I994 (Delhi A1;1 8 of 1995) 
in scction d. in sub.s,eclion [I),  for clause (c), ~ h c  following 
shall bc ntbrtilutcd, .namely :- . 

"(C) the wlrol lor ~ h t  cnr uplo 3 rnnximum o f  scvcn 
hund14c,l :itre5 per nienscm a! Govcrnmenr cost.'. 

It. Ii. PARBHAKAR, Undcr Sccy. ([.&J) 

m F w c r  

q k q ~ a r  

k ~ ? ,  2557, I ~ ~ S J  4 . 

s. . 1 / 1 ( 2 ) / ? 1 2 - v . ~ . / ? ? T .  /1:10 .- T$ 

3 ,  T 2 1 , i 91; ( 

rRliORDlNARY 
. . . . ... .- 

$[ ;cT*,qq *qr 2/2;1 1 - q ! T - 2  k-,;-q r[ 

r m a F ~ m ,  1947(1!!4'; 

UI;TT s ZIT 9- ~f;*r m :%.IT :<:+ 

q+.;~ qq rqmq 3 ~ ~ r  3 

3xf< :+'r qi  cq ,:; ~TR ,*fi 5 I 

. . ; m m ~  $1 f ~ a f i  2.1 ql*, 1 9 6 1  -'!K%i,.: 

;ri??jbr? flaf=kV, 19.17 ( 1 9 : i ~  JiT 1.1) y c r  

qqqq=~ rm +.-r f :6~ :!.T~TF c:r ~ 1 : ;  [q<i 

9 hi?- sr;l- arq rn ah h ~ 3  ?:$$ 

TqYr  3 R% T i  m lL+r:iq;T $r qr? q? fq-c,i 

-. - . . . - - . , - . .. .n-r.~ 
> 

-- i-  Ti!: 77  

L.A 313 U ic DE i'r\ RTh 1 EN'T 

Dcliii, the 25!;.1 Juur, 15)'1G 

N021'j  FiC.'A'l-i  DPJ 

NO. F. 11 1 < 2.; ~ Y ~ - L C ~ E S I I ; - ; ~ ~ \ .  - 111 

pcwtrs ~ ( ~ n r t r r ~ d  s c c l l o ~ i  8 of II!C 111ril 
A c l ,  1947 IN,). S1V 01 !!)A7 j ~rc i l i l  

plzascd ro app,~l; i i  SI; 

Jain. 

rend with [he Cir\\tl, of I :~d i a ,  !:.f~~llsrry c<f !-lu!r~:: 
a i r s  Noiilic~li:~:~ NIL 2j21rl-.1 ucl l .  I [ Jaled Il:c 

tnl Territory DAI 



UW, JUJIISnCE AND LEGISLATIVE A X T F .  DEPAR'I3ZENT 

Dclhi, Ihc 9Lh Junc. 2003 
' 0 .  

Nn F. 14 (12)&h-200010~/978.-~11~ following Ad o f  the L&slalivc ~sscrnbl~  of the National Capilal Tcrritory 
oIDclhimi\dzhcasscntoilht Ptcsidcnl ofIndia on 18-5-20d3 and is hcreby publishcd lor gencral infor~nalion. . -- 

'%c~in iskrs  oilhe Govcmmcnl oilhc Narioml Capi~;ll~brrilpry olDelhi (Salaries and 'Allowamc;) (MlcndncnO 
Act  2003 (Dclhi AO'NO: 4 OF 2003)" . 

. 

( A s p s t d  by t h c ~ c ~ i s l ~ l i v c  Assembly of theNaConal Capi~alTcrrilory orDclhr on thc 3rd April, 2003). 
. . .  

Am AcI to f m c r  anlcnd Ihc hhistcrs of !Ilc Gorcrnfncnt orlhc ~a l iooa l  Ciipital ~crritor~ or (Salaries and 
AUonim~~~)Ac l .  1994 ( D c l h i ~ c t ~ o .  8 o'f 19!J5),. 

Bc i t  cnactcdby rhc Lcgisla~isc h s c n ~ b l y  of thc Naoonal Capibl Tcrrirory of'Dclhi 111 thcFifty-four711 ycarof lhe 
Rcpublic orIndia as follows :- , 

I. Shod ii114 ~d.to~mcnccmcnt--(i)ThisAct,may & cdcd  ~ h c  Minislcrs ~ i l h c  Govcrnmcnl a l  theNalion~l 
T E ~ ~ I O V  df k&'(&farics and Nlnrranaks) (Aii~ndl;;;cnr) , , A?< 2003: ' . 

(2) 11shal1 come. inloforcc . . on such'dateas 111; ~ t ' ~ a ~ c h o r r n a ~ ,  by notiilwti~n i t ,  lllcoKi~i31 G~ZCL~C,  appclinl. 

2. Substituti& or n(w:s&tior~ 101 Sacti& 9.-lnthe&~Xersorlhi &vernmrnloflh( Nalioird Cap id  Tcnito y 
of Dclhi (Salafics and Aliowancfsj Act, 1994 pelhi  Act 8 o f  1995). For Scciion 9, t h e  Collowing sl~all br subslitulcd 
nam+ :- 

"9 ~clcphooeFacik.s-~ach Minis~cr shall  bc grovidcd w i n  , such , numkr of~clcphoncs. with such ccilings on 



- 1 

iramthc,lelcphone~ installed at the oEcc and Ihc residence bf Be  Ministers as may bc deterrnincd by tljc 
nan~ Gmcmor horn b c  lo lime." , . . 

In cxcrcisl: or t!lle.po\vcrs co<errcd.by Sub-syiion (2) or Section 1 of "Thc Mininers or  thc Govcrn~ncnr 01 
Capilal Temrory oiDchi (Salari@ and Allm~anas) Amendmcnl Am 2033 (Del hi ACI NO. 4 of2003)", h c  Liculcnant , 

ernor orlhc National ~ a ~ i ~ ~ l  Temtor). orDclhi hcreby appoi l s  rl~c 9lh June. 2003 as [hc datc on svhich thc idorcraid 
shall mmc inlo forcc. . 



1603 DG/2023 (1) 

रजिस्ट्री स.ं डी.एल.- 33002/99                                                                                                                                  REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99 

 

 

xxxGIDHxxx 
xxxGIDExxx 

असाधारण 
EXTRAORDINARY 

प्राजधकार स ेप्रकाजित 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

 

भाग IV 

PART IV 

राष्ट्रीय रािधानी राज्य क्षते्र दिल्ली सरकार 
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

 

fnYyh] 9 ekpZ] 2023 

dsadvice/103-111.—Hkkjr ds jk"Vªifr }kjk fnukad 14 Qjojh] 2023 dks 

feyh lgefr ds i'pkr~ jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk dk fuEufyf[kr vf/kfu;e tulk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ 

çdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gS%&  

4 tqykÃ 2022 dks jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk }kjk ;Fkk ikfjr½   

[9th March, 2023] 

jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ljdkj ds ea=h ¼osru ,oa HkÙks½ vf/kfu;e] 1994 dk iqu% la'kks/ku djus ds fy, 

vf/kfu;e A Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds frgRrjosa o"kZ esa jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk }kjk  fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 

vf/kfu;fer gks %& 

 ¼1½ bl vf/kfu;e dks jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh ljdkj ds ea=h ¼osru ,oa HkŸks½ 

¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2023 dgk tk;sxkA 

स.ं   73]  दिल्ली,  िकु्रवार, मार्च 10, 2023/फाल् गनु 19, 1944 [रा.रा.रा.क्ष.ेदि. स.ं 513 

No. 73]   DELHI,  FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N. C. T. D. No. 513 

 

भारत सरकार 

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

     

एस.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-10032023-244252
SG-DL-E-10032023-244252



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV] 

¼2½ ;g mi&jkT;iky }kjk 'kkldh; jkti= esa vf/klwpuk }kjk ;Fkkfu;r frfFk ls izòÙk gksxkA 

  jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh ljdkj eas ea=h ¼osru ,oa HkŸks½ vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1995 dk 

fnYyh vf/kfu;e 8½ ¼blds i'pkr ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** ds :i esa lanfHkZr½ dh /kkjk 3 esa & 

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ^^chl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^lkB gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa ^^,d gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d gtkj ikap lkS #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k 

tk,xk( 

¼x½ mi/kkjk ¼3½ esa ^^vBkjg gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^rhl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼?k½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa ^^ipkl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d yk[k #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼³½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk dks lfUufo’V fd;k tk,xk( vFkkZr& 

^^¼5½ izR;sd dk;Zdky ds fy, lnL; ds :i izR;sd ea=h dks ySiVkWi] O;fDrxr daI;wVj] fizaVj] eksckby gSaMlsV 

bR;kfn dh [kjhn gsrq ,dckjxh HkRrs ds :i esa dqy ,d yk[k #i;s Hkqxrku fd;k tk,xkA 

¼6½ izR;sd ea=h dks lfpoh; lgk;rk ds :i esa izfr ekg dqy iPphl gtkj #i;s dk Hkqxrku fd;k tk,xkA**   

- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 esa ^^pkj gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa 

dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

 

¼i½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa ^^nks gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk( 

¼ii½  mi/kkjk 4 ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk dks lfUufo’V fd;k tk,xk( vFkkZr& 

^^¼5½ ,d ea=h lnL; ds :i esa vius dk;Zdky ds Hkhrj ,d okgu dh [kjhn gsrq ckjg yk[k #i;s rd dk 

izfrns; vfxze okgu jkf'k ysus ds fy, ik= gksxkA  

 ¼6½ mi/kkjk 5 esa lanfHkZr vfxze gsrq C;kt nj rFkk mldh olwyh dk rjhdk jk’Vªifr ds iwoZ vuqeksnu ls 

ljdkj }kjk fu/kkZfjr fd;k tk,xkA**   

Hkjr ikjk'kj] iz/kku lfpo ¼fof/k] U;k; ,oa fo/kk;h dk;ZZ½ 

 

 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS 

NOTIFICATION 

Delhi, the 9th March, 2023 

F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/103-111—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the 

National Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 14
th

 February, 2023 and is hereby 

published for general information:- 

“THE MINISTERS OF THE GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023” 

(DELHI ACT NO. 03 OF 2023) 

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th July, 2022). 

[9
th

 March, 2023] 

An Act further to amend the Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1994. 

 Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-third 

Year of the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement. - (1) This Act may be called the Ministers of the Government of National 

Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2023. 

(2)   It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official 

Gazette, appoint. 

2.    Amendment of section 3. – In the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries 

and Allowances) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 8 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3,- 



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3 

  
(a) in sub-section (1), for the words  “twenty thousand rupees”, the words  “sixty thousand rupees” shall be 

substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words  “one thousand five hundred rupees” 

shall be substituted; 

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words  “thirty thousand rupees” shall be 

substituted; 

(d) in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted; 

(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely; -  

“(5) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of 

laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office as a Member. 

(6) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees twenty five thousand per month as secretarial 

assistance.”  

3.  Amendment of section 4. –In the principal Act, in section 4, for the words “four thousand rupees” the words 

“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

4. Amendment of section 6.-  

(i) In sub-section (4), for the words “rupees two thousand rupees”, the words  “rupees ten thousand” shall 

be substituted 

(ii) After sub-section (4) the following sub-sections shall be inserted. – 

“(5) A Minister shall be entitled to a conveyance advance up to twelve lakh rupees for purchase of 

conveyance to be repayable within his term as a Member. 

(6) The rate of interest for the advance referred to in sub-section (5) and the mode of recovery thereon 

shall be such as may be determined by the Government, with the prior approval of the President.” 

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 



1611 DG/2023 (1) 

रजिस्ट्री स.ं डी.एल.- 33002/99                                                                                                                                  REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99 

 

 

xxxGIDHxxx 
xxxGIDExxx 

असाधारण 
EXTRAORDINARY 

प्राजधकार स ेप्रकाजित 

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

 

भाग IV 

PART IV 

राष्ट्रीय रािधानी राज्य क्षते्र दिल्ली सरकार 
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI 

 

fnYyh] 9 ekpZ] 2023 

dsadvice/149-157.—jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYYkh ljdkj ds ea=h 

¼osru ,oa HkŸks½ ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] „å„… ¼„å„… dk fnYyh vf/kfu;e å…½ dh èkkjk 1 dh mièkkjk ¼2½ }kjk çnÙk 

'kfä;ksa dk ç;ksx djrs gq,] jk"Vªh; jktèkkuh {ks= fnYyh ds mijkT;iky] 14 Qjojh] 2023 mä vfèkfu;e dks 

ço`r gksus dh frfFk fuf'pr djrs gSa A 

fnYyh jk"Vªh; jktèkkuh ds mijkT;iky  

ds vkns'k ls vkSj muds uke ij] 

Hkjr ikjk'kj] iz/kku lfpo 

 

 

 

स.ं   78]  दिल्ली,  िकु्रवार, मार्च 10, 2023/फाल् गनु 19, 1944 [रा.रा.रा.क्षे.दि. स.ं 518 

No. 78]   DELHI,  FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N. C. T. D. No. 518 

 

भारत सरकार 

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

     

एस.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-11032023-244271
SG-DL-E-11032023-244271



2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV] 

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS 

NOTIFICATION 

Delhi, the 9th March, 2023 

No. F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/149-157.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the sub-section (2) of 

section 1 of the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) 

(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Act No. 3 of 2023), the Lieutenant Governor of the National Capital Territory of Delhi 

hereby, appoints 14th February, 2023 as the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force. 

By Order and in the Name of the Lieutenant Governor  

of the National Capital Territory of Delhi, 

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


		2023-03-10T22:40:32+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




