The Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,
(Salaries and Allowances) Amendment Act, 1995

Act 4 of 1996

Keyword(s):
Salary, Sumptuary Allowance

Amendments appended: 7 of 1998, 4 of 2003, 3 of 2023

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




DART 1\’]

;Lm 'GAZEfrE . EXTRAORDINARY \

No., Fl3(3)|96—LA-—-The fo]lowmg Act of -

> Legislative Assembly received the assent of ‘the
President- of Indin on 7th Much, 1996 and s
%~ hereby published for gemeral information.

THE SPEAKER AND DEPUTY SPEAKER
OF THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE
NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY QF
DELHI (SALARIES & ALLOWANCES)
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 1993

{(DELHI ACT NO. 3 OF 1996)
Dated 14th March, 1996

— s

AN
ACT

Further to amend ‘The Speaker and Depuly
Spzaker of the Legislative Ascembly of the
National Capital Territey of Delhi’(Salaries &
- Allowaness) Act, 1994,

Bc it enacted by the chlsl'luve Assembly of
" the National Capital Temitory of Delhi in the
Fortly Sixth Year of the Republic oI India as
“tallows '—

1. Shert Title and Commencement,—(1) This
JAct may be called “The  Speaker and Deputy
d Spcaker of the Legislative Assembly of the
B National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries &
. Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 1995

- 12) It shall come into force on such date as
¢ Qe Lt. Governor may, by notification in the offi-
ccial Gazette appoint.

t 2. Omission of Section 6.—In the Speaker
R 2nd Deputy Speaker of the Legislafive Assembly
¢f the National Capital Termritory of Delhi
(Sularies & Allowances) Act, 1994 (Delhi Act
N7 af 1995), section 6 shall be omitted.

- T 3 (4]/ec-kw.q. —ugala w Raw 7 A,
g 1206 ©f Fdy agafa & ovwm Fasig me1 ora olw fee-
7 iR 9% erEror & And wetiee I w0 8-
. :— wgm Wt fa T 0 F fom ogm o ® wl’aa‘u ¥ &
.Y wa (wewR) afafwm oigas.

fedr qinfsee www 4, 1956

vl

o e ¥ feceied ot & Temt R
o fmen st fear snr—

1. Al WiR oF qrem— (1] ;z afifme oem
—yari fa & g@Fe & e B (f9S qd w%) (gaiex)
SETETHER, 1985 ¥EATQ

(fes Deanh Ga Redi © BEm ger fog wmovdg)

[ ) ] TRz R T § e rﬁ T
I‘mrr?r'r{a (r—rq] gwe

2. HIG 4 ¥ ORid TG T@ad 89 (w8 qwre
% ufast & - (e @ ) Wi, 1994 (1895, w5
feph wichigm) (ug oz § 7y wighiow ¥ e i skwfa)
T -EAT 3 w0 SN (3) WG sIqEr
A w6 Wi TR -gw faie® T oomr g 7 s
ara (1) %, ww (8] ¥ faq fied@m shanid i
wTEA Aty -

“N)T wenil WO 9K A1 WL 200 Hire @
e % g 9gw

avd fe 357 o@R el o yatsr sl O T

wl ® o R W owEA §owe @ ¥ oweEdT § W

T AT GAT & |

N6 F.13(4)|96-L.A. —Thc following Act of
Legistalive Asscmbly received the assent of the
President of India on  7th March, 1996 and s
hereby published for genenl informalion.

THE MINISTERS .OF THI. GOVERNMENT
DF THE NATIQNAIL CAFITAL TERRITORY
OF DELHI (SALARIES AND ALLOW-
ANCES) (AMENDMENT) Act 1995.

(Delhi Act No, 4 of 19946)
(Died, the 1410 March, 1996
AN
ACT,

Further to amend ‘The Ministers of the
Government. of the National, Capital Terrizory of
Delhi (Salaries & Allowaocesy Act, 1994

Be it cnacted by the Legislative Assembly
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the
Forty Sixth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :-—

1. Short Title and Commencement.—{1) This
Act may be called “The Ministers of the Govern-
ment of the National Capital Territory of Delhi
(galancs & Allowa.nces} (Amendment)  Act,
1995 : X

(2) It shall come into force on such datc as
the Lientcnant Governor may, by notification in
the official Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of Section 3.—In ‘The Minis-
ters of the Government of the National Capital
Territory of Dethi (Salaries & Allowances) Acl,
1994 (Delhi Act 8 of 1995)' (lhereianter referred
to as “the principal Act™), in section 3, sub-
section (3) shall be omitted.



2

DELHI GAZETTE

5 g4I 6 T AWEA——TEE AT a3
B wore ¥ cfggt % (Gaq 07 wd) (wfafom,
1994) (1995 wv Pt afufmw 8) &1 ura
st oz (1) & v (7)) F omm oax e

fifag 37 aReafm w0 Ahan 79 -
“(q) woEEr =F W gw & fad o aa
afirray =@ g dze abi

qr7. . U,

o< e ([ v =)

LAW, JUSTICE & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS DEPT.

' 'NOTlFICATION
Delhi, the 25th June, 1998

No. F. 14/4/98-LAD257—The following Act of Ihe
Legistative Astembly reccived ihe assent of the President on
12-6-1998 undl is Lereby published for gencral informalion.

The Muisters of the Government of the National Capiln)
Territmy of §2elhi (Sulaiies and Allowances) {(Amendment)
Act, TIE-Asmonl. .

. . (Delhi Act No. 7 of 1998)

(As passed by the Legislative Asscrably of the National
Capitid Tewritory of Delhii on AMth dMarch, [993).

AN
ACT

Further lo amend *The Ministers of the Government of
1e National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allow-
ancees) Act, 1993 (Delhi Act 8 eof JD95). -

Be it enacted by The Leaitlative Assembly of (he Mational -

Cupital Territory of Dellw in the Forly:ninth year of the
Republic of Tndin as fullows —

1. Short title and Commencement.—(1y This Acet may he
cilled the Ministers of the Governmenl of the National Capi-
tal Territory of Delhi (Soluries and Allowances) (Amznd-
.menty Act, 1998,

. {2Y It shall come into force on such date as the Licule-
, ... mant Gavcrnor may, by notification in the Oflicial
<11 Gazetie, appoint, O '

2, Amendment of Seclion 5,—ln the Ministers of the
Government of the Nalional Capital Territory of  Delhi
{Salacies and Allowances) Act, 1994 (Delhj Agl 8 of 1995)

in scction 4, in sub-section (1), for clavse (c), the followi
shall be substituted, namely — @ lowing

i ) -
(C) the p:.-trql_ for ihe car upto 2 maximum of seven
undre, litres per mensem af Government cost.”

R. K. PARBHAKAR, Under Secy. (L&D

a7 faag
Afsq=ar
fzsfl, 2577, 199%.
_ A, w1 1f1(2)/ ez A e [ane — 17
A, AT AT fF RAT o2 wmE a6

: EXTRRORDINARY

*1 wlagaar  war 3z -EE- F
#iaifrs  fagre  sfafera,  1947(1047
FT W 8 ZITT 939 Wiwdl T OREIT
Gemaf) WS YMEAEl W OPTRETCOL
faea, 3o, AT
AR, F. ad w waE 97 Ael ner
¥ BA T ag ameg o ama g ow
ufavry Ferd (e W)

— el == P
LELEN B o

W,/ Ufglee-mar, e, () s
G @THIR AT {2qiw 24 HT®, 1961 U Ay
wathrs e, 1947 {1947 FTO14) 0T 4
a3 Foarainr (2) F 9ol & sEEor
e T X sgemE A Sn . e 3
WATIRT AT AT R ATHIE 21 % (AR
& famd arr gra mowlr bwwy i@y
TNAT 37 RT & O (e SNAT F1 oaE w1 fifig
w7e % fa fafsfrz o '

e
EX

th

&,

LABOUR DEPARTMENT A{’

Delie, the 255 June, 1998 -

| NOTIEICATION £ woar
No. F. 1]1{2;192-LCIESILE30 - I exeiiee of (s 13T

powers conferred section 8 of the Industrial I_Easpj;_@ _.5;} T

Acl, 1947 (No. NIV of 19473 remd wath Govy ok i

India, Ministry of Home Afairs Notificaticr No. 2[2
Ol-Jdl, 1T dued (he 2Mh Macch, 1901, e Lt GO
vernor of the Nalional Capital Teenitory ol DelhiZss
pleascd 1o appoint Shi G. I Milial, o momber Of (HEES
Delhi Higher Tudicial Seiviee, us Lie Prosiding (fficegg
of Labour Court No. 3, Dellil. constituted for th
National Capital Verrilery of Eelii, viee Shrt RK
Jain. §i=

No. F-1{1{2)92-LC Estt. (iito--[n pursuance
the provisions of Sub-sectinn (2} of section 33-C :
the Industrial Disnuies Act. [94T7 (X1V of 194 S
read with the Gowt, of [adia, Minisicy of Home Al
airs Nolificalion No, 2:26(-1udl. [ dated the 244
March, 1961, the Li. Governoe ol the National Oz
tal Territory of Delhi s pleased ra speeily the Lubopts
courl No. 3 consisting of Sho G P Minal for d_f:,t'g:f,'
mining the amorat at which any benelit or maoné)
thal any workaun may be entitled to receive {rom Hiss
cmployer and whizi is capab!s of being compued ig
teims of money, mar be compuled g

SNATHINAL, CATITAL
TCRY OF DFLHI

CHAMAN LAL. Sccv.




' ol Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 18-5 -2003 and is hereby pubhshcd for gcncral inf; orm :mon

B

1 L . DELHI GAZETTES En'monmmmr : \_Lh* LY.
' o faﬁx m@ﬁmﬁrmﬁfa‘m
sfirr=md
 feeh, 9 <, 2003

©d 14(12)1%: Emf—zaoo/os/ws o, mmﬁﬁwmqﬁ. 2003 ﬁiﬁﬂjqﬁ['a?m )
T T T o) S feeet g it Pttt sfrfem sreRe % e s i e -

ﬁﬁﬁu@qmﬁm%wﬁ(ﬂﬂaﬁwﬁ) (i) erfirfm, zoos(ﬁr«ﬂaﬁ:ﬁmm‘qﬂ 2003) "
m@wmwﬁ&ﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁwmsm 2003 =} T Wity
ﬁﬁﬁn@quﬁﬂﬁtm%ﬁﬁ (ﬂmaﬂ'{ﬁ) sifuafam, 1994 (1995 mﬁﬁﬂar&rﬁms)mﬁm}ww%

o v wfufms |

" WWW%W?&HWI@WWWWWWWWWWWWI '

1 mvﬁda:qam—(ﬂwaﬂ‘qﬁmﬁ Wwﬁ mmm#wﬁr(ﬁmmﬁ) (m'huﬂ)

srﬁrﬁzm 2003 FE WY - :
(z)mmmﬁmmaﬁmﬁumﬁmﬁﬁﬁmm; : -

2. umgtmmﬂéummuﬁwm &aﬁmmm&mm#ﬁ(maﬁt wﬁ)aﬁrﬁqq N
1994 (199saﬂﬁaﬁmﬁﬁma)a&mﬁ:mﬁmﬁrﬁfwm&ﬁmm — )

9. iﬁmwﬂmnﬁﬁmmmﬂwwnmﬁﬁmmﬁnmmmww |
ﬁmwaﬁﬂﬁ:ﬂqm%m T E AR

e it TR W 3 At (e SR (EER) srfufEs, zoua(ﬁﬁ"r:ﬂﬁﬁqqmqqd 2003) ") - :
m1ﬁm(z)%mmﬁﬂmwﬁmmumﬁqm@mﬁﬁﬁ%mmvs 2003 B xA
Hﬁaﬁqqn%mﬁ%uﬁﬁgﬁatgn}#ﬂmmﬂn .

LAW, JUSTICE AND LEG]SLATIVE AFFAIRS DEPARﬂIENT
" NOTIFICATIONS
Dethi, the9th June, 2003
No.E 14 {]Z)LLA 2000103{978 ~—The follawing Actof the Legislative Asscmbly of the National Capilal Tcrmory

"l‘hchﬁmslcrs ofthe Govermment of the Natianal Capilal Territory of Delhi (Salarics and mlo\\ ances) (Amendmenty £
Act, 2003 (Dclti Act No: 2o 2002)" )

(Asgpassed by Lhe chtsl;mvc Asscmbly of the Natienal Capiwal Terrilory. of Delhu on the Jrd April, 2003).

An Actto [urther amend the Ministers of the Govcmmcnl of the Natiodal Capital Territary of Dclhi (Salaricsand  :
Allowances) Acl, 1994 (DclIuAct'No 8 of[995) . o

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly nt’lhc Nallonal Capltal Tl:m.tory u]'D::ll'u in lhc I‘tﬂy-fuurth)caroﬂhc
Republic of India as follows:—

. L.Shonl htlc and-commencement.—(1) This Act may be called lhc MHIISICIS of the Government of the Nauonal
Capital Termitory ochllu (Salarics and Allowances) (Amcndmcm) A‘CL 2003 ) :

{2) Itshall comé mlo foroc on suchdate as the LL Govcmor may, by nouﬁcalmn in he ofMicial Gazelte, 1ppn:nt

2 Subshruuon of new sechan for Section 9.—Inthe Mlm\stels of Lhe Governmeat of thg Nationa Capita) Territory
of Delhi-(Salafics and Allomccs) Act, 1954 (Dellu Act 8 of 1995). for ‘Scetion 9, the following shall be substituled |
narmely :— . .

“q Telqihone }‘aciliﬁc.&-—Each Minisier shall be provided with such number of ielephones, with such ceilingson |




v .  DELHI GAZETTE:EXTRAORDINARY

’ oo v .
@l made fiom the telephones pnstalled at the office and the residence of the Ministers as may be determined by the

wtenant Govenor fom Lme to time,”

ks in axercise of l!he.pawcrs conferred by Sub-scelion (2) of Section |.of “The Ministers ol the Governmet of

'm] Capilal Territory of Dethi (Salarics and Allowances) Amendmenl Act, 2003 (Delhi ACINo. 4 0f2003)", the Licutleram

erernor of the National Capital Territory of Delhi hereby appoints the Sth June, 2001 as the datc on which the aforesaid
it shall come into force. o

. WL 14( 1) T wd—97/03 /994 —Tmgla, wE wER F & 22 WS, 2003 B fek T 3 T
™ TR T &t frelt wro Wi Prerfef sifufrm wwearen ¥ gerd st iR ta @ o —

"ﬁﬁ%f@ﬂwﬁm_zﬁl-ﬁmw%wmfﬁ'eﬂt 13 orfufraw, 2003 (feee efirfem T 5 ot
3" ' -
| (T err B foel A faur W pro 24 B, 2003 R V@)

: ﬁﬁﬂn@qmﬁaﬁrﬁ‘mw%wmﬁ%wmq%aafuﬁm,:ooaft?:hm’_ TR T fAnm
e < AEEM T F O WS 6 A e o e R b e o e :

1. Wi vl T ARt —( 1) ¥ AP @ el t@qmﬂﬁ‘tﬁﬁmwﬁwmﬂ?ﬂmaﬂtﬁ
T, 2003 W AL :

¥ (2) 7w T ¥ et @ svieawrs g R fela i g

2. GRUTHTE . —v79 o el R v a7 % ) v fifrm H—

(%) 'ﬁma%ﬁm'aﬁ?vﬂvqhwﬁaﬁﬁm?ﬁm?ﬁmﬁﬁ a1d & for fram g TEEA A TR FE I
o BT FW G H G I et 4 G T FXE D o T &, R fam wn S e 6 I8 i v
= G T e ) _

(@) ' e’ 6 ﬁaﬂn@nmﬂﬁdﬁmﬁ% awmﬁ%-n_

3 G ERAE & A ofT MR — (1) TR T fowelt Tt TEt Uva 63 v AfutT, 1994 (1995

st woa 8) 3 it 3 srmy fe w0 F firer w3, Prafer i v, 36 8 % 50 ¥ ol wed o
!:l(gl'r“l .

(2) 53 TN0F ﬁ:a’-ﬁmﬂﬂrﬁmﬁmmm sfufra, 1994 (1995‘Ern"lﬁ:‘ﬁﬁ sl e 8 ) & S &

B o et vt 2 et e e R 9 e R T R R

(3 o i ) ferh & AT eon e e 2 ) R, T, & v o o e e e e
b <t R i e Ut G T A T O R FRee T TR Yo QR i i, 1994 (1995

B =i i 8) 6 et Pt 2 e e e A g A e w

era ¥ for YEA wre foedt ﬁm%wqﬁmﬁmﬁﬁ*ﬂnﬁwﬁmm& e R F A

b . vror s = Pl R, e T e TR e 2 i T d & feeeh weEm
¥ S, 1990 (1995 T Reeh aifufier SE 8) ¥ siRote wif 3 W% 7 ¥ w6 e ghd s = &

.l | | |
5. W@ HIRe T Tl R, — 5o v Te Terer R 5 w3 1 TSI TN FEn e T

B it T U, 1994 (1995 6 Feeedl Sl e 8) e fe Tl R v R

: 6., A W TR T o WER S WA e Al uﬁﬁw-—w_m_ﬁmm#m_#mﬁﬁﬁ
%i&qﬂ‘ﬁmﬂtﬁmﬂﬁnﬁmmﬁmm?ﬁmmﬂﬁmmmtﬁmmﬁﬁmmmmﬁ



TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99

AT LRI
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Velhi @azette

TS, -31.Ucl.-37.-10032023-244 252
SG-DL -E-10032023-244252

STETYTIT
EXTRAORDINARY

TIARTE o THRTTAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 73] feetl, AT, WTH 10, 2023/FTR[T 19, 1944 o fR € 513
No. 73] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N.C. T.D. No.513

T 1V
PART IV

TET LT ST &7 fiwslt 9
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI

faftr, =g vq fagrft «rd faumr
CIPKCE]
faoell, 9 9/, 2023

. BT 14(69) / TaU—3030 /dsadvice/103-111.—9Rd & Igafad gRT G 14 HRaN, 2023 Bl
el |eAfd & uverq ISR Sl a7 fSeell @ e &1 FrfeiRed e SemeRer o e
1T fbar Sirar g—

IS T g7 fieel! WReR @ w3l (a9 vd W) (ened) afSfs, 03
(033 &1 faeedl fAf—H 03)
4 SJEITS 2022 PI TSR RIS &5 faeell S [Aeraa«r gRT J2r aiika)

[9™ March, 2023]

ISR o & fQeell WRGR & HA1 (99 Ud ) ARFRE, 1994 BT T WA BRI D (oY
ARfFRM | R TR & fagaRd 99 # I o o fieelt @ furer grr fEforfad v # uw
rffrafya 8 —

1 dftrq e va yRw — (1) 39 A & I o 89 Aol WReR @ #Al (a9 Td W)
(M) SNfSf=rH, 2023 HET STRATT |

1603 DG/2023 1)




2 DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART IV]

(2) IT SURTIUTA GRT ARAHII U= H AEGAAT §RT Jii~raa [y & uger gnm |

2 ORI 3 T MG L JoRI &5 ool IWAR # #3 (@a9 vd 7)) AfAfm, 1994 (1995 &
faeetl 1™ 8) (3@ Ueand “qo ARF" & wU # Hafid) & gR_1 3 H —

(@) SUIRT (1) § 9N BOIR ¥9Y” T@&] & I R S BOR U Il BT gfoRenfa fbar o,
(@) STIRT (2) § "Udh OIR $UY" ¥@&I & WM R “UH g9R UE Al 9" el & yforenfua fear
SITQAT;

(") SUIRT (3) H "3M6RE TOR TUY TGl & WIH W U TR $YI” &l Pl ufcenfua faar Sirgem:
(€) SUIRT (4) § U9 EOIR $UY" Vel & XA R “TH oIRF U Ieai bT wlawenfid fear sme;
() SUIRT (4) & uwar fFr=falRad SUaRT &1 |fsfdse faHar g, srerid—

"(6) TS BRIGIA & foU 9e® & WU UASG FAl B oUeH, fead dEer, e, Aasd dede
SN B WIE 8g YhaRT 9l & ©U § ol U oIRg SUY YA fBdT ST |

(6) ISP HA Bl AT FEIA B WU H URT HIE Hof Tead SR S BT YA {HAT ST |

3. ORT 4 T GG —Jd IMARH P gRT 4 § IR §OAR IR &I & WM W "TH F9R 9" &l
H1 uforenfid fasar e,

4. ORI 6 BT AUAET —
(i) SUURT (4) % "< IR W TG} & W W "SH TOIR TSI ¥} BT yforenfia faar S
(i) SUERT 4 & g FEfaRad SUURT &1 AfFfase faar SIrgem; sierid—

“(5) Tb WA W B BU H AU BRIBI B AR Y dred Pl WNIG 8 dNE oA B qh Bl
gfcrer 31 ares I o @ forg o= g |

(6) SUERT 5 ¥ HaRid I Bg NI &R AT ISP el HT dIBI LA & Yd JgAreT |
WRHR gRT AR fbar Smeem |

TRA URRR, va e (A, =g va femd &ri)

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/103-111—The following Act of the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi received the assent of the President of India on 14™ February, 2023 and is hereby
published for general information:-

“THE MINISTERS OF THE GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023”

(DELHI ACT NO. 03 OF 2023)
(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi on 4th July, 2022).
[9™ March, 2023]

An Act further to amend the Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1994,

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-third
Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1.  Short title and commencement. - (1) This Act may be called the Ministers of the Government of National
Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) 1t shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries
and Allowances) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 8 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3,-



[PART IV DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY 3

(@ in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty thousand rupees”, the words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;

(¢) insub-section (3), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(d) insub-section (4), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted;
(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely; -

“(5) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of
laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office as a Member.

(6) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees twenty five thousand per month as secretarial
assistance.”

3. Amendment of section 4. —In the principal Act, in section 4, for the words “four thousand rupees” the words
“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4.  Amendment of section 6.-

(i) In sub-section (4), for the words “rupees two thousand rupees”, the words “rupees ten thousand” shall
be substituted

(ii) After sub-section (4) the following sub-sections shall be inserted. —

“(5) A Minister shall be entitled to a conveyance advance up to twelve lakh rupees for purchase of
conveyance to be repayable within his term as a Member.

(6) The rate of interest for the advance referred to in sub-section (5) and the mode of recovery thereon
shall be such as may be determined by the Government, with the prior approval of the President.”

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy. (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. o :




TRt 9. S.ue.- 33002/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33002/99
HILT GIAhIT

Velhi zette

TH. 3. -31.0cl.-37.-11032023-244271
SG-DL-E-11032023-244271

JYTETI
EXTRAORDINARY

BN EIEE: R EAET

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 78] faeeft, SphaT, AT 10, 2023/FTRT 19, 1944 [raaaf € 518
No. 78] DELHI, FRIDAY, MARCH 10, 2023/PHALGUNA 19, 1944 [N.C. T.D. No.518

| IV
PART IV

TE T T & et aahe
GOVERNMENT OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELH]I

fafer, =g w9 faumrf +=~f fawmr
FferegaT
e, 9 4™, 2023

. BT 14(69) / Td¥—3030 /dsadvice/149-157 —TERT ISl & fieell WRAGR & #3Al
(@9 T W) (e I, 203 (R03 BT facell AMRIFTH 03) B ORT 1 B SWRT (2) §RT Ued
SIRFAT BT TRART BRI BY, IS T &7 fQoell & IURTSHUTA, 14 HRAR], 2023 I ARRH Bl
Uqd B @ Al [Afted & 2 |

faeell IS ISE & SURTSIATA
P MY | 3R S9d 9H W,

WA URIER, YL i

1611 DG/2023 @)



DELHI GAZETTE : EXTRAORDINARY PART V]

DEPARTMENT OF LAW, JUSTICE AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
Delhi, the 9th March, 2023

No. F. 14(69)/LA-2020/dsadvice/149-157.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the sub-section (2) of
section 1 of the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances)
(Amendment) Act, 2023 (Act No. 3 of 2023), the Lieutenant Governor of the National Capital Territory of Delhi

hereby, appoints 14th February, 2023 as the date on which the aforesaid Act shall come into force.
By Order and in the Name of the Lieutenant Governor
of the National Capital Territory of Delhi,

BHARAT PARASHAR, Principal Secy.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



		2023-03-10T22:40:32+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




