The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Extension and Amendment) Act,
1961

47 of 1961

Keyword(s):
Labour, Welfare, Fund

Amendments appended: 8 of 1963, 29 of 1973, 36 of 1980, 5 of 2005

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




SRR




vhle

i

2




g under Sub-

ar

1

im

he

shal




Ingerbion of 9.
Bow sevbion incer
G&in Bom.

Rilof 1858,

TUnpaid
sosumula- AT
= T
tions and
alaims
thersto.

coordance with
discharge an
employee in

the pro

smployer an

respe armound paié

to the @m} loyee to the

exte ons of this se sebion,
“he d

{4} Buch
})ﬁd é:ﬂ{d. iis
© {a) affized o1
part of the pre
lations wer

s a8 may be prescri-

absenice on a conspicuous
which the unpaid accumu-

ituated and
be preseribed,

ym‘éré eing

{8y Aftver
it shall be ag
three years from

s suh-saction {4)

e for a period of
d published, in

of June and

& provisions of sub-
conclusive evidence

s of the iﬁ%",, %}Ezgain}n {}f th@
ferred by the Board to the
of Wages Aect, gy ¢
or establishment 1934,
licate upon, and
shall have the
*?33 as it i

3 i







H
H

:1

(SR ERRS

[RH]

owin

i
i

I
@

lway

i
3ok

o s
o geecned

RE

A

ANAME




. " Ettra No. 8 RUGISFERED 'No. G-440

EXTRAORDINARY

PURLISHED BY AUTHORITY
Vol. IV] TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 5, 1963/ MAGHA 16, 1884

Separate paging is given fo this Part in order that it ‘'may be
filed as a separaie compitation

PART IV

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated
and Regulations made by the Governor.

CONTENTS
i+

Paars
GUIARAT ACT NO. VIII OF ‘1963 —An Ack to amend the Bomhsy Labour Welfare .
Found Aci, 1953 . .o21-—22

The following Act of the Guja;at Leglslature, having been assented to by the

President on the 1Ist February 1963, is hereby published for general
information.’

M. G. MONANI,
: Secretary to the:Government of Gujarat,
Legal Department.
GUJARAT ACT NO. VIII OF 1963.

(First published, after having received the assemt of the President in the
“ Gujarat Government Gazette” on the 5th February 1963),

An Act to amend the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund: Act, 1953.
It is hereby enacted in the Thirteenth Year of the Republicof India as follows:-

1. This Act may be called the Bombay Laboﬁr Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amend-®hort #itle.
ment) Act, 1962.

gom. S In section 8A of thg Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953, after sul- Amendment
XL gection (I2), the following sub-section shall be inserted and shall be deemed of #3etion BA

of Bom. XX
1953, 8lways to have been inserted, namely —_ of 1958,
. 21

1V-Extra-3 (Mono)

1



+ | | -~ i

88 - @QUJ. GOWE, GA%),BX, FEBRUARY 5, 1063/MAGHA 16, 1884 = .~ [Pagr IV

“(13) Nothing in the foregoing isions of this section shall apply to
unpaid accumulations not alreadyjpaid W the Board,
(a) in vespect of which no Bepamite accounts have been maintained so
that the unpaid claims of emplayeeswre not traceable, or

(8) which are proved to have béenispent before the sixth day of December

1961 __ _ o
and aceordingly such unpaid accumulations shall not be liable to be collected
and paid under sub-section (£) of section 3.” 1

N

PRINTED AT THE GOVERMMENT CENTRAL PRESS, AHMEDABAD




Exira No. 3 REGISTERED No, G448

The Gujarat Govexnment Gazette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XIV] FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 30, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 9, 1895

Separate piging is given to this Part In order that it may
be filed a3 n separate compilation,

PART IV

Acts of Gujarat Legislature and Ordimances promwigated
sud Regulations made by the Governor,

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the
President on the 22nd November, 1973 is hereby published for general information.

5. 5. SHARH,
Secretary to the Government of Guijarat,
Legal Department.
GUJARAT ACT NO. 2% OF 1973

(First published, after having reccived the assent of the President in the “Gujarat
Government Gazette” on the 30th November, 1973).

An Act further to amend the Bombay Lahour Welfare Fund Act, 1953.

It in hereby enacted in the Twenty-fourth Year of the Republic of Indis as
follows:—

- -

-
S

1, (I} This Act may be called the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Short title
Amendment} Act, 1973, . and Com-

mengement.

{2) Tt ahall come into force on auch date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Garette, appoint.

Som. ¢ Tpn section 2 of the Bombay Isabour Welfaro Fund Act, 1953 (herein- xmendment

ffL after referved to as “the principal Aet”}),— of sootion
. . of Bom. X
1983, (1) after clause (1), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:— of 1963,

“(14) *oontribution” means the sum of money payable ag contribution
to the Board in acsordance with the provisione of section 6B;";

207
IV—Eszira--01




208 GUJ. GOVT, GAZ,, EX., NOVEMBER 30, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 9, 1835 {Panr IV
{(2) in clause (2)—

(f) for the words “"manual or clerical” the words “manual, clorical,
supervisory or technical “shall be substituted;

{#5) the following shall be added at the end, nsmelyi—
“but does not include any person—
(g} who is employed mainly in » managerial capacity, or

() who, being employed in & supervisory capacity, draws wages excee-
ding seven hundred and fifty rupees per mensera or exercises, either
by the nature of the duties attached to the office or by reason of the
powers vested in hir, functions mainly of a managerial nature;”;

(3) in clause (4), for the portion beginning with the brackets, figurcs and words
“(¢#¢)any establishment” and ending with the words “or any State Government”
the following shall be substifuted, namely:—

®(4%) any establishment within the meaning of the Bombay Shops and Bom.
Establishments Act, 1948, which cmploys, or on any working day during the LXX.
twelve months preceding the specified date employed, ten or more persons: ﬁis‘ff

Provided that, any such establishment shall, subject to the provision contained
in the succeeding proviso continue to bo an cstablishment for the purposes of
thin Act, notwithstanding a reduction in the number of persons to less than ten
at apy subsequent time:

Provided further that, where for a confinunous poriod of not less than three
months the number of persons enuployed thercin has been less than ten, such
establishment slall ceasc to be an establishment for the purposes of this Act
with effect from the beginning of the month following the expiry of the said
period of three months, and the employer shall, within one wmonth from the date
of such cessation, intimate by registercd post the fact thereof to such suthority
a8 the State Government may specify in this behalf;”;

(4) after clause (9), the following clause shall be im;erbed, namely:— |

“(94) ‘“'specified date” in relation to any establishment for the purpose '
of payment o the Board of any eum specified in item (a), (5) or (bb) of sub~ "
section (2) of section 3 shall be the dafe on or before which any such sum \
becomes payable to the Fund;”;

(6) for olause (11), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

*(11) “wages” means wages as defined in clause (vi) of section 2 of the IV of
Payment of Wages Act, 1936;”, 1856,

\mendment . 3. Insection 3 of the principal Act,—

d section % .

§ 1]305;’. - XL (1) in sub-section (1), for the word, figuro and lebter “section 6A” the words,
figures and letters “scotions 6A and,6B" shall be substituted;




Parr IV] GUJ. GOVT, GAZ,, EX,, NGVEMBER 30, 1078/AGRAHAYANA 8, 1895 209

(2) in sub-section (2),—

{a) after item (b), the following shall be inserted, namely :—
“(bb) any contribution psid under seotion 6B ;”;

(3) initem (d), the word “and” shall be deleted;

{¢) after item (e}, the following items shall be added, namely —

“(f) any loan, grant-in-aid or subsidy paid by the State Govern-
ment or any local authority or statutory corporation;

(g) all sums reccived in any other manner or from any other source.”.

4. After section 6A of the principal Act, the following new section shall be Insertion of

. tod by - new  saolion
msgerted, namely — g{B in fBmcn.3
L of 1988,

“6B, {I) There shall be paid to the Board for the purposes of this Act Contributios.
a conbribution payable by the employer in respect of an employee in an
establishment ({hercinafter referred to as “the employer’s contribution”), a
contribution payable by such employee (hereinafter referred to as “the employee’s
contribution”) and a contribution payable by the State Government, as here-
inafter provided and every such contribution shall form part of the Fond.

(2) Theamount of employee’s contribution shall be payable every six months
in respect of every employee whose name stands on the register of the establi-
shment concerned on 30th June and 31st December respectively, at the rate of
25 paise for every such employee and the amount of employer’s contribution
shall be payable every six months at the rate of 50 paise for cach such employee;

Provided that the State Government may, by notification in the Official Gazeite,
inorease the said rate of employee’s contribution to such amount not exceeding 50

paise if it considers necessary to do so to enable the Board to fulfil the objects of
this Aet :

Provided further that where the rate of employee’s contribution iz g0 increased
by the State Government, therate of employer’s contribution shall be twice the
rate of employee’s contribution as so increased.

{3) Every employer shall pay to the Board both the employer’s contribution
and the employee’s contribution before the 16th day of July and 15th day of
January, svery year.

{#) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (2) and (3), the
employer's contribution and the employee’s contribution payable for the
firat time after the date of the coming into force of the Bombay Labour
Woelfare Fund (Gujsrat Amendment) Act, 1973, (hereinafter referred to as “the
sppointed date”) shall be payable before such date, and at the respective



00 QUJ. GOVT. GAZ, EX. NOVEMBER 30, 1073/ACRARAYANA 0, 1895 [Parr IV

rates as aforesaid for every employce whowe name stands on the register
of the establishment conoerncd on snch date as may be specified by the
State Government by notification in the Official Guzette and sueh contribu-
tions payable next thereafter shall be paid in accordance with the provisions
of this Aot, irrespective of whether the period of six months as apecified in
sub-gection {2) has passed or not,

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other enactment but subject
to the provisions of this Act and the rules made thereunder the employer
shall be entitled to recover from any such employee that etaployee’s contribution
by deduction from his wages, and not otherwire; and such deduction shall be
deemed to be a deduction authorised by or under the Payment of Wages 1y o
Act, 1936: 1004,

" Provided that no such deduotion shall be made in excess of the amount of the
contribution payable by such employes, nor sball any such deduction except the
deduction in respact of the employee’s contribution payable for the first time
after the appointed date be made from any wages other than the wages for the
months of June and Decewmber :

Provided further that, if through inadvertance or otherwise, no deduction has
been made from the wages of an employee for the months aforesaid, such dodue-
tion may be made from the wages of such employee for any szbsequent month
or months with the permission in writing of the Inspector appointed under
this Act.

(6) Notwith:tanding any contract to the contrary no employer shall deduet
the employer’s contribution from any wages paysble to an smployee or otlier-
wige tecover it from the employee.

{7} Any sum duly deducted by an smployer from the wages of an employes
under this section shall be deemed to have been entrusted to him by the
employes for the purposs of paying the contribution in respest of which it
was deduoted.

(8) Aun ouiployer shall pay the smployer’s and the employes’s contribution
to the BDoard by cheque, money-order or in cash, and he shall bear the
expenses of remitting to the Board such contribution.

(9) The Welfare Commissioner shall submit to the State Government as soon
ag possible after the end of July and January every year in the prescribed form
a statement showing the total amount of the employer’s contribution in respeoct
of his establishment for the period to whioh the siatement relates and on receipt
of the statement from the Welfare Commissioner, the State Government shall
pay to the Bosrd a contribution of an amount squal to the employer’s contri-
bution in respect of that eatablishment:

Provided that the statement in relation to the employee’s contribution payable
for the first time after the appointed date referred to in sub-section (d) shall be
snbmitted as soon ax posstble after the speeified date in relation to that
contribution.”. '




B

Pirr IV]  GOJ. GOV, GAZ, WX, NOVEMBER 30, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 9, 1896 3901

5. In section 12 of the prinoipal Act, to sub-section (I}, the followingshall be Amedment
added at the end, namely:— gf, ]i":i““g
of 1953,
“Ipspector appointed, whether by s local authority or the State Government
under the Bombay Shops and Establishments Act, 1948 in relation to any avea,
ghall be deomed to be also Inspector for the purposes of this Act, in respect
of establishments, to which this Actapplies and the looal limits within which
suoh Inspector shall exercise his functions under this Aot shall be the area for

whioh he 1s appointed under the said Aot.”, :

§. In section 18 of the principal Act, in sub-section (), for the words “in the gmecdmest
presoribed mapner” the words “in the mauner specified in sub-section (I) of of B-;:im xlf

wection 4 for constitution of the Board™ shall be substituted. of Borm.

IV—Lxtra—62

FRINTED AT TER QOVERNMENT CENYRAL PRESS, CGANDHINAGAR.



Exira No 58 o . REGISTERED NO. G/GNR/2.

The ﬁu)ar&t Gobernment Gajette -
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XX1] FRIDAY, DECEMBER %, 1980; PAUSA 5, 1902

L SR g TR

Separate paging is given to this Part in order thatult may be filed as a
separate Compilation.

PART W

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and
Regulations made by the Govemor.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the
President on the 20th December, 1980 is hereby published for general information.

J. P. VASAVDA,
Joint Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
' Legal Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 36 OF 1980,

(First published, after having received the assent of the Pres;dent in the
“Gujarar Govemment Gazette” on the 26th December, 1980). .

An Act further to amend the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953.
It is hereby enacted in the 'i'hxrty-ﬁtst Year of the Repubhc of Indla a8
foltows : —

1. (1) . This Act may be called the Bombay Labour Welare Fund (Gujarat shm title
Amendment) Act, 1980,

(2) Tt shall come into force on such date as.the State Government may,
notification in the Official Gazette. appoint.

o ommonw
b}l ment;,

- Bom. 2. In the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953 (hercmﬁfter referred 0 Amendmesd
XL of a4 “the principal Act”), in section 3, in sub-section (2), after clause {bb), the off-e’gﬁgx &
following clause shall be inserted, nmamely:— o : gf 19%3

“(bbb) any interest paid under section 6C;”. ]

. L 58-1 : o
IV-Extra 581 ' . .



{nsertion

of new
sation

30 ia Bom.
XL oof 1953,

Interest on
nnpaid :
agoumula-
tions,

ines and
sontribations
after .
notice of
lamand.

A mendment
of aeotion 17
of Bom, XL
of 1953. ]

I nsertion of

58-2 ' GQUJ GOVT. GAZ, EX., DECEMBER 26, 1980/PAUSA 5, 1902 (PART 1V

3. In ihe pnnmpal Act, aliet ae:.uon 6B, the following new section shall be

insetted, pamely:-—

“6C. (I) Where an mnployer does not pay to the Board any amount of
anpaid accumulations or fines realised from the employees or any amount of the
employer’s or, as the case may be, employee’s contributions within the time

. he is required by or under the provisions of this Act to pay such amount, the

Welfare Commissioner may cause 0 be served a uotice on such employer to
pay to the Board the amount within the peried specified thercin, which shall
nut be less than thirty days from ie date of service of such notice.

(2) Where the employer on whom a noiice is served under sub-section (1),
fails without sufficient cause to pay any such amount within the period speci-
fied in the notice, he shafl, without prejudice to uny penalty which may be
imposed oun him under this Act be liable to pay to the Board simple interest
on that amount for the period commencing on the date of expiry of the perind
specified in the notice and ending on dale of the payment of that amount—

(@) in réspect of the period falling within the first three months  after
such expiry, at the rate of twelve percent per annum, and

(by in respect of the other period, at the rate of eighteen percent per _
annum, .

($) The amount of interest payable to the Board under sub-section {2) shall
be collected by the Welfare Commissioner in such manner as may be
plescrlbed

Provided that the Welfare Commissioner may, subject to such conditions as
may be prescribed, remit the whole or any part of the amount of interest- in

respect of any period.”,
4. 1In the principal Act, in section 17,—

(1 aftcr the words “Any sum payablc” the words “lo the Board or” shall
be inserted; -

(2) in the marginal note, after the words “sums payable" the words “to lhe
Board or” shall be inserted. .

§. In the principal Act, after section 17, the i‘ol]owmg new sections shall bc

fiow sections inserted, namcly.

1TA, 178,
1713; 17D

_ and I?E .
in Bom, XL
of 1953,



-PAKT IV} (U, GOVL. GAZ, EX., DECEMBER 26, 1980/ PAUSA 5, 1002 53-3

“17A. Any cmploycr who fails to pay any amount of unpaid accumujations Penalty for
or fines realised from employees or any amount of the employer’s or, as the mi‘?pt:y_
* case may be, employee’s contributions, within the period specified in a notice mentof
served on him under sub-section (1) of section 6C, shall, on conviction, beamﬂm._
punishable with 1mprlaonment which may extend to six months or with fine “D'“

© which may extend 1b. one {housand rupees or with both.

17B. Auy employer who dcducta the whole or any pari of the employer’s Penﬂltylfor
contribution from the wages payable (o an employée or otherwise recovers it unlawid |
from the employee shall, on conviction, be punishable with imprisonent
wiich may extend to six months or with fine which may extend to one

thousand rupees or with both,

17C, Any person who wilfully obstructs an Iuspector in the exercise of ‘ms Pﬁ;xtnltytfor
4

powers or discharge of his duties under this Act or fails to produce for inspec- gapg‘;;’(,;g
tion on demand by an Inspector any document maintained in pursuance of exerclrﬂsmg
0

the prowsmns of this Act or the rules made thereunder ot to supply to him § discharging

on demand true copics of any such document, shall, on conviction, be punish- duties, otes

able— »

(@) for the first offence, with imprisonment for a ferm which may extend
to three months, or with fine"which may extend to five hundred rupecs, or
with both; and

(b) for a sccond or subsequent offences, with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to, six months, or with fine which may cxtend to one
thousand rupees, or with both:

Prowded that in. the absence of special and adequate reason o the con-
trary to be mentioned in the judgement of the Court, in any case where the
offender is sentenced to a_fine only, the amount of fine shall not be less
than fifty rupees.

17D. (1) Where an offence under thls Act is comm:(ted by a company Offences by
every person who at the time when the offence was committed was in charge of, companies,
and was responsible to, the company for the conduct of the - business of the
company as well as the company shall be deemed to be guilty of the offence
. and shall be liable to be proceedcd against and punished accordingly

Provided that notiting contained in this sub-section shall render any such
person liable to any punishment, if he proves that the offence was committed
without his knowledge or that he had exercised all-due diligence to prevent
_ the commission of such offence.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), where an
. offence under thir Act has been committed by a.company and it is proved’ that
the offence has been committed. with the consent or connivance of, or is attri-
butable to. any neglect on the part of any director, manager, secretary or other
‘officer of the company, such director, manager, secretary or other cofficer shall
be deemed to be guilty of that  offence and shall be Hable to be proceeded
against and punished accordingly. o



relating to
jurisdiation,

Amendmat
. of section
19 of

Bom, XL of
1953,

58-4 GUJ. GOVT. GAZ,, EX., DECEMBER 26, 1980/PAUSA 5; 1902 (PART IV

Explanation—For the purpose of this section—

(@) “company” means any body corporate and mcludes a firm or othér
association of individuals; and

. (b) “director” in relation to a firm, means a partner jn the firm.

17E. (1) Notwithstanding anything contamcd in the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973—

{a) no court inferior to that of a Metfopolitan Magistrate or a judicial
Magistrate of the first class shall ry any offence punishable under this Act;
and - :

(b) uo court shall take cognisance of any offence punishable under this
Act, unless a complaint thereof is made within six months of the date on
which the offence is alleged to have been commitied. '

(2) No prosecution for any offence under this Act shall be instituted, by
any person ¢xcept an Inspector and no prosecution shall be instituted by the
Inspector except with the previous sanction of the Welfare Commissioner.”,

6. In the principal Act, in section 19,—

(1) in sub-section (2}, after clause (b), t-ﬁe following clause shail be inserted,
pamely:—

“(bb) the manner in which the Welfare Commissioner shall collect under
sub-section (3) of section 6C the amount of interest payable under sub-section
(2) of that section to the Board, and the conditions subject to which the
Welfare Commissioner may remit the whole or any part of the amount of
interest under the provlso to sub-section (3) of that section;”

7] after sub-section (2}, the following sub-section shal} b_emserted, nameiyﬁ--

“(24) In making any rules under this sectiod, the State Government may
direct that a breach thereof shall be punishable with fine not exceeding two
thousand rupees, and when the offence is a continuing one, with a daily
fine not exceedmg one hundred rupees during the continuance of the
offence.”. :

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENT EENTRAL.PRESS, SANDHINAGAR

2 of
1974,



Extra No, §

© |
The Gujarat Gobernment Basette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

REGISTERED No. G/ONR/2

Vol. XLVI] FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 25, 2005/PHALGUNA, 6, 1926

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a Separate Compilation.

PART-1V

Act of Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances Promulgated
Regulations made by the Governor.

The Following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been
assented to by the Governor on the 24™ February, 2005 is hereby
published for general information.

S. S. PARMAR,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legistative and Parliamentary Affairs Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 5 OF 2005.

(First published, after having received the assent of the
Governor in the “Gujarat Government Gazctte”, on the 25® February,
2005).

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953.

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Bombay Labour Welfare = Shorttitte
Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2005. and

commencement.

TV-Ex 5-1 5-1



5-2 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EX., 25-2-2005 [PART IV

: 2) It shall be deemed to have come into force onthe
31% December, 2004,

Amendment 2.  In the Bombay Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953 (hereinafter  Bom.XL

of section 2 of  yeferred to as “the principal Act™), in section 2,- of 1953,
Bom. XL of
1953. (1) inclause (2}, in sub-clause (b), for the words “seven

hundred and fifty rupees”, the words “three thousand
and five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

2) in clause (10), for the words *three years”, the words
“one year’” shall be substituted.

Amendment 3 In the principal Act, in section 6A,-
of section 6A
of Bom. XL eh) in sub-section (5),
of 1953.
(i) for the words “three years”, the words “one
year” shall be substituted;
(ii) the words “each year” shall be deleted;

2) in sub-section (7), for the words “four years”, the
words “two years” shall be substituted.

Amendment 4, In the principal Act, in section 6B, for sub-section (2) and

of section 6B 1, visos thereunder, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
of Bom. X1,

of 1953, “(2) The amount of employee’s contribution shall be
payable every six months in respect of every employee whose
name stands on the register of the establishment concerned
in the month of June, or as the case may be, in the month of
December, at the rate of three rupees for each such employce
and the amount of employer’s contribution shall be payable
at every six months at the rate of six rupees for each such
employee:

Provided that the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazetre, increase the said rate of
employee’s contribution to such amount not exceeding six
rupees if it considers necessary so to do to enablc the Board
to fulfill the objects of this Act:

Provided further that where the rate of cmployee’s
contnibution is so increased by the State Government, the rate
of employer’s contribution shall be twice the rate of
employee’s contribution as so increased.”.

Repealand 5, (D The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) G Ord.
Savings. Ordinance, 2004 is hereby repealed. 3 of 2004.

(2)  Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall
be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as
amended by this Act. : '

Government Centrat Press, Gandhinagar.



	1961GUJARAT47.pdf
	Guj-1961-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Extension And Amendment) Act-47.pdf
	Guj-1962-The Bombay Labour Welfare fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-8.pdf
	Guj-1973-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-29.pdf
	Guj-1980-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-36.pdf
	Guj-2005-The Bombay Labour Welfare Fund (Gujarat Amendment) Act-5.pdf




