The Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amendment) Act, 1973

310f 1973

Keyword(s):
Judicial Courts, Laws, Civil Courts, Small Cause Courts

Amendment appended: 20 of 1979

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




Exira No. 37

: tbe Sujarat ﬁobétnme-m—f mm}g
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol.XIV] FRIDAY, DECEMBER 21, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 30, 18%

Separalepaglnglsgiven to this Par{ in order. lhatﬂm
be filed as a soparate eompllaﬂon.

Achol&eanm![MadOtMmmWaﬂ
Reguiations made by the Govemor,
Thc following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the
president on the 14th December 1973, is hereby . published for general
information. - : o

S. 8. SHAH,
Secretary to the Government-of Gujarat,
Legal Departmcnt

GUJARAT ACT NO. 31 OF 1973,
(First published, after having received the asseat of the President in the
Gujarat Government Gazette on the 21st December, 1973). co
An Act to amend certain laws relating to Judicial .courts for .
purposes hereinafter appearing.

. Itis hereby enacted in the Twenty-fourth Year of the Repubhc of Indm ok
follows :- .

‘4, This Act may be called the Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amandmam) Bhort m-lo. ',
Act, 1973,

Bom, = 2. For section 35 of the Bombay Civil Courts Act, - 1869 (harama.ﬁ.er referred suhtﬂnﬁm

XV to a8 “the Civil Courts Act”), the following section shallbe substituited, namely:- Jhuor o

1869. ' o . 0 of 1889,
304 : PR o . . S -

IV—Extra—84



305 @GUJ. GOVT, (GAZ., EX., DECEMBER 21, 1973/ACRAHAYANA 30, 1805 {Parr IV

Temporary “35, (I) Where the office of the District Judge in a district falls or remains
vecancy of  vacant from any cause or the District Judge is prevented from performing
})i?;iet his duties due to illness or other cause,—

aage.

{3) if there is a Joint Judge in such district, the Joint Judge shall
assume charge of the District Court without interruption to his own duties
and ghall, while 80 in charge, exercise all the powers of a Distriet Judge;

{i#) if thereis no Joint Judge in the district or if there is & Joint Judge,
but he is unable to assume charge of the District Court due to his absence
from the digtrict - or any other; reason, the first in rank of the Assistant
Judges in the district shall assume charge of the District Court without
interruption to his ordinary jurisdiction and if there is no Assistant Judge
or the Assistant Judge is unable to assume charge for any reason as afore-
gaid, the first in rank of the Civil Judges in the distriet shall so assume
such. charge. S - :

.(2) The Assistant Judge or, as the case may be, the Civil Judge holding ch-
arge of the District Court under sub-section (7} shall, whil> so0 in charge, per-
form the duties of a District Judge with respect to the filing of suits and appe-
als, receiving pleadings, exeoution of processes, return of writs and like
matters and exercige such powers of a District Judge as may be specified by a
goneral or special order made by the High Court. :

{3) The Joint Judge, Assistant Judge, or, as the casé may be, the Civil Judge,
while holding such charge shall be designated as Joint Judge, Assistant Judge
or, as the case may be, Civil Judge, in charge of the district.

"(4) The Joint Judge, the Assistant Judge, or, as the case may be, the Civil
Judge in charge of the district shall continue in such charge until the offics
of the District Judge may be rerumed or assumed by an officer duly appointed
thereto and in cases other than those where such officer so resumes or assumes
such charge, the Assistant Judge or, as the case may be, the Civil Judge so
in charge shall continue $o be in such charge until the Joint Judge, or as the
case Mmay be, the Assistant Judge shall assume such charge.”.

-Amendment 3 Ty geetion 36 of the Civil Courts Act,—

of section

36 of rds “may delegate to an Assistant J i

36 of . (o) for the words y delega : it Judge, or in the absence
Bon. XIvo of an Assistant Judge, to Civil Judge” the words “may delegate to & Joint

Judge, if any, or in the absence of a Join.t Judge, to an Assistant Judge or in
the absence of an Assistant Judge, to a Civil Judge” shall be substituted;

() for the words “shall be deE}ignated Assistant or Civil Judge” the words
*shall be designated Joint or Assistant or Civil Judge” shall be substituted.

Insertion 4 ‘Tn the Ahmedabad Glty Courts Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the Guj.
gfl s;a:uon City Courts Act™), after section 6 the following section shall be inserted, namely:— xfI
[t}
T oaiy e SRR - : | 1961,
Arrangoment “gA. (1) In the event of the _oﬂice of the Principal Judge falling or rema~
as to holding juing vacant from any cause or in the event of his being prevented fromY per-

‘;‘g:.,“’:‘.‘f"ff-’ " forinng his duties due to-illness or othe}' cause, the first in rank of the other
Prinojpal . - Judjgés of the City Court shall, without interruptionto his own duties, assume
g:fiﬁ':_ - charge of the office of the Principal Judge and while so in charge shall

scancy,  perform all the duties snd exercise all the powers of the Princi Ji
vacanoy, ggdar {his Act or any other law for the time being in force. pal Judgo



Guj.

of
1941,

Auj.

xx

of

1961.

Guj.

X1
of

1081,

XV of
1982,

Parr IV] GUJ. GOVT. GAZ, EX., DECEMBER 21, 1973JAGRAHAYANA 30, 1895 308

{2) The Judge so assuming charge shall continue in such charge until the

. office of the Principal Judge may be resumed or asaumsd by an: oﬁioer duly app-
mnted therato ”,

54 In aeotlon 11 of the City Courts Ast, a.fter sub—sectlon (3), the follovnng Amendment
sub-sectlon shall be added, namely:— - ‘;{ ”t?t“’n
. I of Guj.
XIX of
1961,
“18) The Judge specified in sub-section () may, with the approval -of the
ngh Court, mske any chdange in the days to be so observed as holidays for
vaocation, if at any time after the publication of such list; circumstances render
it necessary for him to do so and such change shall be published in the
Official Gazette.”. L

6. In section 14 of the City Courts Act, after sub-section((4), the following sub- Amendment
section shall be added, namely:- : "i‘i':f"t'““
Guj. XIX
of 1861,
“(5}) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (7), {2) and (4),
where a public notification under article 237 of the Constitution has been issued
in relation to such class of Magisirates, the power to appoint Magistrates under
this section shall be exercised subject to the terms of the said notification and
in a case where, in view of the issue of such notification, the power to appoint
any Magistrate vests in the High Court, the term of appointment of such
Magistrate shall be such as the High Court may diract.”.

7. In the City Courts Act, after section 14, the following section shall be Ingertion ;{
- ot
inserted, namely: o éc";}l XX
of 1961,

“14 A. (I) In the event of the office of the Chief Magistrate falling or rema- Arrangemen’
ining vacant from any cauge or in the event of his heing provented from per- ho,;‘:ng
forming his duties due to illness or other cause, the firat inrank of the other charge of
Magistrates for the City of Ahmedabad shall, without interruption to his own glflmghoff
duties, assume chargs of the office of the Chief Magistrate and while 2o in M:gwtl]':te
charge shall perform sll the duties and exercise all the powers of the Chief during

Magistrate under the Criminal Procedure Code or any other law for the time voc#ncy.
beiung in force.

(%) The Magistrate so assuming charge shall continue in such charge until the
office of the Chief Magmt;rate may be resumed or assumed by an officer duly
appointed thereto.”

8. In the Prosidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the Inm’omn
City of Ahmedabad, after section 8A the follomng section shall be inserted, °f #ection 8B

*in Aot XV
namely:~ of 1862,



Arrangement
v - from any canss or in: the event  of his being . prevented from = performing his

of offion of
Chief Judge
during N
vMQi .

307 QUJ. GOVT. GAZ,, EX., DECEMBER 21, 1973/AGRAHAYANA 30, 1805 { Panr IV
- “8B.(7) In the event of the office of the Chief Judge falling or remaining vacant

duties due to illness or other cause, the first in rank of the. other Judges:of
the Court of Small Causes of Ahmedabad shall, without interruption to his

-own: duties, assume charge of the . office of the Chief Judge and whils sa:in

charge shall perform all the duties and: exercise all the powérs. of. tlie; Chief:
Judge under this Aot or any other law for the time being in fozce,

{(2): The Judge so assuming charge shall continue in such charge unkil» the
office of the Chief Jud.ga may be resumed or assymed by an . officer: dyly

" appointed thereto,”.

‘MEMTID AT THE GOVEANMENT CENTRAL PEESS, GANDMINAGAR,




Exira No. 24 REGISTERED NO. G/GNR/Z,

©

The Gujarat Government Gazette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XX] T FRIDAY, AUGUST 31, 1979/BITADRA 9, 1901

Separate paging s given {0 thls Part .n order thai il may
be Bled as m separate compllation,

PART 1¥

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and
Regulafions made by the Govemnor.
‘The followiny Act of the Gujarat Legisiature having been assented to by the
President on the 13th August, 1979 is hereby published for general information.

N. B. PATEIL,
Secretary to the Government of Gujaral,
legal Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 20 OF 1979,

iFirst published, after having received the assent of the President in  the
“Gujarat Government Gazelte” on the 3lst August, 1979).

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Civil Courts Act, 1869 and the Presidency Small
Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the City of Ahmedabad,
for the purposes hereafter appearing.

It is herebv enacted in the Thirtieth Year of the Republic of India as follows:——

1. (I) This Act may be called the Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amend- Short title
ment) Act, 1979. and

)0 e noe-
ment.,

(2} It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint

197
IV—Extra-44



195 GUJ GOV'E. GAZ, EX, AUGLURT 30, 1970 BHADRA @, 1801 {Panr 1V

Amendment 2, In the Bombay Civil Courts Act 1869 (heremafler referred to as “the Civil Bom

‘fé 5 tﬁ?,';“ Courts Act’™), in section 16— X1V

l!f
XIBV l}f 1869 .
1863. R ‘ . £y
8 (1) for the words “does not amount to fifteen thousand rupees in” the

words “is of any” shall be substituted; and

(2) for the words “ten thousand rupees” the words “twenty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment 3. In the Civil Courts Act, in section 24,—
of section

24 of ’ )
'i‘(imélev (1) for the words .“ten thousand rupees” - the words “twenty thousand
of 1869. rupees” shall be substituted;
(2) the proviso shall be deleted,
Amend. 4. In the Civil Courts Act, in section 26, for the words “ten thousand rupees”
ment of “ 13 .
e 6 the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
of Pnm,
X1V of
1869,

Amenduy nb 5. In the Civil Courts Act, in section 28A, in sub-section (2), for the words
ggAEcﬁ?"“ “ten thousand rupees” the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted

Bom. X1V

of 1869,
Amembf 6. In the Presidency Smali Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the gy ¢
eelg City of Ahmedabad (hereinafter referred 10 as “the Small Cause Courls Act™), 1882
fvax\o; in section 18, for the words “three thousand rupees” wherever they wecur, the

0 .
1882, words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted,

Afmnn(tl_mcn:t- 7. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in section 20, for the words “three thousand
ot section

o of rupees” wherever they occur, the words “five thousand rupees”™ shall be substituted.
Aot XV
of 1882,

:]\;_“:E{;(:;::l‘ﬂ* 8. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in section 22, in clause (b), for the words
n

22 of Act “three thousand rupees” the words “five thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.
XV of
1882,

:;*f":‘;‘;ll.’f‘”'t 9. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in section 41, for the words “three
- ‘.lln

41 of Act thousand rupees” the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
XV of
1842,

ﬁf“‘F“;‘[‘r‘:}f“‘ 1. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in the Fourth Schedule, the following

Sehedule  entries shali be added at the end, namely:—
of Act
XV ofI8R2. _
“ M0 3100 5-90 20-50

3100 3200 6-00 2100



Parr 1V] GUJ. GUVT. GAZ, EX., AUGUST du, LU79/BHADRA 9, 14901 19

3200 - 3300 6-15 21-50
3300 3400 6-25 22-00
3400 3500 6-40 - 22-50
3500 3600 6-50 23-00
3600 3700 6-65 23-50
3700 ' 3800 6-75 24-00
3800 3900 6-90 24-50
3900 4000 7-00 25-00
4000 4100 7-15 23-50
4100 4200 7-25 26-00
4200 4300 7-40 26-50
4300 4400 7-50 2700
4400 4500 : 7-65 27-50
4500 4600 1-75 28-00
4600 4700 7-90 28-30
4700 4800 8-00 29-00
4800 4900 8-15 29-50
4900 5000 8-25 30-00.™.

11, Notwithstanding anything contained in the Bombay Civil Courts Act,
ﬁao 1869 or the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, as amended by this Act,—

1882. () all suits and proceedings of a civil nature pending, immediately before
the date on which this Act comes into force, in the specified court shall he
continued in that court as if this Act had not been passed and that specified
court shall have for the purpose of the said suits and proceedings all jurisdic-
tion and powers which it had immediately belo~e the day on which this Act
comes into force;

(2) an appeal or application for revision in respect of any suils or proceed-
ings so continued under clause (/} in any specified court shall lie to the court
which would have appellate or, as the case may be, revisional jurisdiction and
thai court shall entertain and dispose of the appeal or application as if the
proceedings were instituted in that court before the date on  which this Act
comes into force;

{3} all applications for the execution or enforcement of a decree or order
of a specified court passed immediately before the day on which this Act
comes into force and all other applications arising out of such decree or order
shall be made to and disposed of by that court as if this Act had not been
passed.

Explanation.—The expression “specified court” means the court of the Civil
fudge (Junior Division) or that of the Civil Judge (Senior Division) or the
Ahmedabad City Civit Court.

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.

Saving®,



	1973GUJARAT31.pdf
	Guj-1973-The Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amendment) Act-31.pdf
	Guj-1979-The Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amendment) Act-20.pdf




