
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Bombay Civil Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 1982 
 

13 of 1982 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Civil, Courts 
 
Amendments appended: 4 of 1989, 19 of 1993, 16 of 2002



EXTRAORDINARY 

PART 'I! 
Ada d tk Gojam hgibwra end Ordiaaacw poladgated a d  

Hqplatioms m a b  by ibe G- 

The folIowhg Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the 
President on the 6th March, 1982 is hereby published for general infomalion. 

K. M. SATWANI, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujatat. 

L e d  Department. 

GZiJARAT ACT NO. 13 OF 1982. 

( ~ m t  published, after having received the assent of the Prasident in the 
'Yiujyat Government Gm&W an the 17th Mafch, 1982 ). 

AN ACT 

further to am& the Bombay ,Civil Courts Act, 1869. 

It is h b y  e n a W  in the Tbirty-third Year of the Repuhlic of India as , 

fo~iows :- 

I. W Act may be d e d  the -bay Civil CbuttP (&jam h m & n e d t ) b r t  bi% 

Act, 1982. - 
*b 13-1 

13-1 ' ,%? 





EXTRAORDINARY, 
- -. - - 

Val. H X X ]  P R I D A Y , M A R C R ~ , I S ~ ~ ~ P H ~ ~ A  12,1910 A - -a -- -- ----2-- 

& r u w ~ i l g i v e u t o t h i n P l r t b o r d H t b . t Y ~ b I I * 1  

I 4cfs of Ule ~uiarat~Legbhtm ahd Ordhaow promulgated 
Regthtions made by the Governor. 
' C 

The followhg Act of the - --e-...-Lw nmvls ."mu aasujw w ay tne 
' Resident on tho 27th February, 1989 is hereby published fur ge~cral information. ' , 

' 1 

- -  . R. M. MEHTA, , . 
' h r e f a r ~  .the Government of ~ u ~ ~ i ~  . . 

I &gal Department. , .  

I GUJARAT' ACr NO. 4 OF 1989. 

(Rmt published; , after baviag received the assent of the President in the - _ ,  I 
1 

"Guja'mt @vemkmt Gazette" on the 3rd March. 1989). . , .  

+ An Act further to amend the Bombay.Civi1 Courts Act, 1869.. < .  . 

It is haeby enacred h'the Fortieth Year. of the Republic of hdia as , ' , 
< ,,;. 

- fQ~ows$- & .  

.. 
' 1. (1) This' ACt may be called the Bombay Civil Corn (Gujmtm& & 
~m&dment) Act; 1989. md oom- ' I  

- r n e n m t .  . 
(2) This section shall be d ~ m e d  to have come into force-on the 23rd Septem . ., 

A k 1988 and the m i n i n g  pmyisions of this Act shah be d-Bd to have come 
. into foiw on the 19th October, 1988. . # .  

' I  . .  - *  . 4-1. * * <  W-IGeirs-41 - 

. - . I : ' 
. - 



BUJ. GOVT. U A Z E m ,  EX., $$I989 . [PART IT 

b r 6 i o n  of 2. In tho Bombay Civil Caur~i Act. 1869 (herein&er r c h &  to as "the 3 
prhcipal Acty% after set* 4, ths following scction shall be inserted, namely :r d - 

of IS#. LsBe. 

?miUon of "4A. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 4, the position of the 
mdar station of tho ~%hict'of Ahmedabad at Nard shall be in tlie City of 
h e & b a d .  

)A hR in 
~ - d B b d  

W. Explanation.-For the purposes of this section and section 23A, "City of 
hedabad"  means the City of Ahmedabad as defined by clause (2) of zm 
section 2 of the Ahmedabad City Caw?$ Act, .1961.". IMi. 

h r t i o n  of 3. In the iri4cipal Act, after section 23, the following section shall be insertdm 
arrotion 238 

Born. I L I ~  namely :- 
of 1868. 

c i ~ a  JU* 
- ofcivil Colut 

o f m i o t  of 
m c d a b a d  
d Nami 
hold their 

- in 
m e d a l a d  
a t y  . 
~e land ax*. 

" 2 3 k  Nobithstaoding anything contained in section 23, the Civil Judgea 
of the Civil Court at Naml in the District of Ahmedabad' shall hold tlreir 
,Courts in the City of ~hmedahd.'' .  

4. (1) The Bombay Civil Courts (Gujarat Amendment) ~rdianaoce, 1988 is O. 
hereby repealed. 6of 

160% 

(2) Notwithstanding such re@, anything done or any action taken under 
the 'prionpd Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall be dkmed ta have 
bocn done or taken under the principal Act as amended by this Act. 







Extra No. 16 REGISTERED NO. G/GNR;* 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED B-Y AUTHORITY 

VOL XLIII) WEDNESDAY, JUNE 5 ,  2002 IJYAISTH A 1 5 . 1  924 
-- -- - - - - - - * -  ----- - - 

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it 
may bg filed as a Separate- Compiiation. - - 

PART- IV 
Acts of the &jarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated 

and Regulations made by the Governor. 

'I'he following Act of the Gujarat LegisIature, having bccn asserlted 
to ky the President on the 24th May, 2002 is hereby published for general 
ir~t'ortnitcion. 

V. M. KOTHARE, 
Secretary to the Govern~ncn~ of Gujaral. 

Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department. 
GUJARAT .4CT NO. 16 OF 2002. 

(First published, after having received the assent of  the Ptesiden t in 
ihc "C;i!jcrr.ar Gavenmzent Gazelte ", on the 5 ti1 June, 2002). 

A N  ACT 
furtlw to amend the Bombay Civil Courts Acl, 1 869. 

I1 i s  hereby enacted in the Fifty-third year of the Republic of India as 

1. !, I )  This Act may bc called the Bombay Civil Courrs (Gujarat Short 

r ' lnler~t l i~~cnt)  Act, 2002. titlc and 
commente- 

( 7 )  I t  sha!! come into fol-cc un such date as thc State Govcrn~nent may, merit 

noti fication in the Qfllci~ll G ~ ~ z e t t e ,  appoint. 

XIV 01' 2. In the Bombay Civil Courts Act, 1869 (heicinafter sefcrrecl lo as Amend- 

1864. -.the principal Act"), in section 1 6, for the words "fifty thousand ~~opees", the mentuf' 

words "one Ice i.iipecs" shall be substituted. section 16 
of XIV of 

1-V EX. 16- 1 15-1 1869. 



1 6-2 GL'JAR AT GOVERNMENT GME'ITE, EX., 5-6-2002 PART IV 

Arnend- 3. In the principal Act, in section 24, for the words "fifty thousand 
mest of rupees", the words "one lac rupees" shall be substituted. 
section 24 
of XIV uf 
1869. 

Amend- 4. In the principal Act, i n  section 26, for the words "fifty thousand 
mentof rupees", the words "one lac rupees" shall be substituted. 
section 26 
of XTV of 
1869. 

Amend- 5. In  the principal Act, in section 28A, in sub-section (2 ) ,  for the worcls 
merit "tifty thousand rupees", the words "one I ac rupees" shall he substituted. 
section 
28A of X N 
of 1869. 

Transfer of 6. All suits and proceedings of a civil nature wherein the subject mattel- 
pending exceeds in amount or value fifty thousand rupees but does not exceed one 
cases. 

lac rupces pending in a Court of Civil Judge (Senior Division) immediately 
before the con~mencement of the Bombay Civil Courts (Guj arat Amendmen t) Guj. 
Act, 2002, shall after such commencement, stand transferred to, and be l6 

of 2002. disposed of by a Civil Judge (Junior Division) within the local limits of his 
ordinary jurisdiction. 

/ 

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR 


	1982GUJARAT13.pdf
	Guj-1982-The Bombay Civil Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-13.pdf
	Guj-1989-The Bombay Civil Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-4.pdf
	Guj-1993-The Bombay Civil Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-19.pdf
	Guj-2002-The Bombay Civil Courts (Gujarat Amendment) Act-16.pdf




