
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
The Factories (Karnataka Amendment) Act, 2002 

 
Act 1 of 2003 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
 
Central Act Amendment, The Factories Act, 1948

Amendment appended: 33 of 2023  
 



KARNATAKA ACT NO. 1 OF 2003 
THE FACTORIES (KARNATAKA AMENDMENT)  ACT, 2002 

Arrangement of Sections 
Sections: 
 1.  Short title and commencement 

 2. Amendment of section 45 

 3. Amendment of section 49 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS  
 It is considered necessary to amend the Factories Act, 
1948 (Central Act LXIII of 1948) in its application to the 
Karnataka State so as to make a provision for appointment of 
Welfare Officer, Medical Officer and Female Supervisor, in a 
factory, if it employs more than 200 workers. 

 

 Hence the Bill. 

 (LA Bill No. 19 of 2002) 

 

[Entry 24 and 36 of List-III of the Seventh Schedule to the 
Constitution of India] 

 
 



 2

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 1 OF 2003 
(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 

Tenth day of January, 2003) 

THE FACTORIES (KARNATAKA AMENDMENT)  ACT, 2002 
(Received the assent of the President on the  

Thirty first day of December, 2002) 

 An Act further to amend the Factories Act, 1948 in its 
application to the State of Karnataka.  

 Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Factories 
Act, 1948 (Central Act LXIII of 1948) in its application to the 
State of Karnataka for the purposes hereinafter appearing; 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the 
fifty third year of the Republic of India as follows:-   
 1.  Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may  
be called the Factories (Karnataka Amendment) Act, 2002. 

  (2) It shall come into force from such date, as the 
State Government may, by notification, appoint. 

 2. Amendment of section 45.- In section 45 of the 
Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act LXIII of 1948) (hereinafter 
referred to as the principal Act), in sub-section (4), for the 
words “five hundred” the words “two hundred” shall be 
substituted. 

 3. Amendment of section 49.- In section 49 of the 
principal Act,- 

 (1) in sub-section (1), for the words “five hundred” the 
words “two hundred” shall be substituted; 

 (2) after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, 
namely:- 

 
(Published in the Karnataka Gazette Part IV-A Extra Ordinary No.  52 dated 10-1-2003 
in Notification No. ÉâªÀâXµÖE 15 µÖÉâ}â 2002) 



 3

 “(1A) In every factory where two hundred or more women 
workers are ordinarily employed the occupier shall 
employ in the factory, such number of female 
supervisors, as may be prescribed.” 

 By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 

 
M.R.HEGDE 

Secretary to Government, 
Department of Parliamentary Affairs 

and Legislation. 
 

 



(1) 

 
 
 

 
  

 

 

ೇಷ ಾಜ  ಪ ೆ 
 

 

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 

NOTIFICATION 

NO: DPAL 04 SHASANA 2023, BENGALURU, DATED: 07.08.2023 

The Factories (Karnataka Amendment) Bill, 2023 ಇದ  2023ರ  ಂಗಳ 
10  ಂಕ  ಧ ರ ಅ ಮ  , ನ  ವ  ಇದ  
2023ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ : 33 ಎಂ  ಂಕ: 07.08.2023  ಕ ಟಕ 

ಜ ಪತ ದ ಷ ಜ ಪ  ( ಗ IV) ಯ   ಪ ಕ ಸ ಂ  ಆ ಸ ,- 
KARNATAKA ACT NO. 33 OF 2023 

 
 

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 7th day of August, 2023) 
 

 

THE FACTORIES (KARNATAKA AMENDMENT) ACT, 2023 

 (Received the assent of the President on the 10th day of July, 2023) 

 

 An Act further to amend the Factories Act, 1948 in its application to the State 

of Karnataka. 

 Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Factories Act, 1948 (Central 

Act LXIII of 1948) in its application to the state of Karnataka for the purposes 

hereinafter appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy-fourth Year of 

the Republic of India, as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement:- (1) This Act may be called the Factories 

(Karnataka Amendment) Act, 2023. 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

2. Amendment of section 54:- In section 54 of the Factories Act, 1948 

(Central Act LXIII of 1948) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act),- 

s̈ÁUÀ  – 4ಎ 

Part – IVA 

, 07  , 2023 ( , 16, , 1945) 

BENGALURU,  MONDAY, 07, AUGUST, 2023 (SHRAVANA, 16, SHAKAVARSHA, 1945) 

. 379
No.     379 



2 

(i)   the existing provision shall be numbered as sub-section (1); and 

(ii) after sub-section (1) so numbered, the following shall be inserted, 

namely:- 
 

“(2) The State Government may by notification in the official Gazette, extend 

the daily maximum hours of work specified in this section up to twelve hours 

inclusive of interval for rest in any day, subject to a maximum of forty eight hours 

in any week as specified in section 51, in respect of any group or class or 

description of factories on such conditions as it may deem expedient, subject to the 

written consent of such worker for such work, and the remaining days of the said 

week for the worker shall be paid holidays.”  

 

3. Amendment of section 55.- In section 55 of the Principal Act, after sub-

section (2), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
 

“(3) The state government may by notification extend the total number of 

hours of work of a worker without an interval to six hours in respect of any group 

or class or description of factories on such conditions as it may deem expedient 

due to the provision of flexibility in working hours as specified in sub-section (2) of 

section 54.” 

 
4. Amendment of section 56:- In section 56 of the Principal Act,- 

 (i)   the existing provision shall be numbered as sub-section (1); and 

(ii)  after sub-section (1) so numbered, the following shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

 

“(2) The State Government may by notification in the Official Gazette increase 

the spread over up to 12 hours inclusive of his intervals for rest in respect of any 

group or class or description of factories on such conditions as it may deem 

expedient, due to the provision of flexibility in working hours as specified in sub-

section (2) of section 54.” 

 

5. Amendment of section 59.- In section 59 of the Principal Act, for sub-

section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

 

 



 3 

“(1) Where a worker works in any factory,- 

(i) for more than nine hours in any day or for more than forty eight hours 

in any week, working for six days in any week; 

(ii)  for more than ten hours in any day or for more than forty eight hours 

in any week, working for five days in any week;  

(iii) for more than eleven and a half hours in any day working for four 

days in any week, or works on paid holidays 

 

-he shall in respect of overtime work, be entitled to wages at the rate of twice his 

ordinary rate of wages.” 

6. Amendment of section 65.- In section 65 of the Principal Act, in   sub-

section (3),- 

(i) in clause (iv), for the words “seventy five” the words “one hundred and forty 

four hours” shall be substituted; 
 

(ii) after clause (iv) the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
 

“(v) a worker shall be required to work overtime subject to the written consent 

of such worker for such work.” 

 

7. Substitution of section 66.- For section 66 of the Principal Act, the 

following shall be substituted, namely:- 
 

“66. Further restriction on employment of women.- The provisions of this 

Chapter shall, in their application to women in factories, be supplemented by 

the following further restrictions, namely:- 

      (a) no woman shall be required or allowed to work in any factory except 

between the hours of 6 A.M. to 7 P.M: 

Provided that a woman may be required or allowed to work in any factory 

between the hours of 7 P.M to 6 A.M subject to the following conditions, namely:- 

(i) It shall be the duty of the employer or other responsible persons at the 

work places to prevent or deter the commission of acts of sexual harassment and 

to provide the procedures for the resolution, statement or prosecutions of acts of 

sexual harassment by taking all steps required;  

(ii) Express prohibition of sexual harassment in any form such as 

unwelcome sexually determined behaviour either directly or by implication or 



4 

advances or contact to gain contact or demand sexual favours or make sexually 

coloured remarks or showing pornography or any other unwelcome physic, 

verbal or non-verbal contact of sexual nature; 

(iii) Provide appropriate working conditions in respect of works, leisure, 

health and hygiene to further ensure that there is no hostile environment 

towards women at workplaces and no woman employee should have reasonable 

grounds to believe that she is disadvantaged in connection with her employment; 

(iv) The employer shall maintain a complaint redressal mechanism in the 

factory itself and the said mechanism shall ensure time-bound treatment of 

complaint. Such mechanism shall provide, when necessary a Complaint 

Committee, a special counsellor or other support services including the 

maintenance of confidentiality; 

(v) The female employees shall be allowed to raise issues of sexual 

harassment to workers in the workers meeting and other appropriate forums; 

(vi) The employer shall provide proper lighting and CCTV coverage not only 

inside the factory, but also surrounding of the factory and to all places where 

the female workers may move out of necessity in the course of work. CCTV 

coverage shall be storage for not less than forty five days; 

(vii) The employer shall see that the women workers are employed in a batch 

not less than ten; 

(viii) Sufficient women security shall be provided during the night shift at 

the entry as well as exit point; 

(ix) Sufficient number of rest rooms shall be provided for the female workers 

to arrive in advance and also leave after the working hours; 

(x) The employer shall provide transportation facility to the women workers 

from their residence and back (for night shift) and security guards (including 

female security guard) and each transportation vehicle shall also be equipped 

with CCTV camera and GPS; 

(xi) During night shift not less than 1/3rd of strength of the supervisor shift-

in-charge or foreman or other supervisory staff shall be women; 

(xii) There shall be not less than twelve consecutive hours of rest or gap 

between the last shifts and the night shift wherever a women worker is changed 

from day shift to night shift and so also from night shift to day shift; 



 5 

(xiii) The establishment shall obtain Bio-data of each driver and conduct 

pre-employment screening of the antecedents of all drivers employed on their 

own. As regards the driver employed through outsourcing, the company shall 

ensure to its satisfaction that the collection of Bio-data and conduct pre-

employment screening of the antecedents of the drivers is carried out by the 

service provider; 

(xiv) The telephone number, particularly mobile phone numbers email ID 

and address of the women employees shall not be disclosed to unauthorised 

persons; 

(xv) Careful selection of routes shall be made in such a way that no women 

employees shall be picked up first and dropped last; and 

(xvi) It shall not be made compulsory or obligatory for any women worker to 

work in night shifts. Written consent shall be obtained from the women workers 

who are interested to work in night shifts. 
 

  (b) There shall be no change of shifts except after a weekly holiday or any 

other holiday.” 

By Order and in the name of 
the Governor of Karnataka, 

G. SRIDHAR 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary 
Affairs and Legislation 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



6 

ಸ ೕಯ ವ ವ ರಗ  ಮ  ಸನ ರಚ  ಸ ಲಯ 
ಅ ಚ  

: ವ ಇ 04 ಸನ 2023, ಂಗ , ಂಕ: 07.08.2023 
The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) ರ 

ಪ ಕರಣ 5-ಎ ರ ಅ ಯ  ಜ ಲ ಂದ ಅ ತ ದ the Factories (Karnataka 

Amendment) Act, 2023 (Karnataka Act No. 33 of 2023) ರ ಂತರವ  ಅ ತ 

ಕನ ಡ ಪಠ ಂ  ಂಕ: 07.08.2023  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಪತ ದ ಷ ಜ ಪ   

( ಗ-IV) ಯ  ಪ ಕ ಸ ಂ  ಆ ಸ ,- 

2023 ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ : 33   
(2023 ರ ಆಗ  ಂಗಳ  7  ಂಕ  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಪತ ದ ಷ ಯ  ದ  

ಪ ಕಟ ) 

 

ಗಳ (ಕ ಟಕ ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 2023 
 (2023 ರ  ಂಗಳ 10  ಂಕ  ಧ ರ ಅ ಮ ಯ  ಪ ಯ ) 

 

ಗಳ ಅ ಯಮ, 1948  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ  ಅನ ವ  ಮತ  
ಪ  ವ ಒಂ  ಅ ಯಮ.  

ಇ  ಇ ಂ   ಬ ವ ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಗಳ ಅ ಯಮ, 
1948  (1948ರ ಂದ  ಅ ಯಮ, LXIII)  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ  ಅನ ವ  ಮತ  

ಪ   ಕ ದ ಂದ;  
ಇ , ರತ ಗಣ ಜ ದ ಎಪ ಲ  ವಷ ದ  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ  

ನ ಡಲ ಂದ ಈ ಂ  ಅ ಯ ತ ಗ :  
1. ಪ  ಸ  ಮ  ಭ.- (1)  ಈ ಅ ಯಮವ  ಗಳ 

(ಕ ಟಕ ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 2023 ಎಂ  ಕ ಯತಕ .  
(2) ಇ  ಈ ಡ   ಬರತಕ .  
2. 54  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಗಳ ಅ ಯಮ, 1948(1948ರ ಂದ  

ಅ ಯಮ LXIII)ರ (ಇದರ  ಇ ಂ  ಲ ಅ ಯಮ ಂ  ಉ ೕ ಸ ) 
54  ಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 

(i) ಅ ತ ದ ವ ಉಪ ಧವ  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (1) ಎಂ  ಯ  
ೕಡತಕ ; ಮ  

(ii)   ೕಡ ದ (1)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ತ ಯ ಈ ಂ ನದ  
ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ :- 

“(2) ಜ ಸ ರ , ಸ  ಜ ಪತ ದ  ಅ ಚ ಯ ಲಕ ಅ  
ಕ ಂ  ಸಬ ಥ ಷರ ಗಳ  ಗಳ  ಂ  ಅಥ  
ಗ ಅಥ  ವಗ ದ ದಭ ದ , 51  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಷ ಪ   

ರದ  ಗ ಷ  ನಲವ ಂ  ಗ ಳಪ ,  ನದ ನ ಮದ 
ಮಧ ಂತರವ  ಒಳ ಂ , ಅಂಥ ಲಸ  ಅಂಥ ಲಸ ರನ ತ ಒ ಳಪ  



 7 

ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಷ ಪ ದ ನ ಗ ಷ  ಲಸದ ಗಳ  ಹ ರ  
ಗ  ಸ ಸಬ   ಲಸ ರ  ಸದ  ರದ ಉ ದ ನಗ  ವ  

ರ  ನಗ ರತಕ ”.  
3. 55  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 55  ಪ ಕರಣದ  (2)  

ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ತ ಯ ಈ ಂ ನದ  ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ :- 
“(3) ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಸ  ಜ ಪತ ದ  ಅ ಚ ಯ ಲಕ 54  

ಪ ಕರಣದ (2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ  ಷ ಪ  ಲಸದ ಗಳ  ಂ ಯ 
ಉಪ ಧ ಂ , ಅ  ಕ ಂ  ಸಬ ಥ ಷರ ಗಳ  ಗಳ 

 ಂ  ಅಥ  ಗ ಅಥ  ವಗ ದ ದಭ ದ  ಮಧ ಂತರ ಲ  
ಲಸ ರನ ಲಸದ ಒ  ಗಳ ಯ  ಆ  ಗ  ಸ ಸಬ . 

4. 56  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 56  ಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 
(i) ಪ ತ ವ ಉಪ ಧ  (1) ಎಂ  ಯ  ೕಡತಕ ; 
(ii)  ಯ  ೕಡ ದ (1)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ತ ಯ ಈ 

ಂ ನದ  ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ :- 
“(2) ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಸ  ಜ ಪತ ದ  ಅ ಚ ಯ ಲಕ 54  

ಪ ಕರಣದ (2)  ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಷ ಪ  ಲಸದ ಗಳ  
ಂ ಯ ಉಪ ಧ ಂ , ಅ  ಕ ಂ  ಸಬ ಥ ಷರ ಗಳ 

 ಗಳ  ಂ  ಅಥ  ಗ ಅಥ  ವಗ ದ ದಭ ದ  ಆತನ 
ಮದ ಮಧ ಂತರಗಳ  ಒಳ ಂ  ಲಸದ ಯ  ಹ ರ  ಯವ  
ಸಬ ”. 

5. 59  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 59  ಪ ಕರಣದ , (1)  
ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಬದ  ಈ ಂ ನದ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ  ಎಂದ :- 

“(1)  ಯ  ಲಸ ರ ,- 
(i)  ರದ  ಆ  ನಗ  ಲಸ ಗ,  

ನದ  ಒಂಭ  ಗ ಂತ  ಅಥ   ರದ  ನಲವ ಂ  
ಗ ಂತ ; 

(ii)  ರದ  ಐ  ನಗ  ಲಸ ಗ,  
ನದ  ಹ  ಗ ಂತ  ಅಥ   ರದ  ನಲವ ಂ  

ಗ ಂತ ; 
(iii)  ರದ   ನಗ  ಲಸ ಗ  ಅಥ  

ವ  ರ  ನಗಳ  ಲಸ ಗ,   ನದ  ಹ ಂ ವ  
ಗ ಂತ , 

- ಲಸ ದ , ಆತ  ಅವ  ೕ ದ ಲಸದ ದಭ ದ  ನ  
ಮ ಯ ದರಗ ಂತ ಪ  ದರಗಳ  ಮ ಗಳ  ಪ ಯ  
ಅಹ ಗತಕ ”  



8 

6. 65  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 65  ಪ ಕರಣದ (3)  
ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 

(i) ಡ (iv)ರ  “ಎಪ ೖ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದ  “ಒಂ   
ನಲವತ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ ; 

(ii) ಡ (iv)ರ ತ ಯ ಈ ಂ ನದ  ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ :- 
“(v) ಅಂಥ ಲಸ  ಅಂಥ ಲಸ ರನ ತ ಒ ಳಪ  ಅವ  ೕ ದ 

ಲಸ  ಲಸ ರ  ಅಗತ ಪ ಸತಕ . “  
7. 66  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ ೕಜ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ 66  ಪ ಕರಣದ 

ಬದ  ಈ ಂ ನದ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ  ಎಂದ :- 
“66.  ಮ ಯರ ೕಜ  ಮತ  ಬ ಂಧ.- ಗಳ  

ಮ ಯ  ಈ ಅ ಯದ ಉಪ ಧಗಳ  ಅನ ದರ  ಈ ಳ ಡ ಮತ  
ಬ ಂಧಗಳ  ರಕ  ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ ,-:- 

(ಎ)  6.00 ಂದ  7.00 ರ ನ ನ ಗಳ  ರ ಪ   
ಮ ಯ   ಯ  ಯ ವ  ಅಗತ ಪ ಸ ತಕ ದ ಲ ; 

ಪ , ಈ ಂ ನ ಷರ ಗ ಳಪ ,  ಯ  ಒಬ  
ಮ ಯ   7.00 ಂದ  6.00ರ ನ ನ ಗಳ  ಯ ವ  
ಅಗತ ಪ ಸಬ  ಅಥ  ಅ ಮ ಸಬ , ಎಂದ :- 

(i)  ಲಸ ಸ ಳಗಳ  ಂ ಕ ಳದ ತ  ಎಸ ದ  ತ ಗ  ಅಥ  
ಬ ಂ  ಮ  ಅಗತ ದ ಎ  ಕ ಮಗಳ  ದರ ಲಕ 
ಂ ಕ ಳ ತ ಗಳ ಣ ಯ,  ಅಥ  ಅ ೕಜ ಗ  
ಯ ನವ  ಕ  ೕಜಕರ ಅಥ  ಇತರ ಜ ತ ವ ಗಳ 

ಕತ ವ ರತಕ ;  
(ii)   ಪ ತ  ಆಗ  ಅಥ  ಇಂ ತದ ಲಕ ಗ  ಅ ಗ ಹ  ಂ ಕ 

ಧ ತ ನಡವ  ಅಥ  ಪಕ ವ  ಂದ  ಂ ವ  ಅಥ  
ಪಕ   ಅಥ  ಂ ಕ ಸಮ ಯ  ೕ  ಅಥ  ಂ ಕ 
ವ ವ ೕ  ಅಥ  ನಗ ತ ಗಳ  ೕ  ಅಥ  ಂ ಕ ಸ ಪದ 

 ಇತರ ಅ ಗ ಹ  ಕ, ಕ ಅಥ  ಕವಲದ ಪಕ ಥ 
 ನ ಯ  ಂ ಕ ಳದ ಬ ಂಧವ  ಅ ವ ; 

(iii) ಲಸದ ಸ ಳಗಳ  ಮ ಯ   ಪ ಲ ವರಣ ಲ ಂ  
ಮತ  ಖ ತಪ ಳ  ಲಸಗ , ಮ, ಆ ೕಗ  ಮ  ಮ ಲ ದ 

ಧದ  ಕ ಲಸ ವ ವರಣವ  ಕ  ಮ   ಮ  
ಉ ೕ  ತನ  ಉ ೕಗದ ಧದ  ಆ ಯ  ಸ ಂ  

ತಹ ಕ  ರಣಗಳ  ಂ ರತಕ ದ ಲ ;  
(iv) ೕಜಕ  ಯ  ಒಂ   ರ  

ಯ ವ ವ ಯ  ಂ ರತಕ  ಮ  ಸದ  ಯ ವ ವ  ಲಬದ   
ವ ಹ ಯ  ಖ ತಪ ಸತಕ . ಅಂಥ ಯ ವ ವ , ಅವಶ ಗ  



 9 

ಪ ಯ   ಒಳ ಂ   ಸ , ಷ ಸ ೕಚಕ  
ಅಥ  ಇತ  ರಕ ಗಳ  ಕ ಸತಕ ;  

(v)  ಮ  ಉ ೕ ಗ , ಕರ ಸ ಗಳ  ಮ  ಇತರ ಕ  ಗಳ  
ಲಸ ರ  ಂ ಕ ಳದ ಷಯಗಳ  ಪ ಸ  ಅವ ಶ ೕಡತಕ ;  

(vi) ೕಜಕ , ಯ ಒಳಗ ೕ ಅಲ  ಯ ತ ತ  
 ಲಸದ ಯ ದಭ ದ  ಮ  ಕ  ಓ  ಅಗತ ವ 

ಎ  ಸ ಳಗಳ  ಸ ದ ಳ  ಮ   ಕವ   ಅ  ಕ ಸತಕ .  
ಕವ ಜ  ನಲವ ೖ  ನಗ ಂತ ಕ ಲ  ಗ ಹ ಡತಕ ;  

(vii) ೕಜಕ , ಮ  ಕರ  ಹತ ಂತ ಕ ಲದ ಡದ  
ೕ ಸ  ಎಂ ದ  ಗಮ ಸತಕ ;  
(viii)  ಯ  ಪ ಶ  ಗಮ ನ ರಗಳ  ಕ  ಮ  

ಭದ ಯ  ಕ ಸತಕ ;  
(ix) ಮ  ಕ  ಂ ತ  ಆಗ ಸ  ಮ   ಲಸದ ಗಳ 

ತ ಯ ಗ ಸ  ಕ  ಯ ಂ  ಠ ಗಳ  ಕ ಸತಕ ;  
(x) ೕಜಕ , ಮ  ಕ  ಅವರ ಮ ಂದ ಲಸದ ಸ ಳದವ  

ಮ  ಅ ಂದ ಂ ಗ  (  )  ಲಭ ವ  ಮ  ಭದ  
ಬ ಂ ಯ  (ಮ  ಭದ  ಬ ಂ ಯ  ಒಳ ಂ ) ಒದ ಸತಕ  ಮ  

ಪ ಂ   ಹನ   ಮರ ಮ  ಎ  ಂ  
ಸಜ ತ ರತಕ ;  

(xi) ಯ  ಪ ರದ ವ ರಕ  ಅಥ  ೕ    
ಅಥ  ಇತರ ರ  ಬ ಂ ಯ ಂದಬಲದ 1/3  ಗ ಂತ ಕ ಯಲದ  
ಮ ಯ ರತಕ .  

(xii) ಳ ನ ಂದ     ಂದ ಳ ನ  
ಮ  ಕರ  ಬದ ಗ  ಂ ನ ಗ  ಮ  ಯ 
ನ ನ ಮ ಅಥ  ಅಂತರ  ತರ ಹ ರ ಗ ಂತ 
ಕ ರತಕ ದ ಲ ;  

(xiii) ಯ  ಪ ಬ  ಲಕನ ವಯ ಕ ವರ  ಮ   
ಉ ೕಗವ  ಪ ದ ಎ  ಲಕರ ಂ ನ ಉ ೕಗದ ವ  ಇ ಸವ  
ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ . ರ ಯ ಲಕ ಉ ೕಗ ಪ ದ ಲಕ   

ಪ , ತ  ಲಕರ ವಯ ಕ ವರ  ಗ ಹ  ಮ  ಂ ನ ಉ ೕಗದ 
ವ  ಇ ಸವ  ಪ ೕಲ  ನ  ತನ  ಯಕ  ಎಂ ದ  

ಖ ತಪ ಳತಕ ;  
(xiv) ಮ  ಉ ೕ ಗಳ ರ  , ಷ    ಗ , 

ಇ-   ಐ  ಮ  ಸವ  ಅನ ತ ವ ಗ  ಬ ಗ ಸತಕ ದ ಲ ;  
(xv)  ಮ  ಉ ೕ ಗಳ  ದಲ ಸ ಳದ  ಹ ಳ ಥ ಮ  

ಯ  ಇ ಸ ಥ ೕ ಯ  ಎಚ ಂದ ಗ ಗಳ ಆ ಯ  ಡತಕ ;  



10 

(xvi) ಗಳ  ಲಸ  ಬ  ಮ  ಕರ  ಕ ಯ 
ಅಥ  ಕ  ಡತಕ ದ ಲ . ಗಳ  ಲಸ ವ ಆಸ ವ 
ಮ  ಕರ ಂದ ತ ಸಮ ಯ  ಪ ಯತಕ .  
   ( ) ರದ ರ  ಅಥ   ಇತರ ರ ಯ ತ ಯದ ರ  ಗಳ  

 ಬದ ವ  ಡತಕ ದ ಲ .   

The above translation of the Factories (Karnataka Amendment) Act, 2023 
(Karnataka Act No. 33 of 2023) shall be authoritative text in Kannada language 
under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 
of 1963).  

 
ವ  ೕ  

ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಲ  
 

ಕ ಟಕ ಜ ಲರ ಆ ರ 
ಮ  ಅವರ ಸ ನ , 

. ೕಧ  
ಸ ರದ ಯ ದ , 
ಸ ೕಯ ವ ವ ರಗ  ಮ  

ಸನ ರಚ  ಇ . 
 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                                  
      [

ಮುದಕರು ಾಗೂ ಪ ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ ಾ ಾ ಗಳ , ಕ ಾ ಟಕ ಾಜ ಪತ , ಸ ಾ  ೇಂದ  ಮುದ ಾಲಯ, ೆಂಗಳ ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


	STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS



