The Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act,
1982

Act 46 of 1976

Keyword(s):
Member of Legislative Assembly, Pension, MLA

Amendments appended: 3 of 1982, 6 of 1987, 7 of 1987, 34 of 1989, 25 of 1991,
12 of 1994, 15 of 2000, 14 of 2003, 44 of 2005, 26 of 2008, 5 of 2012, 9 of
2018

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF LEGISLATURE
ACT, 1976

Act No. 46 of 1976]

(Received the assent of the Governor on the 28th day of November, 1976 and pub. in K.G. EX. No. 685
dated 1-12-1976)
PREAMBLE

An Act to provide for the payment of pension to persons who have been Members of the Legislature
WHEREAS it is expedient to provide for the payment of pension to persons who have been Members of
the Legislature;

Be it enacted in the Twenty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows.--

Section 1 - Short title and commencement
(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment of pension to members of Legislature Act, 1976.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

Section 2 - Pension of Members of Legislature
(Substituted by Acts 3 of 1982, 7 of 1987 and 12/1994.) [(1)There shall be paid a pension per mensem at
the rate specified in the Schedule to every person who has served as-]

(i) a member of the Kerala Legislative Assembly; or

(if) a member of the Legislative Assembly of the former State of Travancore or Travancore-Cochin or
Madras, representing any territory which after the 1st day of November, 1956, forms part of the State of
Kerala or a member of the Legislative Council or the Legislative Assembly of the former State of Cochin;
or

(iii) a member of the Legislative Council of the former State of Madras and who during the period of such
membership was a permanent resident in the Malabar district referred to in sub-section (2) of section 5 of
the State Reorganisation Act, 1956 (Central Act 37 of 1956); or

(iv) partly as a member referred to in any of the preceding clauses and partly as a member referred to in any
one or more of the other preceding clauses:
(Proviso substituted by Acts 7/1987 and 12/1994 and subsequently Omitted by Act 8/1997) [xxxx]

Explanation.”

For the purposes of this section, a person shall be deemed to have served as a member of a Legislative
Assembly during the period when that Legislative Assembly remains suspended under Article 356 of the
Constitution of India.

(Inserted by Act 3 of 1982.) [(1A) Where a member dies, his or her spouse shall, if such member would
have been entitled to pension under sub-section (1) if he or she had ceased to be a member on the date of
his or her death, be entitled to the same amount of pension as such member would have been entitled to if
he or she had ceased to be a member on that date.

(1B) Where a person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) dies his or her spouse shall be entitled to the
same amount of pension as would have been payable to such person if he or she had not died.

(1C) Where a person who would have been entitled to pension under subsection (1) if he or she were alive
at the commencement of (Substituted by Act 12/1994.) [the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of



Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1994] (hereinafter referred to as the Amendment Act) has died before such
commencement, the spouse of such person shall, with effect from the commencement of the Amendment
Act, be entitled to the same pension as such person would have been entitled to under this Act, as amended
by the Amendment Act, if this Act as so amended were in force on the date of his or her death],

(Inserted by ibid.) [1CC) The spouses referred to in sub-section (1A), (1B) and (1C) shall notwithstanding
anything contained in those sub-sections be eligible for the enhanced rates of pension paid to the persons
referred to in sub-section (1), from lime to time.]

(Inserted by Act 34/1989.) [(1D) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, a person entitled to
pension under sub-section (1) shall also be entitled to receive the full amount of pension payable to him or
her as spouse under sub-section (1A) or sub-section (1B) or sub-section (1C).]

(2) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1),-

(i) is elected to the office of the President or Vice-President of India or is appointed to the Office of the
Governor of any State or the Administrator of any Union Territory; or

(ii) becomes a member of the Council of States or the House of the People or the Legislative Assembly of
any State or Union Territory or the Legislative Council of a State or the Metropolitan Council of Delhi
constituted under section 3 of the Delhi Administration Act, 1966; or

(iii) is employed on a salary under the Government of India or any State Government or any corporation
owned or controlled by the Government of India or any State Government, or any local authority or
becomes otherwise entitled to any remuneration from such Government, corporation or local authority,
such person shall not be entitled to any pension under sub-section (1) for the period during which he
continues to hold such office or as such member, or is so employed, or continues to be entitled to such
remuneration:

Provided that where the salary payable to such person for holding such office or being such member
(Inserted by Act 8/1997.) [other than a member of the Kerala Legislative Assembly] or so employed, or
where the remuneration referred to in clause (iii) payable to such person, is, in either case. less than the
pension payable to him under sub-section (1), such person shall be entitled to receive only the difference as
pension under that sub-section.

Explanation.”"( Omitted by ibid.) [xxx]

(3) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is also entitled to any pension from the
Government of India (Omitted by Act 25/1991.) [xxx] or any corporation owned or controlled by the
Government of India (Omitted by Act 25/1991.) [xxx] under any law or otherwise, then,-

(a) where the amount of pension to which he is entitled under such law or otherwise, is equal to or in excess
of that to which he is entitled under sub-section (1), such person shall not be entitled to any pension under
that sub-section; and

(b) where the amount of pension to which he is entitled under such law or otherwise, is less than that to
which he is entitled under sub-section (1), such person shall be entitled to pension under that sub-section
only of an amount which falls short of the amount of pension to which he is otherwise entitled under that
sub-section.

(Added by ibid.) [(4)Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is also entitled to any other
pension under any law made by the State or otherwise from the State Government or any Corporation
owned or controlled by the State Government or any authority, such person shall be entitled to receive the
pension under sub-section (1) in addition to such other pension.]



[Explanation.--For the purposes of (Substituted by Act 25/1991.) [sub-sections (3) and (4)] pension granted
by the Government of India under the Freedom Fighters, Pension Scheme, 1972 or by the Government of
Kerala under the Kerala Freedom Fighters, Pension Rules or by any other State Government under a
scheme for payment of pension to freedom fighters, shall not be deemed to be pension from the
Government of India or, as the case may be, any State Government].

Section 2A - Medical facilities to ex-members

(Inserted by Act 3/1982.) [Any person who has served as a member referred to in clause (i) or clause (ii) or
clause (iii) ‘Substituted by Act 12/1994.) [of sub-section (1) of section 2 and the spouse of such person]
shall, subject to such rules as may be made by the Government in this behalf, be entitled to medical
treatment and medical attendance and to all other benefits in connection therewith to the same extent

(Substituted by Act 6/1987.) [as a Class | Officer/Grade | Officer of the All India Services is entitled to
from time to time].

Explanation.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby clarified that no member of the (Substituted by Act
12/1994.) [famiiy of a person other than his or her spouse] to whom this section applies shall be entitled to
any benefit under this section].

Section 3 - Power to make rules

(1) The Government may, by notification in the Gazette, make rules for the purpose of carrying into effect
the provisions of this Act.

(2) In particular and without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing power, such rules may provide for-
(@) the form in which and the authority to which application for pension shall be made;

(b) the certificates to be furnished along with an application for pension;

(c) any other matter which has to be, or may be, prescribed.

(3) Every rule made under this Act shall be laid, as soon as may be after it is made, before the Legislative
Assembly, while it is in session, for a total period of fourteen days which may be comprised in one session
or in two successive sessions, and if, before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid or the session
immediately following, the Legislative Assembly makes any modification in the rule or decides that the
rule should not be made, the rule shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect,
as the case may be; so, however, that any such modification or annulment shall be without prejudice to the
validity of anything previously done under that rule.

Schedule - Schedule
(Schedule added by Act 12/1994 and subsequently substituted by Acts 8/1997, 15/2000 and 14/2003.)

[Schedule
(See Section 2(1)

Rate of Pension

[Period Rate of pension per mensem (Rs.)
[For any period below two years 2,500
[For two years in the aggregate 3,000
[For three years in the aggregate 3,500
[For four years in the aggregate 4,000
[For five years in the aggregate 4,500

Provided that where any person has served as a member as stated in sub-s. (1) of S. 2 for a period



exceeding five years, there shall be paid to him as additional pension of five hundred rupees per mensem
for every year in excess of five years:

Provided further that in calculating the net qualifying period for pension, fraction of half year and above
shall be rounded to the next completed year:

Provided also that the maximum pension to which a member is eligible under this Act shall not, in the
aggregate, exceed rupees twelve thousand and five hundred per mensem.]



THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS
OF LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1982[1]

(ACT 3 OF 1982)

An Act to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature Act,
1976.

Preamble: -WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to
Members of Legislature Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the thirty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows: -

1. Short and commencement. -(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1982.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2. -In section 2 of the Kerala Payment of Pension to
Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1976 (46 of 1976) (hereinafter referred to as
principal Act), -

(@) in sub-section (1), -

(i) for the opening paragraph, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“There shall be paid a pension of two hundred rupees per mensem to every person
who has served for a period of two years in the aggregate as”;

(i) in the proviso, -

« for the word “five”, in both the places where it occurs, the word “two” shall be
substituted;

» for the words “four hundred and fifty rupees” the words “five hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely: -

“(1A) Where a member dies, his or her spouse shall, if such member would have
been entitled to pension under sub-section (1) if he or she had ceased to be a member on
the date of his or her death, be entitled to the same amount of pension as such member
would have been entitled to if he or she had ceased to be a member on that date.


javascript:void(0)

(1B) Where a person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) dies, his or her
spouse shall be entitled to the same amount of pension as would have been payable to
such person if he or she had not died.

(1C) Where a person who would have been entitled to pension under sub-section (1)
if he or she were alive at the commencement of Kerala Payment of Pension to Members
of Legislature (Amendment) Act,1982 (hereinafter referred to as the Amendment Act)
has died before such commencement, the spouse of such person shall, with effect from
the commencement of the Amendment Act, be entitled to the same pension as such
person would have been entitled to under this Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, if
this Act as so amended were in force on the date of his or her death.”.

(c) to sub-section (3), the following Explanation shall be added, namely: -

“ Explanation. -For the purposes of this section, pension granted by the
Government of India under the Freedom Fighters, Pension Scheme, 1972 or by the
Government of Kerala under the Kerala Freedom Fighters, Pension Rules or by any other
State Government under a scheme for payment of pension to freedom fighters, shall not
be deemed to be pension from the Government of India or, as the case may be, any State
Government.”.

3. Insertion of new section 2A . -After section 2 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely: -

“2A. Medical facilities to ex-members . -Any person who has served as a member
referred to in clause (i) or clause (ii) or clause (iii) of sub-section (1) of section 2 shall,
subject to such rules as may be made by the Government in this behalf, be entitled to
medical treatment and medical attendance and to all other benefits in connection
therewith to the same extent as a member of the Kerala Legislative Assembly is entitled
to under the payment of Salaries and Allowances Act, 1951 (XIV of 1951).

Explanation. -For the removal of doubts, it is hereby clarified that no member of
the family of a person to whom this section applies shall be entitled to any benefit under
this section.”



THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO
MEMBERS OF LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1986[1]

(ACT 6 OF 1987)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature
Act, 1976.

Preamble. —WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976, for the purpose hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Thirty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement. —(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment
of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1986.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2A. — In section 2A of the Kerala Payment of Pension to
Members of Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976), for the words, figures and brackets “as a
member of the Kerala Legislative Assembly is entitled to under the Payment of Salaries
and Allowances Act, 1951 (XIV of 1951)”, the words and figures "as a Class |
Officer/Grade | Officer of the All India Services is entitled to from time to time" shall be
substituted.


javascript:void(0)

THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS

OF LEGISLATURE (SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 1986 [1]

(ACT 7 OF 1987)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature
Act, 1976.

Preamble. —WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976 for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Thirty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows: —

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment
of Pension to Members of Legislature (Second Amendment) Act, 1986.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.—In the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976), in sub-section (1) of section 2,—

(1) for the words "two hundred rupees”, the words "three hundred rupees" shall be
substituted ;

(i1) in the proviso, after the words "in excess of two,", the word "years." shall be
added and the word "so, however, that in no case the pension payable to such person shall
exceed five-hundred rupees per mensem™ shall be deleted.


javascript:void(0)

THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1989 [1]

(ACT 34 OF 1989)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature
Act, 1976.

Preamble.— WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976 for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Fortieth Year of Republic of India as follows: —

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment
of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act,1989.

(2) Clause (i) of section 2 shall come into force at once and clause (ii) thereof shall
be deemed to have come into force on the 15 th day of January, 1987.

2. Amendment of section 2.— In section 2 of the Kerala Payment of Pension to
Members of Legislature Act, 1976 (Act 46 of 1976), —

(i) after sub-section (1C) the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely: —

“(1D) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, a person entitled to pension
under sub-section (1) shall also be entitled to receive the full amount of pension payable
to him or her as spouse under sub-section (1A) or sub-section (1B) or sub-section (1C).”;

(i1) in the Explanation to the proviso to sub-section (2), for the words, brackets and
letters “clauses (a) and (aa)”, the word, brackets and letter “clause (a)” shall be
substituted.


javascript:void(0)

THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1991 1991 [1]
(ACT 25 OF 1991)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
LegislatureAct, 1976.

Preamble .—WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976 for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Forty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1« Short title and commencement .—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1991.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of October, 1991.

2+ Amendment of section 2 .—In the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976),—in section 2,—

* in sub-section (1),—

* in the opening paragraph for the words "three hundred rupees", the words "four
hundred rupees” shall be substituted:;

* in the proviso for the words "fifty rupees”, the words "one hundred rupees™ and
for the words "every year" the words "every year or part thereof exceeding six months"
shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (3),—

(i) in the opening paragraph, the words "or any State Government" in both the
places where they occur and the words "or any local authority" shall be omitted.

(ii) in the Explanation, for the words "this sub-section”, the words, figures and
brackets "sub-sections (3) and (4)" shall be substituted.

(c) After sub-section (3) the following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

"(4) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1), is also entitled to
any other pension under any law made by the State or otherwise from the State
Government or any Corporation owned or controlled by the State Government or any
authority, such person shall be entitled to receive the pension under sub-section (1) in
addition to such other pension.".


javascript:void(0)

THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1994 [1]

(ACT 12 OF 1994)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature Act,
1976.

Preamble. — WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976 for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Forty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement— (1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1994.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.— In the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) in section
2—

(1) in sub-section (1),—
(1) for the opening paragraph the following shall be substituted, namely:—

"(1) There shall be paid a pension per mensem at the rate specified in the
Schedule to every person who has served as —";

(i1) for the proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

"Provided that any person referred to in clause (i), (i1) and (iii) may give in
writing to the Speaker, stating that he would not accept any pension or would accept only
a part of the pension and thereupon the Speaker shall issue such instructions to the
Legislature Secretariat, as desired by such person."

(2) in sub-section (IC), for the words, figures and brackets "the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1982", the words, figures and
brackets "the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act,
1994" shall be substituted;

(3) after sub-section (IC), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—
"(ICC) The spouses referred to in sub-section (1A), (1B) and (1C) shall

notwithstanding anything contained in those sub-sections be eligible for the enhanced
rates of pension paid to the persons referred to in sub-section (1), from time to time".


javascript:void(0)

3. In section 2A of the principal Act,—
(1) for the words, figures and brackets "of sub-section (1) of section 2" the words,
figures and brackets" of sub-section (1) of section 2 and the spouse of such person" shall

be substituted;

(i1) in the Explanation, for the words "family of a person" the words "family of a
person other than his or her spouse" shall be substituted.

4. After section 3 of the principal Act, the following Schedule shall be added,
namely:—

"SCHEDULE"

(See section 2 (1)

Rate of Pension

Period Rate of Pension per mensem
Rs.
For any period below two years 500
For two years in the aggregate 750
For three years in the aggregate 1100
For four years in the aggregate 1400
For five years in the aggregate 1400

Provided that where any person has served as member as stated in sub-section (1)
of section 2 for a period exceeding five years there shall be paid to him an additional
pension of two hundred and fifty rupees per mensem for every year or part thereof
exceeding six months in excess of five years."



THE KERALA PAYMENT OFPENSION TO MEMBERS OF LEGISLATURE
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2000 [1]

(Act 15 Of 2000)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature
Act, 1976 .

Preamble .— whereas it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

be it enacted in the Fifty-first Year of the Republic of India follows :—

1. Short title and commencement .—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment
of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 2000.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Substitution of the Schedule .—In the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976), for the Schedule the following Schedule shall be
substituted, namely:—

"schedule

[ See section 2(1)} Rate of Pension

Period Rate of pension per mensem
For any period below two years Rs. 2,000
For two years in the aggregate Rs. 2,400
For three years in the aggregate Rs. 2,800
For four years in the aggregate Rs. 3,200
For five years in the aggregate Rs. 3,600
Provided that where any person has served as member as stated in sub-section (1)
of section 2 for a period exceeding five years there shall be paid to him an additional

pension of four hundred rupees per mensem for every year in excess of five years:

Provided further that in calculating the net qualifying period for pension fraction
of half year and above shall be rounded to the next completed year:


javascript:void(0)

Provided also that the maximum pension to which a member is eligible under this
Act, shall not, in the aggregate, exceed rupees seven thousand and five hundred per
mensem."



ACT 14 OF 2003
THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT ) ACT, 2003 [1]

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature Act,
1976.

Preamble.--WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;

BE it enacted in the Fifty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.--(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 2003.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st
day of July, 2003.

2. Substitution of the Schedule.--In the Kerala Payment of Pension to
Members of
Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976), for the Schedule, the following Schedule shall be
substituted, namely:-
"SCHEDULE
[See section 2 (1)]
Rate of Pension

Period
Rate of pension per mensem

(Rs)

For any period below two years
Rs.2,500



For two years in the aggregate

Rs.3,000
For three years in the aggregate

Rs.3,500
For four years in the aggregate

Rs.4,000
For five years in the aggregate

Rs.4,500

Provided that where any person has served as a member as stated in sub-section
(1) of section 2 for a period exceeding five years, there shall be paid to him an
additional pension of five hundred rupees per mensem for every year in excess of five
years:

Provided further that in calculating the net qualifying period for pension, fraction
of half year and above shall be rounded to the next completed year:

Provided also that the maximum pension to which a member s eligible under
this Act shall not, in the aggregate, exceed rupees twelve thousand and five hundred
per mensem.".



THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2005 [1]

(ACT 44 OF 2005)

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature Act,
1976.

Preamble.- WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature Act, 1976 for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Kerala Payment
of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 2005.

(2) It shall come into force at once

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature Act, 1976 (46 of 1976) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in
section 2,-

(1) after sub-section (ICC), the following sub-section shall be
inserted,namely:-

“(1CCC) the spouses referred to in sub-sections (1A), (1B) and (1C)
shall not be eligible for pension from the date on which he or she remarries.”;

(2) after sub-section (ID), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:-

“(IE) Where the spouse referred to in sub-sections (1A), (1B) and (1C)
dies, the minor son or the unmarried daughter or both, as the case may be, of the member
shall be entitled to a family pension from the date of death of the spouse at the same rate
as would have been payable to the spouse, if he or she had not died, subject to the
following conditions namely:-

(i) Inthe case of minor son, until he attains the age of twenty-five years;

(ii) In the case of unmarried daughter, until she attains the age of twenty-
five years or she gets married whichever is earlier;

(iii) If there are two persons entitled to family pension, then the amount of
family pension shall be paid to them equally and if there are more than two eligible
persons, the amount of family pension shall be paid to them proportionately.”;

(3) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-


javascript:void(0)

“(3) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is also entitled
to any other pension from the Government of India or any Corporation owned or
controlled by the Government of India or any authority, under any law or otherwise
such person shall be entitled to receive the pension under sub-section (1) in addition to
such other pension.”.

3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the principal Act, in the third proviso to the
Schedule, for the words “rupees twelve thousand and five hundred” the words “rupees
seventeen thousand and five hundred” shall be substituted.



ACT 26 OF 2008

THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF
LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2008

An Act further to amend the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1976.

Preamble.- WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala
Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1976 for the
purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Fifty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 2008.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, it shall come into force at
once.

2. Amendment of section 2.- In section 2 of the Kerala Payment of
Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1976 (46 of 1976)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act).-

(1) in sub-section (1E),-

(a) in the opening paragraph, for the words "the minor son or the
unmarried daughter or both", the words "the minor son or the
unmarried daughter or the mentally retarded son or daughter or all of
them together” shall be substituted,

(b) in clause (i), after the words "twenty-five years", the words "or he starts
earning his livelihood, whichever is earlier" shall be inserted;

(c) in clause (ii), after the words "she gets married", the words "or she
starts earning her livelihood" shall be inserted;

(d) after clause (ii), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

"(iia) in the case of mentally retarded son or daughter, without
considering age.".

(2) after sub-section (3), the following Note shall be inserted, namely:-

“Note: This sub-section shall be deemed to have come into force on the
14" day of May, 1996.”.



3. Insertion of new section 2B.- In the principal Act, after section 2A, the
following section shall be inserted, namely:-

“2B. Free Transit Coupons for ex-Members of the Legislative Assembly.-
(1) Subject to such rules as may be made in this behalf, any person, who has
served as a member referred to in clause (i) or clause (ii) or clause (iii) of sub-
section (1) of section 2 shall, at the option of such ex-Member, be provided with
all or any of the following free transit coupons of an aggregate value of twelve
thousand rupees for a period of twelve calendar months, namely:-

0] rail travel coupons for travel by such ex-member by rail; and
(i) fuel coupons for the purchase of fuel for the travel of such ex-member
in a private vehicle:

Provided that it shall be lawful for the Government to enhance, by order, from
time to time, the aforesaid amount of free transit coupons proportionate to the
periodical increase in rail charges made by the Central Government.

(2) Subject to such rules as may be made in this behalf every ex-member
shall be entitled to utilise such rail travel coupons for the travel by such ex-
member and his or her spouse and one companion in any class by any railway in
India.”.

4. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the principal Act, for the Schedule, the
following Schedule shall be substituted, namely:-
“SCHEDULE
[See section 2 (1)]

Rate of Pension

Period Rate of pension per mensem
For any period below two years Rs. 4000
For two years in the aggregate Rs. 4500
For three years in the aggregate Rs. 5000
For four years in the aggregate Rs. 5500

For five years in the aggregate Rs. 6000



Provided that where any person has served as a member as stated in sub-
section (1) of section 2 for a period exceeding five years, there shall be paid to him
an additional pension of five hundred rupees per mensem for every year in excess of
five years:

Provided further that in calculating the net qualifying period for pension,
fraction of half year and above shall be rounded to the next completed year:

Provided also that the maximum pension to which a member is eligible under
this Act shall not, in the aggregate, exceed rupees twenty thousand per mensem.”.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The last revision of pension to the Ex-Members of the Kerala Legislative Assembly
was made in the year 2005 by Act 44 of 2005. The rate of pension has to be enhanced due to
the increase in price of commodities and other charges.

As per sub-section (1E) of section 2 of the Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of
Legislature (Amendment) Act, 1976 (46 of 1976), the minor son or unmarried daughter or
both, as the case may be, of the member shall be entitled to a family pension from the date of
death of the spouse subject to the following conditions, namely:-

Q) in the case of minor son, until he attains the age of twenty five years;



(i) in the case of unmarried daughter, until she attains the age of twenty five years or
she gets married which ever is earlier.

But there is an ambiguity regarding payment of pension to a son/daughter, who has
started earning his/her livelihood before attaining the age of twenty five years. Payment of
pension to such persons has to be avoided. This has to be clarified. Government have
decided to extend the benefit of family pension to the mentally retarded son/daughter
without considering their age. Government have also proposed to give retrospective effect
to sub-section (3) of section 2 of the Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature
(Amendment) Act, 1976 as amended by Act 44 of 2005 with effect from 14™ May, 1996.
Government have also decided to introduce free transit coupons to Ex-Members of
Legislative Assembly of an aggregate value of twelve thousand rupees for a period of twelve
calendar months.

Further it is decided to enhance the minimum pension of the Ex-Members of
Legislative Assembly from the existing rate of two thousand and five hundred rupees to four
thousand and five hundred rupees to the rate of four thousand rupees to six thousand
rupees and the maximum pension from seventeen thousand and five hundred rupees to
twenty thousand rupees per mensem.

The Bill seeks to amend the Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature
(Amendment) Act, 1976 to achieve the above object.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Clause 3 of the Bill seeks to introduce free transit coupons of an aggregate value of
twelve thousand rupees for a period of twelve calendar months to the Ex-Members of
Legislative Assembly.

In clause 4 of the Bill seeks to enhance the minimum pension of the Ex-Members of
Legislative Assembly from the existing rate of two thousand and five hundred rupees to four
thousand and five hundred rupees to the rate of four thousand rupees to six thousand
rupees and the maximum pension from seventeen thousand and five hundred rupees to
twenty thousand rupees per mensem.



The Bill if enacted and brought into operation would involve a fairly substantial amount
of expenditure of a recurring nature, for its implementation. The actual expenditure that
may have to be incurred on this account from the Consolidated Fund of the State cannot be
estimated with any reasonable degree of the accuracy at this stage.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELIGATED LEGISLATION

The section 2B of the Act proposed to be inserted by clause 3 of the Bill seeks to
empower the Government to make such rules prescribing free transit coupons and the
method of utilization of such coupons for rail travel for Ex-members of the Legislative
Assembly. The above matter is of routine or administrative nature. The delegation of
legislative power is, thus of a normal character.

M.
VIJAYAKUMAR.



Regn. No. KERBIL/2012/45073
dated 5-9-2012 with RNI

Reg. No. KL/TV(N)/634/2018-20

©
cohog qudand
Govemnment of Kerala

2018.

e.e,mg ®OAVOS
KERALA GAZETTE

@RAVIWIVEMO
" EXTRAORDINARY

@RUWIHal:a20  (aIM]laLNaSITmMIAMD
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

L2018 RO 3

: w0, 3rd July 2018
anelye 7 - S8y 193 ahoymo 19 1777
Vol VII Thiruvananthapuram, 19th Mithunam 1193 No.
Tuesday 1940 @RIt 12
: 12th Ashadha 1940
GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Leglslatmn-G) Department
NOTIFICATION
No. 14662/Leg.G2/2017/Law. : " 3rd July, 2018

Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 19th Mithunam, 1193
' 12th Ashadha, 1940,

The following Act of the Kerala State Legislature is hereby published
for general information. The Bill as passed by the Legislative Assembly
received the assent of the Governor on the 3rd day of July, 2018.

By order of the Governor,

B. G. HARINDRANATH,

Law Secretary.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE ﬂUPFRlI\TE{\DENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2018,

32601/2018/5-15.




2

ACT 19 OF 2018

THE KERALA STATE HIGHER EDUCATION COUNCIL
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2018

An Act to amend the Kerala State Higher Education Council Act, 2007.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient to amend the Kerala State
Higher Edut_:ation Council‘ Act, 2007, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing; I

Bt it enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as

foliows:—l ,

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the
"Kerala State Higher Education Council (Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the Sth day of
~July, 2017.

2. Amendment of the preamble.—In the Kerala State Higher
Education Council Act, 2007 (22 of 2007) (hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act), in thc.preaml;le, in the first paragraph, for the word
“experts”, the words and symbol “experts, teachers, students” shall be
substituted. ' ) '

3 Substltut:on of certain expressions by certain other
expressions.~-In the principal Act, for the words * *Advisory Counct”,
“Executive Council” and “Governing VCQuncil”, wherever they occur, the
words “Advisory Body”, “Executive Body” and “Govering Body” shall,
respectively, be substituted.



3

4. Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of the principal Act, after .
clause (s}, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(sa) “RUSA” means the Rasﬁtriya_ Uchchatar Shiksha
Abhiyan, a centrally sponsored scheme for higher education;”

5. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act,—

(i) .in sub-section (1), for clause (a), the following clause shall
be substituted, namely:—

) “(a) to render advice to the Government, Universities,
colleges and other institutions of higher education in the State in matters
of access, equity and excellence in higher education;™;

, (ii} in sub-section (2), after clause (y), the following clauses
~ shall be inserted, namely:—

“(z) conduct longttudmal studies to understand the impact of
student learning;

(za) promote and integrate scientifically proven indigenous
knowledge systems in the State higher education system;

(zb) evolve programmes to improve access to higher educatlon
for dlfferently abled students;

(zc) collaborate with the Goﬁemment in the implementation of
RUSA and other similar centrally sponsored schemes and other central
sector schemes within the State;

(zd) evolve common academic guidelines for Universities in the
‘State for mutual recognition, approval or equalization of academic
programmes or areas of studies and nomenclature thereof:

(ze) evolve common academic guidelines for Universities in the
State for recognition, approval or equalization of academic programmes or
areas of studies and nomenclature thereof of various programmes
conducted or co-ordinated by Universities or higher education institutions -
outside the State and outside the country;




(zf) facilitate the dissemination of knowledge of higher education
1o targét audience through electronic and print media.”. :

6. Amendment of section 5.-—In section 5 of the principal Act, after
sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:— -

“(4) The Patron may refer any matter relating to higher education and
~ higher education institutions as he deems fit, for the expert opinion of the
Council.”.

7. Amendment of section 6.—In section 6 of the principal Act, after
sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—-

“(4) The Visitor may refer any matter relating to higher education and
higher education institutions, as he deems fit, for the expert opinion of the
Council.”. :

8. Amendment of section 9.—In section 9 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (3), after the words *“as may be prescribed”, the words “or
delegated by the Vice-Chairman from time to time” shall be inserted.

9. Amendment of section 10.—In section 10 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (4), after the words “as may be prescribed”, the words “or
delegated by the Vice-Chairman from time to time” shall be inserted.

10. Amendment of section 11.—In section 11 of the principal Act, in
- sub-section (2),— : _

(i) after the words “shall be__reconstituted”, the word
“simultaneously” shall be inserted;

(i1) in the proviso, for the words “shall continue to be in office fc_\r
a further period of six months or till their reconstitution, wh1cheve§r is
carlier”, the words “shall continue to hold office till their reconstitution

shall be substituted.
11. Amendment of section 12.—In section 12 of the principal Act,—
(i) for item (k), the following item shall be substituted, namely:—

“(k) one Vice-Chancellor of a University outsid'e the State of
Kerala established by an Act of another State, nominated by the

Government;”:

e



_ (i) after item (ab), the following items shall be inserted,
namely:— '

. *(ac) one Chairman or Vice-Chairman of a State Higher
Education Council outside the State of Kerala, nominated by the

Government;
' Y

(ad) one Vice-Chancellor of a Central University outside the
‘State, nominated by the Government.”.

12. Amendment of section 14.—In section 14 of the priﬁcipal Act,
after item (r), the following items shall be inserted, namely:— '

“{s) one nominee of the Ministry of Human Resources
Development, Government of India, not below the rank of a -
| Joint Secretary;

(t) State Project Director, RUSA;

(u) one Principal of an affiliated college, nominated by the
Government;

‘ (v) one non-teaching staff member of a University or College,
nominated by the Government.”. '

13. Amendment of sectibn 15.~—In section 15 of the principal Act, in
clause (k),—

(i) after the words “it shall meet”, the words “at least twice a
year-and” shall be inserted; '

(ii) the words “provided that it shall meet at least twice a year”
shall be omitted. '

| 14. Amendment of section 17.—In section 17 of the principal Act, .
for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

. “(c) it shall nominate one of its members to the Academic
Council of each University.”. ' -

332601/2018/S-15.



6

15. Amendment of section 20—In section 20 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), in the first proviso, the words “for a further period of
six months or” and the words “whichever is earlier” shall be omitted.

16. Amendment of section 25.—In section 25 of the. principal Act, in
sub-section (1), after the words “the University Grants Commission”, the
- symbol and word *,RUSA™ shall be inserted.

17. Special provision relating 10 existing Governing Council.—
Notwithstanding anything contained in the principal Act, on and from the
date of commencement of the Kerala State Higher Education Council
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (13 of 2017), the existing Governing
Council shall stand dissolved and all the members of the said Governing
Council shall be deemed to have vacated their offices as such on such
dissolution.

18. Repeul .(md saving.—(1) The Kerala State Higher Education
Council (Amendment) Ordinancc, 2018 (26 of 2018) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to
have been done or any action taken or deemed to have been taken under
the principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to "
have been done or taken under the principal Act as amended by this Act.




	1976Kerala46
	1982KERALA3.pdf
	1982KERALA3.pdf
	Kerala-1982-The Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act-3.pdf
	Kerala-1986-The Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act-6.pdf
	Kerala-1986-The Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Second Amendment) Act-7.pdf
	KERALA-1989-THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE (AMENDMENT) ACT-34.pdf
	Kerala-1991-The Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act-25.pdf
	KERALA-1994-THE KERALA PAYMENT OF PENSION TO MEMBERS OF LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT-12.pdf
	KERALA-2000-THE KERALA PAYMENT OFPENSION TO MEMBERS OF LEGISLATURE (AMENDMENT) ACT-15.pdf
	2003Kerala14
	KERALA-2005-The Kerala Payment of Pension to Members of Legislature (Amendment) Act-44.pdf
	2008Kerala26





