The Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 1958

Act 18 of 1958

Keyword(s):
Central Act Amendment, Indian Stamp Act, Stamp

Amendments appended: 8 of 2011, 2 of 2015, 22 of 2017, 17 of 2022, 18 of 2025

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




The Madhya Pradesh Civil Courts Act, 1958

Act 18 of 1958

Keyword(s):
Cadre of Higher Judicial Service, Supernumerary Cadre of Additional District
Judges, Value

Amendments appended: 35 of 2011, 16 of 2014

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




30

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
. No. 18 of 1958
THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1958

TaABLE or (CONTENTS

Sections - Page:
1. Short title and commencement. 31
2. Amendment of Central Act. : 31
3. Continuance of stamps of  old denominations. . - 33



31

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
| (No. 18 of 1958)1 _
THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1958

(Received the assent -of the Governor on the 17th July, 1958;  assent first
published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette” on the lst August, 1958.) -

An Act further to amend the Indian Stamp Aet, 1899 (II of 1899), in its application
to the State of Madhya Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the l\iadhya Pradesh Legislature in the Ninth Ycear of
the Republic of India as follows :—.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh  Short title and commencement.
‘Amendment) Act, 1958. - . ,

(2) It shall come into force on such date? as the State Government
may, by notification, direct.

2. The following amendments shall be made in the Indian Stamp Act,  Amendment of Central Act.
1899 (IT of 1899) in its application to the State of Madhva Pradesh in so far ' ‘
as it relates to matters with respect to which the State Legislature has power
to make laws, namely 1— -

(a) in sub-section (I} of section 4 and in the proviso to section 6 for the
words “‘one rupee and eight annas,’ the words ““one rupee and
fifty nayc paise, shall De substituted; '

(6) in clause (a) of section 11 and in clause (¢} of the proviso to sub-
section (3) of section 32, for the words “one anna or half an arna”’
the words “ten naye paise or five naye paise” shall be substituted;

(s} in sub-section (1} of section 31 for the words “cight annas,” the
" words “fifty nave paise” shall be substituted;

(d) in section 53 and 34 for the words “one anna,” the words “six naye
paisc” shall- be substituted; : :

(¢) in clause (b) of section 69 for the words and brackets “one anna
{or half an anna).,” the words and brackets “ten naye paise (or five
nave paise)” shall be substituted;

(f) in section 78 for the wdrds_ “four annas,” the words “twenty five
naye paise” shall be substituted; '

(g) in Schedule I-A—

(i except in clauses (g) and () of article 5 and in articles 127  and
62, for the words mentioned in column (1) of the table below
wherever occurring, whether in conjunction with any other
words or otherwise, the words mentinned in the correspondire
entries in column (2) thereof shall be substituted, namely : °

TABLE
o .
(1) (2)
One and a half annas Fifteen' naye paise.
one and a half annas fifteen naye paise.
Two annas Fifteen nave paise,
two annas fifteen nave paise,

1. For Statement of Objeces and Reasons (in English) see “Madhya Pradesh Gazette” Extra.
ordinary dated 7th April 1955, page 524 and (in Hindi} 528. For proceedings in Assembly
see Madiava Pradesh Vidhan Sabba Proceedings 1958, Volume 11T pages 2769 to 378:,

2. 13t October 1958, see Govt. of M.P., S.R. Department Notification No. GI-V-S.R, dated the
26th August 1938, published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette”, dated the 12th September
1958, Part I~ at lage 878. ) )



33 THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1958

(1) _ ’ )
Three annas o Twenty naye paise.
three annas twenty naye paise
Four annas Twenty-five naye paise
four annas twenty-five naye paise,
Five annas " Thirty-five naye paise
five annas thirty-five nave paise
Six annas Forty naye paise
Six asinas _ forty naye paise
Fight annas _ Fifty naye paise
eight annas fifty naye paise
Ten annas Sixty-five naye paise
ten annas . sixty-five nave paise
Twelve annas o Seventy-five naye paise

twelve annas seventy-five naye palise
{(ii) in article 6 —

(a) for paragraphs (i), (i) and (iii) of sub-clause (a) and for  sub-clause (b)
of clause 2, the following paragraphs and sub-clause shall be substituted,

- namcly .—
“If drawn If drawn if drawn
singly in set of in set of
' two for three for
each part  each part
of the set of the sct
Rs np. Rs. ap. Rs. np.
{iy. when the amount of the loan 0 25 0 15 -0 10
or debt does not exceed Rs. 100
(i} . when the amount of the loan or 0 40 0 25 0 10
debt exceeds Rs. 100 but does
not exceed Rs. 200.
(iify when it exceeds—
Rs, : RS. )
200 but does not excedd 400 0 75 -0 35 0 25
400 Do~ 600 1 1¢ 0 60 0 85
600 Do- 300 1. 50 0 75 0 30
. 800 -Do- - 1,000 I 85 1 00 0 60
1,000 -De- 1,200 2 95 1 10 0 75
1,200 -Do- 1,600 - 3 00 I 50" .1 00
1,600 -Do- 2,500 4 A0 2 25 1 50
2,500 -Do- 5,000~ 9 00 4 50 300
5,000 -Do- 7,500 13 35 6 75 4 50
7,500 -Do- 10,000 18 00 9 G0 6 00
If drawn If drawn If drawn
singly in set of in set of
two for three for
. each part eachk part
of the of the
_ set set
Rs. Rs. Rs.np,  Rs np. Rs. np,
10,000 but does niot exceed 15,000 27 Q0 13 50 9 00
15,000 -Do- 20,000 36 00 18- 00 12 00
20,000 -Do- 25,000 45 00 22 50 15 .00
25,000 -Do- 30,000 34 00 27 G0 18 00
anl for every additional l 18 00 9 00 6 00

Rs. 10,000 or part thereof
in excess of Rs. 30,000



THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1938 33

(b) if such loan or debtis repayable

not more than three months from the

date of such instrument— _ i

: Rs. np. Rs. unp. Rs. - ap,

(i) when the amount of the loan or ¢ 15 0 10 0 5
debt does not exceed Rs. 100,

(i) when the amount of the loan or 0 = 20 0 15 0
debt exceeds Rs. 100 but does not
exceed Rs. 200.

[&1]

(i) when it exceeds—

Rs. . Rs.

" 200 but does not exceed 400 0 40 0 20 0. 15
400 -Do- 600 0 35 ¢ 30 0 20
600 Do~ 800 0 75 0 40 0 25

- 800 - =Do~ 1,000 0 9 0 50 9 30
1,000 -Do- 1,200 1 15 0 55 0 40

1,200 . <Do-’ 1,600 i 50 0 75 0 30

1,600 “Do- 2,500 - 225 i 15 0 75

2,500 -Do- 5,000 4 50 2 25 1 50

5,000 -Do- 7,500 6 70 3 40 2 25

7,500 -Do- 16,000 9 00 -4 .30 3 00

10,000 -Do- 15,000 13 30 6 75 4 50

15,000 -Do- 20,000 18 00 g 00 6 00

20,000 -Do- 25,000 22 - 50 11 25 7 50
- 25,000 -Do- 30,000 27 00 13 50 9 00

and for every additional Rs, 10,000 or : '

part thereof in excess of Rs. 30,0600 9 00 - 4 50 3 00y

and

(iii) in paragraph (i) of article 33, in column (2) for the letters and figures
' “Rs. 13-5-0°° the letters and figures “Rs. 13:35 np.”” shall be substitut-
ed.

3. The stamps denoting the fees chargeable under this Act in old denomina- ‘
tions shall continue to be valid for a period of six months from the date of commen-:

cement of the Indian Stamps (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 1958 ( 18 of
1958) to the same extent to which they would have been valid, if the said  Act
had not been passed.

Continuance of stanps of ok
denominations. '



T JadrEe www.govipressmp.nic.in
9 +ff T dre faran <1 we €

FHE 194] AT, TEaR, fedis 31 °rd 2011—39 10, I 1933

fafy efk faurt < fasm
Jrare, femiw 31 o 2011

. 2086-126-FFhIF-31-(T1.). —Heayew faum gy =1 feafafea stfufram fsg w feaiw 31 99 2011 =
TRMIEH TSIAe &1 ATA W 81 I ¢, TASgNI, WoHIEnol & SHeRl & fad weifer feean <man 2.

HEYQY & TU o AH § qUl STCIER,
AT ATEE, TR ghad.

TqeAYRYT ffufam
HAR ¢ T R0%Q
YRS = ( AeAueyT Honed ) ifafam, 2099

[fefeh 3% ®rd, Ro0%% T UTUWTT Wi STAM W g2, oAfd '‘Heawest Twaw (sr@mmur)’’ ¥ foies
3¢ WrE, oY T WM &R Wy i TS, ]

TeAYQYT T R W T €U | A" wWrm afuftem, ¢k &I o delitm ww
¥q stfufam.

IR TR & 91939 o8 # Heguey faum-vdea g fefafed su o 98 sfufmfiE 81—

2. (2) 39 fufam @ dfara am wRdty W (qemyey "ee) sffTE, 022 B W o
(R) g8 Ul I &1 9ga &, S8 79 sar sifgem gr, e &6,

R. HEIYSY USE ! @F] U ®Y H IR W StfufTad, 24%% (2¢k% H R) (S zEH trwua‘srwa:;r

~ =~ ~ 2 ~ e N s o RN m@m
WW%NFWWWHH&’Q%)W,W$H%H%ﬂld\d‘wlﬂﬁﬂﬁ{f{ﬂ?ﬂﬁ]ﬁEEW ,
S 2¢RR T §=HATH

3 T HINEA.

387



388 TRy TS9H, feqis 31 A, 2011

3?3@ - Al 3. qol AR i SEE - H,—
) (TH) =3 4 |, @ (q) & wF |, f=fafen gve wenfim fFa s, sef—
(o)At T' TE 9ft % @l @1 eer 9 FW H e aftfa gwfaa fmin o fawm &
fu=1 forelt =aferd g0 gff & foepra = Yot S 3 SeR SSTR o &1 a9 9. '

I W) yad & o | weifua €.

() A= R B, Fom 3 # Wgd §, T (V) H g fEa S
(dF) 1= ¥y H, @ve (9) 1 3TEUE (TH) & 9, & () H, wee, ‘ush ot qu’’
F A W, v, UF R v’ iy few S,

argre, feais 31 #2011

. 2087-126-FFRE-A-(T.).—¥Rd & HA9H & FTHT 348 & WU (3) & WU H uRdE wry
(weyew Wener) Stfufem, 2011 (FHIF 8 T 2011) i SN AR TSI & WUEHR ¥ THERT U foHa
ST %,

ALY & TAIA & A9 § I SRR,

9T Iled, 3 gi9a.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 8 or 2011

THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 31st March, 2011; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 31st March, 2011.]

An Act further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the State of
Madhya Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic
of India as follows:—

Short title and 1. (1)} This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2011.

commencement.
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by notification,
appoint.

émimli?;etnlt\l Ozf 2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (No. II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Ofenf;” Cin O{ts Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter
application to the rovi .

State of Madhya provided

Pradesh.

Amedment  of 3. In Schedule 1-A to the principal Act,—
Schedule I-A.

(1) in Article 5, for clause (d), the following clause shall be substituted, namely —

“(d) If relating to the development Three percent on the market value equal
of land or construction of a to the Estimated cost of the proposed
building on aland by a person construction or development as mentioned
other than the owner or lessee in the agreement.”;

of such land.
(i) in Article 22, in column (2), in the proviso, clause (g) shall be omitted,

(i) in Article 45, in clause (d), against sub-clause (i), in column (2), for the words
“One hundred rupees”, the words “One thousanad rupees” shall be substituted.

=, R TR a1 S O, Heavey g s et qgoner, Jiure W i a9 geRiia-—2011.



T FEEEE www.govipressmp.nic.in T
off g3 wire fHar s wea 2.

SAE 7] Jarer, qUER, iR 7 SR 2015—WW 17, WH 1936

fafy oir faurht wrd faum

Wigre, fadiss 7 SFe 2015

%, 149-5-THE-31 (WI.) 31Ty, —meay faum = &1 Fretofee sfufem fa = i o smad, 2015 &
W@mﬁwﬁwﬁﬂﬁ%mmmﬁméfﬁam&mmm%

TGy % TSI & AW H qel SRAEN,
gftde gur faardt, suafa.

13



14 geayeR Yoas, fedie 7 e 2015

AUl Afetray
U I T R0y
WA T ( HeaWeyT Hyner ) rfafaam, 04

fastion & Sall, Q094 T TTEWE H SRS WA gE, e(Ald weauee W (srarawer ) faaiew o s,
3084 TH WIAN TR RV =l 7.

HeAYIST T @ O 5Y ®U B wndg werm sifufrem, g6k’ @ i delifud e
Tq sifufram.

ard TR % Yued o § meay faym-vew gu frefafed v A ww eifufafoa €1 o—
9. 78 Afufrm o diva A AR e (Heayey geitee) sifufie, 209 R i .

2. YRV TS F Ar] 5T w9 H AR wr A, 2¢%] (2¢’) B H. R) (S gEH  Weawew w @

ggfﬂwﬁaﬁw%w@ﬁﬁ&%)aﬁwﬁmmxwfwﬂﬁﬁmﬁfmm ,

94%% T T&HH
3 T WML

3. g ofufrm ) um 3 H, gem wege W, W orgyEh d weifae el o eremedd ST 3 ST HYITE.
w®d g’ o @ fee S,

¥, g ifufrEm o orgEl oo % v R ffafea sgEl i s, st — aFgE 8-
"o -
foreal W wny gk
(urq 3 <fEw)
ol #1 =i 3fed g ges

() ()

R, ofuEteta fonedl o A W o ew # uE A e w9 T
 afusr 7 S ool g A SEeR iR ¥ foRdlt ot ©
(S qwHR & yrEgw @ fa= ?) W fee gus
TS & e W, fadt sm @ gwnaf@ w1 9,
Safe T o) @ SIS SRR & we § Big faa
T EL

2. fueitenfa freh U9 o fache % @@ dfdwel & U EOIR G,
A W wiE 6, 5 gl § Wi fa o g

gyrrE suus, faad sratd vRdlE STUfueR €l ek S UH WA 6 fed e (% 2%) W
aAfufrem, 233y (8] T 3]) I O ], 294 I ¥,

S 3vg qul aHT afdr % TR, 209y (w3

F 4 H UM & F dH fear T SuUE €

A

¥, g Taema, sl o foea (e 9 fa=) S g FER T,
THR-TEU & ATverg @Wey § A gueh- T8 & o
TR Yed L § o1 Yed i & fau aefda 2



TRy e, feie 7 SHad 2015

14 (1)

()

()

yrue-us e fafgd o fman mn R wuA S qeal
& %uq F o arafda § S wUR 0 9 =afs
g s ok forment qfy su% g Y WA
39 wfaqdl & qme o f9= fafy gra swon w3 &
fau erEm e T &, wfaem g e T R

B T IR Dl AU~

(=)

(@)

(=N

m

(=1

Iz 97 fafme-13 % fawa 9 dafm ¥,

(wF) afg ow Wl wfayfa & wa o fawa 9
deifer §;

afe a5 feel Fofaa o) o1 o7 Fmfng e

Y U4,

Y 90,000 TGY I ITF UMW F AT UH T

afyeran TiF TR T & AwHA W®d g,
yfayfa & aenfeafa, = o1 fawa & w9 su&
qed % YF Lo,000 TG A IHF AW * AU
Th HL.

AufEm snylfta Weaasrl & AW |, Jenfeafa,

T & R, fopu, du-u7, e, fed=rn-wme
71 3t R @ fauea gfagfa & wa =@ fawa
4§ defua ©.

afe og fd) fafraiar @ frdt wReR, sTaRR
M, §ig 7m, =R fag (3 A7) @1 g
YHR & fadl o FRER & w@r g fedt
s =afem & 09 fafmfar =1 wRer & w@rdt %
e IF, e IH @R fag (3T ") anfe
HT ITAN HLA U FRAR A1 31 FoRamenera
T HR 7.

7fg 9 4 % @l a1 1R 9 e e

=fad g1 39 ft & faw™ wd /eue 39 W
o % frmafor & weifem 8—

() aft 3ud =g ofgey B T fowm & wwar T

(a0

faerfoa amfa = sw v faeaend, 9”98
fet off 9\ | S ST 8, @H/AERER &
Iy A1 @ gusd: A9 Al 9gaaa: gid/fasy
[ERIRSIRIE

IqUE (UR) & Siaid | e ol ATael] %
fe,

3% % O T % e ufaefa % g % Taw
T &R 91 3UF 9 F fauw 1 €93; qen 9|
i HeoeRRl % HEe H Yed Q0,000 TG AT
TEF 9 F AU U . '

<H BSIR ¥,

agt yom, s fawfaa fea 9m & faw gwafed
grqof 4ff & Fad IW 9T F FER Y &
T I (FHFH ) W A g S
foerraeal g0 dygFad: A quwd: wif/fawia w1
S areft faewfaa wwafa & eHu § g1, 91 39
Yo 1 T S fasRfad fen s % forg weafaa
grgol fy & SI9R Jod % T U (HHIE
W) W T T, T O S osft sAfue g,

fau gearfga awqel | & a€R 7ed &1
0. QY Y,



14 (2)

HeEYRyl Sus, fedie 7 el 2015

()

(R)

T34 R % wSH ¥ fau—

(&) ' faema’ wd ‘fawmeal’ &1 gt e g S
Hegyay TR aan um Ay erfafTam, Qw3
(FHiFH 3 T LR93) HI ¥ R (F) W
qeggey YA YNlde wog Ay, (fosmm,
fafqaaa wd f9gsmon) fAam, 028 &
() (@) # FEw: T fon o R

(1) i gy gye: aia/fasa & S gl 9w
T U fawmasdl w1 v sifusas €9 9
sfeafaa = €1, agi fawtasal &1 39 Qoo
RIGHGRGEE RS LI

(%) dfc g8 v 9ufy & faka @ gafym g—

() STa Hufa &1 Feen gwaraeor-a3 frsuifed fog
fa afea foran s € =1 wiew foy S &
FIR fman wra §;

() & Fufa 1 shew &I e wmn &;

(=) afg =% e dufa & Jre-wa 9 dafd 8,

(®) afg et Sur =1 w0 % AT 6 gl

() afe sr=en Sudfya =& foman = 2L

Toh-Taeral & fady, yuam, findt o s 9 Hafia
R el Frefafed @ deifia s 1 wfead s
el w8 foraa—

(%) TQ wop-Toeral =1 foradi =1 fraa foew feed
d@afa W (faqog fagfa | f9=1) g @1 @ned
2 o g, wel T v fadm, Sum H oeifim fed
Tl S A u % SIYeT SaHE AT el
U1 % FH S & fau gfayfa & s F fe
T™ T .

(@) sm gufa &1 quem, fiRet a1 sreHH, Sl TE
oo, Tl = smream sum # s fed W
& S I o S STel SAEH AT e RO ok
e 5 % foe ufayfa & w9 7 fwen e

&) gk S Hufd % SN qod % forg ediaRor-
W (. ) T A

Teh BSIN ¥qY,

ot Yook S Tufd % SN Yed & A e
U (. ) T AW E

sifyera| o oM@ TOA % 3Tead Wd U, SN
AT FOT HT THA F 0.}y I

= Gl e,

sTferan uie @@ T99 & 31 T@d gY, T
foer@ gr1 afayd W@H 1 0.}y Ui,

sifreram Ut OTE A & 1eAdiE Wd gE, SUR
] RUT H THT FH 0.y, FlAYA.



qeyey TS, fedis 7 SHad 2015 14 (3)

(?)

()

2.

2.

2R,

WETEHTU-TH —34R | aifim feu u @ feo sH
g1 ¥F T STl TEAH AT e Wk gHW S h
fo ger-faoral & fg sreran qogw, firet = smeAm
*1 S E #t gfayfa 9 Hefia fawa W s
aifafiga e W yews gard grm, afe gd feed W
I W YEs g fian T R

TGO, — 39 ST % @UE (F) & WASH &
foru, feret e & fof, femt o smewr A o foReht
iR & ey H ofafdy fedt @ % €19 gu o,
Toh-fadral ¥ fadm @ wefu feredt w1, fooqon,
I G H TR g8 sh-faoral & gy e 9 %

' ﬁm@ﬁ%ﬂ%wmm»mmw%

oq1 S T B, 3R AR g% YUH SUR % o @ 91
T fol 19 Tt etfafiem sur @ syl & fore wfayfa
F gey ¥ 7, W uw, fewu, @ @ o # o™
Toh-foeral % i O defdq forel gorss e A1 R
* 9 % AuE |, gw-faeral & fgm 9 defya
HAL K GIfeTd HA arel, forea gvgm S

T o freares #, =nfedl o g foeen s
o1 STy A wreR. gufq ot e, et ag uE foea

CH Sy el A8, TR T e,

SR AT qeaieRd, S R 9 % e | e
F RN F oA A fowan SR e fawar T R

foreran faerm, oo srfa g% o &@ §, s

et U foreg, fafyer a1 das &t a1 =1 18O 9
daiferg ® o fopet urex &y fodl gfa, =mm =
frarem @ dree % ol T T g

HIAT F T —

(%) Sl e % uE oyt (SR dee) W@l T

(@) St S F T afafsa sterdsh & o efw gsh

vETE el A1 % SEE WO % ey 9
sr=en frd T feet fdw o werey a1 stufroiaes

Cgw Tem s ferfe faftees hosdge @1 gfesy

iRkt

e |/ F.

31 T

AT UTE TR FUU qU1 AfUeRdd UeE T Y
F e g gu, uwl erfufed a1 wewE g
SIS T 0.2y WP '

e @l RH A1 due 9 defyg wufd & 9
qea &1, 399 9 S o eifue 1, R gfawe.



14 (4)

HeAYRy YT, fedie 7 SHad 2015

()

(R)

R

.

24,

&,

2\s.

<.

2.

F Hadgl w WYY H TKE G 6 e foed
FIR % Ferewy fean m due ¥ 9 S fowse o
fRwr &4 oen de=E e €

S genyfa, el S gr dfer % wee, srdeE @1
Tty & g frded # ufegm w6 & fag afay w
wy § fromfea wenfa faema.

ﬁm,sﬁ%é’maﬁ%awﬁ@smsﬁﬁaﬁaﬁ
TR AT AR HiE ST, Rewo (<490 T )
N s Susy w4l fman T R

Ora sere, etaiq @8 foraa fws g agETE 9
1 HE O 1 ufagfa W SuR o ® e ae
Uid 1 IREeOT A H qur SHH GHE-AT i STE
w0 H g g 9.

vd § eriga fordl SwEs 1 /e w B ferd

afe og YW ¥ iR swe fau s Susy &l

fopan T ®.

TEHRIUT-Teh— 4 qo forga W = e qod &
MR W YIAH R T g, @ R e ) faea
R Yk gl foed & oTEr 9 B

FEEHTOT-8— Al qol forea W = e TR
Yoo F SMHR W A fom T 2, A |E wH B
fered W g gafad IR ged R qa fored &
STHER g9 EI,

weayeyl U5 fafum aRvg (ar wRfad) g, sifesr
afafrorm, 998 (2R6% I W) T U I T A
EINRER KRG ICERILEEES

At srfafam, 9243 (234R T 43) @l ¥R 4 o6
TR (2) & A Al & wy H =EEE wE H

THO-TS 1 39 91 1 IUUR () & ofHE 1@

YA o TR0 HT YR,

Tt g wufd & O H, S etert @ H fam W
g e ¥ ol a=ht e ®, @ faww ymo-um, S
e Hem g = T dufa ok shat i feRdl fHfae
] SR R I el AT A7 TS HAURR A
deEd waa Rt o fafy & oA T s % oy
wiferera ferddl a1 s g feam %

sferray TEE BOR $U % AN Wd gL WA
1 0.3y Hitem.

() ~ITm W W eI % readE wd g Wiy
TH A YT H o4 I
(@) el qedish dud T2 €, ol W W ey

TE! ok S T BT TRA R ST (3. Q%) W
SURIS

= |t vou

TH TSN B,

3 F9R T,

agT Yok S FIA FA ¥ ®HT WHH F A
FEATO W (3. ) W I T



qEryeyl N9, {7 s 2015

14 (5)

()

(R)

Ro.

- R

.

2.

R¥.

R4.

YHTOT-UR I 3 S6as S SUF uRF & fohdl
g =afed & fod) fmfaa S99 o e fnfag
e H % W sEe feel 9 fopy o wie derdt
feR o v & o Tl U o 1 frem B &
I IHF IR, ey U Wi 1 WeEunt g ged
SR a1 g% &1 gifkerd s 2.

oS W did o i dfee, sl (FeTa FH %O
gaeht FIR & foar) w5 fowq, fas g =i
S a1 sueE HE fafifds ygw wm wig @l g
FE O & oy veEl & fou e W) fe s
%, =g 39 fored # wif @ve € 0 7 EL

HUTENEA Gelt—

(%) afg o fodl wie TsaEs % 9uRie T8
g Wil fayfeat & w3 @1 fawa &
Yoraerl ¥ Weftd §;

(@) afe o8 ol win Toss & gaRies T8 H

vyega frdt Fmf ot o Foofia freem o %
IR, foru, wis, s, fedw=r, fede-wis =1
gdt yER T o fauwa gfasfaat & wa A
fasra % deoraeil ¥ Weiftm .

TR faera, sgfa fed) ot gro frowfea #1E
foea 5% g1 9% oI/ ARl % WER & fag
ot gufa aaia wa § a1 fowe gw 9 ol
W YYEA-E A1 SN 1 Hed ATERI & iy
for sTan € @ foad g eMerl grn Am-fFAfdy
friternl & wederor & o1l a1 STF-UHT & SneflH
ot ¥ HRAR H THH SRRI & HES AT =]
W & fau suey fear s

feret wfawer % o wenfa faora s g doEdiea
1 ipd fory o arel foRdt st w1 i S
™ R

TLTEOT-UF, & 08 siqo & fere el §, e 9w
FHE &9 % A YUR @@ © A1 92 & T T

TWeRT0T: — 59 2T =T % YA o ford fonsft dufa =, S 6=

TR 2] TG YRR g A1 SEeh! o 4 fromfea fedt
T S kT Foroe - ], SISTR a9 & B S
foraa o <utfan o . ‘

3o, fepy o1 = ¥ e & T TH B9 T
q1 SEF 9 & fow v s

stfermay UiE TR S9U ¥ ereddid wed gy, U
T w e yfafe % dEy § gfoyfadl & sw
e WS geufefd, e (Making-up) wiea Al
%Tfa?{laﬂﬂﬁq"{ goftTe ﬁ’ﬁc%) F TIF 90,000
TR A IYF 9 F feN uw w9

Aufter anuiid deuderl & "l | Jefefd,
I w9 W fasd & o wfayfa % T uOw
TH ARG A1 IEF 9T F faw @ v qan aieH
Wmﬁmﬁ%mﬁm%clooomm
3IGF 9 % fou e e

8 TER U= 6 .

TFH TR B9

39 Hufq % s T weiawo-u #t fawy a%g g,
IR Yo a1 3ud Ivafila gfawa s e
T § S off arferes 71, @ uiE wfowm.

WM

(%) Sl &1 forga dot Afuf@m, 2023 (023
1 2¢) 1GR3 TA 3% 6 Al nferecoy
T & e % Sl =1 St fafrrys
aifafras, 92 (2R¥R W Qo) i U ¥5-F
F A9 ardly o d% & e & reiH
Shuferii & faefiieso a1 wamHer | Hafdd 2,
ael Y Yook, 39 STl TR gufa, S fw




14 (6) weqgey ey, e 7 Sad 2015

()

(R)

€. ufa o1 Sgwur, fSweE aeg vRdE e afufiay, e
(2093 W1 ) &I G s & Iy TRl olien sifueTd
a1 IWF ARY U *g wHivE fRan T § fR @ wEl uid
7 IEX & SR S e we 8 deifud g uad
fafy & srefla gl 2t &

(@)

(M

(%)

=)

(=)

TequRy U % i o 8, &% 9N 4o &
o TTed % S WA A1 Ug 3T & Aty
T o1 gy S A1 sefed SRRl % SR qed
o WY afaewr % ferg dew yfawar =t W& &
1T T 0.4, Ul 3EH W S off 2fEeE €, B

s g ferga fedt ®mor & gaqayH 4
1 0.3y TR BN,

et R Taret wufa 1 fawa a8 & fau
HIR fedl gwfawo-us & fod srufera
HeIMER Yok 8 wiftaad fofan o g1 aen
U FR F STTE | g koo v
fromfed foran sman &, @i @@ faga-o9 ™
Yk TAAH Looo FIH F A WA gU
vd ¥ Hed Yok hl FH FH T TG K
S ST Yok B

et ot s1ieRal <1 Tera gufs 1 fasa

% fau grfuga w33 w1 qeaam feH

-3 % ford erifid TedEr Yook @
weifia feman T €1 e VY GEIAM o STE
#, geam % froaee qun 39 =, faes
ver # 5@ Trewifea faman mon €, & 9ed w1
fargr-s frreifea feman S 2, ot U9 fasha-
5 W Yeeh, <A Rooo ¥ F AL &
B, 7§ d<d YO I FH Hh 39 T
% STEfA 3 Yook B

gl $1E sdusm fag@ =@ wIE dUF BN
=T ¥y ¥ el et duw F oy
e gearER Yok § Wifthd B, a9l dUh
wqfg =1 frelt v foom & favs wEd
fHa 73 fedt 9 & AqEIT § OH1E
e Tes! fronfeq =6t S 8, o'l T
fewt = syw fad@ W 39 Yo, T
THY Qooo % AT WA BY, TR ¥3 &
e U sus-faoe W g d Hew ok
= HEh T TR F T W Y A,
el et forma gr i eafem el dutd |
AT Ot A G A YY1 AH geshd: Al
Hosd: gew@Hl & w9 # wfmfeaa s €,
gl Yo @ g U &k SSR YT 6 TH
gfer grm.




Teuey N9, foain 7 sFed 2015

14 (7)

()

(R)

N9,

RC.

R

0.

3.

R

EES

frdlt forga @1, S fF gow @ gad § iR fower dey
# 3faa ye ? fear 0 7, ufoema = @l i

HoT JTeR Se-UR AT MARTT S-Sl TH
gy fedt fafy & svydel & sporo ® @ ¥ @
aerRt famT & fordlt erfanrd & Feel & ergawor ® =
i a1 e W TRl Yoo % geY # A1 S U AU
e H A & AU o1 I SeEfa R o A
o1 Y gefya fordt 9 % day § A ™ du-T

YU HeayRy Yhrs w@ifge arfaftad, Jeoo (FHI®
R4 T Ro0R) &F M.

TS et Srer UReM—aeyT, st wg U fored, st
39 T ot aafo o1 o1 sus gueffaal = faea
F YRS B, fhE ok a1 UwH W A U9 fEd wierm |
el AT W 9IeSE A1 e W AT T W SR GIE Al
fagy fom wmar €, fodt e % ufiem & fod goer
Tl ], ottt fowa e &1 dufam & fawa =@
AU W, T W F @ g O S 3R ¥ e
F R B, S TY WA W e 1 T ¥ s gL

foramg-faese = formm, stafq =i Tt ferma fSas gm
FI afaa o1uq faame &1 faeed s §.

7d # rdpd faera w1 wifua a1 sed gur w1 @
TEIAS, W] s g1 ®iE gram aiEds |7 fe s
Tl &L ‘

WETRTOT—3Y 3TE3E & YA & foau arem aied
I8 &, S ue foma g erfufafeam qaeid & Al
it o fafus feafa o WER wwa & @1 s qa
wy § fromfen ferma & fafus g & HeR & §.

fordr ferame arfafm, Q’uy ( Qjwy &I ¥3) 1 TEHA
g fedt st fafy o sigfdw faam gamr-us =1
e | ufafie.

wufer & Tafma =t foraa.

Teh TR TUQ

! Y, S IaA & WRH o a9Y-TF (3. Q%) W
SIS

TH TR TG

TH ?UY

Teh &SIl ?Ug

TH ER T

TH H T

@ Yok o SAfYEdd Yod w1 gufd & AR ged
o FRIO-T9 (. W) W, S fafa il e



14 (8) gegyey Teras, feaiw 7 sFaEd 2015

()

()

3. afafaa ur w1 foga swfq <8 T faea st dus
Hufer W 9R e R §—

(%) o T dus T8 %, ¥3 F @ue (F) d ffdwe
frd T aufa F @ frd ww gl w1 § (srulq we
Hfed);

(@) vEfE U9 duF ATWE F. ¥3 F @ug (@) § ffdw
fra T faewolt § @ fedt ww aviw @1 § (Srufq s
ed) —

() ufe srfafem wr ) forma & foes & g, dufa =

oot Ut forma & e 2 fem mn € =1 @ S &
fow =R fvan T ¥

(3) afz s 39 veR e feon B

36, o & forgd S A (F. W\e)AT FEEE a1 ST
(. €3) & B:—

(TH) I pgra & Fordl TS & R §

() = T "ge o

TR, — 39 =98 % WA & forg visg Fed | Hi,
arfurga g,

0. fagfd sg—u.

3¢, uZe, fouF SiTia s/at-uee a1 SU-T2el ag1 9ee Al S
TeT W A A1 fRd gge @1 TEe w5 oo fern e

(wF)wel fo& vzt wd ad @ %9 safy & fau
arafdd g

gt yresw w1 el ferma gro ufayd few g
gAfafted 91t &Y Y F g3
(. J4) W T

T gook S R w5, (Fess siwla w@ dus oIk
gt fopan e g eifafed 9R ¥) Pl @A
F FEARO-T () W §, e g
TE Yok, S WY o syE IR sIfafem W
W Hew foFa T ®, o9 o femn smom.

gt Yo St foea gr wfaya A m@
Afafed YR o) WA & 89 99 (F. %) W
A R,

Y Yok H oY Yok, s Ut Hufw, S W
faver-oeg &, % OISR oo &, SEIR0-TH
(. y) W T E.

a8 o, W U wufy, sogE 6 fama-ag w,
% TR oI &k FEIAO-TF (F. 4) W
SIS

g Yk S Ia € WhH h AE-TF (. Q¥) W

T T2 F A <9 W uied qi WhE W Huld &
AR Y H1 0.0 Flavw, s99 @ w1 ot
st 2.



neTgeyl T, foie 7 smerdt 2015

14 (9)

(2)

()

() el for wger Tt emafy & fon aeaffa § < o
ad @ &y el § foheg uiw od @ #9 ¥

(di)stel fF uezr TE erafy & forg acafia & o=
of & % e ¥ feg gw oad @ wE g

(=n) sl for gzer TE erafy & o arafda @ Sios9
a8 @ vy T ¥ e o ad @ Wy g

(are) Wil o6 gz U erafy & fau @rafda ® S s
i § w9 7 ¥ foreg tm o @ wm

() Tl o e e afa ¥ fo At ¥ S e
a9 =1 su9 oy €, I wwedeeny § o fafvea
wHrerety & fore aeafda & €;

TEETeHTUT-Uh— 519 U] A & HIE 1 HIg (ored
e % feu srifud Yo en ok ¥ Wb T,
3T T FIW & IO H g qaavard, e
e ST ®, 791 gFAH TH TIR TIC F el
= gu U0 vz faer W yesd, qd OSd YeE
F0 HTh, T8 & i I YEw T

TETHTOT-g1—g] Tt uee & daw A fwet <am
e 1 fegt o1 gifan ey e F fag

aiferd oA guR Yok o wiftrd ¥, ofit wHl fest

1 sifqn TR % STgE H awvEd, geel forfed
fera s 2, d9 =AdH U 9N FU S
w4 gU W wzel foere Wogesd T Hed e
H FLF, gk IHH T YEF B

foerm # gursyafila fifrga = afim g3 @ =n
g feu M g €9 qen IRfe@ fopw g
sitgd arffs ves &1 w9, 91 gty &
AR Hed &1 o.¢ Ufaem, g9 @ S ool
aafusr B,

forerg W wersvafvla wifem o a1fim fed @ o
afi feu M et o9 qen sTRfEa fhu T
sitma aififes wew =1 @, o1 gwufa &
ISR Jed w1 T gfaeE, s 9 s oo
it 2

foerg # gusyafofa Wiftem @ eifim fed g =
Afrg few M Tt g9 @ IRfaa few g
sirag affe wiew &) wEE, @ gwfa &
IR ged &1 &1 gfaed, 9 9 S oA
arfe B

foorg # gaeyafiia Wfgag = sifim &3 @ =
sifi feu S ool oM den stRfyd few g
sirq aiffes 9w &1 |, 9 gafa &
IR Hed #1 9R gfaew, s 9 oS o
a1fyes 2l

foorg ® gerevafifa Niftem =1 a1fim @ e @
A feu M At o9 @ emfaa few
fraa wiffs ares &1 EE, F i &
IR ged &1 9" gfoem, T 9 S oA
aifuer 7,



14 (10)

gegyey s, feqiew 7 SHe 2015

()

(R)

WRIHUT-AF—39 31598 & s & foe difqgd, o
Ffim feu wu o fgu 919 ot o9 F ®Y H @R giawd,
o g8 et of s @ s s B, feu e wfawe %
®Y H HFET ST,

T IO — A — TR0 wremafy, afe aeer faerg
fafifde w1 @ sfrafag &, @ odwm veefawm & um
F w9 H 9 ST,

IO — Uia—Seifeh U2eqr e omedl yor, S/
fF W T, Y- o SR o ¥ A1 TR
= o w0 H T w1 efw, St weerwdl W fafu g
ager €, B gEH # S a8 @ o W, s
& UER BN YT TH H TH THER FR R T g,
ek w1 9T gueht St eifum # qmaw e wan
qrees ot eifam o= woen S, S« aw fe o9ed d
fafafde wy ¥ Susfya 4 o feon s fF o # Jam
foren AT Wew, WeH W TR H HS fman S

TETHIOT-BE—3T ITIE & YA & fag gt
gk & ®I A AT STE.

TRTHTOT-ATA—5H =88 & garo & fag fodt

et o SR e, WA g1 e, S 6 TR

EY

%2,

¥R,
()

(=)

YT T RN I U5 WHR & fhdt 3UHT g0 A1
# A A frowfea wee =t fowewg ®, foea o sffa
ol B

IRRT T SNEEA-uF S el o) o weenfua ot H
o1 fpet o w1 yrenfud ot g fad s At fedt
IYUR H 9Ed B.

e -u.

AT —u, 319 O qeo1 SHeh oFER & Wi 3d
a1 1w R fe aer fafafde s & fag s
TEt o Freffa o 3 IR ot s fodeRrER
HRER AR .

HUAT FHT—FJTTT—

ofe STH 1Y FOA ARFRE, 2093 (R03 W L) HI
U 4 % e srEse o

afe STk O IwE g 7 g

TH TUU,

Wk S 2UU,

T BRI,

g AR UTE T,

HUAt FT AT IS F FAqER T8l Yoh W
AT 92 & e g €,



Heyey UsTad, fede 7 SWadt 2015

14 (11)

(%)

(R)

¥3.

serer—foera, S g fooral & fagm, quaw @ fieel @
MM (. ), Ud dU-TF (. W), HEA H SHF
(. %), ST 7@ d9-939 (. wy), 91 gfayfd su-
3 (. 4&) B defua wR T -

(&%) wafe W@ faog ¥ gafae dufa o gufa &
Rt ST T et SEeReRdl B0 < T WA R Al
2 9 & fau s fe mn g,

(@) el gergdiet wes Tl fean o ¥ o fed sm
¥ fau s =gl e T g,

W FIOT—Ueh. UH siudhshal & aR H, S sy g S

e WUl a1 I9& W & HRE H TUST FH &

fore g A g, %Wa@mﬁ%sﬂaﬁa
é:awﬁ%ﬁwfaméém%“

TIETHUT—aL, HEAGSY TR (SFTeNIEoR SRl ST,

¥,

Y

¥E.

fasfer qen o) frorm, QR]¢ qu AwFTSw UM YEREA
(SFTAESR 1 Wi, fefem qen o) frm, 2]]R
F orefH fn & fowm =1 39 W v & fag gisa
dys % foau wem sfywrl gr sTgHifed e st o
Sfeafaa fomm =, gfayfa ofy gf.

() SEfE wE wwiias W g A1 sAfaied A
wheenfua wfayfa €, @1 SWaa aftfa weiem ¥ faw iR
aearEd & w9 A ¥, sl fE oga @ grafae wfagfa
e Y Y @it ¥

A &1 SUeh, e oiafa w1 foea & S waa
¥ fopdt sy W Y ™ 3R & yfaem w afayE s
% fou frdt R @ wiftam o §, 9% d9w & 99
wHA Afege o 8 A A B

el Heielt sl -— et e U fowea, geie, fewm,
STIIHIOH, YHO-TF A1 yfafte, S oy (. ug) W
T i = ufeer Al g o v et & froes H
1 Tt o = g ufsars el & w1 F fafeges
w4 wa gu fonfer w T F

feugur ar FroA—sit gene @ eAfyesat g et wiferes
F1, 18 wifas & o9 f=afafes & w9 @1 fawa #1
TR ST U ST T E—

(/) T Tt W @, ST W e 9 sAfue god
w7

(@) wd fed vy, fepy, w=iw, sg-u, fed=y,
s d T3 ¥ afyw gea w1 7, S wwer wfayfa
T8

gl goF S R faore g gfmm @ F fag
TERIRRO-TF (F.]4) W I T,

TE Yo S W faoe gm ufad @ % dY-1n
(. Q¥) T T .

g9 gl 9T,

TY B,

I BT,

Afuead T €0 % eI W@l gU Yo U
Mg S9Y A SEh 9T F ferd 1 w9,
sTufter enenfia derasrl & "l § aenfiufd,
3T F W fomd o e wlayfa % el &
TR Uk g A1 S T & ferw € v,
gonr ufieq enuifa doreei &AMl § Ui

20,000 TIY Il IHF 9N F AU Teh T,




14 (12)

neqyey Usas, fate 7 Sad 2015

(2)

()

(m)  frdt el gfayfa =,

W38 T & @UE (F) & Teor & forg, Te
fordl wed AR, S Wi Tees @ ARm gieg
(fafrerr) sifufem, 2]uR ( 2]uR o1 \0¥) &1 Ol R
F wue (%) ¥ g1 aflafya fedt g %1 S
Teed B, % N W % fa feg o amR % He) aen
ey U w1 am @us (&) W afvfg wwel & At
dfge @ defad deraeml &1 sfyda (gatweifTa
3YT) T A FIYT WHS SR

o, UG % HEST gRI i ohr feguy;
¢, faursm & farga—

(TH) S FgH F TEwl & ol wl W E
(])) s Trd gms |

fewor. —wufy faufea fFy o9 % Jvem 59 ® 9ol o oW
F (A1 afe | A etfus g9 g F oAw §, S e
sigh o @ et off ofw © o & € O TH 99w o |
q W W W) W Ay wuen e, ew st i
gerer WY fRu U g

WEAHTUT-Ueh, — 39 3 =88 & JasH & fau wes $ga 9
AT sifaga g,

T ERTUT-8Y. — St faure wt g U fered fromfea 6t
78 %, faed gufq #1 g gy faved s @ R
R TH e % ey ¥ fausm e fen T g, e
T favreE gt weE Al forad W e gek 9 9
very forgd &1 oo gHTY T YEH Rl THA HH H Al
sy, foe] 98 UE eR Ty A w9 HEl e,

afyeray Ui gk $9Y % TEAdA wd gY, gfayfd
¥ gufeafy wa o fowa & T 3HF A
% Y% T TR T I IR WM & g
T T

THE 9.

9 Y[ew F A Yok, S e gufd, ¥ qUw
fq 7y Sy A1 I & IR A &
TEIRO-9 (. W) T T .

& o W U wulh, & gee fEU MU siw
3l % AR Yo SR (. W)
W ¥



Hegeyl TS, feie 7 swadt 2015 14 (13)

() (R)

WO, el Faa Ffy gt (TR @ few e @
+7¢ o1 &7, S f fafafde feen so, & ot feoa
T ¥) ¥ faweE § gefua forad §, 98l Yob % FaeH
¥ foru =ToR gea At - TSt % |t T W CEi
feman smem;

wetHRTT—eR, sgi fo fdt usea wifaserd = fafaa
=rrera g fawrss & g sifam ety @ fasrse
FHW 1 FR9 2 gu ey gr fean e dwne, farse
#t frdt forem & fog enifim wr § wiftaa e T
2 ofr TR o W TR ¥ ew ¥ favsm @t ferea
aeageTq fromfed ) T €, o'l TH e W ged Th
TR T W &9 AE B,

¥, IR —
&, urferd) &1 foad—

(F) i arerd # e ofwem ¥ eR T § o X TR EEL
el U8 AREE & I T Yo,000 H IR
& ¥

(\) el W AMEE W T Yo, 000 W 1fHE T; =[H S BN T Ud Sifbhan €9 TSR ¥99 %
aresi T gu, s Sl & wfa.

(M) el sfem @ e SR R weafy  ww § 0 Q61 wefd S SR e @ S e
TS E; '

TSROl 31Tve &1 T I e H qen wuer eafd
¥ ®Y H A T, 98 Wug (@) q«n (M) IE Al
B

W, 9riert w1 foeed a1 wrfier &l denfegia—

(%) 8] vriier) o1 fasea e W oo fadt vrfier & ag Yook S T Guf % SR Te o gIi-
e B W R TR Tufa T8 9RiER W (. }u) W T .
S for 39 qufa & e ifuerd & I % ®9H
e o, 8 fa= fardl smfier gry 21 9eR
w7 o S

(@) et o= e H, Teh TR T,



14 (14)

Hegey USs, fedis 7 S9ad 2015

()

(R)

Yo.

HEAWATHT 9T R (R2) FR1 AamidifoE, s 92
Tl 8—

(®) wEfF 98 g (1) A (F) % AT I A
QAT T Brgat T 0 Ay safeaal ol
T g HogawR ° W @ & fau wifbed
FA T,

(@) SEfem o' WUg () A (F) F SRR I AR
TG Y DS TH Al o Th 8 e
Horagrl H a1 WRUE: S w6 % ol W T
Y erfs oafaadl w1 Yged: A gUkd: TF d
sifirer deeeil | A WEROE: S HE % A
QTFHWW%;

(M) et o wfawa & fag fea e  aun sifeal
T geagew § from fordt Tamar wufa =1 fosky,
fafrra =1 el w9 4 8 Gk F o fag
Tiferd AT ¥

(=) e o wfawe & fom fean e & qen stfveeal
1 qegyey # fem wer d@ufa & fawa, M,
ot o1 e ®1 9 o gwid w0 & fad
ferha s E—

(ww) o Afusdl Here w1 gEH T
(3) v arfyeal F w1 e TR

() wafe og e =afe o fodt fmfha ot o
s ffya frema & & o, T, dyuy,
fedwn, fed=R-w a1 gt g&R &1 fauoy
wfaufa = wfaw & W q F9 FH 5 THAH
e % o wiftga v .

(=) o= feu 9w 1

WEHTOT—Teh—3d =0T & JASH & fau v $da 9

o, foren, oef, ofd, 0, TN, o9, w6, et o
drsA efiga g

TR —a— U o s1fers wafall 1 9@ 39 < o,

“R.

foadl for 3wk & wd & ¥, 39 oTeg % wESHl &

fafrra-ox ar ae=-uw fawges, warea saie Al
yfsersr o1 39 &g ¥ fafy-qedew w1 e fod o
=it g fofed w9 # & 72 U Swon, s fatme-aa
A AT B FEL R ] SGHOA Bl T

TH TR T,

g BER 93,

g1 Yook S Hufd % SR e o gRiae-a3
(. JY) T AT T,

TF BN T,

agt yo S "ofa % 9N el % e u
(%F. W) T AW .

T&H 9 T,

yifted fore T gdE wafs % fou w 39R w9



Heyeyl S, fedie 7 el 2015

14 (15)

(2)

(R)

UR.

43.

Wy,

i & ARER g Swafy et O i amn o feeal @
T Huu-gE, S eIl 1 a5 A iEl @1
Rerer # W gfte ¥ 3% g famn mn ® SR U
H 9IS H dfaw W oo a1 Wi gr 9 W
ure | wEd A 9 @ A 7 3aRa % o 36E g
7% favg fafea w9 & w1 7 w1 =won sefe T@
sroon-us el ufsers o1 3w ¥foea d fafuges w5
0 e Tt o eafa g1 STy A Wi feman
TR,

sufma dufa w1 ufaewrawer, fsad g% facral &
fri gr1 e afEf 3

frdfem orafq ¢ fawa, (S ¥ fefm =1 € e
o o/ R3-% R Susy fawer wen ¥) foud gh @R

wfe forelt ot safaq W T 1 o fedt fafafde awfa
T EE w1 AN H A §—

() el Fod & e gew & uw

() I Tt " d—

WEFOT— 39 =e & YASH & fog s FEd | A,

U,

U&.

Tt ST B

SRS W S, 31 g forea S 39 3uR % ford
yfayfa &t & S forelt 9 F e W AR W A AR
WA A @R R faar T iR fwet sreel e &
Taeq e W g W HIiea ¥

wfqufe seros it stees-faera wdf §— el uw ufayfa
Herrs forel v whdel % wee, e @ o ufayfa
#F wu ¥ funfea feen mn %, =0 wfay g et dfaen
=1 qere, o giafeea s % ford fremfea fen
T, o Tl = o afaed F ARe S e
e arfufem, oo (2o H\9) TR ITIYT ITEH
& & o § fromfea fwar 0 7

T T,

TF TR T,

TH Yok T AT Y[Eh, S gt % I
3R, fg W R g@ @ am e TR, %
yfawe o IR ged, T8 9 S o sifyes
g, % T3 (3. 3Y) W I E.

=€l o, S gufd % 39 IR, W w e
<@ & @M fear T §, % gfawe A1 FeR
e, T79 S oft sifee B, o e
(. W) T T T.

= Yook i gfdea fRT U 3ER S W
FY-TF (F. ¥) W AT E.

et yow W I BT TEHEA k odY-u3
(. ¢%¥) W Nl %



14 (16)

YeggRyl UStaE, feqier 7 SHad 2015

()

(R)

o,

ST —
F, I # foea (Togs ofarta Be faora ®);

(TF) Fd F TSR w W H;

(21 forelt st T A,

TETHTOT § — 78] Fevq & f&d R sgara i fored

F ford oriferd wrw ¥ wifiug © o 9 FIR %
e | oroeenyA Helel forgm oo fronfed et e
2, Tl te) foma W Yow U T9R ¥IC § FH 81
&I

TR }—3d T & WM & fog g Fgd | A,

e

Uz,

go.

&2.

e, wedt, wfe, gz, gf, o€, s, i Wi e A9y
et SAfPE B

(@) TR FHT HaEg

I g g & ford s sifafrad, 023 (Roe3
F1 2¢) & sl Frffia.

T G0 A & 39T, N fhdl Sferam & el 9 Arel
T YU W & o1 I °lel okl IR HiH W Wit gl

uee w1 ereagur for ferdt ufawer & aun el foma-
e dufa st feafa # 21, St fF a7 @ ve faom A
arfuerfera @t g of.

SO —

(F) oW ¢ W Susitd fes= & faam fes=mi =1, s
fooa sfyferrt 3, = gook % fod feder arlt @
a4 B

(@) w9, dud-faorg =@ & aferst g ufaya
feret fea <hl;

() TEIRTEE SAfuTTEE, 9283 (%63 H ¥u) I
g 3R b AT fedl wufw @

TG YOF HI STYT Yok, SN sqaefan wafd
F TR T F EEIRU-T (F. 4) W
ISUCIES

g Y, S orawenfud gufa % s qed
F THEU-T (. 4) W T T

TF TR T,

e # fafafds sl &1 erfufea w@m &
TER IR G & BRI (3. 34) W
T3 Yo &1 TE T Yh.

TIE T4,

TH TR T

feaer @ yfawa %1 WhH F yIe Al w9
o IHF 9 F fAd q=E 99

aET yies S fed &1 UH WEE @ e %
FY-TF (. ¥) T AT ©.

Teh B9R Tl



wegey quras, feqies 7 Serdt 2015 14 (17)

(2) ()
§3. U W IFEIUT, WHISYH BN 7 fF SU 922 gw; a8Y gok S 39 Hufe &, S Ao Hi
fovg-ong €, % 99K Yed & SWIael-vs
(F. 4) W AW .

&3, HH—

F. & WEuT— TR dufq & o 3uF IR § 949 fF
T 4 i fafed w9 § w7 8-

(%) B dufa &1 e[ B, 9 =teng g, S ety Tufa % SR
T ¥ TR (. W) W

(@) foedt s A H, TH TR UG,

|, w1 uferewT— R gufa &1 a1 39F e H Sk T §AR TIT,

98 gdud @ fa= et foed & w0 § fFan o @)

gy, W & ford A, srofq U W fowa, stoswd it TH Fuu "
forelt safom &% o U gURficEl & a1 IHE U &
I wre H ) gufE & g o el § S fwdl e,
SR A A2 W A 39 W uP §, Sefn T fored @
=ifr g a1 SHE SR forerl efiren § Y@ wE ¥,
EW&‘T&HWW&THH@QIT@%,

o (2) ORI W (TEATRY HINEA) SRRV, R0%% (SHHIH 4 WY R0%%) Uaegnl Frfgm Prww me

() S oY F FREA ¥ g g¢ A, S ey % oref F TR HE 9@ A H T
#E HarE 39 fufem ¥ acur susel ¥ et w T o A it Mg Hriens wHEH S,

0o, feqis 7 sHad 2015

. 150-5-TFRG-3 (1. ) -1, —9Rd & WG9 & =98 348 & @Ue (3) & ST H IR © (AR
diied) SffEm, 2014 (R 2, T 2015) I SIS SER TSAUA b WIUHER § SRR TG R S €

TEAYSYT T TSIUE K A Y A SRR,
ufidm guw faard, swfem.



14 (18) neAyey e, fediw 7 sHadt 2015
MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 2 or 2015
THE INDIAN STAMP(MADHYA PRADESH) AMENDMENT ACT, 2014.
[Received the assent of the Governor on the 6th January, 2015; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)” dated the 7th January, 2015.]
An Act further to amend the Indin Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the state of
Madhya Pradesh.
Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty fifth year of the Republic of India
as follows:— .
Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2014.

Amendment of
Central Act No. IX
of 1899, in its ap-
plication to the

State of Madhya

Pradesh.

Amendment of
section 3.

Substitution of
Schedule 1-A.

2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (No. II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),
shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh, be amended in the manner hereinafter provided.

3, In Section 3 of the principal Act, in the first proviso, the words “subject‘to the exemptions
contained in that Schedule’’ shall be omitted.

4. For Schedule 1-A to the principal Act, the following Schedule shall be substituted, namely:—
“SCHEDULE 1-A

Stamp Duty on Instruments
(See Sections 3)

Description of Instruments Proper Stamp Duty
@®n )
1. Acknowledgement of a debt exceeding five hundred rupees Ten rupees.

in amount or value, written or signed by or on behalf of
debtor in any book (other than a banker's pass book) or on
a separate piece of paper, when such book or paper is left
in the creditor's possession.

2. Acknowledgement of receipt of payment of consideration Five thousand rupees.
on account of another deed, which has been previously
registered.
3. Administration-Bond, including a bond given under section The same duty as a bond (No. 14) for the same

291, 375 and 376 of the Indian Succession Act, 1925 amount.
(39 of 1925) and Section 6 of the Government Savings Bank
Act, 1873 (5 of 1873).

4. Adoption deed, that is to say, any instrument (other than a Two thousand rupees.
will) recording an adoption or conferring or purporting to
confer an authority to adopt.

5. Affidavit, that is to say, a statement in writing purporting Fifty rupees.
to be a statement of fact, signed by the person making it and
confirmed by him on oath or, in the case of persons by law
allowed to affirm instead of swearing, by affirmation.

6. Agreement of Memorandum of an agreement-

(a) If relating to the sale of bill of exchange. One rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof.



[eyey UsTay, et 7 SHad 2015 14 (19)

ey

@

(b) (i) If relating to the purchase or sale of a Government
security.

(ii) If relating to the purchase or sale of shares, scrips, bonds,
debentures, debenture-stocks or any other marketable
security of a like nature in or of any incorporated
company or other body corporate.

(¢) It relating to a permission granted by a manufacturer or
owner of a business, know-how, brand name, trademark
or the like to another person to carry on business or
other activity using the grantor's know-how, brand
name, trademark etc., i.e. the agreement of franchise.

(d) If relating to the development of land and/or construction
of a building thereon by a person other than the owner
or lessee of such land.

(1) if having the stipulation that after development, such
developed property or part thereof shall be held/ sold
by the developer, by whatever name called, either
severally or jointly with the owner/ lessee -

(i) for cases not covered by (i) above -
Explanation-For the purposes of this article,

(i)"'development" and "developer” shall have the same
meaning as assigned to them respectively in section 2(f)
of the Madhya Pradesh Nagar Tatha Gram Nivesh
Adhiniyam, 1973 (No. 23 of 1973) and rule 2(1) (b) of
the Madhya Pradesh Special Project and Township
(Development, Regulation and Control) Rules, 2011.

(i1) where the developed property is held/sold jointly but the
share of the developer is not expressly mentioned in the
document, the developer's share shall be deemed to be
100 percent. ‘

(e) If relating to sale of immovable property-

(i) When possession of the property is delivered or is agreed
to be delivered without executing the conveyance.

(if) When possession of the property is not given.

One rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part

thereof, of the value of the security at the
time of its purchase or sale, as the case
may be, subject to a maximum of rupees
five thousand.

Rupees two for every one lakh or part thereof, of

the value of the security at the time of its
purchase or sale, as the case may be, in
case of non-delivery- based transactions;
and one rupee for every rupees 10,000 or
part thereof in case of delivery- based
transactions.

Ten thousand rupees

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the,

market value of only that portion of the
entire land proposed to be developed which
is proportionate to the developed property
to be held/sold by the developer jointly or
severally, or half of the duty as a
conveyance (No. 25) on the market value of
the entire land proposed to be developed,
whichever is higher.

0.25 percent of the market value of the entire

land proposed to be developed, subject to a
minimum of one thousand rupees.

The same duty as conveyance (No. 25) on the

market value of the property.

One thousand rupees.



14 (20) Herye qeTas, fedie 7 Sad 2015

ey

@

(f) If relating to hire- purchase of immovable property.
g) If relating to secure repayment of a loan or debt.

(h) If not otherwise provided for.

7. Agreement relating to deposit of title deeds, pawn,
pledge or hypothecation, that is to say, any instrument
evidencing an agreement relating to-

(a) the deposit of title deeds or instruments constituting or
being evidence of the title to any property whatever
(other than a marketable security), where such deposit
has been made by way of security for the repayment of
money advanced or to be advanced by way of loan or
an existing or future debt.

(b) the pawn, pledge or hypothecation of movable property,
where such pawn, pledge or hypothecation has been
made by way of security for the repayment of money
advanced, or to be advanced by way of loan or-an
existing or future debt.

Explanation I - On an instrument relating to deposit of title
deeds or pawn or pledge or hypothecation for securing
repayment of money advanced or to be advanced by
way of loan or an existing or future debt of a higher
amount than one secured by earlier instruments of like
nature, the duty shall be chargeable only on the
additional amount in case the proper stamp duty has
been paid on the earlier instrument.

Explanation II-for the purposes of clause (a) of this article,
notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment,
decree or order of any court or order of any authority,
any letter, note, memorandum or writing relating to the
deposit of title deeds whether written or made either
before or at the time when or after the deposit of title
deeds is effected, and whether it is in respect of the
security for the first loan or any additional loan or
loans taken subsequently, such letter, note,
memorandum or writing shall, in the absence of any
separate agreement or memorandum of agreement
relating to deposit of such title deeds, be deemed to be
an instrument, evidencing an agreement relating to the
deposit of title deeds.

8. Appointment in execution of a power, whether of trustees
or of property, moveable or immoveable, where made
by any writing, not being a will.

9. Appraisement or valuation, made otherwise than under
an order of the Court in the course of a suit.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property.

0.25 percent of the amount of loan or debt,
subject to a maximum of five lakh rupees.

Five hundred rupees.

0.25 percent of the amount secured by such deed,
subject to a maximum of five lakh rupees.

0.25 percent of the amount of loan or debt
subject to a maximum of five lakh rupees.

Five hundred rupees.

Five hundred rupees.



weayey TS, feas 7 SHad 2015

14 (21)

ey

2)

10. Apprenticeship deed, including every writing relating to
the service or tuition of any apprentice, clerk or servant,
placed with any master to learn any profession, trade or
employment.

11. Articles of a Company -
(a) where the company has no share capital.

(b) where the company has nominal share capital or increased
share capital.

12. Award, that is to say, any decision in writing by an arbitrator
or umpire, on a reference made otherwise than by an
order of the Court in the course of a suit, being an award
made as a result of a written agreement to submit present
or future differences to arbitration and not being an award
directing a partition.

13. Bank Guarantee. Guarantee deed executed by a bank as
surety to secure the due performance of a contract or the
due discharge of liability.

14. Bond, not being a debenture and not being otherwise
provided for by this Act or by the Court-fees Act, 1870
(No.7 of 1870). ‘

15. Bottomry Bond, that is to say, any instrument whereby
the master of a sea going ship borrows money on the
security of the ship to enable him to preserve the ship or
prosecute her voyage.

16. Cancellation - Instrument of cancellation of any previously
registered document, if attested and not otherwise
provided for.

Explanation - I - If on the principal instrument stamp duty is
paid on the basis of value, the duty on the instrument of
cancellation shall be chargeable as per the principal
instrument.

Explanation - II- If on the principal instrument stamp duty is
paid on the basis of market value, the duty on the
instrument of cancellation shall be chargeable as per the
principal instrument on the prevailing market value.

17. Certificate of Enrolment, under section 22 of the Advocate
Act, 1961 (No. 25 of 1961), issued by the State Bar
Council of Madhya Pradesh.

18. Certificate of Practice as Notary, under sub-section (1)
of section 5 of the Notaries Act, 1952 (No. 53 of 1952),
or endorsement of renewal of such certificates under sub
section (2) of the said section.

19. Certificate of Sale (in respect of each property put up as
a separate lot and sold), granted to the purchaser of any
property sold by public auction by a Civil or Revenue
Court or Collector or other Revenue Officer or an officer
authorised to do so under any law for the time being in
force.

Two hundred rupees.

Five thousand rupees.

0.15 percent of such nominal or increased share
capital, subject to a minimum of five
thousand rupees and a maximum of twenty
five lakh rupees.

Two percent of the award amount or market value
of the property to which the award relates,
whichever is higher.

0.25 percent of thé amount, subject to a
maximum of twenty five thousand rupees.

(a) 0.5 percent of the amount or value secured
subject to a minimum of five hundred
rupees.

(b) Where no valuation is possible, five hundred
rupees.

The same duty as a Bond (No.14) for the same
amount. :

Five hundred rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Two thousand rupees.

The same duty as a conveyance (No.25) for the
amount of purchase money only.



14 (22)

Heygey U5, &R 7 el 2015

(1)

@

20. Certificate or other document, evidencing the right or
title of the holder thereof, or any other person, either to
any shares, scrip or stock in or of any incorporated
company or other body corporate, or to become
proprietor of shares, scrip or stock in or of any such
company or body.

21. Charter-Party, that is to say, any instrument (except an
agreement for the hire of tug steamer) whereby a vessel
or some specified principal part thereof is let for the
specified purposes of the charterer, whether it includes
a penalty clause or not.

22. Clearance List-

(a) If relating to the transactions for the purchase or sale of
Government securities submitted to the clearing house
of a stock exchange.

(b) If relating to the transactions for the purchase or sale of
share, scrip, stock, bond, debenture, debenture - stock
or other marketable security of a like nature in or of an
incorporated company or other body corporate,
submitted to the clearing house of a stock exchange.

23. Composition deed, that is to say, any instrument
executed by a debtor whereby he conveys his property
for the benefit of his creditors or whereby payment of a
composition or dividend on their debts is secured to the
creditors, or whereby provision is made for the
continuance of the debtor's business under the
supervision of inspectors nominated by the creditors or
under letters of licence for the benefit of his creditors.

24. Consent deed without any consideration, forming part of
a document already registered or to be registered.

25. Conveyance- not being a transfer charged or exempted
under No.6l

Explanation - For the purpose of this article market value of
any property which is subject matter of conveyance
executed by or on behalf of the Central Government or
the State Government, shall be the value shown in the
instrument.

One rupee for every one thousand rupees or a
part thereof, of the value of the-shares, scrip
or stock.

One hundred rupees.

One rupee for every rupees 10,000 or part thereof
in respect of each of the entries in such list
on the value of securities calculated at the
making up price or the contract price, as
the case may be, subject to a maximum of
rupees five thousand.

Rupees two for every one lakh or part thereof, of
the value of the security at the time of its
purchase or sale,ﬁas the case may be, in
case of non-delivery- based transactions;
and one rupee for every rupees 10,000 or
part thereof in case of delivery-based
transactions.

Two thousand five hundred rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Five percent of the market value of the property
which is the subject matter of conveyance
or the amount of consideration set forth
therein, whichever is higher.

Provided that- -

(a) where an instrument relates to the merger or
amalgamation of companies under the
orders of Tribunal/Court under section 232
and 234 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of
2013), or under the order of the Reserve



ey TS, feRiew 7 SsHad 2015 14 (23)

(1 2)

Bank of India under section 44A of the
Banking Regulation Act, 1949 ( 10 of
1949) the duty chargeable shall be an
amount equal to 5% of the market value of
the immovable property transferred which is
located within the State of Madhya Pradesh,
or an amount equal to 0.5% of the
aggregate of the market value of the shares
issued or allotted in exchange or otherwise
and the amount of consideration paid for
such transfer, whichever is higher.

(b) when an instrument relates to an assignment
of a debt, the rate of duty shall be 0.25
percent on the amount of the debt assigned.

(c) where an agreement to sell an immovable
property is stamped with ad-valorem duty
required for a conveyance and a sale deed
in pursuance of such agreement is
subsequently executed, the duty on such
sale deed shall be the duty payable under
the article less the duty already paid,
subject to a minimum of Rs. 1000.

(d) where a power of attorney authorising the
agent to sell immovable property is stamped
with ad-valorem duty required for a
conveyance and a sale deed is executed in
pursuance of power of attorney between the
executant of attorney and the person in
whose favour it is executed, the duty on the
sale deed shall be the duty payable under
the article less the duty already paid,
subject to a minimum of Rs. 1000.

(e) where a mortgage deed or an agreement to
mortgage is stamped with ad-valorem duty
required for a mortgage under article 43
and a court decree in pursuance of a suit
filed against the mortgaged property, or a
mortgage deed is executed, the duty payable
on the decree or the mortgage deed shall
be the duty payable under the article less
the duty already paid under article 43 on
the mortgage deed, subject to a minimum
of Rs. 1000.

() where by an instrument, a person includes the
name of his wife or daughter or daughter-
in-law severally or jointly as co-owner in
his property, the rate of duty shall be
I percent on the market value of the
property.



14 (24) Hergeyl s, foqie 7 SMed 2015

(1)

(2)

26. Copy or Extract, certified to be a true copy or extract
by or order of an public officer under section 70 of the
indian Evidence Act, 1872 (No.1 of1872) and not
chargeable under the law for the time being in force
relating to court fees

27. Counterpart or duplicate of any instrument chargeable
with duty and in respect of which the proper duty has
beer, paid.

28. Customs Bond or Excise bond, that is to say, any bond
given pursuant to the provisions of any law for the time
being in force or to the directions of any officer of
Custom or Excise for, or in respect of, any of the
duties of Customs and Excise or for preventing frauds
or evasions thereof or for any other matter or thing
relating thereto.

29. Declaration, under the Madhya Pridesh Prakoshtha
Swamitva Adhiniyam, 2000 (No. 15 of 2001).

30. Delivery order in respect of goods, that is to say, any
instrument entitling any person therein named or his
assigns or the holder thereof, to the delivery of any
goods lying in any dock or pert or in any warehouse in
which goods are stored or deposited on rent or hire, or
upon any wharf, such instrument being executed by or
on behalf of the owner of such goods, upon the sale or
transfer of the property therein when such goods exceed
in value hundred rupees.

31. Divorce, instrument of, that is to say, any instrument by
which any person effects the dissolution of his
marriage.

32. Document amending or correcting previously registered
deed, but not making any material alterations.

Explanation - For the purpose of this article a material
alteration is one which varies the rights, liabilities or
legal position of the parties as ascertained from the
instrument in its original state or otherwise varies the
legal effect of the instrument as originally executed.

33 Entry of certificate of marriage, in the register under the
Special Marriage Act, 1954 (No. 43 of 1954) or any
other law for the time being in force.

34. Exchange of Property- Instrument of

35. Further charge- Instrument of, tint is to say, any
instrument imposing a further charge on mortgaged
property-

(a) when the original mortgage is one of the description
referred to in clause (a) of Article No. 43 (that is with
possession).

One ‘hundred rupees.

One thousand rupees.

The same duty as a Bond (No.14) for the same
amount.

Ten thousand rupees.

Ten rupees.

One thousand rupees.

One thousand rupees.

One hundred rupees.

The same duty as a conveyance (No.25) on the
market value of the property of greater
value, which is the subject matter of
Exchange. :

The same duty as a conveyance (No.25) for the
amount of further charge secured by such
instrument.



wegRyl TSy, g 7 sad 2015

14 (25)

ey

)

(b) when such mortgage is one of the description referred to
in clause (b) of Article No.43 (that is, without
possession) -

(i) If at the time of the execution of the instrument of further

charge, the possession of the property is given or
agreed to be given under such instrument.

(i1) If possession is not so given.

36. Gift- Instrument of, not being a settlement (No. 57) or
will or transfer (No. 61):-

(i) when made to member of a family.

(ii) in all other cases.

Explanation- For the purpose of this article, the term
"family” shall mean mother, father, wife, husband, son,
daughter, brother, sister, granddaughter and gradson,

37. Indemnity Bond.

38. Lease, including an under-lease, or sub-lease and any
agreement to let or sub-let or any renewal of lease-

(i) where the lease purports to be for a term less than one
year.

(ii) where the lease purports to be for a term of not less than
one year but less than five years.

(iii) where the lease purports to be for a term of not less than
five years but less than ten years.

The same duty as a conveyance (No.25) for the
total amount of charge (including the
original mortgage and any further charge
already made) less the duty already paid on -
such original mortgage and further charge.

The same duty as a Bond (No. 14) for the
amount of the further charge secured by
such instrument.

Half of the duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property, which is
subject matter of the gift.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property, which is
subject matter of the gift.

The same duty as a Bond (No.14) for the same
amount.

0.01 percent of the whole amount payable or
deliverable under such lease, or of the
market value of the property, whichever is
higher. :

0.1 percent of the amount of premium or money
advanced or to be advanced as set forth in
the deed plus the average annual rent
reserved, or of the market value of the
property, whichever is higher.

One percent of the amount of premium or money
advanced or to be advanced as set forth in
the deed plus the average annual rent
reserved, or of the market value of the
property, whichever is higher.



14 (26) geyey e, ferie 7 Sad 2015

ey

(2)

(iv) where the lease purports to be for a term of not less than
ten years but less than twenty years.

(v) where the lease purports to be for a term of not less than
twenty years but less than thirty years.

(vi) where the lease purports to be for a period of thirty years
or more, or in perpetuity, or does not purport to be for
a definite period.

Explanation- I- When an instrument of agreement to lease is
stamped with the ad-valorem duty required for a lease,
and a lease in pursuance of such agreement is
subsequently executed, the duty on such lease deed
shall be the duty payable under the article less the duty
already paid, subject to a minimum of one thousand
rupees.

Explanation-II- Where a decree or final order of any Civil
Court in respect of a lease is stamped with ad-valorem
duty required for a lease, and a lease in pursuance of
such decree or final order is subsequently executed, the
duty on such lease deed shall be the duty payable under
the article less the duty already paid, subject to a
minimum of one thousand rupees.

Explanation-11I- Any consideration in the form of premium,
or money advanced or to be advanced by whatever
name called shall, for the purpose of this article, be
treated as consideration passed on.

Explanation-1V- The renewal period, if specifically
mentioned in the lease deed, shall be treated as part of
the present lease period.

Explanation-V-When a lessee undertakes to pay any
recurring charge, such as Government revenue, the
landlord's share of cesses or the owner's share of
municipal rates or taxes, which is by law recoverable
from the lessor, the amount so agreed to be paid by the
lessee shall be deemed to be part of the rent. Also, rent
paid in advance shall be deemed to be money
advanced, unless it is specifically provided in the lease
that rent paid in advance shall .be set off towards the
installments of rent.

Explanation-V1- For the purpose of this article royalty shall
be treated as rent.

Explanation-VII-For the purpose of this article market value,

Two percent of the amount of premium or money
advanced or to be advanced as set forth in
the deed plus the average annual rent
reserved, or of the market value of the
property, whichever is higher.

Four percent of the amount of premium or money
advanced or to be advanced as set forth in
the deed plus the average annual rent
reserved, or of the market value of the
property, whichever is higher.

Five percent of the amount of premium or money
advanced or to be advanced as set forth in
the deed plus the average annual rent
reserved, or of the market value of the
property, whichever is higher.



Heyey TS, feais 7 SHad 2015 14 (27)

ey

2)

premium and rent of any property, which is subject matter of
lease executed by or on behalf of the Central
Government or the State Government or any
undertaking of the State Government shall be as shown
in the instrument.

39. Letter of allotment of Shares, in any company or
proposed company or in respect of any loan to be
raised by any company or proposed company.

40. Letter of Guarantee.

41. Letter of licence, that is to say, any agreement between a
debtor and his creditors that the latter shall for a
specified time, suspend their claims and allow the
debtor to carry on business at his own discretion.

42. Memorandum of a company-

(a) If accompanied by articles under section 5 of the
Companies Act, 2013 (No. 18 of 2013)

(b) If not so accompanied.

43. Mortgage deed, not being an agreement relating to the
deposit of title deeds, Pawn, Pledge or Hypothecation
(No.7), Bottomry bond (No. 15), Mortgage of a crop
(No.44), Respondentia Bond (No.55), or a Security
bond (No. 56)-

(a) When possession of the property or any part of the
property comprised in such deed is given by mortgagor
or agreed to be given.

(b) When possession is not given or agreed to be given as
aforesaid.

Explanation-I A mortgagor who gives to the mortgagee a
power of attorney to collect rents of a lease of the
property mortgaged or part thereof, is deemed to give
possession within the meaning of this article.

Explanation-II For mortgage, for creating development of or
construction on land under the Madhya Pradesh Nagar
Palika (Registration of Colonizer, Terms and
Conditions) Rules, 1998 and the Madhya Pradesh Gram
Panchayat (Registration of Colonizer, Terms and
Conditions) Rules, 1999, the development expenses
approved by the competent officer and set forth in the
document, shall be the amount secured.

(¢) When a collateral or auxiliary or additional or substituted
security, or by way of further assurance for the above
mentioned purpose, where the principal or primary
security is duly stamped.

44. Mortgage of a Crop, including any instrument
evidencing an agreement to secure the repayment of a
loan made upon any mortgage of a crop whether the
crop is or is not in existence at the time of the
mortgage.

Ten rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Two thousand rupees.

Two thousand five hundred rupees.
The same duty as is chargeable on Articles under

Article II, according to the share capital of
the company.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) for the
amount secured by such deed.

The same duty as a Bond (No. 14) for the
amount secured by such deed.

Five hundred rupees.

Ten rupees.



14 (28)

wegyey T, ferie 7 SHad 2015

ey

)

45. Notarial Act, that is to say, any instrument, endorsement,
note, attestation, certificate or entry not being a protest
(No. 51) executed by a Notary public in the execution
of the duties of his office, or by any other person
lawfully acting as a Notary public.

46. Note or Memorandum, sent by a broker or agent to his
principal intimating the purchase or sale on account of
such principal-

(a) of any goods exceeding in value one hundred rupees.

(b) of any share, scrip, stock, bond, debenture, debenture
stock or other marketable security of a like nature
exceeding in value one hundred rupees, not being a
Government Security.

(c) of a Government Security.

Explanation -

For the purpose of clause(a) of this article, the record of
transaction (electronic or otherwise) relating to future
and option trading and forward contracts of goods
described in clause (a) effected by the firm for itself or
by proprietor for himself, who is a trading member
through stock exchange or an association as defined in
clause (a) of section 2 of the Forward Contract
(Regulation) Act, 1952 (No.74 of 1952) shall be
deemed to be a Note or Memorandum.

47. Note of Protest, by the master of a ship.
48. Partition- Instrument of -

(i) when made within the family members.
(i1) in any other case,

Note- The largest share remaining after the property is
partitioned (or if there are two or more shares of equal
value and not smaller than any of the other share, then
one of such equal shares) shall be deemed to be that
from which the other shares are separated,

Explanation-I - For the purpose of this article, the term
"family” shall mean mother, father, wife, husband, son,
daughter, brother, sister. granddaughter and grandson..

Fifty rupees.

Two rupees for every rupees one lakh or part
thereof, subject to a maximum of fifty
rupees. '

Rupees two for every one lakh or part thereof, of
the value of the security at the time of its
purchase or sale, as the case may be, in
case of non-delivery- based transactions;
and one rupee for every rupees 10,000 or
part thereof in case of delivery-based
transactions.

One rupee for every rupees ten thousand or part
thereof, of the value of the security, at the
time of its purchase or sale, as the case
may be, subject to maximum of five
thousand rupees.

Fifty rupees.

Half of the duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the separated share or
shares of the property.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the separated share or
shares of the property.



wergey e, fedis 7 SHekt 2015 14 (29)

&)

@

Explanation-II- When an instrument of partition containing
an agreement to divide property in severalty is executed
and a partition is effected in pursuance of such
agreement, the duty chargeable upon the instrument
effecting such a partition shall be reduced by the
amount of duty paid in respect of the first instrument,
but shall not be less than one thousand rupees.

Explanation-III- Where the instrument relates to the partition
of agricultural land exclusively (not situated within
urban or planning area, or any other area as may be
specified), the market value for the purpose of duty
shall be calculated at hundred times the annual Jand
revenue.

Explanation-IV- Where a final order for effecting a partition

passed by any Revenue-authority or Civil Court or an -

award by an arbitrator directing a partition, is stamped
with the stamp required for an instrument of partition
and an instrument of partition in pursuance of such
order or award is subsequently executed, the duty on
such instrument shall not be less than one thousand
rupees.

49. Partnership-

A. Instrument of -

(a) where there is no share of contribution in partnership or
where such share of contribution does not exceed
Rs. 50,000.

(b) where such share of contribution is in excess of
Rs. 50,000,

(c) where such share of contribution is brought by way of
immovable property.

Explanation- Where such share of contribution is brought by
way of cash and irnmovable property, clauses (b) and
(c) both shall apply.

B. Dissolution of partnership or retirement of a partner.

(a) Where on dissolution of partnership or on retirement of a
partner, any immovable property is taken as his share
by a partner other than a partner who brought in that
property as his share of contribution in the partnership.

(b) In any other case.

50. Power of attorney as defined by section 2(21), not being
a4 Proxy-

(a) when authorising one person or more to act in single
transaction, excluding power of altorney coming under
clause (¢) or (d).

(b) when authorising one person to act in more than one
transaction or generally, or not more than ten persons {o
act jointly or severally in more than one transaction or
generally, excluding power of attorney coming under
clause (¢) or (d).

Two thousand rupees.

Two percent of the shares contributed, subject to
a minimum of rupees two thousand and a
maximum of rupees ten thousand.

Two percent on the market value of such
property.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of such property.

One thousand rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Two thousand rupees.



14 (30) Tequeyl T, feqimn 7 smEd 2015

1)

2)

(c) when given for consideration and authorising the agent to
sell, exchange or permanently alienate any immovable
property situated in Madhya Pradesh.

(d) when given without consideration, and authorizing the
agent to sell, gift, exchange or permanently alienate any
immovable property situated in Madhya Pradesh -

(i) when the agent is a member of the family.

(i) when the agent is not a member of the family.

{(e) when authorizing a person for the sole purpose of
purchasing shares, scrips, bonds, debentures, debenture-
stocks or any other marketable security of a like nature
in or of any incorporated company or other body
corporate, in the name of the principal.

(f) in any other case.

Explanation-1- For the purpose of this article, the term
"family" shall mean mother, father, wife, husband, son,
daughter, brother, sister, granddaughter and grandson.

Explanation-11- For the purpose of this article, more persons
than one when belonging to the same firm shall be
deemed to be one person.

51. Protest of Bill or Note, that is to say, any declaration in
writing made by a Notary public, or other person
lawfully acting as such, attesting the dishonour of a Bill
of Exchange or Promissory Note.

52. Protest by the Master of a Ship, that is to say, any
declaration of the particulars of her voyage drawn up
by him with a view to the adjustment of losses or the
calculation of averages, and every declaration in writing
made by him against the charterers or the consignees
for not loading or unloading the ship, when such
declaration is attested or certified by a Notary Public or
other person lawfully acting as such:.

53. Re-conveyance of Mortgaged Property, including
mortgage by deposit of title deeds.

54. Release, that is to say, any instrument (not being such a
release as is provided for by section 23-A) whereby a
person renounces a claim upon another person, or
against any specified property -

(i) when in favouwr of any member of a family.

(ii) in any other case.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property.

One thousand rupees.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property.

One hundred rupees.

One thousand rupees for each person authorised.

Fifty rupees.

Fifty rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Half of the duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the

consideration or market value of the share of
the property over which the claim is
relinquished, whichever is higher.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
consideration or market value of the share of
the property over which the claim is
relinquished, whichever is higher.



TGy TS, feHie 7 SHe 2015

14 (31)

(1

2

Explanation- For the purpose of this article, the term
"family" shall mean mother, father, wife, husband, son,
daughter, brother, sister, granddaughter and grandson,

55. Respondentia Bond, that is to say, any instrument
securing a loan on the cargo laden or to be laden on
board a ship and making repayment contingent on the
arrival of the cargo at the port of destination.

56. Security bond not being a Mortgage deed, where such
security bond is executed by way of security for the
due execution of an office, or executed by a surety to
secure the due performance of a contract, or in
pursuance of an order of the Court or public officer, not
being otherwise provided for by the Court-fees Act,
1870 (No.7 of 1870).

57. Settlement-

(a) Instrument of (including a deed of dower) -
(i) in case of family members.

(il) in any other case.

Explanation-I - Where an agreement to settle is stamped
with the stamp required for an instrument of settlement
and an instrument of settlement in pursuance of such
agreement is subsequently executed, the duty on such
instrument shall not be less than one thousand rupees.

Explanation- II - For the purpose of this article, the term
"family" shall mean mother, father, wife, husband, son,
daughter, brother, sister, granddaughter and grandson.

(b) Revocation of.

58. Share warrants. to bearer issued under the Companies
Act, 2013 (No. 18 of 2013).

59. Shipping order, for or relating to the conveyance of
goods on board of any vessel.

60. Surrender of lease without any consideration and when
the subject matter property is in the same condition, as
it was stated in the principal lease deed.

61. Transfer—

(a) of debentures, being marketable securities, whether the
debenture is liable to duty or not, except debentures
provided for by section 8.

b) of any interest secured by a bOlld, mortgage deed or
[=had =]
pOliC}/ of insurance.

The same duty as a Bond (No.14) for the amount
of the loan secured.

The same duty as a bond (No. 14) for the same
amount,

Half of the duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property settled.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property settled.

One thousand rupees.

One and a half times duty payable on a
conveyance (No.25) for a market value
equal to the nominal amount of the shares
specified in the warrant.

Fifty rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Fifty paise for every hundred rupees or part
thereof, of the consideration amount of
debentures.

The same duty as a Bond (No.14) for such
amount or value of the interest.



14 (32)

Hegey Tas, feqie 7 sHad 2015

&)

)

(c) of any property under section 22 of the Administrator's
General Act, 1963 (No. 45 of 1963).

62. Transfer of least, by way of assignment and not by way
of under lease.

63. Trust-

A. Declaration of- of or concerning any property when made
by any writing, not being a will-

(a) where there is disposition of property.

(b) in any other case.

B. Revocation of- of or concerning any property when made
by any instrument, other than a will.

64. Warrant for Goods, that is to say, any instrument
evidencing the title of any person therein named, or his
assigns or the holder thereof to the property in any
goods lying in or upon any dock, warehouse or wharf,
such instrument being signed or certified by or on
behalf of the person in whose custody such goods may
be.

One thousand rupees.

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of the property, which is the
subject matter of the transfer

Three fourth of the duty as a conveyance (No.
25) on the market value of the property
settled.

One thousand rupees.

One thousand rupees.

Ten rupees.”.

Repeal and
Saving.

hereby repealed.

5. (1) The Indian Stamp (Madhya Prdesh Amendment) Ordinance, 2014 (No. 5 of 2014) is

(2) Notwithstanding the repeal of the said Ordinance, anything done or any action taken under
the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions

of this Act.

FRiseh, A SV A S AT, TR BN U R0 WROner, it 9 g 9o WeEiie—2015.



TH IS www.govtpressmp.nic.in
q ot TRA e e 1w B

HHS 457] Wure, AR, e 22 3T 2017—41E0 31, WH 1939

fafer oi fererrt vl fam
O, feis 22 oFRa 2017

¥. 13761-187-THBIE-31- (V1. ) -3y, —Aeggey faum g =1 Freafafaa sifufem 9w e 18 o,
2017 B THI FRIGE B SAN W & Gh ¥, TR FHUERT R FEER F e vefva faear st €.

TEYRY F TSI % TH ¥ T STRIIER,
TS reE, Sffafs afee.

913



914 TegRY TSI, T 22 evrE 2017

YT ST

HHE R T 029
YR L0 ( HequeyT H9irer ) ifuf@m, og9

[feim ¢ 37, oo I ToAu w1 et wra gg, srfa ‘' weamey Tev (erEmemen) " § feAiw IR0 I, R0
T HIHER TRV @ .1

e T Y o U ¥ vl e s, 2088 Fr o el w3 s

YA TORY % Teaa a9 # qeauey faum-wvea gr ffafaa w1 § 95 sifufafia g —

2. (R) 39 afufrm &1 G M vRdE e (v "@eeE) aifufrem, Q0% ®.
(R) I8 HeARRY TS § 3HF THNE & G F g9 L

3. AYIGRY oY W W] G 9 F A @iy fufim, 26/R (R¢’% F W@ 3) (S 3@
e uvEr g9 ofufem F om ¥ fafde R) @, @ o weq Swefyd dfa d deifua

3. I Stfufem &Y SR - H,—

() IR W H, FlA (R) #, Wy #, @ve () & e Frafafaq @ve sigr =g,
31941;6;:—-

“(®) s w2 fawm, aaftafy, 9 @Rl ofgen 9gSR @ weAld & WY =g & (¥)
(Tw) F i Fromfea forga @ sifvura gu fasm s1fyer wd /steren ffo st
F I | Hoiy Tt ¥, YoF F L, A Th g9 9 F (e ®Wd gY
W AfER & i § Geifya yft & IR g @ gfawd, 6 9 S o stfuen
&, 1 Th giava g, '

() TR & F, wiem () ¥, Frefafa waeieo sier sy, sl o—

* AR TUT— Rl @ U FEIRIH St ]I H, Yoo, U2 Fi I FHemary | FR
WA U ITEDE 3¢(W) F e forg &t T A A Hed F FHged B

i s qen
WA,

YA T Rl
W e ww A
F orfufm,
2¢RR W TEH®
R T HIeA.

IR 2-H H
‘.lgilu l.



ey TN, fEAi 22 v 2017 914 (1)

09, e 22 3P/ 2017

.~ 187-SFHH-T- (W) -3fu.— 9/ & Gfaus F o3 348 & @IS (3) & ATWU ¥, WA =
(VoY GeieE) SifufrEm, 2017 (R 22 W 2017) I ST AR TWTE ¥ WS ¥ TAgEN T
o e ®.

TR ¥ ToATE % AW Y T SRR, -
[T Aregd, Hfaie afaa.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 22 oF 2017
THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2017

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 18" August, 2017; assent first pfxblished in the "Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-
ordinary)", dated the 22 August, 2017].

An Act further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the State of
Madhya Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-eighth year of the Republic
of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2017.  Short title and

commencement.
(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (No. II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) Amendment of

shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter Central Act No.
provided. I of 1899 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

3. In Schedule 1-A to the principal Act,— Amendment of
Schedule 1-A.

(i) in article 25, in column (2), in proviso, after clause (f), the following clause shall be
added, namely :—

"(g) when an instrument relates to transfer of development right and/or construction right,
obtained from the instrument executed under article 6(d) (i), along with consent
of land owner or lessee, as the case may be, the rate of duty shall be one percent
of market value of the land related to transfer of such right or consideration,
whichever is higher, subject to a minimum of one thousand rupees.";

(i) in article 62, in column (2), the following explanation shall be added, namely :—

"Explanation.—In case of assignment of a mining lease, the duty shall be equal to the
amount or value calculated under article 38(b) depending upon the remaining
period of the lease.”.

Fisreh, TMEETE GRUT Qe G A, AEAURE R YRR T RoNerd, Wit 9 gisd qen wehifi—2017.



3 AaHES www.govtpressmp.nic.in 9
ff ST dre fRa T g .

[

A 538] AT, YEeaR, fediw 30 faamR 2022—3nf¥aT 8, e 1944

fafy ik faurt =t faum

a9, feis 30 faamr 2022

. 14824-235-3FRG-31( 1. ). — gy faum g w1 frafafaa sfufras f59 w faie 29 fagm=R 2022 #1
TRMfEH TIUE &t TTAN W &1 Gl €, TAGgRI, AHIERY i ShR % fad g feran sman 2.

TS & ToIUed & A9 ¥ q ARITER,
TSYT qred, IR Ff=E.

1075



1076 gyl Teas, feaie 30 fagmr 2022

HeAayeyT faf=m
A 9 T 03

WA ©T ( AeqeyT 9ned ) Afatad, 2023

[“feaim 3y faamm, 033 @ Toauiel wt aqufa wid gE. AR ‘‘Heawewr uwuw (3r@rmer)’’ W fiw
% TaameR, 037 i YW aR Y & . ]

TEAYQYT T8 Tl @1 T & | ARdrT erd wfufEm, 24’R ot it dvifm & & stfufam
R VRS & fagaed o § wewRy faum-wved gr frefafed w9 H sifufwafid g o —

wfyw i . (R) 3§ fufEg = dfyw @ R =g (qeayes |ead) stfafad, 033 ®.

AL

(R) 9% 9EyRY Uoad H 9% YHRH H G ¥ g9 gL

TG T B . HHAURY T @ AN gL ®9 H IR Ly AfufEm, 2¢’) (¢’ W R) (S 36H 30H

M EW ®Y A sttt % 7 9 FI o Iyafyd Ofg o deifa fean S
! 'W&F{ a9 @ ffdy €) # = ud uvEN Ivefya Y

48R I U&HATH

3 T |l
I 2w 3. a afufrem w5 F oTEE %

(TH) =] & H, @S (¥) I TUvElq ol T Wi o @F W, frefaftad
U U1 WER wWifya few i, svufq:—

“(w) af o' T v @ Eaf
& T A geeer ¥ fir
frdt =afe a1 s
BN, 39 ofy a1 gufd &
fara a1 qAfdwmE i
e 39 R i A

et 9 geifua §,—

() 3 39H 97 offay € Yoob S faspfaa a1 qAfdwaa fee
B T fomm = S % fau wwfaa 9qof 4yt & Fea
qAfdsE & 9wEq 3G 9 F 9NR I % g 9
T fafaa o (FHiF y) W A § S faemmeral

QAfelenfaa gafd g WgEd: I Yd: 4ild a1 fashid i
3IG$T 9P, fommeal, WM el fawfaa @ gAfdsiaa 99 &
R o Tt off AW orua ¥ @), A W Yob I emem S
g 9 W €, kg fowfad @1 Efdefad fer 9m % faw
@ A TIRR WY FEed §@gu Yfi & ISR o &
T @ gEEd: A A TGO OF (SRS W) W I §, FH
Tgad: i o fagea @ S ot aifus €

fran s,



TS 99, {5 30 faamr 2022

1076 (1)

(@)  SWE (Th) & Y U BER BUY % e W g
sfwid 7 1 A fomrfaa o1 qAfdsfaa fFt S9 & fag
HHel % forg, yeafaa |qf fff & SIS Hed W 0.’y
yfeere.

TR0 —H 3= & TeHl & fag,—

() ‘foema’’ qen ‘' fasraseat’’ &1 agl otk T S WEAUSST TR de1 uH Fraw
aifafrEm, {03 (P 33 T LRW3) I U (F) A TEAYSH WA
e e TRARm, (faem, fafmma wd femo) fem, Reey & fam
() (@) ¥ wAw: 3+ fog fem 7 .

(@A) e fowfaa dufa da: ot o faskia 6t SR 91, wig <waas § fasmaenat
1 39 s w9 9 Ifeafaa 7 €1, agi fowmswal +1 3 Qoo gfoem
RSRE TG |

() =< v H, GUE (W) T TN TAEHI T qdT TEH Qo TE W,
Frefafea @ve w6 e wnfia feg s, srfq —

“(w) S Huia F1 quam, TRE 91 e, Stei UEr 9ugH, fREt A ssa 3UR
o Afim fqu 7T a1 fu 9H 9t 99 % 31eE1 IdHE A e K9 & G
IR ¥ fae wfadfa % w9 & fFm w ¥, el RO A IR F @A T —

(TH) Uo,c00 TUT TH  TaK TIY

() yo,co0 T H  UH W T
FIWR T 4 O
Y .

() 4 @ e o Y TR TUY
IR I Lo G
YU doh.

(FR) 2o 9@ ¥TITH  TH TR ¥UY
IR WY 4o TG
dUU deh.

(9E)  bo W@ TUT §  AfYHdH WM A TI1H F9R AT & g
FW T@d Y, YR 41 kY AT A A 0.3y Havm.

TETRIOT Teh.—3UR § 1fim feu 7w o fGu 9@ a6t 99 & 31ear adqm a1 sl
FO &k gHE W & fau ee-faor@l & fagm sryar qugw, fiRel @ smeAm
H I WH B gfaffa @ defa forea W dew sfafted @ W g
i g, Af 96 fama | i = gow g9 faar T R



1076 (2)

qeqyey Uerad, feAiw 30 faamaw 2022

WETHIOT 3. —39 T8 F @8 (F) & TAeH & foau, fwel =mmed & fom,
fesht a1 omew § =1 forelt Wit & oy H sjafde fedl s % B4 38U
ff, gw-faoal & 89 ¥ Feifta fFd o3, fomw, 307 @1 9@ &), 9R® 9%
Th-faor@l & f189 foer 99 & @ o1 W fE0 & w9 W I9F TvEl
fa@n T € @ I T R, SR AR 9% YW 3WR & fou @ a9k 7 fou
MU fRet atfafiaa Sum @1 3uRl & fow wfayfa & deg & |, t8 v, femm,
I A o H W Fh-faodl & 87 § Fefta = 1 9t F9 amw,
foea gwen s

(T

(=)

(ur=)

(%)

SR 23 F, Bem () F, Frfelaa s e W, e -

TR —FAH &9 F fau 9 vgsRl & Ae freiea de semyfa
F T Bt < H, T Yoo Th 9K YT BN, TEE 3 A H,
3T Yok IFTHT {3 F IIER TN

3= Y B, Hiem (R) H, WgH H, U8 (W) & WA K, Fefafea
wug w@ifya faran Sig, svefq —

‘(@) v o forga foRe B % gEIRYE ¥ Gefid €, Ie T g9
Tqq B’

AT 3¢ H, @2 (F) & WN |, Frafafiad gve wnfia fean S,
STQIH:—

T e § i, v foud simid ofeR weer @1 3I9-Ued U qee Al

w—q@m%ﬁmﬁ@q@m@mmﬁ%maﬁiw%—

()

()

(
Sl T T2 w9 ¥ H9 {9 9@ e
sty % forg wmeafda . ’

w&l f& vezr TH emfu® fau =[ad = € T % e wd

aardd & S wk o A etfum €, TQ WifEEW A sifiw few e

fibeg i a9 aF T M T S ol 99 99 IRfaa
feu u sfrgm aifier wes &t WA
* I H1, 91 WU b INR A
1 0.3 fawg 3N Q S ot arfw
gl



Hegey I9TE, fEAid 30 faaw 2022 1076 (3)

() <=t T wezr &t eafud fou AT " W 9 % qeAdH ®d ge, Wi
Tafda € s 9 9d § arfees R, 71 Afim few u A afiw fgu S 9 o= qen
fog <9 o9 & T aRfya few MU sfgm aftfe s =t WA &

AN H, A G9A F IR A HT o4y FlRIg
9 F S afuw Bl

(FR) & f& 9@ T smafyF fou ZAqH 9" 9 90 % A=A wd g, WA
aeaffa @ S oqm ad @ aiftss ®, . W ofim feu i W aifim few W 9t w9 qen
forg &9 o @ ©. aRfaa few o ofgm ot we® ®t WA &

I F, A U & GNIR Yed F TF GN,
T QW o sfeem €L

(W) Sl T vem W sefu s fem A = G 9 6 oA wd gu Wfim
Teada € S S 9d 9 eifu ©, o fim fou u @ fim fou SW o/ o\ e
foog o ¥ =W & IRfaa foe Mo oiwa it weE #f WA F
A H, A1 UG F IR Yed @ o JfEe,
T A S oot arfu Bl

(3%) i fF e U sy F fau A UE-H ¥ & TEdH wd gY, W
grufda & < o ad W Iud 71 fim feu e @1 oifim g S A w9 a9
At ¥, o IRGASEA ¥, 4@ ARferd fpy MU sfwm aiffes wes & WH F
fifeaa wremafy & faw aratda =&t AT B, A GG O AR ged H U giae,
2 ESCR IS o

Ogre, fesier 30 faawr 2022

-EF. -235-3Fh9-3(T1.).—9Rd & HaUH F < 348 & @S (3) & W H, YRdT = (799
HeeA) aifufe, 2022 (Al 17 G 2022) F1 ST STAE TAUE F WIHFR ¥ LGN Y@ fhan <imm <.

YR & TUE & H q q91 SARATER,
TSAYT TS, TR Hida.



1076 (4)

Hegey TSI, fears 30 faawer 2022

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Central Act No.
II of 1899 in its
application to
the State of
Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Schedule I-A

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 29th September, 2022; assent first published in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
NO.17 oF 2022

THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2022

(Extra-ordinary)” dated the 30th September, 2022.]

An Act further to amend the India Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the State of Madhya

Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the seventy-third year of the Republic
of India as follows—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2022

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (No. II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as principal Act),
shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter

provided.

3. In Schedule I-A to the principal Act,—

()

"(d)

®

(i)

If relating to the development or redevelopment of land or property and/or
construction or reconstruction thereon, by a person or agency other than owner

in article 6, for clause (d) and the Explanation given thereafter, the following
clause and Explanation shall be substituted, namely :—

or lessee of such land or property:

if having the stipulation
that after develop-
ment or redevelopment,
such developed or
redeveloped property or
part thereof shall be

_ held or sold by the

developer, by whatever
name called, either
severally or jointly with
the owner or lessee.

for cases not covered by
(i) above.

Explanation.—For the purpose of

(1

this article, —

"development”  and
"developer” shall have the
same meaning  as
assigned to them
respectively in Section
2(f) of the Madhya
Pradesh Nagar Tatha
Gram Nivesh Adhiniyam,
1973 (No. 23 of 1973)

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 25) on the
market value of only that portion of the entire
land proposed to be developed or redeveloped
which is proportionate to the developed or
redeveloped property to be held or sold by the
developer jointly or severally, or half of the duty
as a conveyance (No. 25) on the market value of
the entire land proposed to be developed or
redeveloped, whichever is higher.

0.25 percent of the market value of the entire
land proposed to be developed or redeveloped,
subject to minimum of one thousand rupees.



Hegyey Ts9H, foier 30 faamr 2022 1076 (5)

and rule 2(1)(b) of the Madhya Pradesh Special
Project and Township
(Development,
Regulation and Control)
Rules, 2011.

(i1) where the developed
property is held or sold
jointly but the share of
the developer is not
expressly mentioned in
the document, the
developer's share shall
be deemed to be 100
percent.”;

(>i1) in article 7, for clause (b) and Explanation I and Explanation II thereafter, the following clause
and Explanations shall be substituted, namely :—

“(b) the pawn, pledge or
hypothecation of .
movable property, where
such pawn, pledge or
hypothecation has been
made by way of security
for the repayment of
money advanced, or to
be advanced by way of
loan or an existing or
future debt, Where debt
or loan amount is:—

@) upto Rs. 50,000 Fifty rupees.
!
(ii) Above Rs. 50,000 but Five hundred rupees.
uptoRs. 5 lakhs

(iii) Above Rs. 5 lakhs but Two thousand rupees.
upto Rs. 10 lakhs

(iv) Above Rs. 10 lakhs but  Ten thousand rupees.
upto Rs. 50 lakhs

v) Above Rs. 50 lakhs 0.25 percent of the amount of loan or debt subject to
a maximum of seven lakh and fifty thousand rupees.
Explanation I.— On an instrument
relating to deposit of title
deeds or pawn or pledge
or hypothecation for
securing repayment of
money advanced or to be
advanced by way of loan
or an existing or future
debt of a higher amount
than one secured by



1076 (6) TeAyey TeTe, Tois 30 faar 2022

earlier instruments of like nature, the duty shall
be chargeable oniy on
the additional amount
in case the proper
stamp duty has been
paid on the earlier
instrument.

Explanation II.— For the
purpose of clause (a) of
this article,
notwithstanding
anything contained in
any judgement, decree
or order of any court or
order of any authority,
any letter, note,
memorandum or
writing relating to the
deposit of title deeds
whether written or
made either before or at
the time when or after
the deposit of title
deeds is effected, and
whether it is in respect
of the security for the
first loan or any
additional loan or loans
taken subsequently,
such letter, note,
memorandum or
writing shall, in the
absence of any separate
agreement or
memorandum of
agreement relating to
deposit of such title
deeds, be deemed to be
an instrument,
evidencing an
agreement relating to

. the deposit of title
deeds.";

(iii) in article 13, in column (2), the following explanation shall be added, namely -

"Explanation.—In case of renewal of a bank guarantee.executed between the same parties for the same
amount, payable duty shall be one thousand rupees, in all other cases, payable duty shall be as
per article 13.";

(iv) in article 25, in column (2), in proviso, for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely—

"(b) When an instrument relates to an assignment of a debt, the duty shall be one thousand rupees"” ;



HeAyes W9, o 30 faam=r 2022

1076 (7)

v)

(a)

0]

(i)

(iii)

(iv)

v)

(vi)

Lease, including an under-
lease or sub-lease and any
agreement to let or sub-let
or any renewal of lease,
other than mining lease—

where the lease purports to be
for a term less than one year.

where the lease purports to be
for a term of one year or
more, but up to five years.

where the lease purports to be
for a term exceeding five
years, but up to ten years.

where the lease purports to be
for a term exceeding ten
years, but up to twenty years.

where the lease purports to be
for a term exceeding twenty
years, but less than thirty
years. |

Where the lease purports to
be for a period of thirty years
or more, Or in perpetuity, or
does not purport to be for a
definite period.

in article 38, for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—

Five hundred rupees.

0.1 percent of the sum of the amount of premium
or money advanced or to be advanced and the
average annual rent reserved, or of the market value
of the property, whichever is higher, subject to a
minimum of five hundred rupees.

0.5 percent of the sum of the amount of premium
or money advanced or to be advanced and the
average annual rent reserved, or of the market value
of the property, whichever is higher, subject to a
minimum of five hundred rupees.

One percent of the sum of the amount of premium
or money advanced or to be advanced and the
average annual rent reserved, or of the market value
of the property whichever is higher, subject to a
minimum of five hundred rupees.

Two percent of the sum, of the amount of premium
or money advanced or to be advanced and the
average annual rent reserved, or of the market value
of the property, whichever is higher, subject to a
minimum of five hundred rupees.

Five percent of the sum of the amount of premium
or money advanced or to be advanced and the
average annual rent reserved, or of the market value
of the property, whichever is higher, subject to a
minimum of five hundred rupees.”.

fris, TR RO qUT SEE ST, RSy gRI WSS FAd EOeE, ST I qfEd aen ge@ieh—2022.



T JIEES www.govtpress.mp.gov.in
Y off T4 dre fFa <1 wear .

[

4

IS 250] e, HieraR, feqis 9 faamR 2025— 91K 18, W 1947

fafy R faurh =+ faam

99T, ﬁ?ﬁ g fgamt 2025

. 8590-159-TFRIT-3T (W.).—HeawRy faum aw =1 Frefaiea ifufem f5g = fie 3 faamer, 2025 #
T TRIGH H1 SANG Wi €1 Il ¥, TAggR TearERo & SHER & ol wehiva fepan < g

nmém%ma%wﬁamm
AR, Gi. e, 3tfafea dia.

499



500 Heyey e, fadie 9 faamr 2025

HeAyAyT Sfafem

THHE Q¢ T 03

YRAT @1 ( Heaua9T H9er ) AfRH=d, 03y

[ faaies 3 foamX, 0% ®Y TGUTA ST F[AA UTA gF; IAfa ' WeAYRI Teiws ( rwrawoer)”’
famier @ foawat, 2034 HT YW TRV i 7. ]

TeEWT TG T o] §T &7 W WA =T ifufm, 24%]% i R deifee q ¥ iffrm.
TR RS % fogwRE a9 § geawey faur-Hved g frafafes w9 # 97 sifufrafia g —

dfam W eiT 2. (R) =9 sifafem =1 dfw Tm YR @ (FeEuey dueE) sfafem, 0%y
.

() UE HEHRY USTA H SUF WhIYH Hi ARG § YA BN

TR T . TN TSU FI AN B B § AR W i, ¢’ (¢]R F HEAE R) (S 3EH
AT EU ww 8 3H% uvEd gel AUt % 9 9 fiE ¥) 9 sed s gvEn susfua Gfa F deifua fear s
TH=a wifkifEm,

94%% T HEAIE

3 T HIMEMA.

ST 2 3. @ bR Syt -F A -

e,
(1) o=ty d wiem (R) ¥, < ‘w9 U F WM W, W= D W@ euw”
()  T=T § H,-

(&) @E (¥) & s9@ve () H FHeam () ¥, v ‘T TR T’ F WH W,
weg ‘Ui gER TuT’’ weifia few S,

(A @ve (8 @) H Iv@Evs (TF) IR () F wH R, FEfafeas swave wnfua
fq wmd, sl —

“(wp) afg dfae gew 9e T B ¥9U
G T qF ©.

() Afe dfae goa 9 <" @ T 1 AR dH 6 e
A TIC 9 3 © W®d ge Hfad o #1 0.3 wiawe. "

(FF) @ve () % W |, fFeafdfaa gve i fee s, el —
“(S)  afe smgen Susy T A T El,—
(W) <ot e fifea € <[ Th §OR TUC e @A g

Yod® €9 EOIN B9 A1 3k 91 & AU
Tk &qdl,



Yy N9, feqish 9 faamR 2025 500 (1)

(2)
(¥)

(W)

(%)

()

(¢)

(R)

() W () & TH TR 9"
i T I T
el & fau

FTHE ¥ H, g () H, 9% TF TR U F WH W, =K 0= T8
T Ty fhQ S,
THT R F, FeW () ¥, UK 'TH TR ¢’ F WH W, I TE §6R
Tuq’ Tefya fe wd,

ITDE 3¢ F @UE (W) F ITEE (V) F N, Frfafad sTavs et g,
C‘Hﬂﬂ?l\:—

(@) sHEE (W) T weE & I <F o1 9ied [ @A
() % siwfa T A A %1 R wfaer.
T Y2 & foau

VT ¥-F -

(@) WS () % 9@ (TF) &, Fem () ¥, W v e 7! F
W, ¥ 58 TR 9T’ Tnfaa few e

(A)  @vE (F) F 3I5@es () H, Hiad () H, g ' 9R T F WA
R, Wk 'Y TR T’ wifug fey S,

(@)  @vE (@) % I9EvE (TF) #, Hied () H, I8 'S TR T9¢’’ & W
R, I ‘U9 TR TUC’’ w@fud fRy S,

(9R)  @ve (@) & s5Es () #H Fed () #, w1 T TR T’ % @
R, v 'S TR F9C’’ Tenfua few S

SR ¥¢ W, FeW (3) #, WERU-TE F, g A F wwEw, Wk 7

W F g H < F STH Gl F s=1 WY =

AT R H -

(TF) @S F F ITEUE (F) #, Haw () ¥, g 'Y TR 39" F WH R,
¥ g gk aq wfua R S

(@) TWIE W FITE@E (W) #, Hod () H, U5 TH TR T F WM
I, v ''uig B9R w9U’’ wifya feu S,

AT o H,-

(W)  @ve (F) H, Had () ¥, U= 'TH T9R w0’ F WH W, g ' TR
Tyu'’ wfua e S,

() WL (W) * I9@IS (]) T, & () H, I 'Y TR T’ F W
™, v Ui R w9T e feu S



500 (2) HeyRY e, feAie 9 faawr 2025

() @ve () #, STEe (Th) H, $ied () #, 9% T TR w0 F w@m
R, 7% 'Y TR T wnfiE R S

(FR)  @vE (¥) #, e () H, I 'TF TR I F WM R, 9 W TR
(9=)  @UE (9) ¥, Hiad () H, T ' TH TR T F WH |, I< 'S R
o'’ Ty feew wmd,
(R0) 3FWT 43 H Haw () §, % T TR ' F WH W, UK T TR
(2%) 3MT=D% &o H, Hiew () H, IR ""T&F TR T’ F WM |, I "3 &R
T’ wnita feg S,

S (R) AW &R A, W W A, FeW () IR ' TH R T F W W, q=w
"9 TR e’ wfia fee s

A, feiew 9 faamr 2025
3h. 8590-159-3FHIH-31 (WI).—HRd F WfIUH F T 348 & U (3) & I §, YRdT W (Heawy
o) srffam, 2025 (FHIR 18 WY 2025) I IS SIgAR THAUA  WUHR ¥ TACgRT Wi fofam < .

ALY & TSI & TH | 77 SR,
AT . T, sifaRea wfea.



Y oTuF, feqie 9 Rydwn 2025

500 (3)

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 18 or 2025
THE INDIAN STAMP (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025

| Received the assent of the Governor on the 3™ September, 2025; assent first published in the ‘“Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 9% September, 2025. |

An Act further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to the
State of Madhya Pradesh.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Madhya Pradesh Amendment)
Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the
Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

2. The Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (II of 1899) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided.

3. In Schedule I-A to the principal Act,-

€)) in article 5, in column (2), for the words "fifty rupees", the words "two
hundred rupees" shall be substituted.

(2) in article 6,-

(i) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (e), in column (2), for the words "one thou-
sand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in clause (gb), for sub-clause (i) and (ii), the following sub-clauses shall
be substituted, namely,-

"(i) If contract value One thousand rupees
is upto fifty lakh rupees.

(i1) If contract value 0.2 percent of contract
exceeds fifty lakh rupees. value subject to a maximum
of rupees ten lakh.".

(111) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
"(h) If not otherwise provided for,-

(i) Where value is involved. Rupee one for every
ten thousand rupees or part
thereof of the value, subject
to a minimum of one thousand
rupees.

(i) For the cases not One thousand rupees.".
covered by (i) above.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Central Act 11
of 1899 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Schedule I-A.



500 (4) YUY o197, fedid o RTawx 2025
3) in article 24, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five housand rupees" shall be substituted.
4 in article 32, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.
®) after sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of article 38, the following sub-clause
shall be added, namely:-

"(iii)  for mining leases not 2% of the whole amount payable
covered by (i) and (ii) or deliverable under such lease.".
above.

(6) in article 41-A,-

@) in sub-clause (i) of clause (a), in column (2), for the words "five
thousand rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(i1) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (a), in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(iii)  in sub-clause (i) of clause (b), in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

@iv) in sub-clause (ii) of clause (b), in column (2), for the words
"one thousand rupees", the words "two thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

@) in article 48, in column (1), in explanation-1, after the word "grandson",

the words "and in the event of death of brother, his wife and children"
shall be added.

(8) in article 49,-

@A) in sub-clause (a) of clause A, in column (2), for the words "two
thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substi-
tuted.

(11) in sub-clause (b) of clause B, in column (2), for the words "one
thousand rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted.

{9) in article 50,-

1) in clause (a), in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(1i) in clause (b), in column (2), for the words "two thousand
rupees” the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(iii) in clause (d), in sub-clause (i), in column (2) for the words
"one thousand rupees" the words "two thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.



TeYe Xrorv4, fedie o Riamvy 2025 500 (3)

@iv) in clause (¢), in column (2) for the words "one hundred rupees”
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

~) in clause (f), in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees"
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(10)  in article 53, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(11)  in article 60, in column (2), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(12)  in article 63, in clause B, in column (2), for the words "One thousand
rupees”, the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

iz, TP T AT WET AREf, AR §RT IS SRg RN, Wit ¥ iR T YhTRa—2025.



