The Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982

Act 9 of 1982

Keyword(s):
Bar Association, Cessation of Practice, Dependants, Fund, Junior Advocate, Retirement

Amendment appended: 17 of 2019

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research
(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These
contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the
accuracy, completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be
available. Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please
contact the relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette
notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting
on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any
liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way
responsible for any loss, damage, or distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the
basis of this document.




THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI
ADHINIYAM, 1982

[No. IX of 1982]

[27th March, 1982]

CONTENTS
Secs.
CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY
1. Short title and extent
2. Definitions
CHAPTER I
CONSTITUTION OF FUND
3. Advocates' Welfare Fund
CHAPTER Il

ESTABLISHMENT OF TRUSTEE COMMITTEE, APPLICATION OF FUND
AND ITS MANAGEMENT, ETC.

4. Establishment of Trustee Committee.

5. Disqualification for being a member of Trusteer@mittee

6. Resignation by nominated members of Trustee Cdtem

7. Filling up of casual vacancy

8. Act of Trustee Committee not to be invalidateg vacancy, defect, etc.
9. Vesting an application of fund.

10. Meetings of Trustee Committee.

11. Travelling and daily allowance to members ou3tee Committee.



12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

Funds, borrowing and investments.
Power and duties of Secretary.

Transfer of certain moneys to the fund

CHAPTER IV
FRAMING OF SCHEMES

Preparation of schemes by the Trustee Committee

CHAPTER V
BAR ASSOCIATION, ITS REGISTRATION, DUTIES AND FUNCT IONS
Recognition and registration of Bar Association
Duties of Bar Association.

CHAPTER VI

STAMPS AND THEIR DISTRIBUTION

17A. Definitions

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

Printing of Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidgtamps

Memo of appearance to bear stamps

Cancellation etc. of the stamps.

Contribution to Advocates Welfare Fund

Value of the stamp shall not be chargeable fitbm clients.

CHAPTER VII

MISCELLANEOUS

Protection of action taken in good faith

Bar of jurisdiction of Civil Courts

Power to make rules.

Repeal.



THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI
ADHINIYAM, 1982

[No. IX of 1982]

[27th March, 1982]

AMENDING ACTS

(i) M.P. Act 48 of 1984 (i) M.P. Act 24 of 1994
(iii) MR Act 35 of 1994 (iv) M.P. Act 9 of 1998
(v) M.P. Act 16 of 1999.

An Act to provide for the constitution of a Welfare Fund for running
various schemes for the social security and welfare of Advocates in the State of
Madhya Pradesh and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislaturehim Thirty-third Year of
the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER |
PRELIMINARY

1. Short title and extent.—(@) This Act may be calledThe Madhya
Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of MadBrmadesh.
2. Definitions. -In this Act unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) "advocate" means a person whose name has katered in the State
roll of advocates prepared and maintained by ther Bauncil of
Madhya Pradesh under Section 17 of the Advocates A861 (25 of
1961) and who is a member of a Bar Association;

(b) “Bar Association” means an association ovadates recognised by the
Bar Council under Section 16;

(c) "Bar Council" means the Bar Council of MadhyaaBesh constituted
under Section 3 of the Advocates Act, 1961 (25 861);



(d) "cessation of practice” means permanent stoppag cessation of
practice by an advocate on account of his retiremateath or any
other reason, as the case may be, duly notifiedh® Bar Council,
and include removal of the name of an advocate fribva State roll
maintained by the Bar Council;

(e) "dependants” means wife, husband, father, mgtbemarried children
or widowed daughter of the advocate and actuallpetedent on him
for maintenance;

(f) 'fund" means the Advocates' Welfare Fund constituted unSlection
3;

(9) "junior advocaté means an advocate who was enrolled as an advocate
by the Bar Council not more than five years ago;

(h) "member of the fundfneans an advocate as defined in clause (a) ;

(1) "retirement” means permanent stoppage of practice as an adeommat
account of advanced age infirmity any time aftetaanting the age of
sixty years and communicated to and recorded byBhe Council;

) "suspension of practicetheans voluntary suspension of practice as an
advocate or suspension by the Bar Council for mrshect;

(k) "Trustee Committee’'means the committee established under Section
4.

CHAPTER Il

CONSTITUTION OF FUND

3. Advocates’ Welfare Fund.{1) With effect from the date of establishment
of Trustee Committee under sub-section (1) of Sert#4, there shall be constituted
a fund called the Advocates' Welfare Fund.

(2) There shall be credited to the fund-

(a) a grant of rupees six lakhs that shall initabe made by the State
Government to the fund;

(b) any amount paid by the Bar Council;



(c) any voluntary donation or contribution made ttoe fund by the Bar
Council of India, a Bar Association, other assoodat or institution,
any advocate or any other person;

(d) any sum borrowed under Section 12;
(e) all moneys credited under Section 18;

(f) all sums received from the Life Insurance Coraton of India on the
death of an advocate under the group insurancehefrhember of the
fund;

(9) any profit, dividend, or refund received fronhet Life Insurance
Corporation of India in respect of the policies gmoup insurance of
the member of the fund;

(h) any interest or dividend or other return on amywestment made of
any part of the fund;

(1) any other amount received by the Trustee Contedt

[(2-a) The amount received by the State Bar Coumailaccount of payment
of Stamp Duty on certificate of enrolment, issuedder Section 22 of the
Advocates Act, 1961 (No. 25 of 1961), shall be dted to the fund and such
credits shall discharge the State Bar Council & litability in respect thereof to
the State Government, under Article 17-A of SchedHA of the Indian Stamp Act,
1899 (No. Il of 1899) as applicable to the StateMddhya Pradesh.]

(3) The sums specified in sub-section (2) shallgsad to, or collected by,
such agencies, at such rate and in such mannerttaméccount of the fund shall be
maintained in such form, as may be prescribed.

CHAPTER IlI

ESTABLISHMENT OF TRUSTEE COMMITTEE, APPLICATION OF FUND
AND ITS MANAGEMENT, ETC.

4. Establishment of Trustee Committee.-) With effect from such date as
the State Government may, by notification, appointthis behalf there shall be
established 'for the purpose of this Act a Trust€eemmittee to be called the
Madhya Pradesh Advocate's Welfare Fund Committee.

(2) The Trustee Committee shall be a body corpotatethe name aforesaid,
having perpetual succession and a common seal, wtWer to acquire, hold and
dispose of property, both movable and immovable amaontract, and shall by the
said name sue and be sued.

(3) The Trustee Committee shall consist of the édeting, namely:—



A.-EX-OFFICIO MEMBERS
(1) the Minister-in-Charge of Law-Chairman ;
(i)  The Minister of State-in-Charge of Law-Vice-@lrman;
(iii) the Chairman, Bar Council-Vice Chairman;
(iv) the Advocate General, Madhya Pradesh;

(v) the Secretary to the Government of Madhya Psidelaw and
Legislative Affairs Department-Secretary;

(vi) Secretary, Bar Council-Joint Secretary (havimg voting rights);
(vii) Treasurer, Bar Council-Treasurer;

(viii) the General Manager of the Local Head Offioé the State Bank of
India or his nominee not below the rank of Regiohdnager;

(ix) the Divisional Manager of the Life Insuranceoforation of India,
Indore or his nominee not below the rank of Depubyvisional
Manager;

(x) the Secretary to the Government of Madhya Psdde Finance
Department '[or his nominee not below the rank afplDty Secretary];

B. NOMINATED MEMBERS
(xi) two members to be nominated by the Bar Council

(xii) two members to be nominated by the State Goweent of whom one
shall be a member of Parliament from the State #md other shall be
a member of the State Legislative Assembly.

(4) A nominated member shall hold office during tlpeasure of the
authority nominating him but the term of his officghall not exceed five years
from the date of his nomination.

(5) Whenever any person is nominated or appointeadaamember of the
Trustee Committee by virtue of the post or officeldh by him, he shall forthwith
cease to be a member of the Trustee Committee enchasing to hold such post or
office.

5. Disqualification for being a member of Trustee @mmittee.-A person
shall be disqualified for being nominated or appeith as, and for being a member
of, the Trustee Committee if he-



(a) becomes of unsound mind; or
(b) is adjudged insolvent; or

(c) is absent without leave of the Trustee Comnatfer more than three
consecutive meetings of the Trustee Committee; or

(d) is a defaulter to the fund (in case he is a rhemof the fund) or has
committed breach of trust; or

(e) is convicted by a criminal Court for an offendavolving moral
turpitude or an economic offence unless such cotigit has been set
aside,

6. Resignation by nominated Members of Trustee Comittee.-A
nominated member may resign his office by a notigewnriting to the Chairman of
the Trustee Committee and it shall be deemed toehlasen accepted as soon as it is
so tendered as to be out of the reach or contratheftenderer.

7. Filling up of casual vacancy.A casual vacancy in the office of a member
may be filled up, as soon as may be and a membemaeminated to fill such
vacancy shall hold office for the unexpired portiafi the term of office of the
member whose place he fills.

8. Act of Trustee Committee not to be invalidated B vacancy, defect,
etc.-No act done or proceedings taken under this Actlor rules made thereunder
by the Trustee Committee shall be invalidated meney reasons of-

(a) any vacancy or defect in the constitution oé thrustee Committee; or

(b) any defect or irregularity in the nomination &fhy person as a
member thereof; or

(c) any defect or irregularity in such act proceeding not affecting the
merits of the case.

9. Vesting an application of Fund.-0) The fund shall vest in, and be held
and applied by the Trustee Committee subject to grevisions, and for the
purposes of this Act.

(2) The Trustee Committee shall administer the futitdough the Secretary.

10. Meetings of Trustee Committee.{) The Trustee Committee shall meet
atleast once in three calendar months or more offefound necessary to transact
business under this Act or the rules made thereunde



(2) Five members of the Trustee Committee shallnfothe quorum for a
meeting of the committee.

(3) The Chairman or in his absence, one of the V&emirman shall preside
over a meeting of the Trustee Committee.

(4) Any matter coming up before a meeting of theu§tee Committee shall
be decided by a majority of the members present aotng at the meeting and, in
the case of an equality of votes the Chairman oce/Chairman, as the case may
be, shall preside over the meetings and shall haeasting vote.

11. Travelling and daily allowance to members of Tustee Committee.-
(1) The non-official members of the Trustee Commettehall be eligible to get
such travelling allowance and daily allowance asynb& prescribed.

(2) Official members shall draw their travelling é&ndaily allowance as
admissible to them by virtue of their office in ti&overnment.

(3) The travelling and daily allowance so payabtethe members shall be
paid out of the fund.

12. Funds, borrowing and investments(l) The Trustee Committee may
borrow, from time to time, any sum required for cgng out the purposes of this
Act.

(2) The Trustee Committee shall deposit all moneysd receipts forming
part of the Fund in any scheduled bank or invese thame in loans to any
corporation owned or controlled by the Central Goweent or the State
Government or in loans floated by the Central Gowaent or the State Government
or in any other manner.

(3) All amounts due and payable under this Act anldexpenditures relating
to the management and administration of the fundlkshe paid out of the fund.

(4) The accounts of the Trustee Committee shallauelited annually by a
Chartered Accountant appointed by it.

(5) As soon as the accounts of the Trustee Committave been audited, the
Trustee Committee shall send a copy thereof togethiéh a copy of the report of
the Chartered Accountant and thereon to the StadeeGhment.

(6) The Trustee Committee shall comply with suchreditions as the State
Government may, after perusal of the audit repofttlve Chartered Accountant
think fit to issue.

13. Power and duties of SecretaryFhe Secretary of the Trustee Committee
shall,-

(a) be the chief executive authority of the Trust€emmittee and be -
responsible for carrying out its decisions;



(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)
(f)

(9)

(h)

()

represent the Trustee Committee in all suitsl amoceedings for and
against the Trustee Committee;

authenticate by his signature all decisions amdtructions of the
Trustee Committee;

operate the bank accounts of the Trustee Cotemifjointly with the
Treasurer;

convene meetings of the Trustee Committee arepare its minutes;

attend the meetings of the Trustee Comndtteith all the necessary
records and information;

maintain such forms, registers and other resords may be
prescribed, from time to time, and do all corresgence relating to
the Trustee Committee;

prepare an annual statement of business traesaby the Trustee
Committee during each financial year ; and

do such other acts, on their behalf, as maydirected by the Trustee
Committee or the Chairman.

14. Transfer of certain moneys to the fund.The Bar Council shall pay to
the fund annually an amount as may be prescribed.

CHAPTER IV

FRAMING OF SCHEMES

15. Preparation of schemes by the Trustee Committe€l) The Trustee
Committee in consultation with the Bar Council ofablhya Pradesh may prepare
scheme for,-

(1)
(i1)

(iii)

(iv)

(v)
(vi)

the group insurance of the advocates;

granting gratuity and/or retirement benefits the advocates enrolled
as participating members of such schemes;

the financial aid to the junior advocates may of stipend on nominal
interest repayable in easy instalments or for ggviguarantee for
facilitating advance of such loan to the junior adates by a
financing institution;

medical insurance of the advocates;
facilitating house building loans to the advoes; and

such other welfare or benefits to the advocabs it deems fit.



(2) The scheme shall be submitted to the State Gowent which shall
publish it and thereafter shall lay it on the tabié the Legislative Assembly for
ten days.

(3) On such publication, the provisions of the seleeshall form part of this
Act.

CHAPTER V
BAR ASSOCIATION, ITS REGISTRATION, DUTIES AND FUNCT IONS

16. Recognition and registration of Bar Association(1) An association of
advocates, known by any name, functioning in anytp# the State may, before a
date to be notified by the Bar Council in this b&haapply for recognition and
registration, to the Bar Council in such form anad @ayment of such annual
subscription, or other fees as the Bar Council magm time to time, determine.

(2) Every such application shall be accompaniedtbg rules or byelaws of
the association, names and addresses of the otfesmers of the association and an
up-to-date list of the members of the associatithowing the name, address, date
of birth, age, date of enrolment and the ordinatgge of practice of each member.

(3) The Bar Council may, after such enquiry as ieeths necessary,
recognise the association and issue a certificdteegistration in such form as it
may specify.

(4) The decision of the Bar Council regarding thecognition and
registration of a Bar Association shall be final.

(2) Every Bar Association shall intimate to therBaouncil,-

(a) any change of the office bearers of the asstemawithin fifteen days
from the date of such change;

(b) any change in the membership including admiasi@and readmissions
within thirty days from the date of such change;

(c) the death, retirement, cessation or suspensgiopractice of any of its
member within thirty days from the date of the happg of the event
or on receiving of the intimation thereof, whicheve later; and

10



(d) such other matters as may be required by Blar Council, from time
to time.

CHAPTER VI
STAMPS AND THEIR DISTRIBUTION
17A. Definitions.-In this chapter,-

(a) "Court" means [* * *] a civil, revenue, criminal, labour @ny other
Court or Tribunal or Authority, by whatever namelleal, acting in
the proceedings of judicial or quasi-judicial naguyr

(b) "memo of appearanceincludes Vakalatnama and any authorisation,
under Order IIl of the First Schedule to the CodeGivil Procedure,
1908 (V of 1908), by whatever name called, for agtior pleading
before a Court.]

18. Printing of Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamps-[1]The
State Government shall on the requisition made hg Bar Council of Madhya
Pradesh, print or cause to be printed in such famd in such manner as may be
prescribed in consultation with the Bar Council,h@dive stamps bearing the words
"Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamp" otthalue of 4[four rupees and
ten rupees] for being supplied to the Bar Counaoit @listribution and sale on [* * *
* *] commission basis.

(2) Any Bar Association or Stamp Vendor who pursha Adhivakta Kalyan
Nidhi Stamps worth-

(a) one thousand rupees or more from the counterthef Bar Council
shall be entitled for a commission of ten percemnd

(b) less than one thousand rupees or through PoSElvice shall be
entitled for a commission of five percent.]

19. Memo of appearance to bear stamps(1) A memo of appearance filed
in any Court other than the High Courts shall b¢lae Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta
Kalyan Nidhi Stamp of the value dfFour rupees].

(2) A memo of appearance filed in the High CourtaBhbear the Madhya
Pradesh Adhivakta Nidhi Stamp of the value®ffen rupees].

(3) It shall be duty of the Advocates to affix ohet memo of appearance
stamps under sub-sections (1) and (2) and no Cowluding the High Court shall
accept such memo of appearance unless it is sostdm

20. Cancellation etc. of the stampsEvery stamp so affixed on the memo of
appearance shall be cancelled in a manner providetthe Court Fees Act, 1870 (7
of 1870) for cancellation of court fee stamps.

21. Contribution to Advocates Welfare Fund.Net proceeds received from
the distribution and sale of the Madhya Pradesh i&dkta Kalyan Nidhi Stamps

11



shall be contributed by the Bar Council to the MgdhPradesh Adhivakta Kalyan
Nidhi.

22. Value of the stamp shall not be chargeable fronthe clients.No
advocate shall charge the value of the Madhya Pshdadhivakta Kalyan Nidhi
Stamps from any client and contravention thereofalshbe deemed to be a
misconduct.

CHAPTER VII
MISCELLANEOUS

23. Protection of action taken in good faith.€1) No suit, prosecution or
other legal proceedings shall lie against any par$ser anything which is in good
faith done or intended to be done in pursuance s tAct or any rule made
thereunder.

(2) No suit or other legal proceedings shall lie aagst the Trustee
Committee or the Bar Council for any damage causedikely to be caused by
anything which is in good faith done or intended ie done in pursuance of this
Act or any rule made thereunder.

24. Bar of jurisdiction of Civil Courts.-No Civil Court shall have
jurisdiction to settle, decide or deal with any gti®n or to determine any matter
which is by or under this Act required to be settlalecided or dealt with or to be
determined by the Trustee Committee or the Bar Qoilun

25. Power to make rules.-{) The Trustee Committee may, with the
previous approval of the State Government, by notfion, make rules for the
purpose of carrying into effect the provisions big Act :

Provided that before giving approval to the rulesmrmhed by the Trustee
Committee, the State Government shall consult tlae 8ouncil.

(2) All rules made under this Act shall be laid tre table of the Legislative
Assembly.

26. Repeal.The Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhyade$BA81
(No. 14 of 1981) is hereby repealed.

*kkkkkkx

12



¢

_ Afumg i ¥ arwle @
E F TR g (fem s
o) & Jum ¥ agma. FAIE
. 2-22-peirwTE wesas fa Q.
o, i 30-5-2000."

'q—\i% m‘ i m@i
| ARAFG17/2002."

vt & wefdra

S |- F ] - Ty, OHER, A 1 9ed 200599 11 T 1926

mgl',%z'mzm'aﬁzoos
FHIT 2{2%3?/9@/04.-{5%@%% a1 F7 fraforflag sriufran S w fens 28-12-2004 &

TSI o} SR TR & T ¥, g e ) A % o i s 2.

1 ‘ .
wHflamg & Tsau & AW § T2 FRIER,
fawen fig &y, 3v-wfum.




»

Mmﬁaﬁ_l ﬁqaﬁzods _
it
. (PRI 13 §92004) _

) aﬂmaﬁmwﬁfﬁ(m)wﬁlﬁw 2004 -
maﬁmwﬁﬁmﬁﬁm 1982 & T gmifig w1 ¥g rfuiam.

wm%wﬁﬁﬁ'mﬁﬁmdgﬁ g Prerfesfiga wv 8 a8 stffaartia

wamamger 1. (1) 'mammma%Hmmmmwﬁﬁz{m)aﬁxﬁm
2004 &. . )

(2) %mﬁmm%ﬁﬂmésqﬁiﬁm

w18 gTEREE. 2. mwmﬁtmwﬁﬁmfaﬁm(mgmmsz (3 38¥ 38F T I
sffiam, & am & AR ¥) Fum 18 ¥ w51 TR oE G TR F i s g
T T o= T s R S,

w19 & EER, . 3. l{ﬁﬂf@lﬁ'ﬂqaﬁmlgﬁf,-
(%) ﬁﬂm(1)%W‘WG@”%WWW“WE@"WWW.

@) svuw(2) ﬁﬂwaﬂmﬁ’ ¥ SO TR =i TR el T T,

. uAE, ReiE ) Rl 2004

mzzzl—wm/m;m%dﬁﬂm’%mﬁﬁhus%m(é)%a@mﬁ'mﬁmﬁaﬁrammw T
Ffy (wwirer) arfufam, 2004(;5.13ﬂ2004)m#ﬁaﬁﬁaaﬁww%;®m&wmmﬁmmw%.

f“\ ) | ‘ mﬁ%mﬁ%m%maﬁmﬁﬁ,
_ -, : famen Rig &7, 9-ufm.




¥

2 (16)

sdarg o9, R tseaf 2005 .

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 13 of 2004) -

THE CHHATTISGARH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI
(SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2004

An aét further to smend the Cbhattisparh Adhivakta Kaiyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982,

Be it enacted by the Chhamsgarh Legislature in the fifty fifth Year of the Republic of

India as follows:-
L]

1. (1 This Act may be called the Chhattisparh Adhlvakta Kalyan Nidhi
(Sanshodhan), Adhiniyam, 2004.

(2} ©  Itshall come into force from the date of its pubiication in official gazette,
2 Section 18 of the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (Na. 9 of
1982} (hereinafler referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “Four Rupees & Ten
- Rupees” the words “Ten Rupees & Twenty Five Rupees” shal be substituted.

3 In section 19 of the Principal Act,-

- . In sub-sectmn (l) for the words “Four Rupees the words “Ten Rupecs™
shall be subst:tutcd :

(i) In sub-section (2} for the words “Ten Rupces the w0rds “Fwenty Five
Rupees” sha!! be substituted. -

-t

Short titie and

commencement.
Amendment of
Section 18,
Amendment of
Section 19.

ém,wmémm.mmmmm,mﬁmﬂ yfEg a1 g 2005




A HHH
“Befierre/F/09/2013-2015.”

“faaee U ¥ aeid S YoR S
g g (T e e ) F g
2 ATHA. FHF S.2-22-SAEG
e [ 38 T @ fuas, fEw
30-05-2001."

(TFTHT)
TR | gHite

FAF 136 ] TR, AaR, f3aiE 7 ot 2018 — =1 17, 76 1940

fafyr ik fourht #rf faum

T, & 7 @i 2018

FHIE 3485 /S, 63/21-31 /0T, /8. 71, [ 18, — Dol faam w1 FrmfoRaa siffaam i w famis 03-04-2018F1
TSI il AT WA B = 2, TgE HaaTaRuT il SHER & fore wanTore foan s 2.

TATTE & T & AH H A1 SRR,
wefty AR g, arfefea afeE.

271



172

Teltee TeaE, a7 @i 2018

dfagm =m am
WIH.

I 18 HT HIHA.

HTO 19 F1 FEiE.

BeleRTg ATAaH

(SFHT 9 5 2018)

SIaTe Aftraw Foaor A (F@she)  erfufeas, 2018

gwtwTg aftasan wear faf aftfoem, 1982 (. 9 & 1982) #i it @wifta

wH 2q Attt

WRA TR & Ia0d a4 d g iae Aurmmeea g fefaiad =a # 7g sfufaama 2t -
(1) Tz ftfram s Afteea wem faf (d@eye) sftfeas, 2018 Faam@m.

(2) TE AU H 39 T il AR | WP 2R

el arftraern eamor faft erftrfaam, 1982 (6. 99 1982) (1 70 o0 vwaTe go s
Fwud fafde ) i ur 18 8, v “29 504 vd gt w0 F W 0, v U= E0d uh
U= v At e,

Tt afefm $it am 194, -

(TF)  I9-9R (1), 7= “TWEA” F AR, I T e nfaeaniud R e, @R

(=) I0-URT (2) H, 7= ‘U= v % e W, e o= vud T niaeentue R e

w7 v, fami 7 @i 2018

FHIE 3485 /21, 63/21-31/UTE. [B.71./18.— HRA F AU F ATHE 348 F 0L (3) F e # 36 Fowm Firaweers
AT AT 7-4-2018 1 SIS FFATE T F WAFHR H UAGERT W19 a1 e 2.

ST F TSI & A E G4 ATEAER,
T FAR I1ge, afafa afea.



B e TaH, fa i 7 i 2018 272 (1)

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
Section 18.

Amendment
Section 19,

of

CHHATTISGARH ACT
(No. 9 of 2018)

THE CHHATTISGARH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 2018

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982
(No.9 of 1982).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of
India, as follows :-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2018.

) [t shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In Section 18 of the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982

(No. 9 of 1982), ( hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words
“Ten Rupees and Twenty Five Rupees”, the words * Twenty-five Rupees and
Fifty Rupees ™ shall be substituted.

3. In Section 19 of the Principal Act,-

(i in sub-section (1), for the words “ Ten Rupees ”, the words “Twenty-five
Rupees” shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words *Twenty-five Rupees”, the words
“Fifty Rupees” shall be substituted.

FeITer, GEUT A1 o |, Sieg ST e Eed, T § gfEe qun v - 2018.



TH ATUEE www.govtpressmp.nic.in |
+ft oA s fFn S w €

HHE 360] M, wER, fEAis 24 3T 2019—9K 2, T 1941

fafy ik faurt & favm

i, f&Aie 24 STTE 2019

F. 14002-231-TFRIG-31(W. ) -31fe. —Aeawew faum @ # frafafaa sfufem g | feae 22 T
2019 FY TUE WEISA HI AR W & TH T, W, SR w SR ¥ oy R S .

qeAgRy % ToUUE % T Y AT SMQWIER,
T ared, stfafed afed,

719



720 ey Toas, feAid 24 TG 2019

weagayr st
HHE 9 T 0N
HETT ST heATuT T ((Heier ) sfufEE, Ro%R.

[ faies ] T, R0%R Y T SR WK g8, wﬁ“qmm(m)"ﬁm Q¢ 3,
20%% Y WIW AR W@ W 1

e aifuEs wean fif s, 9]¢3 WY T wehfd wE ¥ AfaFEm.
mw%aﬂﬁaﬁﬁmﬂﬁﬂﬁm—ﬁ%ﬁmﬁmﬁmﬂmﬁﬁaﬁmﬁaﬁ —
i . 2w e & i A AR S Fer (o) AAfufRm, 3023 R,

gt 8¢ W7 2 TR e Fe fifd s, 236 (I < W R3eR) (S 3ad TF TER
whrer. q\aafuﬁw%qmﬁﬁﬁ\z%)aﬁmzcﬁ,m(z)ﬁ,w“aﬂﬂmaﬂimm”%
wmm,w“m?ﬁvm_aﬁuﬁm“wﬁammﬁ.

R L 3. g st F oA R §—

' (TF) wem(z)ﬁ,v@“aﬁam"ﬂ:www“aﬁﬁam”wﬁama@

(@)  STEE () H, 1R e T ¥ A W, W CE e oy ey S,
g, feish 24 3T 2019

. 14002-231-SFRIE-HA(T.) - — 9@ F  HfTHr ¥ T 348 F WS (3) F ATH i weyey
sfasa Feam ffu (ehe) afufEm, 2019 (FHiF 17 T 2019) T ST AR ToATNA F wfywr 9
eI WY R ST €

HeTRs ¥ TSATE ¥ AH Y q«1 SR,
TSt Ared, i dfea.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
NO. 17 or 2019

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 2019

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 22nd August, 2019; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 24th August, 2019.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Seventieth year of the Republic of
India as follows:—

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2019.

Amendment of 2. Tn Section 18 of the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 9

Section 18. of 1982), (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty

rupees and fifty rupees”, the words “forty rupees and hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 3. In Section 19 of the principal Act,—
Section 19.
6] in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “forty rupees” shall

be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “hundred rupees” shall
be substituted; '

W,Wwamwm,mmmﬁaw, siiaret @ fsa ao WHRE—2019.



	THE CHHATTISGARH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI ADHINIYAM
	view-casepdf
	FileCS



