
 
 
 
 
 

 
The Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 

 

Act 9 of 1982 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Keyword(s): 

Bar Association, Cessation of Practice, Dependants, Fund, Junior Advocate, Retirement 
 
Amendment appended: 17 of 2019 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research 

(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These 

contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the 

accuracy, completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be 

available.  Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please 

contact the relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette 

notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting 

on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any 

liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way 

responsible for any loss, damage, or distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the 

basis of this document. 

 



1 

 

 

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI 

ADHINIYAM, 1982 

[No. IX of 1982] 

 

[27th March, 1982] 

 

 

CONTENTS 

Secs.            

CHAPTER I  

PRELIMINARY 

1. Short t i t le and extent  

2. Defini t ions  

CHAPTER II  

CONSTITUTION OF FUND 

3. Advocates' Welfare Fund  

CHAPTER III  

ESTABLISHMENT OF TRUSTEE COMMITTEE, APPLICATION OF FUND 
AND ITS MANAGEMENT, ETC. 

4. Establ ishment of Trustee Committee.   

5. Disqual i f icat ion for  being a member of Trustee Committee  

6. Resignation by nominated members of Trustee Committee  

7. Fi l l ing up of casual  vacancy   

8. Act of  Trustee Committee not to be inval idated by vacancy, defect, etc.   

9. Vesting an appl icat ion of fund.   

10. Meetings of Trustee Committee.   

11. Travel l ing and dai ly al lowance to members of Trustee Committee.   



2 

 

12. Funds, borrowing and investments.   

13. Power and duties of Secretary.    

14. Transfer of certain moneys to the fund   

 

CHAPTER IV 

FRAMING OF SCHEMES 

15. Preparat ion of schemes by the Trustee Committee.   

CHAPTER V 

BAR ASSOCIATION, ITS REGISTRATION, DUTIES AND FUNCT IONS 

16. Recognit ion and registrat ion of Bar Associat ion  

17. Duties of Bar Associat ion.   

CHAPTER VI 

STAMPS AND THEIR DISTRIBUTION 

17A. Defini t ions  

18. Print ing of Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamps    

19. Memo of appearance to bear stamps  

20. Cancel lat ion etc. of the stamps.   

21. Contr ibut ion to Advocates Welfare Fund  

22. Value of the stamp shal l  not be chargeable from the cl ients.   

CHAPTER VII  

MISCELLANEOUS 

23. Protect ion of  act ion taken in good faith  

24. Bar of jur isdict ion of Civi l  Courts   

25. Power to make rules.   

26. Repeal.   

 

 

 



3 

 

 

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI 

ADHINIYAM, 1982  

[No. IX of 1982] 

[27th March, 1982] 

 

AMENDING ACTS 

( i )  M.P. Act 48 of 1984  ( i i )  M.P. Act 24 of 1994 

( i i i )  MR Act 35 of 1994  ( iv) M.P. Act 9 of 1998 

(v) M.P. Act 16 of  1999. 

An Act to provide for the consti tution of a Welfare Fund for running 
various schemes for the social  security and welfare of  Advocates in the State of  
Madhya Pradesh and for matters connected therewith or  incidental  thereto.  

Be i t  enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legis lature in the Thirty-third Year of 
the Republ ic of India as fol lows :— 

 

CHAPTER I  

PRELIMINARY 

1.  Short t i t le and extent .—(1) This Act may be cal led The Madhya 
Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982. 

(2) It  extends to the whole of the State of Madhya Pradesh. 

2. Def ini t ions. -In this Act unless the context otherwise requires,- 

(a)     "advocate" means a person whose name has been entered in the State 
rol l  of advocates prepared and maintained by the Bar Counci l  of 
Madhya Pradesh under Section 17 of the Advocates Act,  1961 (25 of 
1961) and who is a member of a Bar Associat ion; 

(b)    “Bar Associat ion" means an associat ion of advocates recognised by the 
Bar Counci l  under Section 16; 

(c) "Bar Counci l"  means the Bar Counci l  of Madhya Pradesh consti tuted 
under Section 3 of the Advocates Act, 1961 (25 of 1961);  

 



4 

 

(d) "cessation of pract ice" means permanent stoppage or cessation of 
pract ice by an advocate on account of his ret irement, death or  any 
other reason, as the case may be, duly noti f ied to the Bar Counci l ,  
and include removal of the name of an advocate from the State rol l  
maintained by the Bar Counci l ;  

(e) "dependants" means wife, husband, father, mother, unmarried chi ldren 
or widowed daughter of the advocate and actual ly dependent on him 
for maintenance; 

 ( f)  ' fund" means the Advocates' Welfare Fund consti tuted under Sect ion 
3; 

(g)  " junior advocate" means an advocate who was enrol led as an advocate 
by the Bar Counci l  not more than f ive years ago;  

(h) "member of the fund" means an advocate as defined in clause (a) ;  

( i )  "ret irement" means permanent stoppage of pract ice as an advocate on 
account of advanced age inf irmity any t ime after attaining the age of 
sixty years and communicated to and recorded by the Bar Counci l ;  

( j ) " suspension of pract ice" means voluntary suspension of pract ice as an 
advocate or suspension by the Bar Counci l  for misconduct;  

(k)  "Trustee Committee" means the committee establ ished under Section 
4. 

CHAPTER II  

CONSTITUTION OF FUND 

 

3. Advocates’ Welfare Fund.-(1) With effect from the date of establ ishment 
of Trustee Committee under sub-section (1)  of Section 4,  there shal l  be consti tuted 
a fund cal led the Advocates' Welfare Fund. 

 

(2) There shal l  be credited to the fund- 

(a) a grant of rupees six lakhs that shal l  ini t ial ly be made by the State 
Government to the fund; 

(b) any amount paid by the Bar Counci l ;  

 

 



5 

 

(c) any voluntary donation or contr ibut ion made to the fund by the Bar 
Counci l  of India, a Bar Associat ion, other association or inst i tut ion, 
any advocate or  any other person;  

(d) any sum borrowed under Section 12;  

(e) al l  moneys credited under Section 18;  

(f)  al l  sums received from the Life Insurance Corporat ion of India on the 
death of an advocate under the group insurance of the member of the 
fund; 

(g)  any prof i t ,  dividend, or refund received from the Life Insurance 
Corporat ion of India in respect of the pol ic ies in group insurance of 
the member of the fund; 

(h) any interest or dividend or other return on any investment made of  
any part of the fund; 

( i)  any other amount received by the Trustee Committee. 

[(2-a) The amount received by the State Bar Counci l on account of payment 
of Stamp Duty on cert i f icate of enrolment, issued under Section 22 of the 
Advocates Act , 1961 (No. 25 of 1961), shal l  be credited to the fund and such 
credits shal l  discharge the State Bar Counci l  of i ts l iabi l i ty in respect thereof to 
the State Government,  under Art icle 17-A of  Schedule I-A of the Indian Stamp Act, 
1899 (No. I I of 1899) as appl icable to the State of Madhya Pradesh.] 

(3) The sums specif ied in sub-section (2) shal l  be paid to, or col lected by, 
such agencies, at such rate and in such manner, and the account of  the fund shal l  be 
maintained in such form, as may be prescribed. 

 

CHAPTER III  

ESTABLISHMENT OF TRUSTEE COMMITTEE, APPLICATION OF FUND 
AND ITS MANAGEMENT, ETC. 

4. Establ ishment of  Trustee Committee.-(1) With effect from such date as 
the State Government may, by noti f icat ion, appoint in this behalf there shal l  be 
establ ished 'for the purpose of this Act a Trustee Committee to be cal led the 
Madhya Pradesh Advocate's Welfare Fund Committee. 

(2) The Trustee Committee shal l  be a body corporate by the name aforesaid, 
having perpetual succession and a common seal, with power to acquire, hold and 
dispose of property, both movable and immovable and to contract , and shal l  by the 
said name sue and be sued. 

(3) The Trustee Committee shal l  consist of the fol lowing, namely:— 

 



6 

 

A.-EX-OFFICIO MEMBERS 

( i )  the Minister-in-Charge of Law-Chairman ;  

( i i ) The Minister of State-in-Charge of Law-Vice-Chairman; 

( i i i ) the Chairman, Bar Counci l -Vice Chairman; 

( iv)  the Advocate General,  Madhya Pradesh; 

(v)  the Secretary to the Government of Madhya Pradesh, Law and 
Legislat ive Affairs Department-Secretary;  

(vi)  Secretary,  Bar Counci l -Joint Secretary (having no voting r ights);  

(vi i )  Treasurer, Bar Counci l -Treasurer; 

(vi i i )  the General Manager of the Local Head Off ice of the State Bank of 
India or  his nominee not below the rank of Regional Manager; 

( ix) the Divisional Manager of the Life Insurance Corporat ion of India, 
Indore or his nominee not below the rank of Deputy Divisional  
Manager;  

(x) the Secretary to the Government of Madhya Pradesh, Finance 
Department '[or his nominee not below the rank of Deputy Secretary];  

 

B. NOMINATED MEMBERS 

(xi)  two members to be nominated by the Bar Counci l;  

(xi i )  two members to be nominated by the State Government of whom one 
shal l  be a member of Parl iament from the State and the other shal l  be 
a member of the State Legislat ive Assembly.  

(4) A nominated member shal l  hold off ice during the pleasure of the 
authori ty nominating him but the term of his off ice shal l not exceed f ive years 
from the date of  his nomination. 

(5) Whenever any person is nominated or appointed as a member of the 
Trustee Committee by virtue of the post or off ice held by him, he shal l  forthwith 
cease to be a member of the Trustee Commit tee on his ceasing to hold such post or  
off ice. 

5. Disqual i f icat ion for being a member of Trustee Committee.-A person 
shal l  be disqual i f ied for being nominated or appointed as, and for  being a member 
of, the Trustee Committee i f  he- 

 

 



7 

 

(a) becomes of  unsound mind; or 

(b) is adjudged insolvent; or 

(c) is absent without leave of the Trustee Committee for  more than three 
consecutive meetings of the Trustee Commit tee; or 

(d) is a defaulter to the fund ( in case he is a member of  the fund) or has 
committed breach of trust;  or 

(e) is convicted by a cr iminal Court for an offence involving moral 
turpitude or an economic offence unless such convict ion has been set  
aside, 

6. Resignation by nominated Members of  Trustee Committee.-A 
nominated member may resign his off ice by a notice in wri t ing to the Chairman of 
the Trustee Committee and i t  shall  be deemed to have been accepted as soon as it  is 
so tendered as to be out of the reach or control of the tenderer.  

7. Fi l l ing up of  casual vacancy.-A casual vacancy in the off ice of  a member 
may be f i l led up, as soon as may be and a member so nominated to f i l l  such 
vacancy shal l  hold of f ice for the unexpired port ion of the term of off ice of the 
member whose place he f i l ls. 

8. Act of  Trustee Committee not to be inval idated by vacancy, defect, 
etc.-No act done or proceedings taken under this Act or the rules made thereunder 
by the Trustee Commit tee shal l  be inval idated merely by reasons of- 

 

(a) any vacancy or defect in the consti tut ion of the Trustee Committee; or 

(b) any defect or i rregulari ty in the nomination of any person as a 
member thereof; or  

(c)      any defect or i rregulari ty in such act  or proceeding not affect ing the 
merits of the case. 

9. Vesting an appl icat ion of  Fund.-(1) The fund shal l  vest in,  and be held 
and appl ied by the Trustee Committee subject to the provisions, and for the 
purposes of this Act.  

(2) The Trustee Committee shal l  administer the fund, through the Secretary.  

10. Meetings of  Trustee Committee.-(1) The Trustee Committee shal l  meet 
at least once in three calendar months or more often i f  found necessary to transact  
business under this Act or the rules made thereunder.  

 

 

 



8 

 

(2) Five members of the Trustee Committee shal l  form the quorum for  a 
meeting of the commit tee. 

(3) The Chairman or in his absence, one of the Vice Chairman shal l  preside 
over a meeting of the Trustee Committee. 

(4) Any matter coming up before a meeting of the Trustee Committee shal l  
be decided by a majori ty of the members present and voting at the meeting and, in 
the case of an equal i ty of votes the Chairman or Vice-Chairman, as the case may 
be, shal l  preside over the meetings and shal l  have a cast ing vote.  

11. Travel l ing and dai ly al lowance to members of  Trustee Committee.- 
(1) The non-off icial  members of the Trustee Committee shal l  be el igible to get 
such travel l ing al lowance and dai ly al lowance as may be prescribed. 

(2) Off icial  members shal l  draw their travel l ing and dai ly al lowance as 
admissible to them by virtue of their off ice in the Government.  

(3) The travel l ing and dai ly al lowance so payable to the members shal l  be 
paid out of the fund. 

12. Funds, borrowing and investments.-(1) The Trustee Committee may 
borrow, from t ime to t ime, any sum required for carrying out the purposes of this  
Act.  

(2) The Trustee Committee shal l  deposit  a l l  moneys and receipts forming 
part of the Fund in any scheduled bank or invest the same in loans to any 
corporat ion owned or control led by the Central Government or the State 
Government or in loans f loated by the Central Government or the State Government 
or in any other manner. 

(3) Al l  amounts due and payable under this Act and al l  expenditures relat ing 
to the management and administrat ion of the fund shal l  be paid out of the fund. 

(4) The accounts of the Trustee Committee shal l  be audited annual ly by a 
Chartered Accountant appointed by i t .  

(5) As soon as the accounts of the Trustee Committee have been audited, the 
Trustee Committee shal l  send a copy thereof together with a copy of the report of  
the Chartered Accountant and thereon to the State Government.  

(6) The Trustee Committee shal l  comply with such direct ions as the State 
Government may, after perusal of the audit  report of the Chartered Accountant 
think f i t  to issue. 

13. Power and duties of  Secretary.-The Secretary of the Trustee Committee 
shal l , - 

(a) be the chief executive authori ty of  the Trustee Committee and be - 
responsible for carrying out i ts decisions;  



9 

 

(b) represent the Trustee Committee in al l  suits and proceedings for and 
against the Trustee Committee;  

(c) authenticate by his signature al l  decisions and instruct ions of the 
Trustee Committee;  

(d) operate the bank accounts of the Trustee Committee joint ly with the 
Treasurer; 

(e) convene meetings of the Trustee Committee and prepare i ts minutes; 

(f)      attend the meetings of the Trustee Committee with al l  the necessary 
records and information; 

(g)  maintain such forms, registers and other records as may be 
prescribed, from t ime to t ime, and do al l  correspondence relat ing to 
the Trustee Committee; 

(h) prepare an annual statement of business transacted by the Trustee 
Committee during each f inancial year ;  and 

( i)  do such other acts, on their behalf , as may be directed by the Trustee 
Committee or the Chairman. 

14. Transfer of  certain moneys to the fund.-The Bar Counci l  shal l  pay to 
the fund annual ly an amount as may be prescribed. 

 

CHAPTER IV 

FRAMING OF SCHEMES 

15. Preparation of  schemes by the Trustee Committee.-(1) The Trustee 
Committee in consultat ion with the Bar Counci l  of Madhya Pradesh may prepare 
scheme for,- 

( i )  the group insurance of  the advocates;  

( i i ) granting gratuity and/or ret irement benefi ts to the advocates enrol led 
as part icipat ing members of such schemes; 

( i i i ) the f inancial aid to the junior advocates by way of st ipend on nominal 
interest repayable in easy instalments or for giving guarantee for 
faci l i tat ing advance of such loan to the junior advocates by a 
f inancing inst i tut ion;  

( iv)  medical insurance of  the advocates;  

(v)  faci l i tat ing house bui lding loans to the advocates; and 

(vi)  such other welfare or  benefi ts to the advocates as i t  deems f i t .  



10 

 

(2) The scheme shal l  be submitted to the State Government which shal l  
publ ish i t  and thereafter shal l  lay i t  on the table of the Legislat ive Assembly for 
ten days. 

(3) On such publ icat ion, the provisions of the scheme shal l  form part of this 
Act.  

 

CHAPTER V 

BAR ASSOCIATION, ITS REGISTRATION, DUTIES AND FUNCT IONS 

16. Recognit ion and registrat ion of Bar Associat ion.-(1) An associat ion of 
advocates, known by any name, funct ioning in any part of  the State may, before a 
date to be noti f ied by the Bar Counci l  in this behalf, apply for recognit ion and 
registrat ion, to the Bar Counci l  in such form and on payment of such annual 
subscript ion, or other fees as the Bar Counci l  may, from t ime to t ime, determine. 

(2) Every such appl icat ion shal l  be accompanied by the rules or byelaws of  
the associat ion, names and addresses of the off ice-bearers of the associat ion and an 
up-to-date l ist  of the members of the associat ion showing the name, address, date 
of birth, age, date of enrolment and the ordinary place of pract ice of each member.  

(3) The Bar Counci l  may, after such enquiry as i t  deems necessary,  
recognise the associat ion and issue a cert i f icate of registrat ion in such form as i t  
may specify.  

(4) The decision of  the Bar Counci l  regarding the recognit ion and 
registrat ion of a Bar Associat ion shal l  be f inal. 

 

 (2) Every Bar Associat ion shal l  int imate to the Bar Counci l , -  

(a) any change of the off ice bearers of the associat ion within f i f teen days 
from the date of  such change; 

(b) any change in the membership including admissions and readmissions 
within thirty days from the date of such change; 

(c) the death, ret irement,  cessation or suspension of pract ice of any of  i ts 
member within thirty days from the date of the happening of the event 
or on receiving of the int imation thereof, whichever is later; and 

 

 

 

 



11 

 

(d)     such other matters as may be required by the Bar Counci l ,  from t ime 
to t ime. 

CHAPTER VI 

STAMPS AND THEIR DISTRIBUTION   

17A. Def ini t ions. -In this chapter,- 

(a) "Court"  means [* * *]  a civi l ,  revenue, cr iminal, labour or any other 
Court or Tribunal or Authori ty, by whatever name cal led, act ing in 
the proceedings of judicial  or quasi-judicial  nature ;  

(b) "memo of appearance" includes Vakalatnama and any authorisat ion, 
under Order II I of the First Schedule to the Code of Civi l  Procedure, 
1908 (V of 1908), by whatever name cal led, for act ing or pleading 
before a Court.]  

18. Print ing of  Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamps.-[1]The 
State Government shal l  on the requisi t ion made by the Bar Counci l  of Madhya 
Pradesh, print or cause to be printed in such form and in such manner as may be 
prescribed in consultat ion with the Bar Counci l ,  adhesive stamps bearing the words 
"Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamp" of the value of 4[four rupees and 
ten rupees] for being suppl ied to the Bar Counci l  for distr ibut ion and sale on [* * * 
* *]  commission basis. 

 (2) Any Bar Associat ion or Stamp Vendor who purchases Adhivakta Kalyan 
Nidhi Stamps worth- 

(a) one thousand rupees or more from the counter of the Bar Counci l 
shal l  be enti t led for a commission of ten percent ; and 

(b) less than one thousand rupees or through Postal Service shal l  be 
enti t led for a commission of f ive percent.]  

19. Memo of  appearance to bear stamps. -(1) A memo of appearance f i led 
in any Court other than the High Courts shal l  bear the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta 
Kalyan Nidhi Stamp of the value of 8[Four rupees].  

(2) A memo of appearance f i led in the High Court shal l  bear the Madhya 
Pradesh Adhivakta Nidhi Stamp of the value of 9[Ten rupees].  

(3) It  shal l  be duty of the Advocates to aff ix on the memo of appearance 
stamps under sub-sect ions (1) and (2) and no Court including the High Court shal l  
accept such memo of appearance unless i t  is so stamped.] 

20. Cancel lat ion etc. of  the stamps.-Every stamp so aff ixed on the memo of  
appearance shal l  be cancel led in a manner provided in the Court Fees Act,  1870 (7 
of 1870) for cancel lat ion of court fee stamps. 

21. Contribut ion to Advocates Welfare Fund.-Net proceeds received from 
the distr ibut ion and sale of the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamps 



12 

 

shal l  be contr ibuted by the Bar Counci l  to the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan 
Nidhi.  

22. Value of  the stamp shal l  not be chargeable f rom the cl ients.-No 
advocate shal l  charge the value of the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi 
Stamps from any cl ient and contravention thereof shal l  be deemed to be a 
misconduct.  

 

CHAPTER VII 

MISCELLANEOUS 

23. Protect ion of  act ion taken in good faith.-(1) No suit ,  prosecution or 
other legal proceedings shal l  l ie against any person for anything which is in good 
faith done or intended to be done in pursuance of this Act or any rule made 
thereunder.  

(2) No suit  or other legal proceedings shal l  l ie against the Trustee 
Committee or the Bar Counci l  for any damage caused or l ikely to be caused by 
anything which is in good faith done or intended to be done in pursuance of this 
Act or any rule made thereunder.  

24. Bar of  jurisdict ion of  Civi l  Courts.- No Civi l  Court  shal l  have 
jur isdict ion to sett le, decide or deal with any question or to determine any matter 
which is by or under this Act required to be sett led, decided or dealt  with or to be 
determined by the Trustee Committee or the Bar Counci l .  

25. Power to make rules.-(1) The Trustee Committee may, with the 
previous approval of the State Government, by noti ficat ion, make rules for the 
purpose of carrying into effect the provisions of this Act :  

Provided that before giving approval to the rules framed by the Trustee 
Committee, the State Government shal l  consult  the Bar Counci l .  

(2) Al l  rules made under this Act shal l  be laid on the table of the Legislat ive 
Assembly.  

26. Repeal.-The Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi  Adhyadesh, 1981 
(No. 14 of 1981) is hereby repealed. 

 

******** 



,. 

• ;..,:_. 
. ·(;. 

.. .. . 
\. ... "'.~ ..... , ... ·•. 

~~ W2 ~ 3Fii'TII m, 
~ ~ ';j1J<( ~ (f.Rr m, 
~)~ffl~3fjlr<!, ~ 
.ft. 2-22-§§Tiitl'I~ -.r,;Jc/38 fu. it. 
f'R'!B, ~ 30-5-2001." 

( 3lfliURUi ) 

~~ Qcfilr.lld 

. lJ'I;!{, ~. ~ 1 ~ 2005-'TT'! 11 '1T'li 1926 

lJ'I;!{, ~ 1 ~ 2005 

• 

i;i;llT<li 2/21-ar/r;rrwur/04.- ,hCi>il•I-$ ~ = a.;r f.l<-t~fuia ~ ~ '11: ~q; 2s-12-2004 q;) 

• 

~ a€t • !lfl! it~ i, ~~<Kt ;;im;rt\ ~ fu11; ~ ~ oITnT i. 
1 

0'tfl>il•I<$ ii;~ ii; 'ITlf \T ~1 <>.il~~llj>il1(, 

. ~ mw iliV, aq--~ . 

• 

, 2 (14) 



,nu 19 '"'lim,r,r. . 3. 

.. a 

• 

{fo
0

l~PI~ ~ 
(~ 13 {'l'I_ 2004) 

@'fflttllif 3fftlc:hfil ifici'lil•I f.lfu (~i#ail:.:i) 31ftlf.1<1¥1, 2004 
.· 

'ffi(l~;l; ~'fif i\' \§\1itl'I</ f1im:Pim mr f.lR~f<sld ~q·l!"('; ~ - . 

(1) ~~ef;Tmmr'fllf~~'li<"ll1Jff.litf(mrrtR) ~. 

2004 t. 

o ... lw1{~ 'li<"ll1lT f.llt. ~ (iifim'li 9 l'l'I, 1982) (.rr ~ ~ ~ '@ 

~. ;l;'[J1fif~t) '1rrmu 18 i'i ~·'<!Kml!,ci~m";l;l"ll'l<TT:~"~ 
m l!,ci ~ m" ~ fif;,;rr off((. 

~. ~ 1 · ~ 2004 

!ifim'li 2/21-ar/!1Wflli/04:-lffi'ff ¾; mm:ril; ~ 348 ¾;~ {3) ii;:~ i'i Ot1lM$ ,>i~ ~ 
f.litf (mtr-f) ~. 2004 (~. 13 l'l'l,2004) ef;!:i:iil.ft.~il;~~ ~~f\;f;m~t 

' 

~¾;~ii; 'fl1f U lml "i14~11:j«I(, 

~ ftiw ~' Jir-~. 

' 

I 



;... .. 

.. 

~ . 

' 

• 

0,il6'1<9 u.!'a, ~ I~ 2005 

CHHATTISGARH ACT 
·(No. 13 of 2004) 

THE CHHATIJSGARH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI 
(SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2004 

An act further to amend the Cbhattlsgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhinlyam, 1982, 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the fifty fifth Year of the Republic of 
India as follows:- · 

I. 

2 

3. 

(I) 

(2) ' 

This Act may be called .the Chbattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi 
(Sanshodhan), Adhiniyam, 2004. 

It shall come into force from the date of its publication in official gazette . 

Section 18 of the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 9 of 
1982) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words "four Rupees & Ten 
Rupees" the words "Ten Rupees & Twenty Five Rupees". shall be substituted. 

In section 19 of the Principal Act,-

• 
- (i) In sub-section (I) for the words "Four Rupees" the words "Ten Rupees" 

shall be substituted. 

(ii) In sub-section (2) for the words "Ten Rupees" the words "Twenty Five 
Rupees'' shall be substituted. 

, 

I 

2 (16) 

Short title and 
c:ommencemeot. 

Amendment 
Section 18. 

Amendment 
Section 19 . 

of 

of 

• 



'~tme ~~~W<fi~ 
~ ~(w.JT ~~)~ WiJUT 
~ ~ -~ ~ -2-22-ffi'IIB•I~ 

~ I 38 fu. ~- ~. ~ 
30-05- 200 1. " 

rtir:r-r~ 
" ifaflB•I~/ '5ftl 09 / 2013-2015." 

(1'11451 
( mrftl i{O I) 

J:Uif:4cfii{ ~ S.cfil~id 

~136 ] ~ .~.~7~2018-~17,~1940 

.f<IT~, ~ 7 ~ 2018 

~ 3485/ it. 63/21-'3l/~- / ~ .1f./18. -0iffiB•l~~mrT<lil f.:IJ.tR-1Rsk1 ~mq.:~ 03-04-2018cfil 

~,£t~~mw€tt. ~~,£t~~~~fcfim~t. 

271 

0iffiB•I~~~~ -m:J~om-311a:111:1,@., 

lR'N ~ ~ . ~ ~ -



272 

3ffil-{•M~ ~ 
(sfilTTcfi 9~2018) 

u~ ;&1fticlcffll <ti~ f;fftt ;&1~f.:tt111, 1982 (ii. 9 W{_ 1982) <ti1 am: 4:tflftrn 
<tir-{ ~ at ft! f.:t ti II . 

(1) 

3::Jl'tl•I~~ ~f.riu~, 1982 (sfi. 9~1982) (~~~~~~ 
~ ~'if ~t> ctt um 18 'if,~ "rffim 1fc"i ~ m" ~ ~ 1R, ~ "~ m 1f<"i 

~m··~~~-

trm 19 <fil -.ifflt..T. 3. 

sfilTTcfi3485/it.63/2F~/~. /u.lf./18.-~~~~~348~~(3)~~1t~rci'lrn<N'tlll'8@<f> 

~~ 7-4-2018<til~~~ ~~~~J:l,.fiffl@~"'1ffit. 

0m1"t1•1~ ~~~ -m:1~tim~1~:111,;"t11-1., 

wfttf~~.~~-



i . 

Short title and 
commencement. 

Amendment 
Section 18. 

Amendment 
Section I 9. 

of 

of 

CHHATTISGARH ACT 

(No. 9 of 2018) 

THE CIIBATTISGARH ADHIVAKTAKALYAN NIDIIl (SANSHODHAN) 

ADHINIYAM, 2018 

272 ( 1) 

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 
(No. 9 of1982). 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of 
India, as follows:-

1. 

2. 

3. 

(1) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi 
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2018. 

(2) It shall come into force from the date ofits publication in the Official Gazette. 

In Section 18 of the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 
( No. 9 of 1982 ), ( hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words 
"Ten Rupees and Twenty Five Rupees", the words "Twenty-five -Rupees and 
Fifty Rupees " shall be substituted. 

In Section 19 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words" Ten Rupees", the words "Twenty-five 
Rupees" shall be substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "Twenty-five Rupees ", the words 
"Fifty Rupees" shall be substituted. 






	THE CHHATTISGARH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI ADHINIYAM
	view-casepdf
	FileCS



