The Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010

Act 17 of 2010

Keyword(s):
MLA, Salary and Allowances, Salary, Allowances, Member, Legislative

Amendments appended: 15 of 2011, 23 of 2012, 8 of 2013

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




qeagey eus, feiw 27 adie 2010 540 (1)

e, et 27 s 2010

#. 2702- 162333»%a—(m)—m%ﬁ%m%aﬁtmsﬁ;m(s)%ﬂmﬁ Ty faum 9w
HeH 9, W a° YA (Hwed) sfufmm, 2010 (FWiE 17 T 2010) maﬁeﬁeﬂaﬁm%ﬁwﬁ
TASEN et faEn S R,

TEYRY & THTA F 9 § 91 FRUIR,
. TSAT AEE, W Gfad.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 17 oF 2010.

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA PENSION
(SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2010.

TABLE OF CONTENTS.

Sections
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of Section 3.
3. Amendment of Section 4.
4. Amendment of Section 4-A.
5. Amendment of Section 4-B.

6. Substitution of Section 4-C.
Substitution of Section 5.
Amendment of Section 6-A.

: Amendment of Section 6-B.
10. Amendment of Section 6-C.
1. Amendment of Section 7.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 17 or 2010.

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN. BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2010.

{Received the assent of the Governor on the 23rd April 2010; assent first published in the *“Madhya Pradesh Gazette
{Extra-ordinary)’, dated the 27th April, 2010].

An Act Further o amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhinivam. 1972.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India
as follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha  Short title.

‘Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhintyam, 2010.

2. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension  Amcndment of
Adhiniyam, {972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “nine  Section 3.
thousand rupees”. the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.




540 (2) geyey ey, fa 9w 27 e 2010

smendmeat of 3 Section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “sixteen.
Nection 4. thousand rupees”™ shall be substituted.

Apendment of 4. In Section'4-A of the Principal Act, for the words “seven thousand rupees”, the words “ten
Section 4-A. ‘thousand rupees” shall be substituted. '
Arendmont of 5. In Section 4B of the Principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “four

oo 4B, thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Substitution of 6. For Section 4-C of the Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely —
Section 3~
Orderly “4-C. There shali be paid 1o every member orderly ailowance at the rate of five thousand
allowance.

rupees per mensem.”

Substitution ef 7. For Section 5 of the Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely 1~
Section 5.

Bus Travelling “5. There shall be paid to every member Bus Travelling Allowance at the rate of two hundied
Allowance. : fifty rupees per mensem.”. '
Ammndment 3 dn subesection (1) of Section 6-A of the Principal’ Act—

Seetion 6-A.

i

rupees’, the words “seven thousand

s ST S TR E e T T
E SO T FH IR FEY 1

rupees” shal! be substituted.

(i) the first proviso, for the words “twao hundred rupees”, the words “rhree hundred

rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 9. In Section-6-B of the Principal Act, for the words “three thousand Tupess”, the words
Section 6-B. “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
a drieny o Wy In Sgetion-0-O0 of the Principal Act, for the words “three thousand rupees’, the words

Nection 6-L “five thousand rupees” shall be substituiad.

fnendrient of LR DR EL R

S el
DO TUDSSS
Seetion 7. wy

the words




T daHEe www.govtpressmp.nic.in 9
ff TR wie fRar ST e R

IR 228 ] AITe, FYaR, fedier 27 oWa 2011—3°M@ 7, IF 1933

- fafy ok faurht & faam
iy, feaie 27 o1 2011

. 2614-166-3FR -~ (U.). —Heayey faum qw o fafafaa eifufrem 9 w feaiw 23 o1dd, 2011 i
qEEfeH TSIUre 1 AAN U 81 g, TASEN WAHHR & SR % ford yemify fear S .

TEYRE & TSI & A9 G q SRR,
TR AEE, AR Fiea.

455



456 Heqyeyl Yo, faqier 27 218 2011

qergeyl rfafTem

HHAF Q4 T 3022

TeAYRYT O |UT HSE da, =T d94r U9 (Eoned ) a1, 2098

[ferter 33 3109, R02¢ I TANS & AN YIa gs; STAfd ' Heaysy wers (erEmren) ) § fais o a1de, 2093
T gUH 9R Y| R ]

TP faem vt wew 9ad, v A9 vy sifufem, ¢weR @ ofiv Heifua e i erfufem.

AR TURTSE F "@3d 99 B gegyey fayr-ded g fAwfafga w9 7 wg

Afufmafaa 81—
W T SR 3. (R) 3w sifyfram = dfra 9 geauey faum | wee 9949, W= aen Uve (HEeE)
TR, aifyfem, 02 B
() I8 Tt R a1d, Rofo H WIH TN WA ST,
ST & T T, R. AWy faem v wew Jad, W= aur Uy SifufTEm, 99 (iR © U 8R93 ) Wi
U u & WH W, Fefafas g wenfua w6t S, srerfg: —
SE AT 9 “y Ye O T AT 4T & -k o 3TENT YT & oW e Ude Sith Rl Ui

@t U wfaare &t g 9 w9 g uwr fear s

e, femier 27 s1¥e, 2011

F. 2615-166-3FhE-37-(U1.).—YRd & HAUH & I E 348 & WIE (3) F WU ¥, UHARY fgum
Y HEH Fa, Wl a9 e (Heied) stfufrEm, 2011 (R 15 W 2011) H1 SUSH STAE TSATE % WK
Y TaggN, YN fman i ¥,

HEIYQY o TSI & A1 H ql STCIER,

TSP ATed, TR gH=a.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No.15 or 2011.

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA PENSION
(SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2011.

[ Received the assent of the Governor on the 23rd April, 2011; assent first published in the "Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-
ordinary)", dated the 27th April,2011.)

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-second year of the Republic
of India as follows:—

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
commencement: - oha Pension (Sanshodan) Adhiniyam, 2011.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force from the 27th April, 2010.

Substitution of 2. For Section 5 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan. Bhatta Tatha Pension
Section 3. Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). the following Section shall be substituted, namely :(—

Bus Travelling "5. There shall be paid to every member and every person entitled to pension under
Allowance. section 6-A Bus Travelling Allowance at the rate of five hundred rupees per
mensem.".

PRI, SIS RV A O S, TRy 5 SRR T qeuner, gl W ik 9o geRiiid—2011,



Y JIHES WWw.govtpressmp.nic.in ¥
ff TRA @re foran 1w €.

wHF 224 " oo, wfear, fedis 5 92 2012—99Rg 15, WE 1934

fafy ek faurdt = favm
a9, feaiw 5 @8 2012

. 2569-178-FFRG-3I(. ). —weayRy faum aw & frafafaa sifufem 59 = faiw 3 7€, 2012 =1 we™eq
TIUA T STTAN W B I T, TASEN TR B SIHER % fad gemifya e sm .

TAYRY & A & AW H qAl SRR,
TSAYT I1Ed, 3T |iaa,

Heageyt Afuf=m

HH% 3 G RoR

HeAUQYT (9T AT WS 9dq, Wl 9o Vo (99neT )
=, 2093

faer-g=h.

wfem =,

YN ¥ T HAEA
R ¥-@ HT G
g7 ¥~ T GIMEHA.
N 4 T FINEA
T 4-TF T GIEA.
R §-F H AN
W &% H HINEA.
R €~ T GIMEH.

ER N LU S

447



448

HegyRyl U9, f&ie 5 2 2012

YT ¢ HT WYL,

T ¥-W AT

BN
gRT ¥-T &
wyhe.
4R & AT EIiTer.

gRT %-" 6T

T9Ner.

gNT §-<h &7

gT &§-E& <7

TYTer.

T &-T AT

T

Hegest Tfafay

AR 33 T R02R

HAYQYT TaeMT 9T HEE e, Ul aer U9 (HIne)

arfafEd, 0%
[ feriier 3 W, R0%R WY oAUl it SrRT W g orfAf ‘ WeANReT T (ST )” § i« W, R0eR W
THAR WIS ht T |

ey fagm o wee I, W aen e eiffad, 2wk @l iR wuifud e o ifufe.

kA TORSE % fREsd af § wergly faum-ned g fr=fafes w9 & 9%
Aty § —

2. 3q afufqam =1 Wi - Aeggee faum 99 9e9 o9d, w1 9um UvH  (HueE)
afufy, 093 ®.

R, HEAURYT Torer ET W 3, W e Yo SifufEm, 91197 (RIS @ | 2]03 ) (STl
ok Uy WA fafem o | fAfde ) = o ¢ # v HietE TR % i W v e
TR Tenfua fed S,

3. 9 AU &l anr ¥-@ ¥, veg O TR o WM W OveE 'ed g nfud

¥. g fufem &t o ¥-7 °, v (Ui TR h e W veE e T wnfud
fwar <.

y. get i st o o H, visg ' uie W oh T W e ¢ Ueh s vt foRd T,

&, et Sl &t 4 «-& ¥, ITuT (R ) % oy Fetalea 15 s staswentia wt
. et —

“(3) W fufaa & Sussl wX ufage T T for, <igl @i v Heayest T
o iR Uk T W Y T dek aTgar 9 AT I €, | 9% U A o fag
A & e it wiqufd @1 gwer g

U] 39 SULT o e Qe amsit &t ot W wided widie 9 sifies i grh.

m.tgfa?&rﬁmﬁam&mﬁ,mv (%) ¥,—
(T ) wrifues TTE W e 9 TR R TIM W, VIS U UE e wenfud
TR ITd;
(Br) vuw Wge #, I VA Y o W W, v ute | wenfud ey T,
¢. A IMUFEH T aT £-9 H, I UiE TR F WM W, VK 'T9 R i
ferT <.
. g AT T amT §-T H, veg C'UiE g R WM W, e ' g’ wenfua
TR <,



HEYEY U, fei 5 g 2012 448 (1)

g, f&aren 5 W8 2012

. 2570-178-3H -3 (W.).—HRA & Gfa9M & T8 348 % WU (3) & STER0 H Heayey faum &
- GEE, o, Wal a1 UeH (Fee) sifufeam, 2012 (SREIE 23 T 2012) T S STAE TS % TSR | UG
BEINGRE RIS G

TYCY & T o H § a7 QUK
THYT Aq1ed, TR afa.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 23 oF 2012

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012

TABLE OF CONTENTS
Sections

Short title.

Amendment of section 4.
Amendment of section 4-B.
Amendment of section 4-C.
Amendment of section 5.
Amendment of section 5-B
Amendment of section 6-A.
Amendment of section 6B.
Amendment of section 6-C.

S R N

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 23 oF 2012

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012

[Received the assent of the Governer on the 3rd may, 2012 assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 5th May, 2012.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972.

Be it enacted by the Médhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-third year of the Republié of
India as follow:—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Short title.
Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012.

2. In section 4 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Am?“d‘::em of
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words section 4.
“Sixteen thousand’’, the words “twenty five thousand’’ shall be substituted.

3. In section 4-B of the prinicipal Act, for the words “four thousand’, the words “ten Amendment of
thousand’” shall be substituted. section 4-B.

4. In section 4-C of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand”’, the words “ten Amendment of
thousand’” shall be substituted. section 4-C.



448 (2)

Hegyeyl TN, faies 5 1 2012

Amendment of
section 5.

Amendment of
‘section 5-B

Amendment of
section 6-A.

Amendment of
section 6-B.

Amendment of
section 6-C.

5. In section 5 of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred’’, the words “one thousand’
shall be substituted.

6. In section 5-B of the Principal Act, after sub-section (2), the following new sub-section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Without prejudice to the provisions of this Act, where a member travels by air
within the State of Madhya Pradesh from one place to another, he shall be

entitled to reimbursement of the air fare of such journey:

Provided that the total number of such journeys under this sub-section shall not be more
than thirty four per year.”.

7. In section 6-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

(1) in the opening paragraph, for the words “seven thousand’’, the words *‘fifteen
thousand’’ shall be substituted;

(ii) in the first proviso, for the words “three hundred’’, the words “five hundred”’
shall be substituted.

8. In section 6-B of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand’’, the words “ten
thousand’’ shall be substituted.

9. In section 6-C of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand’’, the words “ten
thousand™’ shall be substituted.

Frei=e, TS qEO1 a1 ET S, THyEy 51 IS R HEOned, e | qikd a7 TEia—2012.



Y IR www.govipressmp.nic.in 9
ff TR wie foRar s e R

A% 18] A, AR, Tl 10 SHeRt 2013—1 20, W% 1934

fafy ofix faurt w@d favm

991, feqi 10 et 2013

. 220-17-3F6IE-31-(91.) Sifu.—auayey faum aw &1 fefafe sifufag g w® s 8 s, 2013
! HEMIEH TSIUTE S STIAG W B b §, TN WaEmHR &l SHERl & fad yaifvm fean sma 2.

TG & ToFUd % TH § q€l SCUHER,
TAYT IOTEd, TR giad,

TeAyey Afufm

HH® ¢ T 3033

HeAWeyT fqem |ur |as oaF, W aen Yo (fgde doirer ) sifaftm@m, 0%
[ferte ¢ Sad, 3023 1 ToUE H oAl W g8, Al ¢ TRy e (SR ' feAi g0 S,
R0%3 HI WUW SR WHIRE W TE.]
TeaYRYT foer | wew 9aw, R aer Yo ifufEm, gRwR @i 3l Heiifta e ¥ sifufrm.

IRA TR & fegsd ad o #wwuw fauym-wveq g f=fafea w9 7 U9
sfyfrafia 81—

2. () Tg rfyufrm o1 dftra A geauey faum 9 Ue= 9aq, w1 aen Uye (fedtm deieq)  wfgm Im eir
aIfyfrm, 0¢R %, T

(R) I8 o9 H 39F THEH + i@ ¥ wege g

R.  HEARQYT foelr Werm Wy e, e ae Uere sifafam, R30R (hHih 9 B qR93 ) T UTT & HT
URT §- , SN (¢ ) % WM W, Frfafad Suumr sl @ s, sl c— oM.

“(%) weEWQeT fauT Ot wew e, W A e ( fgdta deiem) sfufEm, Ro9
& YT |, Udeh i b, o weauaer faum s & o9 & w0 § fedt
o Frerrafin o fore sl foRar &, o 29I U wiawme U9T ohT L ferar Saem:

Ui it fnat wafem 3, oier g @ eiftres & sreaty o T weamaeT o T el &
w § & fora &, et S Ui o & Sifafied veie o & g uier | wud ufaae
sifafer YT T 1A foram s ofiY ferelt v it orafir & oifem o =it B
T AT TR it I Stfcifiard YT U SR o WESTH ok forg qut o Wl <.

35



36

[eqyey T, fedis 10 et 2013

0o, feqis 10 sHad 2013

. 221-17-FFRIA-31-(U1.) fl.— R % Wfaum & STI=0 348 & WYL (3) & TN H, ALAYRY faum |
TeE A, R e Uve (fgda geiem) erfufem, 2012 (iR 8 W 2013) Wi SHSH orgae Usawel % WifdeR
R EDINCRER RS ICI S

Shert title and
commencement.

Amendment of
Section 6-A.

HEYY F TAYE % AH Y qA SSTER,
TEIYT A, TR g,

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 8 or 2013

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (DWITIYA SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 8" January, 2013; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 10% January, 2013.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972,

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-third year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension (Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012.

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the official Gazette.

2. In Section 6-A of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“) With effect from the commencement of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha
Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012,
there shall be paid a pension of fifteen thousand rupees per mensem to every
person who has served for any period as a member of the Madhya Pradesh
Legislative Assembly :

Provided that where a person has served as a member of the Madhya Pradesh
Legislative Assembly for a period exceeding five years, there shall be paid
to him an additional pension of five hundred rupees per mensem for every
year in excess of five years, and the period of six months or more of the
last year of the term of any member shall be deemed whole year for the
purpose of earning additional pension.”

Fredseh, e RO A1 AR I, WS B IS R gRunad, e § gE a9 i —2013.



