The Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha Evam Neta
Pratipakha Vetan Tatha Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010

Act 18 of 2010

Keyword(s):
Speaker, Deputy Speaker, Leader of Opposition, Salary and Allowances

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




gy o, el 27 U 2010

542 (1)

sirare, feiw 27 ST 2010

F. 2706-163-39HE-H- (). — R ¥ wdfaur F e 348 % WUE (3) ¥ argE | HUIYCY S1eae
S wd e wiaae dq qen e fafs (dere) sfufem, 2000 (FHF 18 T 2010) 1 SIS HIARG TTA ED

T & TG T S R

ey ¥ TewE F A Y A SRR,
YT e, AR afEd.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 18 0r 2010

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHYAKSHA TATHA UPADHYAKSHA EVAM NETA
PRATIPAKSHA VETAN TATHA BHATTA VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2010.

[Received the assent of the Governer on the 23rd April 2010; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette
(Extra-ordinary)”, dated the 27th April, 2010]. ’

An Act Further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan Tatha
Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1972 and the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mandal Neta Pratipaksha
(Vetan Tatha Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1980. .

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India
as follows:—

t.This Act may called the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksh Evam Neta Pratipaksha
Vetan Tatha Bhatta Vidhi {Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010

PART 1
Amendment to the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 27 of 1972). :

2. In Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 27 of 1972) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “nine
thousand » the words “ten thousand” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 3 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “nine thousand™ and “six thousand”, the words “thirteen
thousand” and “ten thousand” shall respectively be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “twelve thousand”, the words “eighteen thousand” shall
be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section {3). for the words “five hundred”, the words “eight hundred” shall
be substituted;

PART 1
Amendment to the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mandal Neta Pratipaksha (Vetan Tatha
Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1980 (No. § of 1980).

4. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mandat Neta Pratipaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)
Adhiniyam, 1980 (No. 8 of 1980) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “nine
thousand”™ the words “ten thousand”” shall be substituted.

Short title.

Amendment of
Section 2.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Amendment of
Section 3.



542(2) : HEASIQY T, fai 27 s 2010

_—.ﬁ,_‘_nﬁ,..__-_.,_w_.__m—*&__—m‘ﬁ__—.ﬁ__._._w.ﬂ_-_.____—.___-*_._.. i
- N E_—b_.__u__m___.__.__"ﬁ,m__——-u’_____‘._mm‘_w—_ ——— ]

Amendment of 5. In Section 4 of the Principal Act,—
Section 4. :
{1} in sub-section (1), for the words “nine thousand” the words “thirtcen thousand™ shall be
substituted:

{1t} In sub-section (2), for the words “tweive thousand™, the words “eighteen thousand”™ shall
be substituted:

(iii} in sub-section (3}, for the words “five hundred”, the words “eight hundred” shall
be substituted.




