
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund Act, 1953 

 

Act No. 40 of 1953 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research 

(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These 

contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, 

completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  

Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the relevant 

state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette notification. Any person 

using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting on any information contained 

in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this 

document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or 

distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 

Amendments appended: 20 of 2023, 25 of 2024 

https://mahakamgar.maharashtra.gov.in/writereaddata/Portal/Magazine/Document/1_633_1_maharashtra-labour-welfare-fund-act.pdf
https://mahakamgar.maharashtra.gov.in/writereaddata/Portal/Magazine/Document/1_633_1_maharashtra-labour-welfare-fund-act.pdf
































¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945       1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XX OF 2023.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 11th April 2023).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Industrial Relations Act, the

Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund Act, the Maharashtra Mathadi,

Hamal and other Manual Workers (Regulation of Employment and
Welfare) Act, 1969, the Maharashtra Private Security Guards

(Regulation of Employment and Welfare) Act, 1981 and the

Maharashtra Workmen’s Minimum House-rent Allowance

Act, 1983.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Industrial

Relations Act, the Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund Act, the Maharashtra
Mathadi, Hamal and other Manual Workers (Regulation of Employment and

Welfare) Act, 1969, the Maharashtra Private Security Guards (Regulation of

Employment and Welfare) Act, 1981 and the Maharashtra Workmen’s

Minimum House-rent Allowance Act, 1983, for the purposes hereinafter

XI of
1947.
XL of
1953.
Mah.

XXX of
1969.
Mah.

LVIII of
1981.
Mah.

XXIII of
1988.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 9, +ÆEò 22]        ¨ÉÆMÉ³ý´ÉÉ®úú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945    [ {ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 6, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 37
|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Labour Laws (Amendment) Act, 2022 (Mah. Act No. XX of 2023), is
hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀------37---1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945

appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-third Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY. 

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Labour Laws  (Amendment)
Act, 2022. 

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA INDUSTRIAL

RELATIONS ACT.

2. In section 104 of the Maharashtra Industrial Relations Act
(hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Industrial Relations Act”),
for the words “with imprisonment of either description for a term which
may extend to three months, or with fine or with both”, the words “with a
fine which shall not be less than five lakhs rupees but which may extend to
ten lakhs rupees” shall be substituted. 

3. In section 106 of the Industrial Relations Act, in sub-section (2), for
the words, letters and figures “with imprisonment which may extend to three
months or for every day on which the contravention continues with fine which
may extend to Rs. 5,000 or with both”, the words “with a fine of five lakhs
rupees and for every day on which the contravention continues with a fine of
five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LABOUR

WELFARE FUND ACT.

4. In section 17A of the Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund Act
(hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Labour Welfare Fund
Act”),—

(1) for clauses (a) and (b), the following clauses shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(a) for the first offence, with fine which may extend to one
lakh rupees; 

(b) for the second or subsequent offence, with fine which may
extend to two lakh, rupees : ”; 
(2) in the proviso, for the words “fifty rupees” the words “five

thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

5. After section 17B of the Labour Welfare Fund Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely :—

“ 17C. (1) The offence punishable under section 17A may, on an
application of the accused person, either before or after the institution of
any prosecution, be compounded by the Welfare Commissioner, for a sum of
fine provided for such offence, in such manner, as may be prescribed. 

(2) Nothing contained in sub-section (1) shall apply to an offence
committed by a person for the second time or thereafter within a period of
five years from the date—

XI of
1947.

Short title.

Amendment of
section 104 of

XI of 1947. 

Amendment of
section 106 of

XI of 1947. 

Amendment of
section 17A of

XL of 1953.

XL of
1953.

Insertion of
new section
17C in XL of

1953.

Compound-
ing of

offences.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945       3

(a) of commission of a similar offence which was earlier compounded ;
or 

(b) of commission of similar offence for which such person was
earlier convicted. 

(3) The Welfare Commissioner shall exercise the powers to compound
an offence, subject to the direction, control and supervision of the State
Government. 

(4) Every application for the compounding of an offence shall be made
in such form and manner, as may be prescribed. 

(5) Where any offence is compounded before the institution of any
prosecution, no prosecution shall be instituted in relation to such offence,
against the offender in relation to whom the offence is so compounded. 

(6) Where the composition of any offence is made after the institution of
any prosecution, such composition shall be brought by the Welfare
Commissioner in writing, to the notice of the Court before whom the
prosecution is pending and on such notice of the composition of the offence
being given, the person against whom the offence is so compounded shall be
discharged. 

(7) No offence punishable under the provisions of this Act shall be
compounded except under and in accordance with the provisions of this
section.”. 

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MATHADI, HAMAL

AND OTHER MANUAL WORKERS (REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT AND

WELFARE) ACT, 1969. 

6. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Mathadi, Hamal and other Manual
Workers (Regulation of Employment and Welfare) Act, 1969 (hereinafter, in
this Chapter, referred to as “the Mathadi, Hamal and other Manual Workers
Act”), for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(3) The scheme may further provide that,—

(i) a first contravention of any provision thereof shall, on
conviction, be punished with fine which may extend to such amount
as may be specified (but in no case exceeding five lakhs rupees);

(ii) for second or subsequent contravention of any provision
thereof shall, on conviction, be punished with fine, which may
extend to such amount as may be specified (but in no case exceeding
ten lakhs rupees) ; and

(iii) if the contravention is continued after conviction, with a
further fine which may extend to five thousand rupees for each day
on which the contravention is so continued.”.

Amendment of
section 3 of
Mah. XXX of
1969. 

Mah.
XXX of

1969.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------37---2



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945

7. In section 27 of the Mathadi, Hamal and other Manual Workers

Act,—

(1) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “five lakhs rupees”

shall be substituted; 

(2) for the words “one hundred rupees” the words “five thousand

rupees” shall be substituted. 

8. After section 27 of the Mathadi, Hamal and other Manual Workers

Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely :—

“ 27-1A. (1) Any offence of contravention of any of the provisions of

any scheme punishable under the scheme, may, on an application of the

accused person, either before or after the institution of any prosecution, be

compounded by the Chairman of the concerned Board, for a sum of fifty per

cent., of the maximum fine provided for such offence, in such manner, as

may be prescribed: 

Provided that, such amount of composition shall be credited to the

administrative account of the concerned Board established for the purpose

of administration of that Board. 

(2) Nothing contained in sub-section (1) shall apply to an offence

committed by a person for the second time or thereafter within a period of

three years from the date,—

(a) of commission of a similar offence which was earlier compounded ; 

or

(b) of commission of similar offence for which such person was

earlier convicted. 

(3) Where any offence is compounded before the institution of any

prosecution, no prosecution shall be instituted in relation to such offence,

against the offender in relation to whom the offence is so compounded. 

(4) Where the composition of any offence is made after the institution of

any prosecution, such composition shall be brought by the Chairman of the

concerned Board, referred to in sub-section (1), in writing, to the notice of

the Labour Court or the Industrial Court, before whom the prosecution is

pending and on such notice of the composition of the offence being given, the

person against whom the offence is so compounded shall be discharged. 

(5) No offence punishable under the scheme shall be compounded except

under and in accordance with the provisions of this section.”. 

Amendment of
section 27 of
Mah. XXX of

1969.

Insertion of
new section

27-1A in Mah.
XXX of 1969.

Compounding
of offences.

XI of
1947.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945       5

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA PRIVATE
SECURITY GUARDS (REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT AND

WELFARE) ACT, 1981.

9. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Private Security Guards (Regulation
of Employment and Welfare) Act, 1981 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred
to as “the Private Security Guards Act”), for sub-section (3), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) The Scheme may further provide that,—

(i) a first contravention of any provision thereof shall, on
conviction, be punished with fine which may extend to such amount
as may be specified (but in no case exceeding five lakhs rupees);

(ii) for second or subsequent contravention of any provision
thereof shall, on conviction, be punished with fine, which may
extend to such amount as may be specified (but in no case exceeding
ten lakhs rupees); and

(iii) if the contravention is continued after conviction, with a
further fine which may extend to five thousand rupees for each day
on which the contravention is so continued.”. 

10. In section 27 of the Private Security Guards Act,—

(1) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “five lakhs rupees”
shall be substituted; 

(2) for the words “one hundred rupees” the words “five thousand
rupees” shall be substituted. 

11. After section 27 of the Private Security Guards Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely :—

“27A. (1) Any offence of contravention of any of the provisions of any
Scheme punishable under the Scheme, may, on an application of the accused
person, either before or after the institution of any prosecution, be
compounded by the Chairman of the concerned Board, for a sum of fifty
per cent., of the maximum fine provided for such offence, in such manner as
may be prescribed: 

Provided that, such amount of composition shall be credited to the
administrative account of the concerned Board established for the purpose
of administration of that Board. 

(2) Nothing contained in sub-section (1) shall apply to an offence
committed by a person for the second time or thereafter within a period of
three years from the date,—

(a) of commission of a similar offence which was earlier compounded ; 
or

(b) of commission of similar offence for which such person was
earlier convicted. 

(3) Where any offence is compounded before the institution of any
prosecution, no prosecution shall be instituted in relation to such offence,
against the offender in relation to whom the offence is so compounded. 

Amendment 
of section 3 of
Mah. LVIII of
1981. 

Mah.
LVIII of

1981.

Amendment 
of section
27 of Mah.
LVIII of 1981.

Insertion of
new section
27A in Mah.
LVIII of 1981.

Compounding
of offences.



6 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, BÊ|É±É 11, 2023/SÉèjÉ 21, ¶ÉEäò 1945

(4) Where the composition of any offence is made after the institution of
any prosecution, such composition shall be brought by the Chairman of the
concerned Board, referred to in sub-section (1), in writing, to the notice of
the Court, before whom the prosecution is pending and on such notice of the
composition of the offence being given, the person against whom the offence
is so compounded shall be discharged. 

(5) No offence punishable under the Scheme shall be compounded except
under and in accordance with the provisions of this section.”. 

CHAPTER VI

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA WORKMEN’S

MINIMUM HOUSE-RENT ALLOWANCE ACT, 1983. 

12. In section 10 of the Maharashtra Workmen’s Minimum House-rent
Allowance Act, 1983,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to one year, or with fine which may extend to two
thousand rupees, or with both”, the words “with fine which may extend
to ten lakhs rupees” shall be substituted ; 

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to six months, or with fine which may extend to one
thousand rupees, or with both”, the words “with fine which may extend
to ten lakhs rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 10 of

Mah. XXIII
of 1988.

Mah.
XXIII of
1988.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 18, 2024/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 28, ¶ÉEäò 1945 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXV OF 2024.

(First publilshed, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 18th March 2024.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund Act.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Labour
Welfare Fund Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby
enacted in the Seventy-fifth Year of the Republic of India, as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Act, 2024.

2. In section 6BB of the Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund Act, for
sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :–

Short title.

XL of
1953.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 10, +ÆEò 13(8)] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®úú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 18, 2024/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 28, ¶ÉEäò 1945 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 41

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Labour Welfare Fund (Amendment) Act, 2024 (Mah. Act No. XXV of
2024), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

 Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

––––––––––––

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀-41----1

Amendment
of section
6BB of XL of
1953.

XL of
1953.



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 18, 2024/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 28, ¶ÉEäò 1945

“ (2) The amount of contribution payable every six months in
respect of every employee and an employer for each such employee
shall be at the following rates, namely :–

(a) in respect of an employee, whose name appears in the
register of an establishment on the 30th June and 31st December,
respectively, shall be at the rate of twenty-five rupees :

Provided that, the State Government shall on receipt of a
proposal from the Board, by notification in the Official Gazette,
increase once in every three years, the rate of employee’s
contribution so, however that, such increase shall not exceed thirty
per cent. of the rate of contribution ;

(b) in respect of an employer, for each employee referred to
in clause (a), thrice the amount of contribution payable by an
employee.”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR :
DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


