
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Bombay Village Panchayats Act, 1958

Act 3 of 1959

Keyword(s):
Repealed, Associate Member, Building, Cattle, Zilla Parishad, Factory, Gram
Sabha, Land, List of Voters, Octroi, Panchayat, Sarpanch, Upa-Sarpanch,
Scheduled Tribes, Secretary, Street, Tax, Village, Ward

Amendments appended: 37 of 2006, 38 of 2006, 21 of 2007, 5 of 2009, 27 of
2009, 16 of 2010, 23 of 2010, 28 of 2010, 33 of 2010, 19 of 2011, 27 of 2011, 39
of 2011, 16 of 2012, 22 of 2012, 29 of 2012, 18 of 2014, 43 of 2014, 7 of 2015,
10 of 2016, 28 of 2017, 42 of 2017, 11 of 2018, 24 of 2018, 54 of 2018, 66 of
2018



DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Bombay Village Panchayats Act, 1958

Act 3 of 1959

Keyword(s):
Repealed, Associate Member, Building, Cattle, Zilla Parishad, Factory, Gram
Sabha, Land, List of Voters, Octroi, Panchayat, Sarpanch, Upa-Sarpanch,
Scheduled Tribes, Secretary, Street, Tax, Village, Ward

Amendments appended: 37 of 2006, 38 of 2006, 21 of 2007, 5 of 2009, 27 of
2009, 16 of 2010, 23 of 2010, 28 of 2010, 33 of 2010, 19 of 2011, 27 of 2011, 39
of 2011, 16 of 2012, 22 of 2012, 29 of 2012, 18 of 2014, 43 of 2014, 7 of 2015





































































































































































































































































































RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528
Reg. No. MH/MR/South-344/2014-16

c r i  %  3TcF ^ ( t t ) ]  i s r a i r .  ^  ? o * * / 3 T T W  X ,  ? ,  % * T r T  : ^  ^ V 9 .o o

amrarnrT *ni<*> \9o 

WlFy$H MeblVIH

Tffrw 3rM¥m er HvWrrrri ŷ nfrrr arszn̂ r ? %c^ anfoT
g' «ni4i tcixMiicp̂ 'i 3t!(r)nl fa^T% ($UmO 3THa7̂ ).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation 
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment and Continuance) Act, 2014 
(Mah. Act No. XVIII of 2014), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

H. B. PATEL,
Principal Secretary to Government, 

Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XVIII OF 2014.

(First published, after having received the assent o f the 
Governor in the “M aharashtra Governm ent G azette” , on the

25th June 2014).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act.

Mah. WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra promulgated the Maharashtra 
Ord. II Village Panchayats (Amendment) Ordinance, 2014, on the 30th January 

of 2014. 2014;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the 
24th February 2014, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Bill, 
2014 (L. C. Bill No. I of 2014), for replacing the said Ordinance by an Act of 
the State Legislature was passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Council on 
the 28th February 2014, and transmitted to the Maharashtra Legislative 
Assembly;

(?)



3

Short title 
and 

commence­
ment.

Insertion of 
section 54-1A 
in III of 1959.

Special 
provisions 
relating to 
village and 

Gram Sabha.

AND WHEREAS thereafter, as, the session of the Maharashtra 
Legislative Assembly was prorogued on the 28th February 2014, the said Bill 
could not be passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213 (2) (a) of the Constitution of 
India, the said Ordinance would have ceased to operate at the expiration of 
six weeks from the re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the 6th 
April 2014;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session 
and the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances existed 
which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action to continue 
the operation of the provisions of the said Ordinance, for the purposes 
hereinafter appearing; and, therefore, promulgated the Maharashtra Village Mah. 

Panchayats (Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2014, on the 5th April
2014; '

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an 
Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-fifth Year of the 
Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats 
(Amendment and Continuance) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 30th January 2014.

2. In Chapter III-A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act HI of
1959

(hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), before section 54-A, the 
following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“54-1A. Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 4, 5 or any 
other provisions of this Act, in the Scheduled Areas ,-

(a) a habitation or a group of habitations or a hamlet or a group 
of hamlets comprising a community and managing its affairs in 
accordance with traditions and customs, and which is declared as a 
village in the prescribed manner shall be the village for the purposes 
of this Chapter;

(b) every village, so declared under clause (a), shall have a 
Gram Sabha consisting of persons whose names are included in 
the electoral rolls for the panchayat at the village level and a 
panchayat may comprise of one or more than one of such villages.”.

H f W H d  ? T T T R  a i f W M N U I  H f F T  3 T T S , ! ) o ^ / 3 n T C  ? T %



Mah. 
Ord. IX 

of 2014.

VTRFT TTJHT̂T 3TOTOT7̂T WI 3TO, 9°W/3TTW X, ?T% WS, 3
J ■ .

3. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment and Repeal of 
„  ,, . ,  , , Mah. Ord. IX
Continuance) Ordinance, 2014 is hereby repealed. of 2014 and

saving.
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken 

under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance 
(including any notification issued) shall be deemed to have been done, taken 
or issued, as the .case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the 
principal Act, as amended by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED 
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, 
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



















¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ, +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 26, 2015/SÉèjÉ 5, ¶ÉEäò 1937 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VII OF 2015.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 26th March 2015.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby
enacted in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment) Act, 2015.

2. In section 10-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act
(hereinafter referred to as “ the principal Act ”), in the first proviso,
for the words, figures and letters “ before the 31st December 2013 ”
the words, figures and letters “ before the 31st December 2015 ” shall
be substituted.

Short title.

Amendment of
section 10-1A
of III of 1959.

III
of 1959.

III
of 1959.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 1, +ÆEò 11] MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®úú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 26, 2015/SÉèjÉ 5, ¶ÉEäò 1937 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 24

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ´ÉÉnù).

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2015 (Mah. Act No. VII of
2015), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

M. A. SAYEED,
Principal Secretary and R.L.A.

to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

(1)

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--24----1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ, +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 26, 2015/SÉèjÉ 5, ¶ÉEäò 1937

3. In section 30-1A of the principal Act, in the first proviso, for
the words, figures and letters “ before the 31st December 2013 ” the
words, figures and letters “ before the 31st December 2015 ” shall be
substituted.

Amendment of
section 30-1A

of III of 1959.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT
GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2016/SÉèjÉ 11, ¶ÉEäò 1938 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. X OF 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government  Gazette ”, on the 31st March 2016).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, 1958.

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted
in the Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment) Act, 2016.

III of
1959.

Short title.

(1)

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 2, +ÆEò 20(2)] MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2016/SÉèjÉ 11, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 28

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ´ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. X of
2016), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É` 28----1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2016/SÉèjÉ 11, ¶ÉEäò 1938

2. In section 10-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act
(hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), for the existing provisos, the
following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or by-elections for which the
last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December
2017, in accordance with the election programme declared by the
State Election Commission, a person who has applied to the Scrutiny
Committee for verification of his Caste Certificate before the date
of filing of the nomination papers but who has not received the
Validity Certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers
shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to
the Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate
or any other proof of having made such application to the
Scrutiny Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period
of six months from the date on which he is declared elected,
the Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee:

Provided further that, if the person fails to produce the
Validity Certificate within a period of six months from the
date on which he is declared elected, his election shall be
deemed to have been terminated retrospectively and he shall
be disqualified for being a member.”.

3. In section 30-1A of the principal Act, for the existing provisos,
the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :––

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of Sarpanch
for which the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before
the 28th February 2018, in accordance with the election programme
declared by the State Election Commission, a person who has
applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification of his Caste
Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination papers but
who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date of filing
of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination
papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to
the Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate
or any other proof of having made such application to the
Scrutiny Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking, that he shall submit, within a period
of six months from the date on which he is declared elected,
the Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee:

Provided further that, if the person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which
he is declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been
terminated retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a
Sarpanch.”.

III of
1959.

Amendment
of section

10-1A of III of
1959.

Amendment
of section

30-1A of III of
1959.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



1¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, BÊ|É±É 15, 2017/SÉèjÉ 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XXVIII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor
in  the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 15th April 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and
the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take
immediate action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act
and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for
the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 on the 31st January 2017 ;

III of
1959.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. V

of 2017.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEòú 36(3)] ¶ÉÊxÉý´ÉÉ®ú, BÊ|É±É 15, 2017/SÉèjÉ 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 71

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ

Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

 In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2017,  (Mah. Act No. XXVIII of 2017), is hereby published under the
authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

––––––––––––———

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------71---1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, BÊ|É±É 15, 2017/SÉèjÉ 25, ¶ÉEäò 19392

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 31st January 2017.

2. In section 14 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, in
sub-section (1), in clause (j-5), after the words “of the Gram Sabha” the words
“or of the Chief Executive Officer or an officer designated by him; or a self-
certificate” shall be inserted.

3. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, in sub-section (1), in clause (p), after the words “of the
Gram Sabha” the words “or of the Chief Executive Officer or an officer
designated by him; or a self-certificate” shall be inserted.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the Maharashtra
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961 as amended by the said
Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case
may be, under the corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts as amended
by this Act.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 14 of

III of 1959.

III of
1959.

Amendment
of section 16 of
Mah. V of 1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. V
of 2017.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. V of

2017 and saving.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XLII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 29th May 2017).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations Act, the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles Tax Act, the Maharashtra
Village Panchayats Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, the Maharashtra State Tax
on Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments Act, 1975 and the
Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles
Tax Act, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, the
Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments
Act, 1975 and the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002, for the purposes

III of
1888.

I of 1923.
LIX of
1949.

 LXV of
1958.
III of
1959.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah. XVI
of 1975.
Mah. IX
of 2005.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEò 43] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 14, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 90

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax related Laws (Amendments,
Validation and Savings) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act  No.XLII of 2017), is hereby published under the
authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Principal Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---90---1
(1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 19392

hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER  I
1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax

related laws (Amendments, Validation and Savings) Act, 2017.
(2) (a) Section 63, sub-section (3) of section 67 and section 73 shall come

into force on the date of publication of this Act in the Official Gazette ;
(b) remaining sections shall come into force from such date as the

State Government may by notification in the Official Gazette appoint, and
different dates may be appointed for different provisions.

CHAPTER  II
AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2. In section 3 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act (hereinafter,
in this Chapter, referred to as “the Mumbai Corporation Act”),  clause  (pa)
shall be deleted.

3. In section 126 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (2), in
clause (a), the words “and, in the case of octroi on such articles” shall be
deleted.

4. In section 128 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (1), in
clause (a), the words “and the articles on which octroi  shall be levied,” shall
be deleted.

5. In section 139 of the Mumbai Corporation Act,  entry (4) shall be
deleted.

6. Above section 192 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the heading
“Octroi” shall be deleted.

7. Sections 192, 193, 194, 194-1A, 194A, 195, 195-1A and 195-1B of the
Mumbai Corporation Act shall be deleted.

8. In section 196 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the words ‘‘or by adding
to the number of articles on which octroi is being levied” shall be deleted.

9. Section 199 of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be deleted.

10. Section 213 of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be deleted.

11. Sections 478, 478-1A, 478-1AA and 478-1B of the Mumbai
Corporation Act shall be deleted.

12. Schedules H and H-1 of the Mumbai Corporation Act shall be
deleted.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 3

of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 126

of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 128

of III of
1888.

Amendment of
section 139 of

III of 1888.

Deletion of
heading

above section
192 of III of

1888.

Deletion of
sections  192,

193, 194, 194-
1A, 194A, 195,

195-1A and
195-1B of III

of 1888.

Amendment
of section 196

of III of
1888.

Deletion of
section 199 of

III of 1888.

Deletion of
section 213 of

III of 1888.
Deletion of

sections 478,
478-1A, 478-

1AA and 478-1B
of III of 1888.

Deletion of
Schedules H

and H-1 of
III of 1888.

III of
1888.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 3

CHAPTER  III

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA ENTERTAINMENTS DUTY ACT.

13. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act
(hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Entertainments Duty Act”),—

(1) clause (d-1) shall be deleted ;

(2) after clause (f-a1), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely :—

“(f-a2) “local authority” means,—

(i) a “Municipality” as defined in clause (e) of article 243P
of the Constitution ;

(ii) a “Zilla Parishads” as constituted under the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961 ;

(iii) “Cantonment Board”, as defined in section 3 of the
Cantonments Act, 2006 ;

(f-a3) “Chief Officer” means a person appointed or deemed to
be appointed as Chief Officer under the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 ;

(f-a4) “Chief Executive Officer” of the Zilla Parishads
means the Chief Executive Officer of a Zilla Parishad appointed
under section 94 of Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and  Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 ;

(f-a5) “Chief Executive Officer” of the Cantonment Board
means the person appointed as the Chief Executive Officer of a
cantonment under the Cantonments Act, 2006 ;

(f-a6) “Municipal Commissioner” means the Municipal
Commissioner for the Municipal Corporation appointed under the
Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act or as the case may be, under
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act ;”.

14. In section 3 of the Entertainments Duty Act,—

(1) except sub-sections (6), (7) and (8), for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall
be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (3), in clause (j), for the word “Commissioner”
the words “local authority” shall be substituted ;

(3) in sub-section (4), in clause (d), for the words “Collector of the
District” the following shall be substituted, namely :––

“ (i) Municipal Commissioner, in case of a Municipal
Corporation, or

(ii) Chief Officer, in case of a Municipal Council, or

(iii) Chief Executive Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad or a
Cantonment Board, as the case may be,”;

(4) in sub-section (13), in clause (b), in sub-clause (i), for the word
“Collector” the following shall be substituted, namely :––

“(i) Municipal Commissioner, in case of a Municipal
Corporation,

Amendment
of section 2
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 3
of I of 1923.

I of
1923.

Mah. V
of 1962.

41 of
2006.

Mah.
XL  of
1965.

41 of
2006.

Mah. V
of 1962.

LIX  of
1949.

III of
1888.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 19394

(ii) Chief Officer, in case of a Municipal Council,

(iii) Chief Executive Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad or a
Cantonment Board, as the case may be, ”.

15. Section 3AA of the Entertainments Duty Act shall be deleted.

16. In section 3A of the Entertainments Duty Act,––

(1) for the words “State Government” the words “local authority”
shall be substituted;

(2) the words, figure and letters “and a surcharge provided by
section 3AA” shall be deleted.

17. In section 4 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

18. In section 4B of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

19. In section 4E of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

20. In section 5 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word “Collector”
wherever it occurs, the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

21. In section 6 of the Entertainments Duty Act, in sub-sections (1)
and (2), for the word “Collector” the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

22. In section 8 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the portion
beginning with “The Commissioner” and ending with “the State Government”
the words “Any officer duly authorized by the local authority” shall be
substituted.

23. In section 9A of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall be
substituted.

24. In section 9B of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Government” the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

25. In section 9C of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Collector” the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

26. In section 9D of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Collector” the words “local authority” shall be substituted.

27. In section 10 of the Entertainments Duty Act,—

(1) the existing section 10 shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1)
thereof; and in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, for the words “ State
Government” wherever they occur, the words “local authority” shall
be substituted ;

(2) after sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the following sub-
section shall be added, namely :––

Deletion of
section 3AA
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 3A
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 4

of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 4B
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 4E
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 6

of  I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 5

of  I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 8

of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9A
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9B
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9C
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 9D
of I of 1923.

Amendment
of section 10
of I of 1923.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 5

“(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1) , the powers of the
local authority shall be exercised by ( i) the Municipal
Commissioner, in case of a Municipal Corporation, (ii) the Chief
Officer, in case of a Municipal Council, (iii) the Chief Executive
Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad, (iv) the Chief Executive Officer,
in case of a Cantonment Board, in their respective jurisdiction.”.

28. In section 10A of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the word
“Collector”, wherever it occurs, the following shall be substituted, namely :––

“ (i) Municipal Commissioner, in case of a Municipal Corporation,

(ii) Chief Officer, in case of a Municipal Council, (iii) Chief
Executive Officer, in case of a Zilla Parishad, (iv) Chief Executive
Officer, in case of a Cantonment Board”.

29. In section 12 of the Entertainments Duty Act, for the words “State
Government”, at both the places where they occur, the words “State
Government and local authority” shall be substituted.

30. Section 13 of the Entertainments Duty Act shall be deleted.

31. Schedule appended to the Entertainments Duty Act shall be deleted.

CHAPTER  IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

32. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act
(hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”),
clauses (6A), (31A), (42), (70A), (70B) and (70C) shall be deleted.

33. In section 32 of the Municipal Corporations Act,-

(1) in sub-section (4), the words “octroi or” shall be deleted;

(2) in sub-section (5), the word “octroi” shall be deleted.

34. In section 99 of the Municipal Corporations Act, the words, brackets
and letters “excluding local body tax under clause (aaa) thereof” shall be
deleted.

35. Sections 99A, 99B, 99C and 99D of the Municipal Corporations Act
shall be deleted.

36. In section 127 of the Municipal Corporations Act, in sub-section
(2), clauses (a), (aa) and (aaa) shall be deleted.

37. In section 128 of the Municipal Corporations Act, in clause (5), the
words “octroi  and ” shall be deleted.

38. Section 146 alongwith the heading “Exemptions from Octroi” of the
Municipal Corporations Act shall be deleted.

39. In section 149 of the Municipal Corporations Act, sub-section (6)
shall be deleted.

Amendment
of section
10A of I of
1923.

Amendment
of section 12
of I of 1923.

Deletion of
section 13 of
I of 1923.

Deletion of
Schedule of I
of 1923.

Amendment
of section 2
of  LIX of
1949.
Amendment
of section 32
of  LIX of
1949.

LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 99
of  LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
sections 99A
to 99D of
LIX of 1949.

Amendment
of section 127
of LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 128
of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
section  146
of  LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 149
of LIX of
1949.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀---90---2



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 19396

40. Chapter XIA and sections 152A to 152O of the Municipal
Corporations Act shall be deleted.

41. Chapter XIB and sections 152P, 152Q, 152R, 152S and 152T of the
Municipal Corporations Act shall be deleted.

42. Sections 398 and 398-1A of the Municipal Corporations Act shall
be deleted.

43. In section 466 of the Municipal Corporations Act, in sub-section
(1), in para (A),—

(1) in clause (a), the words “octroi and ” shall be deleted;

(2) in clause (b), the words “octroi and ” shall be deleted;

(3) clause (c) shall be deleted;

(4) clause (e) shall be deleted;

(5) clause (g) shall be deleted.

44. Schedules A, B and C of the Municipal Corporations Act shall be
deleted.

45. In Schedule D of the Municipal Corporations Act, in Chapter VIII,
rules 26, 28 and 29 shall be deleted.

CHAPTER  V

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MOTOR VEHICLES TAX ACT.

46. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles Tax Act, for clause
(1A), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1A) “cost of vehicle” in relation to,—

(a) a vehicle manufactured in India means, cost as per the
final cost mentioned in the purchase invoice of the vehicle issued
either by the manufacturer or the dealer of the vehicle which
shall include the basic manufacturing cost, Central Goods and
Services Tax levied under the Central Goods and Services Tax
Act, 2017, Integrated Goods and Services Tax under the Integrated
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, Cess under the Goods and
Services Tax (Compensation to States) Act, 2017 and Goods and
Services Tax under the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act,
2017 and if the vehicle  has been sold in the State of Maharashtra
from any other State or Union Territory shall include the Goods
and Services Tax paid in such State or Union Territory, and

Amendment
in section 2

of LXV of
1958.

LXV of
1958.

12 of
2017.
13 of
2017.

15 of
2017.

Mah. of
2017.

Deletion of
Chapter XIA
and sections

152A to
152O of LIX

of 1949.

Deletion of
Chapter XIB

and section
152P to 152T

of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
sections 398
and 398-1A

of  LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 466

of LIX of
1949.

Deletion of
Schedules  A,

B and  C of
LIX of 1949.

Amendment
of Schedule
D of LIX of

1949.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 7

(b) a vehicle imported into India irrespective of its place of
manufacture means cost as per the landed value of the vehicle
consisting of the assessable value under the Customs Act, 1962
and the customs duty paid thereupon, including additional duty
paid if any, as endorsed in the Bill of Entry by the Customs
Department, and  Integrated Goods and Services Tax  under the
Integrated Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, and Cess under the
Goods and Services Tax (Compensation to States) Act, 2017, if
any.

Explanation.–(1) The discount given by the manufacturer or
the dealer, if any, shall be added in the final cost as mentioned in
the purchase invoice.

(2)  The vehicles sold prior to the date of commencement of the
Central Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017, the Integrated Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017, the Goods and Services Tax
(Compensation to States) Act, 2017 and the Maharashtra Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 and produced for registration after such date
shall be taxed as per the provisions which were in force prior to the
Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax related laws (Amendments,
Validation and Savings) Act, 2017;”.

CHAPTER  VI

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VILLAGE PANCHAYATS ACT.

47. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter,
in this Chapter, referred to as “the Village Panchayats Act”),  in section 3,
clauses (5), (11A) and (11B) shall be deleted.

48. Section 124 A of the Village Panchayats Act shall be deleted.

CHAPTER  VII

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND

INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965.

49. In section 2 of Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to
as “the Municipal Councils Act”), clause (3A) shall be deleted.

50. In section 87A of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (3), in
clause (xi),––

(1) in sub-clause (a), the word “cess” shall  be deleted;

(2) in sub-clause (b), the word “cess” shall  be deleted.

51. In section 105 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (1),
clauses (aa) and (e) shall be deleted.

52. Chapter IXA and sections 148A to 148O of the Municipal Councils
Act shall be deleted.

Amendment
of section 3
of III of
1959.

Deletion of
section 124A
of 1959.

Amendment
of section 2
of  Mah. XL
of 1965.

Amendment
of section 105
of  Mah. XL
of 1965.

Deletion of
Chapter IXA
and sections
148A to
148O of
Mah. XL of
1965.

52 of
1962.

13 of
2017.

15 of
2017.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

III of
1959.

Amendment
of section 87A
of  Mah. XL
of 1965.

12 of
2017.
13 of
2017.
15 of
2017.

Mah. ....
of

2017.

Mah.
XLII

of
2017.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---90---3



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 19398

CHAPTER  VIII

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA STATE TAX ON PROFESSIONS,
TRADES, CALLINGS AND EMPLOYMENTS ACT, 1975.

53. In Schedule I appended to the Maharashtra State Tax on
Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments Act, 1975, for entry 20A, the
following entry shall be substituted, namely :—

“20A. Persons, registered under the  Maharashtra        2500 per

         Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017.         annum.”.

CHAPTER-IX

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VALUE ADDED

TAX ACT, 2002.

54. In the long title of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002
(hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Value Added Tax Act”), the
words “or purchase” shall be deleted.

55. In the preamble of the Value Added Tax Act, the words “or
purchase” shall be deleted.

56. In section 2 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) clauses (1), (2) and (3-a) shall be deleted;

(2) after clause (3-a) so deleted, the following clause shall be
inserted, namely :—

“(3-b) “appointed date for the Maharashtra Goods and Services
Tax Act” means the date on which the Maharashtra Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017  comes into force;”;

(3) in clause (4), in the Explanation, clause (i) shall be deleted;

(4) clause (7) shall be deleted;

(5) in clause (8), Exception I, II and III shall be deleted;

(6)  clause (9) shall be deleted;

(7) for clause (12), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—

“(12) “goods” means petroleum crude, high speed diesel, motor
spirit (commonly known as petrol), natural gas, aviation turbine
fuel and alcoholic liquor for human consumption;”;

(8) after clause (14) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(14A) “Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act” means the
Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017;”;

(9) clause  (17A) shall be deleted;

(10) in clause (20), Explanation IA shall be deleted;

(11) in clause (24), in the Explanation, in clause (b), in sub-clause
(vi), for the words and brackets “of goods, being food or any other article
for human consumption or any drink (whether or not intoxicating),  the
words “of alcoholic liquor for human consumption” shall be substituted;

(12) in clause (25), Explanation IA shall be deleted;

Mah.
XVI of
1975.

Mah. ....
of 2017.

Mah.
IX of
2005.

Mah. ....
of 2017.

Amendment
to Schedule I
of Mah. XVI

of 1975.

Amendment
in long title

of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
in preamble

of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 2

of Mah. IX of
2005.

Mah. ....
of 2017.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 9

(13) clause (27) shall be deleted;

(14) in clause (29), the words “or purchase tax leviable or as the
case may be,” shall be deleted;

(15) in clause (32), Explanation I shall be deleted;

(16) in clause (33), Explanation I shall be deleted.

57. In section 3 of the Value Added Tax Act,––

(1) sub-section (1) shall be deleted;
(2) in sub-section (2),—

(a) for the words “to whom sub-section (1) does not apply and
whose turnover either of all sales or, as the case may be, purchases
made” the words “whose turnover of all sales of goods” shall be
substituted;

(b) in the proviso, the words “ and purchases” and the words
“or turnover of purchases” shall be deleted;

(3) in sub-section (3), the words “or turnover of purchases” shall
be deleted;

(4) sub-section (5A) shall be deleted;
(5) in sub-section (8), the words “or purchases” shall be deleted.

58. In section 6 of the Value Added Tax Act,––

(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(1) There shall be levied a sales tax on the turnover of sales
of goods, specified in column (2) in SCHEDULE B at the rates set
out against each of them in column (3) of the said Schedule.”;

(2) in sub-section (2) , for the word and letter “ Schedule D”,
the word “ SCHEDULE B” shall be substituted;

59. Sections 6A, 6B and 7 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

60. In section 8 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2), the words “and lubricants” shall be deleted;
(2)  sub-sections (3C) and (3D) shall be deleted.

61. In section 16 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (6), in clause (b), the words “or the turnover of
purchases” shall be deleted;

(2) after sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(6A) The registration of a dealer, who has not effected sale,
during the year 2016-17, of any goods, specified in column (2) in
SCHEDULE A or, as the case may be SCHEDULE B, as it exists
on the appointed date for the Maharashtra Goods and Services
Tax Act, shall be deemed to be cancelled with effect from the said
appointed date:

Provided that, any such dealer, whose registration is deemed
to be cancelled, may apply in the prescribed manner for the
revocation of the cancellation of his registration, if he intends to
carry on the business in these goods.”.

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 6
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Deletion of
sections 6A,
6B and 7 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 8
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 16
of Mah. IX of
2005.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---90---3+



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 193910

62. Section 17 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

63. After section 26A of the Value Added Tax Act, the following section
shall be inserted, namely :—

 “26B. The State Government may enact a scheme by a notification
in the Official Gazette providing for,—

(i) the speedy disposal of proceedings of assessments under
section 23, rectifications under section 24, review under section
25, appeals under section 26, refund proceedings and recovery
proceedings;

(ii) criterion for selection of cases for assessment; and

(iii) criterion for selection of cases for withdrawal of pending
proceedings referred in clause (i).”.

64. In section 30 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (2), after
the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided also that, in case a dealer, whose registration is deemed
to be cancelled under sub-section (6A) of section 16 , files an annual
revised return, as provided under clause (b) or, as the case may be,
clause (c), of sub-section (4) of section 20, for any period starting from
the 1st April 2017,  then the interest shall be payable on the excess amount
of tax, payable as per such annual revised return from the prescribed
dates by the prescribed class of dealers.”.

65. Section 31A of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

66. In section 41 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (4),—

(1) in clause (a), the words “and petroleum products” shall be
deleted;

(2) in clause (b), in the Explanation, the words “and petroleum
products” shall be deleted;

(3) clause (c) shall be deleted.

67. In section 42 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) sub-section (1) shall be deleted;

(2) in sub-section (2), the portion beginning with the words “who
are running any eating house” and ending with the words “or vendors”
shall be deleted;

(3) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be added
and deemed to have been added with effect from the 1st April 2010,
namely :—

Deletion of
section 31A

of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 41
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Amendment
of section 42
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Deletion of
section 17 of

Mah. IX of
2005.

Insertion of
section 26B

in Mah. IX of
2005.

Speedy
disposal of

various
proceedings.

Amendment
of section 30
of Mah. IX of

2005.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 11

“(3B) The registered dealers, who had undertaken the
construction of flats, dwellings or buildings or premises and
transferred them in pursuance of an agreement along with the
land or interest underlying the land and where,—

(a) such agreement is registered on or before the 31st
May 2017; and

(b) the works contract activity in respect of aforesaid
agreement is continued on or after the date notified for the
purpose of the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act or,
as the case may be, payment is received,

then notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section
(3A) or, as the case may be, in the Notification, Finance
Department, No. VAT/2015/CR-65/Taxation.-1 dated the 9th
July 2010, but subject to the conditions stated in column (3)
at Serial Number (3) to (5) and (7) of the aforesaid notification,
the said dealer shall,—

(i) determine the composition amount in lieu of tax
payable on the transfer of the goods (whether as goods or in
some other form), in execution of the works contract under
the Act, at one per cent. of the payment received in respect
of said flats, dwellings or buildings or premises till the date
immediately preceding the date on which the Maharashtra
Goods and Services Tax Act comes into force, and deduct the
amount so determined from the  composition amount paid as
per the aforesaid notification, and

(ii) take the credit into the electronic credit ledger
prescribed under the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax
Act of the balance unutilized amount remained on the date
on which the Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act comes
into force.” ;

(4) sub-sections (3), (3A) and (4) shall be deleted.
68. In section 45 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2), the words “or purchased” shall be deleted;
(2)  in sub-section (3),—

(a) the words “or purchases”, at both the places where they
occur, shall be deleted ;

(b) in the proviso, the words “ or purchase ” shall be deleted.

69. In section 47 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section (2A),
the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

  “(2B) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, if the
order of the Court, Tribunal or the Central Government is passed on
or after the appointed date of the Maharashtra Goods and Services
Tax Act, then the provisions of the said Act, in this regard, shall be
applicable.”.

70. In section 48 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (a),—

(a) sub-clauses (i), (iii) and (iv) shall be deleted ;

(b) in sub-clause (ii), the words “or purchase” shall be deleted ;

(2) sub-section (3) shall be deleted.

Amendment
of section 45
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 47
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 48
of Mah. IX of
2005.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 193912

71. Section 49 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

72. In section 74 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (3), clause

(c) shall be deleted.

73. For section 84 of the Value Added Tax Act, the following section

shall be substituted, namely :—

“84. (1) The Commissioner may, by notification in the Official

Gazette, require any class of registered dealers, as may be specified in

the notification, to declare the details, to the prescribed authority,

regarding capital assets and the stock of goods held by them on the

day immediately preceding the appointed date for the Maharashtra

Goods and Services Tax Act.

(2) The Commissioner may, by notification in the Official Gazette,

require any class of registered dealers, migrating to the Maharashtra

Goods and Services Tax Act to furnish any other information in the

prescribed manner.”.

74. Section 87 of the Value Added Tax Act shall be deleted.

75. In Schedule A appended to the Value Added Tax Act, for the entries

1 to 63, the following entries shall be substituted, namely :—

“1 Toddy and Arak- Nil

2 Goods supplied from bond to foreign going ships

and aircrafts. Nil.”.

76. Schedules B, C, and E appended to the Value Added Tax Act shall

be deleted.

77. Schedule D appended to the Value Added Tax Act shall be renamed

as Schedule B thereof and in Schedule B as so renamed,—

(a) entry 4 shall be deleted ;

(b) in entry 6, in column (2), for the figures and words “ entry 8 of

SCHEDULE C, entry 11 and entry 11A ” the figures and words “ entry

11, 11A and entry 13 ” shall be substituted. ” ;

Deletion of
section 49 of

Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 74
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Substitution
of section 84
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Declaration of
stock of goods

held on the
appointed
date and

calling for
other

information,
etc.

Deletion of
section 87 of

Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
to Schedule A
of Mah. IX of

2005.

Deletion of
Schedules B,

C and E of
Mah. IX of

2005.

Amendment
to Schedule

D of Mah. IX
of 2005.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 1939 13

Savings.III of
1888.

I of
1923.

LIX of
1949.

LXV of
1958.
III of
1959.
Mah.
XL of
1965.
Mah.

XVI of
1975.

Mah. IX
of 2005.

(c) for entries 12, 13 and 14 the following entries shall be substituted,
namely :—

“12 Petroleum Crude 5%
13 Aviation Turbine Fuel sold to a Turbo-prop 5%

 aircraft.
Explanation.—for the purposes of this entry,
“ Turbo-prop Aircraft ” means an aircraft deriving
thrust mainly from propeller, wich may be driven
by either turbine engine or piston engine.
14 Bunker Oil supplied to foreign going ships 6%
15 Natural Gas 13.5%.”.

CHAPTER  X
VALIDATION AND  SAVINGS.

78. (1) Notwithstanding the amendments made in the Mumbai
Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Entertainments Duty Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, the Maharashtra Motor Vehicles
Tax Act, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, the
Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Trades, Callings and Employments
Act, 1975 and the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002  by this Act, those
laws and all rules, regulations, orders, notifications, form, certificates and
notices, appointments and delegation of powers issued under those laws which
are in force immediately before the appointed day of the Maharashtra Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017 shall, subject to the other provisions of this Act,
in so far as they apply, continue to have effect after the appointed day of the
Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 for the purposes of the levy,
returns, assessment, re-assessment, appeal, determination, revision,
rectification, reference, limitation, production and inspection of accounts and
documents and search of premises, transfer of proceedings, payment and
recovery, calculation of cumulative quantum of benefits, exemption from
payment of tax and deferment of due date for payment of tax, cancellation of
the certificate of Entitlement, collection or deduction of tax at source, refund
or set off of any tax, withholding of any refund, exemption from payment of
tax, collection of statistics, the power to make rules, the imposition of any
penalty, or of interest or forfeiture of sum where such levy, returns
assessment, re-assessment, appeal, determination, revision, rectification,
reference, limitation, payment and recovery, calculation of cumulative
quantum of benefits, exemption from payment of tax and deferment of due
date for payment of tax, cancellation of the certificate of entitlement,
collection, deduction of tax at source, refund, set-off, withholding of any
refund, exemption, collection of statistics, the power to make rules, limitation,
production and inspection of accounts and documents and search of premises,
transfer of proceedings, penalty, interest or forfeiture of any sum relates to
any period ending before the appointed day of the Maharashtra Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 or for any other purpose whatsoever connected with
or incidental to any of the purposes aforesaid and whether or not the tax,
penalty, interest, sum forfeited or tax deducted at source, if any, in relation
to such proceedings is paid before or after the appointed day of the
Maharashtra Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017.

Mah.  ....
of 2017.

Mah.  ....
of 2017.

Mah.  ....
of 2017.

Mah.  ....
of 2017.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 29, 2017/VªÉä¹`ö 8, ¶ÉEäò 193914

(2) Without prejudice to the provisions contained in the foregoing sub-
section, the provisions of section 7 of the Maharashtra General Clauses Act,
shall apply in relation to the repeal of any of the provisions of the Acts referred
to in sub-section (1).

I of
1904.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



1¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒú 16, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 26, ¶ÉEäò 1939

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and to
repeal the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Payment of Lump-sum

Contribution by Factories in Lieu of Taxes) Rules, 1961.

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats Act and to repeal the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Payment
of Lump-sum Contribution by Factories in Lieu of Taxes) Rules, 1961, for the
purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment) and the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Payment of Lump-
sum Contribution by Factories in Lieu of Taxes) Rules (Repeal) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Sate Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

Short title and
commencement.

III of
1959.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 2(3)] ¨ÉÆMÉ³ý´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 16, 2018/{ÉÉè¹Éù 26, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 11

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ
Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) and the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats (Payment of Lump-sum Contribution by Factories in Lieu of Taxes) Rules (Repeal)
Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. XI of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

————————

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XI OF 2018

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “Maharashtra
Government Gazette”, on the 16th January 2018.)

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------11---1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒú 16, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 26, ¶ÉEäò 19392

2. Section 125 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Act”) shall be deleted.

3. In section 176 of the principal Act, in sub­section (2), clause (xxvii)
shall be deleted.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Payment of Lump-sum
Contribution by Factories in Lieu of Taxes) Rules, 1961 shall stand repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding deletion of section 125 of the principal Act
and repeal of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Payment of Lump-
sum Contribution by Factories in Lieu of Taxes) Rules, 1961, the
agreements entered into or executed in pursuance thereof, shall be valid
for a period mentioned in the agreements and shall then expire :

Provided that, the tax may be levied and collected separately,—
(i) if during the period the agreement is effective, Panchayat

imposes any new taxes as per the provisions of the principal Act or
rules made thereunder ; or

(ii) if the occupier constructs a new building in his premises
or makes material alterations in any existing building.

III of
1959.

Deletion of
section 125 of

III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 176
of III of 1959.

Repeal and
saving.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



1¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 28, 2018/SÉèjÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1940

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXIV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 28th March 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, for the
purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 on the
9th February 2018 ;

III of
1959.

 Mah.
Ord. V

of 2018.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 24(2)] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 28, 2018/SÉèjÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 3, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 56

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ
Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. XXIV of
2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀------56--1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 28, 2018/SÉèjÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 19402

Short title and
commencement.

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of
the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 9th February 2018.

2. In section 10-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act
(hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), for the existing provisos, the
following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or by-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 30th June 2019, in
accordance with the election programme declared by the State Election
Commission, a person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for
verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the
nomination papers but who has not received the Validity Certificate on
the date of filing of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the
nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date on which he is declared elected, the Validity
Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a member.”.

3. In section 30-1A of the principal Act, for the existing provisos, the
following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of Sarpanch for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 30th June
2019, in accordance with the election programme declared by the State
Election Commission, a person who has applied to the Scrutiny
Committee for verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of
filing of the nomination papers but who has not received the Validity
Certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall submit,
alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date on which he is declared elected, the Validity
Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee:

Amendment
of section

10-1A of III
of 1959.

III of
1959.

Amendment
of section

30-1A of III
of 1959.



3¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 28, 2018/SÉèjÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1940

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a Sarpanch.”.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Ordinance,
2018, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. V
of 2018 and
saving.

 Mah.
Ord. V

of 2018.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004  AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI
PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. LIV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 13th August 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter
referred to as “the said Ordinance”) on the 19th July 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Bill,
2017 (L.A. Bill No. LVI of 2017) (hereinafter referred to as “the said Bill”) for
converting the said Ordinance into an Act of the State Legislature, was
Introduced in the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 10th August 2017 ;

Mah. Ord.
XVI of 2017.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEò 62] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 9, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 128

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. LIV of
2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

(1)

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--128------1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 19402

AND WHEREAS as the session of the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly
was prorogued on the 11th August 2017, the said Bill could not be passed by
the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213(2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance would have ceased to operate on the 3rd September
2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it was considered expedient to continue the provisions
of the said Ordinance and, therefore, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as
“ the said Continuance Ordinance ”) was promulgated by the Governor of
Maharashtra on the 1st September 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
11th December 2017, the said Bill was passed with amendment by the
Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 19th December 2017 and
transmitted to the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS the said Bill has been passed by the Legislative Council
with further amendments on the 22nd December 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS, before the amendments to the said Bill made by the
Maharashtra Legislative Council, could be considered by the Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly, the session of the Legislative Assembly was prorogued
on the 22nd December 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS, as provided by article 213(2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Continuance Ordinance would have ceased to operate at the
expiration of six weeks from re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is,
after the 21st January 2018 ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session;
and the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances existed
which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action to continue
the operation of the provisions of the said Continuance Ordinance, for the
purposes hereinafter appearing; and, therefore, promulgated the Maharashtra
Village Panchayats (Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2018
(hereinafter referred to as “the said Continuance Ordinance, 2018”) on the
20th January 2018 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance, 2018 by an Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in
the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 19th July 2017.

2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Act”),—

(a) after clause (11AA), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :–

“(11 AAA) “member” means a member duly elected as a member of
panchayat under section 11 and include the Sarpanch of panchayat
elected directly under section 30A-1A ; ” ;

Short title and
commencement.

III of
1959.

Amendment of
section 3 of III

of 1959.

Mah.
Ord. II
of
2018.

Mah.
Ord.
XVIII
of
2017.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

(b) in clause (17) after the word and figures “section 30” the figures,
letters and sign “ , 30A- 1A” shall be inserted.

3. In section 7 of the principal Act, after sub­section (3), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(3A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is elected
directly under section 30A-1A, unless otherwise provided in this Act,
all meetings of the Gram Sabha after each general election to a
panchayat, shall be presided over by the Sarpanch and in his absence
by the Upa-Sarpanch; and in absence of both Sarpanch and Upa-
Sarpanch, it shall be presided over by senior most member of panchayat
by age present in that meeting of the Gram Sabha. In case no member
of panchayat is present, the said meeting of the Gram Sabha shall be
adjourned for a period of one week, and such adjourned meeting shall
be presided over by Sarpanch and in his absence by Upa-Sarpanch and
in absence of both the Sarpanch and Upa-Sarpanch by the senior most
member of the panchayat by age present in the meeting of Gram Sabha.
In case no member of panchayat is present, such meeting shall be
presided over by an officer authorized by the Block Development Officer
in that behalf. ” .

4. In section 10 of the principal Act, after sub­section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply
with the modifications that, in sub-section (1), in clause (a), before
sub­clause (i) the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(i-A) Sarpanch elected under section 30A-1A- ex officio member ;
and ”.”.

5. In section 13 of the principal Act, for sub-sections (1) and (2), the
following sub­sections shall be substituted, namely :—

“(1) Every person whose name is in the list of voters shall, unless
disqualified under this Act, or any other law for the time being in force,
be qualified to vote at the election of, a member for the ward to which
such list pertains and, Sarpanch of panchayat to be elected directly.

(2) Every person whose name is in the list of voters and who is not
less than 21 years of age on the last date fixed for making nomination
for every general election or bye-election shall, unless disqualified under
this Act, or under any other law for the time being in force, be qualified
to be elected for any ward of the village and for Sarpanch of panchayat.
No person whose name is not entered in the list of voters for such village
shall be qualified to be elected for any ward of the village and Sarpanch
of panchayat.

(2A) Every person who is not less than 21 years of age on the last
date fixed for making nomination for every general election or
bye-election and whose name is in the list of voters and who is born on
or after 1st January 1995, and who is not disqualified under this Act, or
under any other law for the time being in force shall, unless possesses
minimum 7th standard of school education passing certificate or acquired
educational qualification equivalent to 7th standard, as certified by the
competent authority, be qualified to be elected as Sarpanch. ” .

Amendment
of section 10
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 13
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 7 of
III of 1959.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--128------2



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 19404

6. In section 14 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

(i) in clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “five years” the
words “six years” shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (d), for the words “five years” the words “six years”
shall be substituted.

7. In section 15 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), after the word
and figure “section 11” the words, figures, letters and sign “or section 30A-
1A, as the case may be” shall be added.

8. In section 16 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words
“State Government” at both the places where they occur, the word
“Commissioner” shall be substituted.

9. In section 29 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words
“forward it to the Secretary” the words “forward it within seven days to the
Secretary” shall be substituted.

10. In section 30 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is elected
directly under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply with
the following modifications :—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :–

“(1) Every panchayat shall be presided over by a Sarpanch.”;

(b) sub-section (2) shall be deleted ;

(c) in sub-section (4), for the words “the members belonging to” the words
“persons belonging to” shall be substituted. ” .

11. After section 30, the following section shall be inserted, namely :—

“30A-1A. (1) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2017 in respect of the panchayat to which the
general election is to be held, subject to provisions of sub-sections (4), (5)
and (6) of section 30, every panchayat shall have a Sarpanch who shall be
elected by the persons whose names are included in the list of  voters for
village under section 12.

(2) Election of the Sarpanch shall be held simultaneously with the
general elections of the panchayat and the procedure regarding holding of
elections to the panchayat shall, mutatis mutandis, apply to such election.

(3) If at an election, no Sarpanch is elected, a fresh election shall be
held to elect a Sarpanch, and if there is a failure to elect a Sarpanch at the
fresh election, such vacancy may, notwithstanding anything contained in
this Act, be filled by election by the elected members from amongst
themselves and the term of Sarpanch elected under this sub-section shall
be co-terminus with the term of members of the panchayat.

(4) Any person elected under sub-section (3) shall be deemed to be duly
elected at an election under this section.

Amendment
of section 14

of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 15

of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 16

of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 29

of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 30

of III of 1959.

Insertion of
section 30A-

1A in III of
1959.

Mah.
LIV of
2018.

Direct
election of
Sarpanch.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 1940 5

(5) If, in the election of the Sarpanch, there is an equality of votes, the
result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn by the State Election
Commissioner or the officer appointed by him for the purpose.

(6) In case of a dispute regarding election of the Sarpanch, the
provisions of section 15 shall, mutatis mutandis, apply. ” .

12. In section 30A of the principal Act,—

(a) after sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :–

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected, the election of the Upa-Sarpanch shall be held in the first
meeting held after every general election. ” ;

(b) after sub-section (2), the following  sub-section shall be added,
namely :–

“(2A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected, the provisions of sub-section (3) of section 30 shall, mutatis
mutandis, apply in the case of Upa-Sarpanch.

13. In section 33 of the principal Act, after sub-section (5), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :–

“(6) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly elected
under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply with the
following modifications :—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “election of Sarpanch and
Upa- Sarpanch” at both the places where they occurs, the words “election of
Upa-Sarpanch” shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(1A) The election of the Sarpanch shall be held in accordance with the
provisions of section 30A-1A of this Act.”;

(c) in sub-section (2), after the words “presided over by” the words “the
Sarpanch and if the post of Sarpanch is vacant by” shall be inserted;

(d) in sub-section (3), the words “Sarpanch and” shall be deleted;

(e) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted,–

“(4) If, in the election of Upa-Sarpanch there is an equality of votes, the
Sarpanch shall have the right to exercise casting vote, and if the post of
Sarpanch is vacant, the result of elections shall be decided by lot drawn in
the presence of the officer presiding in such manner as he may determine.”;

(f) in sub-section (5),–

(i) the words “Sarpanch or” shall be deleted;

(ii) after the word, brackets and figure “ sub-section (1) ” the words
“Sarpanch or” shall be inserted.”.

14. In section 35 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :–

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A- 1A, the provisions of this section shall apply with
the following modifications:—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “one-third” the words “two-
third” shall be substituted;

Amendment of
section 35 of
III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 30A
of III of 1959.

Amendment of
section 33 of
III of 1959.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--128------2+



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 19406

(b) in sub-section (3), for the portion beginning with the words “If
the motion” and ending with the words “against the Sarpanch;” the
following portion shall be substituted, namely :—

“ If the motion of no-confidence is carried by a majority of not less
than three-fourth of the total number of the members who are for the
time being entitled to sit and vote at any meeting of the panchayat, the
Sarpanch or the Upa- Sarpanch, as the case may be, and ratified before
the special Gram Sabha by the secret ballot in the presence and under
the Chairmanship of the Officer appointed for the purpose by the
Collector, shall forthwith stop, exercising all the powers and, performing
all the functions and duties of the office and thereupon such powers,
functions and duties shall vest in the Upa-Sarpanch, in case the motion
is carried out against the Sarpanch ;”;

(c) for the fourth proviso, the following provisos shall be
substituted, namely :–

“Provided also that, no such motion of no-confidence shall be brought
within a period of two years from the date of election of Sarpanch or
Upa-Sarpanch and before the six months preceding the date on which
the term of panchayat expires :

Provided also that, if the no-confidence motion fails, then no motion
shall be brought before the passage of time of next two years .”.”.

15. In section 38 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), after clause
(i) the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(i-a) in respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, the Sarpanch shall also exercise the
following powers, functions and duties,—

(a) finalise the agenda of panchayat meetings :

Provided that, if three or more members demands regarding
inclusion of any item on agenda for immediate next meeting, the
Sarpanch shall include the same in next meeting :

Provided further that, no ad-hoc financial business shall be
transacted unless it forms a part of the circulated agenda :

Provided also that, if the panchayat resolves on any subject
that is detrimental to the well-being of the village at large in the
opinion of Sarpanch, the Sarpanch shall cause the resolution to be
kept for final decision immediately in the next following Gram-
Sabha, and the decision of the said Gram Sabha shall be final ;

(b) prepare the annual budget of panchayat ;

(c) exercise all other powers to implement the schemes in
consultation with panchayat ; ”.

16. In section 39 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words
“five years” the words “six years” shall be substituted.

17. In section 43 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), after the
existing proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided further that, the post of the directly elected Sarpanch
fallen vacant under this sub-section shall be filled in by election in the
manner laid down in section 30A-1A, within six months from the date of
such vacancy.”.

Amendment
of section 38

of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 43

of III of 1959.

Amendment of
section 39 of

III of 1959.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 1940 7

18. In section 49 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), in proviso,—
(i) before clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted,

namely :—
“(a1) the Sarpanch shall be the ex officio Chairman ; ” ;

(ii) after clause (f), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(g) Gramsevak shall be ex officio Member- Secretary . ” .

19. In section 62 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1AA) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply
with the following modifications :—

(a) for sub-sections (1) and (1A), the following sub-sections shall
be sustituted, namely,—

“(1) The Sarpanch shall determine annually on or before
5th January of every year in such form as may be prescribed, a
statement of,––

(a) the opening balance in the fund and estimated income
of the panchayat for the following financial year ;

(b) the expenditure proposed on establishment and
discharge of its duties under section 45 ;

(c) the amount to be contributed to the District Village
Development Fund established under section 133 ;

(d) the statement made under clause (a), (b) or (c), as the
case may be, shall be placed by the Sarpanch, before the
panchayat ;

(e) the panchayat shall in respect of the said statement,
finalise its recommendations on or before the 31st of January ;

(f) the statement along with the recommendation of the
panchayat under clause (e), shall be placed before the Gram
Sabha, which may ratify it on or before 28th of February ;

(g) after the decision of the Gram Sabha under clause (f),
the said statement shall be submitted to the Panchayat Samiti.

(1-A) If, on or before the date specified in sub-section (1),–

(a) the Sarpanch fails to submit the statement ; or

(b) the panchayat fails to make recommendation in respect of
the statement ; or

(c) the Gram Sabha fails to take decision in respect of
ratification of the recommendations,

the Secretary shall prepare the statement, regarding the
mandatory and office expenditure to be carried out and submit it
to the Panchayat Samiti in the form prescribed under the said sub-
section.”;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the portion beginning with words
“ The Panchayat Samiti ” and ending with words “ increased or
decreased: ” the portion “ The Panchayat Samiti shall, either
approve the statement or direct that the proposed expenditure on

Amendment
of section 62
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 49
of III of 1959.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 19408

any of the duties falling under section 45 shall be increased or

decreased on or before 31st March of the every year. Expenditure

shall be carried out as per this statement till the date budgetary

process outlined in sub-section (1) of this section is completed:”

shall be substituted ;

(c) in second proviso of sub-section (2), after the words “ be

increased or decreased” the words and figure “ on or before

31st March of every year and in case of revised and supplementary

statement ” shall be inserted. ”.

20. Section 62A of the principal Act, shall be re-numbered as sub-section

(1) of that section and after sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the following

sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“(2) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly

elected under section 30A-1A, a Sarpanch may at anytime during the

financial year for which any such statement has been approved as

aforesaid cause a revised or supplementary statement to be prepared.

Every such revised or supplementary statement shall be considered

and approved by the Panchayat Samiti in the same manner as if it were

an original statement, and the provisions of section 62 shall apply in

relation to such revised or supplementary statement. ” .

21. In section 145 of the principal Act, sub-section (1 A) shall be deleted.

22. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the

Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, as amended by this Act, the State

Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette, as the occasion

arises, make such provisions not inconsistent with provisions of the said

Act, as amended by this Act, as may appear it to be necessary or expedient

for purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period

of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may

be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Amendment
of section 62A
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 145
of III of 1959.

Power to
remove

difficulty. III of
1959.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 13, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 22, ¶ÉEäò 1940 9

III of
1959.

Mah.
Ord. II

of 2018.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.  II
of 2018 and
saving.

23. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment and
Continuance) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, as amended by the
said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the
case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the said Act, as amended
by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LXVI OF 2018.
(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the

“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 14th December 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS, the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore promulgated the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 on the 11th October 2018 ;

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of
the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic
of India as follows :—

 III of 1959.
Mah. V

of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. XXI
of 2018.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 85(3)] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®ú, Êb÷ºÉåþ¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 167

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LXVI of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA  G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------167-1 (1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 19402

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 11th October 2018.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VILLAGE

PANCHAYATS ACT.

2.   In section 10-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter
in this Chapter referred to as “ the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act ”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “ six months ” the
words “ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “ six months ” the words
“ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—
“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any

person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “six months” specified in such undertaking shall be
deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

3.   In section 30-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act,—
(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “ six months ” the

words “ twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “ six months” the words “twelve
months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall
be deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA ZILLA PARISHADS

AND PANCHAYAT SAMITIS ACT, 1961.

4. In section 12A of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
Act, 1961 (hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as “ the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act ”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “ six months ” the
words “ twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

Short title
and

commence-
ment.

Mah.
LXVI of
2018.

III of
1959.

Amendment of
section 30-1A of

III of 1959.

Amendment of
section 10-1A
of III of 1959.

Mah.
LXVI
of 2018.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section

12A of Mah.V
of 1962.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words
“ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall
be deemed to have been substituted as “twelve months”.”.

5.   In section 42 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
Act, in sub-section (6A),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “ six months ” the
words “ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “ six months ” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall be
deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

6. In section 67 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
Act, in sub-section (7A),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “six months” the
words “twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from the 7th May 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words
“ twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall
be deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

CHAPTER IV
MISCELLANEOUS

7.   (1) Nothing in this Act shall affect the elections conducted by the
State Election Commission for conducting the elections or any programme
declared by it therefor, prior to the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Act, 2018,  for filling up the resultant vacancy in view of the
provisions of section 10-1A or section 30-1A of the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats Act ; section 12A or sub-section (6A) of section 42 or sub-section
(7A) of section 67 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act,
1961, as it stood prior to such date of commencement.

Mah.
LXVI of

2018.

Amendment
of section 67
of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah.LXVI
of 2018.

Amendment
of section 42
of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah.
LXVI  of

2018.

Saving as to
certain
elections.

III of
1959.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
LXVI of

2018.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------167-2



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 19404

8.  Any person, who has obtained the Caste Certificate and Validity Certificate,
but has not filed such certificate prior to the date of commencement of this Act,
shall not be deemed to be disqualified under the provisions of the relevant
Panchayat law, if he submits such certificate within a period of three months from
the date of commencement of this Act :

Provided that, the provisions of this section shall not apply where the State
Election Commission has already prior to the date of commencement of this Act
held elections to fill the vacancy of such person or declared the programme for
holding of such election.

9.  (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, as amended by this Act, the
State Government may, as the occasion arises, by an Order published in the
Official Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the
said Acts as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or
expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after expiry of the period of two
years from the commencement of this Act.

10. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken (including
any notification or order issued) under the corresponding provisions of the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of said Acts, as amended by this Act.

Power to
remove

difficulty.

Saving as to
certain

disqualifications.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.

XXI of 2018
and saving.

Mah.
Ord. XXI
of 2018.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI
MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI
400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH
ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 5, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 1941 1

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Village

Panchayats Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted

in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats

(Amendment) Act, 2020.

2. In section 7 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter

referred to as “ the principal Act ”),—

(1) sub-section (3) shall be deleted;

(2) in sub-section (3A), the words “ In respect of the panchayat to

which the Sarpanch is elected directly under section 30A-1A, ” shall be

deleted.

III of

1959.

Short title.

Amendment

of section 7 of

III of 1959.

III of

1959.

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the

following translation in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats

(Amendment) Act, 2020 (Mah. Act No. II of 2020), is hereby published under the

authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

—————————

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. II OF 2020.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the

‘‘Maharashtra Government Gazette’’, on the 5th March 2020).

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 6, +ÆEòú 11] MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 5, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 1941 [{ÉÞ¹`äö 5, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 22

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---22-1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 5, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 19412

3. In section 13 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), the words “ and, Sarpanch of panchayat to be

elected directly ” shall be deleted ;

(2) in sub-section (2), —

(a) for the words “for any ward of the village and for Sarpanch

of panchayat ”, the words “as a member for any ward of the village ”

shall be substituted ;

(b) the words “ and Sarpanch  of panchayat ” shall be deleted ;

(3) in sub-section (2A), for the word “ Sarpanch ” the word “member ”

shall be substituted.

4. In section 15 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), the words, figures

and letters “or section 30A-1A, as the case may be” shall be deleted.

5. After section 30A-1A of the principal Act, the following section shall

be inserted, namely:—

“ 30A-1B. After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Village

Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2020, in respect of the general elections and

by-elections to panchayat, the provisions of section 30A-1A shall cease to

apply and every panchayat have a Sarpanch, who shall be elected under

section 30 and the provisions of section 33 shall apply therefor.”.

6. In section 35 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “one-third” the words “two-third”

shall be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (3),—

(a) for the words “ two-third ” the words “ three-fourth ” shall

be substituted ;

(b) for the fourth proviso, the following provisos shall be

substituted, namely :—

“ Provided also that, no such motion of no-confidence shall

be moved within a period of two years from the date of election

of Sarpanch or Upa-Sarpanch and before six months preceding

the date on which the term of panchayat expires :

Provided also that, if the no-confidence motion fails, then

no motion shall be moved within next two years from the date

of failure of no-confidance motion.”.

7. In section 38 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2), after clause (j), the following clauses shall be
inserted, namely :—

“ (k) finalise the agenda of panchayat meetings :

Provided that, if three or more members demands
inclusion of any item on agenda for immediate next meeting,

the Sarpanch shall include the same in the next meeting :

Amendment

of section 13

of III of 1959.

Amendment

of section 15

of III of 1959.

Insertion of

section 30A-

1B in III of

1959.

Non-

application of

section 30A-

1A.

Amendment

of section 35

of III of 1959.

Mah. II

of 2020.

Amendment

of section 38

of III of 1959.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 5, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 1941 3

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---22-2

Provided further that, no ad-hoc financial business shall

be transacted in the meeting unless it forms a part of the

circulated agenda ;

(l) prepare the annual bedget of panchayat ;

(m) exercise all other powers to impelement the schemes in
consultation with panchayat ;” ;

(2) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely :—

“ (4A) If in the opinion of the Sarpanch or the person who

presides over the meeting, the resolution of the panchayat on any
subject is detrimental to the well-being of the village at large, the

person presiding over the meeting shall cause the resolution of the
panchayat to be kept for final decision in the immediate next

following Gram Sabha, and the decision of the Gram Sabha thereon

shall be final.”.

8. In section 43 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the second
proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided further that, the post of directly elected Sarpanch fallen

vacant, then such post shall be filled in by election from amongst the
members of the panchayat themselves within thirty days from the date

of such vacancy.”.

9. In section 62 of the principal Act,—

(1) for sub-sections (1), (1A) and (1AA), the following sub-sections
shall be substiuted, namely:—

“ (1) The Sarpanch shall determine annually on or before the

28th February of every year, in such form as may be prescribed, a
statement of,—

(a) the opening balance in the fund and estimated income

of the panchayat for the following financial year;

(b) the expenditure proposed on establishment and

discharge of its duties under section 45 ;

(c) the amount to be contributed to the District Village

Development Fund established under section 133 ;

(d) the statement made under clause (a), (b) or (c), as the

case may be, shall be placed by the Sarpanch before the
panchayat.

(1A) The panchayat shall in respect of the said statement,

finalise its recommendations on or before the 7th of March of the

same year.

(1B) The statement along with the recommendation of the

panchayat under sub-section (1A), shall be placed before the Gram

Sabha, which may ratify it on or before the 15th of March of the

same year and the decision of the Gram Sabha shall be submitted

to the Panchayat Samiti.

(1C) If, on or before the date specified in,—

(a) sub-section (1), the Sarpanch fails to submit the

statement ; or

Amendment

of section 43

of III of 1959.

Amendment

of section 62

of III of 1959.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 5, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 19414

(b) sub-section (1A), the panchayat fails to make

recommendation in respect of the statement; or

(c) sub-section (1B), the Gram Sabha fails to take decision

in respect of ratification of the recommendations,

the Secretary shall prepare the statement, regarding the

mandatory and office expenditure to be carried out, and submit

it to the Panchayat Samiti in the form prescribed under the

said sub-sections.”;

(2) in sub-section (2),—

(a) for the portion beginning with the words “ The Panchayat

Samiti” and ending with the words “ increased or decreased :” the

following shall be substituted, namely :—

“ The Panchayat Samiti  shall, either approve the

statement or direct that the proposed expenditure on any of

the duties falling under section 45 shall be increased or

decreased on or before the 31st March of the every year.

Expenditure shall be carried out as per the statement till the

date budgetary process outlined in sub-sections (1), (1A) and

(1B) is completed :”;

(b) in second proviso, after the words “ be increased or

decreased ” the words, figures and letters “on or before the

31st  March of every year and in case of the revised and

supplementary statement” shall be inserted.

10. For section 62A of the principal Act, the following section shall be

substituted, namely :—

“ 62A. A Sarpanch may at anytime during the financial year for

which any such statement has been approved, cause a revised or

supplementary statement to be prepared. Every such revised or

supplementary statement shall be considered and approved by the

Panchayat Samiti in the same manner as if it were an original statement

and the provisions of section 62 shall apply in relation to such revised

or supplementary statement.” .

11. In section 145 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following

sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“ (1A) If more than half of the total number of seats in a panchayat

have become vacant, the State Government may, by an order published

in the Official Gazette, dissolve such panchayat :

Provided that, the provisions of this sub-section shall not apply in

respect of a panchayat where the Sarpanch is directly elected under

section 30A-1A.”.

12. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 30A-1B of the

principal Act, if any order in respect of election or bye-election of a panchayat

is issued or any procedure for election of or bye-election of the panchayat is

commenced, before the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Village

Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2020, such election shall be held as per the

provisions of section 30A-1A.

Amendment

of section 62A

of III of 1959.

Revised or

supplementary

budget.

Amendment

of section 145

of III of 1959.

Removal of

doubts.

Mah. II

of 2020.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 5, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 1941 5

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in second proviso to sub-section

(1) of section 43 of the principal Act, as amended by this Act, if any order in

respect of filling of casual vacancy of directly elected Sarpanch is issued or

any procedure for filling of casual vacancy of directly elected Sarpanch is

commenced, before the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Village

Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2020, such election shall be held as per the

provisions of the second proviso to sub-section (1) of section 43, as it existed

before the commencement of this Act.

13. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the

principal Act, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, by an

order published in the Official Gazette, as the occasion arises, make such

provisions not inconsistent with the provisions of the principal Act, as

amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the

purpose of the removing of the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made, after the expiry of a period

of two years, from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may

be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Mah. II

of 2020.

Power to

remove

difficulty.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,

RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,

MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,

21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.




