
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961

Act 5 of 1962

Keyword(s):
Associate Councilor or Associate Member, Backward Class, Block Grant, Block
Development Officer, Chief Executive Officer, Co-Operative Society,
Councillor, Development Scheme, District, District List, Election, List of
Voters, Panchayat, Panchayat Samiti, President, President Authority, Relevant
Code, Residing in a Block, Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes, Standing
Committee, Subjects Committee, Vice-President, Zilla Parishad

Amendments appended: 10 of 1979, 37 of 2006, 21 of 2007, 5 of 2009, 16 of
2010, 24 of 2010, 33 of 2010, 19 of 2011, 39 of 2011, 18 of 2012, 21 of 2016, 25
of 2016, 28 of 2017, 30 of 2018, 47 of 2018, 66 of 2018, 79 of 2018, 32 of 2019, 
4 of 2022, 18 of 2022, 19 of 2022, 46 of 2022, 47 of 2022, 7 of 2023

















































































































































































































































































































































































































































¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXI OF  2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Govenor in the
‘‘ Maharashtra Government Gazette ’’, on the 7th May 2016).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS,   it   is   expedient   further   to   amend   the Maharashtra
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of
the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis  (Amendment) Act, 2016.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Short title.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 2, +ÆEòú 32(3)] ¶ÉÊxÉ´ÉÉ®ú, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 3,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 55

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2016
(Mah. Act No. XXI of 2016), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö----55-1 (1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938

2. To section 12A of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and  Panchayat
Samitis  Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), the
following provisos shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or by-elections for which the last date
of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December 2017, in accor-
dance with the election programme declared by the State Election Com-
mission, a person  who  has  applied to  the  Scrutiny  Committee  for
verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomina-
tion papers but who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date
of filing of the nomination papers shall submit, along with the nomina-
tion papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any other proof
of having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date on which he is declared elected, the Validity
Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if the person fails to produce the Validity Cer-
tificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is de-
clared elected, his election shall be deemed to have   been   terminated
retrospectively   and   he   shall   be disqualified for being a Councillor.”.

3.   In section 42 of the principal Act, to sub-section (6A), the following
provisos shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of President for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December
2017, in accordance with the election programme declared, a person who
has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination papers but
who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, along with the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any other proof of
having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit within a period of six months
from the date on which he is declared elected, the Validity Certificate
issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if the person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a President.”.

4. In section 67 of the principal Act, to sub-section (7A),   the
following provisos shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of Chairman for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December 2017,

Amendment
of section

12 A of Mah.
V of 1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section

42 of Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section

67 of Mah. V
of 1962.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 3

in accordance with the election programme declared, a person who has
applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification of his Caste Certificate
before the date of filing of the nomination papers but who has not received
the Validity Certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall
submit, along with the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any other proof
of having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit within a period of six
months from the date on which he is declared elected, the Validity
Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if the person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a Chairman.”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXV OF 2016.
(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in

the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 8th August 2016).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore,
promulgated the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2016, on the 1st June 2016 ;

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. X

of 2016.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--84---1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 2, +ÆEò 54] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®úúú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 8, 2016/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 84

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra  Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second
Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XXV of 2016), is hereby published under the authority of the
Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,

Principal Secretary and R.L.A. to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————---------------

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

(1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 8, 2016/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉø 17, ¶ÉEäò 19382

Mah. V
of 1962.

Short title
and commen-

cement.

Mah.
XXV
of
2016.

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act
of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2016.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st June 2016.

2. In section 9 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), after sub-
section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(2A) If in the general election,  less than two-thirds of the total
number of Councillors are elected then, the State Election Commission
shall not publish the names and permanent addresses of such elected
Councillors :

Provided that, before coming into force of the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2016, where
less than fifty per cent. of the total number of Councillors are elected
and if the State Election Commission has published the names of such
elected candidates, then such candidates shall have no right to claim
and continue as Councillors :

Provided further that, in such case, the State Election Commission
shall hold the fresh election of such Zilla Parishad.”.

3. In section 57 of the principal Act, after  sub-section (3), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(3A) If in the general election, less than two-thirds of the total
number of members are elected then, the State Election Commission
shall not publish the names and permanent addresses of such elected
members :

Provided that, before coming into force of the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2016, where
less than  fifty per cent. of the total number of members are elected and
if the State Election Commission has published the names of such elected
candidates, then such candidates shall have no right to claim and continue
as members :

Provided further that, in such case, the State Election Commission
shall hold the fresh election of such Panchayat Samiti.”.

4. (1)  The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2016, is herby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the principal Act as
amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or
issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the principal
Act, as amended by this Act.

Amendment
of section 9

of Mah. V of
1962.

Amendment
of section 57
of Mah. V of

1962.

Mah.
XXV
of
2016.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. X
of 2016 and

saving.

Mah.
Ord. X
of 2016.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



1¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, BÊ|É±É 15, 2017/SÉèjÉ 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XXVIII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor
in  the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 15th April 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and
the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take
immediate action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act
and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for
the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 on the 31st January 2017 ;

III of
1959.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. V

of 2017.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEòú 36(3)] ¶ÉÊxÉý´ÉÉ®ú, BÊ|É±É 15, 2017/SÉèjÉ 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 71

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ

Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

 In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2017,  (Mah. Act No. XXVIII of 2017), is hereby published under the
authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

––––––––––––———

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------71---1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, BÊ|É±É 15, 2017/SÉèjÉ 25, ¶ÉEäò 19392

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 31st January 2017.

2. In section 14 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, in
sub-section (1), in clause (j-5), after the words “of the Gram Sabha” the words
“or of the Chief Executive Officer or an officer designated by him; or a self-
certificate” shall be inserted.

3. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, in sub-section (1), in clause (p), after the words “of the
Gram Sabha” the words “or of the Chief Executive Officer or an officer
designated by him; or a self-certificate” shall be inserted.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the Maharashtra
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961 as amended by the said
Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case
may be, under the corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts as amended
by this Act.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 14 of

III of 1959.

III of
1959.

Amendment
of section 16 of
Mah. V of 1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. V
of 2017.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. V of

2017 and saving.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, BÊ|É±É 9, 2018/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and

Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS,   it   is   expedient   further   to   amend   the Maharashtra

Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes

hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the

Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and

Panchayat Samitis  (Amendment) Act, 2018.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Short title.

(1)

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 27(3)] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®úúúú, BÊ|É±É 9, 2018/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 3,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 63

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Zill Parishad and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2018
(Mah. Act No. XXX  of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

I/c Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

————————

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXX OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “Maharashtra
Government Gazette”, on the 9th April 2018).

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö----63-1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, BÊ|É±É 9, 2018/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940

2. In section 12A of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and  Panchayat
Samitis  Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), for the
existing provisos, the following provisos shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 30th June 2019, in
accordance with the election programme declared by the State
Election Commission, a person  who  has  applied to  the  Scrutiny
Committee  for verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of
filing of the nomination papers but who has not received the Validity
Certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall
submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or
any other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of
six months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have   been
terminated   retrospectively   and   he   shall   be disqualified for being
a Councillor.”.

3.   In section 42 of the principal Act, in sub-section (6A), for the
existing provisos, the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of President for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 30th June
2019, in accordance with the election programme declared, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination papers
but who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date of filing
of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination
papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or
any other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit within a period of
six months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee:

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a President.”.

Amendment
of section

12 A of Mah.
V of 1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section

42 of Mah. V
of 1962.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, BÊ|É±É 9, 2018/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

4. In section 67 of the principal Act, in sub-section (7A), for the
 existing provisos,  the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of Chairman for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 30th June 2019,
in accordance with the election programme declared, a person who
has  applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification of his Caste
Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination papers but who
has not received the Validity Certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or
any other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit within a period of
six months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of six months from the date on which he is
declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a Chairman.”.

Amendment
of section
67 of Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 6, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XLVII OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 6th August 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and

Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that

circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate

action further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat

Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore,

promulgated the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 on 7th October 2017 ;

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEò 59] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 6, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 121

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2017
(Mah. Act No. XLVII of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c.  Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

—————————

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--121----1
(1)

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord.

XXI of
2017.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 6, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 15, ¶ÉEäò 19402

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act
of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on 7th October 2017.

2. In section 111 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, (hereinafter referred to as “ the principal Act ”) in
sub-section (3),—

(a) for the word “one-fifth” the word “two-fifth” shall be
substituted ;

(b) for the existing proviso, the following provisos shall be
substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, special meeting shall not be called within
sixty days from the date of immediately preceding meeting of
Zilla Parishad :

Provided further that, if the President receives the request
for calling a special meeting within sixty days from the date of
preceding meeting of Zilla Parishad, then the President may,
either call a special meeting within sixty days or reject the
request by recording the reasons thereof :

Provided also that, where a special meeting is called the
notice of meeting shall state a date at which the meeting is to
be held, being a date not later than thirty days from the date of
the issue of the notice.”.

3. (1) The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall
be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under
the corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this
Act.

Short title
and

Commence-
ment.

Amendment
of section 111

of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.

XXI of 2017
and saving.

Mah.
Ord.
XXI of
2017.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,  21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LXVI OF 2018.
(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the

“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 14th December 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS, the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore promulgated the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 on the 11th October 2018 ;

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of
the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic
of India as follows :—

 III of 1959.
Mah. V

of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. XXI
of 2018.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 85(3)] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®ú, Êb÷ºÉåþ¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 167

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LXVI of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA  G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------167-1 (1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 19402

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 11th October 2018.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VILLAGE

PANCHAYATS ACT.

2.   In section 10-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter
in this Chapter referred to as “ the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act ”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “ six months ” the
words “ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “ six months ” the words
“ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—
“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any

person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “six months” specified in such undertaking shall be
deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

3.   In section 30-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act,—
(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “ six months ” the

words “ twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “ six months” the words “twelve
months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 31st March 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall
be deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA ZILLA PARISHADS

AND PANCHAYAT SAMITIS ACT, 1961.

4. In section 12A of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
Act, 1961 (hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as “ the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act ”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “ six months ” the
words “ twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

Short title
and

commence-
ment.

Mah.
LXVI of
2018.

III of
1959.

Amendment of
section 30-1A of

III of 1959.

Amendment of
section 10-1A
of III of 1959.

Mah.
LXVI
of 2018.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section

12A of Mah.V
of 1962.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words
“ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall
be deemed to have been substituted as “twelve months”.”.

5.   In section 42 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
Act, in sub-section (6A),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “ six months ” the
words “ twelve months ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “ six months ” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall be
deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

6. In section 67 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
Act, in sub-section (7A),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii),  for the words “six months” the
words “twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from the 7th May 2016 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words
“ twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th May 2016 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any
person under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of
commencement of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act,
2018, the period of “ six months ” specified in such undertaking shall
be deemed to have been substituted as “ twelve months ”.”.

CHAPTER IV
MISCELLANEOUS

7.   (1) Nothing in this Act shall affect the elections conducted by the
State Election Commission for conducting the elections or any programme
declared by it therefor, prior to the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Act, 2018,  for filling up the resultant vacancy in view of the
provisions of section 10-1A or section 30-1A of the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats Act ; section 12A or sub-section (6A) of section 42 or sub-section
(7A) of section 67 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act,
1961, as it stood prior to such date of commencement.

Mah.
LXVI of

2018.

Amendment
of section 67
of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah.LXVI
of 2018.

Amendment
of section 42
of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah.
LXVI  of

2018.

Saving as to
certain
elections.

III of
1959.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
LXVI of

2018.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------167-2



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉø 23, ¶ÉEäò 19404

8.  Any person, who has obtained the Caste Certificate and Validity Certificate,
but has not filed such certificate prior to the date of commencement of this Act,
shall not be deemed to be disqualified under the provisions of the relevant
Panchayat law, if he submits such certificate within a period of three months from
the date of commencement of this Act :

Provided that, the provisions of this section shall not apply where the State
Election Commission has already prior to the date of commencement of this Act
held elections to fill the vacancy of such person or declared the programme for
holding of such election.

9.  (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, as amended by this Act, the
State Government may, as the occasion arises, by an Order published in the
Official Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the
said Acts as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or
expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after expiry of the period of two
years from the commencement of this Act.

10. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken (including
any notification or order issued) under the corresponding provisions of the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of said Acts, as amended by this Act.

Power to
remove

difficulty.

Saving as to
certain

disqualifications.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.

XXI of 2018
and saving.

Mah.
Ord. XXI
of 2018.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI
MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI
400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH
ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 24, 2018/{ÉÉè¹Éø 3, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LXXIX OF 2018.
(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the

“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 24th December 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2018.

Mah. V
of

1962.

Short title.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 89] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, Êb÷ºÉåþ¤É®ú 24, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 3, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 180

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2018
(Mah. Act No.LXXIX of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------180-1 (1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 24, 2018/{ÉÉè¹Éø 3, ¶ÉEäò 19402

2. In section 158 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961,—

(i) to sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided that, where the State Government has, by rule or
order issued under clause (a) of section 9 of the Maharashtra Stamp
Act decided to reduce or remit the duties leviable under the said
Act, such reduction or remission in duties shall also be applicable
extra duty leviable under this sub-section, on the instruments of
sale, gift and usufructuary mortgage, respectively, of immovable
property.”;

(ii) to sub-section (4), the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided that, the Pune Zilla Parishad shall, in accordance
with the rules made by the State Government in this behalf, out
of the amounts received by it, within the jurisdiction of the
Pune Metropolitan Region Development Authority, under
sub-section (3),—

(i) contribute an amount equal to twenty-five per cent. to
the village fund of each Panchayat situated within the
jurisdiction of the Pune Metropolitan Region Development
Authority, and

(ii) transfer an amount equal to twenty-five per cent. to
the Pune Metropolitan Region Development Authority.”.

Amendment
of section 158

of Mah. V of
1962.

LX of
1958.

Mah. V
of
1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR
GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004.
EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀,Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 26, 2019/{ÉÉè¹É 5, ¶ÉEäò 1941 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No.  XXXII OF 2019.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 26th December 2019).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS, both houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS, the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore,
promulgated the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendement) Ordinance, 2019 on the 23rd August 2019 ;

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventieth Year of
the Republic of India as follow :–

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2019.

Short title
and commen-
cement.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. XXI
of  2019.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 5, +ÆEòú 49(3) MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®úú, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 26, 2019/{ÉÉè¹É 5, ¶ÉEäò 1941 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 102

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ

Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2019  (Mah. Act No. XXXII of
2019), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------102--1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 26, 2019/{ÉÉè¹É 5, ¶ÉEäò 1941

Amendment
of section 75B

of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. XXI
of 2019.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 23rd August 2019.

2. To section 75B of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “ the principal Act”), the
following provisos shall be added, namely :–

“ Provided that, the period of authorization under this section shall not
exceed four months :

Provided further that, in exceptional circumstances to be recorded in
the order, the said period may be extended, from time to time, for such further
period as may be specified in the order, but such period of authorisation
shall not exceed six months in the aggregate.”.

3. To section 91B of the principal Act, the following provisos shall be
added, namely :–

“ Provided that, the period of authorization under this section shall not
exceed four months :

Provided further that, in exceptional circumstances to be recorded in
the order, the said period may be extended, from time to time, for such further
period as may be specified in the order, but such period of authorisation
shall not exceed six months in the aggregate.”.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2019, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Amendment
of section 91B

of Mah. V of
1962.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. XXI

of 2019 and
saving.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`öú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. IV OF 2022.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette’’, on the 20th January 2022).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and
the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take
immediate action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
Act and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961,

III
of 1959.

Mah.
V of

1962.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---4---1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 8, +ÆEò 2(2)]         MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®úú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 [ {ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 4

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2021 (Mah. Act No. IV of 2022), is hereby
published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

––––––––––––

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

(1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943

for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the
Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2021, on the 6th December
2021 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of
the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-second Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act,
2021.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 6th December 2021.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VILLAGE PANCHAYATS ACT.

2. In section 10-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (herein-
after in this Chapter referred to as “the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act”),
for the existing provisos, the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last date
of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December 2022, in
accordance with the election programme declared by the State Election
Commission, a person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for
verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination
papers but who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date of filing
of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any other proof of
having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of twelve
months from the date on which he is declared elected, the Validity
Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the Validity
Certificate within a period of twelve months from the date on which he
is declared elected, his election shall be deemed to have been terminated
retrospectively and he shall be disqualified for being a member.”.

3. In section 30-1A of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, for the existing
provisos, the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of Sarpanch for which the
last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December 2022,
in accordance with the election programme declared by the State Election
Commission, a person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for
verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination
papers but who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date of filing
of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 10-

1A of III of
1959.

III of
1959.

Amendment
of section

30-1A of III of
1959.

Mah.
Ord.
XIV of
2021.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`öú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 3

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of
twelve months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the
Validity Certificate within a period of twelve months from the
date on which he is declared elected, his election shall be deemed
to have been terminated retrospectively and he shall be
disqualified for being a Sarpanch.”.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA ZILLA PARISHADS

AND PANCHAYAT SAMITIS ACT, 1961.

4. In section 12A of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as “the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act”), for the existing
provisos, the following provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st December 2022,
in accordance with the election programme declared by the State
Election Commission, a person who has applied to the Scrutiny
Committee for verification of his Caste Certificate before the date of
filing of the nomination papers but who has not received the Validity
Certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall submit,
alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of
twelve months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the
Validity Certificate within a period of twelve months from the
date on which he is declared elected, his election shall be deemed
to have been terminated retrospectively and he shall be
disqualified for being a Councillor.”.

5. In section 42 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, in sub-section (6A), for the existing provisos, the following
provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of President for
which the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st
December 2022, in accordance with the election programme declared,
a person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification
of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination
papers but who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date
of filing of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the
nomination papers,—

Amendment
of section 12A
of Mah. V of
1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section 42
of Mah. V of
1962.



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 20, 2022/{ÉÉè¹É 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit within a period of
twelve months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the
Validity Certificate within a period of twelve months from the
date on which he is declared elected, his election shall be deemed
to have been terminated retrospectively and he shall be
disqualified for being a President.”.

6. In section 67 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, in sub-section (7A), for the existing provisos, the following
provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the post of Chairman for
which the last date of filing of nomination falls on or before the 31st
December 2022, in accordance with the election programme declared,
a person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for verification
of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing of the nomination
papers but who has not received the Validity Certificate on the date
of filing of the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the
nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the Validity Certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit within a period of
twelve months from the date on which he is declared elected, the
Validity Certificate issued by the Scrutiny Committee :

Provided further that, if such person fails to produce the
Validity Certificate within a period of twelve months from the
date on which he is declared elected, his election shall be deemed
to have been terminated retrospectively and he shall be
disqualified for being a Chairman.”.

CHAPTER IV
MISCELLANEOUS

7. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats and Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2021, is
hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the Maharashtra
Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, as amended by the said
Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case
may be, under the corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts, as amended
by this Act.

Amendment
of section 67
of Mah. V of

1962.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. XIV

of 2021 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord.
XIV of
2021.

III of
1959.
Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004
EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 31, 2022/¨ÉÉPÉ 11, ¶ÉEäò 1943 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No.  XVIII OF 2022.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette’’, on the 31st January 2022).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat

Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla

Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter

appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic

of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and

Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2021.

Short title.

Mah. V
of 1962.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---18---1 (1)

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 8, +ÆEò 4]         ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®úúú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 31, 2022/¨ÉÉPÉ 11, ¶ÉEäò 1943 [ {ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 18

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2021 (Mah.
Act No. XVIII of 2022), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

––––––––––––

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 31, 2022/¨ÉÉPÉ 11, ¶ÉEäò 1943

Amendment of
section 9 of

Mah. V of 1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

2. In section 9 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, in sub-section (1), in clause (a), for the words “not more
than seventy-five and not less than fifty in number” the words “not more
than eighty-five and not less than fifty-five in number” shall be substituted.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the 
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ; 

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that 
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate 
action further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act and the 
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the 
purposes hereinafter appearing ; and therfore, promulgated the Maharashtra 
Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat 
Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021, on the 23rd September 2021 ; 

(१)

III of 
1959.

Mah. V 
of 1962.

Mah. 
Ord. III 
of 2021.

भाग आठ-१९—१ 

RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

महाराđł� शासन राजपŇ
असाधारण भाग आठ

वषɑ ८, अंक ५] मंगळवार, फɁŎुवारी १, २०२२/माघ १२, शकɁ १९४३ [पृđठɂ ४,  िकȽमत : ȟपये २७.००

असाधारण ĸमांक १९

Ōािधकȵत Ōकाशन
महाराđł िवधानमंडळाचे अिधिनयम व राùयपालांनी Ōóयािपत कɁलेले अĄयादेश व कɁलेले िविनयम आिण

िविध व ąयाय िवभागाकडȴन आलेली िवधेयकɁ (इंĺजी अनुवाद).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation 
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and 
Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2021 (Mah. Act. No. XIX of 2022), is hereby published under 
the authority of the Governor.

                                                               By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

                                                                                      SATISH WAGHOLE,
                                                                       I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
                                                                                 Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XIX OF 2022

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “ Maharashtra 
Government Gazette ”, on the 1st February 2022.)



2                       महाराđł शासन राजपŇ असाधारण भाग आठ, फɁŎुवारी १, २०२२/माघ १२, शकɁ १९४३         

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act 
of the State Ligislature ; it is hereby encacted in the Seventy-second Year of 
the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats and 
the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 
2021.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 23rd September 2021. 

CHAPTER II

2. In section 10 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter 
referred to as “the Village Panchayats Act”), in sub-section (2), for clause (c), 
the following clause shall be substituted, namely :– 

“(c) the seats to be reserved for persons belonging to the category of 
Backward Class of Citizens shall be upto 27 per cent. of the total number of 
seats to be filled in by election in a panchayat and the total reservation shall 
not be more than 50 per cent. of the total seats in the panchayat and such seats 
shall be allotted by rotation to different wards in a panchayat: 

Provided that, in a panchayat comprising entirely the Scheduled Areas, 
the seats to be reserved for the persons belonging to the Backward Class of 
Citizens shall be the seats remaining, if any, after reservation of the seats for 
the Scheduled Tribes and Scheduled Castes: 

Provided further that, the reservation for the persons belonging to 
the Backward Class of Citizens in a panchayat falling only partially in the 
Scheduled Areas shall be as per the provisions of this clause: 

Provided also that, one-half of the total number of seats so reserved shall be 
reserved for women belonging to the category of Backward Class of Citizens;”.

3. In section 30 of the Village Panchayats Act, in sub-section (4), for 
clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(b) the offices of Sarpanchas to be reserved for the persons belonging to 
the category of Backward Class of Citizens shall be upto 27 per cent. of the 
total number of such offices in the panchayats and the total reservation shall 
not be more than 50 per cent. of the total seats in the concerned District: 

Provided that, one-half of the offices so reserved shall be reserved for 
women belonging to the category of Backward Class of Citizens;”. 

CHAPTER III

4. In section 12 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat 
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the Zilla Parishads and Panchayat 
Samitis Act”), in sub section (2), for clause (c), the following clause shall be 
substituted, namely:—

“(c) the seats to be reserved for the persons belonging to the category of 
Backward Class of Citizens shall be upto 27 per cent. of the total number of 

Short title 
and com-

mencement.

Amendment 
of section 10 

of III of 1959.

Amendment 
of section 12 
of Mah. V of 

1961.

Mah. V 
of 1962.

III of 
1959.



                महाराđł शासन राजपŇ असाधारण भाग आठ, फɁŎुवारी १, २०२२/माघ १२, शकɁ १९४३                                            3
seats to be filled in by election in a Zilla Parishad and the total reservation 
shall not be more than 50 per cent. of the total seats in the Zilla Parishad and 
such seats shall be allotted by rotation to different electoral divisions in a Zilla 
Parishad: 

Provided that, in a Zilla Parishad comprising entirely the Scheduled 
Areas, the seats to be reserved for the persons belonging to the Backward 
Class of Citizens shall be the seats remaining, if any, after reservation of the 
seats for the Scheduled Tribes and Scheduled Castes:

Provided further that, the reservation for the persons belonging to the 
Backward Class of Citizens in a Zilla Parishad falling only partially in the 
Scheduled Areas shall be as per the provisions of this clause: 

Provided also that, one-half of the total number of seats so reserved shall be 
reserved for women belonging to the category of Backward Class of Citizens;”.

5. In section 42 of the Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, in 
sub-section (4), for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :– 

“(b) the offices of Presidents to be reserved for persons belonging to the 
category of Backward Class of Citizens shall be upto 27 per cent. of the total 
number of such offices in the Zilla Parishads and the total reservation shall 
not be more than 50 per cent. of the total seats in the State: 

Provided that, one-half of the offices so reserved shall be reserved for 
women belonging to the category of Backward Class of Citizens;”.

6. In section 58 of the Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, in
sub-section (1B), for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, 
namely: —

“(c) the seats to be reserved for the persons belonging to the category of 
Backward Class of Citizens shall be upto 27 per cent. of the total number of 
seats to be filled in by election in a Panchayat Samiti and the total reservation 
shall not be more than 50 per cent. of the total seats in the Panchayat Samiti 
and such seats shall be allotted by rotation to different electoral colleges in a 
Panchayat Samiti: 

Provided that, in a Panchayat Samiti comprising entirely the Scheduled 
Areas, the seats to be reserved for the persons belonging to the Backward Class 
of Citizens shall be the seats remaining, if any, after reservation of the seats 
for the Scheduled Tribes and Scheduled Castes: 

Provided further that, the reservation for the persons belonging to the 
Backward Class of Citizens in a Panchayat Samiti falling only partially in the 
Scheduled Areas shall be as per the provisions of this clause: 

Provided further that, one-half of the total number of seats so reserved 
shall be reserved for women belonging to the category of Backward Class of 
Citizens;”.

7. In section 67 of the Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis Act, in sub-
section (5), for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(b) the offices of Chairman to be reserved for the persons belonging to the 
category of Backward Class of Citizens shall be upto 27 per cent. of the total 
number of such offices in the Panchayat Samitis and the total reservation shall 
not be more than 50 per cent of the total seats in the State: 

Provided that, one-half of the offices so reserved shall be reserved for 
women belonging to the category of Backward Class of Citizens;”. 

Amendment 
of section 42 
of Mah. V of 
1962.

Amendment 
of section 58 
of Mah. V of 
1962.

Amendment 
of section 67 
of Mah. V of 
1962.



4                       महाराđł शासन राजपŇ असाधारण भाग आठ, फɁŎुवारी १, २०२२/माघ १२, शकɁ १९४३         

CHAPTER IV

8. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats and the Maharashtra Zilla 
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021, is hereby 
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken 
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding provisions 
of the Maharashta Village Panchayats Act and the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads 
and Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961 as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be 
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the 
corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts, as amended by this Act.

Mah. 
Ord. III 
of 2021.

Repeal of 
Mah. Ord. III 

of 2021 and 
saving.

III of 
1959, 
Mah. V 
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, 
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, 
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 12ú, 2022/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944  1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XLVI OF 2022.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 12th September 2022).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter appearing, and, therefore,
promulgated the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 on the 14th July 2022 ;

Mah. V
of 1962.

Mah.
Ord. III
of 2022.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 8, +ÆEòú 38(2)] ºÉÉä¨É´ÉÉ®úú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 12, 2022/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 82
|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in
English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2022.
(Maharashtra Act No. XLVI of 2022), is hereby  published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--82----1



       2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 12ú, 2022/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-third Year of
the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra  Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 14th July 2022.

2. In section 43 of the Maharashtra  Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), to sub-
section (1), the following provisos shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, the term of office of the President or Vice-President
in office, on the date of commencement of the  Maharashtra Zilla
Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Amendment) Act, 2022, may be
extended  upto three months by the State Government by an order
published in the Official Gazette :

 Provided further that, notwithstanding anything contained in the
above proviso, the term of office of the President or Vice-President shall
be co-terminus with the terms of offices of elected Councillors as provided
in section 10.”.

3. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
principal Act, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, as occasion
arises, by an order published in the Official Gazette, do anything not
inconsistent with the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act,
which appears to it to be necessary or expedient for the purposes of removing
the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after expiry of a period of
two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid, as soon as may be,
after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding provisions,
of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to
have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding
provisions of said Act, as amended by this Act.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Amendment
of section 43
of Mah. V of

1962.

Mah.
XLVI of
2022.

Power to
remove

difficulty.

Short title
and

commence-
ment.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. III

of 2022 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord. III
of  2022.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®úõú 12, 2022/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XLVII OF 2022.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “Maharashtra Government Gazette” on the 12th September 2022.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore,
promulgated the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayats Samitis
(Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 on the 4th August 2022 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance, by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-third Year
of the Republic of India as follows :–

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2)  It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 4th August 2022.

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the following translation in English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment) Act, 2022 (Mah. Act  No. XLVII of
2022), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 8, +ÆEòú 38(3)] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®úúú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 12, 2022/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 83

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É

+ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---83------1

Mah.
Ord.

VIII of
2022.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Short title and
commencement.



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ööú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®úõú 12, 2022/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944

2. In section 9 of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), in sub-
section (1), in clause (a), for the words “not more than eighty-five and not
less than fifty-five in number” the words “not more than seventy-five and
not less than fifty in number” shall be substituted.

3. Notwithstanding anything contained in the principal Act  and the
rules, notifications or orders made thereunder, where the process,—

(i)  to divide a district into electoral divisions and to determine  the
number of Councillors to be elected from District, or

(ii) to divide an electoral division into electoral colleges, or

(iii) of reservation of seats of Councillors in the Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis,

is started or completed by the State Election Commissioner, or the State
Government, as the case may be,  before the date of commencement of the
Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Second Amendment)
Act, 2022, shall be deemed to be annulled and such process shall be done
afresh according to the provisions of the principal Act as amended by this
Act.

4. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
principal Act, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, by an
order published in the Official Gazette, as the occasion arises, make such
provisions not inconsistent with the provisions of the principal Act, as
amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the
purposes of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid, as soon as may be,
after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

5. (1) The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayats Samities
(Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2022, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued), under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Amendment
of section 9 of

Mah. V of
1962.

Annulment
of process.

Mah.
XLVII
of 2022.

Power to
remove

difficulties.

Mah.
Ord.
VIII of
2022.

Mah. V
of 1962.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.

VIII of 2022
and saving.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 11, 2023/{ÉÉè¹É 21, ¶ÉEäò 1944 1

Mah. V
of 1962.

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session;

AND WHEREAS, the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take
immediate action further to amend the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis Act, 1961, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; and,
therefore, promulgated the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2022, on the 12th September 2022;

Mah.
Ord. IX

of 2022.

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 9, +ÆEòú 4(2)] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒõ 11, 2023/{ÉÉè¹É 21 ¶ÉEäò 1944 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ 2,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 7

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É

xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis ( Third Amendment) Act,
2022 (Mah. Act No. VII of 2023), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH  WAGHOLE,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VII OF 2023.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “Maharashtra
Government Gazette”, on the 11th January 2023.)

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö-7--1
(1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 11, 2023/{ÉÉè¹É 21, ¶ÉEäò 19442

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-third Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and
Panchayat Samitis (Third Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 12th September
2022.

2. In section 75B of the Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat
Samitis Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), the
existing provisos shall be deleted.

3. In section 91B of the principal Act, the existing provisos shall be
deleted.

4. (1) The Maharashtra Zilla Parishads and Panchayat Samitis (Third
Amendment) Ordinance, 2022, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Amendment
of section 75
B of Mah. V

of 1962.

Amendment
of section 91
B of Mah. V

of 1962.

Mah. V
of 1962.

Short title
and

commence-
ment.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. IX
of 2022 and

saving.

Mah.
Ord. IX
of 2022.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


	1962MH5.pdf
	1962MH5.pdf
	1979MH10.pdf

	2006MH37.pdf
	2007MH21.pdf
	2009MH5.pdf
	2010MH16.pdf
	2010MH24.pdf
	2010MH33.pdf
	2011MH19.pdf
	2011MH39.pdf
	2012MH18.pdf



