
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Preservation of Trees Act, 1975

Act 44 of 1975

Keyword(s):
Preservation of Trees, Relevant Act, to Fell a Tree, Tree, Tree Officer, Urban
Area, Urban Local Authority

Amendments appended: 10 of 2010, 6 of 2012, 15 of 2015, 13 of 2017, 9 of 2021, 

25 of 2022, 43 of 2023



































































































¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, BÊ|É±É 9, 2015/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1937 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XV OF 2015.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the

“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 9th April 2015).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban
Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the  Sixty-sixth Year of the
Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection
and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Act, 2015.

(1)

Short title.

Mah.
XLIV of

1975.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 1, +ÆEò 18 (2)]    MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®ú, BÊ|É±É 9, 2015/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1937 [ {ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ̄ û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 41

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ

Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ´ÉÉnù).

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of
Trees (Amendment) Act, 2015 (Mah. Act No. XV of 2015), is hereby published under the
authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

M. A. SAYEED,
Principal Secretary and R.L.A. to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É̀ ö----41-1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, BÊ|É±É 9, 2015/SÉèjÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 19372

2. In section 2 of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as “ the principal
Act ”), in clause (f), for the portion beginning with the words “ the Bombay
Municipal Corporation Act ” and ending with the words “ Municipalities
Act, 1965 ”, the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“ the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations Act, or a municipal area within the meaning of clause (24) of
section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships Act, 1965 ”.

3. In section 3 of the principal Act, after sub-section (4), the following
sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“ (5) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1) and (2),
where, in respect of the area of a Municipal Corporation or, as the case
may be, a Municipal Council, the Tree Authority is not constituted or is
not able to function for any reason whatsoever, the Municipal Commissioner
of such Municipal Corporation or, the Chief Officer of such Municipal
Council, shall act as the Tree Authority and shall exercise all the powers
and discharge all the duties of a Tree Authority in such area, till such
Authority is duly constituted or is able to function :

Provided that, every decision taken by the Municipal Commissioner or
the Chief Officer under this section, shall be placed before the general body
of such Municipal Corporation or, as the case may be, the Municipal Council,
in its immediately next meeting held after such decision. ”.

Mah.
XLIV of
1975.

Amendment of
section 2 of

Mah. XLIV of
1975.

Amendment of
section 3 of

Mah. XLIV of
1975.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

III of 1888,
LIX of
1949,

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Preservation of Trees Act, 1975

Act 44 of 1975

Keyword(s):
Preservation of Trees, Relevant Act, to Fell a Tree, Tree, Tree Officer, Urban
Area, Urban Local Authority

Amendments appended: 10 of 2010, 6 of 2012, 15 of 2015, 13 of 2017



1¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 16, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 26, ¶ÉEäò 1938

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XIII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 16th January 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban
Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection
and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Act, 2016.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

Mah.
XLIV of

1975.

Short title and
commencement.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--18----1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEò 10] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 16, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 26, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 3 ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò  18

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees (Amendment)
Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XIII of 2017), is  hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Principal Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

(1)

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 16, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 26, ¶ÉEäò 1938

2. In section 4 of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as “ the principal
Act ”), in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “ every month ” the words “ every fortnight ” shall be
substituted ;

(b) for the words “ forty-five days ” the words “ twenty-one days ” shall
be substituted.

3. In section 8 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (2), for the words “ Tree Authority ” the words “ Tree
Officer ” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (3),—

(i) for clause (a), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely :—

“(a) On receipt of such application, the Tree Officer shall,—

(i) give public notice by advertising it in at least one local
newspaper ;

(ii) affix such notice on the conspicuous part of the tree that is
to be felled ;

(iii) personally inspect the tree; and

(iv) hold an inquiry.

The Tree  Officer shall, after expiry of the period of submission of
objections and suggestions which shall not be less than seven days, submit
his report alongwith objections or suggestions, if any, received to the Tree
Authority or an officer mentioned in sub-section (6), as the case may be :

Provided that, the Tree Officer shall submit his report within a period
of twelve days from the date of receipt of the application :

Provided further that, no personal inspection of the trees by the Tree
Officer shall be required, if the applicant submits images and details of the
trees to be felled, by using Information Technology enabled system developed
by the urban local authority which suffices the requirement of submission of
report by the Tree Officer :

Provided also that, no such permission shall be refused if, in the opinion
of the Tree Authority or the Officer, as the case may be, the tree is dead, or
diseased or windfallen, or it constitutes a danger to life or property, or
obstructs traffic; and if any objection is received against such  permission,
the matter shall be placed before the Tree Authority or the Officer, as the
case may be, for reconsideration, and a decision shall be taken within two
weeks after giving a hearing to the person who has raised the objection.

(a-1) The Officer referred to in sub-section (6) or the Tree Authority, as
the case may be, shall allow the application, with or without conditions or,
may refuse it, within a period of forty-five days from the date of receipt
of the application.”;

(ii) in clause (b), for the words “ six months ” the words “ three
months ” shall be substituted ;

Amendment of
section 4 of

Mah. XLIV of
1975.

Mah.
XLIV of
1975.

Amendment of
section 8 of

Mah. XLIV of
1975.



3¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 16, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 26, ¶ÉEäò 1938

(c) in sub-section (4),—

(i) for the words “ If the Tree Authority fails to inform ” the words
“ Subject to the provisions of sub-section (5), if the Tree Authority fails
to inform ” shall be substituted ;

(ii) for the words “ sixty days ” the words “ forty-five days ” shall be
substituted ;

(d) for sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(5) Where permission to fell a tree is granted or deemed to have
been granted under sub-section (4), the applicant shall plant twice the
number of trees to be felled of the same or other suitable local species
on the same site and if required at other suitable places as decided
by the Authority. The number of trees to be planted on the same site
and that on other suitable place alongwith location of such suitable
place shall be mentioned in the permission to be granted by the
Authority. The trees shall be planted within fifteen days from the date
the tree is felled, or such extended time as the Tree Officer may allow
in this behalf :

Provided that such extended time granted shall not exceed fifteen
days. ”;

(e) after sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be added,
namely :—

“ (6) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, if the number
of trees proposed to be felled is twenty-five or less, in such cases all the
functions and powers of the Tree Authority shall be exercised by the
Municipal Commissioner of Municipal Corporation or the Chief Officer
of Municipal Council or the Chief Executive Officer of the Authority as
the case may be.”.

4. In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
“ one or more trees ” the words “ twice the number of trees ” shall be
substituted.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.

Amendment of
section 10 of
Mah. XLIV of
1975.















¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀öú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇÇ 21, 2022/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXV OF 2022.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 21st March 2022).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act,
the Maharashtra Education and Employment Guarantee (Cess)
Act, 1962 and the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and

Preservation of Trees Act, 1975.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, theIII of

1888.

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö-----36--1

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 8, +ÆEò 16] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, ¨ÉÉSÉ ÇÇ 21, 2022/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943    [ {ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 36
|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, Maharashtra Education and
Employment Gaurantee (Cess) and Maharashtra (Urban Areas) protection and Preservation of
Trees (Amendment) Act, 2022 (Mah. Act No. XXV of 2022), is hereby published under the
authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀öú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇÇ 21, 2022/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943

Maharashtra Education and Employment Guarantee (Cess) Act, 1962 and
the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees Act,
1975,  for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, Maharashtra Education and Employment
Guarantee (Cess) and Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022 on the 2nd February
2022 ;

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance, by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-third Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1.   (1) This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation,
Maharashtra Education and Employment Guarantee (Cess) and Maharashtra
(Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 2nd February
2022.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2.  In section 140 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act,–

 (a) in sub-section (1), in clause (c), the proviso and Explanation shall
be deleted and shall be deemed to have been deleted with effect from the
1st January 2022;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted
and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 1st January
2022, namely :—

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section  or any
other provisions of the Act, from the 1st January 2022, the Corporation
shall not levy any tax component of property tax specified in sub-section
(1) of section 139A, on the residential buildings or residential tenements,
having carpet area of 46.45 sq. meter (500 sq. feet) or less.”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA EDUCATION AND

EMPLOYMENT GUARANTEE (CESS) ACT, 1962.

3.  After section 7 of the Maharashtra Education and Employment
Guarantee (Cess) Act, 1962, the following section shall be inserted and shall
be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 1st January 2022,

namely :—

Mah. XXVII
of 1962.
Mah. XLIV
of 1975.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 140

of
III of 1888.

III of
1888.

Insertion of
section 7A in

Mah. XXVII of
1962.

Mah.
XXVII of
1962.

Mah. Ord.
I of 2022.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀öú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇÇ 21, 2022/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943 3

    “ 7A. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 4 or any other

provisions of the Act or any other law for the time being in force, from the

1st January 2022, the Municipal Corporation of Brihan Mumbai shall not

levy and collect the education cess specified in section 4, in the Municipal

Corporation of Brihan Mumbai area, on the residential buildings or

residential tenements, having carpet area of 46.45 sq. meter (500 sq. feet) or

less.”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA (URBAN AREAS)

PROTECTION AND PRESERVATION OF TREES ACT, 1975.

4.  In section 18 of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas)  Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, after sub-section (1B), the following sub-
section shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with
effect from the 1st January 2022, namely :—

 “ (1B-1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1) and
(1A) or any other provisions of the Act or any other law for the time being
in force, from the 1st January 2022, the Municipal Corporation of Brihan
Mumbai shall not levy and collect the Tree Cess specified in sub-
section (1),  in the Municipal Corporation of Brihan Mumbai area, on the
residential buildings or residential tenements, having carpet area of 46.45
sq. meter (500 sq. feet) or less.”.

Exemption of
certain
residential
buildings or
residential
tenements
from payment
of tax.

Amendment
of section 18
of
Mah. XLIV of
1975.

Mah.
XLIV of

1975.



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀öú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇÇ 21, 2022/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1943

CHAPTER V

MISCELLANEOUS.

5.  (1) The Mumbai Municipal Corporation, Maharashtra Education and
Employment Guarantee (Cess) and Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection
and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Ordinance, 2022, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra
Education and Employment Guarantee (Cess) Act, 1962 and the Maharashtra
(Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, as amended
by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or, as the
case may be, issued under the corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts,
as amended by this Act.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. I of

2022 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord. I of
2022.

III of
1888.
Mah.
XXVII of
1962.
Mah.
XLIV of
1975.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 25, 2023/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 3, ¶ÉEäò 1945 1

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban Areas)
Protection and Preservation of Trees Act, 1975.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban
Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-fourth Year of
the Republic of India, as follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection
and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Act, 2023.

Mah.
XLIV

of
1975.

Short title.

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö-95--1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 9, +ÆEò 52] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®ú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 25, 2023/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 3, ¶ÉEäò 1945 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 95

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Act,
2023 (Mah. Act. No. XLIII of 2023), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.
––––––––––––

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XLIII OF 2023.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 25th August 2023).



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 25, 2023/¦ÉÉpù{Énù 3, ¶ÉEäò 1945

.

2. In section 6A of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, (hereinafter referred to as “principal Act”),
clauses (iii) and (iv) shall be deleted.

3. In section 8 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (3), in clause (a-1), first, second and third provisos
shall be deleted;

(2) sub-section (5B) shall be deleted.

Mah.
XLIV of
1975.

Amendment
of section 6A
of Mah. XLIV

of 1975.

Amendment
of section 8 of
Mah. XLIV of

1975.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR :
DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


	1975MH44.pdf
	2010MH10.pdf
	2012MH6.pdf



