The Maharashtra Legislature Members' Pension Act, 1976

Act 10f 1977

Keyword(s):
Member, Term of Office, MLA, pension, Legislative Member

Amendments appended: 15 of 2006, 46 of 2006, 1 of 2007, 26 of 2007, 20 of
2008, 24 of 2008, 18 of 2009, 23 of 2011, 32 of 2016

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




1977.: Mah. 1] - 9729
THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’ PENSION
: ) ACT, 1976.
CONTENTS.
PREAMBLE.
SECTIONS.
i. Short title and commencement, - : ‘ s
2.. Definitions.
3.: Pension payable to members.
‘4, Pension to be held in abeyance.or {0 be reduced in certain circunmstances.
5. Power to make rules and orders.
6. Decisions on gquestions relating to pansion.

jli
|



. C v
Replacement Series LXVII—p. 85 A
- 9731

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. I OF 19771

[THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’ PENSION Acr, 1976]
[5th January 19771

Amended by Mah. 15 of 1977,
s v s 53 0f 1977 (1-4-1977).%

_An Act to provide for payment' of pension to persons who have served as members
' " of any State Legislature in Maharashtra,

WHEREAS it is expedient to provide for payment of pension to persons who have
served as members of any State Legislature in Maharashtra and for ‘other matters
connected therewith ; It is .hereby enacted in the Twenty-seventh. Year of the
Republic of India as follows :— ’ S

1. (1) This Act may bé called the Maharashtra Legislature Members® Pension Short title
Act, 1976. ' ' . - and
. : . . commence-
N (2) It shall come into force on such 2date as the State Government “may, by ment.
,; notification in the Official Gazette, appoint. ‘

'2. . In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,—

(1) “ member of the State Legislature ” means a member of the Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly or the Maharashtra Legislative Council, and includes—

(q) a.-member of the Bombay Legislative Assembly, the Madhya Pradesh
Legislative Assembly or the Hyderabad Legislative Assembly, elected to any of .

. those Assemblies, on or after the earliest date on which all constituencies of any

of those Assemblies were called upon to elect members in 1952, (hereinafter in

this cldause referred to as ** the said date )— : ‘

(#) if as a sitting member, he continued as a member of the Bombay Legisla-

tive Assembly or was deemed to have been elected to that-Assembly under the

" Defimitions.

XXX- States Reorganisation Act, 1956 ; or

VI of (i) if as a sitting member, he continued to be a member of the Maharashtra
1956. Legislative Assembly or was deemed to be elected to that Assembly under -
)](91 6?)f ~the -Bombay Reorganisation Act, 1960.; . . :

(b) a member of the Bombay Legislative Assembly, nominated to that Assem: -
bly, on or after (he said date; 3% * * * o L
© {¢) a member of the Bombay Legislative Council elected to that Council, on
or after the said date,— ' ' :
(@) if as a sitting member, he continued as a member of the Bombay Legisla-
tive Council or was deemed to have been elected to that Council under the
States Reorganisation Act, 1956 ; or :

vgs%f (i) if as a sitting member, he continued as a member . of the Maharashtra
' Legislative Council or was deemed to have been elected to that Council under
© XIof the Bombay Reorganisation Act, 1960 ; : _
1960. (d)-a member of the. Bombay Legislative Council, nominated to that Council,
* * * %

on or afier the said date; 3*

~ (2) * term of office , in relation to a member of the State Legislature, means the
period beginning with the date of publication of the notification of his election or
homiﬁation as a member and ending with the date on which his seat becomes vacant.

1 For Statement of Objects and Reasons, see Maharashira Government. Gazetre, 1976, Part V,
Extra., pp. 612-617. _ ’ ) ’ :
? ist. April 1977 vide G. N, L. A. D.,; No. PEN. 1077/152.111, dated Ist April 1976, published in- -
Maharashtra Government Gazeite, 1977, Part 1V-B, Exra, page 156. . R
% The words * if such member was during the period of his membership permanently residing in
any area which forms part of the State of Maharashtra  were deleted by Mah. 53 of 1977, s. 2{a). *
. 1This indicates the date of commencement of Act. ) . ~

*




9732 Mahar

Explanation 1.
does not take pld

ashtra Legislanu;c Members® Peb.s'imi Aet, 1976 [1977 : Mah. I

~Where a general election to the Assembly-is held and election
iICe In any constitutency for any reason and a member is clected

in that constitutency at the election held subsegeuntly, in his case the term of office

shall be deemed
election in other

to have begun on the date on which the results of the gencral
constituencics are published in the Official Gazette.

Explanation I1 .—Where any member of the Statc Legislature had resigned

his seat for any ¢

ause -or causes approved by the State Government in this

behalf by notification in the Official Gazette, then for the purpose of calculating

his term of offj
a member, but fg

cc, the period during which he would have continued to he
r his resignation, shall be taken into consideration and he shall

be deemed to have served as u member for that perfod also :

Provided that,
accordingly shalt

[ Explnation I

'the maximum .period which shall be taken inio consideration
ot exceed six months in the case of any member.

—Where any Assembly is dissolved eartlier, but not earlier

than six months prior to the date on which its duration would have expired under
the provisions of [clause (1) of article 172 of the Constitution of India, then for the
purpose of calculating the term of office of any member thereof, the period during
which he would Have continued to be a member of the Assembly if it had not been
dissolved carlier, shall be taken into consideration, and he shall be deemed to have

Pension

‘period during w

served as a mem!

Explanation IV |
tive Council refer:

section 156 of the Representation of the People Act, 1951, and he was made to retire XUI1
before the expiry| of his normal term of office, then the period during which he ©f

served as such member, shall, notwithstanding anything contained in section 3 of 1951.
this Act be taken |

per month for ev
3. () Withe

before or after s
Sember of the sa

Provided that,
five years, there
month for every
payable to such

(2) In computi

a Legislative Cou
or as Minister,

r for that period also.

‘Where the term of office of any member of the Bombay Legisla-
ed to in paragraphs (¢) and (d)of clause (1) was curtailed under

nto consideration, and he shall be paid a pension of fifty rupees
y period of one complete year he served as such member.]

ect from the date of commencement of this Act, there shall be

psyab;rt: paid a pension of|two hundred and fifty rupees per month to every person who has
MEmBers: served as a member of the State Legislature for a term of office of five years, whether

commmencement, whether continuous or not and whether as a
e House or of different Houses of the State Legislature :

here any person has served as aforesaid for a period exceeding
hall be paid to him an additional pension of fifty rupees per
ear in excess of five, so, however, that in no case the pension
rson shall exceed five hundred rupees per month. -

g the number of years for the purposes of sub-section (1), the
ch a person has served as Chairman or Deputy Chairman of

ncil or Speaker or Deputy Speaker of a Legislative Assembly

Minister of State, Deputy Minister or Parliamentary Secretary

or in more than one of those capacities by virtue of. his membership- in the Council
or in the Assembly, shall also be taken into account. :

4. (1) Where any person entitled to pension ander section 3,—

(a) is elected

to_the office of the President or Vice-President of India or, is

appointed to the Office of the Governor of any State or the Administrator of

any Union Terr

itory ; or

(b) becomes 2 member of the Council of States or the House of the People or
any Legislative Assembly of a State or Union territory or any Legislative Counci]

of a State:; or

1T

hese explanations werc added by Mah. 53 of 1977, 5. 2 (4).

’ .

e




Replacement Series No. LXVII--p. 86 k .
1977 : Mah, I} Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 9733

(¢) is employed anya salary under the Central Government or any . State
Government, or any’ corporation owned or, controlled by the Central Govern-
ment or. any State Government, or any local authority or otherwise receives
any remuneration from such, Government, corporation or local authority;

such person shall not be entitled to any pension under section 3 for the period during
which he continues to hold such office, or continues as such member, or 1s s0
emplayed, or continues to reeeive such remuneration :

Provided that, where the salary payable to such persop for holding such'ofﬁéc or
being such member or so employed, oF where the remuneration _referre_td to in clause
(c) paid to such person, is. in, either case, less than the pension payable to him

under section 3, suchperson shall be entitled only to receive the balance as pension
under that section. '

~ (2) Where any person entitled to pension under section 3 also receives any pension
from the Central Government or any State Governent, o any corporation owned
or controlled by the Central Government or the State Government, or any local
authority, under any law or otherwise, then, ‘[where the amount of pension
which he receives under such law or otherwise is less than five huridred rupees per
month, such person shall be entitled to pension under section 3, but where the total
amount of such pensions exceeds five hundred rupees per month, he shall be entitled
to only such amount of pension under section 3 which falls.short of the amount
of five hundred rupees per month].

*{(3) Notwithsanding aaything contained in sub-section (2), where any person
entitled to pension under section 3 also receives any person from the Central Govern-
ment or any State Government as a freedom-fighter, then such pension shall not be
taken into consideration in deciding the amount of pension to which he is entitled
under that section].

35. (1) (a) For the purpose of making rules or ordeTs under this seclion, there powerto
shall be constituted a Joint Committee of both Housesof the State Legislature make nies
consisting of five members from the Maharashtra Legislative Council nominated by and orders.
the Chairman of the Council and ten members from the Maharashtra Legislative ‘
Assembly nominated by the Speaker of the Assembly. .

() The Joint Committee constituted under clause (@) shall elect its Chairman
and shall have power to regulate its procedure. , ’

() A member of ths Joint Committee shall hold office as such member for one
year from ths date of his nomination and any casual vacancy in the Joint Commitiee
may be filled by nomination by the Chairman or the Speaker, as the case may be.

(2) (@ Thx Joint Committee constituted under sub-section (I) may, in consultation
with tha State Government, make rules or orders for carrying out the purposes of
this Act. : )

(5) In particular and wihout prejucice to the generality of the foregoing power, -
such rules or orders may provide for alf or any of the following matters, namely :—

(i the ferm in which and the authority to which an application for pension
shall be made | . .
(i) the certificates to be furnished along with an application for pension ;
«  (iii) the declarations to be made at the time of drawing pension . ‘
(iv) any other matters necessary for proper implementation and enforcement
of this Act. )
"1 This was substituted for original clauses (/) and (ify by Mah. 53-of 1977, 5. 3(a).
i Sub-section (3) was aaded, ibid., s. 3(b). )
3 Section § was substituted for the origmal by Mah. 15 of 1977;s. 2. ) .




9734 ‘Maharashtra Legislature Members® Pension Act, 1976 [1977 : Mah. 1

(3) All rules or orders made under sub-section (2) shall not take effect until they
are approved and confirmed by the Chairman of the Council and the Speaker of the
Assembly and are published in the Official Gazette. Such publication of the rutes

. or orders shall be conclusive proof that they have been duly made.

(4) Any rules or orders under this section may be made so as to be retrospective
to any date not earlier than the date of commencement of this Act.

(S)AAll rules or orders made under this section shall have effect as if enacted in
this Act,]

Decisions on 6, If there is any doubt or dispute as to whether a person is entitled to pension
rgg%?ﬁ??g or as to the amount of pension. or as to the period for which he shall be entitled to
pension, Pénsion under this Act, the matter shall be referred to *[the Chairman of the Maha-
rashtra Legislative Council and the Speaker of the Maharashtra Legislative

Assembly, who shall, in consultation with the State Government, decide the question.

‘The decision of the Chairman and the Speaker shall be final].

et e ———

1These words were substituted for the words ** the State Government and its decision shall be
.final™, by Mah. 15 of 1977., 5. 3, :

ap—
&




AT . ¥¥ o . | AR A, ORI/ ORI/ AR -33Y/3008-04

_TEAR, A ¥, 008/3WRE v¥, W I
A WP UL BT HIUATEISE AT WO 3T U5 i fiet S,
TERTY faarriees safafae T TwaEEt yEnfua e sreRy T wee fatam
anfir fafyr a1 = v st R (st qame).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ pension (Amendment)

Act, 2006 (Maharashtra Act No. XV of 2006), is hereby published under the authority

of the Governor. -

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,.

A. M. SHINDEKAR,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XV OF 2006.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor,
in the “ Maharashtra Government Gazette” on the 4th May 2008.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
Pension Act, 1976

Mlagf " WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
1977. Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Fifty-seventh Year of the

Republic of India as follows :(—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Short title.
Pension (Amendment) Act, 2006,

(33¢)

[féa : $9 R.c0]
AT AlG—a0 -



3R

Amend-
ment of
section 4A of
Mah. I of
1977.

2.

HEWTE TIEF A0S, SWHER, § ¥, 008/30E ¥, T 13¢ {wT ae

(@) in sub-section (2),—

(z} for the figures, letters and words “lst day of August
1993” the figures, letters and words “1st day of January 2006”
shall be substituted ; ’

(it) for the word “ widow ” the words “ widow or widower ”
shall be substituted ;

(zi7) for the words “ rupees one thousand ” the words ¢ rupees

three thousand ” shall be substituted ;
(b} in sub-section (2A),—

(1) for the figures, letiers and words “Ist day of August
1993” the figures, letters and words “lst day of January 2006
shall be substituted ;

(ii) for the word “ widow ” the words * widow or widower”
shall be substituted ;

(iii) for the words “ rupees one thousand ” the words “ rupees
three thousand ” shall be substituted ;

('c) after sub-section (24), the following sub-sections shall be

inserted, namely :—

“(2B) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub sections
(1), (2) or (2A), but subject to the provisions of sub-section (3),
there shall be paid a pension to the widow or widower of the
‘member of the State Legislature, who was not entitled to
pension under the Act, from the 1st September 2000 to the

~ 31st December 2005, at the rate of rupees one thousand per

month ; and with effect from the 1st January 2006 at the
rate uf rupees three thousand per month.

(2C) With effect from the 1st January 2006, where the
widow or the widower ‘of the deceased member is survived by
a minor child or children of such member, there shall be paid
a pension per month to such minor ch1ld or children at the
same rate at which the pension was payable to the widow or
widower, and such pension shall be paid in such manner as
may be prescribed by rules.”

{d) for sub-sectl_on 3, the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

In section 4A of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ ?’Iah-
Pension Act, 1976,-—

of

19717,

“(8) Where such widow or widower has re-married, then
she or he shall not be entitled to the pension under this -

section from the date of such re-marriage.”;

(e) in the marginal note, for the words “ widow of member ”
the words “ widow, widower or minor child of member ” shall
be substituted.




3. . R4% | TS = T/ R AR/ ATES-33%/3008-04

AR, fedaR =], Roow/iW ¢, ¥H 2]
WA AHT WUPT A SHOGEET AT AETAT A Y HHIE (5o AR,
HEAT ATS .
-mmmawmﬁma%ﬁﬁﬁﬁaﬂ
et faet @ =g fawvmegm areet favws Gust seram).

- In pursl;ance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension (Third
Amendment) Act, 2006 (Mah. Act No. XLVI of 20086), is hereby published under the .

authorlty of the Governor.
By order and in the name 'of the Governor of Maharashtra,

A. M. SHINDEKAR,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XLVI OF 2006

(First Published, after having received the assent of the
Gouvernor, in the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the
29th December 2000)

An Act further to amend the Maharashira Legislature
v Members Pension Act, 1976.°

WHEREAS it is expechent further to amend the Maharashtra

Mah. 1 Legislature = Members" Pension Act, 1976, for the purposes

of hereinafter appearmg it is hereby enacted in the Fifty-seventh
ror?. Year of the" Repubhc of India as follows:— :

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislature Short titie.
Members' Pension (Third Amendment] Act. 2006.

(¢28)
I &S -2 ] o T S0 |




e HERTE WA 7997, AR, fedey 3%, 00%/0iw ¢, W& §’2¢ [wm &

Amendment

‘;ﬁigﬁ"?é Pension Act, 1976, in sub-section (1), in the second proviso, 197$f
1977, tor the words “ disqualified as a Member of the State Legislature ” C
the words “disqualified for being a Member of the State
Legislature under clause (1) of article 191 of the Constitution
of India” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted with effect from the 1st September 2000.

-

TNEHT T TROTOR, Horg

2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislaturé Members' Mah. 1

.



N

L. . ¢ : : - RS 4, TIOR/ OHAR/AIHY-23%/ 200804

IEHAR, TAHAHT W, 009/ T 4, T e
WET HHAT WU WIEe HIVATHE! AT WANTET 3716 g5 HATE (9t ATed.

HEAT ATS

HenTE faumrss ™ fafmm T TeaamiT WU held StEEw 7 heel fataa
' artfur fafir 7 =g fvrmeg sEe fadmss @ustt oEE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’, Pension (Second
Amendment) Act, 2006 (Mah. I of 2007), is hereby published under the authority
of the Governor. '

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

A. M. SHINDEKAR,

Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department. _

MAHARASHTRA ACT Neo. I OF 2007.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Gouvernor in the
“Maharashtra Govermment Gazette ”, on the 5th January 2007).
An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislature
Members’ Pension Act, 1976.

Mah. I  WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
‘197$f Legislature Members' Pension Act, 1976, for the purposes
" hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Fifty-seventh
Year of the Republic of India as follows :—
1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislature Short title.
Members' Pension (Second Amendment) Act, 2006.
Mah. 1 2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Amendment
of pPension Act, 1977, in sub-section (1), for the first proviso, the gfos;‘iﬁ;%“]

1977, following proviso shall be substituted, namely :— of 1977.
' ®)

I 3181  [fFmE TR R.00]



T

HERTS YITE {919, 379, WHARE &, 3009 / WY ¢y, THh ]3¢ [wrT I
“ Provided that, where any person has served as a Member

for a period exceeding five years, there shall be paid to him

an additional pension of five hundred rupees per month for
every vear {n excess of five years: ".




L . €% o : s A, qﬁqaquazw!mm—qqmooa-oc

IFHATY, AT R0, R00W/3TUT 2R, T 3%
AT WHeA U HIEeF HITOTHIST AT WITEN 3% U5 o fEe .

HWT ATS
g fToevsew afufam @ oo wenfun S seRw 7 wew Ghew anfe
faet 7 =ma frvreege At fadas Gusht srram). ‘

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
following translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Meémbers
Pension (Amendment) Act, 2007 .(Mah. Act No. XXVI of 2007), is hereby
published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

‘A. M. SHINDEKAR,

Secretary fo Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXVI OF 2007.

(First published, after having received the assent of the
~ Governor, in the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on
the 10th August 2007).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Leglslature
Members’ Pension Act, 1976

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
Mah. Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976, for the purposes
1;7‘;f hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Flfty—elghth
" Year of the Republic of India as follows :—
1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislature Short title.
Members’ Pension (Amendment) Act, 2007.

(¥33)
T AE—R ¢ . [ema : 3 %.00]




€33 TR YT 1A, AR, AR Lo, ?oo\s/mur 23, T W]WR] Ci iy

Amend_ment 2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Leg1slature Members Mah I
oF pection o?} Pension Act, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as “ the pr1nc1pal Act”), | 1977
1977. in sub-section (1), for the words “ six thousand rupees” the words
“ eight thousand rupees ” shall be substituted and shall be deemed

to have been substituted with effect from the 1st April 2007.

Amendment 3. In section 4A of the principal Act,—
of section N
4A of Mah. (@) in sub-section (2),—

I of 1877, (i) for the figures, letters and words “1st day of January

2006”7 the figures, létters and words “1st day of April
2007 ” shall be substituted ;

(it) for the words “rupees three thousand” the words
“rupees four thousand ” shall be substituted ;

{b) in sub-section (24),—

(i) for the figures, letters and words “1st day of January
2006 ” the figures, letters and words “1st day of April
2007 ” shall be substituted;

(&t) for ﬁ;he words “rupees three thousand” the words
“rupees four thousand ” shall be substituted ;

(¢} in sub-section (2B), for the portion beginning with the
words, figures and letters “from the 1st September 2000 ” and
ending with the words “ rupees three thousand per month ” the

- following shall be substituted, namely :—

“with effect from the 1st April 2007 at the rate of rupees
four thousand per month ”.




- S F. ¥R S T ied . RO OReTR/AE- 13%/R008-06

| IRAR, ¥ 2, R004/AUTE 22, W 2930

meﬁwamﬁmﬁawma%ﬁé%ﬁm
- mhﬁmammmﬁfﬁrﬁu%(smﬁm)

In pursuance of clause (3) of artlcie 348 of thc Constitution of India, the followmg
translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances and
Pension (Amendment) Act, 2008 (Mah. XX of 2008), is hereby pubhshed under the a.uthonty
of the Governor.

'By order and 'in the name of “the ‘Governior of_ Maharashtra,

“A. M. SHINDEKAR,

Secretary to Govemment,
‘Law and Judiciary Department.

-

g

® S 'MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XX OF-2008.

{First published, after having received the assent of the Gor)emor,
in the “ Maharashtra Government Gazette ” on the 9th May).

An Act further to amend the Maha;rashtra Legislature Members’
Salaries and Allowances Act and the Maharashtra Leg151ature
Members’ Pensmn Act, 1976.

" %’E : WHEREAS it is exped:ent further to amend the Maharashtra,
of Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act and the Maharashtra
1956. Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter
M,ah Oi appearing ; it is hereby enactedin the Fifty-ninth Year ofthe Repubhc of
1977. India as follows —
(¥ew)

, uﬁrm—éu_ [ T tweo]



¥R _ - WERTE YIRA T, HETIRM, | 2, ol/hME R, T RYe  [wmam

CHAPTER I

PREL.IMINARY

i_y‘

Short 1. This Act may be. called the Mabarashtra Legislature Members oL

- title. Sa.lemes and A]lowances and Pensmn (Amendment} Act, 2008

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
- MEMPERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES Acr.

Amendment 2. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ 'Salarleé Bom.
- of section 5nd Allowances Act, in sub-section (ZA), for the words “twelve single XLIX

. 1956,

. 5 D.f Bom. i ourn eys” the words “twenty single Journeys” shall be substituted.
- of 1956. : L ' | |
CHAPTER III

AVENDMENT T0 THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
' MEMBE:RS PENSION Act, 1976.

Amendment . 3, In section 4 of the. Maharashtra Legislature Members Pensmn Mah. -

- ofsection Aot 1976 in sub-section (1), the proviso shall be deleted and shalI be i ;fv'
. 7T,

41°§f 1M977 deemed always to have been deleted.

S

]

Py



HGT. . ¥E _ rﬁmé_#. TR AR ESU-23%/ 300 t-0¢

wiiegR v
WA, ¥ 82, 200s/ 9T R, ¥ 230
‘ﬁ AT HUHAT WUA BT HIVATAIST AT WHIET ATH Y5 HRIE e S

HET ATS
TERTE, TrarEresTd sfafam T o=t vt Fen s o e At
anfur fafy @@ =@ frarnseR et fadass (Guslt sraEe).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
following translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’

- Pension (Amendment) Act, 2008 (Mah. XXIV of 2008), is hereby published
under the authority of the Governor. .

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra, '

A. M. SHINDEKAR,
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXIV OF 2008.

(First published, after having received the assent of the
. Governor, in the “Maharashtra Government Gozetie”, on the
12th May 2008).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legisiature
Members’ Pension Act, 1976. :

Mah. I WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the-
of Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976, for
1977, the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted

in the Fifty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (I) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Short title
Legislature Members’ Pension (Amendment) Act, 2008. and

. . commen-
(2) It shall come into force with effect from the 1st May cement.
2008. -
{¥%3)

NMHAR—RL . TR BE e ]




¥R¥

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah. I of

1977, Act”), in sub-section (I),—

Amendment
of section
4A of Mah. 1
of 1977.

TR VAR {0, FER, § 2R, R00c/30Wd R, W& (30 BCLE

2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Mah, 1

Pension Act, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal igw

(a) for the words “eight thousand rupees” the words
“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
() in the first proviso, for the words “five hundred

rupees” the words “seven hundred fifty rupees” shall
be substituted. '

3. In section 4A of the principal Act,—

(¢) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words, letters and figures “the 1lst day of
April 2007” the words, letters and figures “the 1st
May 20087 shall be substituted ; ~

(it) for the words “ rupees four thousand” the words,
“rupees five thousand” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (24)—

(i) for the words, letters and figures “the 1st day
of April 2007” the words, letters and figures “the 1st
May 2008”7 shall be substituted ;

(it) for the words “ rupees four thousand” the words
“rupees five thousand” shall be substituted ;

(c) in sub-section (2B), for the words, figures and letters
“the 1st April 2007, at the rate of rupees four thousand
per month” the words, figures and letters “ the 1st May
2008, at the rate of rupees five thousand per month”
shall be substituted.

L] a

R

™

L ]



L T T .

Ty ABY ] AER, TR, Ro0t/ATIE &, TH R [ 9% ¥, i : wud Ro.00

IMATGHROT HHIEH wo

AT ST
mrrg RErrsre afafan 3 taueEl wernfua S sERw g e fatEw
- onfor faeft 7 = farTEgE anelelt R (3OS SER).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in Enghish of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman)
and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances,
the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension and the Leaders of
Opposition in Maharashtra fegislature Salaries and Ajlowances (Amendment) Act, 2009 (Mah.
XVII of 2009), is hereby published under the authority of the Govemnor.

By ofder and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,
H. B. PATEL,

Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XVIII OF 2009.

(First published, after having received the ussent of the Governor,
in the “Maharashira Government Gazette”, on the
27th June 2009).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances
Act, the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the
Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act,
the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and the
Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1978.

®
I SIS —uo-g



Short title
and
commence-
ment.

" Amendment
of section 4A
of Bom.
XLVII of
1956.

Amendment
of section
12B of
Bom. XLVII
of 1956.

/
WERTE I IS0 SRTHIT W 3075, 7 39, R00%/3ATHIE &, T 232

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and
Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
Act, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
Act, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and
the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1978, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is
hereby enacted in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :—

-CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the
Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra

Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra

Legislature Members’ Pension and the Leaders of Opposition in
Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act,
2009.

(2} It shall come into force with effect from the 1st July 2009,

CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE CoUNCIL (CHATRMAN AND
DEerUTY CHAIRMAN) AND MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SPEAKER AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER) SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

2. In section 4A of the Maharashtra Legislative Council {Chairman
and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker
and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this
Chapter, referred to as “ the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and the
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act”), for the
words “ four lakh rupees” the words “ six lakh rupees” shall be
substituted. '

3. In section 12B of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and the
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for the
letters and figures “ Rs. 7,000” the letters and figures “ Rs. 8,000”
shall be substituted.

Bom.
XLVII

956
Bom.
XILVIT
of
1956.
Bom.
XLIX
of

1956.
Mah.
Iof
1977.
Mah.
VHI
of
1978,

Bom.
XLVII

1956.




o TERT YR YT STHTEOT W 318, S 39, R00%/3T8TE &, T 213
' . CHAPTER III :

. AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MINISTERS” SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES
Acr.

<1 4. In section 10C of the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and
VI:? Allowances Act, for the letters and figures “ Rs. 7,000 ” the letters and
1956. figures “ Rs. 8,000 shall be substituted.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAUARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’ SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES ACT.

Bom.

Bom.

XLIX
0

1956.

5. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act”), to sub-section (1A), the
following Explanation shall be added, namely .—

“ Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, in relation
to a member whose nearest airport from his residence is situated
out of the State, the term “ nearest airport from his residence,
within the State” shall include such airport situated out of the
State, which is nearest from his residence.”.

6. In section 6-of the Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act, in
sub-section (3), for the letters and figures “ Rs. 7,000 ” the letters and
figures “ Rs. 8,000 ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
MemeERs’ PEnsioN AcT, 1976.

Mah. 7. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pensicn
T of Act, 1976 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Legislature
" Members’ Pension Act”), in sub-gection (1),—

(a) for the words “ ten thousand rupees” the words “ fifteen
thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

. (b) in the first proviso, for the words “ seven hundred fifty rupees”
the words “ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.

8. In section 4A of the Legislature Members’ Pension Act,—
{a) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words, letters and figures “ the lst day of May
20087 the words, letters and figures  the 1st July 2009 ” shall be
s_ubstituted;

(i) for the words “ rupees five thousand ” the words “ rupees
seven thousand five hundred ” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (2A)—

Amendment
of section
10C of
Bom,
XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment
of section 5
of Bom.
XLIX of
1956.

Amendment
of section 6
of Bom. XLIX

. of 1956.

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah_ T of
1977.

Amendment
of section 4A
of Mah, [ of
1977.



¥ | T W QI ST T 15, T 9, R00%/3THE &, T 23R

(1) for the words, letters and figures “ the 1st May 2008 7 the
words, letters and figures “ the 1st July 2009 * shall be substituted ;

(ii} for the words “ rupees five thousand ” the words “ rupees
seven theusand five hundred ” shall be substituted ;

{c) in sub-section (2B), for the words, figures and letters “ the 1st
May 2008, at the rate of rupees five thousand per month” the
words, figures and letters “ the 1st July 2009, at the rate of rupees
seven thousand five hundred per month ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER V1

AMENDMENT TO THE LEAapERS OF OPPOSITION IN MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
SALARIES aND ALLOWANCES AcT, 1978.

Amendment 9. In section 10A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Mah.

of section 10A Tegislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, for the letters and VI

of Mah. VIII £oires “ Rs. 7,000” the letters and figures “ Rs. 8,000” shall be °f

of 1978. ; 1978,
substituted. ‘

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATICNERY. AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY
SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAV], PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ] SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A,
NETAJY SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. '




RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

HETIT MM I[TTA
STHTTII HWT S

. g 3, 3w () wiaTe, ORI 30, RoR0/ANRE 20, TH 9833 [0S ®, i : TR ow00

ITTTTT THEHIE Go

'~ g ST
mewre faamrza sfuftmm 7 TouamEl nemfta SEe sy @ Fae fafae
anfr faeft @ =@ fawmwga aeelt fadad (Fusit svEm).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension (Amendment)

Act, 2011 (Mah. Act No. XXIII of 2011}, is hereby pubhshed under the authority of
the Governor,

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashira,

H. B. PATEL,

Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXIII OF 201l.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor
in the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 30th April 2011).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra lLegislature

Members’ Pension Act, 1976. ’
WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
Mah. I Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter
197?; appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-second Year of the

Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Short title.
Pension (Amendment) .Act, 2011.

T S —Fo-% l (2)




3 WERTY VIRA TWGA FRERT 9T 008, UNE 30, J0RQ/3AWE o, W 8933

Amendment 2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members' Pension Mah.!
of section Act, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act"), in ‘;577
3 of Mahl b section (2 ), for the words “fifteen thousand rupees” the words '
of 1977. © :
“twenty-five thousand rupees" shall be substituted, with effect from
the 1st May 2011.

Amendment 3. In section 4 of the principal Act, to sub-section (1), the
of section following proviso shall be inserted and shall be deemed always

4 of Mah. : .
" n —
I of 1977 to have been inserted, namely

"Provided that, where the salary payable to such person
- for holding such office or being such member or so employed,
or where the remuneration referred to in clause {¢) paid to
such person, is, in either case, less than the pension payable
to him under section 3, such person shall be entitled only
to receive the balance of pension under’ that s}ection.".

Amendment 4, In section 4A of the principal Act, after sub-section (2C),

of s:;ti‘:;- the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

Mah. T of “(2D) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections
1977, (1), @), (2A), (2B) and (20), but subject to the provisions
of sub-section (3), there shall be paid a pension, to the
widow or widower of the member of the State Legislature
or where the widow or widower of such deceased member
is survived by minor child or children, to such minor child
or children, with effect from the 1lst May 2011, at the rate
of rupees twenty-five thousand per month.”

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHR! PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004
AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD,
CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAJ 400 004. EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

aw 3, IF we(R)] AR, AMRE ¥, R0/ R, Ik R3¢ [g9 w, fwa : 30 Rw.00

SHRUT HATE 3

TR IahTITT
TeRTE, faariee afufam g U wenfue deid Ry F Feret faftaw sufor
fafer @ = faurmega e faged (T orETE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and the
Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the
Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension and the Leaders of Opposition
in Maharashtra Legislature Salries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XXXII
of 2016), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXXII OF 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 24th August 2016).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman
and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker
and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature
Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978.

XLVII of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative
1956. Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
XLVIISI)I52f Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the
XLIXof Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
1956. Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
Mah.Tof Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and the Leaders of Opposition in

1977. . .
Mah. VIII of Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, for the purposes

1978. g
HIT A8 ]{3-2



R HERT IMEA SIS AETEIRUT WAT 36, AMRE ¥, 0RE/WE R, IHh R3¢

hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly
(Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra
Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension and
the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2016.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS To THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL (CHAIRMAN AND
Drputy CHAIRMAN) AND MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SPEAKER AND DEPUTY SPEAKER) SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

Substitution 2. For section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and
Ofse(;zf{l,ﬁ gg Deputy Chairman) and the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and
1956. Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “ the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker and Deputy

Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act”), the following section shall be

substituted, namely "—

Salaries of “3. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to

Chai . . . .
and SE::;E:E the Chairman and Speaker, during the term of their office, the salary
equivalent to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances
admissible to the Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and
as revised, from time to time.”.
Amendment 3. In section 5 of the Legislative Council Chairman and Deputy

of Se(;f{;ﬁ gg Chairman and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, sub-

1956. section (2) shall be deleted.

Afmeffc(_imeilg 4. For section 10 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker
° :;;E{;lﬂof and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, the following section shall

1956. be substituted, namely:-

Salaries of “10. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to
c hD,eputy the Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker, during the term of their office,
airman
and Deputy the salary equivalent to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other
Speaker. allowances admissible to the Additional Chief Secretary to the

Government of Maharashtra and as revised, from time to time.”.

Amendment 5. Section 12B of the Maharashtra Legislative Council Chairman and
of section 12B o,y Chairman and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances

of XLVII of i
1956. Act, shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1) thereof and,—

(a) in sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, for the letters and figures
“Rs. 15,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 25,000” shall be substituted;

XLVII of
1956.



HERTZ IMHA IO AEERTT HET 713, ARE ¥, R0L/HTE R, Tk R3¢

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(2) There shall be paid to the Chairman, the Speaker, the
Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker a sum of Rs. 10,000 per
month for availing the services of computer operator.”;

(¢) in the marginal note, after the words “personal assistant” the
words “and a computer operator” shall be added.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS To THE MAHARASHTRA MINISTERS’
SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

XLVIII 6. For section 3 of the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
of 1956. Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Ministers’ Salaries and
Allowances Act”), the following section shall be substituted, namely”—

“3. (1) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to
the Minister, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent to the
basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances admissible to the
Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and as revised, from
time to time.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to the
Minister of State, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent to
the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances admissible
to the Additional Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and
as revised, from time to time;.”.

7. In section 8 of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, sub-section
(2) shall be deleted.

8. Section 8A of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act shall be
deleted.

9. Section 10C of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, shall be
re-numbered as sub-section (I) thereof and,-

(a) in sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, for the letters and figures
“Rs. 15,000" the letters and figures “Rs. 25,000” shall be substituted;
(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(2) There shall be paid to every Minister, Minister of State and
Deputy Minister a sum of Rs. 10,000 per month for availing the
services of computer operator.”;
(c) in the marginal note, after the words “personal assistant”
the words “and a computer operator” shall be added.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS To THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
MEMBERS’ SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

XLIX of 10. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and
1956. Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Legislature
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act”).
T A R3-R

Substitution
of section 3 of
XLVIIIof
1956.
Salaries of
Ministers and
Minister of
State.

Amendment
of section 8 of
XLVIII of
1956.

Deletion of
section 8A of
XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment
of section 10C
of XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment of
section 3 of
XLIX of 1956.



Amendment
of section 4 of
XLIX of 1956.

Amendment
of section 6 of
XLIX of 1956.

Amendment
of section 3 of
Mabh. 1 of
1977.

Substitution
of section 3 of
Mabh. VIII of
1978.

Salary of
Leader of
Opposition.

Deletion of
section 3A of
Mabh. VIII of
1978.

HERTZ IMHA TSUA AEERUT HET 713, ARE ¥, R0L/HTE R, Tk R3¢

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(1) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid
to the Members, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent
to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances
admissible to the Principal Secretary to the Government of
Maharashtra and as revised, from time to time.”;

(b) sub-section (2), shall be deleted;

(c) in the marginal note, the words “and consolidated allowances”
shall be deleted.

11. In section 4 of the Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
Act, for the letters and figures “Rs. 1,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 2,000
shall be substituted.

12. In section 6 of the Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
Act,-
(a) in sub-section (3), for the letters and figures “Rs. 15,000” the
letters and figures “Rs. 25,000” shall be substituted;
(b) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(3A) There shall be paid to every Member a sum of Rs. 10,000
per month for availing the services of computer operator.”;
(c) sub-section (4) shall be deleted.
CHAPTER V
AMENDMENT T0 THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’
Pension AcT, 1976.
13. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act,
1976, in sub-section (1), for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “fifty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER VI

AMENDMENTS T'o THE LEADERS OF OPPOSITION IN MAHARASHTRA
LEGISLATURE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES AcT, 1978.

14. For section 3 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978 (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries
and Allowances Act”), the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“3. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to the
each Leader of Opposition, during the term of his office, the salary
equivalent to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances
admissible to the Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and
as revised, from time to time.”.

15. Section 3A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature
Salaries and Allowances Act shall be deleted.

Mah. 1 of
1977.

Mah.
VIII of
1978



HERTZ IMHA IO AEERTT HET 713, ARE ¥, R0L/HTE R, Tk R3¢ “

16. Section 10A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Amendment
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, shall be re-numbered as sub- of section 10A

) of Mah. VIII
section (1) thereof and,— of 1978.

(a) in sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, for the letters and figures
“Rs. 15,000” the letters and figures “Rs, 25,000” shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

(2) There shall be paid to each Leader of Opposition a sum of

Rs. 10,000 per month for availing the services of computer operator.”;

(¢) in the marginal note, after the words “personal assistant” the
words “and a computer operator” shall be added.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



	1977MH1.pdf
	2006MH15.pdf
	2006MH46.pdf
	2007MH1.pdf
	2007MH26.pdf
	2008MH20.pdf
	2008MH24.pdf
	2009MH18.pdf
	2011MH23.pdf



