The Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1978

Act 8 0f 1978

Keyword(s):
Leaders of the Opposition, Salaries, Allowances, MLA

Amendments appended: 18 of 2009, 32 of 2010, 32 of 2016, 17 of 2017

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




Replacement Series No. XC—p. 791
9887

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VIII OF 1978

(THE LEADERS OF OPPOSITION IN MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES AcCT, 1978]

Amended by Mah. 30 of 1981 (1-4-1981). *
e " . 48 of 1981 £

- ' 72 of 1981 (1-4-1981). *££
" ” . 10 of 1982 (1-2-1982), *
. v . 3 of 1986 @(1-8-1985). *
" . . 24 of 1987 (1-8-1987). *
‘s . ” 4 of 1989 (1-7-1988). *
. ” " 6 of 1991 @@(2-1-1991). *
" ” " 5 of 1994 (1-8-1593), #
e 10 of 1997 (1-1-1997)*

An Act to provide for salariez and allowances of Leaders of Opposition in
Maharashtra State Legislature.

WHEREAS, it is expedient to provide for determination of the salaries and
allowances of the Leaders of the Opposition in the Maharashtra State Legisiature
and for certain other matters hereinafter appearing; It is hereby enacted in the
_Twenty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :— ‘

1. (D) This Act may be called the Leaders of Opposition in kisharashirs Legi- Short title
slature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1973. and com-

: t.
(2) It shall, be deemed to have come into force on the 27th March 1978. mencemen

2. In this Act, “ Leader of the Opposition ** in relation to either House of the Definition,
State Legislature, mea s that member of the State Legislature Assembly or the
State Legislature Council as the case may be who is for the time being the Leader in
that House of the party in opposition to the State Government having the greatest
numerical strength and recognised as such by the Speaker of the Assembly or the
Chairman of the Council as the case may be.

Explanation.—Where there are two or more parties in opposition to the State
Government in the Assembly or in the Council having the same numerical strength,
the Speaker of the Assembly or the Chairman of the Council as the case may be
shall, having regard. to the status of the parties, recognise any onc of the Leaders
of such parties as the Leader of the Opposition for the purposes of this Act, and
such recognition shall be final and conclusive. :

3. There shall be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a salary of 2[Rs. 2,000] Salary of

Leaders of
per month. ‘ Opposition.

1 For Statemgnt of Objects and Reasons, see Maharashtra Government Gazette, 1978, Part V.
Extra, p. 46.

2 Tlgxgse let;er and figures were substituted for the lettrs and figurrs ‘* Rs. 1,800 " by Mah. 24 of
1987, s. 2.

* This indicates the date of commencement of Act.

£Mah. 48 of 1981 except sections 5, 7 and 9 came into force on the 1st April 1931, Section 5,
7 and 9 came into force on the date of publication of the Act in the Official Gazette, i. e. on
the 18ih September 1981.

££Mah. 72 of 1981, except sections 3 and 9 came into foce on st April 1981, the sections 3 and 9
%ame ug;o force on the date of publication of the Act in the Official Gazette, i, e., 29th Decem-

er 1981. .

&Mabh. 3 of 1986, except sections 1 and 2 came into force on 1st August 1985, sections 1 and 2
camelgxgg force on the date of publication of the Act in the Official Gazetie, i. e., 28th Jan-
uary . . . ’

@ @*Sections 2, 4 and 5 of this Act came into force on the st day of June 1990 and section 3
came into force on the 20th May 1987. .

H 42{0--100a




| |
9888  Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Iegislaiure (1978 : Msh. VI
. Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978

all Sitting  1{3A. Each Leader of Opposition shall be entitled to a sitting allowance at the
lowance {0 rate of [Rs. 150] per day throughout his term of office as such Leader of Opposition.]

Opposition. i

Residence of 4. (I) Fach Leader of the Opposition shall, so long as he continues as such
OLead‘?r.S of T eader and for a period of fifteen days immediately thereafter, be entitled, without
pposition. ., ument of rent, to the use of a furnished residence in Bombay. or in lieu of such
residence a house allowance at the rate of 3[Rs. 2,500 per month and in addition
a sum equal to the electricity charges and water charges, if any, paid by him for his
place of residence in Bombay (being a place other than the place of residence pro-

vided under this Act by the State Government)].

(2) No charge shall fall on the Leader of the Opposition personally in respect of
the maintenance of and residence provide under this section.

(3) The expenditure on furnishing the residence provided under this section shall
be on such scale as the State Government may by rules or orders determine.

4[(4) Where a house allowance and other sum are payable under sub-section (1)
to a Leader of the Oppostion, thep, save as otherwise provided by or under this Act,
the State Government shall not incur any expenditures, or the Leader of the Opposi-
tion shall not be entitled to any payment for, additions, alterations, maintenance,
repairs or for doing anything whatsoever in respect of his place of rcsidence.]

Cenveyarices 5. (/) The State Government may from ume to time for the use of each Leader
for Leaders of the Opposition, purchase and provide a motor car and ciher suitable conveyances
of Op'fi%s['l' upon such conditions as regards its maintenance and repairs as may be determined
“by rules or orders made in this behalf. The State Government may also provide

free of charge the services of a chauffeur for the car or conveyance so provided.

(2) There shall be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a conveysnce allowance
at 5[such rate per month as may be prescribed by rules made in that behalf.]

Travelling 6. Subject to any rules or orders made in this behalf by the State Government,
and daily each Leader of the Opposition shall be entitled to—-

allowance ) . . . )
and resi- (a) travelling aliowance for himself and the members of bis family, and for
dential  the transport of his and his family’s effects,
accommoda- - s . . ; .
tion at (i) in respect of the journsy to Bombay from his usual piace of residence
places other outside Bombay for assuming office; and
than head- eyt &t : - . . - .
quarters. (if) in respect of the journey from Bombay io his usual place of residence

outside Bombzay on relinquishing office; and ,

(b) travelling and daily allowances in respect of tours undertaken by him in
the discharge of his duties as the Leader of the Opposition, and suitable residential
accommodation at places visiied by him on such tours.

Explanation—The expression * Bombay ” includes any other place appointed
by the State Government for the purposes of this seetion.

B

1 Section 3A was inserted by Mah. 24 of 1987, s. 3. :

» These letters and figures were substituted for the letters and figures ** Rs, 100 ™ by Mah. 6 of
1991, s. 2. :

s T};ese worgf )were substituted for the words and figures * Rs. 250 per month ** by Mah. 4 of
1989, s, 10(a).

¢ Sub-section (4) was added by Mah. 4 of 1989, s. 4(b).

5 These words were substituted for letters and figures * to ruic of &t Rs, 1,000 per month ™ by
Mabh. 3 of 1986, 5. 2.




Replacement Series Ne, XC-p.792
1978 « Mah, VIII]  Leaders of Opposition in Maharashira Legislature 9889
Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978

kilometres for]travelling, to claim travelling allowance as if he or both or all of then,
as the case may be, had undertaken the [journey by first class by railway]. In
such cases, the difference between the fare for journey by air and the fare for
1[journey by first class by railway] will have to be borne by the Leader of the
Opposition. .

(b) Where a Leader of the Opposition, either singly or jointly with the members
of his family as aforesaid undcitakes a journsy by steamer or road transport, in
any part of India outside the State, he shall be entitled, subject to the maximum
limit of *[thitty thousand kilomenties] of travelling, to claim the fare for journey
by steamer o1 road transport i€ it is loss than the fare for journey by first class by
railway] for the same distance or, if the faie for journey by steamer or road transport
is more than the fare for [journcy by first class by railway] for the same distancs,
to claim the fare for [journey by first class by] railway for the distance, and he shall
have to bear the difference between the two fares.

(3) In this scction, where facilitics are given to 2 Leader of the Opposition to
travel jointly with the spouse (with or without mivor childien), then in the case of
a lady Leader of Oppsition, she shall be entitled to have these facilities to tiavel,
from time to time, jointly with her spouse or, instead, with any other member of
her family as defived in the Explanation to section 8.]

8. Subject to any 1ulcs or orders made by the State Government, a Leader of Medical
the Opposition and the members of his family who are residing with and dependant attendance.
on him, shall be entitled, fres of charge, to accommodation in hospitals maintained
by the State Government and to medical attendanc: and treatment.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, the expression “a member of
the family ” means (he husband, wife, son, daughter, father, mother, brothsr or
sister.

9. (1) Each Leader of the Opposition shall during the term of his office be Telephone
entitled to have a telephons installed at Government cost at the place of residencs facilities.
or at any place in his constituency selected by him, being a place other than the
place of residence provided under this Act, bv the State Government.

(2) No chaige shall fali on the Leader of the Opposition parsonally in 1espect of
installation of, initial deposit for, rental chaiges for maintenance of, and official
calls made fiom the telephone installed under sub-section (J).

(3) There shall also be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a sum of 3[Rs. 4,500}
per month, from the month in which telephone facility has been provided under
this section.

4[(4) Wheie a Leader of the Opposition has a telephone installed at any place
referred to in sub-section (I) at his own cost, then—
(a) the rental charges in respzct of such telephone shall ke borne by the State
Government) and there shall be paid to him a sum of 5[Rs. 4,500] p21 month in
respect to such telephone;

! These words were substituted for the words * first class ” by Mah. 6 of 1991, s. 3(5).

s '11‘911867se wgrds were substituted for the words * twenty thousand kilomtres * by Mah. 24 of
s. 4. .

® These letter and figures were substituted for the letters and fiures “ Rs. 4,000 ” by Mah. 10

of 1997, s. 8(a). ,with effect from 1st January1997,

4 Sub-section (4) was substituted by Mah. 4 of 1989, s. 11. i
* These letters and figures were substituted for the letters and figures “Rs. 4,000 " by Mah. 10
of 1997, s. 8(b), with effect from 1st January 1997.




l
- 9890 Leaders of Opposition in Maharashira Legisiature {1978 : Mah, VII
: Sularies and Allowances Act, 1978

(b) the charges in respact of official calls made from such tekephone shall also
ba borne by the State Government if he resides at suchplace as a residence and a
separate telephone is not provided to him by or under the provisions of this Act
by the State Government.] ;

Secretariat 10, There shall be placed atthe disposal of each Leader of the Opposition such
facilities. staff as may be determined by rules or orders made in that behalf.

Facility of  1[10A. Each Leader of the Opposition shall be entitled, frec of charge, to the
a personal services of a2 pursonal assistant. For this purpose, each Leader of Opposition may
assistant. znnoint any porson, possessing such quelifications as may be prescribed by rules
or oiders made under section 13, as his pzrsonal assistant. Subject to such rules or

orders as may be made in this behalf, the assistant so appointed shall receive a fixed

salary of 2[Rs. 2,500] per month from the State Government]. :

Leadersof 11. N otwithstanding anything contained in any law for the time being in force ’
Opposition de(ermining the salaries and allowances of the members of the State Legislatwe, a

n‘s’glg‘;vd;i‘g Leader of the Opposition shall not be entitled to receive any salary or allowances

allowances Of other facilitiesunder such law although he is member of the Asserbly or the
etc. as Council, as the case may be. .
members of
State
Legislature.

Leaders of 12. For the avoidance of doubt, itis hereby declared that a person shall not be

Opposition disqualified for being chosen as, or for being, a member of the State Legisiative

dis ua]iﬁ‘é‘ét Assembly or the State Legislative Council merely by 1eason of the fact that he holds
4 “ the office of a Leader of the Opposition. ,

Power of 13. (I) Without prejudice to any power to’make rules o1 order contained else-
- State where in this Act, the State Government may make any rules or oiders for carrying -

Government i ]
of make out thc purposcs of this Act.

rules and

dors (2) Any rule o1 order under this Act may be made so as to bs retrospactive to

any date not carlier than the date of commencement of this Act.

(3) All 1ules 01 orders made under this Act shall have effect as if enacicd in the
Act.

© 14, [Amendment of Bom. XLIX of 1956] Amendments have been incorporated in ‘.
the principal Act.

| ' |

1 Section 10A was inserted by Mah. 48 of 1981, s. 9.
2 These letters and figures were substituted for the letters and figures “ Rs. 2,000 ” by Mah. §
of 1997, s. 9, with effect from 1st January 1997.




L T T .

Ty ABY ] AER, TR, Ro0t/ATIE &, TH R [ 9% ¥, i : wud Ro.00

IMATGHROT HHIEH wo

AT ST
mrrg RErrsre afafan 3 taueEl wernfua S sERw g e fatEw
- onfor faeft 7 = farTEgE anelelt R (3OS SER).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in Enghish of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman)
and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances,
the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension and the Leaders of
Opposition in Maharashtra fegislature Salaries and Ajlowances (Amendment) Act, 2009 (Mah.
XVII of 2009), is hereby published under the authority of the Govemnor.

By ofder and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,
H. B. PATEL,

Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XVIII OF 2009.

(First published, after having received the ussent of the Governor,
in the “Maharashira Government Gazette”, on the
27th June 2009).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances
Act, the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the
Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act,
the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and the
Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1978.

®
I SIS —uo-g



Short title
and
commence-
ment.

" Amendment
of section 4A
of Bom.
XLVII of
1956.

Amendment
of section
12B of
Bom. XLVII
of 1956.

/
WERTE I IS0 SRTHIT W 3075, 7 39, R00%/3ATHIE &, T 232

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra
Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and
Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
Act, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
Act, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and
the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1978, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is
hereby enacted in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :—

-CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the
Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra

Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra

Legislature Members’ Pension and the Leaders of Opposition in
Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act,
2009.

(2} It shall come into force with effect from the 1st July 2009,

CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE CoUNCIL (CHATRMAN AND
DEerUTY CHAIRMAN) AND MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SPEAKER AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER) SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

2. In section 4A of the Maharashtra Legislative Council {Chairman
and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker
and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this
Chapter, referred to as “ the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and the
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act”), for the
words “ four lakh rupees” the words “ six lakh rupees” shall be
substituted. '

3. In section 12B of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and the
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for the
letters and figures “ Rs. 7,000” the letters and figures “ Rs. 8,000”
shall be substituted.

Bom.
XLVII

956
Bom.
XILVIT
of
1956.
Bom.
XLIX
of

1956.
Mah.
Iof
1977.
Mah.
VHI
of
1978,

Bom.
XLVII

1956.




o TERT YR YT STHTEOT W 318, S 39, R00%/3T8TE &, T 213
' . CHAPTER III :

. AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MINISTERS” SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES
Acr.

<1 4. In section 10C of the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and
VI:? Allowances Act, for the letters and figures “ Rs. 7,000 ” the letters and
1956. figures “ Rs. 8,000 shall be substituted.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAUARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’ SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES ACT.

Bom.

Bom.

XLIX
0

1956.

5. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act”), to sub-section (1A), the
following Explanation shall be added, namely .—

“ Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, in relation
to a member whose nearest airport from his residence is situated
out of the State, the term “ nearest airport from his residence,
within the State” shall include such airport situated out of the
State, which is nearest from his residence.”.

6. In section 6-of the Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act, in
sub-section (3), for the letters and figures “ Rs. 7,000 ” the letters and
figures “ Rs. 8,000 ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
MemeERs’ PEnsioN AcT, 1976.

Mah. 7. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pensicn
T of Act, 1976 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Legislature
" Members’ Pension Act”), in sub-gection (1),—

(a) for the words “ ten thousand rupees” the words “ fifteen
thousand rupees ” shall be substituted ;

. (b) in the first proviso, for the words “ seven hundred fifty rupees”
the words “ one thousand rupees ” shall be substituted.

8. In section 4A of the Legislature Members’ Pension Act,—
{a) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words, letters and figures “ the lst day of May
20087 the words, letters and figures  the 1st July 2009 ” shall be
s_ubstituted;

(i) for the words “ rupees five thousand ” the words “ rupees
seven thousand five hundred ” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (2A)—

Amendment
of section
10C of
Bom,
XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment
of section 5
of Bom.
XLIX of
1956.

Amendment
of section 6
of Bom. XLIX

. of 1956.

Amendment
of section 3
of Mah_ T of
1977.

Amendment
of section 4A
of Mah, [ of
1977.



¥ | T W QI ST T 15, T 9, R00%/3THE &, T 23R

(1) for the words, letters and figures “ the 1st May 2008 7 the
words, letters and figures “ the 1st July 2009 * shall be substituted ;

(ii} for the words “ rupees five thousand ” the words “ rupees
seven theusand five hundred ” shall be substituted ;

{c) in sub-section (2B), for the words, figures and letters “ the 1st
May 2008, at the rate of rupees five thousand per month” the
words, figures and letters “ the 1st July 2009, at the rate of rupees
seven thousand five hundred per month ” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER V1

AMENDMENT TO THE LEAapERS OF OPPOSITION IN MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
SALARIES aND ALLOWANCES AcT, 1978.

Amendment 9. In section 10A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Mah.

of section 10A Tegislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, for the letters and VI

of Mah. VIII £oires “ Rs. 7,000” the letters and figures “ Rs. 8,000” shall be °f

of 1978. ; 1978,
substituted. ‘

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATICNERY. AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY
SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAV], PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ] SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A,
NETAJY SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. '




ad %, 3w wo(¥)]  vTmATY, iR 98, R020/STIRTIN 30, TH 23R [ 7 &, e : T 2200

.

STETETIOT HHIH

AT W

" meﬁwwawﬁmﬁﬁ%ﬁﬁma%ﬁﬁw

afor faelt & = RrvTmEgA aeelt Rread (Fust seE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman)
and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances,
thc Maharashtra Ministérs’ Salarics and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislative Members’
Salaries and Allowances and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra’ Legislature Salaries
and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2010 (Mah. Act No. XXXII of 2010), is hereby published
under the authority of the Governor. -

By order and in thc name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

H. B. PATEL,
Secretary to  Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXXII OF 2010.

(First published, after having received the assént of the Governor, in
the "Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 21st December, £010).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative Council {Chainman
and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative Assermbly (S'pc'akef
and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Minjsters’
Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances Act and the Leaders of Oppd.sition in Maharashtra Legislature
Salarics and Allowances Act, 1978. _

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra

Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and

WIT 3SR - § : ()



3 "RERT ST TAUH FETETOT ¥ s, Fadiem 22, 0%0/AmEaw 3o, W 27317

Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker)
Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries
and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances Act and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-first Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY
Short titte 1, (J) This Act may be called the Maharashira Legislative

comm:ig;: Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and
Allowances, the Maharashtra Ministers' Salaries and Allowances,
the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries
and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2010.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come mto force on the lst April
2010,

CHAPTER 1I

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LuaIstATIivE Counciv
- {CHAIRMAN AND DEPUTY CHAIRMAN) AND MAHARASHTRA
LLGISLAHVD ASSEMBLY (SPEAKER AND DEPUTY SPEAKER)
SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

Amendment 2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra  Legislative Couneil
of "ggt‘g“lf (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
XLV of Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances
1958. Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Chairman and
Deputy Chairman and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and
Allowances Act”™), for the letters and figures “Rs. 5,000” the letters

and figures “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted.

24 oouncil (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra’

Bom.
XLVII
of
19586,
Bom,
XLV
of
1956.
Bom.
XLIX
of
1958,

Msah,

VIO
of
1978,

Bom,
XLVII

1956.

Amendment 3. In section 4 of the (Jhmrman and Deputy Chaxrman and

"f o?eﬁt:;: Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, in sub-

XLVII of section (1), for the letters and figures “Ra. 2,500” the letters and
19561 figures “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted.

2



. Bom.

RO A 0N SRR URT 3tE, fEdaT 2R, Qoto/amygvanT 3o, W 2]IR

4. In section 7A of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act,—

() in sub-section (3), for the letters and figures
“Rs. 8,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 12,000” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the letters and figures
“Rs. 8,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 12,000” shall be
substituted.

5. Throughout section 8 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman
and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for
the words “thirty thousand kilometers”, wherever they occur, the
words “fifty thousand kilometers” shall be substituted.

6. In section 10 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for the
letters and figures “Rs. 4,600 the letters and figures “Rs. 9,200
shall be substituted.

7. After section 10 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman
and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act,
the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“10-1A. There shall be placed at the disposal of the Deputy
Chairman and the Deputy Speaker each, a sumptuary allowance
of three lakh rupees per annum.”

8. In section 10A of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and
Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for the
letters and figures “Rs. 200" the letters and figures
“Rs. 500" shall be substituted. '

9. In section 11 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and

Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for the

- letters and figures “Rs. 2,500” the letters and figures“Rs. 10 ,000”
-shall be substituted.

CHAPTER I
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MINISTERS' SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES ACT. .
10. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and
XLVIT Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the
105 ‘;f Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act”),—
{a) for the letters and figures “Rs.
figures “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted,
(b} for the letters and figures “Rs. 4,600” the letters and

figures “Rs. 9,200” shall be subshtuted
T SRS 3

5,000 the letters and

3

Armendment
of section
7A of Bom.
XLV of
1956,

Amendment
of section 8
of Bom.
XILVII of
1956.

Amendment
of section
10 of Borm.
XLV of
1956.

Insertion of
section 10-
1A in Bom. -
XLVH of
1956.
Sumptuary
allowance

to Deputy
Chairman
and Deputy
Speaker.
Amendment
of section
104 of

Bom. XLVII.
of 1956,

Amendment
of section
11 of

Bom. XLVII
of 1956.

Amendment
of section 3
of Bom.
RLVIIL of
1956.



¥ FERTE IO TGS SUTOT WIT 415, FEdaw 38, [000/3ATHTAT 30, TR 9R39

- Amendment 11, In section 4 of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act,
of Eﬁ“{;ﬁ; in sub-section (1) for the letters and figures “Rs. 2,500” the leuters

XLVII of and figures “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted.
. 1956,

Amendment 12 In section 7 of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act,
of section 7 o cub- section (1), for the letters and figures “Rs. 2,500 the letters

of Bom.
XLVIH of and figures “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted.
1956.
Amendment 13 TIn section 8A of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
gl Section p ot for the letters and figures “Rs. 2007 the lettors and figures |
XLVII of “Rs. 500" shall be substituted.
1956.

Amendment 14,  In section 10A of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
of section Act—

104 of .
Bom. {(a) in sub-section (3), for the letters and figures “Rs. 8,600”
XLVIII;SET the letters and figures “Rs. 12,000” shall be substituted,; _

(b) in sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the letters and figures
“Rs. 8,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 12,000” shall be
substituted.

Amendment 15, Throughout section 10B of the Ministers’ Salaries and
of ig‘gmor} Allowances Act, for the words “thirty thousand kilometers”, wherever
Bom. they occur, the words “fifty thousand kilometers” shall be

XLVI;; gf substituted.

CHAPTER 1V

TAMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES ACT.
Afmendment 16. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
tion 3
O Bom. Salaries and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred

. XLIX of to as “the Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act”),—

1956.
(a) in sub-section (1), for the letters and figures “Rs. 2,000” the
letters and ﬁgures “Rs. 8,000” shall be substituted;

(&) in sub-section (2), for the letters and figures “Rs. 1,500” the
letters and figures “Rs. 3,000” shall be substituted.

Amendment 17, In section 4 of the Legislature Members Salaries and

of qutg’;l; Allowance‘; Act, for the letters and figures “Rs. 500” the letters and

XLIX of figures “Rs. 1,000” shdll be substituted.
1956.

Bom.
XLIX
of
1956.




B\

REWTE JTa- AU FATERUT 90T Ae, Fedan 32, voto/smmmT 30, W 23R 4

18. In section 5 of the Legislature Members’ Salaries.and ﬁ“‘engm‘”’;
: ) . . of section
Allowances Act, for sub-section (IAJ, the following sub-section of Bom.

shall be substituted, namely:— ;%:I;i of
- 20,

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section(Z), any
‘member may undertake or perform journey by air from any
airport to any cities or towns or from any cities or towns to any
airport, within the State, total thirty-two single journeys; and
journey from any airport within the State to any airport
situated out of the State within the territory of India, total
eight single journeys during the entire period of a year.

Explanafion.~—For the purposes of this sub-section, the term

’ ’ “any airport within the State” shall include such airport situated

h out of the State, which is nearest from his place of residence.”.
19. In section 6 of the Legislature Members' Salaries and Amendment

f section 6
Allowances Act,— . gf s]; sn:;on

XLIX of

() in sub-section (4), for the 1étters and figures “Rs. 25,0007 1086

the letters and figures “Rs. 46,000” shall be substituted;
(b) in sub-section (), for the letters and figures “Rs. 7,5007
the letters and figures “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER V
AMENDMENTS TO THE LEADERS OF OPPOSITION IN
MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES AcT, 1978.

Mah. 20. In section 3 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Amendment
ﬂ._\ Wﬂ" Legislaturg Salarigs and Allowances Act, 1978 (hereinafter, in this gi ;ﬁ;or{,gl
' 1978. Chapter, referred to as “the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra of 1978
: : Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act”), for the letters and
figures “Rs. 5,000” the letters and figures “Rs.10,000” shall be

substituted.

21. In section 3A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Amendment
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, for the letters and figures gff ;;ﬁ;‘m{,ﬁf‘

“Rs. 200” the letters and figures “Rs. 500” shall be substituted. of 1978

22. In section 4 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Amendment
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, in sub-section (1), for the zé ;i:ﬁo\r,ln;
letters and figures “Rs. 2,500” the letters and figures “Rs. 10,0007 of 1978.

shall be substituted.



E TERTZ FIHR (A0S QM0 90T airs, ey 9%, R020/3MURmuT 3o, T 2R3R

Insertion of 23 After section 4 of the Leuders of Opposition in Maharashtra

i 4A . i . . . .
Seckllm;dah, Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, the following section

VII of ghall be inserted, namely:—

1978.
Sumptuary “4A, There shall be placed at the disposal of each Leader of
allowance 0 ie . kh
to Leaders pposition, a sumptuary allowance of three lakh rupees per
of  agnnum.”.
Opposition.

Amendment  24. Throughout section 7 of the Leaders of Opposition in
of se;t;;; a.h7. Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, for the
vill of words “thirty thousand kilometers”, wherever they occur, the ) q

1978. words “fifty thousand kilometers” shall be substituted.

Amendment 25 In section 9 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra

of section 9 . .
of Mah. Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act,—

Vllg.?‘; (@) in sub-section (3), for the letters and figures “Rs. 8,000”
the letters and figures “Rs. 12,000” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the letters and figures
“Rs. 8,000” the letters and figures “Rs.12,000” shall be substituted.

v 4

4‘[’;

ON BEHALF OF QOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION. PRINTED AND PURLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH
GOBAVL, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY ANI) PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI
400 004. EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

aw 3, IF we(R)] AR, AMRE ¥, R0/ R, Ik R3¢ [g9 w, fwa : 30 Rw.00

SHRUT HATE 3

TR IahTITT
TeRTE, faariee afufam g U wenfue deid Ry F Feret faftaw sufor
fafer @ = faurmega e faged (T orETE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and the
Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the
Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension and the Leaders of Opposition
in Maharashtra Legislature Salries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XXXII
of 2016), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXXII OF 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 24th August 2016).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman
and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker
and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature
Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978.

XLVII of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative
1956. Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
XLVIISI)I52f Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the
XLIXof Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
1956. Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
Mah.Tof Legislature Members’ Pension Act, 1976 and the Leaders of Opposition in

1977. . .
Mah. VIII of Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, for the purposes

1978. g
HIT A8 ]{3-2



R HERT IMEA SIS AETEIRUT WAT 36, AMRE ¥, 0RE/WE R, IHh R3¢

hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly
(Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra
Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension and
the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and
Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2016.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS To THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL (CHAIRMAN AND
Drputy CHAIRMAN) AND MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SPEAKER AND DEPUTY SPEAKER) SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

Substitution 2. For section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and
Ofse(;zf{l,ﬁ gg Deputy Chairman) and the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and
1956. Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “ the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker and Deputy

Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act”), the following section shall be

substituted, namely "—

Salaries of “3. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to

Chai . . . .
and SE::;E:E the Chairman and Speaker, during the term of their office, the salary
equivalent to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances
admissible to the Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and
as revised, from time to time.”.
Amendment 3. In section 5 of the Legislative Council Chairman and Deputy

of Se(;f{;ﬁ gg Chairman and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, sub-

1956. section (2) shall be deleted.

Afmeffc(_imeilg 4. For section 10 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker
° :;;E{;lﬂof and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, the following section shall

1956. be substituted, namely:-

Salaries of “10. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to
c hD,eputy the Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker, during the term of their office,
airman
and Deputy the salary equivalent to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other
Speaker. allowances admissible to the Additional Chief Secretary to the

Government of Maharashtra and as revised, from time to time.”.

Amendment 5. Section 12B of the Maharashtra Legislative Council Chairman and
of section 12B o,y Chairman and Speaker and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances

of XLVII of i
1956. Act, shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1) thereof and,—

(a) in sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, for the letters and figures
“Rs. 15,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 25,000” shall be substituted;

XLVII of
1956.



HERTZ IMHA IO AEERTT HET 713, ARE ¥, R0L/HTE R, Tk R3¢

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(2) There shall be paid to the Chairman, the Speaker, the
Deputy Chairman and the Deputy Speaker a sum of Rs. 10,000 per
month for availing the services of computer operator.”;

(¢) in the marginal note, after the words “personal assistant” the
words “and a computer operator” shall be added.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS To THE MAHARASHTRA MINISTERS’
SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

XLVIII 6. For section 3 of the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
of 1956. Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Ministers’ Salaries and
Allowances Act”), the following section shall be substituted, namely”—

“3. (1) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to
the Minister, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent to the
basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances admissible to the
Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and as revised, from
time to time.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to the
Minister of State, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent to
the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances admissible
to the Additional Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and
as revised, from time to time;.”.

7. In section 8 of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, sub-section
(2) shall be deleted.

8. Section 8A of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act shall be
deleted.

9. Section 10C of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, shall be
re-numbered as sub-section (I) thereof and,-

(a) in sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, for the letters and figures
“Rs. 15,000" the letters and figures “Rs. 25,000” shall be substituted;
(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(2) There shall be paid to every Minister, Minister of State and
Deputy Minister a sum of Rs. 10,000 per month for availing the
services of computer operator.”;
(c) in the marginal note, after the words “personal assistant”
the words “and a computer operator” shall be added.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS To THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE
MEMBERS’ SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

XLIX of 10. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and
1956. Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Legislature
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act”).
T A R3-R

Substitution
of section 3 of
XLVIIIof
1956.
Salaries of
Ministers and
Minister of
State.

Amendment
of section 8 of
XLVIII of
1956.

Deletion of
section 8A of
XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment
of section 10C
of XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment of
section 3 of
XLIX of 1956.



Amendment
of section 4 of
XLIX of 1956.

Amendment
of section 6 of
XLIX of 1956.

Amendment
of section 3 of
Mabh. 1 of
1977.

Substitution
of section 3 of
Mabh. VIII of
1978.

Salary of
Leader of
Opposition.

Deletion of
section 3A of
Mabh. VIII of
1978.

HERTZ IMHA TSUA AEERUT HET 713, ARE ¥, R0L/HTE R, Tk R3¢

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(1) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid
to the Members, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent
to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances
admissible to the Principal Secretary to the Government of
Maharashtra and as revised, from time to time.”;

(b) sub-section (2), shall be deleted;

(c) in the marginal note, the words “and consolidated allowances”
shall be deleted.

11. In section 4 of the Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
Act, for the letters and figures “Rs. 1,000” the letters and figures “Rs. 2,000
shall be substituted.

12. In section 6 of the Legislature Members’ Salaries and Allowances
Act,-
(a) in sub-section (3), for the letters and figures “Rs. 15,000” the
letters and figures “Rs. 25,000” shall be substituted;
(b) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(3A) There shall be paid to every Member a sum of Rs. 10,000
per month for availing the services of computer operator.”;
(c) sub-section (4) shall be deleted.
CHAPTER V
AMENDMENT T0 THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’
Pension AcT, 1976.
13. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Pension Act,
1976, in sub-section (1), for the words “forty thousand rupees” the words “fifty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER VI

AMENDMENTS T'o THE LEADERS OF OPPOSITION IN MAHARASHTRA
LEGISLATURE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES AcT, 1978.

14. For section 3 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978 (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries
and Allowances Act”), the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“3. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to the
each Leader of Opposition, during the term of his office, the salary
equivalent to the basic pay and dearness allowance and other allowances
admissible to the Chief Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and
as revised, from time to time.”.

15. Section 3A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature
Salaries and Allowances Act shall be deleted.

Mah. 1 of
1977.

Mah.
VIII of
1978



HERTZ IMHA IO AEERTT HET 713, ARE ¥, R0L/HTE R, Tk R3¢ “

16. Section 10A of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Amendment
Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, shall be re-numbered as sub- of section 10A

) of Mah. VIII
section (1) thereof and,— of 1978.

(a) in sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, for the letters and figures
“Rs. 15,000” the letters and figures “Rs, 25,000” shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

(2) There shall be paid to each Leader of Opposition a sum of

Rs. 10,000 per month for availing the services of computer operator.”;

(¢) in the marginal note, after the words “personal assistant” the
words “and a computer operator” shall be added.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

HERTE IME a4
STHTEANOT HIET ATS

aw 3, 3 o(w)] HIFER, FHER 28, R029/T1Y 38, T 1R3¢ [ s 3 fFma : w0 Rw.00

STHTANUT HHTH IR

TTTerhe ThTI

TeRTE, faarmiee™ afafam g Teauret Tenfua doe SRy @ Hed fafem snfr
fafer @ =ma favmmega eetet fadas (FUst IFETE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and the
Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the
Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries
and Allowances and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances
(Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XVII of 2017), is hereby published under the authority of
the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XVII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “ Maharashtra
Government Gazette ”, on the 16th January 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and
Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker
and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra
Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature
Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act and the Leaders of
Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries
and Allowances Act, 1978.

XLVII of WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Legislative
)2531611 Council (Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and Maharashtra Legislative
of 1956. Assembly (Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act, the
XLIX of Maharashtra Ministers' Salaries and Allowances Act, the Maharashtra Legislature
1956. Members’ Salaries and Allowances Act and the Leaders of Opposition in
Vl}/;lagf Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978, for the purposes
1978. hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the

Republic of India as follows:-

(®)

HAT 3TS3-R—



Short title
and
commence-
ment.

Amendment
of section 3 of
XLVII of

1956.

Amendment
of section 10
of XLVII of
1956.

Deletion of
section 10A of
XLVII of

1956.

Amendment
of section 11A
of XLVII of
1956.

Amendment
of section 3 of
XLVIII of
1956.

Amendment
of section 5 of
XLVIII of
1956.

HERTE JME I SAWERUT WAT TS, THART RE, 019/U19 R, Tk ]3¢

CHAPTERI
PRELIMINARY

1. (I) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Legislative Council
(Chairman and Deputy Chairman) and the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly
(Speaker and Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra
Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances, the Maharashtra Legislature Members’
Salaries and Allowances and the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra
Legislature Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2016.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the
24th August 2016.

CHAPTERII

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
(CHAIRMAN AND DEPUTY CHAIRMAN) AND MAHARASHTRA
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (SPEAKER AND DEPUTY SPEAKER)

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislative Council (Chairman and
Deputy Chairman) and the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly (Speaker and
Deputy Speaker) Salaries and Allowances Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “ the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker and Deputy
Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act”), for the words “ the basic pay and
dearness allowance and other allowances ” the words “ the basic pay and
dearness allowance ” shall be substituted.

3. In section 10 of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker
and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, for the words “ the basic
pay and dearness allowance and other allowances ” the words “ the basic pay
and dearness allowance ” shall be substituted.

4. Section 10A of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker
and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, shall be deleted.

5. In section 11A of the Chairman and Deputy Chairman and Speaker
and Deputy Speaker Salaries and Allowances Act, sub-section (2) shall be
deleted.

CHAPTERIII

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MINISTERS’ SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES ACT.

6. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances
Act (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Ministers’ Salaries and
Allowances Act ”),-

(I) in sub-section (I), for the words “ the basic pay and dearness
allowance and other allowances ” the words “ the basic pay and dearness
allowance ” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “ the basic pay and dearness
allowance and other allowances ” the words “ the basic pay and dearness
allowance ” shall be substituted.

7. In section 5 of the Ministers’ Salaries and Allowances Act,
sub-section (2) shall be deleted.

XLVII of
1956.

XLVIII
of 1956.



HERTZ JMEA ST FETIRUT HET 316, THARE %, 009/UIW 8, Ik 833¢

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA LEGISLATURE MEMBERS’
SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT.

XLIX of 8. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Legislature Members’ Salaries and
1956. Allowances Act, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(1) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, there shall be paid to the
Members, during the term of his office, the salary equivalent to the
minimum basic pay and dearness allowance admissible to the Principal
Secretary to the Government of Maharashtra and as revised, from time to
time. ”.

CHAPTER V

AMENDMENTS TO THE LEADERS OF OPPOSITION IN MAHARASHTRA
LEGISLATURE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT, 1978.

Mah. 9. In section 3 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature
‘ig;gf Salaries and Allowances Act, 1978 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as
* “the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature Salaries and Allowances
Act?”), for the words “the basic pay and dearness allowance and other
allowances ” the words “ the basic pay and dearness allowance ” shall be
substituted.

10. In section 5 of the Leaders of Opposition in Maharashtra Legislature
Salaries and Allowances Act, sub-section (2) shall be deleted.

Amendment
of section 3 of
XLIX of 1956.

Amendment
of section 3 of
Mah. VIII of
1978.

Amendment
of section 5 of
Mah. VIII of
1978.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVIL



	1978MH8.pdf
	2009MH18.pdf
	2010MH32.pdf



