The Manipur Liquor Prohibition Act, 1991

Act No. 04 of 1991

Keywords:

Amendment appended: 11 of 2021

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research
(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These
contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy,
completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.
Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the relevant
state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette notification. Any person
using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting on any information contained
in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this
document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or
distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




'.M'midh';',’ ' A}:'ir"'l ey
a1 '._'""aovemmsm OF zmmpun
. SECRETARIAT :. LAY & LEG'SLATIVE "AFFAIRS DEPARI"-&EN_;:

\GTIkICAT[GﬂH _
_ Imphal h_e I__s_t _I_anl. __.1.99[ :

Ne. 10 imoba) ‘c:hal

994 [ALt Mo '1_01'
i5:Hereby  published :

""’;i‘}:&jn Exéept for medicingl, - scient ﬁc. indi Istrial or .rucf
raidlec o, " mannfaetiyre, FOTECES nr.r irtport. r"rprrrl.', Immpdﬂ."“
ale - gt congunption of ligior in o State af Maniour,”

Beit enactm' by r)':s Lfgrsfame Ascembly of ff're Srare af Mampur in’ a&r
orr}—:erard Te6r uf I.&e Repu&ﬂc a_r‘ J’ud:a

. “Short ’I‘n‘h’ E).tent und Cnrnmen"-""'
1“ “Mnmpur L;quor Prohihumu P;ct' ]

{3—] It"‘shall conme mtn fc.rr:r— an cuc
' b*.' a nﬂhﬁt‘aunn in the officia 'gﬁze{h,

e Beﬁmhuns e In .thls_m-,t
subjcct or Copfext iew - ’ o

(I}. ""Armed funu"’ !
1950 (No. 46 of _1_-;-
Mavy Acl



o _-othezvnsc. .

(Y “Commissidoir™ merns th:hltm
tion 24 of tais Act.

4 ""‘quuur mcans an :'nﬂu:almg uop nfi:'l.

"B of or containipe - Dhoi and  any su""
Governme.,r. Bay, by serdca foa, dacl 8
of this Act

{5 “\I:mul’a Iurc’ inclages every pracess,’ whctharn
. Whieh: oy htflﬁu}' 15 prodizid or Preparsd, alse, r
proess. far " the rectifiensing, flavaucing, bI*ndmg

S f Patg a!‘]lu‘_r- i'm-:-‘ B1%4ns prrsons under As
AW 5 A *?'J!) Border Securify Forces At i
o mi.-mben ol any “thar (yrce- nider the Dperat

=

‘_Frescr bed mMeans Crascribed ky rules undtr thu Ar.‘t'

K Prnhlbltlun officer” ine, i nd oy Person
:.'-'umjf,r Secticn 25 o, this e, - : - : .

3 ‘PUH“C p;ac,l v

a4 macs g dcﬁlmd .as
Gambling” A, PRET wdgr g of 18

EI{I] Uhetisterad medipal meas

Hitiuner™ mr:ans (chrsmr . ﬂ}&tzl;'bd_ l-mdf
- indian: Megica) L- WL Act 1956 (o, 102 of 1936))

:[113 TSR wiHE 2l G greningicy) variatiags,
t.l B otramsier by o ogfr o loan or otherwise,

(1'2}- “'*"T:L[f: Armed Poiice’™ gl trodyde menihers of P-Iammrr ‘B Tesand
Arpiee (,‘unstabui"' :‘. n:. ot‘n Sl::ue ar of - lhE (‘.‘cn:rc stalicasd
in: 'rimil:ll.lr.

. ST e
p.u'blic- _place.in_' the

[u
r
I

T "'i'i'-p

). Wrards and C-\'!’JTE:)IUBS used but pot dehned i thls.
“the sams e ning 3y nreae Tespestively assizaed - 1o ;-
I and Assam E'c-:-:se ﬁu:t. IEHU {Nﬂ

: khé Bastery -
tof. 19?&1 B ‘.x{m ed g -




ar.ll acture
B ppﬂtluct by “a

s l:"mre al’ H‘
‘na iz fyp :aw ﬂil’sltf

Shalt 1 be ¢ msl*ur:l 10 mazp tha
tiseptic Preparation sehat
500, Persa gaail drmk a;;;_.- S

tintiﬂ'l w;
_.sh...h spitit mnyibs
_'qaux

urcd s pirit.. iy res
b atmn 0T, .sr.ucmpi to ai-

: wmn!uuua Preparation ly
: ¢ltign that such Fx

uumm_-n -15 a_ el b

i - wreseriptiong. . o sLigwar  excen ln
frilancrv 141y EES] MhCE I Re2itere 4
n-u*t- my |m~m:[| . I i I T LT T e o,

I':-I'i.i‘-nq'-r

(21 "\-‘o Rc ‘rter-d Nri“dlc P
he belisves in go
wl.ome use sugn”
Perypmr is peey

ractitiomer sy prescrine
o filth aftee- eareful  medica]

such lig
pms:;.-munn W micts, oy

:__cmmm'mm of the 't




4

- Tt t - ':?
. B) A registeted medica) Fractitioner shall state, in esery prgscrjpljm'é(
Jiguweissued by him, the fdam dnd-atfdress of the person to whom issucd, the

‘6 issue, digections, for vee, a'n'd:'::the smount and freguency of the dose, and &
sLye, d. copy of the preserip lon-ferene vear froto ihe date ¢f issve. On i
o-preseried he shall stale thevaitthent o which the liquor is prescribed.

Iy

- of, doiny any et . caiculated fo fncife or,

[fé;_r_ce—No pr:wp_’_\ shall--

7oA} soheit the use of, or offer, any - fiquor -or,

b} do ey act which is m!chlﬁlﬁ& '"ifn-:;i__l'c.;nr encoyurage any class of
e tublic generally tx com any offence under this Aet or ¢

16k aue rales, requlation of, order made. or the conditions of .an

Tisaygon granted thereundep. i o, -

I Tor (Lé. porpese-of producing & state ¢

of medicing} Ptepazation. containing - alcoh,
haly
épatalicn comaining alcohol in ape ~vantj

lanatioh—The expression *
tion, tmears the quintity pres

dose’, in re'ation to any medming
ed Dy a Repistered Medical Practitiqn
sugh prescription has been obtaing
theditections given hy the mang

TRt

10-Be' taken.at a time and In a case whcks o
the quaatity indicatzd to be taken al ati

facturer of the:medicinal preparation.

... Prohihition. of possession of dénatured’ - spirifenies Sreparalioh in exees
ddfmit-~¢ 1)} N person, shaii have i his posseisian; 2acepl, uader a ar
an cficer. empawered by the State Governmient in that behoi
: Bitliuus preparation in exeess of such quantity oy the
cxtion-in. ihie:official Gazers, SpeEily.

scsspon- of den':-.lu.red spiril-uuus-prér}arat
Ad ko the necessite for the free PR5srssion

ticand other purpose and different limits f

wnder sub-Sectivi
such preparation fisr leg
be fixed for '
'{fi-] differant local areas, s

i AB) difereny classes of prsons;: “4nd:.
.fey..different  gecasions. Coe

egilation of madufactire, ete. (0 - dératored’ Spiritvous preparation-
cridre, sell or bottle for sale agy ﬁéﬂﬁ-wﬁe’#' SPiTitor its preparg
erceptiunder the authsrite and ip accosdance with the terms agd .,%
. ligas of 4 permir. .

{b) Timport, cxport or transport any denatured: spirit or it5 prepas

T in excess of the limit of Potsession specified under sub-section
Secticn 11 exvept under th: authority and in geeorcance wilk tke 1-::'11%
conditivns of 4 permig, | o s

ey drink noy 'ﬂé}p_;.mreﬂ_ﬁ" Apitit or. ifs -preparation.



¥ Petsen ap
- SCthetisgd o

410 grant t
Aithe  conditens of t

T ACE

() ¢ Fovereign “of Ht'adof ",_a:.'..f-orei:.r
by, ;-n:-..-'mi-bass'a:d_:ﬁr,c Biplcn g
A tiades Reres ; o

2lives of a lorcipi

BUSC ().bN(c) eriamg r
: i

i€ Purchese, e ] MEGSRY of 5y
memlicrs of Ay Medd, Fercen, it
i Theirmigsg

A0 canteens.

2 SE comsur, tR fiquer in the Statfe, by pa
fosces ypd State Armi

1i lapy

LOF Congery Ligs
b-PEEMIt ypdeg n} 'ﬂi'-lﬁ'c.p_ A
€ plece ¢r iy Hution 10

Brautﬂd;:ﬁﬂﬂe; this Act shyll atlow iy aie ar
part of the liguor held by him ¢o any othey Persog: .-
iSed o uee OF Tofsume qu_uur' under thjs .dg_.;;___ g

-




it
. A% Permit for Bonafide Medical and Other Purpose:—The Stats Goverameds
- Joay, by rtules, or by adgrderin wWriting, authorise an officér 1o grant permit to
Ay person, or iostitution, Tor the purchase, possession, or use efany liquor oz
denatured -spicit for (be madufacture of any articles mentioned in soction 4 on

" sugh conditions ay may beprescribed;
rovided: thaty no-permiithiall be neezssary. Jfoe the possession of denztured
“fess than the qoanlity” ds may be prescribed:

ver 1o- gance '%Imn__d-_-p&r'rﬁfi_,ts_qtc_1=':-r;- -}.-*S.-iibjpgt to such conditiong
Gloysrnment: scribe, tHio  wuthorify . gednting any  permit under

is kbt may cancel o wme on any of the fafloving groznds: -

{a} W.I:lc.fu-n‘ny dul ] .,\ bl b}’ thu Loldar fhéreof hais mpot besn
pati; - ' i e a

(b} Where. thif¥e B

" hélder tersct ge

_w@t_‘a‘:_hi-'s expr

he terms and dondilions by ‘the
by atty ouc acling on hix behall
siony . - !

S Rohs
%r “the time

20y offdnce: punishable uade
-being [a force reiating tc

;.__:I::::f-:\ils';g-uﬂl‘.y of any cognizablo or }non-bailabl

gof i ]t)gn.f -\&naﬁ__ offosicn puni:hnb!e under th
410, ' tha:Narial U8y and Pyycliotropic Subs
M:&m_u:i__n.} a._u'd;;-._‘gm ot :preparations {Excise Daties

At isssy T
{f} Where tho hoider thereol js.. giilty- of “anyroffeace punishable nade
Sections 112 and 114 of the Customs Aet, 1962;

s puilty of “any. offorca punishable uad
dian Penal Code; .
m;___.'r.jj'q_-';-mtf-_;’#ida:d {foc such  cancellntic

() Whiers -the-ligldor therenf:§
: ‘Seetio 483 of the:

-
4)- - Hoperson: to-whoff 4 -permit- vy ban grhiitsd undor this Act shall ha-
. ¥ claity for compepsation’ for the canccllation .of susponsion of hir perx
- mider this: Act'or to the cefind of any feo paid or deposited rclating thereto;

'(3) “Any bolder af a . permit for denatursd apirit or liquor granted a1
covered under his Act meysurronder -this.pormit on sxpication of one montk
: iven. by him to the:Gommissioner of his intention to surreador {he sag
nt of the fee payable. for the permit for tho whols period [
B uch- sutrender;

- ﬁt%en':.grnnted under this Act =h

thor ‘a.tmn has beom _dbtaim:d. theouy

. tg geaswal of. sug

¥ | hipermit,
e 2%, Rights Tile £ Tilecest. inder Peroiit not linble to be sold or atiact
-im. Execution:—Not withstaiiding anvibing coatained i any law for the tima bej

in foreo o right, title “ar intepest. imany permit,’ pass- or authorisation grao!
under this Acrshall e liable'ts bs sold, traasferied or attached in excculion

- amy. process .of -any civib oz any'othef churt. \




i ispose: s fpokyi.
PErmit, pagy gy ;

-arits Pieparg.

OF o -eliicials and
~'The State _gumlt-_
Uie apy g h-Caunejr. "

'ze:'te;"éb#.ié%
fit, Propipl,
Governmeny

2Y ¥irtile of -
e

& afbicer ko -
‘A5 may he .p':cﬂ_:ribed.

My require ihe -



8

(4) The duties to be, perforeed by the Siats
hibition Comgsittee and the :cftl_t:fgu-,bc_fwt.cn_ ths

Bhail- be aﬂ'--kﬁ_'ég' be prescribed,”

Prohibition. Cauncil, 4ad Pro.
Council; and” the Committes

e 2T € { Commissioge feors and other o ficers:— |
i 0 exercise g powers and:in. diseh duties and functions under |
» < the provisiens 7@ s Act or. orders miade: . et gl Probibition Officers |
and-al offics leding (he officers of . the- Pt er departments Shaﬁh ]
. subject: g : ‘or special orders of the [Spsh avermunent be subordi-
; : =hal. be bound te
mme 0" time. make,
iate Government oy delegate anyof the powers I

o-4he. Comissioner or such -ather officer a¢
, |

ion..of tha. Stars Government the i
+80¥: other oficer - appdinted orl .
e - 'de{“E'gmtedg_:= by-Him- to " any oli

. i.

. _ vof olficers of
- officer ef ‘the Givernroent g
oShall e legally toved toasese _any
T ALY c ths  kehalf s carryifie 6

Cat] ‘-'I'ur.huritif_s_.tn_-asaiét:—E\-:r)'!

Vit of ‘a Toeal authority, }
1er police gfficer or person |
otis of this Act, 5

2 cecupiers i

therowner
race, vesset Wit
Iy stall be teurd fa
¢fFcer er rolice cifcer mmm

aving the wse of any!
¢d [or manpfacture":'_'
fice of the fzct to a
tiately oo discovery,
3. Tavestmeet of pewers Cof o Bcers-in-charge of police statloa:—(1) Thei
State Goiernirert moy igvest any: Clicer cEilie Excise. Deoartment mot balow!.

ke rank of IrsTector with e Poweds 6 4 ficersfi:Charge of a - Police!

Sraticn ot tle: 'mestigation. ‘of :ofor.ces This shall however noty’
© Ee . comstited 38 - Hmitioe. 3 tsongel to carry | out such?

(Ker. persons to give infur-!
3 }. H

Cprebititica

y ";'t-he official gazette, spés
ties 13id down in this Agl,

. ! N i
ectior d:—(1) Neo mes
5 [ all sell; -uge or dispoge ofi
pUtehassd: : of suck-mamifacture under the.,
Provisicms of this Act-otherwise thap a5 an ingredient o the- articled authorised to be.
magufaciured therelrom, No riore: alegtiol . shall b ed -in the imanufacture:]
«-0f any of.the articles mentivned N4 thon thequantity necessary for)
.extracijon .ot: solition of the gontaioed therein-aad- for the preserygé
 tion. of fhe rtities; P
i that this shallnot. appiw-in.case of matuficlure ©f any indasteiyd
glephol frem industiial by-product mentioned in clause (e} of section 4

r

g—,ly-,.scll"_-a.ﬁ;,;-. '..irt.iclt.?.;:fnfﬁﬁtiﬁﬁ'ea.",j'ﬁ_ sgsfian- 4. for bring use

A3 A0 intoXicaling dtinki-or.

- (bJ." sell -any  such a,‘r..ticj@}_ﬁ,!;;l;g{;e:.._her ~hasg '-re'a's&n':.lq befieve thet ';-._
- ¢ . purchaser :may [ikely. . use them. @s intoxicant. © .




the satisf ctign of
drfich - COLrEspond;
1 g O E

anarticle meniisg
] _ﬂ_‘:léfc_lll.l_
With. |

0T which
© Conceaied:

PSS O enlry a5 Iyspection.
tmkﬁfﬁmﬁmf"-"’l'h“-‘-”-":'c“’ :

TR of i Tjﬂ's"g&c:,lbf--.Qf'P'JI""‘.“"H-mi"%-
NEWHY Fasreaien fo-Befiey

Teise Dopn rtn':li;l-nlf"". ,
iCe. Officer oy

Geh.. building, ¥ostel or .
PR Spe any go Jrand

e




PRaratug and;;"
hich may furnigh!

.

—

i has reasoq Lo béliave {6,
¢t relating ¢4 such liqugr,

W orrant
enlrrent of:
¢ Iccctding the
ssel or entiosed pfncgi;g

ity for ¢he cone
Ller, he yia . After
: bui!dings‘, Ve

42) White. aay ,'_-ufﬁcc'r-"

: 2T : Anan wndey _rilz-h_.-ﬁcc::nn,n'l , O
Fecards EIoUnas fofhic . hedi theTeto - he shaf
LB COPY L fipraer t RIS ey .

officer

1Torthwirh send
Paster o siny
Lhp Berartang

fa}). '-s'f:Fi"c.', in any pyx
oimplemeny Cr ap

) S places; Any
33

ofiicer o
1) -1'11:1;:—-

Ay liquor, Malerial, vtonsiy
T oap ich ba: hge FEASONS (0. helipred
Ot etfengy g Brthe ryleq e thars
LIS Bran Coriingi i

under_!
; OF Bt Aty
vizh. may. I

the Offence, and

any CCLEmIT
¥ .Commissign of

o (h} detein, Seara.
Com H[gd a

e has e
o A .
37.. Ao

nst‘a.‘gi To bcfic'.-e:'m

£ afore
thirgy da 8 ol

an coimmodj
Fare the Court g claing .
fder: of “onfiseation and r




é_!a;i_m i 'ma_,dg: _J.-:.il,:l__l.ﬂ the: .8
.='sj‘,_-.<a}i=_'be_.;ca_nce'[!'é-':_i' and. ghy

-

‘AL Offence 1 be re
And evere officer g gopi

~Headmao/Khuliziepa

L this:. behalf

of any
s ndpr’

Power to prevep (e
‘may know or tave

izance ol qp nﬂ'cm:u
by the Commissionesr

this_Act.or of
. —iEd
~.A2thorisatian 2

any ‘rul 4
rareled tisr

ast, “permii. or

An¥ Hquor:

istilery - or bregg ¥i

tersits. in laieaty™
m‘T—ﬁAqTIW’—_L“M
S0 b pay nisheg

with impeiionme

Mar eviend to thia ar x\'ilh-b_ot'li-i;-ﬁ

Piovided thy in e sbseace of

FaFY - to be'mentioned in the jud

nl'l"_'c_:._r.'r:te.j.}i-:sucl'l gLk
fine  ghal) not

: risonimEn
80t b Jess

yent aflence, -suejy: imntisenment sk
Al nat hes foss i

k]

not be.fes
L0 thousand rupees;

“denalured SPiKil (1) Whegys
¥ o alier any -depatured SDirif
208 of  ahioh. hi- Knows of T
Pt his. besp mada shall 4

i 5
may c:{ngﬁ"_' tor




12

Provided tpay 10 the absenca of Special apd adequity reason: o the
AOMTArY £y be men*wnedm the Judgcmcntnl‘ the Court, sitsl fin
shall ngt h. iess  thap tﬁreg
hundrcd CUppeEg, '

BIriop ment shalf =
IS and (jne shall ‘ngr 63e

'.!.;hall be presumcd Until |he!

llbﬁl]’)l s alier any dcunfurcd Spirip
it

BH "'défm tured 5 prmru NS pre.

Erl.'emnta fo:
On any sych;

ﬂsr.‘rn t.a behm Ihatan‘h
Herar . i ICET. i T, be PUsisheq;
ﬂmﬁ”'s@-n;mcnt far Ate . whﬁch Y ety one _w:j@ a:nd
WA extind 49 gra lhousand rur*cex* T 1 s

with fina:
"":*:?"'f‘i't‘d"'ff‘-'lf in (ke 'tbr.uTc-. af
v B Mataied g the fizdgan

253 than I."Jrcl’ Munths pd ﬁ

!

% mrpr:sonmem '
five Bundrey:

]n prnfccutmns un:Ir_r this. Sf: tl.m it sha!]
£y £ pm‘-c.! that the

be prcsumcd, Uil theh

aiten:mn or Sttampt ¢ alter sy denam:ﬁd SPricitous:
d 0C Wil tha ,mrent' - ﬁmt -i  may use” fur human :
Gor, . i

A i
_regardmg prescnprfnns —Whncvcr

pmch:loncr i35Ue; 3. prepnpt:on for

Fra ntmn of Ihc Provisions of sectinn g o

to state i the" pmscrr lien fof
Sacncn . toy be. star L therein,. of

+OF 2 copy . theteqar for
that . sectrcn to--. bc preserved

{crm whzc
0. one.. thqusand repe:

'lmpnsorlmcm for
b 2y extend

c for m-mul‘acmrmg urm;—lc menhuued i
uns of seciiop 32'-—'-{]} Wh i

'tqulrmenflm
prawsmns ﬁ

""@ures _ importg or

eXper(s &ny amc

!

- of an;




vehicle. g Plage, knpw,

Used 95 fituor o %73 2ny

% them for . such.
R rlr.:a- ’a‘}:ch mn;.- '

ueki Fyticle 1y
hinent a5 jg

section IL— (DY I the
+- Tiils 0 show to the

ﬁi’:scffp{ious and
USE- or Possestion

25 of sectjog 33 <k,
A Which .-"?abf-m’t:hd':t?; e 1y
for pﬂ*seﬂinq ".'5‘.':"*.. denaty

Hsion" of wéy, AT

in con-
Intontravegtion of
e =irt cr

2 .

oro) feps wh
trqﬂ-'tq_twg AEgug
o and’ 2dequa lereasiy
£ Cy Ert, such impriso e

L5S than gne i

Ity extond
Ad. 11 recs:

ptisenimont fop. et whicly
n‘e"'.--Whic_h“may-__ AU 1o g

S.rAsens, fo.fhe-o
JPrisoirmey Ea

HHrgry,

halt o

A4 ang ¢ Busang Fupepg.

o dtinking hejice- Wheever, Leing the

hayin : '  FO0IY enelsppeg, SPACe, vegsg), -
e cog Mmissien, by gy

- 50, . Pena_lry-_i'orjgpcuing.
OWer or occiupier or

te be used fep

RH. it miphe TeRgdnably
o e



14

‘other person, of anBlfence punishable ugder this Act or the rules made thereunder, -
shail be pugished with impri\snmntnt for 4. 1erm _'ﬁn"hich_'m.m)i',gx@]:lgiusz_;i-x’l‘ﬂ'ontlis buat
not less tham one month or fine which, may:txisng to <hundrédTupess but not
less than.fifty rupess or. with boty. = T 7 T S :

51. Faitakey far prinling or ‘publishing advertisenrent in Yeution of provisions

_ L= Whoever, in cvalraventigu: of Lhe. provisigns B iis Act, or of nny

vule, reglldtiogur orisr ade teretnder, prints, or i biis Oy Gewspaper,
. mewW-shel; boak, Jeafler. boaklel, or aky single or periodical putilication or other-

| . wise. dis Sisizibutes any - adv Sthsements or other mattep it

e of- Mees: any liquor, or v i

ae 1cite any individual - orclass of

ommil an_ effence - under’ thiy Act, -

¢. provisions of, “iny rule,

the conditions of a permit,

rtie Public geverilly 4
Himit & Breach of, 0r Yo,
tien - o1 ‘ordér ‘mad¢ therennder
: r-a'u-.lhorii_sa_,tion - granted thersunder;

ncem:clmn be: punished: with imprisonment for a.lerm which-may exteqd

. months or fne which may extend o five hundred rupees or with both,

52 Peaalty for: inciting or encouraping. certain offence etc.:—~Whaever, in

. contraventiosn of the pra 3:.0f-this  Act.or anyrgle, roguiation or order made

* thiscgitnde
A

urageany individaal
0 combnit an offonce
v Tegulation or order
- adthotisation praated

" {6 copmii
tugder or conditions o
] ' T

- shal i rf_:i-‘."-.l-rc'.:p'tinisﬁc_i with im.ﬁrii‘dmhbn—&fpr. 3 torm’ which' a:.' extend
e sixcavonths or fine whicly any e¢xtind tu-ﬂﬂu--thbu&a‘nd'rupté!-'-nji" With both.

I eaalty for “contzaventsy

o provisions of se¢tiz
ke

of Provisions of section ¥8: —Whoever. in con-

L i B

o igstifution to which the public may

E_ use  or Consyfmp

: af - 2y Guantity offiquor possessed by
ny otfer persan e o oos B

Pk

such: offeace with imprisoemest which

~mayextend to-1wo thiusand rapees,or

: eI meksures ete,: - Whoever, In cantravention of
Fiel wule or regalatizo-or order or condition of any permit

yocs g ply himself With mgasurls. and weiblits for measuring |
\ e g sy Yiguiop ar” with Tastrumeats. for testing the strongih
l=. L-a‘]*—-ﬂ" h's L keep the :’am:r'—-'.-'i_ﬁ"‘gdr’od---mn ditina, or -

'_J_



(a) I"mis w prodn!*
- Ptohitition: ﬂﬂic

5 0F RLI!HUI"IS foon demand by u
“wificer “dily cmpm-.::mri il wgh ;JCEU-llt;i
Possession or cmmol or " | "

e jn -con_:travuu.tmn_ c-f any rulg,

1 - 11 eTED = H
pertistion, ¢ Qu His henalf. under.
nmitted  the - sage, uhless he sh
ans. wcrc cxerc:se:l b}'

ail °
l:nm ‘Lo ]:lrcvc‘u.tj

'zm, lhe actual’ affcndcr
pnymcnt of fuu:.'.

o 3

“the i:omrmssu
for such attein)
1\1§nnmpnl offencs:

or lmpimd
2rimit, pass

ko .ﬁ'.e. htm
;-,ﬂud reasunab#& TR

fy

: }' pmon who Cam
w:thout the! peomission Dl'thc he
m.éthc sacrre punul:mnnt. S

an;,* bi‘cach sluII v-heih
Ser-of the p::rmit, Iass o

: ' ﬁm Act or
_ of a ion’ ol' a permif, pass ar auihorrsutmn
euch c:-fs.u:ch pcrsous, : T -



16

" all, ofi convietion, Be puniihed with imprirosment for a revicd which may e,
fo Iwo years orfine which mray eatecd to one thousand tupees cr with both, -

" w80, Terfaliy for teing drvrk ard for- disardetly Jehaviour :—{1) Whoever o
LAy street or thorovghfare o1 pulblic piace L1 inary. place to. which the public hay
L BT AEE. Fermitted potpre Recess is dourd a4 dronptle o takirp carg of himsel
o Behave in discrderle manrer urder the mflverce of denk, shall or convictiar

-i=,i*h'.-.:'smp.1'isnr. mt:ntf‘fﬁggf._"i;' term which ma
omayextend to two Burdred rupees ¢

for™tfig 6

-:4a)

' L Fensi-ns te the contrary to
1 ment skadl mol be Jess tha
han tiventy ive |

eF less 't
BN e ‘Sét

sefnfor an effence  vrder sit- 3 it shall be Presume
aryis proved that (Re perse nageesed ‘el the sdid cffence has drun,

e purpere U Teirg irtexicated angd nel fermediemal - purpese.

;o Gl Penaler for chemist, . drugeist’ of apothecary for allonitig his premiscs t
lie used for purpnse of censumgption of liguer :—A cliemisi, druggist, apoihecary o
keoper of 3 dispensars who allows any . liguor, which has- et been  bonafide
meticated: T ¢ m Frioise, o e farthe presceipion ol aveatitered mediea:
] i ; - o e an his business premives by
Fmentfor a tenm which mazy
oaSand rutees, or Witk both,

<3 2 registered medieal practitiones
uely preseriplion shall bo used b the
Ipeecel consiming ligior, in contravenlion
; AT A, er rule; repilatien er erder mrace thereunder or
LAy Tes or awtlorisaticn granted vuder tFis Act, he shzll an convietion,
¢ punishid -« i feypriscnmeint. far a . {orm. which miy extend 1o sis months ar
HRe Which  may estend’ta one thoussnd repees Cpwith Bethe . '

Peoainf or mal icicusts giving false fnderma oni—Any perscn whe makicious/y
ety gives information to Y Persen exciéising rowers under this Act leadins
dreh, seiznre, detention o agresl, ghatl, ofi- eanviction, e . ponisked with

LLoer o rermik kel nie Neird 1o six menths or fie. which may extend
gand rupees : T e - ’

K1

contrave

i tienalty for: offences i ¢ provided Tor:—-\Wheever is 2uilty of apy
"Ll act or intentignal, o i tion of the provisions of thie
Act, any rule, reguldtiof; oo ¢ thereyider or rf apv Permif;, pasi or
“authorisation granted’ yndérk i Aefy and i sich Aet wr omission is got atherwise
made an ¢ fégcs under: ¥ ctishall -an ed Wviction, b puniched. with the iTpri-
sgnrent fera’ | s which-may: extend to SIX.NM0tLs or fine whicl: may catend o
five hundred rigees or with both,. T S e

s

- 7 285 Punbslinien For Vexatious search, seizire or arrest :—Agp ¥ Olicer or perscn
EXCICHING powers voder this Act, whg—

AR) malicivusly eniers of searchies of causcs to. be .entered or searched, any-

... ‘buildiagor-house or siinilar dweiling plaec, or -



7

any perion, of
fol ‘powers, shall - .
oo wihich may
dastnd rupess

P

righable under

v ipbaent of apperatus, o Fespect of
BRSOt 1ed, . : :

5

eXPaTt or transport,
i liquur
A, ryle

EREta
Arhuiisil

< hmvhes a

iEncer fas' in his
respect of “which an
. otker fiouor, :

] 5 Sﬁid_ll- Hi{yAY |
as been gomiitied; the.wiy

the order of.the Counrs -

e package.or Coveling. in wiivh m [
; U)is fougd and the ofges
£ _ i and the apimals
ed-.in currying dny §uc

[ be Courr”

jislile o’ confis

i Cllencsundert
foin under the feregiiy
i claining anv rigl
t-of his. ¢l

LIt may, aftér Rearing -
.q.‘f:'cfi::'i‘,tc if any, which
: it the case of apy
ccfine ds the court

cHiies ance shafl ba
EXereived d:qg

& U,

ey ey “hitg been
I of cifipg W when anyihing
s (s ACt s, Toiund o e1ddd, CRmmissioner,

g DiticY Mak trteof auy oiber ‘oflider autiorized by the State Goverament
- this ﬁ&ﬁ‘!‘l-f_.mﬂ:;,-:maii.c"--aﬁr" ineairy andif altdr such Mguisy -

E _ afie g - satisfied thge
" Af ,ﬁﬂ'ﬁh‘cq_ hus  teen s€anmmitled, ‘may. order the thing folud 19 2l eenfiscateds h
"P.‘Q:‘n'idfd'lhiifﬂt_} sitch orider shall be - made before the expity of one nrpth

* frem the date aof seirpre, or without hearing 11e persan if any,” Wha cldin any
. xight therotg and the evidecse, if any, which - he prodyges in suppoct of his cluim



‘18

.18 fuun.:mmuarctc tEs wéer sale op drﬂ{u:_;mn af. mwmm}mm
,rlf the thing in uusstion is fiable lo speedy Tand Thitarl deeav; or -
infsEn, (,”J"[ of e offizer authorized by the Staie Guierpment jn
i5, .0, ki shethe sk v ould te for Hio bevedt of the av.per,
=I't nr lhe edieer nay, alany fiire, direct u. to he sold and
o 23 ar 11I .w"iv m E1r a5 may bc to thie net proceeds Dr.

o bl to. cmcfh card waweral decav, ér is of
B Ay ~1Jt'r such thipo to bet

in tlt circumztiences

‘l:.-.,.\!'-_.‘-,}_-_:;.r ay g LU T [ R ’mlm-' \1.-‘30 af .
]L‘H'H "-'l'k]l.l of uliwp
-'r-lr~ RIRI COeernmeit

e Sate

w t|‘1 s -,-r:;'
'_\ 'H'-’*..“.‘f Fint ol - gy '-shnd: ;
N T I '\“l“" N2 R
L IR [s nC Al LSS (R BT

Lhere gy apy

Comy pf

—..r\C"lL,l"lh S SR TRI H e Te 1 " L " }'

' fedd, f rt\..t_c.. aTEFTR I T “nory be

(1 8 v i S T R srenay WET M saizp
A ne 1

=AY A Laiare & may, IR L herize
G Sl 1 I T S P nnd senren e
any Cenpe off.

. -iic. :
e s .'I‘Tl[‘ in

LEUUTL jssue o Y stch news-
opaiy e - \.-.Utt et ather prishenr o Ay he or sy e
R R "l..,l'!'h ] o Ep Ev roboy ST INE RN Urtde e tkj iy seetion slingl he ch o cited
i !|- 'mnwr "—uni . r:.-r tie

-uuun nr L H T

F W 1rr1-m nder the .0s of
it i’ :

i gf (e bcm,e Dn'rnm'nt wider Ueds “Bection sk he ¢
het. Ty LlLWleC;.(‘J n .m\ Court.

LA TR NN,
Aipther e r’:
Ty -1:|It:nc{_~
T nrr=l1 il

] cncm in u--!mn TS (1) I rroge-

ity jp shall he presumed withoyt -
wroed rersan bas vommiled -
Al vy |I=I. Wt i slement ;
§ AR aterfals el |
llflillf(‘l' H4s been Mg g

¢ fs ﬂmhic h .r-::-vmt sitmfucwniv.

B i anv il
- z.p CRTURCR O A
UEFd porson wag pri:ﬁv-ur by -:{‘gt
T owus the wnes or Cocyis

sfacrare of' Htour and sing
Prsvisiong of this Act, it i proved
e lith s stll while it was working

SEET afe, wharein such sl wag
u‘::-i s thy bonden. of PTOvEny PREL 1 had ant used, pr padt

il L MF
AL abetr d - s e Ures! - for. g 1—:4).1:1;.;; uquurishgm te on Ih2 peeygad.
rersen anud the Conrt shall, m e ﬂbScncc of fuch’ prmrprcsumc te the contrary,
N

t.
_72._ Compaunding of m']-.'m:t" . (-,i} Mi nﬁ‘::nc:: Wit -‘1-': et Iy he ¢,
ol 20
o €Il af 4 sem .nt ctwcu:m-*mpuc&lcn thousand Dty
r-rn}uhthuu uﬂ'ccr v ith stich canditions and

4T ded
on the orders of (e
r::.trn.unrs a8 may be. prescribed,

H“} wa Olfn:n.,nlmll I‘e'c:.nmoundt‘i #H by resson c:nf previ
n.ahk e:t'-er Iij 11: aad punm*m,m ot Lo p
nlfenee, &

|1u9 COD?IEIIOH
u-ushmmt ul‘.{rHchnt kKind for such



Gm LrRRYene

'.{." '

L PESSERSH , ma

(n]

Sﬁi‘hﬂmn ofiiy v
: =iy sy

5
-I-.

r mhcr than {lic-'_
mm.‘r ar 1Iﬂ_‘, Ilmc'

{ﬁ‘l. ."{” _i,,lj';l_

“ahal [ 'vr\pc.athL m the ‘Smtc :
T diteg of the

‘ rdcr wmpl.u:md’:__-._

" S b the Cvmmis_»imm'r

Gun “Thmeqt -

DT gy
PRTHI ur e Ao o b
i- ET‘L oy -.uu i g g !rl ar gy

ke -.-i_' the .,..lui
:\L..\L‘ 'H i.url

b H W] I."I—Ll!.r

T Coanarg

-_. pi..l flh &
¢ g ity
vl hu:'t m-wd-

ll-};tl
mcrnnu.u[ m At

Fllg ) I’&'ul' r
._pralubumn uthu:r

ey bv *m. l’_:-.nrmulrﬂ wr, ar h} :my

1m;‘-ﬂn salg, rurchase,.
ouwmpuen, or 9F e natsred Spirit
repardtiog : : '
: o the. m.umr |-.,wre nl" r.m epn"r'i-'r.‘-. n;
the r:r:lr-!

IV I efitian op

patite, pﬂ&‘ﬁ or
HIpoer, r.-xpc»rl: haeg] . :-u!e. prurclinse
I;ul’acturc ban!mg wmuuplmn u;-"<f~ 'rn_',l- cnl the aboye
ielesi o e

s for dhie

4] unﬂ

»ﬁtiu pcrmds nnds L
g

¥
Birtes e iy n:tqr!_\gndsul
Fre-\crmuv‘lhc ~
 PETmL s op
[ Bibition of .
deemed [ l*-:

k,m:n te sranted
nes mengwncd

; ! o i h any
€ prantrid rlumu.,: i) e

pt rt!l WY Dhgeer or MY sul danee
ur uh;u-:tu nabtr: :_

Lo re’
I"il"\l:}U'S




20

1Y) the Pf-?hlhman of mc ol dc_*mﬁlred -_Ehiii_é" ,den'atuml-.sF:ifituuus'
e Rreparation.. except for. Fured

uridurmg which any prcmlsm .

(L)lhﬂ rrescriptionof the davs A
s Baprovisicns for the elusuro .

Cmay or may net be kept ORI
of such- prenns=s : :

(&) the p Prescription of the accounts o e m.unmlrn.d and the rn:'tui_'ns
-~  tobe suu'rmwda; 2y permit holders ; - . .

('e)"":.‘-m regw I:tlon of pnlu,,:tu;n_ of ‘the transfer of permit."

(i) (-1}

- deatercd through, he awendy

: amest Gificers aml Tae ©,
"k‘f”iﬁ'!.ﬂ'-%--: k-
h sp*II!‘ h'ne Eeen dnr-suur:d
ihe: -:'nrlu-.nrnt by the' permir holder of -
in THs- inSllli."i: Wany capdeity whuss, ever ¢

ftip ..;raons or - classes ¢ f peesans 1 whom any Jiguor or
G S0y PRVPAERton, moy of n ks <, |4 or v Ramy not
gd b Gt archase r Use ary of hose articles : '

Préseniring (s .:mmm
a0Y° PITR, s on
-DRLHE ns for e ;

sitzd - by (e huidcr of
ke rerf\.rmamc ol thn

11c b l».*cﬂ; o rtrm:h “assus gr
_ les. porchase, pms::-:smn. COHWSUmMp.
P 40 - bc e n:n:d in_tne register ; '

- previtiag far L m
"1"Ihn'1nnm el fhe
UIB Or uyse and the

¥ - n_gl!l‘.it_l_' g l-_"i'fﬁ.;"
Cgiviny 'I'I;I'OI-T“QI
IT.nu.cs A

rewEnd o ctrcn-m ta iBeers, or peranrs
e in- the Jt,!v'u M9t anvestization of
d chgompedtiind o persyins chaig=g
Her this Act ond 'wq.u ted ¢

--cgmmnt.us, %4 B.ards asxd the

mzmr.s and: dutigs ¢f Prohibition officers,
i I'c"s and ailowpnea Payabie to tha
pmmzﬂces 1

espest ef-aay orivil. EL. Permit pass, or
pssue.l uru:h:r ttus Acl.

3. E'»cfj' rnh. n*udc un’h:r thiy. shnﬂ h-« ild' as sT0f az may be, after
v detis made, before the Nl.pipy: ¥e Assembli while isin session for a
. hotal period of sTvan davs, '-\h!-.x‘l-- Mgy be . B prised- in one tessien or in Lwo
 BYCCEsSiVE” seseinne. zng i, helhre the ez"plry of tbe session. in which it is so
daid: or the !u:s;.l ons immediately follawing g, the Afanipur [episiative Assemhly
‘et - modifeation {o:the rile. or.lle - Mianipur Lmslntwe Assembly
hould not be ‘made, the rule sholl thereafrer have effect onl
4, of be of no-cffcet 85" the cose may be; so however lha:
Et;f!ic'sn or rlnml-lmcﬂ.{- l-s’half* be ithout prc}udicc te ihe vahdlt}'




- officers and persers emrowered Lo exercise anv power or o e

. helion argse,

[

ANy person empowered g ercTcive Powers ar (o pertlarm functiens

1. Officaes and p=TI0By acting wwdér thia act ta La priglic servontx ;— Al

crform oy fune.

HOBS under Lhis Act sheli be deemed 10.be puthie servants widin' tie mMeanir 7
of section 20 of tiwe Irdian Penal Code.

78. Bar ¢f procecdings : — No suit or proceedines shalt i against the Gowveri.
Ment or against any person emrewered to exercise powers or 4a perform funcgisse
tunder this Act, for anrthing in good faith done or PIFPOrURS to be dupe wud. s
Uuis Act, .~ ' ’

<79 Liruitation of proseeutiops or wits apninst o floors r— iy Al prows.
tivns of apy Frohehition, Poiice or other ofleers. or of any §ereons Cam e |
12 UXereie powers or Lo rerform Functiens under this Acl, and il achieus wie by
iy be Jaw iyl Proughl apains the Goverrment or any of g sloscsid ol ers
CTpersvma, in retpeet of anythirg done ar alleged to ke Fepen done in pnirganes
oF this Act, shuil e fnstituted within (oo™ months e the tale of the act g

PMlamed of and not afierwards, and G sEelaetion whalt b dismioe. -

(@) il the plaintif does ngt prove that, previnusly 1o Peinming such actiog,
he has presenfed ali swch apreals pilowed by this Act. or by sny otier
v for the (ime being in force, as within the afaresaid period of fuue
months it was pouibls to present, o

{B) in the cuge of sn actisn for damucs. jf tender -of suficient amends
shall hive been made refere the setion wye Browsiot, or ff  afier thae
institwlion of the aciion 3 suficiomt sum of moner 0 opaid tne Coygp
with costs, by or on behaif of the defendyn,

(2) Subjeer 1o the provivions. of reclion 197 of the Code of Crimipad
Procedure, 1973, no’ Courl shall rake coguizance of an efRange cerimitied of
alleged to have been committed by any Pruhibition, Polies or ctict ollicer nr
.1i‘,"|ur'L"f This
Act, in regard to anything done under this Avl, unless 4 warction e eranted
in acenr@ance with the Marestid provisirns of section 9T ol the Code ol Crom,al
Frocgdure, 1973, ' :

{3) No suit shall fje apinst any prohibition, Polics of nher offieers far Camges

unless the came g instituted within four months frem the  time the couse of

80. Exemprion from wperetlon of the act ‘—Nothingin this Act ghat o] v

{1} in respect of any Liquor, denantred spirit and their preparations which
i are the property and in the Bossession of the Government and

in tetpeet of liquor manufactured and veed by the Schedu'ed Caspes
o and Bcheduvied Trikes of Manipur excluding Yiwlin mada fircrgn Siguor
and foreign liquor provided U fa used for customary  and readitional
Purposes subject to such cunditjons and restrictions as may be specified
by pouficalion in the official pazelte.

§l. Powmer to remove di feutties 1 —(1) If any difficulty or doubl arices in
Bivirg effect to Provisions of this Act, 1he State Governmere mav hy  order
prhliched in the Gazctte, make such Provisions, not inconsistent wirh the purs
Dese of this Act appears to it 1o be necessary or cxnendicnt for the remaial

of the diffictlty oy doy bt; and the order of the Siate Government in supel cdses
sball be figal, : '



MANIPUOR GAZETTE

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Imphal; Wednesday, March 10, 2021 (Phalguna 19, 1942)

No. 4

9
‘h

GOVERNMENT OF MANIPUR
SECRETARIAT : LAW & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Imphal, March 4, 2021

No. 2/4/2021-Leg/L: The following Act of the Legislature, Manipur which received assent of
the Governor of Manipur on February 25, 2021 is hereby published in the Official Gazctte:

THE MANIPUR LIQUOR PROHIBITION (THIRD AMENDMENT).'ACT, 2021
(MANIPUR ACT NO. 11 OF 2021)
AN

ACT

further to amend the Manipur Liquor Prohibition Act, 1991 (Manipur Act No. 4 of 1991)

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Manipur in the Seventy
Second Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

(1) This Act may b(e)z(:lalled the Manipur Liquor Prohibition (Third Short title and
Amendment) Act, 2 . commencement.

(2) It shall come i force with effect from the date of its
publication in the Of .al Gazette.

2. In the proviso to section 43 of the Manipur Liquor Prohibition Act, Amendment of

1991 (hereafter referred to as the Principal Act), - section 43.
(i) for the words “*five hundred rupees”, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
(ii) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “thirty .
thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and
(iii) for the words “two thousand rupees’, the words “sixty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
3. In sub-section (1) of section 44 of the Principal Act, for the words Amendment of
“one thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be section 44.

substituted and for the words ‘“five hundred rupees” in the proviso,
the words “fifteen thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.

Scanned with CamScanner



Amendment of
section 45.

Amendment of
section 46.

Amendment of
section 49.

Amendment of
section 50.

Amendment of
section S1.

Amendment of
section 52.

Amendment of
section 33.

Amendment of

section 54.

Amendment of
section 35.

4. In sub-section (1) of section 45 of the Principal Act, I

N

I L

=

- the words “one

thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupee<” snall = substituted

and for the words “five hundred rupees” i tne proviso, the word- fifteen
thousand rupees” shall be subs<tiwted.

. ” % . , i o " £
In section 46 of he Principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees ', the

words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

In scction 49 of the Principal Act, :
(1) nsub-clause (i) -
(a) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted and for the words “five hundred rupees™ in
the proviso, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
(b) in the proviso, the words “than three months and fine shall not be
less™ shall be inserted between the words “less” and “than™.
(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “sixty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted and for the words “one thousand
rupees” in the proviso, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.
(iii) in sub-clause (iii), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words
“sixty thousand rupees” shall be substituted and for the words “one
thousand rupees™ in the proviso, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

In section SO of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees but
not less than fifty rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees but not less
than one thousand five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

In section 5! of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the
words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

In section 52 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the
words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

. In section 33 of the Principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”, the

words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

In section 54 of the Principal Act, for the words “two hundred rupees”, the
words “six thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

. In section 55 of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the

words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted,

Scanned with CamScanner



B

13, In section 58 of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred
rupees”, the words “filteen thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

14. In scction 59 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

|5 In sub-section (1) of section 60 of the Principal Act, for the words

“two hundred rupees”, the words “six thousand rupees” shall be

substituted and for the words “twenty five rupees” in the proviso,
the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees™ shall be substituted.

16. In section 61 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

17.1n section 62 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

18. In section 63 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

19. In section 64 of the Principal Act, for the words “five hundred
rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

20. In section 65 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words © .ty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

21.In section 72 of the Principal Act, for the words “rupees ten
thousand”, the words “three lakh rupees” shall be substituted,

Amendment of
section 58,

Amendment of
section 59,

Amendment of
section 60,

Amendment of
section 61.

Amendment of
section 62,

Amendment of
section 63.

Amendment of
section 64,

Amendment of
section 63,

Amendment of
section 72.

NUNGSHITOMBI ATHOKPAM,
Secretary (Law),
Government of Manipur.

Printed at the Directorate of Printing & Stationery, Government of Manipur/255-C/10-03-2021.

Scanned with CamScanner



