The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member of the Legislative
Assembly Act, 1999

Act 5 0f 1999

Keyword(s):
Member of Legislative Assembly, Salary, Allowance, Pension

Amendments appended: 7 of 2004, 5 of 2010, 18 of 2019, 10 of 2024

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




,r,)n._

Regd. No. NE 907

“The ' Mlzoram Gazette
E)(TRA ORDINAHY
Published by Authority

" VOL. XXVII Aizawl, Friday, 20. 8. 1999, Sravana 29, S.E. 1921, Issue No. 213

NOTIFICATION

No.H.12018/86/99-LID/8, the 20th Auvgust, 1999. The following Act. of the Mi-
zoram Legislative Assembly, which received the assent of the Governor of Mizo-
ram is hereby published for general information.

The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of the Legisla-
tive Assembly Act, 1999,
{ Act No, 5 of 1999 )

( Received the assent of the Governor of Mizoram on the 12th August, 1999 ),
AN
ACT

to provide for the Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member
of the Legislative Assembly of Mizoram,

Be it enacted by the Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the
Fiftieth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances
commencement and Pension of Member of the Legislative Assembly Act, 1999,

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force onthe Ist day
of August, 1999.

Definitions 2. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires :

(a) *“Assembly” means the Législative Assembly of Mizoram;



Ex—213/99

(%)
(©)

(d)

(¢)
()
(&)

“Committee” me;ms a Committee of the Assembly;
“Day” means a period of 24 hours beginning at midnight;
“Family” in relation to a Member means —

(i) his wile or her husband, as the casc may be;

(ii) the children, step-children, widowed daughters, wholly

-dependent on such member; and

(iii) the parents, minos brothers, handicapped adult brothers,
sisters and widowed sisters, wholly dependent on such

Member;

“Form™ means a form appended to the Second Schedule;
“Government’” means the Government of Mizoram;

“Member” means a member of the Assembly, save as
otherwise expressly provided in this Act, does not include —

(i) A Minister as defined in the Mizoram Salaries and
Allowances of Ministers Act, 1999;

(ii) the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker as defined in the
Mizoram Salaries and Aliowances of the Speaker and the
Deputy Speaker Act, 1999;

(iii) the Leader of thz Opposition as defined in the Mizo-
ram Salaries and Allowances of Leader of the Opposition
Act, 1999 and;

(iv) . Government Chief Whip and Deputy Government
Chief Whip as defined in the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances
of Government Chief Whip and Deputy Government Chief

Whip Act, 1999

but mcludes -

the . C]:uef Mmlster, the Speaker, the Ministers, !he Mmlstcrs
of State, the Deputy Speaker, the Leader of the Opposmon
and the Government Chief “Whip and Deputy Government
Chief Whip for the purposes of grant of Inans and advances
under Section 14 and of pension under Section 15 and of

'dcath gratulty under Section 16;



3 Ex—213/99

{h) “Period of residence on duty” means the period during
which a member resides at a place where a session or the

- Assembly or a sitting of a Committee is held or where any

other business connected with his duties as such Member is
transacted, or for the purpose of attending such session
or sitting or for the purpose of attending such other business
is transacled and includes-

(i) in a case of a session of the Assembly, a period of
such residence, not exceeding three days immediately prece-
ding the commencement of the session and a period of such
residence, not exceeding three days immediately succeeding
the date on which the Assembly is adjourned sine die or for
a period exceeding seven days; and

(i1} in the case of a sitting of a Commitiez or any other
business a period of such residence not exczeding two days,
immediately preceding the commencement of the business of
the Committee or other business and a period of such
residence not exceeding two days immediately succeeding the
conclusion of the business of the Committee or other
“business; '

() “Prescribed  authority ” means the authority as pre-
scribed by the Government from time to time; .

(j)) “Schedule” means a Schedule appended to this Act;

(k) “State” means the State of Mizoram.
(I) “Term of Office” in relation t6 a member means-

(i) Where such member is a member elected in a
general election held for the purpose of constituting a new
Assembly, the period beginning with the date of publication
of the notification of the Election Commission under Section
73 of the Representation of the People Act, 1951; or

(i) Where such member is memb:r elected in a bye-
¢lection to the Assembly or a member nominated to  the
‘Assembly, the period: beginning with the date of .his. election
referred to in Sectioa 67A of the said ‘Act, or as the - case
may be the date of his nomination, and ending with, in
each such case, the date on which his seat becomes vacant;



Ex—213/99

Salary and
Daily Allow-
ances

Resider.ce, etc.

(m) “Headquarters” in relation to a member means Consti-
tuency Headquarters to be declared by the Spenker.

3. A member shall be paid 2 salary of Ten thousand rupees
per mensem during the whole of his term of Ofic: and shall
also be entitled to receive daily aliowancas ¢ Rs. 350/- for
each day during the sitting of a session of the Assembly
or the meeting of a Committee and for ecach day of period
of residence at any place  where aay other  busingss conaec-
ted with his duties as membe:r is trapsacied, such as at-
tending a refresher course of seminar, con’orence or wmeeting
of any Patliamentary Association, Usiversity or other recognised
body on matters connected with Parliameniary Affairs., including
the days spsnt on jouraeys for thz purposs.

4, A member shall be entitled without ¢y navment to the
use and maintenance of a furnished residence throughout
his term of office as a member and for a period of fifteen
days immediately thereafter; and so long as such residence
is not provided, he shall be entitled to a residence for which
rental charges of not more than three thousind five hundred
rupees per mensem.

EXPLANATION : For the purpose of this Scciion—

Furnishing
of residence

Constituen- 6.
¢y, contin-
ency and
amity
allowances,

LI

* maintenance in relation to a residence includes-

(1) Provision of electricity upto 600 units per mensem and
free supply of water; and

(ii) installation of telephone with provision of telephone
calls upto 3,000 calls per month.

5. A Member who occupies own House shall be entitled to

receive a sum of Rs. 50,000 in the first year for furnishing
and Rs. 20,000 annually for the subsequent vears of the term.

A member shall be paid, per mensem coustituency allowance
of Rs, 5,000; contingency allowance of Rs. 3,000; and family
allowance of Rs. 5,000.



5 Ex—213/99

Free Travel- 7. Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act and subject to
ling by Train,

ete, with
family
members

Travelling
or cash
allowances

8,

the provisions of the Schedule, a Member shall be entitled to:~

(a) free travelling by any railway in first class air-condi-
tioned 2 Tier coach upto 40,000 kilometres within India during
five years’ term with family upto 5 members and in case actual
children are left out it may be increased with permission of the
Speaker, subject to the ceiling of expenditure as may be incurred
on traveliing by any railway within India, as mentioned in this
clause, or whichever is less,

(b) free travelling by air from Aizawl to Calcutta and
Calcutta to Aizawl with family upto 5 members, in lieu of
travel by any railway from Aizawl to Calcutta and Vice-versa.

EXPLANATION- For the purposes of this section, the term
“first class train” means the most comfortable and highest
ranking coach in the particular train along the particular route,
Therefore, a member and his family or a member and his
attendants shall be entitled to avail the first class air-conditioned
coach where there is any such compartment in the particular train
and if there is no first class air-conditioned coach and only the
second class air-conditioned coach is available in the train, ‘“‘the

first class” shall include the second class air conditioned coach
also.

(1) Members shall not be paid separate travelling allowance in”
respect of every journey performed by him for the purpose of
attending a session of the Assembly or sitting of Committee or
for the purpose of attending to any other business ceanected
with his duty as member from his/her constituency Headquarters
to the place where the session or the sitting is to be held or the
other business is to be tramsacted and for the return journey
from such place to his constituency headquarters but cash
allowance at the rate af Rs. 5/-per KM in lieu of Petrol, Oil
and lubricants from Aizawl to constituency Headquarters by the
shortest route shall be given to each member subject to a
minimum of Rs. 500/- per mensem,

(2) There shall be paid travelling allowance to each member in
respect of the journey performed by air or train or by road on
tour for performing official duties outside the State.



Ex—213/99 6

(3) Where no government accommodation is available outside
the State, member on official duty shall be entitled to recimburse-
ment of accommodation charge of a room in a Three Star Hotel
in addition to the Daily Allowance subject to production of
actual payment receipt.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section {2), a
member who performs a journey by road between places
connected by rail, either wholly or in part, may draw the road
mileage on the scale menticned in sub-section (I);

Provided that the total allowance of travelling allowance
drawn by such mermber for the entire journey shall not exceed
the amount which would have been admissivle to him/her, had
hefshe performed the journey by rail.

Provided further that a member shall be entitled to an
advance of travelling, cash and daily allowances in respect of
the tours undertaken by him/her.

Daily allowan- 9. When a member absents himself for less than seven days du-
ces for interme- ring a session of the Assembly or a sitting of a Committee for
diate journey  visiting any place in the State he shall be cntitled to receive
daily allowance in resgect of such journey to such place and for

the return journey under section 3.

Allowances du- 10. Where the interval between the adjournment of the Assem-
ring short inter- bly and re-assembly of that Assembly does nol exceed seven
vals between days and the member concerned elects to remain at such place

termination of  during the interval, he/she shall be entitled to draw for each day
one session and of residence at such rate specified in Section 3.

commencement
of another
session

Provided that if the member leaves such place during the
interval, his/her absence during a session of the Assembly and
the provisions of section 9 shall apply accordingly.

Trz}vel by air, 11. A member shall be entitled to travel by air or train or by
train or by road on tour for performing official duties within India.

road



Vehicle

Personal At-
tendents

QGrants of loans
for construction

or Furchase of
building, and
advance for pur-
chase of Motor

Vehicle

7 Ex—213/9 9

12, (a) A member shall be provided vehicle by the government
the cost of which shall not exceed rupees four lakhs. If any
member wants to have a vehicle the cost of which exceeds
rupees four lakhs, the excess amount shall be deposited with the
Assembly Secretariat by the member concerned, but the book
value shall be calcuated from rupees four lakhs.

Provided that the vehicle shall be redeemed at book
value by the member concerned after he ceases to be a Member
and in' case he/she ceases to be a member due to death his
wife/husband or legal heir shall redeem the vehicle.

(b) Member who is provided vehicle by the government shall
be given one driver each. The appointment of which shall be co-
terminus without any increment.

(¢) Member shall be given maintenance charge for the
vehicle as follows —

1st year — Rs. 5,000
2nd year — Rs. 7,000
3rd year — Rs. 10,000
4th year — Rs. 14,000
5th year — Rs, 16,000

EXPLANATION : Member includes Ministers, Speakers,
Whips, and Leader of the Opposition Party recognised as such,

13. A member shall be entitled to the service of two Grade
IV staff of his/her choice in the residence throughout his/her
term of office. The appointment of which shall be co-terminus
without any increment.

14.(1) Subject to such conditions and limitations as may be
prescribed by rules there may be paid to a member.

(a) a repayable loan for a sum of money not exceeding five lakh
rupees for a building or purchasing a house;



Ex—213/99

(b) a repayable advance for a sum of money not exceeding four
lakhs rupees or the actual cost of vehicle, whichever is less, for

purchase of motor vehicle.

Provided that a member who has taken a loan or an advance
under section 14 (1) (a) and section 14 (1) (b) respectively is not
allowed to take a fresh loan or advance, as the case may be,

vnless and until he/she has repaid the loan or the advance taken
during the previous term with interest thereon,

(2) On the application for a building loan a member shall execute
a deed in the form prescribed by rules, undertaking to use the
loan for the purpose for which is sanctioned, rendering himself
and such property as may be specified in the deed as security
including the house pnrchased or built with the aid of the loan
liable for the repayment of the loan with interest due thereon.

Provided that no loan for building of the house shall be
sanctioned unless the plot of land on which the house is to be
built is exclusively owned and possessed by the members applying
thereof, and is free from all encumbrances.

(3) On the application for advance for the purchase of a Motor
Vehicle, a member shall execute a deed in a prescribed form un-
dertaking to use the advance for the purpose for which it is sanc-
tioned, rendering himself and the Motor Vehicle to be purchased
liable for the repayment of the advance with interest due thereon,

(4) {1) No transfer, assignment of charge made or created after
the execution of the deed under sub-section (2) under this
section in relation to the property specified therein or the
House purchased or built with the aid of loan or advance as
the case may be shall be valid agaiast the Government, un-

less it has been made or created with the previous consent
of the Government in writing.

(i) Where a member having obtained a loan or an advance
under clauses (a) or (b) of sub-section (I) of this section,
dies while holding office as such, the amount of the loan or
the advance as the case may bs or any part thereof which
would have accrued on the date of his death in accordance
with the terms and conditions of the grant of the loan or
the advance alongwith interest thereon sha!l be written off

with the sanction of the authority as may be prescribed by
the Government from time to time.



Pension

9 Ex-—213/99

(5) No member shall be allowed to avail both the opportunity
of Vehicle being provided to him/her by Government under
section 12(a) and the Car advance under this section.

i5. (1) There shall be paid a pension of five thousand rupees
per mensem to any member who has served for a period of five
years or for any period shorter than five years, whether conti-
nuous or not,

(a) as a member of the erstwhile Assam Legislative Assem-
bly from any constituency forming part of the present State of
Mizoram, or

(b) as a member of the Legislative Assembly of the Union
Territory of Mizoram, or

(¢©) as a member of the Legislative Assembly of the State
of Mizoram.

(2) Where any person has been re-elected for the other
term whether he has completed the term or not he shall be
entitled to an additional peusion of one thousand five hundred

rupees per term, but in no case the pension payable to such
person shall exceed ten thousand rupees.

(3) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-
section (1)

(a) is elected to Office of the President or Vice-President
of India or is appointed to the Office of the Governor
of any State or the Administrator of any Union Ter-
ritory; or

(b) becomes a member of the Council of States or the
House of the People or any Legislative Assembly of a
State or Union Territory or any Legislative Council of
a State; or

(¢) is employed on a salary under the Central Government
or any State Government or any Corporation owned
or controlled by the Central Government or any State
Government or any local authority or becomes
otherwise entitled to any remuneration from such Go-
vernment, Corporation or local authority.

Such person shall not be entitled to any pension under
sub-section (1) for the period during which he continues to hold
such office or as such member, or is so employed, or continues
to be entitled to such remuneration.

Provided that where the salary payable to such person
for holding such office or being such member or so employed,
or where the remuneration referred to in clause (c) payable to
such person is, in etther case, less than the pension payable to
him under sub-section (1), such person shall be entitled only
to receive the balance as pension under that sub-section.

f



Fx—213/99

Death Gratuity

Family Pension

Medical treat-
ment

10

(4y Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1)
is also entitled to any other pension, such person shall be en
titled to receive the pension under sub-section (1) in addition
to such pension,

(5} There shall be paid an annual jncrement of pension at the
rate of 5 per cent per annum.

(6) A member who had been elected three times or more be-
fore the commencement of this Act shall be entitled to draw a
sum of Rs. 6500/— per month as an initial pension amount.

(7) In computing the number of years for the purposes of
sub-section (1), the period during which a person has served as
a Minister as defined in the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances
of Ministers Act, 1999, or as a Speaker dcfined in the Mizoram
Salaries and allowances of the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker
Act, 1999 or as a Leader of the Opposition as defined in the
Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of the Leader of the Oppo-
sition Act, 1999 or as the Governmsnt Chief Whip as defined
in the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of Government Chief
Whip and Deputy Government Chief Whip Act, 1999 or has
served in all or any two of such capacities by virtue of his
membership in the Mizoram Legislative Assembly or in the
Assam Legislative Assembly shall also be taken into account.

16. If a member dies during his term of Office his spouse
shall be paid a death gratuity of two lakhs rupees. If he has
no surviving spouse at the time of his death, his other family
member of the first preference, if any, shall be paid the said#
death gratuity. .
17. (1) When a sitting or former Member dies his spouse or
if he has no surviving spouse at the time of his death, his
other family member of the first preference, if any, shall be
paid a family pension of two thousand (ive hundred rupees
per mensem subject to the limitation in sub-section (2).

(2) the period for which such family pension shall be pay-
able to the widow or widower, son or daughter of a member
shall be as follows:—

(a) in the case of a widow or widower upto date of death
or remarriage, whichever is earlier,

(b) in the case of a son, until he attains the age of
twenty five years.

(c) in the case of an unmarried daughter, until she attains
the age of twenty five years or until she get married
whichever is earlier.

18. A member and the members of his family shall be entitled
free of charge to accommodation in hospital maintained or
recognised by the Government and also to medical treatment
in accordance with the Medical Attendance Rules, as amended
from time to time, as to First Grade Officer of the Govern?
ment of Mizoram.



Power to make
rules

Special Provisions

Procedure

Repeal and Saving

<

11 Ex—213/99

EXPLANATION : If a member has more than one wife
residing with him, the benszfit conferred by this section shall
be available only to such wife as may be nominated in this
behalf by the Member :

Provided that a member and the members of his fa-
mily, if referred to by the Medical Board for examination,
investigation and treatment outside the State, shall be entitled
to travel by air :

Provided furtrer that wiere no governmeat accommo-
dation is available outside tihie Stale, a member and the
memuers of his {amily, if referred to by the Medical Board
for examination, investigation ard ireatment outside the State,
he shall be entitled to reimbursement of accommodation
charge of a rcom in a Three Star Hotel.

19. (1) The Guvernment may, by notification in the Mizo-
ram Gazette, make rules for carrying out the purposes of
this Act.

(2) Every ruie made uader this Act shall be laid, as
soon as may be after it is made, before the Legislative
Assembly of Mizoram, while it is in session, for a total
period of seven days which may be comprised in one session
or in two or more successive sessions and if, before the
expiry of the session immediately following session or the
successive sessions aforesaid, the Legislative Assembly of
Mizoram agree that the rule, be made or should not be
made, the rule shall thercafter have effect only in such
modified form or be of no effect as the case may be. Howe-
ver that any such modification or annulment shall be withe
out prejudice to the validity of anything previously done
under that rule.

20 In the special circumstances specified in the First
Schedule, the provisions of this Act shall apply subject to

the provisions of the Schedule,

21. The provisions of the Second Schedule shall apply in
respect of all claims for salaries and allowances.

22. (1) The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pensions of
Members of Legislative Assembly Act, 1987 is hereby repealed.



Ex—213/99 12

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal; anvthing done or any
action taken under the Act so repealed shall, in so far as it
is not incousistent with the provisions of this Act be deemed
to have been done or taken under this Act.

P. Chakraborty,
Secretary,
Law & Judicial Deptt.,
Govt. of Mizoram.

FIRST SCHEDUILE
(SEE SECTION 20)

Admissibility of 1. No separate travelling allowance =hall be claimed by the
Travelling allo- members in respect of any journey or pari thereof performed
wance, where a by him but he shall be entitled to draw daily allowance at
member is provi- the rate of three hundred fifty rupees only per diem where

ded with free transit the duration of such journey lasts for not less than six
for the whole or any hours on any day.
part of the journey.

Admissibility of 2. Where during session of the Assembly or a sitting of a
daily allowances Committee, a member petforms a jouriey not exceeding
where the place seven days from the place where such sitting is held to any
from which a other place for the purpose of attendingz to any business con-

member perform nected with his duties as a member, he/she shall be entitled
his journey or to to receive daily allowance for each day during any period of
which he returnsis residence on duty at the other place at the rate of Rs. 350/-
not his constituency per day.

headquarters.

Regulation of pay- 3. (1) Notwithstanding that a member nas not taken hisfher
ment of daily and seat in the Assembly to which he/she is clected he/she shall
travelling allowan- be entitled to receive travelling allowances at the rate of Rs.
ces 5/- per Kilometre for the journey performed by him/fher
for the purpose of taking his/her seat in the Assembly.

(2) For absence for a period of scven days or more
during a session of the Assembly or a sitting of Committee

for visiting any place in the State of Mizoram, no travelling
or daily allowance will be admissible. '

| 4



13 Ex—213/99

EXPLANATION : If a member comes back on the scventh
day, whether in the forenoon or. in the afternoon, his/her
absence shall be treated as bemg less than seven days.

L1

(3) Thc term “during a session ™ or “a sitting of a Com-
mitiee” occuring in sectlon 9 and in sub-paragraph (1) of
section 8 does not include the period of three days immedia-
tely preceding the commencement of the session three days
immediately succeeding the end of the session or two days
immediately preceding the commencement of the business,
and two days immediately succeeding the conclusions of the
business of the Committee,

4 1If a member leaves the place where the session of the
Assembly or sitting of a Committee is held before the
commencement of the interval between the adjournment of
the session or the sitting of a Committee sine die and the
commencement of another session or sitting such interval
not exceeding a period of three days, his/her absence from
that place shall be treated as ‘intermediate absence ‘during a
_session of the Assémbly or a sitling of a Committee as the
case may be, and the provisions of = section - 9 shall apply
accordingly. :

(5) Daily allowance for a retarn journey to the constituency
headquarters shall be admissible to'a member who leaves
the place of thg session of the Assembly ot a sitting of Com-
mittes during the continuance of such session or sitting and
return to the plac_e of session or sitting within three days
after the conclusion of the business of the session of the
sitting as the case may be, before finally returnmg to his
constituency headquarters. ' =

(6) All cases regarding the admissibility of daily aflowances
to a member who arrives at the place where a session of
‘the Assembly or a sitting of a Cemmittee is held, without
knowledge of the postponement of the session or the sitting
- including ‘cases of such membets who arrive after ihe session
or a sitting, is adjourned: suddenly, shall. be determined by
the Speaker of the Assembly havmg regard to the oircum-
- stances of- each case

In ¢ase the member hags pcrfarmed such jgur'nezy at
his/her own expenses, he/she shall have to certify for the
safne as follows :



Fx—213/99 14

“Certified that I have not perfornic! any part of the
journey by a conveyance provided at the expense of the
Governmment or a local fund”,

(7) Where a member is provided with fres board and lod-
ging at the expense of any Government or a local fund, he
shall be entitled to recsive only daily allowance as admissible
to him under section 3.

SECOND SCHEDULE
( See Section 21 ) |

PROCEDU RAL PROVISION

(1

(3)

@)

Every member shall as soon as possible after he/shc 1s clected declare in
Form ‘A’ appended to Second Schedule, hisfher Constituency headquarters to
the prescribed authority and any subsequent change in the constituency head-
quarters so declared shall be notified in the said Formn to the prescribed
authority.

A member who claims any daily or other allowance under this Act shall
support hisfher claim by a certificate in the following form, namely :—

“Certified that no travelling allowance in respect ol the journcy or
- daily allowance for the period mentioned in this bili bas been or will
be claimed from any other efficial source™,

After completing each final return journey on termination of a session of the
Assembly or a sitting of a Commitiee or any other busincis connected with
his/her duties as a member, a member shall furnish a certificate in Form ‘B’
appended to Second Schedule.

Ordinarily any non—govcrnmental dues outstanding against a member shall
not be recovered from his salaries and . allowances but where such dues are
on aCCOunt of certain services rendered to him in the course of his duties as a
member, such as when he is on tour with a committes, and the arrangements
for such services have been made by or at thé instance of semi-Government
institutions or private parties at the request of Officers of the Assembly, and

whete such member, - inspite of repeated requests, bad failed to make payment

of such dues, recovery thereof may be eﬁ'ectcd from the salaries or daily
allowance bills of such member.

¥



15 Ex—213/9%
FORM ‘A’

My Constituency headquarters is
or
I have changed my Constituency headquarters from ...........ccocess

O weiriiir e i i e ... .. with effect

from .oovvieiiiiiie e e dU 1O e ene s here stafe
the reasen ).

I may henceforward be allowed travelling allownnces from

Signature ....,.
Constituency ...........

Date

FORM B
DEPARTURE AND RETURN JOURNEY CERTIFICATE

The certificates may kindly be filled, signed and returned to the Secretary,

legislative Assembly, as soon as possible after the completion of the

return
journey.

(1) Certified that ! performed the return Journey under section 9 of the Mizoram

Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of Legislative Assembly Act,
1999 leaving -

(Place) on the

.........................

(Date) I arrive at

ile oe:. - Ay ,:- A -_. . :_.".\. -.':«‘ -: ’ '."_4' ._ -. {Eigpc}l on‘ w ':- -‘u“}n,‘.l:‘o‘; ;'<’ ‘-in essnir e v abivas
PR IR R, e R . e ae e . -
‘ {Date) - .



Bx—213/99 16

(2) Certified that I have not performed any part of journey (other than the rail-
way journey) by a conveyance provided at the expense of the Government
or a local fund.

(3) Certified that I actually travelled by air from ... e e
e rneneea e WAPlacey to .. (Place) by
day/night service. '
Payment of the supplementary bill is required at .....

. .{Station).

‘Member of the Legizlative Assembly
Constituency .........oiivrrniiiiennns

Station

Dated the ........
Strike out if not apphcable

Publishod & Issued by she @ontrolies, Printing & Stationery, Mizoram
Prigtod at the Mizorem Govt, Pross, Alsawl. Gopies—750



The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member of the
Legislative Assembly (Second Amendment) Act, 2004

Bill No. 7 of 2004
Act No. 7 of 2004
Passed on 13.07.2004

An Act

to further amend the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and: memon of M‘mnhﬁr of the
Legislative Assembly Act, 1999 as earlier amended by the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances
and Pension of Member of the Legislative Assembly (First Amm}dmant) Act, 200

It is hereby enacted by the Mizoram: [ ative Assembly im Fifty-fifth year
of Republic of India as follows :-

Short title and comiaencement 1. (1) This Act may be called the Mizoram
Salaries; Allowances: and’ Pension: of Member of the
Legislative: Assembly (Second Amendment) Act;
2004.

(2) It shall come into: force ﬁ‘am the date: of
publication: in: the Mizoram: Gazette:

Amendment of Section 2 2. In' sub-clause: (i1): of clause (h): under Section
2 of the Mizoram: Salaries;, Allowances: and: Pension:
of Member of the: Legislative: Assembly Act; 1999
(hereinafter referred to as the: Principal Act), the:
words “not exceeding: two: days?” between: ‘residence’
and ‘immediately succeeding” shall be substituted by
the words: “not exceeding one day”.

. Under sub-clause: (ii): of clause: (¢): of Section:
2 of the Principal Act; a new proviso: shall be
inserted, namely -

“Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-clause
(1) & (i) of clause () of Section: 2 for the purpose of
salaries, allowances: and other amenities, the term: of
Office of a member means: & period: beginning: with
the date' a member takes oath: or affirmation: to: be
such & member and: ending: with: the date on: which: his:
seat becomes: vacant or dissolution of the: Assembly,

whichever is-earlier”.

2=



Amendment of Section 12

“Vehicle

Amendment of Section 15

“Pension

4

2

The  whole provisionn of Sectiom 12 of the
Mizoram' Salaries; Allowances and Pensiom of Member of
the Legislative Assembly Act, 1999 except the
Explanation shall be substituted! by the: following; nmamely -

(1) A member may be provided a vehicle; the cost of
which shall be determined by the General Purpeses
Committee of the Mizoram: Legislative Assembly and
communicated to the Gavernment from time to time A
member shall purchase the wvehicle within three: months:
from the date of drawal of momey and the registration
document shall be produced to the Secretary; Legislative
Assembly.

(2) A co-terminous Driver shall be provided on
productiom  of the vehicle: so purchased alongwithn the
registration: document’”.

5. The whole provision of Section: 15 of the Mizoram:
Salaries, Allowances: and Pensiom of Member of the
Legislative Assembly Act; 1999, as amended, shall be
substituted by the following; namely -

15 (1) There shall be paid a pension:of five thousand
rupees per mensenn tor every member who has served
for any period as 2 member

(a) of the enstwhile Assam Legislative
Assembly from: any constituency forming: part of
the present State of Mizoram; or

(by of the Legislativer Assembly of the: Umomn
Territory of Mizoram; or

() of the Legislative Assembly of the Siate
of Mizoram:

(2)  Notwithstanding anything contained in: sub-section:
(1), a member who had! beem elected three: times: or more:
befD[& th& commeneement Q‘Eﬂl]& Aﬁﬁ ShHiL &E’ ‘
to draw a sum of Six thousand five hundred! mupees: per
month ag an initial pension amount:

o



@)

Where any persom has. beew reselected affer the

commencement of this Act for the other term; whether
he has completed the term: or not, he shall be entitled
to an additional pension: of one five hundred
rupees per term:

@

)

(a@)  The pension shall be increased by 5 (five)
percent annually at compound rate;

(b) Im no case the pensiom payable to a

Where any persom entitfed to pension under
sub-section: (1)

(a) is elected to the office of the President or
Vice-President of India or is: appointed to the
office of the Governor of any State or the
Administrator of any Union: Territory, or

(b)  becomes a member of the Council of States. on
the House: of the: People: or any Legislative: Assembly
of a State or Union: Territory or any Legislative
Council of a State; or '

(c) is employed oma salary under the Central
Government or any State Government or any
Corporation owned' or controlled! by the Central
Government or any State Government or any
local authority or becomes otherwise entitled to
any remuneration: from: suchh Government,
Corporation: or local authonity;.

Such person shall not be entitled to any
pension under sub-section: (1) for the period during
which he: continues to hold’ such office: or as: such
member, or is so employed| or continues to be
entitled: to: such remuneratiom:

Provided that where the salary payable to
such' persem for holding: such office: or being: such
member or so: employed| or where: the: remuneration:
referred to: in clause: (¢) payable: to: such persom is;
in either case, less than the pension payable tohim
under sub-section(T);, such person: shall be entitled
only to receive: the: balance as pension: under that: sub-
section.



Feskokok

EC Wondsg
St paRqWNUAl  Aq 77 UONIRS Junsixe oy 6

Jeuy 3q Jreys 1oxeads
3l JO UOIIAP AP WY Sup Jo suomsiaoid ayy jo Aue
jo wuonepidpur oy} 01 se sesue Jqnop Aue j 7T

. Appureu
1T uono3s Ieye pajiostl aq [[BYS UOHIDY MIU'Y 8

'PRIRPRP 39 [reys PV [edoulig g jo
g] uonoag 1apun uoneuejdxy 03 osiroid puosoeg L

poInsqns aq qreys
Juesuawr pad saadnu parpuny 9AY puesnoyl omi Jo uoisuad
Apwrey,, Apwreu ‘spiom 2yl  wasuaw 1ad ssadni puesnoy)
om) Jo nomuad Ajimey,, ‘APWel ‘SpIOM Y] 10] PIPUIWE SE
10y fedioulid 9y Jo L] uonag Jo () Uonoas-qns uj i

" Junoooe Ojul UdNe) g OS[R jeys AJQUIdsSY QANR[SISY]
WSSy 9y} Ul 10 A[qUIdSSY QAUR[SIBT  WRIOZI
ayp w digsaquaw sy Jo amma Aq sapoedes yons
Jo omy Aue 1o [ ul PaANs sey IO g661 Py diym
Jany) JusummdAon Andaq pue digpy JOIYD) JUSWUIIAOLD
JO S2DUBMO|[Y PUR SAR[RS WRIOZIN Yl Ul pIupdp se
diga oy JusWLIAAOL 3y SB 10 6661 PY uomsoddo
] JO AP JY) JO SIDUBMO[[Y pue  soLe[e§
weloziy oy} Ul paugap se uomsoddp oy jo sapea]
T SB U0 666 0oV seyeads Andaq ey pue Iadeadg
S o SRanuRIYpae Sl MEDSpY @i’ paEp
se  yeadg B SB 10 ‘ge6] 1OV IRISIUIA JO SOUBMO[[Y
pue souRjeS WRIOZIA Y1 Ul pougep SB IMNSIUIA B Se
paaias sey uosiad & yomm Suunp pouad ay) (1) uonoas-qns
Jo sesodund oy 107 sieek jo soqumu oy Supndwoo up (1)

‘uoisuad yons 03 uoIppe ul
(1) uonaas-gns 1apun uoisuad Iy} DATIDAI 0} PA[IIUD 2 [[BYS
uosiad yons ‘wosuad 1pyjo Aue 0] papnus osfe st (1) uo1dIs
-gns 1apun uoisuad o1 papnud uosiad Aue awyp  (9)

uoIwag JO JuLRqUINUIY

uonejeidiaiuy,,

UOI}09S MU B JO UOIIdSU]

g UOI}23S JO JUSWPUIUIY

Joisusg Apue,
L1 uonoag jo

:(1)uon2as-qns JO JUDWPUIUTY



The I\/Iizorm Gazette

RNI No. 27009/1973

EXTRA ORDINARY

Published by Authority

Postal Regn. No. NE-313(MZ) 2006-2008 Rs. 2/- per issue

VOL - XXXIX  Aizawl,

Thursday 29.4.2010 Vaisakha 9, S.E. 1932, Issue No. 117

NOTIFICATION

No. H. 12018/86/99-LJD, the 23" April, 2010. The following Act of the Mizoram Legislative Assembly,
which received the assent of the Governor of Mizoram is hereby published for general information.

The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member of the Legislative Assembly
(Fourth Amendment) Act, 2010.

Act No. 5 of 2010

(Received the assent of the Governor of Mizoram on 8.4.2010)

AN
ACT

to amend the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member of the Legislative Assembly Act,

1999 (Act No. 5 of 1999).

It is enacted by the Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the Sixty-First year of the Republic of India

as follows :-

Short title and o1
Commencement
Amendment of T2,
Section 7

“Travelling facilities : 7.

(1) This Act may be called the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension
of Member of the Legislative Assembly (Fourth Amendment) Act, 2010.
(2) Itshall come into force from the date of publication in the Mizoram Gazette.

Section 7 of the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of
the Legislative Assembly Act, 1999 shall be substituted by the following,
namely -

A member and his family/relative shall be entitled to travel in any mode of
transport within India, whether separately or together subject to the reimbursement
of not exceeding Rs. 1,00,000/- (Rupees one lakh) only in a financial year.
Final payment for the cost of such travel shall be made on production of
relevant ticket(s) or any other documentary proof”.

Sd/-
Commissioner/Secretary,
Law & Judicial Department
Govt. of Mizoram.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery Department, Government of Mizoram

Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, Aizawl. C/810



The Mizorm Gazette

EXTRA ORDINARY
Published by Authority

RNINo. 27009/1973 Postal Regn. No. NE-313(MZ) 2006-2008
VOL - XLVIII Aizawl, Monday 9.12.2019 Agrahayana 18, S.E. 1941, Issue No. 826

NOTIFICATION

No. H. 12018/86/2011-LJD/26, the 9™ December, 2019. The following Act is hereby published for
general information.

“The Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of the Mizoram Legislative Assembly
(Amendment) Act, 2019

(Act No. 18 of 2019)
(Received the assent of the Governor of Mizoram on 27.11.2019)

Secretary,
Law & Judicial Deptt.,
Govt. of Mizoram

THE MIZORAM SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBER OF THE
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019

AN
ACT
further to amend the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member of the Legislative Assembly
Act, 1999.
Be it enacted by the Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the Seventieth year of the Republic of India as
follows:
Short title and 1. (1)  This Act may be called the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension
commencement of Member of the Legislative Assembly (Amendment) Act, 2019.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1% day of April, 2019.
(3) Amendment of Section 5 shall be deemed to have come into force
from the 9" Mizoram Legislative Assembly.



Ex-826/2019

Amendment
section 3-

Amendment
Section 4 -

Amendment
Section 5 -

Amendment
Section 6 -

Amendment
Section 14-

Amendment
section 15 -

Amendment
section 16 -

Amendment
Section 17 -

of

of

of

of

of

of

of

of

-2

In section 3 of the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member
of the Legislative Assembly Act, 1999(hereinafter referred to as the Principal
Act) (1) for the words “forty thousand rupees per mensem” the words
“eighty thousand rupees per mensem” shall be substituted. (2) For the
words “daily allowances of Rs. 750/-(within the State) and Rs. 1,000/-
(outside the State) per day” the words, bracket and figures, “daily allowances
of Rs. 1,000/-(within the State) and Rs. 2,000/-(outside the State) per day”
shall be substituted.

In section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words and figures “five thousand
rupees per mensem” the words and figure “eight thousand rupees per
mensem” shall be substituted.

In section 5 of the Principal Act, for the words “a sum of Rs. 1,00,000/- in
the first year” the words and figures “a sum of Rs.2,00,000/- in the first
year” shall be substituted.

In Section 6 of the Principal Act, for the words and figures “Constituency
Allowance of Rs. 10,000/-, Contingency Allowance of Rs. 5,000/- and Family
Allowance of Rs. 5,000/-" the words and figures “Constituency Allowance
of Rs. 40,000/-, Contingency Allowance of Rs. 14,000/- and Family
Allowance of Rs. 8,000/-" shall be substituted.

In clause (a) of sub- section (1) of section 14 of the Principal Act, for
the words “ten lakh” the words “twenty lakh” shall be substituted.

1) In section 15 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the words
“twenty thousand” the words “forty thousand” shall be substituted.

2) In sub-section (2) for the words “a member who has been elected
three times or more before the commencement of this Act shall be
entitled to draw a sum of twenty five thousand rupees per month as
an initial pension amount” the words and figures, “if a member had
been elected two terms or more, a sum of Rs. 5,000/- per term shall
be added to the initial pension of Rs. 40,000/- irrespective of the
number of terms a member is elected” shall be substituted.

3) In sub-section(3) for the words “Where any person has been re- elected
after the commencement of this Act for another term, whether he
has completed the term or not, he shall be entitled to an additional
pension of five thousand rupees per term” the words “The maximum
amount of pension shall not exceed Rs. 70,000/-" shall be substituted.

In section 16 of the Principal Act, for the words “ten lakh” the words “fifteen
lakh” shall be substituted.

In sub-section(l) of section 17 of the Principal Act, for the words “family
pension of ten thousand rupees per mensem” the words and figures, “family
pension of 50% of the last pension received by the Ex-MLA or if a sitting



-3- Ex-826/2019

MLA dies, 50% of the pension that would have been received by him”
shall be substituted.

Amendment of In para 1 of the Schedule of the Principal Act, for the words “seven hundred

Schedule fifty rupees (within the State) and one thousand rupees (outside the State)”
the words “one thousand rupees (within the state) and two thousand rupees
(outside Mizoram)” shall be substituted.

In para 2 of the Schedule of the Principal Act, for the words and figures,
“Rs 750/-(within the State) and Rs. 1000/-(outside the State)” the words
and figures “Rs. 1000/- (within the state) and Rs. 2000/-(outside the State)”
shall be substituted.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery Department, Government of Mizoram
Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, Aizawl. C/200



The Mizoram Gazette
EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
RNI No. 27009/1973

VOL-LII Aizawl, Friday 15.3.2024 Phalguna 25, S.E. 1945, Issue No. 206

NOTIFICATION

No. H. 12018/86/2011-LJD(FIN), the 15" March, 2024. The following Act is hereby published for
general information.

“The Mizoram Salaries and Allowances and Pension of Member of the Legislative
Assembly(Amendment) Act, 2024
(Act No. 10 of 2024)

(Received the assent of the Governor of Mizoram on 15.03.2024)

THE MIZORAM SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBER OF THE
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2024

AN
ACT

Sfurther to amend the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Member of the Legislative
Assembly Act, 1999.

It is enacted by the Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the Seventy-fifth year of the Republic of
India as follows ;-

1. Short title and (1) This Act may be called the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and
commencement.- Pension of Member of the Legislative Assembly (Amendment)Act,
2024.
(2) It shall come into force from the date of publication in the Official
Gazette.
2. Amendment of In section 5 of the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of members
section 5.- of the Legislative Assembly Act, 1999 (hereinafter referred to as the

principal act) the words “who occupy own house” shall be omitted.



Ex-206/2024 -2

3.

Amendment of In section 6A of the principal act, the word, figure and symbol “Rs. 20,000/-"

section 6A .- per month shall be substituted by the word, figure and symbol “ Rs. 35,000/-
per month (fixed)”.

Amendment of In section 12 of the principal act,-

section 12.- 1) sub- section (1) shall be omitted.

2)  sub- section (2) shall be substituted as follows, namely :-

“(2) A driver shall be provided to each member of the Legislative
Assembly at Rs. 30,000/- per month (fixed).

EXPLANATION : Member includes Ministers, Speakers, Whips and
Leader of the Opposition Party recognised as such”.

Amendment of Section 13 of the principal act shall be substituted as follows, namely :-

section 13.- “13. Personal Attendants.- A member shall be entitled to the service of
two household Grade IV staff at Rs. 27,000/- per month (fixed) in the
residence throughout his term of office, the appointment of which shall
be co-terminus”.

Amendment In sub- section (1) of section 14 of the principal act.-

of section 14.- 1) Clause (a)shall be substituted as follows, namely :-
“(a) A payable loan for a sum of money not exceeding thirty lakh
rupees for building or purchasing a house, with an interest rate of
5.5 % per annum”.

2) Clause (b) shall be substituted as follow, namely :-
“(b) A payable advance for a sum of money not exceeding fifteen
lakh rupees or the actual cost of vehicle, whichever is less, for
purchase of motor vehicle, with an interest rate of 5.5 % per annum”.

Secretary,
Law & Judicial Department,
Govt. of Mizoram.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery Department, Government of Mizoram
Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, Aizawl. C/180



