
 
 
 
 

 

The Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961 

 

Act 25 of 1961 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS Legislative Research 

(PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources PRS believes to be reliable. These 

contents have not been independently verified, and PRS makes no representation or warranty as to the 

accuracy, completeness or correctness. In some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be 

available.  Principal Acts may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please 

contact the relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the gazette 

notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and legal advice before acting 

on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons connected with it do not accept any 

liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any persons connected with it shall not be in any way 

responsible for any loss, damage, or distress to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the 

basis of this document. 

 

 

Keyword(s): 

Co-operative Society, Co-operative Society with Limited Liability, Co-operative Society with 

Unlimited Liability, Net Profits, Nominal Member, Producers Society 

 

Amendments appended: 1 of 2014, 14 of  2014, 25 of 2014, 11 of 2017, 27 of 2017, 20 of 2021

15 of 2025





















































































































PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JANUARY 3, 2014

(PAUSA 13, 1935 SAKA)

1

PART I

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 3rd January, 2014

No.1-Leg./2014.- The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the 12th Day of

December, 2013, is hereby published for general information:-

THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (SECOND AMEND-

MENT) ACT, 2013

(Punjab Act No. 1 of 2014)

                                                        AN

                                                       ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Sixty-

fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies (Second

Amendment) Act, 2013.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on and with effect from

the 9th day of September, 2013.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961, in section 26, in sub-

section (2), in clause (a), in the second proviso, for the sign ";" appearing at

the end, the sign ":" shall be substituted and thereafter, the following proviso

shall be added, namely:-

"Provided further that the condition of share capital of twenty lacs

of rupees or more mentioned in the first proviso to clause (a) of sub-

section (2) of section 26 of the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961,

shall not apply in the case of any Central Co-operative Bank, which has

been provided finance by the Government, the Government of India, the

National Bank for Agriculture and Rural Development or the Reserve

Bank of India and the Government may appoint as Managing Director

of such Bank, any person, who is a Member of the Indian Administrative

Service, the Punjab Civil Service (Executive Branch), a Deputy Registrar,

a Joint Registrar or an Additional Registrar of Co-operative Societies or

is a professional having specialization in the field of banking and

Short title and

commencement.

Amendment in

section 26 of

Punjab Act 25

of 1961.



possessing the qualifications and experience specified by the Government

in this behalf ;".

3. (1) The Punjab Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Ordinance, 2013

(Punjab Ordinance No. 8 of 2013), is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken

under the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-

section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal

Act, as amended by this Act.

H.P.S. MAHAL,

Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Legal and Legislative Affairs.

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JANUARY 3, 2014

(PAUSA 13, 1935 SAKA)

2

Repeal and

savings.

401/01-2014/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

47

PART I

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 28th July, 2014

No. 15.-Leg./2014.-The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the 3rd Day of July,

2014, is hereby published for general information:-

THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2013

(Punjab Act No. 14 of 2014)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Sixty-fourth Year

of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies

(Amendment) Act, 2013.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred

to as the principal Act), in section 2,-

(i) after clause (aa), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aaa) “Chairman” means the Chairman of the committee;”

(ii) in clause (k), the word “and” appearing at the end, shall be

omitted; and

(iii) in clause (l), for the sign “.” appearing at the end, the sign and

word “; and” shall be substituted and thereafter the following

clause shall be added, namely:-

“(m) “Vice-Chairman” means the Vice-Chairman of the

committee.”

3. In the principal Act, for section 6, the following section shall be

substituted, namely:-

“6. No member other than the Government or a co-operative

society shall, hold more than such portion of the share

capital of a co-operative society, as may be prescribed,

Short title and

commencement.

Amendment of

section 2 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Substitution of

section 6 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Restrictions on

holding of shares.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

48

which in no case shall exceed one-tenth of the share capital.”.

4. In the principal Act, in section 10, in sub-section (4), for the sign

“.” appearing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the

following provisos shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that no order refusing to register the amendment shall be

passed   without giving the co-operative society an opportunity of being

heard:

Provided further that the proposal for registration of the amendment

shall be disposed of by the Registrar within a period of  sixty days from

the date of receipt thereof by him.”.

5. In the principal Act, in section 13, in sub-section (1), for the words

“two third majority of the members present and voting at a general meeting of

the society”, the words “majority of the members present and voting at the

general meeting at which not less than two third of members for the time being

are present” shall be substituted.

6. In the principal Act, for section 18, the following shall be substituted,

namely:-

“18. Every  member  of  the  co-operative  society shall  have one

vote in the affairs of the society:

Provided that-

(a) a member who has attended less than two general

meetings  out of the last  five general meetings; or

(b) a member who has failed to utilize such minimum

services,  as may be  specified in the bye-laws; or

(c) a person who has been a member of the  cooperative

society  for a period of less than nine months,

shall not be eligible to participate in the general meeting of the

co-operative society for election to the committee of the

co-operative society:

Provided further  that-

(a) in the case of an equality of votes, the chairman shall

have a  second or casting vote;

(b) a nominal or associate member shall not have the right

of vote; and

Amendment of

section 10 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment of

section 13 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Substitution of

section 18 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Votes of

members.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

49

Amendment of

section 19 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

(c) where the Government is a member of the co-operative

society, each person nominated by the Government on

the committee shall have one vote.”.

7. In the principal Act, in section 19, in sub-section (2), for the words

"one of its members",  the words "one of the members of its committee” shall

be substituted.

8. In the principal Act, in section 23, for sub-section (1-A), the following

sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1-A) Notwithstanding anything in sub-section (1), where a

co-operative society consists of not less than one thousand or such

greater number of members as may be prescribed, the society may

provide in its bye-laws for the constitution of a smaller general

body designated as the representative general body, to be elected in

the prescribed manner for a term of  not more than five years,

consisting of such number of members of the society and to exercise

all or such of the powers of the general body as may be specified in

the bye-laws and thereupon any reference in this Act to the general

body or meeting thereof shall be construed as a reference to the

representative general body or its meeting:

Provided that the representative general body shall not alter

any provision in the bye-laws relating to its constitution or powers:

Provided further that not less than twenty percent of the total

members of the co-operative society may requisition a meeting of

the general body for re-constitution of the smaller general body. On

receipt of such requisition, the committee shall call a meeting of the

general body not later than one month from the date of receipt of

such requisition. If in such a meeting of the general body,  it is

decided by a majority of members present and voting to reconstitute

the smaller general body, then the election to such smaller general

body shall be held within forty five days thereof .”.

9. In the principal Act, for section 24, the following shall be substituted,

namely:-

“24.  Annual general meeting of a co-operative society shall be

called by the Chairman or in his absence by the Vice-

Chairman within a period of six months of close of

the financial year every year for the purpose of-

Amendment of

section 23 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Substitution of

section 24 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Annual general

meeting.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

50

(a) approval of the programme of the activities of the society

prepared  by the committee for the ensuing year;

(b) election, if any, of the members of the committee other

than nominated members;

(c) consideration of the audit report and the annual report;

(d) disposal of the net profits;

(e) appointment of auditor or auditing firm;

(f) information regarding admission and termination of

members;

(g) information regarding amendment of bye-laws registered

in the previous year;

(h) consideration of  any inspection report under section 49

of this Act and  any inquiry report under section 50 of

this Act and action taken thereon  by the concerned

authority ;

(i) information  regarding instructions issued by the Registrar

under rule 45 of the Punjab State Co-operative Societies

Rules, 1963;

(j) information regarding  transfer or lease or mortgage of

immovable assets of the co-operative society ;

(k) consideration of the loans and advances made to the

members  of the committee and their relatives , the

defaults , if any , and the action  taken for  recovery

thereof ; and

(l) consideration of any other matter which may be brought

forward in accordance with the bye-laws:

Provided that  if the Chairman or  the Vice-Chairman,

as the case may be, fails to hold an annual general meeting

within the specified period, he shall, after affording an

opportunity of being heard,be liable to be removed from the

office after the  expiry of the specified period:

Provided further that in such a case the Registrar shall

hold such meeting either by himself or through an officer

authorized by him and such meeting shall have the same effect



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

51

as if it was convened by the Chairman or Vice-Chairman

himself:

Provided further that where the committee of any

co-operative society has divided the area of operation of

the society into zones in the manner laid down in sub-section

(1-A) of section 26, election of the members of the committee

may not be held in general meeting.”.

10. In the principal Act, in section 26,-

(i) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely:-

“(1) The members of the committee of a co-operative society

shall be elected in the manner prescribed and no person

shall be so elected unless he is a share holder of the

society:

Provided that the maximum number of members

of the committee of a co-operative society shall not exceed

twenty-one:

Provided further that there shall be reservation of

one seat for the scheduled castes and two seats for

women on the committee of every co-operative society

consisting of individuals as members and having members

from such class or category of persons.”.

(ii) for sub-section (1-B), the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely:-

“(1-B)  The term of office of elected members of the committee

and its office bearers shall be five years from the date of

election and the term of office bearers and shall be co-

terminous with the term of the committee:

Provided that the committee may fill a casual

vacancy on the committee by nomination out of the same

class of members in respect of which the casual vacancy

has arisen, if the term of office of the committee is less

than half of its original term:

Provided further that such casual vacancy shall be

filled in a meeting of the committee held in the presence

Amendment of

section 26 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

52

of a nominee of the Registrar.”.

(iii) in sub-section (1-D), for the existing proviso, the following

shall be substituted, namely:-

“Provided that the period for which an Administrator

may be appointed, shall not in case of a co-operative society

carrying on the business of banking exceed one year and shall

not exceed six months in case of other co-operative society.”.

(iv) in sub-section (2), after the words "sub-section (1)", the words

"but subject to a ceiling of twenty one members of the

committee" shall be added.

11. In the principal Act, in section 26-A,-

(i)  in sub-section (2), the words and sign “scheduled castes,

scheduled tribes or", shall be omitted and thereafter the

following proviso shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the maximum number of members of

the committee shall not exceed twenty one excluding the

members co-opted under sub-section (4).”.

(ii)     after  sub-section  (3),   the  following  sub-section (4)   shall

be added, namely:-

“(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section

(1), the committee shall co-opt as members from amongst the

persons  having an experience in the field of banking,

management and finance or having specialization in any field

relating to the objects and activities undertaken by such a

society:

Provided that the number of such co-opted members of

the   committee shall not exceed two in addition to twenty-one

members specified in the first proviso to sub-section (1) of

section 26:

Provided further that such co-opted members shall not

have the right to vote in any election of the co-operative society

in their capacity as such member and shall also not to be

eligible to be elected as office bearers of the committee:

Provided further that the functional directors of a co-

operative society shall also be the members of the committee

Amendment of

section 26-A of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

53

and such members shall be excluded for the purpose of counting

the total number of members specified in the first proviso of

sub-section (1) of section 26.”.

12. In the principal Act, in section 27, for sub-section (1), the following

shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) If, in the opinion of the Registrar, a committee or any

member of a committee persistently makes default or is negligent in

the performance of the duties imposed on it or him by this Act or

the rules or bye-laws made thereunder, or commits any act which is

prejudicial to the interest of the society or its members, or makes

default in the implementation  of production or development

programmes undertaken by the co-operative society, or there is

stalemate in the constitution or functions of the committee,  the

Registrar may, after giving the committee or the member, as the

case may be, a reasonable opportunity to state its or his objections,

if any, by order in writing,-

(a) remove the committee, and appoint a Government servant as

an administrator, to manage the affairs of the society for a

period not exceeding six months, as may be specified in the

order; and

(b) remove the member and get the vacancy filled up through

election for the remaining period of the outgoing member,

according to the provisions of this Act and rules and bye-laws

made there under:

Provided that the committee of any such co- operative

society shall not be superseded or kept under suspension where

there is no Government shareholding or loan or financial

assistance or any guarantee given by the Government:

Provided further that in case of a co-operative society

carrying on the business of banking, the provisions of the

Banking Regulation Act, 1949 (10 of 1949) shall also apply:

Provided further that in case of a cooperative society

carrying on the business of banking, the period of six months

mentioned in clause (a) shall be one year.

Explanation:- Co-operative societies which have been allotted land at

concessional rates or at reserve price by any statutory authority or

Amendment of

section 27 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

54

Government organization shall be deemed to have taken financial

assistance from the Government.”.

13. In the principal Act, after  section 34,  the following section shall be

added, namely:-

“34-A.  Notwithstanding anything contained in the Provincial

Insolvency Act, 1920 (5 of 1920), or any

corresponding law for the time being in force, the

dues of a co-operative society from a member, in insolvency

proceedings, shall rank in order of priority next to the dues payable

by him to the Government or to the local authority.”.

14. In the principal Act, in section 39, for sub-section (2), the following

shall be  substituted ,namely :-

“(2) On the execution of such agreement, the employer shall,

if so required by the co-operative society by a requisition in writing

and so long as the society  does not intimate that the whole of such

debt or demand has been paid, make the deduction in accordance

with the agreement within a period of two months of the requisition

made by the co-operative society and pay the amount so deducted

to the society  within a period of fourteen days after deduction, as if

it were a part of the salary or wages payable on the day as required

under the Payment of Wages Act,1936 (IV of 1936). Such payment

shall be valid  discharge of the employer for his liability to pay the

amount deducted.”.

15.  In the principal Act, in section 48, -

(i) for sub-section (1), the following sub-sections shall be

substituted, namely:-

“(1) The accounts of co-operative societies shall be audited

at least once in each year within a period of six months of the

close of the financial year to which such accounts relate.

(1-A) The accounts of co-operative societies shall be

audited by an auditor or auditing firm approved by the general

body of the co-operative society from out of the panel of

auditors or auditing firms approved by the Government or by

an authority authorized by the Government in this behalf.

The qualifications and experience of the auditors or auditing

firms shall be such, as may be prescribed.”;

Insolvency of

members.

Amendment of

section 39 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Insertion of  new

section 34-A in

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment of

section 48 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

55

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the word "person", the words "auditor

or the auditing firm” shall be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (4), for the word "person", the words "auditor

or the auditing firm" shall be substituted;

(iv) in sub-section (5), for the words "Registrar or the person,

authorised by him", the words “auditor or the auditing firm

authorised" shall be substituted;

(v) in sub-section (6), for the words "Registrar or the person

authorised by him under sub-section (1)", the words "auditor

or the auditing firm authorised under sub-section (1-A)", shall

be substituted;

(vi) after sub-section (6), the following sub-sections shall be added,

namely:-

“(6-A) The audit report of the accounts of an apex co-

operative society shall be laid before the State Legislature.

(6-B)   Audit report shall be submitted by the auditor or

the auditing firm, as the case may be, to the co-operative society

and a copy thereof shall be submitted to the Registrar.”; and

(vii) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be added,

namely:-

“(8) If the Registrar, suo moto, or on the application of

not less than ten members of a co-operative society finds that it

is necessary or expedient to conduct special audit of the accounts

of a co-operative society, he may by an order, provide for such

special audit  and the provisions of this Act, and the rules

applicable to the audit shall also apply to such special audit:

Provided that such special audit shall be ordered only

when there is a prima-facie case of fraud or misappropriation

or embezzlement of funds.”.

16. In the principal Act, in section 71,-

(i) for sub-sections (1), (2) and (3), the following sub-sections

shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Any person other than a co-operative society

carrying on business under any name or title of which the

word “co-operative”, or its equivalent in any India language,

Amendment in

section 71 of

Punjab Act No.

25 of 1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

56

is part, without the sanction of the Government shall be

punishable with the fine which may extend to two thousand

rupees and in the cases of continuing breach with a further

fine which may extend to fifty rupees for every day during

which the breach is continued after conviction for the first

such breach:

Provided that if a person, having been convicted of an

offence is again guilty of offence punishable under this sub

section, shall be punishable for the second or subsequent

offence for a term of imprisonment which may extend to three

months and shall also be liable to pay fine which may extend

to ten thousand rupees.

(2) Any member or past member or the nominee, heir

or legal representative of a deceased member of a co-operative

society who contravenes the provisions of sections 31 and 32

by disposing of any property in respect of which the society is

entitled to have a first charge under that section or do any

other act to the prejudice of such claim, shall be punishable

with fine which may extend to five thousand rupees or with

imprisonment upto three months or both.

(3) An officer or a member of a co-operative society

wilfully making a false return or furnishing false information

or any person wilfully or without any reasonable excuse

disobeying any summons requisition or lawful written order

issued under the provisions of this Act or wilfully failing to

display or furnish in the specified manner any information

required from him by a person authorized in this behalf under

the provisions of this Act, shall be punishable with fine which

may extend to two thousand rupees:

Provided that if a person, having been convicted of

an offence under sub-section (3) is again guilty of an offence

punishable under that sub section, he shall be punishable

for the second or subsequent offence for a term of

imprisonment which may extend to three months and shall

also be liable to pay fine which may extend to ten thousand

rupees.”;



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

57

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the word “five hundred”, the word

“five thousand”  shall be substituted;

(iii) for sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely:-

“(5) Any officer or custodian who wilfully fails to

handover custody of books, accounts, documents records,

cash, security and other property belonging to a co-operative

society, of which he is an officer or custodian to a person

entitled under sections 26, 48, 49, 50 or 58 shall be punishable

with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees and in the

case of a continuing breach with a further fine which may

extend to two hundred and fifty rupees for every day during

which the breach is continued after conviction for the first

such breach:

Provided that if a person, having been convicted of an

offence is again guilty of an offence punishable under this sub

section, he shall be punishable for the second or subsequent

offence for a term of imprisonment which may extend to three

months and shall also be liable to pay fine which may extend

to ten thousand rupees.”;

(iv) in sub-section (6), for the words “two hundred”, the words

“two thousand or imprisonment upto three months or with

both” shall be substituted;

(v) after sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be added,

namely:-

“(7) Whoever, before during or after any election under

this Act:-

(a) fraudulently defaces or fraudulently destroys any nomination

paper; or

(b) fraudulently defaces, destroys or removes any list, notice or

other document affixed by or under the authority or a returning

officer; or

(c) fraudulently defaces or fraudulently destroys any ballot paper

or the official mark on any ballot paper or any declaration of

identity; or



(d) without due authority supplies any ballot paper to any person

or receives any ballot paper from any person or is in possession

of any ballot paper; or

(e) fraudulently puts into any ballot box anything other than the

ballot paper which he is authorized by law to put in; or

(f) without due authority destroys, takes, opens or otherwise

interferes, with any ballot box or ballot papers then in use for

the purposes of the election; or

(g) fraudulently or without due authority, as the case may be

attempts to do any of the foregoing acts or wilfully aids or

abets the doing of any such acts; or

(h) offers any gift or promises to offer any gratification to any

person with the object, directly or indirectly, of inducing,-

(i) a person to stand or not to stand as, or to withdraw or

not to withdraw from, being a candidate at an election;

or

(ii) a member to vote or refrain from voting at an election,

or as a reward to a person for having so stood or not

stood or for having withdrawn or not having withdrawn

his candidature; or

(iii) a member for having voted or refrained from voting,

shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term which

may extend to three months.”.

17. In the principal Act, for section 74, the following shall be substituted,

namely:-

“74. (1) Every co-operative society, shall keep a copy of this

Act, the rules and its bye-laws balance sheet, inspection

note and  audit  report,  open to inspection free of

charge at all reasonable time at the registered  address

of  the society.

(2) Every co-operative society, shall provide access to each

member of the co-operative society to the books, minutes of the

meetings of the committee and general body, list of members and

information and accounts of the co-operative society kept in regular

transaction of its business with such a member.”.

Substitution of

section 74 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Copy of Act,

rules and bye-

laws etc. to be

open to

inspection.

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

58



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 28, 2014

(SRVN 6, 1936 SAKA)

59

18. In the principal Act, in section 82, after clause (b), the following

clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(bb)any matter relating to service conditions of employees of co-

operative societies;”.

19. In the principal Act, in section 85, in sub-section (2), after clause

(xiii), the following   clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(xiii-a) the minimum qualifications and experience of auditors and

auditing firms under sub-section (1-A) of section 48 for auditing

accounts of the co-operative societies;”.

H.P.S. MAHAL,

Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Legal and legislative Affairs.

Amendment of

section 82 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment of

section 85 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

552/07-2014/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

147

PART I

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 17th September, 2014

No. 26-Leg./2014.-The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the 26th Day of

August, 2014, is hereby published for general information:-

THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT)

ACT, 2014

(Punjab Act No. 25 of 2014)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Sixty-fifth

Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies

(Amendment) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred

to as the principal Act), in section 2,–

(i) in clause (k), at the end, the word "and" shall be omitted;

(ii) in clause (l), at the end, for the words and sign "this Act.", the

words and sign "this Act; and" shall be substituted; and

(iii) after clause (l), the following clause shall be added, namely:-

“(m) “Public Sector Undertaking" means an organization

owned by the Government or in which the Government

has pervasive control or created by an Act of the

Government.”.

Short title and

commencement.

Amendment in

section 2 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

148

3. In the principal Act, for section 6, the following section shall be

substituted, namely:-

“6. No member other than the Government, a Public Sector

Undertaking or a co-operative society shall,

hold more than such portion of the share

capital of a co-operative society, as may be prescribed which

in no case shall exceed one-tenth of the share capital:

Provided that in the case of milk producers co-operative

society engaged in the marketing of such other perishable

commodity, as may be notified by the Government, from time

to time, in this behalf (hereinafter referred to as ‘society dealing

in notified commodity’) registered after the commencement

of the Punjab Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 1978,

no member shall have or claim any interest in the shares of

such society exceeding one thousand rupees.".

4. In the principal Act, for section 15, the following section shall be

substituted, namely:–

“15. No person shall be admitted as member of a co-operative

society except the following, namely:–

(a) an individual competent to contract under section  11 of

the Indian Contract Act, 1872 (9 of 1872);

(b) any other co-operative society;

(c) the Government;

(d) a Public Sector Undertaking; and

(e) such class or classes of persons or associations of

persons as may be notified by the Government.".

H.P.S. MAHAL,

Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Legal and legislative Affairs.

Restrictions on

holding of shares.

Substitution of

section 15 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Persons who

may become

members.

Substitution of

section 6 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

590/09-2014/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

933

PART III

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF HOME AFFAIRS AND JUSTICE

(Home-V Branch)

NOTIFICATION

The 16th September, 2014

No. G.S.R.49/P.A.2/2013/S.18/Amd.(1)/2014.-In exercise of the

powers conferred by section 18 of the Punjab Prevention of Human Smuggling

Act, 2012 (Punjab Act No. 2 of 2013), and all other powers enabling him in

this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased to make the following rules

further to amend the Punjab Prevention of Human Smuggling Rules, 2013,

namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Punjab Prevention of Human

Smuggling (Amendment) Rules, 2014.

(2) They shall come into force on and with effect from the date of

their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Punjab Prevention of Human Smuggling Rules, 2013 (hereinafter

referred to as the said rules), in rule (1), in sub-rule (1), in the title, for the

words, "Prevention of Human Smuggling", the words "Travel Professionals'

Regulation" shall be substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 2, after clause (c), the following clause shall be

inserted, namely:-

"(cc) "IELTS" means the International English Language Testing

System;"

4. In the said rules, in rule 3, in sub-rule (2),-

(i) in clause (i), for items (a), (b) and (c), the following items

shall be substituted, namely:-

“(a) a fee of rupees one lac, for the firms, which are running

travel agency or coaching institutions of IELTS or

consultancy, for a period of more than five years:

Provided that the consultancy firm may either

deposit the said amount of rupees one lac in one

installment or in five equal installments;



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

934

(b) a fee of rupees twenty-five thousand, for the firms,

which are running Travel Agency or Coaching

Institutions of IELTS or Consultancy, for a period of

less than five years:

Provided that the Consultancy firm may either

deposit the said amount of rupees twenty-five thousand

in one installment or an amount of rupees ten thousand

in first installment and the balance amount in four equal

installments;

(c) a fee of rupees one lac for the Ticketing Agents, who

are in the business of ticketing, for a period of more

than five years:

Provided that the Ticketing Agents may either

deposit the said amount of rupees one lac in one

installment or in five equal installments:

Provided further that the Ticketing Agents, shall

have to submit a monthly chart of the tickets sold by

them, either on domestic or international airlines, on

internet to the Deputy Commissioner concerned;

(d) a fee of rupees twenty- five thousand,  for the Ticketing

Agents, who are in the business of ticketing, for a  period

of less than five years:

Provided that the Ticketing Agents, may either

deposit the said amount of rupees twenty-five thousand

in one installment or ten thousand in first installment

and the balance amount in four equal installments:

Provided further that the Ticketing Agents, shall

have to submit a monthly chart of the tickets, sold by

them, either on domestic or international airlines, on

internet to the Deputy Commissioner concerned;

(e) a fee of rupees one lac for the firms, which are running

the business of general sales agents, for a  period of

more than five years:

Provided that the said general sales agents, may



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

935

either deposit the said amount of rupees one lac in one

installment or in five equal installments; and

(f) a fee of rupees twenty-five thousand for the firms, which

are running the business of general sales agents, for a

period of less than five years:

Provided that the said general sales agents, may

either deposit the said amount of rupees twenty-five

thousand, in one installment or ten thousand in first

installment and the balance amount in four equal

installments.”.

(ii) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(ii) shall submit the documents, for obtaining a license, as

specified in form I- A.”.

5. In the said rules, in rule 4,-

(i)  in sub-rule (1), in clause (vii), for the figures "15 ft. x 20 ft.", the

words 100 sq.ft." shall be substituted;

(ii) sub- rule (2) shall be omitted;

(iii) in sub- rule (6),-

(a) for the words, "license is granted”, the words "license is granted

for a travel agency” shall be substituted; and

(b) for the words and sign "from said clients", the words and

sign" from said clients:" shall be substituted, and thereafter,

the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that the person, to whom a license is

given for a Consultancy Firm, shall inform the State

Government on six monthly basis, giving details of his

clients and the fee charged therefrom:

Provided further that the person, to whom a license

is given for a Ticketing Agency, shall inform the Deputy

Commissioner concerned, on monthly basis, giving a

monthly chart of number of tickets sold by him for

domestic or international airlines, as the case may be, in

electronic mode on his official email id:

Provided further that each travel agent or



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

936

consultant or ticketing agent, who has obtained a license,

shall maintain record of the fee charged and submit the

same to the competent authority or the State

Government, as the case may be, in case a complaint is

received against such licensee.”.

6. In the said rules, after form-I, the following form shall be inserted,

namely:-

“ FORM-I-A

[See rule 3 (2)]

PART-1

1. For proof of Residence (Copy of any one of the following)

(i) Residence Certificate ;or

(ii)  Voter I.D. Card ;or

(iii)  Aadhar Card/UID ;or

(iv)  Arms License ;or

(v)  Passport.

2. For Proof of Identity (Copy of any one of the following)

(i) Voter I.D. Card ;or

(ii) PAN Card;or

(iii) Aadhar Card/UID ;or

(iv) Arms License ;or

(v) Passport .

3. For Proof of Date of Birth (copy of any one of the following)

(i) Birth Certificate ;or

(ii) Matriculation Certificate ; or

(iii) Passport,

That Only the Copy of Passport is also acceptable

as a single proof towards proof of Identity, Address

and Date of Birth.

4.  Other Documents:

(i) Three passport size photographs ;



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

937

(ii) Copy of Pan Card;

(iii) Income Tax Return for minimum 1 year and maximum 3 years;

and

(iv) Bank Account Statement of previous year or since the

inception of business, whichever is lesser.

5. Proof of occupancy of business place (Copy of any one of the

following)

(i) Copy of the ownership of the accommodation; or

(ii) Rent deed (if available) ; or

(iii) Certificate from bank-certifying holding of a current account

and the business address on record; or

(iv) Copy of registration under Shops and Establishments  Act (if

available); or

(v) Copy of Utility bills,

(a) Electricity; or

(b) Telephone/Broadband; or

(c) Property Tax Receipts.

6.     Proof of constitution/operations of business:

(1) In case of Sole Proprietorship.-

(a) Certificate from Charted Accountant  regarding sole

proprietorship ; and

(b) Certificate from Bank, certifying sole proprietorship;

(2) In case of Partnership Firm (Only the managing partner shall

apply).-

(a) Copy of Partnership Deed; and

(b) Certificate from other partners authorizing at least one partner/

Manager to apply for and comply with the requirements of

licensing under the Act;

(3)  In case of a Private Limited Company or a Limited Company,

incorporated under the Companies Act, (only one of the Directors

or an Authorized Manager shall apply, for the license along with

required documents).



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

938

PART-II

Affidavit

I,______________S/o____________R/o_________________________

District ___________________, do hereby solemnly affirm and declare as

under:

1. That I am a *Citizen of India or a Non- Resident Indian, as the case may

be, and my date of birth is  ____________.

2. That I am operating as *ticketing and travel agent/ overseas education

advisor/immigration consultant since ____________________, as and

the *owner/proprietor/director/ Manager of the company _________,

with its registered/head/main office located at: ________________.

3. That I am applying for grant of license under the Punjab Travel

Professionals’ Regulation Act, 2012. I undertake to comply with all the

provisions of the Act.

4. That I have neither been *convicted or involved in any criminal case or

complaints, as the case may be, related to my trade/profession, nor there

is any criminal proceeding pending against me in any court of law till

date.

5. That I have not been barred from carrying out this profession by any

agency regulating this profession.

6. That I am a person of sound mind and was never declared as insolvent

or bankrupt.

7. That I do not hold any office of profit either under the Government of

India or any State Government.

8. That I have adequate space/accommodation, for running the said

profession which is easily accessible.

9. That I have sufficient arrangement to maintain records of my clients in

electronic form, and will make available soft copy of the same to any

client or to any authorized person/ department, when demanded.

10. That I will do this business on my own and not through any other person.

If I would intend to carry out my profession through an authorized person,

then I will get the antecedents of such person verified through the police

of the area concerned, and shall also obtain a bond from the said person



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

939

duly witnessed by two persons, who are income tax assesees.

11. That I undertake that in case of any advertisement or publicity with

reference to my profession or to hold seminar in respect thereof, I shall

prominently display my license number and will refrain from giving any

misleading advertisements/ claims.

Date: Deponent

Place:

Verification:

Verified ______________ day of _____________ 20____, that the

information contained above are true and correct to the best of my knowledge

and nothing has been concealed therein.

Date: Deponent

Place:

*( Tick  (     ); whichever is applicable)

PART III

RESOLUTION

(On letter head of the company concerned)

It is hereby resolved on ________ Day of  _______________ 2014, in

the  board meeting of (Name of the Company),-

1) that the company shall comply with the provisions of the Punjab Travel

Professionals’ Regulation Act, 2012, and further resolves that the license

application, be made to the competent authority, in whose jurisdiction,

the head office of the company, is located.

2) that the Director of the company (Name of the Director/Manager), be

authorized, to apply for the license in his/her name and complete all the

formalities as prescribed under the Act.

ü



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 17, 2014

(BHDR 26, 1936 SAKA)

940

590/09-2014/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar

3) that Mr./Ms. (___________ name __________), will act on the behalf

of the company and ensure that the operations of the company, across

all branch offices in Punjab, would comply with the procedure prescribed

under the Act and the rules.

For NAME OF THE COMPANY

NAME AND SIGNATURES OF ALL THE DIRECTORS

Date:

Place:

COMPANY

SEAL/STAMP.”.

JAGPAL SINGH SANDHU,

Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Home Affairs and Justice.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

191

PART I

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 21st July, 2017

No.15-Leg./2017.- The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the  8th  day of July,

2017, is hereby published for general information:-

 THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES

(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2017.

(Punjab Act No. 11 of 2017)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Sixty-

eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies (Amend-

ment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force on and with effect from the date of its

publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961, section 67-A, shall be

omitted.

VIVEK PURI,

Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Legal and Legislative Affairs.

Short title and

commencement.

Omission of

section 67-A of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

1299/07-2017/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

827

PART III

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORT

(TRANSPORT - II BRANCH)

NOTIFICATION

The 19th July, 2017

No. S.O.39/C.A.59/1988/Ss.99 and 100/2017.-WHEREAS, the Governor of

Punjab is of the opinion that for the purpose of providing an efficient, adequate, economical

and properly coordinated road transport service, it is necessary in the public interest that

road transport services in relation to certain areas and routes should be run and operated by

the State Transport Undertakings to complete or partial exclusion of other persons;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by Section 99 of the Motor

Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act No.59 of 1988), and all other powers enabling him in this

behalf, Governor of Punjab is pleased to formulate a proposal regarding the road transport

services to achieve the aforesaid purpose, in supersession of the Scheme notified vide No.

SO.41/C.A.59/1988/S.100/1990, dated The 9th August, 1990 as modified from time to time.

Notice is hereby given that any person may within a period of 30 days from the date of

publication of the above said proposal in the Official Gazette, file objections as required

under sub-section (1) of section 100 of the aforesaid Act, to the Principal Secretary to

Government of Punjab, Department of Transport, Punjab Civil Secretariat-2, Sector-9,

Chandigarh against the proposed Scheme given below and such objections shall be considered

by the State Government in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (2) of section 100

ibid.

DRAFT SCHEME

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Punjab Transport Scheme, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force on and with effect from the date of its publication in the

Official Gazette.

2. In the Scheme, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) ‘Major District Roads’ means the roads notified as such by the Government of

Punjab from time to time;

(b) ‘National Highways’ means the roads notified as such by the Government of

India from time to time;

(c) ‘Other District Roads’ means the roads notified as such by the Government of

Punjab from time to time;



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

828

(d) ‘Private Operator’ means any operator who may be granted permit under the

Scheme, not being a State Transport Undertaking;

(e)  Rural Link Roads means the roads notified as such by the Government of Punjab

from time to time; and

(f) ‘State Highways’ means the roads notified as such by the Government of Punjab

from time to time.

3. Movement of stage carriages on all routes and/or roads in the State of Punjab, and on

all routes and/or roads to or from other States, shall be regulated as per the table below:

Sr. No. Classification of Routes % share of % share of Transport

State Transport Private Vehicle Type

Undertakings Operators

A. Routes notified for service 100 0 Stage carriages

exclusively by State (Buses) having seating

Transport Undertakings capacity of 39 or more

B. Inter State Routes 100 0 excluding driver, with the

further condition that

C. National Highways within 50 50 air-conditioned stage

the State of Punjab carriages shall be run only

by State Transport

Undertakings out of their

overall share

D. State Highways/Main 40 60

District Roads/Other

District Roads

E. Stage Carriages (buses) with seating capacity of 38 or less, excluding driver shall get

permits under Chapter V of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act 59 of 1988)

for plying on link roads only. However, they shall be allowed to travel upto 12 kms on

above categories of roads and such particular stretch shall be mentioned on their

permit.

4. State Transport Undertakings shall have fixed time slabs for departure of their stage

carriages. The time slabs shall be fixed by the Secretary, Regional Transport Authority

based upon the number of State Transport Undertakings’ stage carriages on the

concerned route. The time slabs fixed, shall remain unchanged round the year, subject

to seasonal variations permitted by the State Transport Commissioner for convenience

of commuters. In exceptional cases, time slabs may be varied by the Secretary, Regional

Transport Authority in public interest justified by analysis of ridership data. Halting time



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

829

at stage carriage stands shall be equitably distributed between State Transport

Undertaking stage carriages and those of Private Operators.

5. Stage carriages operated by the Private Operators shall follow schedules as per a

roster of movement amongst all private operators on a route.

(1) The roster shall be monthly.

(2) The roster shall be approved by Secretary, Regional Transport Authority. The

State Government shall within a period of one year ensure availability of appropriate

software and technology to facilitate computer generation of rosters for the entire

State.

(3) The roster shall ensure that all Private Operators on a route get to operate stage

carriages at lean and high traffic times of a day equally, over the period of the

roster.

(4) Timings of stage carriages belonging to a particular operator on a route shall be

clubbed to avoid unhealthy competition provoking over speeding, concomitant

discomfort to passengers and scare of accidents.

6. Permits issued for a route, shall carry the registration numbers of stage carriages that

are to ply on that route.

7. The permit or a copy of the permit number shall be displayed on the vehicle in the

manner as may be specified by the State Transport Commissioner.

8. Allotment of permits for stage carriages shall be made by the State Government. The

eligibility criteria and the reservation to be followed, shall be notified by the State

Government in exercise of its powers under Section 71 of the  Motor Vehicles Act, 1988.

(1) In case number of eligible applications received for a particular route are more

than the number of permits that can be granted for such route, the permits shall

be allotted by way of draw of lots.

(2) In case of Private Operators, not more than 25% of the total permits earmarked

for Private Operators of a particular route, shall be issued to one firm/party/

person on such route.

9. Permits issued under this Scheme shall be valid for a period of five years from the date

of issue and require renewal every five years thereafter.

10. Permits issued by the State Government, that were valid immediately prior to the coming

into force of this Scheme, shall subject to:

(i) the provisions of the Motor Vehicle Act, 1988;

(ii) the permits not having been declared invalid by any court of law



(iii) the operator furnishing an undertaking to comply with all the terms and provisions

of the present Scheme,

be continued/renewed under this Scheme for the remainder period of their original

validity only at no extra charge.

11. No transfer of permits shall be allowed, except in case of replacement of a stage

carriage, or, in case of inheritance due to death of an individual permit holder.

12. Once granted, there shall be no extension, or diversion, or curtailment of the route

mentioned on the permit, save when a bus stand is shifted to a new location or a route

is altered due to coming up of an overbridge.

13. An operator may surrender his permit by way of notice of three months, or payment in

lieu of notice of total dues payable for three months as assessed by the Secretary,

Regional Transport Authority.

14. Each operator, within six months of grant of permit under the present Scheme, shall

ensure to the satisfaction of the authority notified by the Punjab Government, that;

(i) Global Positioning System tracking system and Radio Frequency Identification,

as may be specified by the Punjab Government are installed on all stage carriages

registered in the State, to enable monitoring of movement, speed, stoppages and

regularity of the service of stage carriages on permitted routes, by the State

Government, as well as by the general public;

(ii) Close Circuits TV cameras, as may be specified by Punjab Government are

installed inside the stage carriages plying in the State and entering the State, to

minimize chances of untoward incidents inside the stage carriages and to ensure

detection and appropriate action in case of such incidents;

(iii) Panic buttons as may be specified by the Punjab Government that triggers an

SMS/Call to nearest police station along with Global Positioning System Location

of the stage carriage (bus), are installed inside the stage carriages; and

(iv) he undertakes to be part of a common digital platform with requisite devices in

stage carriages, to enable common tickets/passes for passengers travelling on

stage carriages in the State of Punjab.

15. A holder of stage carriage permit shall be liable for penal action and cancellation of

permit, as provided under the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 and under the Punjab Motor

Vehicles Rules, 1989 in case of non-compliance of terms and conditions of the permit

and/or any breach of conditions specified in this Scheme:-

Provided, that the terms and conditions contained in the clauses to the present Scheme

shall be deemed to be conditions contained in the permit issued hereunder.

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

830



Provided further that, the following shall be deemed to be conditions contained in the

permit issued under this Scheme and any operator, if found guilty of the same, shall be

deemed to have violated the conditions contained in the permit:

a. To be not adhering to timings; or

b. Deviating from route; or

c. Over speeding; or

d. Making un-authorized stoppages; or

e. To have switched off, or, removed, or tampered with the Global Positioning

System at any time irrespective of whether stage carriage is on the move or is

stationary; or

f. Is without annual road worthiness certificate; or

g.  Overcharging or harassing passengers by the staff; or

h. Being driven by driver not holding proper license; or

i. Government dues/taxes are not paid in time; or

j. Endangering safety of passengers.

16. Motor Vehicle Tax shall be proportionate to the reference fares notified by the Punjab

Government for different classes of stage carriages (buses) and shall be charged on

mileage sanctioned in permit with 4 off days in a month. Where there exists a reciprocal

arrangement with other States/UTs, rate of tax shall be equal to the rate charged by

the other States/UTs. For buses running on rural roads the tax shall be lump sum

Rs.30,000 per annum which shall increase 5% every year in compounded manner.

17. For the sake of safety on roads, the State Government shall endeavour to ensure that

Toll Plazas, or other appropriate stretches of State Highways and National Highways

have mandatory lanes for commercial vehicles with built-in weigh bridges. Overloaded

vehicles shall be stopped and allowed to pass only after excess load has been shifted to

another vehicle.

It is clarified that, the aforesaid shall be in addition to and not in derogation to any

challans, penalties or punishments prescribed for overloading by any other law for the

time being in force.

18. The State Government shall endeavour to ensure that appropriate facilities are developed,

on an outsourced basis, for automatic detection of over-speeding and issuance of challans

using speed radars and vehicle number plate readers, along the State Highways and

National Highways.

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

831



19. The State Government shall endeavour to ensure that appropriate facilities are developed,

on an outsourced basis, to set up Adequate Automatic Computerized Testing Stations

for conducting annual fitness check of commercial vehicles.

20. The Punjab Government shall endeavour to ensure that challans are issued by Police

and Transport Departments only on online handheld machines linked to a central/cloud

server.

SARVJIT SINGH, IAS,

Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Transport.

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), JULY 21, 2017

(ASAR 30, 1939 SAKA)

832

1299/07-2017/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), DECEMBER 29, 2017

(PAUSA 8, 1939 SAKA)

241

PART I

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 29th December, 2017

No. 37-Leg./2017.-The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the 15th day of

December, 2017, is hereby published for general information:-

THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (SECOND

AMENDMENT) ACT, 2017

(Punjab Act No. 27 of 2017)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Sixty-

eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies

(Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force on and with effect from the date of its

publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961(hereinafter referred to

as the principal Act), in section 13, for sub-sections (11) and (12), the following

sub-sections shall be substituted, namely:-

"(11) In case a member or a creditor who had objected to the proposed

order under sub-section (9) remains aggrieved with the orders of

the Registrar, may make second reference to the Government within

thirty days of passing of such order. The Government shall, after

affording due opportunity of hearing to the members and creditors

who have made second reference to the Government, annul, modify

or uphold the order of the Registrar passed under sub-section (9).

The decision of the Government in this regard shall be final.

(12) The order passed by the Registrar under sub-section (9) or by the

Government under sub-section (11), as the case may be, shall be

final and where such an order involves the transfer of any assets

Short title and

commencement.

Amendment in

section 13 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), DECEMBER 29, 2017

(PAUSA 8, 1939 SAKA)

242

and liabilities, the same shall, notwithstanding anything contained in

any law for the time being in force, be a sufficient conveyance to

vest the assets and liabilities in the society in which these are vested

under that order without any further assurance.".

3. In the principal Act, in section 19, for sub-section (2), the following sub-

section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), a

co-operative society which is a member of another co-operative

society, may, subject to the rules, appoint one of the members who

is eligible to vote on its behalf in the affairs of that other society.

Explanation.- In case the member appointed by a society, to vote

on its behalf in the affairs of another society of which such society

is a member, gets elected to the committee of that society, his term

of office shall be co-terminus with the term of committee of that

society.".

4. In the principal Act, in section 26, in sub-section (1-D), after the proviso,

the following Explanation shall be added, namely:-

"Explanation.- The delay caused in constitution of an elected

committee due to judicial proceedings in civil courts in this regard,

shall be excluded at the time of computing the period for which an

Administrator is appointed.".

5. In the principal Act, in section 27, in sub-section (1), the existing

Explanation shall re-numbered as Explanation 1 and thereafter the following

Explanation shall be added, namely:-

"Explanation 2.- The delay caused in constitution of an elected

committee due to judicial proceedings in civil courts in this regard,

shall be excluded at the time of computing the period for which an

Administrator is appointed as provided in clause (a).".

6. In the principal Act, in section 69, the following Explanation shall be

added, namely:-

"Explanation.-

(i) The application of a party to a reference shall not lie

before the Registrar or the Government, as the case

may be, if appeal under section 68 of the Act lies or has

been availed of by such a party to a reference;

Amendment in

section 19 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section 26 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section 27 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section 69 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), DECEMBER 29, 2017

(PAUSA 8, 1939 SAKA)

243

(ii) The application of a party to a reference shall not lie

before the Registrar or the Government, as the case

may be, if an order or decision is made in revision by

the Registrar or any authority authorized by him in this

regard;

(iii) No revision shall lie under section 69 against any order

passed under the service rules of the concerned

co-operative societies where in a revision is already

provided in the service rules of that society; and

(iv) No revision under section 69 shall be available against

any office order passed by the Registrar or his

subordinates.".

  VIVEK PURI,

Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Legal and Legislative Affairs.

1406/12-2017/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), APRIL 26, 2021

(VYSK 6, 1943 SAKA)

EXTRAEXTRAEXTRAEXTRAEXTRAORDINARORDINARORDINARORDINARORDINARYYYYY

Published by AuthorityPublished by AuthorityPublished by AuthorityPublished by AuthorityPublished by Authority

CHANDIGARH, MONDAY, APRIL 26, 2021

(VAISAKHA 6, 1943 SAKA)

( liv )

LEGISLATIVE  SUPPLEMENT

Contents Pages

Part - I Acts

The Punjab Co-operative Societies

(Amendment) Act, 2021.

(Punjab Act No. 20 of 2021).

Part - II Ordinances

Nil

Part - III Delegated Legislation

Nil

Part - IV Correction  Slips,  Republications and

Replacements

Nil

______

..    149-151



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), APRIL 26, 2021

(VYSK 6, 1943 SAKA)

149

Short title and

commence-

ment.

Amendment

 in section  3  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

                                                PART I

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 26th  April, 2021

No.20-Leg./2021.- The following Act of the Legislature of the State of

Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the  26th day of

March, 2021, is hereby published for general information:-

THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT)

ACT, 2021

                                      (Punjab Act No. 20 of 2021)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Seventy-

second Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies

(Amendment) Act, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to

as the principal Act), in section 3, in sub-section (5), for the words and sign

"purposes of appeal, ", the words and sign "purposes of appeal and revision,"

shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Act, in section 6,-

(i) before the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,

namely:-

"Provided that in case of Urban Co-operative Bank (UCB),

shareholding of an individual member, in no case, shall exceed

five per cent of the share capital:"; and

(ii) in the existing proviso, for the words "Provided that" the words

"Provided  further that" shall be substituted.

Amendment in

section  6  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), APRIL 26, 2021

(VYSK 6, 1943 SAKA)

150

4. In the principal Act, in section 7, for sub-section (1), the following

sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(1)   For purposes of registration, an application shall be made to

the Registrar alongwith the Registration Fees, as may be prescribed, by

the Registrar from time to time.".

5. In the principal Act, in section 22, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the

words "two years", the words "three years" shall be substituted.

6. In the principal Act, after section 26-B , the following section shall be

inserted, namely:-

"26-C. In case of an insured Co-operative Bank, if an order for

supersession of its Committee, as per the requisition of

the Reserve Bank of India, is made under sub- section

(3) of  Section 70A, at any time within a period of ten

years before the date of  incorporation of this section or

at any time after such incorporation, then, no member of

such Committee shall be eligible for being re-appointed,

re-nominated, re-elected or re-co-opted on the

Committee of such bank or, for being a member or being appointed,

nominated, elected, or co-opted, as a member of Committee of such

bank or any other bank, for a period of two terms of the Committee from

the date of order of supersession of the Committee.".

7. In the principal Act, in section 55, in sub-section (1), after clause (d), for

the words "such dispute shall be referred to the Registrar", the words "such

dispute shall be referred to the Registrar within a period of six years" shall be

substituted.

8. In the principal Act, in section 66, for the words, figures, signs and brackets,

"purposes of Article 182 of the First Schedule to the Indian Limitation Act,

1908 (9 of 1908).", the words, figures and signs "purposes of Article 136 of the

First Schedule to the Indian Limitation Act, 1963." shall be substituted.

9. In the principal Act, in section 68, in sub-section (2), in clause (e), for the

sign".", the sign ":" shall be substituted, and thereafter, the following proviso

shall be added, namely:-

Amendment in

section  7  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section  22 of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Insertion of new

section 26-C in

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section  55  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section  66  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Amendment in

section  68  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

Restriction on

membership of

an insured Bank

imposed after

the order of

Reserve

Bank of India as

a consequence

under Section

70- A.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), APRIL 26, 2021

(VYSK 6, 1943 SAKA)

Amendment in

section  69  of

Punjab Act 25 of

1961.

151

"Provided that if an appeal is filed beyond a period of sixty days, the

Appellate Authority may condone the delay for sufficient reasons.".

10. In the principal Act, in section 69, for Explanations (i) and (ii), the following

Explanations shall be substituted, namely:-

"(i) The Government shall notify the officers, who shall exercise these

powers on behalf of the Government. The Registrar of Co-operative

Societies may also notify the officers, who shall exercise these

powers on behalf of the Registrar.

(ii) The application of a party to a reference shall not lie before the

Registrar, if an order or decision is made in revision by the Registrar

or any authority authorized by him in this regard.".

 S.K. AGGARWAL,

Secretary to Government of Punjab,

Department of Legal and Legislative Affairs.

2281/4-2021/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), NOVEMBER 4, 2025

(KRTK 13, 1947 SAKA)

667

PART I
GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF LEGAL AND LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS, PUNJAB

NOTIFICATION

The 3rd November, 2025

No. 16-Leg./2025.- The following Act of the Legislature of the State of
Punjab received the assent of the Governor of Punjab on the 16th day of
October, 2025, is hereby published for general information :-

THE PUNJAB CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2025

(Punjab Act No. 15 of 2025)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Punjab in the Seventy-sixth
year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Co-operative Societies
(Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force on and with effect from the date of its
publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Punjab Co-operative Societies Act, 1961 (hereinafter referred to
as the principal Act), in section 37, for clauses (2) and (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-

"(2) any debenture issued by any society not creating or extinguishing
rights in immovable property; or

(3) any endorsement upon or transfer of any such debenture:

Provided that the Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
direct that the exemption under this section, or any part thereof, shall not apply
to such class or classes of co-operative societies, or to such categories of
instruments, as may be specified in the notification and upon issuance of such
notification, the co-operative societies or instruments, so notified, shall be deemed
to fall within the scope of clauses (b) and (c) of sub-section (1) of section 17 of
the Registration Act, 1908, and shall, accordingly, be subject to compulsory
registration under the said Act."

Short title
and
commencement.

Amendment
in section 37
of Punjab
Act 25 of
1961.



PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ.(EXTRA), NOVEMBER 4, 2025

(KRTK 13, 1947 SAKA)
668

3. In the principal Act, in section 38 in sub-section (3), in clause (d), at the
end, for the sign ".", the sign ":" shall be substituted and thereafter, the following
proviso shall be added, namely:-

"Provided that the Government may also, by notification, withdraw, vary,
or restrict any such remission or exemption granted under this section, whether
generally or in respect of any class or classes of co-operative societies, or for
any category of instruments."

Sd/-
B.B.S. TEJI,

Principal Secretary to Government of Punjab,
Department of Legal and Legislative Affairs.

Amendment
in section 38
of Punjab
Act 25 of
1961.

3546/11-2025/Pb. Govt. Press, S.A.S. Nagar




