The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Second Amendment) Act, 1970

Act 23 of 1970

Keyword(s):
Manufacturer, Excisable Goods, Liquor

Amendments appended: 4 of 1971, 6 of 1972, 30 of 1972, 13 of 1973, 5 of 1976,
13 of 1979, 23 of 1983, 23 of 1984, 7 of 1985, 19 of 1986, 5 of 1989, 1 of 1990,
16 of 1997, 7 of 1998, 22 of 1999, 13 of 2000, 16 of 2001, 4 of 2018, 22 of 2018

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




E UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 1970

(U. P. Acr No. 23 oF 1970)' +

¥ *[Authoritative English Text of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Dwitiya Sanshodhan)
1 ) Adhiniyam, 1970.] :

AN
ACT

’fuf ther to amend the U. P. Excise Act, 1910, for the purposes hereinafter appearing

It is hereby enacted in the Twenty-first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:— '

; 1. This Act may be callcd the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Second Amendment)  Short title.
Act, 1970. ' N

2. In section 3 of the U. P. Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter referrcd to asthe  Amendment of
principal Act, after clause (20), the following new clause shall be inserted, namely: %‘:‘"g‘ 3 I; &‘5
' of 1910, -

“(20-a) ‘cultivation’, with its grammatical variations, means the raising
of a plant from seed, and includes the tending or protecting of a plant
during its growth;”.

3. For section 57 of the principal Act, the following section shall be subs- /Substitution  of ~ _
tituted, namely :— : - , mew section for” N Lot
1 section 57. : “d
“57.  Every person who owns or occupies any land or building and the
Duty of owaer, agent of such owner or occupier, on or in Which there
occupier, lekhpal 1S been any unlaw‘ful manufacture of any intoxicant,
or village police-  or any unlawful cultivation or collection of any plants
man to report  from which an intoxicating drug can be produced,
certain matlers.  and gvery owner of a vessel or vehicle in which any
intoxicant is manufactured contrary to the provisions of this Act, and
every lekhpal or village policeman in whose jurisdiction such land or build-
ing is situate or vessel or vehicle is found, shall, in the absence of reason-
able excuse, be bound to give notice of the same to a Magistrate or to an
officer of the excise, police or land revenue department immediately the
same¢ comes to his knowledge.”

i 4. For section 60 of the principal Act, the following section shail be subs- n§ubsﬂs';g§°ﬂ o
§ tituted, namely:— , : sec‘fion 60fo o

“60. Whoever, in contraveation of this Act or of any rule or order
Penalty for un- made under this Act, or of any licence, permit or pass

lawfual import’ N ’S r o
export, transport, obtained under this Ac
manufacture, pos-

session, sale etc.

(@) imports, exports, transports or possesses any intoxicant; or
(b) manufactures any intoxicant ; or
(c) cultivates any hemp plant (cannabis sativa); or

(d) collects or sells any portion of the hemp plant (cannabis sativa)
from which any intoxicating drug can be manufactured; or

(e) constructs or works any distillery or brewery; or

*(For Statement of Objects and Reasons, pleasesee Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, dated
e May 2, 1970.) : :

¢ (Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on May 1, 1970 and by the
Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on May 15, 1970.

(Received the Assent of the Governor on June 4, 1970 under Article 200, of the Constitution
b of India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, dated June 6, 1970.)

Price 85 Paise.




2

N (f1 ) uses, keeps or has in his Possession any materials, st
!mplements or apparatus whatsoever for the purpose of Mmanu -
~any intoxicant other than tari; or - factur;

(g) removes any intoxicant from any Vdistillery brewe
1 ! ¢ om 3 : ) Ty or wa:
house licensed, established or continued under this Ac%, ; or *

(k) bottles anyA liquor for purposes of sale; or

(@) sells any intoxicant, 8ave in the case provided for by section 1
/ _or : ,

() taps, or draws tari, from any fari-producing tree in aréas notif
under section 42, '

shall be punished with impr_isonmaﬁt which may extend to 1y
Years or with fine or with both :

Provided that in the case of conviction for an offence under clause {
a sentence of not less than three months’ imprisonment shall, in the absen
of special and adequate reasons to the contrary to be mentioned in t}
judgment of the Court, be passed.”

Substitution of = §, For sectio

new section for tituted, namely

n 61 of the principal Act the following section shall be sup
section 61,

61, If any licensed vendor, or any person in ‘his employ an

Penalty for unlawful acting on his behalf—
selling to persons under

eighteen, or employing ’
persons under eighteen

or women.

(@) in contravention of section 22 sells or delivers any liquor o

intoxicating drug to any person apparently under the age of eightee:
years; or

(b in Contravention of section 23 empioys Or permits to be emp
loyed on any part of his licensed premises referred to in that section,
any person under the age of eighteen years or any woman;

he shall be punished with fine which may extend to one thousand rupees.’

Substitution  of 6. For section 62 of the principal Act, the following section shall be Subs.
oW . section for  firygeq namely :— '

section 62,

“62. Whoever renders or attempts to render fit for human con.
Penalty for rendering - SUmption any spirit whether manufactured in India_m
denatured spirit fit for not which has been denatured, or has in his possessior
buman consumption.  py denatured spirit which has been . renderec
fit for human consumption or in respect of which any attempt has been
made to render it so fit shall be punished with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to one year or with fine which may extend to two

thousand rupees, or with, both.”

Substitution fof 7. For section 64 of the principal Act, the following section shall be subs-
new section for ; —
soction 64. tituted, namely: .
“64. Whoever, being the holder of a licence, permit or pass granted
Penalty for certain  under this Act, or being in the employ of such holder
ﬁ;{“m or bis  and acting on his behalf—
(a) fails to produce such licence, permit or pass on the demand
of any Excise Officer or of any other officer duly empowered to make
such demand; or

(b) in any case not prévided for in section 60, wilfully coniravenes
any rule made under section 40; or

(¢) wilfully does or omits to do anything in breach of any of the
conditions of the licence, permit or pass not otherwise provided
for in this Act, ,

shall be punishable for each such offence with fine which may
extend to five hundred rupees.”’ :




!

3

1. 8. For section 65 of the principal Act, the following section shall be subs-
g @ tituted, namely:— :

2 “65. (1) If any chemist, druggist, apothecary or keeper of dispen-
. Penalty ~ for  sary allows any intoxicant which has not been bong fide
: X 0 medicated for medicinal purposes to be consumed on
g?gmm P his business premises by any person' not employed
) in his business, he shall be punished with imprisonment
for a term which may extend to six months or with fine which may extend
to two thousand rupees, or with both.

d | : (2) If any person not einployed as aforesaid consumes any such inioxi-
» cant on such premises, he shall be punished with fine which may extend
o § ~ to five hundred rupees.”

9. For section 68 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substi-
tuted, namely:—

“68. Whoever is guilty of any act or intentional omission in contra-
Penalty for of. ~Vention of any of the provisions of this Act, or of any
ences not other- rule or order made under this Act and not otherwise
wise provided for. ' provided for in this Act, shall be punished for each
such act or omission with fine which may extend to five hundred
rupees.” -

10. In section 69 of thé principal Act, for the proviso thereto the following
@ Provisos shall be substituted, namely:— ' :

“‘Provided that in the case of conviction for a second or subsequent

offence under clause (@) or any of the clauses (¢) to (j) of section 60, section

: 62, section 63 or section 65, a Senlence of imprisonment for a term of not

r & less than one month with or without fine, and in the case of conviction

n § for a second or subsequent offence under clause (b) of section 60, a sentence

= of imprisonment for a term of not less than six months, with or without

fine, shall in the absence of special and adequate reasons to the 'contrary
to be mentioned in the judgment of the court, be passed :-

1 Provided further that nothing in this section shall prevent any offence
- R which might otherwise have been tried summarily under Chapter XXII
of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898, from being so tried.””

“§ 1L After section 69 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be
§ inserted, namely:— ,

“69-A. (1) Whenever any person  is convicted of ap offence
Demand for sec- punishable ~ under the  provisions of clause ),
%},‘i‘?nfﬁf Cagggi‘;: clause (c), clause (e), clause (f) or clause (h) of section
sion of certgin 00, or Section 62, the court convicting such person

may, at the time of passing the sentence on such person,
order him to execute a bond for a sum proportionate to his mean
or without sureties, to abstain from the commission of any offence punish-

able under the said provisions during such period not exceeding three vears
as it may direct. ‘

A R I |

(2) The provisions of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898, shall
mutatis mutandis apply to all matters connected with such bond as if it
Wwere a bond to keep the peace ordered to be executed under section 106

. | of the said Code.
. 69-B. Whoever abets an offence punishable under this Act shall, whether

: . such offence be or be not committed in consequence of
mty for abet such abetment and notwithstanding anything contained

w

1 o in section 116 of the Indian Penal Code, be
; on conviction for such abetment with the same punishment ag
£ vided for the principal offence.

punished
Is pro-

69-C. (1) Where an offence under this Act has been committed by a

. company, every person who at the time the offence was
Saﬁn?:s.oeby com committed was in charge of, and wa

Substitution of
new section fof
sectiqn 65,

Substitution of
new section for
section 68,

Amendment of
section 69,

Insertion of new
sections 69-A,
69-B and 69-C.




i

DO 4

Provided fhaai nothing contained in ‘this sub-section shall render any =
such persongliable to any punishment if he proves that the offence was
committed *without his knowledge or that he exercised all due diligence

. to prevent the -commission of such offence. '

=% (2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), where an

offence under this Act has been committed by a company and it is proved

that the offence has been committed with the consent or connivance of,

or is attributable to any neglect on the part of, any disector, manager, -
secretary, managing agent, secretaries and treasurers, or other officer of

the company, such director, manager, Secretary or managing agent,

secretaries and treasurers, or other officer shall also be deemed to be

guilty of that offence and shall be liable to be proceeded against and

punished accordingly. ~

Explanation—-For the purposes of this section—

(@) ‘company’ means any body corporate and includes a firm or other
association of individuals ; and

(b) “director’, in relation to a firm, means a partner in the firm.
Amendment of 12.  For sub-section (1) of section 70 of the principal Act, the following sub-

-section 70. section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) No Magistrate shall take cognizance—

(@) of an affence punishable under section 60, section 63 or section
65, except on his own knowledge or suspicion or on the complaint
or report of an Excise Officer; or

(b) of an offence punishable under section 64, section 66, section-

67 or section 68 except on the complaint or report of the Collector

or an Excise Officer authorised by him by a general or special order
in that behalf.”

Insertion _ of 13. After section 71 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
new section 1A 4 corted, namely:— :

“71-A. The provisions of sections 337, 339 and 339-A of the Code «
. of Criminal Procedure, 1898, shall apply in relation
E _rov:sxon;oregael;ci- to offences punishable under this Act as they apply’x’n
1'?’3 ;’;’p,y“ to relation to offences mentioned in the said section 337.
offences punish-
able under the
Act, -

PSUP—A. P. 134 Genl. -(Eeg)—1970. 1,823 (M.)




LA 1# 7

gere wgT gaarew (qda dgtas) sfafwa, 1970
( ¢ wdw atataas dear 4, 1971)

(s Rw famw & 7 fei= 21 feawa, 1970 fo Far ST AW
qfweg & faams 23 fea=, 1970 §o %7 dz% # Ty FFaT 1)

(w0 wfaa” F 9T=8% 200 F T Tsaare T faiw 4 sEd, 1971
%m’k@rgﬁrmﬁwaauﬁaﬁaaaﬁﬁmmm T # feAiw 6 Fak, 1971
£o @Y swafoa g 1) ‘

dfae § 79T 47 ¥ fefaa T £ AR & Frdws aell & wew § wa-fve

-

£ SRR T AT TGN T ® TG A Lo 0 TS T, 1910 F1 ARG guE
v ot U arafaa A ¥ e 76 & ,
' areT qUIIen & Ra a8 § gaegra freffe sfaf s s g —
17z wfafem g WA GRTE (T i) sfafew, 1970 b aw
e R, 1910, el Al aw wfafer ST, W AT 20 F -
avara, Pt BT T A, R — T a2
- wg0eqar 14 # it frdt maw T # wam, frafy gr 20w @
' o ofeEw #r gRfyg F@ ® UST @@L 00
| ?ﬁ?:q{ﬁ;“'ﬁm'mﬁmﬁamukmzoﬂm 4) % .
st Firel witew aeg #Y Few ¥ @A w 5fa- price 03 Tasc
5 fug +@ ¥ wha 7, waW oy ¥ wofie w1 WE R sa ‘
 Frifrs sEa ¥ fear ot e § 9 Frfafe awl o) s @@
7q g o< fafaw & &1 a4 T frar v g:
(%) o e, forar $72 a1 sieifow Ga & €1 99 7
fordtqar ;
(@) waria frarfedl 3t amr sifes fefa foms s
It T gfteae Wi AFa-we AT E;
(7) s SE-E; AR
(7) #7E T°7 GIQ 9, ST ST TLF B g F, ww-fea 7
A G '

(gEw s Tt & foarn & fad o &30 30 faaray, 1970 o T AWIY
wamTey Twe Afey 1)



,
o

Stqaea ag 1% 37 Ivarwr Y faY ara § g wifem 75 awsr s iy
ST GTHT AT q=_T 7 T a1 7, s urar a3 feeft fafore
aa 1, Wy & gada & fod, fedt a e frt o, e

20-4r (1) afs @qw wsy ar @ feft wm @ @aw §
(fdr o em arar o wa-fade da s )
T NMa % wawd qu 20 & IeaTa
(4) # sfiw &g afuge srd Y s &y
va-fria a4 & w59 7 gm0 14 & wehw wtegsn a7 @) swfieg =9
4 9941 T8 RGFRI AT WAl & e Tgd 2e, ot sfugaar € fifae
ferary s, STy Y <17 @Ay €

(2) 4 wa-feda &7 & d5g F vy @R aval faa) g,
TATT ArA T 1 g7 ar3e g, T 14§ wfe ar g 20 €9t
ST () & gary sfagamr 7 sffen aws awn, wdd s
FRp A § e w) frafafer g a1 Sa% satEl & ol aed
7 7@, 31 ITHT Amara-feata at afiags #06 F wAm A RS gz aw
a1 fafoef=or &7 gt 3:— .

(%) sfcwear i & geew;

TI-A9y & FIEH
nqaTg, wife

(@) ao-fieg &@ 9 76 3 a1 fEm w3 T G
(7) ww-fida da ¥ 7oA 9 g6l ~ :
() o=t (Fa= e Y T 7 ) q@w § Ay foed ey
% fo3 wrew aeq # grawwwat 3y ; .
(%) 3 =fw fome o e 17, 18, 21 51X 24 3 s
SHECE R : L
() ¥, g% ar aeqam g wo-frdw @ ¥, W, ar At ¥
gIFT S a1 G S
() =, dmfas, dfas, gteda a1 ofos sqom
(3) feit Qe g an farfasiiaor & dda F 5t STaRT(2) # i @
T, AT TIHY, N & Fasi gra v avr an fae sk g,
T SrfTdr g, 1 fafase fsat s, 6 o a1 oefe R W )
AT F GHAT § 4
(4) Swarr (1) ¥ sfufeee afagaar $ o) w fd 99 01, @
%mﬁwm{é’a%ﬁ'mm&ﬁﬁ.mﬁ,aﬂmagw-
ﬁ&a%awmn%,ﬁm,ﬂ&aqmﬁmma,sﬁtézm
ATEHH HT JEANT 77 & GG 7 3 L6 Y T F T F770T 5
qaw,wmmﬁmwﬁmmwﬁﬁﬂﬁ%ﬁm
a1 AT BT WY AT FY, 7 ¥ T TR W 2 gawy 1} (af
FILET) T, et dm, Foeg qrEEEETD A7 ATHER W oWR @
ﬁsﬁaﬁ%#ﬁaﬁamasﬁamfmm%@ﬁgq 1, w15 sfawv
T AT R
- (5) afx swarr (4) & sl 1€ arede @ e a@ @
\ AT A9 19 FY AT T &7 T 99 SF FA0T S
TS FCHI Q1 MAFTY AT AT 771 faqw wrdw gra Frsw 317
Feftaor 3—zg wfatm & srow $94 qa wfafow i @ 14 ararr 20 9
ST (4 )% et AT A Wl S g, 1R ang-awy ) qaeaifag
To qlo Tretfaade M Soq, 1947 & 710 ¥ awmd 7q fry I TFR
%mwﬁimaﬁ%ﬁgﬁmmﬁm%awa@aﬁgw
ST 6T 91 A1 99 o aA et S @9 Y F 9w 9, W
TEAF TAT FA WEaF 5§ U axFR grT Guiaw a7 faefed

- TF fer e
Fo Jo HRW ‘ - s N -
dearil, 1970 I IT THES (FAT JAT TLFT) TEARIA, 1970 gaa
w1 frT faeea ooy siar

dte g0 o dro—qgo d10327 s (FW)—1971~-) .34 + 50 S.S. {(#e°)



- 39T yiq wrArEs (G@wa) Afafrre, 1972
(ga= gxor wfafqow =1 6, 1972)

[SarsEnframand f@iw 6 aad 1972 $o T IW waxr o afkwg |

TqiE 10 TATY 1972 Fo 1 I3w | @i oAt |
[“nea &1 dfaa’ & S7eeT 200 & wana Teawts A G 19 S,

(072 $o Tt wYHla TITA FY AAT IHT TITRT ATHTL HATHIW T H fain 22 AT,
t972% o wY i gt | | B

e & srpesT 47 W Sfeotaa Ter i Afa® T i ® aqgae q
rafeY & T AT JEET A gF S ® IeI ¥ FARET NiAAw TS R,
1910 FT FUAT VN T, AUT IqY Ay fawdl w1 wwEEd ¥R F 6

} sitafaaa -
WA O & arded ad # freteten sfufrom g o § —

s v TR

“/3/5‘7/0

3

s eragad
(TIBT ABTHR )
. S 939, qe€9%

1—ug wiafran o 2w grarge (d@etaa) sfafaw, 1072 FEA | sfarca am
1__gamde wfwAw qraEw Qs 1910, f¥ w@ AW wfufaw S AY g 14w
fary 14 e @ st - - . fame @
3——v wfafran € ara 20 §, s (4) Few @ @ q 20 #
, dataw
4——v gfufran @ ara 20-g Wi 2040 fawrr @ s o 2090
R 20t &
sﬁﬁm%mms%mﬁm&rﬁaamw&mm,m:— Tq WA 6-%
“geam vl ¥ waa § fadwgeww S
37-%( 1)—<ou aww wagwn K- |
aTE W (%) JocsRA qr Iaw frdt W # v agi A fed wew
aa, fata, afe- arg & v ar fafa & fafeg scasd@r g @
e o (@) et s 7 oy w1 e v et &1
(2) ara 20 ¥ FyEHl qT SFAET TWE T fEAt, T AW, wiferge gTa
JoT 92N O Su fedy fafesr @ m ga ® safya sraa = faqw gt AT,
73 s, afx o &, &, whge & fafeer e o, & wefld @@ g0 Rkl
sqfrrdl gTCT felt wraw aeg 1 ar ay wafaag w1 K an Gy At F s @ g
A sfergaa F fafass €1 o, *61 § vad wr fady wT gt )
Price 05 Paise,

PR

[ @iz srwrea & fog gaar feai® 6 WA, 19725 0 FTATHT warreor s I |

|



I 92w
qeaRw et
21, 1971 &1
frea

2

(3) Sqar@ (1) ¥ weha fedt s g & wraw, fata @ af@gs =
fafirg wY3 B ToT avETe W nfEa w1 A Swaw (2) & weiw  fwey are ag
DT | 1@ A ffog 7] 1 Jaa ofE w1 5w T | wefasy w1 wtaw s
oot A AT F wAE # e s qwa g, A freafafan @ s | @ gQ aw-

d

ara X fafas Sl @ agd www fwar o awr §—
(=) i am, faen ¥ T AtEfTs a0 & ©v | fow da A faaw,
(@) waria frafaat # q@r sfas feafa, foed =@ 9%
o gfte-aw wie s @ A g,
() e sA-w, A
(a) *E o dma qeq TET LRI F 7T § 9 g ® awE g
Wg%%mmﬁ&ﬂammu@aﬁa@mm forad
T ATHTT B AR ARY § g ot o fermd srene o s fafre o wer s s
mﬁ%faquwa;mm,aﬁafmmmal
(4) ufe aeqw gaT R a1 I felt wrw (ol st T wra § marfds
e Tl T ) B ey § I if & wraw § guura (2) ¥ wER W9 A
g S ® A at wafRy & ¥ wed § g (1) ¥ seiw wfagem @ @
etz & # s 4% S @ et & e @R gy S wiegEn q fafes #t
amm, W A w A ) |
(5) fireft e Faie S & G § U OIS, T A frawl T sraan g
mﬁﬁuuﬁﬂmm(l)%mmm(z)%mmiﬁ@a
aRE TG 2 a7 St wvew aegul | N feelty A {reafafer oo oI qeET &

%) ufeen ¥l & w7, ,

(@) wo A A7 § wR T 7 faw v T R,

(w) wa frdw A ¥ TR AW A, o

(o) wwaefy (e o o TO0 |) sk s s fored Earee & W

(¥) s 17, 18, 21 @ 24 ¥ RN AEAW TEW wWR AQ O,
(=)-=, @amwﬁmwﬁiﬂﬁaﬂ, ot PR PR AW

RN, v
(v) whefirs, defs, S, st urfers sl
(6) faeit deit 52 m (afacie & qw & N FruT (5) ¥ wiw @ wm,
wmmﬁﬁﬁmmmﬁﬁwmm, o afasd @, S
fafee Tt W, @ @ ofRe fd W A s w1 wwt g1

(7) swara (4) & wiwfee wfage st a3 fed @ T, mu&ﬁm‘ fam &

maﬁﬁwﬁwmﬂ,mﬁ,aﬁm’quﬁw—m aa

& fam Afrw goe faeea T a0 & #ix 2 agua e H sEwra ot &

aow & 3w gaata @, af 98 @, T e S 3w, feg AEROETQ WY QX

freaw & @vrg ¥ ourg 35 €A f el & 9 g W g fe 2 A
‘(s)aa:mam(ﬂ%m”ﬁaﬁi s freea fn s @ sdeRaTd
mm@ﬁma@ﬁmfmmmmﬁm T GTHIL AT WG
W(mmﬁm)mm%mﬁwmﬁiﬂ%:” v
T TR TS (FWE) weARY, 1971 TEEW foreea o st €0

freggogodto ~—godlo 51 FALH (S1)——1972-—1,859+50 (o) I




I Naw v (aa) sfafmw, 1972
(Fwx wIw atafaas dwar 30, 1972)

[Fax w3 faur @ | favis 27 gtd, 1972 o aun Iwx R faum afimg
7 faatw 2 ey, 1972 $o A Tow 7 wiwpa fear 1]

[WT =T dfqa € AeST 200 F swRTe TATS | faiw 119w, 1972 $o
o Sftpfa g & qur IR ST GTRT ST Toe § faviw 16 stTeA, 1972
$o #Y swtfare gt 1]

geTEdE WfaFAw TFATEH 42, 1910 FT WAL NIgT FH & 59U
gfufazs
WIRA TOE & agad ag § Feafafes wfufmn qaa s g—

1—ag wiafraw IaT x3w qrans (dnem) afafraw, 1972 sge@m | dfere A
2—aATgEe Sfads QRS €9T, 1910, fod ant wwlafafawwgr v g, 1 9o dlo G
ara 21 W, Iu% sfaaawns e ot @ (3) fee faagem o g weat 4, 1910
&1 I 21 w1
e
3—uw wfafraw &t a2 24 & o Feafofaa oo agr @ om, safg— @€ 9T 24
“24-%F—(1) WU 31 % IrEE & AT @A gU, IWETY ngEa fe ST
famt o & N o el 8w 7 (ondw oa gl §
din AR S X IEF TET I & o, aqEr J9 o
R W R & age swdw & fag) gl ¢
fiwre 2o Wfaﬁmﬁ{ﬁéﬁmaﬂ%tzm
fwfar & 7 swdw gt sEAST
wpa wC awaT ( o
(2) foelt = & ddlw § gear (1) & 1w 91 o ar s &
witpa frd @ & R AT, Qe i [\ A TR gl F g
% fed frdslt o ) ek fet & fafora sgen & ity v o o sfies
TR AE gEW 4
(3) =gl 3st ety & fou et A F dda § g (1) F s ow @
Ffw STEA EPa $F w1 AWE g A Taw 0 srraea & fog we sifag
w1 wE w1 ahm gEa ety
(4) @A ¥ ssw gwifas fraTier & fafre o witpa fed
WA & "ET H WO 25 FX 30 AT AR 39 ¥ vy e & Jwaey
T TR BE LA 5w T T v 24 F wew gwifaw fasafawr &
faferer 1§ wTEa witga fod 0 & daw § SwEW § 1
4%Wmﬁmﬂ4oaﬁm(3)ﬁﬁmé}m: gt 40 &7
_ e
5-—IAY Wam uFHTEH (EWYA) A=, 1972, Uasgwy fawem fewr IET WRw
AT 2 AYYRT  HEqt
13, 1972 7
_ fraw
(= &tz TN & faaww & fod gaan famim 27 a:ati, 1972 $o F¥ AR
sreaTee we af@d 1) - : . . o e .
R CEE SR N " Price 05 Paise

PR v #

Tto gdHo ::_r:o fo—=To Gt 163 FATT (¥70) (fgo)——1972~~1,834+50 S.S. (o) 1




i TRaRRE
: l K e RN - I Z’{
THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1973 / Z.Lg
[ U. P. Act no. 13 oF 1973 _

* duthoritative English Text of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Sanshodhan) . /Z
[ Adhiniyam, 1973] @o

AN

ACT

further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910
Fr 1s HEREBY enacted in the Twenty-fourth Year of the Republic of India

as follows :— ‘ .
1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, Short title.
1973.

2. In section 62 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter ~Amendment of
referred to as the principal Act, for the words “imprisonment for a term which SSC?(I’{‘/ 5% ?S;l(;j P,
may extend to one year or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees "< * ° '
or with both”, the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“imprisonment for a term which may extend to two yvears ard in the
absence of special and adequate reasons to the contrary to be mentioned
in the judgment of the court, shall not be less than six months, and
shall also be punishable with fine which may extend to two thousand
rupees.”

$. In section 69, of the principal Act, in the first proviso thereto,— ’ Amendment of
section 69.
(i) the words and figures “section 62" shall be omitted ;

(ii) for the words, figures, letters and brackets “clause (b) of section
60, the words, figures, letters and brackets “clause (b) of section 60 or
section 627 shall be substituted ; and »

(iii) for the words “six months” the words “one year” shall be
substituted. ,

(iv) the words “or without”, wherever occurring, shall be omitted.

*por Statement of Objects and Reasons please see Urtar Paradesh Gazette (Extraordi-
nary), dated January 22, 1973.

(Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Paradesh Legislative Council onJanuary 19,1973 and by
the U'tar Paradesh Legislative Assembly on March 13, 1973).
(Received the Assent of the Governor on April 15, 1973 uander Article 200 of the Consti-

‘iléi?g%f) India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary dated April

oqAogsTto=-Totlo 32 TATH (FW0)==1973-=1,671 (o) 1




THE ©TTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) (RE-ENACTMENT
AND VALIDATION) ACT, 1976 :

(U. P. Act ~o. 5 oF 1976)
*{Author tative Englich Text of the Uttar Pradesh Abkari (Sanshodhan) (Punch
Adhiniyam Aur Véidhikaran) Adhiniyam, 1976]
AN
ACT

to veenact and validate the United Provinces Excise (Amendment) Act, 1972

 WHERTAS it is expedient in the public interest to provide for the adoption
of the system of grant of licences prevailing in respect of country liquor with
necessary modifications for the grant of licences in respect of foreign liquor ;

~Anp wHEREAs the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1972
(U. P. Ordinance no. 13 of 1972), which was replaced by the Uttar Pradesh

Excise (Amendment) Act, 1972 (U. P. Act no. 30 of 1972), was adjudicated by
the High Court of Judicature at Allahabad in its judgment in Sheo Pat Rai

and Others versus State of Uttar Pradesh and Others, reported in 1972
Allahabad Law journal Reports, 1000, to be beyond the competency of the
State Legislature ;

AND WHEREAS subsequently, in the case of Nashirwar and Others versus .

State of Madhya Pradesh and Others, reported in All India Reporter, 1975
Supreme Court, 360, the Supreme Court has upheld the power of the State
Legislature to make provision for holding of public auction for the grant of
right or privilege to possess and sell foreign liquor ;

AND WHEREAS it has become necessary to repeal and re-cnact the Uttar
Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 1972 (U. P. Act no. 30 of 1972);

Now, THEREFORE, it is hereby enacted in the Twenty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India, as foliows —

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
‘(Re-enactment and Validation) Act, 1976.

*For swiement 0 {ojects und Reisoas, please see Utizr Pradesh Gazetie (Extreordizary)
dated Apsit 7, 1375)

{(Fassed in Hin
Uttar Pradeshk Legis

(Teoeived .

o Assembiy of Ayl 5, 1976 and by the

197, under Article 203 of the Co-sing
o Cazeiseo {Evraordiooryy dakd Apri 1g,

Short title,

BRICE 10 PAl




2

Re-enactment of 2. The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 1972 is hereby, with
gf- 113-7?“ 0.30 effect from August 16, 1972, repealed and re-enacted with the following modi-
’ fications :—

(i) Section 1 shall be renumbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and
after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the following sub-section shall
be inserted :—

“(2) It shall be deemed to have been in force ever since the com-
mencement of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, and accordingly,
all references to the State Government in the amendments made in
that Act by this Act shall, in relation to the period before
January 26, 1950, be construed as references to the Provincial
Government.” ;

(ii) for section 3, the following section shall be substituted :—

Insertion of new “3. After section 24 of the principal Act, the following sections
SZZC%OHS 24-A and shall be inserted, namely :— :

“24-A. (1) Subject to the provisions of section 31, the
Grant of exclusive or Excise Commissioner may grant to any person
other privilege in respect  a licence or licences for the exclusive or other

of foreign liquor. privilege,—
(a) of manufacturing or of supply by wholesale, or of
both ; or

(b) of manufacturing or of supplying by wholesale, or of
both and selling by retail ; or
(c¢) of selling by wholesale (to  wholesale or retail
vendors) ; or
(d) of selling by retail at shops (for consumption ‘off' the
premises only) ;

any foreign liquor in any locality.

(2) The grant of licence or licences under clause (d) of
sub-section (1) in relation to any locality shall be without pre-
judice to the grant of licences for the retail sale of foreign liquor
in the same locality in hotels and restaurants for consumption
in their premises. ‘

(3) Where more licences than one are proposed to be granted
under clause (d) of sub-section (1) in relation to any locality
for the same period, advance intimation of the proposal shall be
given to the prospective applicants for every such licence.

(4) The provisions of section 25, and proviso to section 39
shall apply in relation to grant of a licence for an exclusive or
other privilege under this section as they apply in respect of the
grant of a licence for an exclusive privilege under section 24.

“24-B. For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared—

Removalof doubts.  (a) that the State Government has an exclusive right
or privilege of manufacture and sale of country liquor
and foreign liquor ; -

g (b) that the amount described as licence fee in clause
(c) of section 41 is in its essence the rental or considera-
tion for the grant of such right or pfivilege by the State
Government ;

(c) that the Excise Commissioner as the head of the
Excise Department of the State shall be deemed, while
determining or realising such fee, to act for and on

L2

behalf of the State Government’.
- (ifi)- after section 3, the following section shall be inserted :—

“8-A. For section 30 of the principal Act, the following section
shall be substituted and be deemed always to have been substituled,

namelyv —
'30. (1) Instead of or in addition to any duty leviable
Substitut on of sew sac-  urder the Chapter, the State Government or
iion for section 39, on its behall the Excise Commissioner may

accept pavment of a sum in consideration of
the grant of licence for any exclusive or other privilege under
section 24 or section 24-A.




3

(2) The sum payable under sub-section (1) may be deter-

mined either by auction or by calling tenders or otherwise’.

(iv) after section 4, the following section shall be inserted :—

“4-A. In section 41 of the 'principal Act, for clause(c), the
Amendment of following clause shall be substituted and be deemed
section 41. always to have been substituted, namely :—

‘() prescribing the scale of fees or manner of fixing the
fees payable for any licence, permit or pass including any consi-
deration for the grant of any exclusive or other privilege granted
under section 24 or section 24-A or for storing of any intoxicant.

Esxplanation (1)—Fees may be prescribed under this sub-
clause at different rates for different classes of licences, permits,
passes or storage, and for different areas.

(2) The manner of fixing fee or consideration shall include
auction or invitation of tenders or both’.”

3. In section 40 of the principal Act—

(a) in sub-section (1), the following proviso thereto shall be inserted,
namely :—

“Provided that the Uttar Pradesh Licensing under the Surcharge
Fee System Rules, 1968 made by the Excise Commissioner, Uttar
Pradesh, with the previous sanction of the State Government, as
amended by the Excise Commissioner, Uttar Pradesh, from time to
time, before the commencement of this Act, shall, until altered or
repealed by the State Government by rules made under this section,
be deemed to be and always to have been as valid and effective as
if the said rules were duly made by the State Government under
this section.” ;

(b) in sub-section (2), for clause (c), the following clause shall be
B substituted, namely :—
2 “(c) prescribing the manner in which appeals or revisions shall
- be presented and the procedure for dealing with such appeals and

o

revisions ;”. :

4. Notwithstanding any judgment, decree or order of any court to the
contrary, anything done or purporting to be done and any action taken or pur-
porting to have been taken under any provision of the Uttar Pradesh Excise
(Amendment) Act, 1972, before the commencement of this Act, shall be
: deemed to be and always to have been as valid as if the provisions of this
Act were in force at all material times.

4 U.P.Ordi 5. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) (Re-enactment and Vali-
?}nf;%o' 15 dation) Ordinance, 1976 is hereby repealed.

1 ) (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under
the aforesaid Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of this Act, as if this Act had come into force on

February 28, 1976.

PSUP—A. P. 179 Sa. (Vidayka)—2126—1976—1827+50 S.S. (M)

Amendment of
section 40,

validation.

Repeal and sav.
ings.




e e T L




L
NS
1?@;5"/__

e o ,_ L Jedl I8

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1979
"(U. P. Acr No. 13 or 1979). [

' fAuthoritative English text of the Uttar Pradesh Aabkari (Sanskodhan)! i i
t Adhiniyam, 1979 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 18 of 1979] : ta..ﬂ-—g S ARREAL L'
AN =Y :
ACT (W WYW y “‘.‘;
further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 % wu< Had, aele !;gs-
It 1s HEREBY enacted in the Thirtieth Year of the Republic of Indiaas ¢ —— - "
- follows :— . ~
: 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Short titie and &
- Act, 1979. : ) 7 Commencement.

(2) Sections 3 and 5 shall be deemed to have come into force on August 16,
1972, sections 2, 4, 6, 9 and 10 shall be deemed to have come into force on
November 30, 1978 and the remaining sections shall come into, force at once.

2. In section 28 of the U. P, Excise Act, 1910 (hereinafter referred to as  Amendment of
- the principal Act) in sub-section (3), in clause (a), for the figure and .f:g?ox;’zs ot;U.&.
. words “2 per litre” occurring against item 2 (a) in the table, the figure and 71979 0.

. words “4 per litre” shall be substituted. o

; 8. In section 30 of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the follow- Amendment of
' ing sub-section shall be substituted, namely :— section 30.
“(2) The sum payable under sub-section (1)’ may either be fixed
by auction o inviting tenders or otherwise or be assessed on the basis
of the sales made or quota lifted under the licence or partly fixed and
partly assessed in the aforesaid manner.” -

4. In section 40 of the principal Act, in subsection (2); after clause (1)’ Amendment of
~ the following clause shall be inserted, namely :— ‘ section 40.
“(m) for the grant of rewards to officials, afficers or informers by the
Collector out of and up to fifty per cent of composition fee and by the
Magistrate trying the case, out of and up tq fifty per cent of fine recovered
under the Act.” :
5. In section 41 of the principal Act, in clause (¢)— :ctqendﬂent of
section 41,
(i) before Explanation (1), the following proviso shall be inseried
namely :— , .
“Provided that nothing contained in this clause shall be cons-
trued to prevent the State Government from levying by notification
made from time to time, any fee, including vend as part of con«
sideration for the granting of any such privilege.”

(ii) for Explanation (2), the following Explanation shall be substi-
tuted, namely :— .

“(2) The manner of fixing such fee or consideration includes any
one or more of the following manners, namely—
(i) auction, .
(ii) invitation of tenders,

(iif) assessment on the basis of sales made or quota lifted
under the licence, permit ar pass”’

For Statement of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh - i-
nary), dated December 27, 1978. ’ ¢ ar Pradesh Gazefte (Bxtraoedi

(Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on March 27,1979 and b
the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on April 16, 1979). 1979 and by

[Received the assent of the Governor on April 18, 1979 under Article 200, of the C
\stution of India and was published in Part I(a) of tl’le Legislative Supple en"t 2f t!\:: %IS-
Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, dated April 18, 1979}, pplem vttar

1

Price ou Pai.




Amendment of 6. In section 60 of the principal Act, after sub-section (2), the following
section 60. sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(3) Whoever, in contravention of this Act or any rule or order made
thereunder, consumes any intoxicant, shall be punished with fine which
shall nct be less than five hundred rupees and which may extend to one
thousand rupees.”

Amendment of 7. In section 72 of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the following

section 72. sub-sections shall be substituted, namely :—
- “(2) Where anything or animal is seized under any provision of this
Act and the Collector is satisfied for reasons to be recorded that an
offence has been committed due to which such thing or animal as become
liable to confiscation under sub-section (1), he may order confiscation of
such thing or animal whether ar not a prosecution for such offence has
been instituted :

Provided that in the case of anything (except an intoxicant) or animal
referred to in sub-section (1), the owner thereof shall be given an option
to pay in lieu of its confiscation such fine as the Ccllector thinks ade-
quate not exceeding its market value on the date of its seizure.

(3) Where the Collector on receiving report of seizure or on inspection
of the seized thing, including any animal, cart, vessel or other conveyance,
is of the opinion that any such thing or animal is subject to speedy wear
and tear or natural decay or it is otherwise expedient in the public interest
so to do, he may order such thing (except and intoxicant) or animal to
be scld at the market price by auction or otherwise.

(4) Where any such thing or animals is sold as aforesaid, and—

(@) no order of confiscation is ultimately passed or maintained
by the Collector ‘under -sub-section (2) or on review under sub-
section (6) ; or .

(b) an order passed on appeal under sub-section (7). so requires ;
or

(¢) in the case of a prosecution being instituted for the offence in
respect of which the thing or the animal is seized, the order of the
Ccurt so requires ;

the sale proceeds after deducting the expensés of the sale shall be paid
to the person found entitled thereto.

(5) (a) No order of confiscation under this section shall be made
unless the owner thereof or the perscn from whom it is seized is given—

(i) a notice in writing informing him of the grounds on which
such confiscation is proposed ;

(ii) an opportunity of making a representation in writing within
such reasonable time as may be specified in the notice ; and

(iii) a reasonable opportunity of being heard in the matter.

(b) Without prejudice to the provisions of clause (a) no crder confis-
cating any animal, cart, vessel, or other conveyance shall be made if the
owner thereof proves to the satisfaction of the Collector that it was used
in carrying the contraband goods without the knowledge or connivance
of the owner, his agent, if any, and the person incharge cff the animal,
cart, vessel or other convevance and that each of them had taken all reason-
able and necessary precautions against such use.

'(6) Where on an application in that behalf being made to the Collector
within one month from any order of confiscation made under sub-
section (2), or as the case may be after issuing notice on his ~own
motion within one month from the order under the sub-section refusing
confiscation to the owner of the thing or animal seized or to the person
from whose possession it was seized, to show cause why the order
should not ‘be reviewed, and after giving him a reasonable opportunity

\ of being heard, the Collector is satisfied that the order suffers from a
8 mistake apparent on the face of the record including any mistake of
law, he may pass such order on review as he thinks fit, oo




(7)' Any person aggrieved by an order of the cenfiscation uader sub-
section (2) or sub-section (6) may, within one month from: the date of
the communication to him of such order, appeal to such judicial authority
as the State Government may appoint in this behalf "and the judicial
authority shall, after giving an opportunity to the appellant to be heard,
pass such order as it may think fit, confirming modifying or annulling'
order appealed against. ‘ A

(8) Where a prosecution is instituted for the offence in relation to
which such confiscation was ordered the thing or animal shall subject to
the provisions of sub-section (4) be disposed of in accordance the order
of the Court,

(9) No order of confiscation made by the Collector under this secticin
shall prevent the infliction of any punishment to which the person affected
 thereby may be liable under this Act.” :

8. After section 73 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
inserted, namely :—

«73.A. Where any intoxicant is confiscated under section 72 or sec
O.der for des- tion 73 the Collector may subject to any order passed
troying confis- in that behalf by any court if in his opinion it is expe-
cated intoxicant. dient to do so, order the intoxicant to be destroyed any

thing to the contrary in this Act, notwithstanding :

Provided that the intoxicant shall not be destroyed except after expiration
of three months from the date of confiscation or where an application for
review or an appeal against the order of confiscation is pending except
in accordance with the order passed in such review or appeal in this regard :

Provided further that adequate sample of the intoxicant shall be preserved
to meet the evidentiary requirements.”

9. In section 74 of the principal Act afier sub-section (I) the following
sub-secticgn shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1-A) Any officer specially empowered by the State Government in
that behalf may subject to any general or special order of the State Govern-
ment compound, whether before or after the institution of the prosecution
any offence punishable under clause («) cf sub-section (1) of section 60
section 63, where the quantity of the intaxicant involved does not exceed
the quantity notified by the State Government in that behalf, or any
offence punishable under sub-section (3) of section 60, on payment of
such sum of money as composition fee as he thinks fit, which shall not be
less than fifty rupees and which may extend to three hundred rupees
where any such offence is committed by a person for the first time.”

10. In section 77 of the principal Act, the following proviso shall be
inserted at the end, namely :— '

i -

“Provided that notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained
in this section or in any judgment, decree or order, the notification nos.
3514-E/XI11-331-78 and 1227-E/XII1-332-78, both dated April 17, 1978,
made by the State Government in excise of the powers under sections 28
and 29 and the amendments made by the aforesaid notifications shall
have effect and he deemed always tc have effect on and from April 1,
1978.” '

11. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1979 is
hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the previsions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance speci-
fied in sub-section (1) or by the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Fourth Amendment)
Ordinance, 1978 shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corres-

ponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if this Act
were in force at all material times,

1 preoriro-godto 11: |0 (faare) 7-8-79 (1561)-~1979-~1852-450s3 (FF0) 1

Insertion  of
new sectien 73-A.

Amendment of
section 74.

Amendment of
section 77,

.

Repeal and
savings.



No. ETﬁG{l‘-);XVILV--—]-I(Ka)—lE-I983
. g 7 15ar.r::.;i Lucknow, September 23, 1983

[n pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the - Constitution of India,
the Governor 1s pleased to crder the publication of the following English translation of the
Uttar Pradesh Abakari {Sanﬁhudhan] Adhiniyam, 1983 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya
73 of 1983) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and _assmt:d to by the Governor on
September 20, 1983:
THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1983
' [U. P. Act No. 23 OF 1983] - :
(As passed by the Utiar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT -
further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910

1T 1s HERERY enacted in the Thirty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :— . :

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
commencement.  Act, 1983,

(2) Itshallbe deemed to have come into force on May 9, 1983.

_*"’i@‘“d"‘“’g‘ of 2. Insection 28 of the U. P. Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter referred to as the
ﬁ’f’;f};ﬂ “ ﬂf principal Act, in sub-scction (3), in clause (&), for the figures and words **2 per
of 1910. litre of alcohol™” occurnng against items 1 and 2 in the table, the figure and

words 5 per litre of alcohol™ shall be substituted.

Repeal  and 3. (1) The Uft_ar Pradesh Fxcise (Amendment) Ordihance, 1983, is hereby
saving. repealed. ' '

(2) Nﬂtwithstanding_sﬁch repeal, anything done or any action taken under
the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance referred to in
sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have beendone or taken under the corres.

ponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the pro-
visions of this Act werc 1n force at all material times.

By order,
G. B. SINGH,

Sachiv.

dto t70 70 Tro~—T 0 §70 237 §TO (famro )——{(2311)—1983-700 (HF0) 1




i i i il

No.2044(2)/ KVII-V—I—1-(KA)14-1 984
{}ared Lucknow,. October 3, 1984

v IN pufsuan_-':ﬂ.‘of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of th-:'Cunstitutinn of India,

't he Governor is pieascd to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar

pradesh Abkari {Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1984 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 23' of 1984),
as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on October 1, 1984:

_ (U.F. ACT r0. 23 OF 1984]
(s passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legisla ture)

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984

AN .
ACT e
further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 g e
IT 1S HEREBY enacted in ihe Thirty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as

follows :— :
Short title com- 1. (1) This Act may be calied the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
mencement. and ‘Act, 1984, : : : |
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on April 1, 1983,

Amﬁdmeﬁt 2. In section 77 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter re-
of section77 of ferred to as the principal Act, after the proviso thereto, the following proviso
U.P. Act no. 1V shall be added, namely : R ey
a7 1940. ° . “PpProvided further tha notwithstanding anything to the contrary
contained in this section, or in any contract, judgement, decrec or order,
the notification no. 33427_]5;){111-—512-.83,‘dated May 25, 1983, made
. by the State Government " exercise of the powers undet section 30
S 2 <hall have effect and be- deemed always ' to have effect on and from
S AR IPRS L e T | e
_Repeal andsa¥- 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1984, is hereby
g o repealed. . . : . _
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything don? or any action taken undsr
‘the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1),
shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding pro-
visions of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the provisions of this
Act were in force at all material times, : '

§

B.)r order,-
B. L. LOOMBA;
Sachiv. |

dto q®0 T0 M 0——T0 910164 WO ﬁmﬂ—‘('ﬂllz)'—_‘*-igﬂi“‘“'? 50-(A®0) 1.




No. 529(2)/XVI-V—I-I(KA)-16-1983
Dated Lucknow, March 29, 1985 _
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to  order the publicajion of the following English translation of the

Uttar Pradesh Abkari (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1985 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 7 of

1985) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on March 28,
1985, :

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1985
f [U. P. Acr No. 7 or 1985]
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT
further  to amend the U. P. Excise Act, 1910.

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Thirtysixth Year of the Republic of India
as follows : '

‘Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act,
1985. :

Insertion of new 2. After section 33 ol the U.
:‘J“E_WASE':‘U 'S shall be inserted, namely ;-

of 1910,

I'. Excise Act, 1910, the following section

“38-A. (1) Where anv excise revenue has not been paid within three
months from tihe date on which it becomes payable,
mterest at such rate not exceeding twentv-four per
cent per annum,  as mav  be prescribed. shall be

payable from the date such excise revenue becomes pavable till the date
of actual pavment :

Interest on grreyrs
of excise revenue.

Provided thiat untii @ higher e is piescribed. the rate of interest
wil be eighteen per cent per annum :




ST I AT S, 29 AT, 1985

of such commencement if the excl
of the said date.

Provided further that in respect of an excise revenue which became
pavable before the commencement of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amend-
ment) Act, 1985 interest at the said rate shall be payable from the date
se revenue is not paid within 3 months

Explanation : Nothing in this sub-section shall be construed to affect
the pavment ol interest under an agreement, the terms of an auction

or. a decree of the court, passed before the date of commencement of the
Uttar Pradesh Excise {(Amendment) Act, 1985 or which may be passed
after the date of such commencement, in  suits  or proceedings filed

‘before the said date. ,770 90

(2) Provisions of section 39 shall mutatis mutandis apply to realisation

.of such interest as they apply to realisation of excise revenue.”

By order,
B. L. LOOMBA,
Sachiv.

Dogao 0 Mo--Tofo 317 Fa (fraro)~-(4270)=—1985- 730 (awo)




No. 1659 (2) /XVILV-1—1 (KA) 26-1986
Dated Lucknow, Sapfcmbcf.'lg, 1986

In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitu-
tion of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication ~of the
following English transiation of the Uttar Pradesh Abkari (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 1986 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 19 of 1986) as passzd

v the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on -

September 18, 1986.
THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1986

(U. P. Act No. 19 oF 1986)
(As passed 5y the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT
further to amend the U. P. Excise Act, 1910

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-seventh Year of the Republic of India

as follows :
Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment).
mmﬂm‘ Act, 1986.

(2) 1t shall be deemed to have come into force on April 26, 1986.

¢ . 2. In section 28 of the U. P. Excise Act, 1910 hereinafter referred to as
ﬂ?ﬂﬂ“‘“‘i‘g of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),— : _

-!:njt: rﬂl?ld no, 4 (i) ip clause {b)i for the ﬁgurq and words, “5.00 per litre of alcohol”,

occurrir g against items 1 and 2-in the table appended to the said clause,
" the figure and words ‘°20.00 per litre of alcohol” shall be substituted ;
(i) in clause (d), for the figure and words, “14 per kg.””, occurri
against item 4. in the table appended to the said clause, the figure annﬁ
e words, 25 per kg.”, shall be substituted. '
Repeal and _ 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1986, is hereby
savings repealed. : _ .

. {2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken und 6
the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance referred to ?: e
sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have 'been done or taken under the corres-
ponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act, as if the pro-

~ visions qof this Act were in force at all material times. T S
oo 2 U q e ' " By oxder,

S. N. SAHAY,
"~ Sachiv.

0 t{““ﬁHeﬁﬁ s a1 o (frat n)f—-( 1602)—1 sae% 850 ("%0)!




No. 490(2)/XVII-V-1-1(KA)1-1989
Dated Lucknow, March 16, 1989

In-pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution ef
- India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English tran-
slation of the Uttar Pradesh Abkari (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1989 (Uttar Pradesh
Adhiniyam Sankhya 5 of 1989) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented

to by the Govérnor on March 16, 1989. '

Short title and
ﬁmm:nument

Amendment of
section 28 of U. P.
Actne.40f.9 0

R:lps:al angl
Saving

aToTa awneTn——oradtn 212 &T0 (f4wT0) ~(3869)-1989-850—~(H% 0) !

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENHMEN'I') ACT, 1989
(U.P. Acr No. 5 oF 1989)
[4s passed by the U. P. Legislature]

AN
ACT
further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910.

It 1s HEREBY enacted in the Fortieth Year of the Republic of India
as follows:

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment)]
Act, 1989. .

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on October 27, 1988.,

92 In section 28 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act, in sub-section (3).,—

(i) in clause (a), for the figure and words “4 per Htre",-

against item 2 (a) in the table, the figure and words “5 per litre” shall

be substituted : :

(ii) in each of the clauses (c), (d) and (¢), for the figure and words
“9 per litre” occurring against item 2 (a) in the table, the figure and
words “b per litre” shall be substituted. '

3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1988, is
hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance refer-
red to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under
the corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act, as
if the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.

By order,
NARAYAN DAS,
Sachiv.

U.P.
Ordinance
No. 15 of

1988



No. 270 (2) /XVII-V_1-1 (KA) 44-1989
Dated Lucknow, January 20, 1950

In pursuance of the provisions of clause ‘(8) of Article 348 of the Consti-
ution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English tranelation of the Uttar Pradesh Abkari (San-
shodhan) A yam, 1990 (Uttar Pradesh Adhinivam sankhya 1 of 1990),
as p by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor
on January 20, 1990.

'THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1999
(U.P. Acr vo. 1 oF 1990)
(4s passed by the U. P. Legislature)

AN
ACT

further to amend the U. P. Excise Act, 1910.

IT 18 HEREBY enacted in the Fortieth Year of the Republic of India
as follows :— . 3
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amend-

rt tith
o et ment) Act, 1990, _ i
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on December 28, 1989.

4t of 2. In section 28 of the U.P, Excite Act, 1910, hereinaftcs referred to
sectlon 28 of U.P. a8 the principal Act, after subsection (8), the following sub-section shall
“(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section '(8), the

fermented

maximum rate of duty on Ale, beer, porter, cider and other

]ictfﬂm occurring against item 2 (a) ir the table, in clause (¢) of
su . litre with effect

section (8) shall be deemed to be rupees 5
from June 4, 1975 and any notification issued on or after June 4, 1975
which is in conformity with the provisions of this sub-section shall
be deemed to be, and always to have been, valid and lawful as if the
provisions of this sub-section were in force at all material times.”

i




I T2U AUTHTI TS(E, 20 STATQ, 1990

U.P. 8. [(1). The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1989 is Repcal 454
: S
Yot of heveby repealed. | | o
1989 (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done on any action taken
¢ under the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance refer-
/ tll.: to in subsection (1),

: ofb‘wtOhavebemdoneormmmder
thexmndpalm amended by this A
uifthemviﬁomofthisﬂctwuemfupeatan:m.] i by this Act,

By order,

NARAYAN DAS,
Sackiy.

bou¥

o qwo Jo fro——~Tofo 233 aro (farfaFr)--(3689)—~1990--850 (#0) 1




No, 1264 (2XVII-V~1--1 (KA).30/1997
. = Dated Lucknow > August 16, 1997

IN puruance of the pnwlmmm of clausu {‘1} of article 348 of the Constitution, of India, the
Governor is pleaaed to order the publication of the: following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh
Aabkari (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1997 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 16 of 1997) as passed by the
Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on August 16, 1997.

Short title

Amendment of

section 3 of
CUP. Act lm 4
of 1910

ook

5T HE U‘i"l AR [’RADESH EXCISh {AM[ZNDMEI\T} AC]" 199?
{U o ﬁucl No 16 of 1997)
[As ﬂfmgd by. ffm Urmrfmdem Legu Iamre JI
_ _ A{.J g g
fwmw t ﬂuwm' the, Unm-'d meﬂcﬂ Excise Act, 1910

ll IS HEREBY tnrl-LtLd in_the Fﬂrl}—mghih Y-:ar /}l‘ the R,epuhhc of India as
I'crllnw*. -

1. i‘tm ﬁuc: m'w hecalluithe Uttar [’mdeqh qusc (Amendmem) Act, 19‘)?
. 9. 1n sm.;mn 1 {llf lhq Unmd I’mvmw [Ixt:lsc Act, 191{] imr::maﬂer

referred to as the pnllctpal !u,t aﬁer clau;e [3 al thc fulmwmg ctause shall be

inserted, namiely :—" Tl E e

““(4) “manafactory’ mbans a unit Other than a distillery, where Indian made
foreign tiuor is manufactured and bouled.”




3. In section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words “or Amendment of
brewery” the words “brewery of manufactory” shall be substituted. section 17

4. In section 18 of the principal Act, in clause (c) for the words “or brewery” Amendment of
the words “brewery or manufactory” shait be stubstituted. section 18

5. In section 19 of the principal Act, for the word “brewery” the words Amendment of
- «prewery, manufactory” shall be substituted. section 19

6. In section 29 of the principal Act, in clause (e) for the words “or brewery” Am?ﬂdmeﬂt of
_ wherever occuring the words “brewery or manufactory” shall be substituted. section 29

7. In scction 41 of the principal Act, in clause (b) for the words “or brewery” Amendment of
the words “brewery or manufactory” shall be substituted. section 41

& In section 60 of the Principal Act, in sub=section (1) in clauses (d) and (f), Amendment of
 for the word “brewery” wherever occuring the words “brewery, manutactory” shall be S¢1°" 60
RIS substituted. _

By order,
R. D. MATHUR,

Pramukh Sachiv.




—— i — )

No. 292 {2’}{}(%’”-?«1'—1{!{3}-3?-199? .
. Dated Lucknow, February T, 1998
[N pursuinde of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of h® Constitution of
India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following Boglish
tran!i:lation of the Uttar Pradesh Aabkaii({Sa nshodhan) Adhihiyan, 1998 (Uttar Pradesh
Adhiniyam Sa nkhya 7 of 1998) as passed bv the Ultar p-adosh Legislature and assentod to
by the Governor on Febfuary 6, 1998. : ;

- THE UTTAR PRADESH BXCI(SE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1998
r= . (U. P. Acr No. 7 or 1998) : ' :
= '(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
. :
ACT
further to amend the United Provinces Excisz Aet; 1910
WHEREAS the State Government in April, 1983 granted licences valid 3

uﬁ to March 31, 1984 for wholesale vend of Indian made foreign liquor in "
form F. L. 2 on payment of fixed fee ; it

AND WHEREAS the conditions of licence inter alia provided that the
licensee had to pay prescribed assessed fee on the sale of Indian made
foreign liquor and beer according to rules ;

AND WHEREAS il accordance with the conditions uf_licencé the Stage _
Qovernment issued notification dated May 25, 1983 requiring the licensees e
to pay fee assessed on the basis of sales at the rates specified therein ; -

AND WHBREAS pursuant to the said notification demands were made
upon the licensees which they challenged before the Hon'ble High Court

AnD WHERiAs the Hom'ble High Court accepted the case of thi
licensees and inter alia held that the notification will have no effect on the -
‘privileges granted before May 25, 1983; '

¢ AND WHEREAS by the Uttar pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance,
f 1984 (U. P. Ordinance no. 12 of 1934) promulgated by the Governor on
May 30, 1984 section 77 of the U.P. Excise Act, 1910 was amended by
inserting a proviso to the effect that notification dated - May 25 1983 shall
have effect and be deemed always to have effect from April 1, 1983 ;

AND WHEREAS ‘the said Ordinance ne. 12 of 1984 'was replaced by~
Uttar pradesh Excise ( amendment) Act, 19 84 (U. P, Act no. 23 of 1984);

AND WHEREAS in view of the amended provisions of section 77 the
notification dated May 25, 1983 was made effective with effect from
April 1, 1983. .

ANp WHEREAS the appeals filed by the State Government against the
| judgement and order of the Hon'ble High Court were dismissed by the
§  Hon'ble Supreme Court on September 17, 1996 ; :




. JOT Y AT qAz, 7 GIAL, 1998

I

Shori title and
* .amencement

Amendment of
wction 30 of

U.P, Act 8o, 1V
of 1910 .

Vaiidation and
consequentis!
orovision

Repeal and
sayings

7. AND WHEREAs a review petition was filed by the State Government 3
before ths. Hon'bls. Supreme Court was dismissed by ths Hon'ble -

Supremo Court on January 28, 1997; , .

 AND WHERPAS Substantial sums as assessed fee, had already been

realized by the State Government on ‘the basis of the said notification
dated May 25, 19833

- . AND WHEREAS licensscs have ‘made good the sald assessed fee by

adjusting it in their prices realized from the customers, therofore in °

public interest ihe licensees can pot be allowed undue snrichment; -

AND WHEREAS it is mecessary to validate the said realization of

assessed fee by the State Government from the lioznsecs;
Now, THEREFORE, IT IS HEREBY enacted in the ‘Forty-ninth Year of

“the Republie of India as follows ;~—

1. (1) This Act may becalied the Uttar Pradesh Bxcise {Amendment)
Act, 1998, . .
(2) Itshall bs deemed to have come into force on April 1, 1983,

2. Insection 30 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act, after sub-scction (2), the following

-gub-section shall deemed to have been jnserted on Aprl 1, 1983,

namely :—

«(3) For the financial year commencing on April 1, 1983 apart
from the sum fixed for grant of licence under seCtion 24-A, the sum
assessed, called as- assessed fee, on the basis of sales under the
licence shall be payable, at the rate of rupees. five per reputed quart
bottle of ail kinds of sprit, wine, ligunor and Cordiat and at the rate
of paise sixty per reputed quart” bottle” of bear, stout und other
fermented liquors by the wholesale vendors of fareign liquor.

3. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in any
contract, judgemeat, decree or order of any Court or acceptance of
any fixed sum for grant of licence wunder section 24-A by the State
Government of on it behalf by the Excise Commissioner for the
financial year commencing on April |, 1983, the assessed, fee realized,
over an i above the said fixed sum, from the licensees at the rates menti-
oned in sub-section (3) of section 30 of the principal Act shall be deemed
to have been validly realized under the said sub-section as if the provisions
of this Act wers in fo-ce at all materiaj times and no licensce shall be
entitled to refund of such fee and #f any licensee has not paid the sald
assessed fee the same shall be recoverable from him,

4. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 1997 is
hereby repealed. , o ‘
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal anything done or any action taken
under the provisiors of the principal ‘Act as amended by the Ordinance
referred to in -ub-sectjon (1) shall be deemed tfo have been done or taken
under the corresponding provisions of the principa) Act, as amended by this
Act as if the, provisions of this Act were In force at ali material times.

By order,
G. S. PANDEY.
}’ishesh Saqhiv.

o' qEO L0 (No==G0 0 228 EIO PARIO~~( 2378}~ 1958~~450 (f%o0) 1




I - i, m—

No. BIZ].'.":{E},-‘XVII-"H'-i--l{ﬁ.ﬂ;}-lg-lﬂ*}
Dated Lucknow, Apr:l 11, 1995

I "IN pufsuﬁncé of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, of India,
_ the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English transiation of
the Uitar Pradesh Abakary (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1999 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam
- Sackhya 22-of 1999) as . assed by the Uttur Prazdesh Legislature and- assented 10 by The
Governor on April 9, 1999.
‘ | THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1999
; (U.P. ACT No. 22 OF 1529)
| [As passed bY the T1iag Pradesh Legisiature]
AN
ACT

i
s P PSR e s S i g e

‘ further to amend the Uaited Provinces Excise Act, 1910.

hy
I

T \
IT 1S HEREBY ¢nacicd ip the Fiftieth Year of the Republic of Indix
| | as followss— S

e
a—

| e G 1. (1) This Act may b2 called the Uttar e T T Amandment)
commet cement Act, 1599, . L _
(2) It shall come into force vn April 1, 1992,

In section 28 of the United ProvinCes Excise Act, 1910, in sub-

Amendment of . : ; ;

| section 28 of  SCCtion (3), én each of the olauses {a), (¢}, (d)agd {9) for the figure and

U.P. Act no. 4  words “RS. 5 per litre’ occuring against itemZ (z) in the 1able, the ficure
o1 1910 apd words “Rs. 15 per litre” shall be sybsrirred.

| | | E By ctder,
| i y. R. TRIPATHL
‘ Praomokl Sachiv.

Y Tgn goNN=—~ToTTC 4 =0 faarg —{ 58)=- 1999~ -850 (#F0) !




R

No. 917 (2)/XVIL Va1 —I(KA) 11-2000
Dated Lucknow, April 10, 2000

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, of India;
the Governor is pleased Lo order the publication of the following English translation of
the Uttar Pradesh Abakari (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2000 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam

Sankhya 13 of 2000) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the
Goveraor on April 7, 2000. ' '

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2000

(U. P. AcT No. 13 oF 2000)

(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
' AN
ACT

Jurther to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910.

IT1s HEReBY enacted in the Fifty-ficst Yoar of the Republic of Iadia
as follows : - :

. ide snd 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise
z:og?::,n::m‘:en: (Amendment) Act, 2000, :

(2) It shail come into force on April 1, 2000,

Ammdmém of 2. Ia section 28 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, herelnafter

ﬁ-ﬂ;ﬂﬂmf* ﬂ: referred to as the principal Act, in sub-section (3), in eachof the clauses
+ na,

of 1910 (), (c), (d) and (¢) fo- the figure and words “Rs.15 per litre™ occuring

against item 2 {¢) in the table, the figure and words “Rs. 30 per litre"”

shall b2 subsiuted.

Rapeal’ am:.;l 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, “2000 is
~ Savlogs : hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance
referred foin subsscction (1), shall be deemed to have- been done or taken
under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by
this Act as if this Act were in force at all matcrial times,

Byorder,
Y. R. TRIFATHI,
Pramukh Sachiy,

& et 0 g0 T 9--qo Fo 22 w0 Faeio--(106)--2000--850 (%) |




T SR ST E, 30 it 2001

No. 980 (2)/XVII-V-1—1 (KA)-13-2001
Dated Lucknow, April 30, 2001

Objects and Reasons thereto :— ‘ )
THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT)
/ AcCT, 2001
( U.P. Act no. 16 of 2001 ) .
[As Passed byy the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
| AN |
"ACT _
further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1 910.

IT IS HEREBY cnacted in the Fifty-second Ycar of the Republic of India as
follows :— o ‘ o
, 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excisc (Amendment) Act,
. 2001. '

(2) It shall comg¢ into force on April 1, 200L.
, 2. Tn section 12 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910, hereinafter referred
o as the pﬁncipal Act, sub section (3) shall be omtitted. ‘

3. In section 28 of the principal Act, in sub section (3) for clauses (a). ib), (c),
(c), and (=1, the following clauscs shall be substituted, namely:— '
(a) Countervailing duty on excisable articles imported in accordance with
the provisions of section 12(1)

Item

no. Maximum rate of duty

Description of exeisable articles

1 Country liquor (excepting tari) Rs. 90.00 per bulk litre

- 2 Liquor manufactured in India and sophisticated or
coloiired so as to resemble in flavour or colour
liquor imported into India; and rectificd spirit—

(a) A/le,‘beer, porter, cider and other femented Rs. 60.00 per bulk litre

liquors

toilet preparations)
{c) Wines

preparations containing spirit not
otherwise specified (other than drugs and
medicines)

(b) Perfumed spirit (other than medicinal and Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

. Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre {l
(d) Liquors, cordials, mixtures and other Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

{e) Branly, gin, whisky, rums, rectified spuit Rs. 600.00 per buik litre
ot other sorts of spirit not oilerwise
specitied , »
3 Bhang Rs. 75.00 per Kilogram

In pursuance of the pkovisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of {he Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uuar Pradesh
Abkari (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2001, (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 16 of 2001) as passed by the
Uuar Pradesh Legislatre and assented to by the Governor on April 30, 2001 alongwith the Statement of

Short title and
commence-
ment

Amendment of
section 12 of .
U.P. Actno. IV
of 1910

Amendment of
section 28

.

i




I VT ST e, 30 I, 2001

6
(b) Excise or countervailing duty on excisable articles imported in accordance with the
provisions of section 13 ‘
‘Ttem L . | Maxi f dut
0. Description of excisable articles - o ximum rate of duty
1 Country - liquor (cxceptg;xg' tari and other _ -Rs. 90.00 per bulk litre
) fermented alcoholic beverages) ‘ ‘ ' .
2 Liquor manufactured in India and sophisticated . Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre
"~ or coloured so-as to resemble in flavour or
colour liquor imported into India (excepting i
beer)
3  Beerbrewed in India . Rs. 60.00 per bulk litre
4 Bhang “Rs. 75.00 per Kilogram
A (c) Excise or countervailing duty on excisable articles transported
Item o .
1o Description of excisable articles - Maximum rate of duty
1 Country liquor (excepting tari) Rs. 90.00 per bulk litre
2 Liquor manufactured in India and sophisticated
“or coloured so as to resemble in flavour or
colour liquor imported into India; and rectified
spirit—
(a) Ale, beer, porter, cider and other fernfented ‘ Rs. 60.00 per bulk litre
liquors
(b) Perfumed spirit (other than medicinal and Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre
toilet preparations)
(c) Wines Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre
(d) Liquors, cordials, mixtures and other Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre
preparations containing spirit not
otherwise specified (other than drugs and , /
medicines) ¢ .
(e) Brandy, gin, whisky, rums, rectified spirit ' Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre
and other sorts of spirit not otherwise
specified
3.

Bhang ‘ : Rs. 75.00 per Kilogram




I U AT WL, 30 e 2001

(d) Excise duty on excisable articles manufactured, cultivated or collected under any licence

granted under section 1 7

- Item
no.

Description of excisable articles

Maximum rate of duty

3

Country liquor (excepting tari)

Liquor manufactured in India and sophisticated

or coloured so as to resemble in flavour or

colour hquor unportcd into India; and rectificd

spirit— -

(a) Ale, beer, porter, cider and other fermented
liquors

(b) Perfumed spirit (other than medicinal and
toilet preparations)

(c) Wines

(d) Liquors, cordials, mixtures and other
preparations contammg spirit not
otherwise specified (other than drugs 'md
medicines)

(e) Brandy, gin, whisky, ruins, rectificd spirit '
and other sorts of spirit not otherwise

specified
Bhang

Rs. 90.00 per bulk litre '

" Rs. 60.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre
Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 75.00 per Kilégram

(e) Excise duty on excisable amcles‘ manufactured in any dzsnllery estabhsl d, or any distillery or
brewery licensed under section 18

Item
no.

Description of excisable articles

Maximumn rate of duty

Country liquor (excepting tari and fermented
alcoholic breverages)

Liquor manufactured in India and soplnsueated
or coloured so as to resemble in flavour or
colour liquor imported into India; and rectified
spirit—

“(a) Ale, beer, porter, cider and other fermented

liquors.

~(b) Perfumed spirit (other than medxcnml and

toilet preparations)

(c) Wines

(d) Liquors, cordials, mixtures and other
preparations containing spirit not
othierwise specnﬁed (other than drugs and
medicines)

(e) Brandy, gin, wlusky, runs, rectified spirit
and other sorts of spirit not otherwise
specified

Rs. 90.00 per bulk litre

~

Rs. 60.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 600.00 per bulk li

Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre

Rs. 600.00 per bulk litre




8 ) ;AT ST AT L, 30 I, 2001

Repeal and 4. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise'(Amendment), Ordinance, 2001 is hcrcby U.P. Ordi-
i ’ nance no.

Savings - repealed. - S . © 10 of 2001

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anythmg done or any action taken under the
‘provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in
. sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if this Act were in force at all

material times.

By order,
Y.R. TRIPATHI,
Pramukh Sachiv.

STATEMENT OF OBIECTS AND REASONS

It was decided to introduce & new systemn of settlement .of liquor shops on the basis of licence fees

and excise duty. To implement the said decision it was neccssary (0 enhance the licence fee and raise the

~maximum limit of excise duty payable under the Act was, therefore decidced to amend the Umtcd Provinces
Excise Act, 1910 for the purposes aforesaid.

Snce the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legnslauve action was neces:,ary to
implement the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2001 (U.P. Ordinance
no. 10 of 2001) was promulgaied by the f"m«.mor on March 5 2001,

This Bill is introduced to replace the aferes:ud Ordinance.

Se 70 o Tro-To Flo. 21 Hio Relto—2001—(199)—850— (T famede ) |

+




HH-¥T—16 LT THY-UHoTHoWlo / TeAo—

Eeclo / Tiollo—91 /2014—16
AU T URE YT FRLAS <

QU TE, I 729

- TR U9l @R SR W

STATIOT
Remt uRRe

HAT—1, GoS (H)
(TR daw AfS=HaR)
g%, AR, 6 S-4d%), 2018
giy 16, 1939 I[P THIA

Iedx a9l A
faerll argwTT—1

T 2731 / 79-3-1-17-1(%)-20-17
AEGHE, 6 FHIN], 2018

JferRga

fafae

“YIRE 1 GfquT @ TS 200 @ UM ISTUTE HEIQd 4 S&IN UL SN (W)
fadRre, 2017 WR f3Aid 5 W=ad), 2018 B IJFART FAE B MR g8 Iar uLy AfRew w4
W 2018 B WU H GAARRO & goered 39 JfRgE gRT gt fhar S 2 )

IR U ITEHN (W) fEraE, 2017
(IR uew FMFRM = 4 99 2018) |
[Srar I@R uey fdur guee gT ailRa gan]
dYa wI AEEHN AR 1910 BT SR WA B B ford
siferfas
e RSy @ Jewed af # famfaRed sftfae aamn sren 8-

1-(1) ¥ IMRfEn SEr W AEEHN (HeeE) JfRfEm, 2017 @ W AE R
ST | U
(2) T® 27 Rucrax. 2017 &) U §3M HHSAT AT |

796 RPH adhiniyam 4 2018_Data 6 Vidhatka Folder




IR YUY GO TToie, 6 Wael, 2018

g AT
sferforas

& 4 T
1910 @Y =T
3 & HEHEE

2— YT W AEHR ARFTE, 1910, R amt Hq@ affw @E T B
P g 3 B @ (12) H-

—

(@) Swavs (1) ¥ W “Rifg o T & wWH W e ar fafgr

(@) suEvs (2) fFard fear s,

(M) Gve (4) B W W fr=afafean @ve v fRar smm, serfa—
“(4) BE I AP Yo TR I WHR ARFAT gV AED

sy ey a1 :

3o AW & urT 28 ¥ STURE (3) T (4) R 1 s 2016 @
freprelt T TAgh S |

4—e IRfEm & urT 30 A SwwT (1) @ o A fEfafad W T@r
fean W, arifq -

ufe a8 & 5 fR9ie 1 alid, 2016 W, SR URW IJEHN (TER)
FeRY, 2017 B U ER B e b SeUE WReA Yod, ORI 28 B I
TG Yob FHAT SR |

5—Ho1 JfferTm & R 50 W~

(@) T “IIRM FRAT AT D WA UR Ak WY HIAT AT A

oo ford gRIRT o gam” v&@ & Wi,

(@) w8 T b UNT 60" B WM W YK AT AP YR 60,

g 60% @ &l S |

6—Hel IR & o7 51 F TR PIE I AT B B WM W R
13 N fbar & yerar SES ford guRa fmn 2 o oI wd o “uNT 60"
B WM W = d 3id U 60, URT 60% ¥ fad WU |

7-c affrgw @) a7 52 # ¥R UG 3 ORI 60" B WM W Wk Ud
3 R 60, URT 60%” ¥ fad WG |

8-t A" A grT 53 F TR TI ofF "UNI 60" B WM W I TG
3f® “URT 60, HIRT 60%" Y& f&d WG |

oot ffram N urr 54 ¥ pfEuee @ve @ WM R fEfataa
wfteeToe wvs @ fear SR, st -

“Ofya= 7E & % GURT 60, ORI 60, UINT 61, U 62, U 63, URT 647,
gRT 65, UNT 68 @ N gveg fHEl I aemar Se uaRRl @ AN B
WY P GIRY B R qvey Rl e @ amaww, e G Aftege @
ey A fHur o wHar 2 R T8 & 9= 51 A gRT 52 B DA Heldger g
S Y T Rl arve @1 fAwred, R W e g fea W e @
Y weger g1 Iad FaeE & foR wiliea fasar wma

10-Hot IR A urT 55 B W W FEfaied avr @ @ S,
eIt —

“56 HT] 60 B SUENI (2), URT 60%F, UNT 62, NI 63, TR 64F MR Il
gl @ aefe Rl aoRe @ gERT @ i qvedm P awm, gus kA
wfgan, 1973 @ Jyufrta s B9 1T

1-7a IRFEE A ow 60 & ' W PR g v & R,
et —

“60 (1) & @1 afe g@ AffEw @ agdm R ® FA Fram o
W Jal e Wa R TeeE, WY o1 oW @ SeeEd a,—

(@) fr wes avg & fafa var 8; s

796_RPH_adhinivam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



IR T RN T9E, 6 S-avl, 2018

(@) 59 s @ g1 63 B A TeBIRT P "Wed awg
&1 URaET FRAT & U IY Heol A [GaT 8; Iqar
. (1) ®&ue AN R HA: g uered ffrmw, 1985 @ i
aresed =@, T W R o Aes oY @ = wole g9 W@
QUGS dlel SiTell YRAG | (B9 Jergan) & oY &) ofaqar ok B
svsd (RH well a1 Sell @ S affer w8t ) @ wus a1 famy
X B, YA
(8) &3 g “gargas, fafatoremer ar semEa A dean
g U g ®, W
() fF vor & B GEE, @I, go, VR a7 SUBR, el
| = ol wed avg @ fafwin @ gaivw & ol wgaa axar @ @
3TN U AT TH Fed F Q@A 8,
(@) =9 e & e orgde ww, wnfta ar @ fee
JrEE, garEdHl, fafmrarer, et @ averR | 38 Ak
g% BCrdl & Sl
®) famy @ woee @ R 50 sRe @ Aaa ¥ g T g
rerar
(S1) o1 61 BN St wn @ o &4 Ae avg &1 fama
PR B; A
(ﬂ)amua%m%aaﬁqﬁmmfrm@ﬁmaﬂﬁmﬁﬁﬁqaﬁ
T g 2, A1 fFAmrerT B
@ SH PREE W Ifsd fhar R o SuEve (F) @ JEhE Rl TR @
Rerfy # <1 ad 9% & Favar & ok ga @ sfed fFar oA o v& g9R s9d
a® & d&ar 8 R fHed ey Ry & sraw 9 gfted e o & &9 ad
% B & §Hal & AR WA FEH @ Ied fFw SR & afied gew At
gRIR A1 9o W, IR O wiewd avg B Hew ¥ g9 Iffrmm ok aged e
R frad ok 3 W el @ ager @ agdiE ww fl aeRe, wfte O
U @ AJER PIUarEl @t g enil @t Seuevia Bl @ IW A W I FTuR W
S oft IS &, 9 Fw T Erfty
() &t @2 g9 ARfEE W agde R M RS oo fad ety
71 39 IRfm 3 e ura el agdi, e @1 N @1 Sooigd ke, )
AIes g P AT FRal 2, Y BREE S B A ¥ FH A8 e R o A
a¥ a® 8 ghal &, &1 qve fadr SR &R I¥ FEH F1 ft qve fear S &
UfE B9R $UY § FH A B 3R O g9 B YU aF B Gl B
@) o P 39 IR T e TR M B fw @ R m
Y & oot IR [HHl HGP avg H ST IR 2, I/ FAH FT v R
SRAT S U B9k SR § FH A8 BN SR O &) 9k ¥U O% &) 9adl 21
" 12— s & uRT e0 @ uvmrg frEfolad amr ggr & S,
It -

"60B—ull By fHdl AEd derf B W I uerf @1 i
e T ¥ Y U dxA 2g A wRa1 @ w1 fafda
g%ﬁmw‘ém@wmaﬁmmﬁm
fifte oy AUTIER USRS @1 A Aed axg @ AT F Iwn B
@ ford won fagpg wRar 8, 99 "I IR & F1 Ay dearar & A
ey PO W R W Suew ovam 8 Rwd wea @
wee ey (Aol U JUEfA A ER [USF A TG AW PE I
a‘?‘aﬁ;qj uRomd aifer gl wwafaa 8, a1 afed fasar smam -

fassy
% o
nf

796 _RPH -adhinivam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

TE U 60%
B gGTT FATH



4 Ted WS R e, 6 Si-del, 2018

(@) afe Q@ frd B @ weRawd §og w8 A 99
arofiae HREN 3R oA, O o6 g 0 a6 & | &, ]
o eI § o A e, @ R of & B8, -

(@) aft W fred P & worvawy Rparmar a1 g STef B o
@ aToflae BRI ATl FIR BREAK A o a6 a§ aF 8 Fgaw 8 fbeyg
w af ¥ HF 9 B, AR ST | S Ue e W @ 8 WAl E
fohg = oE $UA & &HA | BN

(W)uﬁ@gﬁﬂ%mwmﬁﬁmﬁﬁaﬁaﬁéa%ﬁmaﬁs‘m
qRoT & ugad 8, o Q¥ oy @ @A @ St @ g a@ ) wEd
?,ﬁﬂ@a&@wagﬁmsﬂ?gnﬁﬁ@hamwmm
o 8 wbal & o e og uede FOR $99 [ B A 8|
TG54 URT B FEre U Suefy’ @ O U’ & wef 9f)

2 o 9Iee gue wfedn 1860 (ARITIEH WRET 45 § 1860) B A UIRT 319

g A
S dte

ud 320 A § |
4T 62 Bl 13- SFTE B R 62 § v AT ¥ A W U BWR W a%
e B woal £ TUeE BN B WM W e G | S U g B0 6 A
8 BT SR ol 99 BOR $Ud d@ € wadl &, gveHy B v fl e |
HRT 63 Bl 14 aRfEE B OR 3 @ v W At g @ § S,
BRI 319)1?[%

“s3—uil @ wfi 9 omfrgw a1 9gdE 9 T R frow
sem A @ PY T RN IRY B IeeEd AR AW wU A
sy ST grfad fdl AT § oWed avg @1 uRdgd &gl
PR g e v, 98 W BRA W, W B A 8 @
=81 gnm ik o it af g B waedr 8 iR ol &
aRT 30 & i SIS Yob U WRIGA Yob B weRIf O, AR fHE
Ao aw B Geg 39 gRFEE iRk agd s R A fgE e
@Wﬁ%mmw%wmﬁawﬁzmwaﬁw
PRI @ T A @ serE ad, @ T a1 dfa g vud, W
B o 8, A B9 T8 8 e A s
R 64 B 157 ARFE B aN 64 A WU (M) & i W Frfafea a@ve v
e faan oA, it -
<) ¥ Ae, frd ol aRT 60 H Sua B, 9 e fme e | A
40 TG 41 @ 3T 9 T R PigE @1 SHgE a) JewEd dRdl B 99 Hdd
W ey @ R oA, o Ue BwN vUd @ B AR BRT SR O utE BN
S0 dd 8 "edl B, 9§ fvsa fEar s
&R 64T BI 16— afofras & anT 64 H—

BEICE]

(@) Suurr (1) Fare & S,

(@) SRl (2) § ¥ Gl BOIR WU & XM PR e diE BN
s v@ fed W,

() SR (2) B g W v W W IR B W W g
TR SUA” Tl I Ui @ T @ WM W ¥ T geR Ul %"

&l SR |
M 65 @1 17-7e Jffm @ urT 65 H -
g
(@) SR (1) § T B AR B WM R & CTE a9 q IR
2 EER BUY B WM W Yk “UfE geR $93 @ A S,
(@) SR (2) ¥ e ufg @ W B W W A UE ESR
sl g Rl S
YR 66 @1 1e—Te I @ G166 § wed I e B W R IR CH qU”

GRICE! Gonr Sre g W) BT P W Wy Ui geR ud @ Ry i |

796 RPH_adhimyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



I TSI SR 9ie, 6 W-a%], 2018

‘ 19-7a AffFTm 3 aR1 67 § e T W b WM W Uk U gy
o T U UG W BWT B WH R UL U TR R 7w R S
- 20— ARFTEH A aRT 68 H T U@ H TWT b WM W ¥R Ui
EaR U0 g f3 SR
2101 JRfFm & uRT 69 H ver wfoduets @ # e dW At @
WH W IE T q RN TR TH 9 B WE R Ik 9 AV W@ Ry IR
227 AT 9 gRT 69 T F U HER W 3P IR 60 B SUHNI
(1) T SR (2) B wWue (@), Wve (9), @ve (§) U @WUe (B) A 9N 62 B
3 WM W e IR 3k g 60, UIRT 60 P, URT 62, URI 63 Il YRl 65 ¥
o sy
23—9a fefm @ a1 70 H-

(@) Swrr (1) 4, @vs (@) © W[ ® AEfaiead @ve @ R
\—rlTaTTT.GTQTf?[:—
(@) IF@! A AFBR AT FQE A 81 qar B g
e g uRare w1 RUE 9 f&ar oy, gRT 60, T 60 B,
g 62, HRT 63, NI 64 &, HRT 65 T URT 69 @ B IET UG
R ara=Te @1, ar’
(@) SUaRI (2) @ YF W FEfefRaa Swarr w@ @ wRel, serfa—
“(2) TG WHR @ RN Wi » W @ afree, uw
60 & @) IUHRT (&%) TAT (W) Td URT 67 @ 3w B 74 3peray
Sue ford guiRa el srovw @ =1 g9 affam @ adi=
8, @ yzarg ve oy & faw 9 §Rera e s e
24—l ATy & g1 71 H -

(@) T 3R 3 U 607 B WM W UK AR HH IR 60,
gRT 60F " T ey W,

(@) vitEurns @ve & WM R fa=fafed dfoaues wve e
%mmitm,ama;—

‘gfdes gg & % aRT 60% T U1 699 A A @@ &
wfode g gl ff aafle ool @ = i afe &1 At
23 ° =fawn & Ra ora ®f goe [4g] §91 ST |°
25-7a fAfFam & grt 72 § SmuRT (2) @ R W fEfafad suaw
?’@”ﬂﬁ'\?\'ﬂi"ﬁ,&?ﬂfﬁ:_

“(2) WET g9 Affam @ & Suew @ ol fel avg @1 Uy &0
Ffgee P S get N Swfa @ afnEid v g R aren
Aftresrd), V0 IR vd Fega & fR9ie 9 09 o Rew & Wiy,
R o fawga RUle dolder @ wHE HRIG ST | dHeldey JARusy
199 3R afda wafed wfea Saa RUE ora 39 R dosia 91 3
Trfera ifiren afR wverw 8 amew <, o 5 g SR gws) afe
fafaRag Rl o9 918 BROT § FoldeR B 98 SENTE 8 o fF B8
R fn w8 Rred RO WA aw) 91 Uy SUHRl (1) @ A
afERer & 99 &1 <) 8 T R, @ 98 U 9% I 9y B AfOERv
FRA B ST ¢ Fhal & AR U IR $ ford fiare \Rera e
T & W A9 s a8

gfrar g8 2 5 swuw (1) % Pffe R ovg (\@ee awg &
vlgar) a1 0y & Refy § Swae WM @ g8 ey fRar s & ag
e AERY B gac § I9H MYV fHY oM @ feAiw @ 9w
IR e ¥ FfE AT 1 graE &, R Heiger uaia §\we

796_RPH_adminivam 4_2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

YN 67 @T
o 68
g 69 @

HINT 69F Bl

T 70 &7

R 71 &1

=T 72 B
Heye



TN U JFHRY OIS, 6 AN, 2018

g 73 & &
e

YT 74 6T
YA

Nl 74d BT
RSEIT]
e al

J5g ¥ aiforsg &) faurT & uvar IneeR) fadr guw wew g1 fawr €1 gy 201617
HAHT RBurT g1 A7IF 14,272 BRe WUA Suiiia B3 1 9 waast # fuiRe @e & ane @
o Wit g2 o | Sa B B g e yerd e, faRivee sRan @ sy afewr @ o)
of) | I YR A W ¥ ady wlew @ o @ 9 dadt v @ IorE A aft g8 ot avq U
3y dorl Wl AR B TUWAT @ FR SE-ollgd @) afd & gead R gkl off | e wHal
Q wEfg WA weel AR o wEnel @1 [aRw axa @ Iqew 9 ge Rfvvgn o g e

Ferfg—

26—7c1 I 3 a1 73 & 3 W R FrEfafed gr @ @ e,

-

“73h—GTEl I 72 T °RT 73 & A BIE HdD 9] 6 IR0 [FUl -

g, agt el e g 9w v A M R adw @ eraE,
fE delger &) A H RO H T Ted avg AHd SN A 48 B
JUal afe el @ TR wee avg w1 e Ty ufRfda w8
S FEHAT & @ ae g9 affrm ¥ safde B e @ afame & g
Iq qEH a¥g D) T B TH B e T FaHE @

ufde= a8 2 fF S wes avg & AR 5 9™ 3 fais 9 Q)
o B W @ uTgg @ Rar @ wEr ANERn & ARy & favE
gAfdeted o el odid 2g amdew-u3, $9 =™ d 08 yAfderes @
afier % oG eyl & FWR & fHary affed 8, T 781 favar S -

IeR wiies ¥g 2 &% 39 N1 @ i "ies o] T Ry S gg
B3 ey, I9 Afdd, Rradd siffrer & wes oy v o mar &)
B 7 T @ Afew @ yTAq GAag @& saeR wer By e gk e
farar

g o2 N & 5 Ae avg @ waia T @iias ardema @l
ufd & ford ufRfem e sy
27—9@ s & gy 74 A -

(@) SuuR (1) § v U NN JUY’ @ WM W & TEd
g9 Ul e 2y @
(@) Juamg (1-) H—
9 U4 AER GUS () B AT B WM W TR UG HER
"@ug (F) aul (@) & FdF T A e,
o gERg BYA ol O G $Ud Od 8 ghd) & P WH W
v U R B0 Gl Ufg g9k vUd OF B HaHa 8 @ {3
ST |
28—qa A @ ur 743 H Fuww (1) A e UiE E9R I B

WM W ¥ UdH ang SR v @l S

29—(1) SR USY HEHN (W) IJRARY, 2017 TEAGERI SR W

iy ey Wi 2 ey

HEgT 1

(2) W& s @ &0 gy N S (1) # fAfde weake R g 500

g1 Wl wE afdfram @ Suedt @ wefE od @13 e A @ T
B Hrdad), 3@ ADfam g g WM e sfeftaw @ we
geaeft Suget & aflm @ @ @) T wws oA Tl gw arfafram
@ Iudy W) wRaE w9d J vga o |

IgaeT AR R

Hgad ww SEEn AffE 1010 # WA eve g@ad: e sue R o

(1) Soa aftfram & 2fbe® Suawl @1 sMenha Afos Fer fEar ST

796 RPH_adhiniyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



TR WSE IJHEERY TolC, 6 SiaR], 2018 7
(2) URher BT B! IUE Yob & WU H a¥el b BT Iue fbal S,
(3)3ene vew @ Ffwan G § wEfug Suasl @ e 1 b, 2016 § wH
fea s
(4) wmos MR ek wEmd uenf aftfrriees d wfafad fhr W @ www
WWW@WJ%O%W@W@W&HWWWW;
(5) wiftsw arvelf # SR &1 Aftafea fhar o |
qﬁﬁwﬁwwwﬁﬂﬁwaﬁ?ﬁaﬂﬁﬁwaﬁmaﬂﬁa%ﬁﬁw
et BRIAE S AEUEE o, He: VSUuld g feAid 27 fEER, 2017 @ SR YSH
STEFT (WIEH) AR, 2017 (IR FF AeATCY A 1 W 2017) A fhar |
78 fege gatad searew ® ufeRenfie @ve @ R wenfa faar s 2 |
TS 9,

AR5 HAR AR,
g wfa |

}

No. 2731(2YLXX1X-V-1-17-1(ka)-20-17 Py
Dated Lucknow, January 6,2018

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Aabkari
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2017 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 4 of 2018) as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on January 5, 2018.

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT. 2017
(U.P. ACT NO. 4 OF 2018)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
ACT

further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910.

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 2017. Short title and

; & t
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on September 27, 2017. ommeneemen

2. In section 3 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 hereinafter referred to as  Amendment of
o A ) section 3 of
the principal Act, in clause (12), UP Actno 4

(a) in sub-clause (i) for the words "Sidhi or Ganja" the words "or sidhi"  of 1910
shall be substituted,
(b) sub-clause (ii) shall be omirted:;
() for clause (iv) the following clause shall be subsrituted, namely:-
"(iv) any other intoxicating substance which the State Government
may by notification declare to be an intoxicating drug:".
3. In section 28 of the principal Act, sub-sections (3) and (4) shall be deemed to ~ Amendment of
have been omitted from April 1, 2016. Sectinn.23
4. In section 30 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) the following proviso shall ~Amendment of
be inserted at the end, namely:— section 30
"Provided that consideration fee levied from 01 April. 2016 upto the date of
commencement of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance. 2017 shall be
deemed to be Excise Duty under section 28".

796 RPH_adhiniyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



8

IEN U N T9E, 6 -9, 2018

Amendment
of section 50

Amendment
of section 51

Amendment
of section 52

Amendment
of section 53

Amendment
of section 54

Amendment
of section 55

Amendment
of section 60

5. In section 50 of the principal Act, -
(a) for the words "committing an offence"the words "committing or abett" g h
an offence"shall be substituted ; -
(b) for the word and figures "section 60"the words and figures "section v,
section 60A" shall be substituted

6. In section 51 of the principal Act for the words "committed any offence"the
words "committed or abetted any offence” and for the word and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A" shall be substiruted.

7. In section 52 of the principal Act for the words and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section®60, section 60A" shall be substituted.

8. In section 53 of the principal Act for the words and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A" shall be substituted.

9. In section 54 of the principal Act for the proviso the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:-

"Provided that an offence punishable under section 60, section 60A. section 61,
section 62, section 63, section 64-A, section 65, section 68 or an offence punishable for
abetment of any offence under the said sections may be investigated into without the order of a
Magistrate, and that any warrant issued by the Collector under section 51 or section 52 may be
executed by any officer authorised by the Collector for the said purpose."

10. For section 55 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,
namely:-

"55. All offences punishable under sub-section (2) of section 60, section 60A,
section 62, section 63, section 64-A and any offence punishable for abetment of any
offence under the said sections, shall be non-bailable within the meaning of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973."

1. For section 60 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,
namely:- L9,

"60. (1) Whoever, in Contravention of this Act or of any rule or order made
thereunder. or of any licence, permit or pass obtained thereunder:—

(a) exports any intoxicant; or

(b) transports or possesses any intoxicant which is not covered under
section 63 of this Act; or

(c) collects or sells the leaves and small stalks (not accompanied by
flowering or fruiting tops) of natural and spontaneous growth of wild Indian

Hemp plant (Cannabis Sativa) other than charas, ganja or any other intoxicating

drug covered under the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances Act, 1985;

or

(d) constructs or works any distillery, brewery, manufactory or vintnery: or

(e) uses, keeps or has in his possession any material, still, utensil,
implement or apparatus, whatsoever, for the purpose of manufacturing any
intoxicant other than tari; or

(f) removes any intoxicant from any distillery, brewery, manufactory,
vintnery or warchouse licenced, established or continued under this Act; or

(g) bottles any liquor for the purposes of sale; or

(h) sells any intoxicant, save in the case provided for by section 61; or

(i) taps. or draws tari from any tari-producing tree in the areas notified
under section 42 ;

shall be punished with imprisonment which may extend to two years and with

fine which may extent to one thousend rupees in the case of an offence under sub

clause (i) and in any other case, with imprisonment which may extend to three
years and with fine which shall, not be less than ten times of the amount of
consideration fee or duty which would have been leviable if such intoxicant had
been dealt with in accordance with this Act and the rules and orders made

796 _RPH_adiimyam 4 2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



IR U9 IR THE, 6 a9, 2018

thereunder or in accordance with any licence, permit or pass obtained
thereunder, or two thousand rupees whichever is greater.
(2) Whoever in contravention of this Act or any rule or order made thereunder
or of any licence, permit or pass, obtained under this Act, manufactures any intoxicant
shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be less than six months and which
may extend to three years and also with fine which shall not be less than five thousand
rupees and which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

(3) Whoever, in contravention of this Act, or any rule or order made thereunder,
consumes any intoxicant, shall be punished with fine wh:ich shall not be less than one
thousand rupees and which may extend to two thousand rupees."

12. After section 60 of the principal Act the following section shall be inserred,

.

namely:-

"60A. Whoever, adulterates or causes to be adulterated any intoxicant
;ﬁ’;?l]l‘g for by mixing any other substance or foreign ingredient to make
noxious such intoxicant noxious or sells, offers or makes or causes to be

substance with - 414 or offered or made available such noxious intoxicant or any
intoxicant and

selling of other noxious substance for consumption in the garb of an
:3;‘;;‘;5; . intoxicant, likely to cause disability or hurt or grievous hurt or
under the garb ~ death or any other consequential injury to humanbeings, shall be
of intoxicant punished;

(a) if as a result of such an act, death is caused, with death or
imprisonment for life and shall also be liable to fine which may extend to ten
lakh rupees but shall not be less than five lakh rupees;

(b) if as a result of such an act, disability or grievous hurt is caused, with
imprisonment for life or rigorous imprisonment which may extend to ten years
but shall not be less than six years and with fine which may extent to five lakh
rupees but shall not be less than three lakh rupees;

(c) if as a result of such an act, any hurt or any other consequential injury
is caused to any person, with imprisonment for a term which may extend to two
years but shall not be less than one year and fine which may extend to two lakh
fifty thousand rupees but shall not be less than one lakh twenty five thousand
rupees.

Explanation:~ For the purpose of this section the expression "hurt and
grievous hurt" shall have the same meaning as in section 319 and section 320
respectively of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 (Act no. XLV of 1860)."

13. In section 62 of the principal Act for the words "liable to fine which may
extend to five thousand rupees" the words "liable to fine which shall not be less than five

thousand rupees and which may extend to ten thousand rupees.” shall be substituted
14. For section 63 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,
namely:-
"63. Whoever, in contravention of this Act, or of any rule or order made
Penalty for thereunder, imports any intoxicant or transports or has in his
;’;‘:::tﬁ;‘f possession any quantity of any intoxicant unlawfully imported,
intoxicant and Shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be less
transportor  than six months and which may extend to five years and also
gg?:f:;:ﬁ; °f with fine which shall not be less than ten times the amount of
imported excise duty or consideration fee under section 30 which would
intoxicanterc. have been leviable if such intoxicant had been dealt with in
accordance with this Act and the rules and orders made
thereunder or in accordance with any license, permit or pass
obtained thereunder or five thousand rupees whichever is greater."

796_RPH_adhiniyam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

Insertion of
new section
60A

Amendment of
section 62

Amendment of
section 63



10

I TS IR TiE, 6 W-as], 2018

Amendment of
section 64

Amendment of
section 64-A

Amendment of
section 63

Amendment of
section 66

Amendment of
section 67

Amendment of
section 68

Amendment of
section 69

Amendment of
section 69-A

Amendment of
section 70

Amendment of
section 71

15. In section 64 of the principal Act for clause( c) the following clause shall
be substituted, namely:- -

"(c) save in a case provided for by section 60, willfully contravenes any w
rule made under sections 40 and 41 shall, for each such offence, be punished
with fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees and which may
extend to five thousand rupees."

16. In section 64-A of the principal Act,-
(a) sub-section (1) shall be omirted;
-(b) in sub-section(2) for the words "two thousand rupees" the words
"five thousand rupees" shall be substituted,
(c) in the proviso to sub-section (2) for the words "two hundred rupees”
the words "two thousand rupees" and for the words "five hundred rupees"” the
words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

17. In section 65 of the principal Act,-

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "six months" the words "one year"
and for the words "two thousand rupees” the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (2) for the words "five hundred rupees" the words
"one thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

18. In section 66 of the principal Act for the words "three months" the words
"one year" and for the words "five hundred rupees" the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

19. In section 67 of the principal Act for the words "three months" the words
"one year" and for the words "five hundred rupees" the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

20. In section 68 of the principal Act for the words "five hundred rupees" the
word "five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

21. In section 69 of the principal Act, in the first proviso for the words "three
months" the words "one year", and for the words "one year" the words "two years"
shall be substituted.

22. In section 69-A of the principal Act for the words letters and figures
"clause (b), clause (d), clause ( €) or clause (g) of sub-section (1) or of sub-section (2)
of section 60 or of section 62" the words and figures "section 60, section 60-A,
section 62, section 63 or of section 65" shall be substituted.

23. In section 70 of the principal Act,-
(a) in sub-section (1) for clause (a) the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:-
"(a) of an offence punishable under section 60, section 60-A,

section 62, section 63, section 64-A, section 65 or section 69-B,

except on his own knowledge or suspicion or on the complaint or report

of an Excise Officer; or"

(b) for sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely:-

"(2) Except with the special sanction of the State Government no
Magistrate shall take cognizance of any offence punishable under this Act
other than an offence committed or abetted under sub-sections (a) and
(b) of section 60-A and section 67, unless the prosecution is instituted
within a year after the date on which the offence is alleged to have been -
committed. "

24. In section 71 of the principal Act.-

(a) for the word and figures "section 60" the words and figures
"section 60, section 60-A" shall be substituted,

796_RPH_adhinivam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



ook WeYl IERNY TSle, 6 WHdv], 2018

11

(b) for the proviso the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:-

"Provided that, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in
sections 60A and 69B, no person other than the actual offender shall be
punished with imprisonment except in default of payments of fine."

25. In section 72 of the principal Act for sub-section (2) the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) Where anything or animal is seized under any provision of this Act, the
officer seizing and detaining such property shall, within three working days
from the date of such seizure and detention; produce a detailed report for
confiscation alongwith such seized property, seizure memo and other relevant
documents before the Collector. The Collector shall, upon receiving the said
report alongwith seizure memo and seized property, immediately order for safe
custody and storage of goods as he may deem fit. The Collector, if satisfied for
reasons to be recorded that an offence has been committed due to which such thing or
animal has become liable to confiscation under sub-section (1), he may order
confiscation of such thing or animal whether or not a prosecution for such offence has
been instituted:

Provided that in the case of anything (except an intoxicant) or animal referred
to in sub-section (1), the owner thereof shall be given an option to pay in lieu of its
confiscation such fine as the Collector thinks adequate, not exceeding its market value
on the date of its seizure."”

26. For section 73-A of the principal Act the following section shall be
substituted, namely:-

"73-A Where any intoxicant is confiscated under section 72 or section 73,
the Coilector. may, subject to any order passed in that benalf by anv court if in
his opinion the confiscated intoxicant is not fit for human consumption or if
the confiscated intoxicant cannot be stored or preserved, order the intoxicant
to be destroyed notwithstanding anything to the contrary comntained in this Act:

Provided that the intoxicant shall not be destroved except afier expiration
of two months fiom the date of confiscation or where an application for review
or an appeal against the order of confiscation is pending except in accordance
with the order passed in such, review or appeal in this regard:

Provided further that any order for destruction of the intoxicant under
this section shall not be passed without providing opportunity of hearing
after notice of seven days to the person from whose custody the intoxicant
1s recovered:

Provided also that adequate sample of the intoxicant shall be preserved to
meet the evidentiary requirements."

27. In section 74 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees" the words
"fifty thousand rupees"” shall be substitured,
(b) in sub-section (I-A).-
(i) for the words and letter "under clause (a)" the words and letters
"under clauses (a) and (b)" shall be substituted:

(ii) for the words "fifty rupees which may extend to three hundred
rupees” the words "one thousand rupees which may extend to five
thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

796_RPH_adhimyam 4_2018 Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

Amendment of
section 72

Amendment of
section 73A

Amendment of
section 74



2 Il Uy IMRINY THe, 6 W+ayl, 2018

Atfiendment of 28. In section 74-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the
SRR words "five thousand rupees” the words "one lakh rupees” shall be -
substituted. -
Repeal and saving 29. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 is U P
hereby repealed. ,?;d;n:? *
2017

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the
Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
done or taken under the coresponding provisions of the principal Act as
amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all
material times.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Excise Department is the second largest department after Commercial Tax Department in the
State. In the year 2016-2017 Rupees 14,272 crore only were earned by the Excise Department. In the
previous years the revenue receipt had been reduced relatively to the target fixed. The main reason for the
said reduction was the smuggling of illegal liquor from the neighboring States particularly from Haryana.
Similarly, the extraction of illegal liquor in the State has caused not only the loss of the revenue of the
State but also incidents of the loss of lives of the people due to the consumption of such illegal and
poisonous liquor. In order to prevent such incidents and other problems relating to the excise matters it has
been decided to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 mainly to provide for,-
(1) making the penal provisions of tﬁe said Act more stringent;
(2) making provisions for realising consideration fee as Excise duty;
(3) abolishing the provisions relating to the maximum limit of Excise duty with effect from
April 1, 2016;
(4) omitting the provisions relating to Charas and Ganja from the United Provinces Excise
Act, 1910 because of their inclusion in the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances
Act, 1985;
(5) including the abetment in the penal offences.

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to
implement the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (U.P.
Ordinance no. 1 of 2017) was promulgated by the Governor on September 27, 2017.

2. This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance accordingly.

By order,
VIRENDRA KUMAR SRIVASTAVA,
Pramukh Sachiv.

FlouE0g0E0—Tot0 796 ITTUF—(B)—2018—(2501)—599 FIT—(FHFgeR /A / AMHHT) |
GlovEogedio—godio 157 @0 faemdl—2018—(2502)-300 YRITI—(FgeR /T / ITHHT) |

796 RPH_adhimyam 4 _201% Data 6 Vidhaika Folder



FH-E 92 AR TRY-THoTHoYlo / Yelo—
-

o / TioWo—91 /201416

AN T URe VT FRIEA 2

AURRT T9E, FAT qaI

T HE9NT TSR I AEHNe

AT
ey aRfere

ANT—1, @S (H)
(SR yeTr i)
@, 999K, 11 3dd, 2018
IH 21, 1940 T FHT
SR CEIIINE]
el argWTT—1

T2 814 / 79-d-1—-18-1(F)3-18
T, 11 IUd, 2018

SAfERgET

fafay
‘e T R B IE 200 F FHF TSI AEET | I WEY S (Here)
Rrda, 2018 W R 10 oiw, 2018 F ST FaM # MY 98 ImW Heer SetEm wem 22
T 2018 B &7 § FHEARE # gEAr g6 SAUgE & TH B S 2
I TReT STy (Heier) arfafem, 2018
(S Ry sifafem e 22 |9 2018)
[FET I o9 fuE Aqvew g wiRd g
HgHT A TSN SR, 1910 F S HAET F F
Sl e

d TREE & STeEE gn § Frefeied sfefeEm a9mr o 2

1-(1) e sffmEe So JEY STEE (Hetee) sfafm, 2018 @ wEE M
ST | Lo A

(2) 72 i 8 Ry, 2003 FI 9@ TN HHA FAA |



2 IR U AR T, 11 A, 2018

T 2-HgHT T e A, 1910 R e @ afufm @ o

mi. i e, #, a0 247 ¥ 3w (1) ¥ @e (9) 3 @ W Al a@ve @ R

77 1010 & O, 37Hl- :

:ﬂﬁgg “(a) TP W e Rl @ RR (R 3 e @ are
T F R s R PO o AT geem 3 )
THITH A Y RAMABR F [ aEeE oy agdd B eigd &
T 21"

T o 3-09 AffEE @ 4R 24-% F usHg releRed @ wer @ s,

24-% & aqgﬁa\:_ .

Skl “24-%% IR YN AEHN (Fee) arfefrem, 2018 @ s @

et & qd el = @ Rl Fof, R @ omy @ sftegw o
g A 39 ofifem 3 5 owery & ade B B @ Rl e @ RR
TR PR AW d W W oA R 9N 3 A BE e
Rftmr et o 38 w9 Rty & wwsh ot A gw oTfafEm
F I, oA B I9 fEm v g9fe 2 w9 arem ' W

g e
Fre 3 4-(1) IERX R MEHY (VM) AARY, 2018 THIERT ;ﬁajﬁfﬂ
il R e ot 2 i
¥9 2018

(2) @ Frew & 3 @ i Soaw (1) ¥ Piffe sty

B AN g AR B Suart 3 W F9 B B A

H T B FEAR, 36 SR G g @ effEE @

© W gl IuE % oW F@ oW A R gl S Aer oz
fefm # SuEy gft araE = § wew 9

IR T FHT

E A SR ARe SlEdl @ o, Fata, uRees, Rl Rew 9w oeanfitum @
g, R IR R T e Bl Rt & @ & § S99 st ok Ame olufiEl @
I, Fat, dReed, e, B ok oftue @t sifts #0539 T @R B aifem
A 8 geted RiEE & @ F R T G w0 3 e dgw o e
i, 1910 siRfaf B mr 21 oF sffem &t o) 24-% & oA (1) @ @ve (9) §
Tl ogE B B A B @ W (CER 2 ery suad) gew e 3 Re
aEHE @i 3 SfeR W Re mr ¥ 1 onedt g, Sw RW A S% i@l & wEn
& I R e (Rt 2Rk @it wsw a0 & kR oae @1 @) Faemed, 2003
i Ren 2, st Reiw 8 Raoes, 2003 & ot B, Rrad w=w o 3 el § RRd aRa
F I FA B R IuEw R mn ¥ Re it sfew sl wdew Raw wdsw gan
URYe §M IR RT T SR o # "0 Ie9 g, saeEe o fafvsen e @ B aew
a9 F G-PEmR ' IuEm F R R aRw @ e ¥g ande mW & 3 Fewad @
Sue, 3% SfafTER # Suesdl & oiER ametm T8 R oiR 09 arddr @ fes sEad #
S EfRT | AR 70 IR e & gEed Ry # O A AW il % ey M w

14 RPH_2018 adhiniyam 22



TN WY IR THE, 11 AU, 2018 | ' 3
- [F TR, A T TR H A STEREY, 2017 ® A, 2018 % R 9RO F Ew 91 s
I & o e § AR S gew o) g o arRte Wy g S &
gfEE o AEEENRE # HT gsal oqud @A orgen sdw () Wwd @ A0 S
~EE § e @ T RE 0 Jead 9Eed $ Y Feided 7 9 wme R @ R
i 8 fyeva, 2003 & Wowe yWE & So0 fefvaw # Hallew e o Gifed | oIud S
TR 3 Wt 3 oTaE § oF offm § Heted B o @ Rfesw fen o 2
4% T BuE wved @3 § T o1 ol @iva Ry & @ 1 % W3 gia u
FHTE FET AEEF O, A ToUd & RAE 29 FEadl, 2018 H ITX WY FEHN
(Helrer) o7eARy, 2018 (IEX o9 HeARY HEAT 4 9 2018) FEANIG a1 4T |
7e fies gEea seERy & e 9 F R ey e o @

3T 9,
N @AR AT,
W e |

No. 814(2)/LXXIX-V-1-18-1i(ka) 3-2018
Dated Lucknow, April 11,2018

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Aabkari
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2018 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 22 of 2018) as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on April 10, 2018 :—

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 20138
(U. P. ACT NoO. 22 OF 2018)
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT

further to amend the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910.
IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as

follows:—
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Short title and
Act, 2018. commencement
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on September 08, 2003.
2. In the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 hereinafter referred to as the Ameﬂd":';m 0?
i : . . . . i 4-
principal Act, in section 24-A, in sub-section (1) for clause (d) the following :;'L:m; W n:: ]?v

clause shall be substitured, namely:— of 1910
“(d) of selling by retail at shops (for consumption ‘on’ or ‘off” the
premises or for consumption ‘on’ and ‘off’ the premises) any foreign
liquor in any locality.”
3. After section 24-A of the principal Act, the following section shall be ~Insertion of new
inserted, namely:— section 24-AA

“24-AA Notwithstanding any judgment, decree or order of any
court to the contrary, anything done or purporting to have been done,

14 RPH_2018 adhimyam 22



4 Tooe URY AWMU TSE, 11 310, 2018

and any action taken or purporting to have been taken under any
provision of this Act, before the date of publication of the Uttar Pradesh

-
Excise (Amendment) Act, 2018 shall be valid and be deemed always to
have been valid as if the provision of this Act as amended by the said Act
were in force at all material times.”
Repeal and 4. (1) Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 is hereby "
saving Ordinance
B repealed. no. 4 of

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the 2018

provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-
section (1) shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if the provisions of this

Act were in force at all material times.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 has been enacted to consolidate and amend the laws
relating to the import, export, transport, manufacture, sale and possession of intoxicating liquors and
. intoxicating drugs and to authorise the State Government to prohibit the import, export, transport,
manufacture, sale and possession of the liquors and intoxicating drugs in Uttar Pradesh or in any specified
area or areas thereof. In clause (d) of sub-section (1) of section 24-A of the said Act, the Excise
Commissioner is empowered to grant to any person a licence for selling by retail at shops (for
consumption ‘off’ the premises) any foreign liquor. The Excise Commissioner, Uttar Pradesh has in
exercise of the said powers framed the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Settlement of Licences for Model Shop of
Foreign Liquor) Rules, 2003 which is effective from 08-09-2003, in which provision has been made for
the consumption of foreign liquor ‘on’ the premises of the model shop. In the writ petition Akhil Bhartiya
Sarvjan Hitaya Sarvjan Sukhaya Parishad versus State of Uttar Pradesh and others, the High Court of
Judicature at Allahabad has decided that the provision in the rules for giving licence for the sale of foreign
liquor for consumption ‘on’ the premises of model shop is prima facie not maintainable according to the
provisions of the said Act and action should be taken against such licences.

Had the licences of Model Shops cancelled in pursuance of the aforesaid order of the Hon’ble
High Court, the State Government would have been deprived of the revenue generated from the excise
duty on the sale of foreign liquor from October, 2017 to March, 2018 and apart from this the proportional
amount of the licence fees would also have been refunded to the licensees. Therefore, Special Leave to

Appeal (civil) is filed in Hon’ble Supreme Court of India in which Additional Advocate General of

Hon’ble Supreme Court has advised that the said Act should be amended retrospectively with effect from
08-09-2003. It has therefore been decided to amend the said Act in the light of advice of Additional

Advocate General.

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to
implement the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 (U.P.
Ordinance 4 of 2018) was promulgated by the Governor on January 29, 2018.

2. This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance accordingly.

By order,
VIRENDRA KUMAR SRIVASTAVA,
Pramukh Sachiv.

GoTH0ZoUI0—T0UI0 14 TOTIA—2018—(35)—599 ofrri— ([@FER /T / ATHIE) |
fovaogodio—vodio 4 w0 Burfl—12—4—2018—(36)—300 Uftrri—(@r=eR /& / JTHIT) |

14 RPH 2018 adhiniyam 22



	1970UP23.pdf
	UP Act No. 23 of 1970.pdf
	UP Act 4 of 1971.pdf
	UP Act 6 of 1972.pdf
	UP Act 30 of 1972.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1973.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1979.pdf
	UP Act 23 of 1983.pdf
	UP Act 23 of 1984.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 1985.pdf
	UP Act 19 of 1986.pdf
	UP Act 5 of 1989.pdf
	UP Act 1 of 1990.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 1997.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 22 of 1999.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 2000.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 2001.pdf
	2018UP4
	2018UP22


