The Indian Stamp (The Uttar Pradesh Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1970
Act 10 of 1971

Keyword(s):
Instrument of Partition, Treasury, Central Act Amendment

Amendments appended: 20 of 1974, 49 of 1975, 19 of 1982, 32 of 1985, 23 of
1988, 22 of 1990, 11 of 1992, 22 of 1998, 23 of 1998, 9 of 2001, 38 of 2001

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




{ J27 7!

L AIG[ e
e L —
~ - ::4‘
ghozas @ (I g gata) atat=aad 1970 ' @".‘f”‘* " ﬂ*’\%ﬂ
(sareszm wfafe qer1o, 1971) p s &
(v s faares A P 10 e, 1970 £o et TR S FAT AL, (« gad auti®
ﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂﬁw,lmo%oﬁ%&ﬁﬁ‘ﬁ?@afwu ;i‘/ -

RS F1 qfaae & HITO% 201 & s wrgafa 7 i 15 wady, 1971
%oﬁ@”@?&sraﬁaﬁamsmwézﬁquﬁr Tt o # s 18 s,
1971 £o Y sEHICE ZAT 1)
rere s 3 et s # @ s @ O 1899 , sHa< GAHEA
FA & fod
statran
mmﬁq%mﬁa&ﬁﬁwﬁw@ammmzz—
1—(1) ag wfafe cfrea ww (IAC T gaive) wfafwam, 1970 gfireq TR T
3 A \ saT<

2~mmﬁmﬂs§ﬁ$mﬁmﬁfaﬁgﬁaﬂm@,ls99,ﬁ% 1899 %1 T
qﬁﬁaa&ﬁmww%ﬁmuﬁ,m(ﬁ)%mnﬁwﬁﬁamw 2 # gra 11
feear 9T, WAV FT1 HHET

“(é‘r)qgaﬁffriaa,1961%m22%qﬁama&ﬂaﬁé€mm—
mm:»Tﬁﬁmwwﬁﬂm-qa;”

s—n;aufsrﬁmmﬁsrﬁa"rl—a"ri,
(1) w=R 17%mﬁmﬁ=rﬁaﬂ weae waT T S,

"y 7 -gtgetEeE 3, 1961 S 22 @ R SeTRw & €2
aﬁmm&mmﬁmmﬂﬁmwﬁmmm:

7l G, 1952 AT 5 W WA (1) T el
o Y o 3 U H SfEU W AT, T IR qrd &Y S
(2) %zxa”ra@m—qa%mmmqgmu”
(2)@3oﬁmafmmu- ‘

4O AW A e fafer (&) e, 1970 & weAd 7 MA@ ST wow
froen T ST @0 weqRE gEt
) 14, 1970

§ AT 7.

1 faEa

.(aimmmiaﬁfam%faqgmmsq«r{, 1970 £o &1 FWT ,
SEE 9 Ed 1) e e
Price U Paise

o qaro To dro—go o 341 ST (R)——1971--1834 430 (Fwo) 1



N

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADI:‘SH AMENDMENT) ACT, 197
[U. P. Acr No. 20 oF 1974] » :

'[*Awthori-tati.ve English =~ Text of the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesk
Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1974] :
AN’ ‘

ACT

t Mof further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, in its application to Uttar Pradesh.

899. . - . .
79 IT 1S HEREBY enacted in the Twenty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—
1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment)
Act, 1974. : ’
(2) 1t extends fo the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

B3It shall be deemed to have come into force on May 25, 1974.

3. In section 2 of the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act, for clause (15), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
*(15) “instrument of partition’ means any ‘instrument ‘whereby
co-owners of any property divide or agree to divide such property in
severalty, and also 1ncludes— v
(i) a final order for effecting a partition passed by any revenue
authority or any civil court; ¢

L TONTN

«[For Statement of Objects and Reasons, please see  Uttar Pradesh Gazette Bxtraordinary
dated June 12, 1974. ' .
~ (Passed inHindi by the Uttar pradesh Legislative Assembly on June 12,1974, and bythe
Uttar Prades Legislative Council on Jupe 21, 1974.)

(Received the asseat of the Governor on July 21, 1974 under Article 201 of the Constitu-
Received the assent OL MRS XUV B o pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, dated July 22,

Short title,extent
and commenco-
ment. ”

Amendment of
section 2 of Act
11 of 1899,



”
&

(ii) an award by an arbitrator directing a partition ; and

(iii) when any partition is effected without executing any such ins-
trument, any instrument of instruments: s1gned by the co-owners- .

and req()rding, whether by way of declaration of such partition or
otherwise, the terms of such partition amongst the co-owners ;”

Amendznent of 3. 1n section 4 of the principal Act, for the existing sub-section (1), the
section 4., following sub-section shall be substituted, namelyi— .
¢ (1) Where, in the case of any sale, mortgage or settlement, several -

‘instruments are employed for completing the transaction, the principal
instrument only shall be chargeable with the duty prescribed in Schedule
I-B for the conveyance, mortgage or settlement, and each of the other
instruments shall be.chargeable with a duty of five rupees instead of the
duty (if any) prescribed for it in -that Schedule.” :

. msion of a 4. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
~ now section 10-A.  jpgerted, namely:— ‘ \ »

“10-A (l)'NotWithstanding anything contained in section 10, where’
Payment of duty the Collector is satisfied that there is temporary shortage-
in cash. of stamps in the district or that stamps of required
o denominations are not available, he may permit duty
to be paid In Cash and authorise the officer-in-charge of the treasury on:
production of a challan evidencing payment of duty in the Government
treasury or sub-treasury, to certify by endorsement on the instrument
or instruments the amount of duty so paid in cash.

(2) An endorsement made on any instrument under sub-section (1)
shall have the same effect as if the duty of an amount equal to the amount
- ‘ ~ stated in the egdorsement has been paid in respect thereof and such pay- -
ment has been indicated on such instrament by means of stamps in accord-
ance With the requirement of section 10.” '

~ Amendment of - S. Tn section 47-A, in sub-section (4), for the words “two years”, the words.
section 47-A. “four years” shall be substituted and be deemed always to have been substituted.

- Amendment of 6. In Schedule I-B of the principal Act—
-8 chedule I-B. : (1) for- the existing entry in Column 2 against Article 3, the following

entry shall be substituted, namely:—
“Fifty rupees’, -
(2) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (a) of Article 4,
_ the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—
’ “Two rupees”,

(3) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (¢) of Article 5,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely:i— ,
~ “Five rupees”, - :
(4) for the existing table of rates below sub-clause (@) of clause (2)
- of Article 6, the following table stiall be substituted, namely:—

I8 e

Description of instrument Proper stamp
duty

s

, Rs
When the amount of the loan or debt does not exceed Rs. 200 1

When it exceeds Rs. 200 but does not exceed Rs. 400 ) 2

When it exceeds Rs. 400 but does not exceed Rs: 600 3

When it exceeds Rs. 600 but does not exceed Rs. 800 4
When it exceeds Rs. 800 but does not exceed Rs. 1,000 5
When it exceeds Rs. 1,000 but does not exceed Rs. 1,200 6

When it exceeds Rs. 1,200 but does not exceed Rs. 1,600 8

When it exceeds Rs. 1,600 but does not exceed Rs. 2,500 12
When it exceeds Rs. 2,500 but does not exceed Rs. 5,000 25
When it exceeds Rs. 5,000 but does not exceed Rs. 7,500 - 37

When it exceeds Rs. 7,500 but does not exceed Rs. 10,000 50
When it exceeds Rs. 10,000 but does not exceed Rs. 15,000 75

When it exceeds Rs. 15,000 but does not exceed Rs. 20,000 100
When it exceeds Rs. 20,000 but does not exceed Rs. 25,000 125
When it exceeds Rs. 25,000 but does not exceed Rs. 30,000 150
and for every additional Rs. 10,000 or part thereof in excess of

Rs. 30,000 . . .- .-

S cs8222842888888™

50

AL 2




N

_ Where it exceeds Rs. 200 but does riot exceed Rs. 300

-3
(5) for the existing entry in Column 2 against . clause b of 'Article 8,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely.-—-
“Thirty-seven rupees and fifty paise”,

(6) for-the ¢éxisting entry in Column 2 against Aftlcle 10, the followmg
~ eatry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Two hundred and twenty-five rupees”, ,
(7) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (c) of Artlcle 12
the following entry shall be substituted, namely —
“Thirty-seven rupees and fifty paise”, '
(8) for the existing table of rates below Atticle 15, the following table
shall be substituted, namely:—

143

Proper stamp
duly

Description of instrument

W here the amount or value secured does not exceed Rs.‘IO
. Where it exceeds Rs. 10 but does not exceed RS‘ 50
Whert it exceeds Rs. 50 but does not exceed Rs: 100 -

Forty-five paise.
One rupee.

Three rupees and
seventy-five paise,
Seven rupees and
fifty paise..

Eleven rupees and
twenty-five paise.
Fifteen rupees.

Eighteen rupees and
seventy-five paise,
Twenty-two rupees.

and fifty paise.

Where it exceeds Rs. 100 but does not exceed Rs.. 200

Where it exceeds Rs. 300 but does not exceed Rs. 400
‘Where it exceeds Rs. 400 but does not exceed Rs. 500

V/here it exceeds Rs.500 but does not.exceed Rs. 600

Whiere it exceeds RsQ 600 but does not exceed Rs. 700 Twenty-six  rupees
' : and  twenty-five
paise.

Where it exceeds Rs 700 but does not exceed Rs..800
Where it exceeds Rs. 800 but does not exceed Rs. 200

Thirty rupees.
Thirty-three rupees

and seventy-five
paise.
Where it exceeds Rs. 900 but does not exceed Rs. 1,000 Thirty-seven rupees
and fifty paise.

and for every Rs. 500 or part thereof in excess of Rs. 1,000 Eighteen rupees and
’ seventy-ﬁve paise.

(9) for the existing table of rates below Article 23, the following table
shall be substituted, namely:—

[£4

Description of instrument Proper stamp

duty

Rs. P.
Where the amount or value of the conmderatmn of such conveyance
as set forth therein or the market value of the property which is
the subject of such conveyance, whichever is greater, does not

exceed Rs.50 S e e 200
Where it exceeds Rs. 50 but does not exceed Rs. 100 7 50
Where it exceeds Rs. 100 but does niot exceed Rs. 200 .. 15 00
Where it exceeds Rs. 200 but does not exceed Rs. 300. 22 50
Where it exceeds Rs. 300 but does not exceed Rs. 400 30 00
Where it exceeds Rs. 400 but does not exceed Rs. 500 .. 37 50
Where it exceeds Rs. 500 but does not exceed Rs. 600 .. 45 00
Where it exceeds Rs. 600 but does not exceed Rs. . 700 52 50
Where it exceeds Rs. 700 but does not exceed Rs. 800 60 00
Where it exceeds Rs. 800 but does not exceed Rs. 900 67 50
Where it exceeds Rs. 900 but does not exceed Rs. 1.000 75 00
and for every Rs. 500 or part thereof in excess of Rs. 1,000 37 50

fgatd o
uﬂ@"’(ﬂ :

gﬁ‘{ 9ad)

¢ ¥




-

4 N -

(10) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (ii) of Article 24
the foilowing entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Three rupees, when the copy.or extract is of an agricultural lease
or of a mortgage-deed or sale-deed of agricultural land and the
value of the subject-matter of the original does not exceed one thou-
sand rupees; in any other case, five rupees,”

(11) for the exisfing clause (@) in Column 1 of Article 25, the follbvving

clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(a) if the duty with which_the originiﬁl instrument is chargeable

R

does not exceed five rupees;”,

(i‘Z) for the existing entry in Colpmn 2 against clause () of Article 25,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—
““Five rupees”, -
(13) for the existing clause () in Columa 1 of Article 34-A, the following
clause shall be substituted, namely :— »

~*{a) if the duty with which the original instrument is chargeable

R 1]

does not exceed ten rupeecs; . ‘

14) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (& of
Article 34-A, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“Five rupees”,

(15) for the proviso below the existing entry in Column 2 against.
clause (c) of Article 35,, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that in any case when an agreement to lease is stamped
with the ad valorem stamp required for lease, and a lease in pursuance °

of such agreement is subsequently executed the duty on such lease
shall not exceed five rupees.”

(16) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause () of Article 39,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—

~ “One hundred rupees "
(17) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (b) of Article 39,

.

the following entry shall be substituted, namely :—
“Three hundred and twenty-five rupees” .

(18) in Article 45, in Columan 2, for the existing clause (@) of the proviso,
the following clause shall be sybstituted, namely:—,

“(@) When an instrument containing an agreement to divide pro-
perty in severalty is executed and a partition is effected in pursuance
of such agreement, the duty chargeable upon the instrument effecting
such partition or.upon the instrument recording, by way of declara-
tion or otherwise, the terms of such partition shall be reduced by the
amount of duty paid in respect of the first instrument but shall not be

less than five rupees;” .

‘(19) for the existing clause (c) in Column 2 of Atrticle 45, the follow-
ing clause shall be substituted, namely:— :

“(c) where a final order for effecting a partition passed by any -

Revenue authority orany Civil Coutt, or an award by an Arbitrator

directing a partition, is stamped with the stamp required for any

insttument of partition, and an instrument of partition, in pursuance
~ of such order or award is subsequently executed, the duty on such
instrament shall not exceed five rupees.”,

(20) for the existing entry in Column 2 against item “A”, sub-item (b)
of Article 46, the following eniry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Ope hundred and fifty rupees.”,

(21} for the existing entry in Column 2 against item “B” of Article 46,
_the followigg entry shall be substituted, namely :—

e D seatap Y2




R

5

(22) for the existing table of rates under Article \48',;the following table
shall be substituted, namelys— 4 '

Description of instrument - 4 Proper stamp
- duty

- (@) when executed for the sole purpo'/se of procuring the Two rupees and fifty -
registration of on¢ or more documents in relationto a paise. S
single transactio# or for admitting execution of one or
more such documents;

" : 7 ‘ w-aﬂi’ﬁ“l
. - . NP *hil
() when authorising one person or more to act in a single Five rupee: ﬁm;" 'i N
. transaction other than the case mentioned in clause (a); gma )

* {c) when authorising not more than five persons to act Twenty rupeds. . __  q@dd
P . m{ gaﬂ' < A

_ jointly and severally in more than one transaction or
generally; ;

(d) when authorising more than five but not more than ten Forty :rupeeS.
persons to act jointly and severally in more than one '
transaction or generally;

te) when given for consideration and authorising the Thesame duty as a

attorney to sell any immovable property; yconveyance (no.

~ 23) of th¢ consi-
_ ‘ deration. .

{f) in any other case ' .. Fiveruapees for each
: person authorised

(23) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clausé (b) of Article 54,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely —

“Seventy-five Tupees.”,

(24) for the existing clause (a) below Article 55, the following clause
shall be substituted, namely :— t

“(a) if the amount or value of the claim does not exceed Rs.2,500;”
(25) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (b) of Article 55,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—
“One hundred rupees.”,
(26) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (b) of Article 57,
the following entry shall be substituted, namely —
“Thirty-seven tupees and seventy-five paise.”,

(27) for the existing provisq in Column 2 against Article 58, the follow-
ing proviso shall be substituted, namely *— .

«provided that, where an agreement to settle is stamped with the
stamp required for an Insttument of settlement and an instrument of
settlement in pursuance of such agreement is subsequently executed,
the duty on suth instrument shall not exceed five rupees.”,

(28) for the existing clause (a)-in Column I of Article 61, the follow-
ing clause shall be ' substituted, namely:— ’ ,

“(a) when the duty with which the lease is chargeable does not

exceed thirty-seven rupees and seventy-five paise.”

/. . . .
29) for the existing entry in Column 2 against clause (b) of Article 61»
the following entry shall be substituted, namely —

«Thirty-seven rupces and seventy-five paise.”,

(30) for the existing item (i) of clause (¢) in Column 1 of Article 62,
the following item shall be substituted, pamely —

(i) if .the duty on such bond, mortgage-deed or policy does not
excoed thirty-seven rupees and seventy-five paise.”’




L
v ) 7 &

6
S (31) for the existing eniry in Column 2 against item (ii) below clause (c)
of Article 62, the following entry shall be substituted, namely :—

“Thirty-seven rupees and seventy-five paise :

Provided that, if by any one instrument the interest secured by
several bonds, mortgage-deeds or policies of insurance is transferred
the duty payable in respect of such instrument shall be the aggregate .
of the duties which would have been payable if separate instruments
of tramsfer were executed in respect of each such bond, mortgage-
deed or policy of insurance.” :

(32) for the existing entry in Columa 2 against item “B” of Article 64
the following entry shall be substituted, namely:— -

9
\

“The same duty as a Bond (no. 15) for a sum equal to the amount
or value of the property concerned but not exceeding seventy-five
rupees.”. ' /

Repeal, 7. The Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 1974 is U.P,Ordl-
hereby repealed. m‘ 99’2.

*

 qroquenofto—o dto 132 Mo (Famfawt)——1456-1974=~1827+50S.S. (¥o)



.

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 197%
(U. P. Act ~o. 49 oF 1975)

*[Authoritative English Text of the Bhartiya Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Sanshodhan)'
Adhiniyam, 1975]

AN
ACT

further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, in 1its application
to Uttar Pradesh

It 1s nErey enacted in the Twenty-sixth Year of the Republic of India
as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amend-
ment) Act, 1975. ’

2y It extends to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

(8) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may
by notification in the Official Gazette appoint in this behalf.

9. 1In section 2 of the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, as amended in its applica-
tion to Uttar Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), after
clause (26-A), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“97. ‘Quarter’ means a quarter of the financial year.”

*[ For Statement of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh Gazett: (Extra-
ordinary), dated August 9, 1975].
(Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on August 6, 1975 and by the
“Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on August 8, 1975).
(Received the Assent of tie President on September 22, 1975, under Article 201 of the
Constitution of India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette (Extraordinary), dated
September 27, 1975). .

Short title, extent
and commence-
ment.

Amendment of
section 2 of
Act 11 of 1897.

pPRICEH 15 PA

[

3

€2}



2
Amendment of 3. In section 6-A of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the follow-
section 6-A. ing sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“6-A. Where any instrument is registered in any nart of India other
than Uttar Pradesh and instrument relates, wholly or p.ctly to any property
situate in Uttar Pradesh, the copy of such instruni-at shall, when received
in Uttar Pradesh, be liable to be charged wiily the difference of stamp
duty as for original under section 19-A to the extent of and in proportion
to the consideration or value of property situated in Uttar Pradesh, and
the party liable to pay stamp duty on the original instrument shall
upon receipt of notice from registering officer pay the difference in
the duty within the time allowed.”

Insertion of sec- 4. After section 11 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
tion 11-A. inserted, namely :— :

“I-A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 11, the

stamp duty due under Article 25-A of Schedule I-B on

dut}; ymen Oonf @ counterpart or duplicate  (including counterfoil or

such memos carbon copy) of a bill or cash memo may be paid

either by means of stamps on the date of issue of such

instruments, or in cash once in every quarter, for all such instruments

issued in the previous quarter, into the treasury or sub-treasury under such
head as the State Government may by general or special order direct.

(2) The treasury challan prepared for deposit of duty in cash shall
be accompanied by such statement and shall be preserved for the
purpose of verification for such period and proper account thereof
shall be maintained in such form as the State Government may by
general or special order direct.”

Se“g?ggd;’gem of 5. In section 33 of the principal Act, after sub-section (2), the following
: sub-sections shall be inserted, namely :—

“(3) Where deficiency in stamp duty paid is noticed from the copy
of any instrument, the Collector may swo molu or on a reference from
any court or from the Chief Inspector of Stamps, Uttar Pradesh or any
Officer of the Stamp Department, Board of Revenue, call for the original
instrument for the purpose of satisfying himself as to the adequacy of
the duty paid thereon, and the instrument  so produced before the
Collector shall he deemed to have heen produced or come in the per-
formance of his functions.

(4) In case the instrument is not produced within the period specified
by the Collector, he may require payment of deficit stamp duty, if any,
togethen with penalty under section 4@ on the copy of the instrument :

~ Provided that no action under sub-section (8) or sub-section 4
shall be taken after a period of four years from the date of execution
of the instrument.”

Amendment of 6. In section 47-A of the principal Act—
section 47-A. . . » . .
(@) in sub-section (1) for the words, “is less than that determined +in

accordance with any rules made under this Act”, the words, “is less than
even the minimum value determined in accordance with any rules made
under this Act” shall be substituied,

(b) in sub-section (4), for the words, “or on a reference from Chief
Inspector of Stamps, Uttar Pradesh” the words, “or on a reference from
any court or from the Chief Tnspector of Stamps, Uttar Pradesh or any
officer of the Stamp Department of the Board of Revenue” shall be
substituted.

Amendment  of 7. For section 48 of the principal Act, the tollowing section shall be
section 48, -y .
substituted, namely :—

“48.  All duties, penzlties and other sums required to be paid under.

Recovery of this Act may be recovered by the Collector by distress
duties and pe- wand sale of the movable property of the person from
nalties. whom the same are due or by any other process for the
time being in force for the recovery of arrears of land revenue.”




3

cti e principal Act, the followi tions shall be In
8. After section 64 of the principal Ac e following sections sha I ections G4.A

inserted, namely :— and 64-B.

“64-A. Any person who either refuses or neglects to stamp a counter-
penaity for omis- Part or duplicate (including counterfoil or carbon
sion to comply copy) of any bill or cash memo on the ‘date of its
with sections 11-A  jssue in accordance with Article 25-A of Schedule 1-B or
a‘tld “}‘“(‘f]le zijA fails to pay the duty in cash in accordance with section
of Schedule B~ 11 A or where the same is paid in cash, fails to main-

tain a proper account thereof in accordance with sub-section (2) of

section 11-A, shall for every such offence be punishable with fine which

may extend to five hundred rupees. .

64-B. (1) Where any person liable to pay duty under this Act is

Recovery of convicted of an offence under section 62 or 64, in
amount of respect of any instrument (not being an instrument
deficit  stamp specified in Eatry 91 of List I in the Seventh Schedule
to the Constitution), the Magistrate shall in addition
: to any punishment which may be imposed for such offence, direct
recovery of the amount of duty and penalty, if any, due under this Act
from such person in respect of that instrument, and such amount shall
also be recoverable as if it were a fine imposed by the Magistrate.
(2) Upon such recovery the Collector shall thereupon certify by
endorsement on the instrument that proper duty or penalty, as the
case may be, has been levied in respect thereof.”

PSUP—-A.P. 134 Sa. (Vidhayaka)——l77l—~1976—1827-‘r50 SS. (M ).




No. 1299(2)/XVNII V-1—120-1981
Dated Lucknow April 26, 1982
In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English transieticn-¢f ke

Bhartiva Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1982 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam San-
khya 19 of 1982), as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Leg:s]ature and assented to by the President

on April 20, ]982
THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1982
" (U.P. ACT No. 19 oF 1982)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN

ACT
further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, in its application to Uttar Pradesh

It 15 HerepY cnacted in the Thirty-third Year of the Republic of India
as follows :
Short title, extent I. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Uttar Prade:’
Efm commence- Amendment) Act, 1982,
' (2) It extends 1o the whole of Uttar Pradesh.




!
g
i

g T

AT T2 AT 9L, 26 AT, 1982

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
Motification, appoint in this behalf.

2. In Schedule I-B to the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, hereinafter referred
to as the said Scheduvle, in Article 1, in the second column for the existing entry
the following entry shall be substituted, namely —

“Fifty Paise.”

3. In the said Schedule, in Article 2, in the second column, for the existing

entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely :—

“Subject to a maximum of two hundred rupecs, the
a Bond (No. 15).”

4. TIn the said Schedule, in Article 3, in the second column, for the words
“Fifty rupees’ the words *““Seventy-five rupees” shall be substituted.

same duty as on

5. 1In the said Schedule, in Article 4, in the second column, for the words,
“Four rupees and fifty paise” the words “Five rupees”™ shall be substituted.

6. In the said Schedule, in Article 5, in'clause (¢), in the second column,
for the words “Five rupees” the words “Six rupees” shall be substituted.

7. Inthesaid Schedule,in Article 6, in clause (2), in sub-section (a), in the
second column, f>r the figures set out in Column 1 below, the figures sct out in
Column 2 below, shall be substituted :—

Colurmn 1 Column 2
Rs. P. Rs. P.
1.00 ' 1.50
2.00 © 3.00
3.00 4.50
4.00 ¥ 6.00
5.00 2 7.50
6.00 9.00
8.00 12.00
12.50 18.75
25.00 37.50
37.50 56.25
50.00 75.00
© 75.00 112.50
100.00 150.00
125.00 187.50
150.00 225,00
50.00 75.00

8. In the said Schedule, in Article 7:—
(a) inclause (@), in the second column, for the existing entry the
following entry shall be substituted, namely :— :
“Fifty rupees”. ‘
(b) inclause (D), in the second column, for the existing entry the follow-
ing entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“One hundred rupees.”

9. 1In the said Schedule, in Article 10, in the second column, for the exis-
ting entry the following entry shall be substituted, namely :—

“Three hundred rupees.”

10. In the said Schedule, in Article 11, in the second column, for the
existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Four hundred rupees.”

11. In the said Schedule, in Article 17, in the second column, for the
existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely: —

“Twenty-five rupees.”

12. 1In the said Schedule, in Article 19, in the second column, for the
existing entry the following entry shall be substituted, namely:- -

“Fifty paise”

Amendment of

Article 1

of

Schedule I-B to
Actno.2 of 1899,

Amendment
Article 2.

Amendment
Article 3.

Amendment
Article 4.

Amendment
Article 5.

Amendment
Article 6.

Amendment
Article 7.

Amendmont
Article 10.

Amendment
Article 11,

Amendmeni
Article 17.

Amendment
Article 19.

of

of

of

of

of

of

of

of

of

of



6 I T2 AFTITT THE, 26 AXS, 1982

Amendment of 13. Inthe said Schedule, in Article 20, in the second column, for the
Artlcle 20. existing entry the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Six rupees.”

mendment of . . . .
A’?t?czz gmz,n ° 14. In the said Schedule, in Article 22,in the second column, for the
existing entry the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—
“Fifty rupees.”
A’P?”dj;‘“” of 15. In the said Schedule, in Article 26, in the sccond  column. for the
Article 26 cxisting entry the following entry shall be substiruted. namely:

“Subject to a maximum of one hundred fifty rupees, the samc duty
as on a Bond (no. 15).”

,{?f;ﬁf‘i’gcm of 16, Tn the said Schedule. in Article 28, inthc second column, for the
4 NVEAE P . R R
existing entry the following entry shall be substituted, namely:

“Fifty paisc.”
Af}g’ggdggfm of 17. In the said Schedule, in Article 29, in the second column. for the
‘ existing eatry the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—
“Twenty-five rupees.”

Aﬂ";g?zl’iedgf}; of 18. TIn the said Schedule, in Article 34-A, in the second column, for the
i words “Five rupees”™ the words “six rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 19

Article 36, In the said Schedule, in Article 36, in the second column, for the

existing entry the following entry shall be substituted, namley :—
“Fifty paise.”

A’?g’cel’;d?’;m of 20. In the said Schedule, in Article 39, in the second column, for the words
) “one hundred rupees” the words “Two hundred rupees’ shall be substituted and
Jor the words “Three hundred and twenty-five rupees” the words “Five hundred

rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of i i i —
Pstiviny nt o 21. In the said Schedule, in Article 43,

(a) inclause(a),in the second column, for the existing entry, the follow-
ing entry shall be substituted, namely :

“One rupee.”

(b) in clause (b), in the second column, for the existing entry, the
following entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Subject to 2 maximum of seventy-five rupees; one rupee for every
Rs. 10,000.0r part thereof of the value of the stock or security.”

Amendment  of . .22. In thesaid Schedule, in Article 44, in the second column, for the
Article 44, existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely ;—

“Three rupees.”

Amendment of 23. In the said Schedule, in Article 48, —
Article 48,

(a) in clause (a), in the second column, for the words “Two rupees and
fifty paise” the words ““Three rupees’ shall be substituted;

(b} in clause (b), in the second column, Jor the words “Five rupees”
the words “Six rupees’ shall be substituted;

(¢} in clause (c), in the second column, Jor the words “Twenty rupees”
the words “Tweaty-four rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) in clause {(d), in the second column, for the words “Forty rupees”
the words “Forty-cight rupees” shall be subs fituted ;

(e clause (/). in the second column, for the words UHive rupees”
the words “'Six rupees™ shall be substituted.

5 4 fin the soid Schedule, in A riacte 50, i the second column far the o3
« o es Il L Hele, an Articie DUy i the second column, for the exis-
Ship ey, ihe ollewing entry shadl be substitured, namely :—

“Five rupees,”’




LA e R R

e

AT

S WX SFETETC THE, 26 FHH; 1982 s 7

pe———
et s e

25. In the said Schedule, in Article 51, in the second column, for the Aﬁ?:{;dg;ent of
existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely:— .

“Five rupees.”

. .. . Amendment of
26. Inthesaid Schedule, in Article 58 in item B, in the second column, for  Artlcle 55

the existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“The same duty as a Bond (No. 15) for a sum equal to the amou?t or
value of the property concerned, but not exceeding fifty rupees. ’

. .. Amendment of
97. Inthesaid Schedule,in Article 60, in the second column, for the existing articte 60.

entry, the following entry shall be substituted, pamely:—
“Fifty paise.”

. . ‘ Amendment of
28. 1Inthesaid Schedule under Article 62:— Article 62.

(a) in clause (¢), in sub-clause (ii), in the second column, for the words
“Thirty-seven rupees and seventy-five paise” the words “Seventy-five
rupees” shall be substituted ;

(b) in clause (d), in the second column, for the existing cntfy, the fol-
‘lowing entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“Sixty-seven rupees and fifty paise” ;

(¢) inclause(e), inthe second column, for the existing entry, the follow-
ing entry shall be substituted, namely:—

+

“Thirty-four rupees or such smaller amount as may be chargeable
under clauses (b) and (c) of this agticle.”

29. Inthesaid Schedule,in Article 64, inPart A, in clause (b), inthe second ,Aﬂ‘?c"‘e‘dﬂ‘m of
column, for existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely:— = )

“On ten thousand rupees, the duty payable under clause (a), and on

the remainder, Three rupees for every additional one thousand rupees
or part thereof.”

30. Inthesaid Schedule,in Article 65, in the second column, for the exist- Amendmont of
ing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely:— Article 65.

““Three rupees.”

By order,
G. B. SINGH,
Sachiy.

drogE e 70 Tro—-gofro 22 J6 freT0—=27~4—52 - 342)~1982~850 (FF0) |

I —



[,

i e

T R TR A R B e S T

SRT AT AWETE TAE, 17 T, 1985

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1985
(U. P. Act No. 32 of 1985)
(4s passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN

Act

further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 inits application to Uttar Pradesh

It 1s uEreBY enacted in the Thirty-sixth Year of the Republic of India,
as follows :

1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amend-

ment) Act, 1985.
- 178433
(2) It shall extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

2. In Schedule I-B to the Indian Stamp Act, 1899—

(a) in Article 15 (Bond), in the column relating to the “Proper
Stamp Duty”, for the words set out in column 1 of the table below, the
words set out respectively against them in column 2 of the table below,

. shall be substituted, namely :

Y

CoLumN 1 - COLUMN 2
(Existing words) ‘ (Words to be substituted)
- Fifty paise " One rupee
Two rupees | ‘ Two rupees and fifty paise
Fourfupses and twzanty-five paise’ Four rupees and seventy five paise
Right rupees and fifty paise Nine rupees and fifty paise '
’ vaélve rupees and seventy-five paise - Fourteen rupees and twenty five
: oo . paise.
_Seventecn rupees _ B Nineteen rupecs
Twenty-one rupees and twenty-five paise Twenty-three rupees and sevexity
) ‘ : - five paise. ‘ .
Twenty-five rupses and fifty paise Twenty-eight rupees and fifty paise
Twenty-nine rupees and seventy-five paise Thirty-three rupees and twenty five
. paise
Thirty-four rupees Thirty eight rupees
Thirty-eight rupzes and twenty-five Forty-two rupees and seventy-five
paise. 7 paise. '
Forty-two rupees and fifty paise - Forty-seven rupees and fifty paise
Twenty-one rupees and twenty-five Twenty-three rupees and seventy-
paise. five paise.

. -

R R

Short title and
extent

Amendment of
~ Schedule I-B to
Act no. I of
1899, . .



S TR AR M AN, 17 YWY, 19857

¥

(b) in Article 23 i(ébnﬁéyéncé), in the column féiyéﬁng'to *‘Proper B

Stamp Duty”, for the figures set out in column 1 of the table below, - ¢
the figures set out respectively against them in column 2 of the table
below, shall be substituted, namely :— ¥
CoLumnN 1 _ CoLumN 2
(Existing figures) ' (Figures to be substituted)
Rs. P. Rs. P.
4.00 4.75
,i 8.50 9.50
17.00 '19.00
25.50 28.50
34.00 38.00
42.50 47.50
1 51.00 57.00 -
59.50 66.50
68.00 76.00
© 76.50 85.50.
85.00 95.00
42.50 47.50

. By order,

' B. L. LOOMBA,
L gy e

0 QO Z0 qto—~ Qoo 198 Ao (faevo)——(2305)-—1985~~850 (¥iwo) 1



MNo. 2138?{2)}}‘{‘!’11-\“1-]{5&]11-1983
Dated Lucknow, November 11, 1988

[N pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,

the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the

Bhartiya Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1988 (Uttar Pradesh Adhinivam

Sankhya 23 of 1988) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the President’

on November 8, 1988.
THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH AME!NDMENT) ACT, 193%
(U. P. AcT no. 93 or IE?ES'}- |
(ds passed’ by the U. P. Legislature)

AN
© ACT

further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899,:in its application to Uttar Pradesh

IT is HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-ninth YEE‘;: of the Republic of India

as follows : -

Short titls, extent 1. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amend-
and cfmmenc®  ment) Act, 1988. ’ '

I‘l'.ll“-nh
(2) It shall extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

”~

(3) It shall be deemed to have come into force on June 24, 1988,

Amendment of 2. In Schedule 1.B to the Indian Stamp Act, 1399, hereinafter referred

ﬁ t- : 5 -!| ﬂf . * ] . g o -
QR 1B fo to as the said Schedule, in Article 3 (Adoption-Deed), in the column relating

e T of to the “Proper Stamp Duty” for the words ‘‘Seventy-five rupees” the words -

1899 ‘one hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
Article 6 of the

3, In the said Schedule, in Article 6 (Agreement Telating to dé'posit of
sajd Schedule, title deeds, pawn or pledge), in clause (2), in sub-clause (4), in the column ,
' relating to the “Proper stamp duty” for the figures set out in column 1 of the -




e s

T TR FATETOIAE, 11 A7ET, 1988 -5

tahla below, the figures set out respectively against them in column 2 thereof
shall be substituted, namely — : .

Column 1 : . : Column 2
Rs. P ‘ , Rs. P.
1,50 3.00 -
3.00 : _ 600 -
4,20 ' 9.00 ) R )
‘ 6.00 . . 12.00 i )
7,50 o 15.00 ) o
9.00 18.00
12.00 ' 2400 o ,
1875 , , 37.50 - ' . :
-37.50 ‘ 75.00
56.25 ' _ . 112,50
75.00 . 150,00
112.50 o 225.00
150,00 ‘ 300.00
187.50 ‘ ' 375.00 '
225.00 v 450.00
75.00 v , o ~» -150.00

4. 1Inthe said Schedule, in Article 15 (Bond), inthe column relating to  Amendment of
the “Proper stamp duty”,fo7 the words set out in column 1 of the table below, Article 15 of the
the words set out respectively against them in - Column 2 thereof shall be %2id Scheduls
substituted, namely — .

Column 1 Column 2
. Rs. P. . ' Rs. P,
One rupee : _ - One rupee and fifty paise
Two rupees and fifty pais Three rupees:
Four rupees and seventy-five paise ‘Five rupees and fifty paise
Nine rupees and fifty paise " Eleven rupees
" Fowrteen rupees and twenty-five paise Sixteen rupees and fifty paise
Nineteen rupees A Twenty-two rupees : . |
Twenty-three rupees and seventy-five ' Twenty-seven rupees and fifty paise )
paise. : ,
Twenty-eight rupees and fitty paise  Thirty-three Tupees
Thirty-three rupees and-twenty-five paise - Thirty-eight rupees and fifty paise
Thirty-eight rupees 7 - Borty-four Tupees
Forty-two rupecs and seventy-five paise 3 Forty-nine rupees and fifty paise
Forty-seven rupees and fifty paise “Fifty-five rupees - |
Twenty-three rupees and seventy-five paise Twenty-seven rupees and fifty paise, e

3 . 0

5. In the said Schedule, in Article 23 (Convéyance), in the column relat~-  Amendment of
ing to “Proper stamp duty” for the figures set-out in Column 1 of the table Articte 23 of the
below, the figures set out respectively against thém in Column 2 thereof saidBchedule.
‘shall be substituted, namely :— ~ : ‘ ‘

Column 1 B Column 2
RS. P- . . : RS. Pc
4775 . » 6.25
9.50 » 12.50
19.00 - - ' ' 25.00
28.50 : : 37.50
3300 50.00
47.50 - T 62.50
57.00 : 75.00
66.50 - ‘ 87.50 ’
76.00 ' 100.00 -
85.50 ; : o 112.50 ,
95.00 i , ‘ 125.00

47.50




6 "I Y FATUTOT T3, 11 %Y, 1988
: AS!thiﬁf;siOl} ?; 6. Inthe said Schedule,for Article 24 (Copy or extract), the following
1cle (¢} 4 ] z 7 . . ’
eaid Sehe dule. Article shall be substituted, namely :— _
) “24. Copy or extract certified to R R
be a true copy or extract by or by , o o -

order of any public officer and hot
‘ , chargeable under the law for the time :
L being in force relating to - court-fees— ,

-+ (i) if the original was not charge-  Two rupees and twesty-five paise
able with duty or if the duty with when-the copy or extract is ofan A
which 1t was_chargeable does not agricultuiallease or of a mortgage- =
exceed three rupees. - " deed orsale-deed of agricultural E
: . ' land; in any other case, five rupees. E
g:) in any other ease not falling . Three rupees, when the copy of -
within the previsioms of section 6-A. extract is'of ah agricultural le2se’or
. of a mortgage-deed or sale-deed of
‘ . ' ‘agriculturalland and the value of
. » ‘the subject-matter of the origina!l
, o _ or , _ does. not exceed one thousand
‘ ‘ v rupees ; in any other case ten trupees.

Exemption

(¢) Copy of any paper whicha . ' .
public officer is expressly required by ) ‘ ‘ )
law to make or furnish for record in I
any public office or for any public pur-
pose. .

. (b) Copy of, or extract from, any
register relating to births, baptisms, -
_ namings  dedications,  marriages,
divorces, deaths or burigls.”’ ’

e

Amendment of ' 7. Tn the said Schedule, in Article 48 (Power of Attorney)—
8 Article 48 of the ,

said Schedyle. " (a) in clause (b), in the column relatingto “Proper stamp duty.”
, for the words «‘Six rupees’ the words “Ten rupees™ shall be substituted;
(b) in clause (¢), inthe column relating to Proper stamp - duty” for
. the words “Twenty-four rupess” the words «Fifty rupees’” shall be
- : © substituted; - B
’ (¢) in clause (d), in the column relating to “Proper stamp duty” for

“the words «Forty-eight rupees” the words “One hundred rupees” - shall
be substituted, g :

(4 In clause (f)yin the column relating to “Proper stamp duty® for
the words <‘Six rupees’” the words “Ten rupees™ shall be substituted.

: Repeal = and 8. (1) The Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 1988,
i Saving 'is hereby repealed, o ‘

(2y Notwithstanding such refeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the Act reperred to in section 2, as amended by the
Ordinance referred to sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or
taken under the corresponding provisions of the said Act, as amended by this
‘Act, as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all material time,

By order,
5. N. SAHAY, -
Sachiv. -

.

_frotwo govto~goivo 128 AT e (Fawro)=(2140)~1988-850 (Wwo)1




il — e pi—"
No. 1886(2) /XVII-V—1-1(KA)25-1990 -
" Dated ‘Lucknow, July 25, 1990

In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Censtitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication
of the following Finglish translation of Bhartiya Stamp (Uttar Pradesh
Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1990 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 22
of 1900) .as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to
by the President on July 23, 1990. . _

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1990
[U. P. Acr No. 22 OF 19907

(As paseed by the U. P. Legislature)
; AW
ACT

further to amend the Indian Stamp Act. 1599 in its application to Uttar
Pradesh ' B

-




ITT WM KAV W, 25 JATE, 1990 . 3

" “ It 1 HEREBY cmacted in the Forty-first Year of the republic of India
aS¥ollews . . ‘ |
1. (1) This Aect may Bbe called the Indian Stamp Utter Pradesh Short title extent

ent) Act, 1990. and commences . - ‘
Amendment) Act, and ,

(2) It shallextend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh. L
(3) It shall be deemed to have come into force on June 7, 1990, o

5. Tn Schedule I-B to the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 hereinafter referred  Amendment of
{0 as the principal Act in Article 5 (Agreement of Memorandum of an Agree- Schedule I-B to
ment) after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :— . fscgrs) No. 2 of
“(b-1) if relating to the sale of The sameduty as on conmveyance
an immocvable property where,1n (No. 23) onone half of the amount of
part performance of the contract consideration as set forthinthe agree-
possessien is admitted to kave been ment.
delivered or isagreed to bedelivered
without executing the conveyance :—

Provided that when conveyance in
pursuance of such agreement

(i is executed, the duty paid
under this elause shall be adjusted
towards thetotal duty payableon
the conveyance ;

(ii) is not executed, the duty
paid under this clause in excess of
theduty payableunder clause (c)
shall subject to the rules be re-
funded without anydeductiononan
application . being made for - the
purpose not beyomd 6 months

from the expiration of the period
during which conveyanee could
have been executed in pursuance of
the agreement.”

Ord- 3. (1) The Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 1999, Repeal and saving

no. is |
%%, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action tak
under the  provisions of the principal Act, as an%ended by thye Ordintan::
rgferred toin sub-sect_lon (1), shall be deemed to have been dope or takcn,
under the corresponding provisio ns of the principal Act as amended by this
Act, as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times, '

By order,
NARAYAN DAS,
Sachiv.

90 Ta0 T 0 Fro~-To o 123 IO (f\a'HTO)-'-(1492)-—1990—8507(3?0)I




" e uge swraTwr Twe, 20 W, 1992

No. 736 (2)/XVII.V—1—I(KA) 29/1591
Dated Lucknow, 1992
In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Consitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the
Bhartiya Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Sanshodhan) Adbiniyam, 1992 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam
Sankhya 11 of 1992) as passed by the Uttar przdesh Legicletvre end ascented to by the Presider:
on March 17, 1992,

THE INIIJAN S’fAMP (UTTAR FRALISE AMENDMENT) ACT, 1992
(U. P. Act No. 11 or 1992)
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)

AN
ACT

Surther to amend the” Indian Stewp™ Act, 1559 in its application to Utiar Pradesh

IT 35 HEREBY enacted in tuwe Forty-third Year? of the Republic of India as’

follows :—

Short title extent 1. (1) This Act may be called_the Indian Stamp Uttar Pradesh (Amendment)

and commence- -
an e Act, 1992.

(2) It shall extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.:.

(3) Sections 2to 5 shall be deemed to have come into force on November
1, 1991, and the remaining provisions shall come into force atonce.

Amendment of 2. In section 2 of the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, hercinafter referred to as
5;“%“% of Act  the principal Act, in clause (16), affer sub-clause (d), the following clause
&No. 2 of 1899 . shall be inserted, namely :—

“(e) any instrument by which mining lease is granted in respect of
minor minerals as defined in clause (e) of section 3 of the Mines and
Minerals (Regulation and Development) Act, 1957.” ‘

Amendment of 3. In section 10-A of the principal Act, ﬂ)—r‘sub-section ()] ihe following
section 10-A  gub-section shall be substituted namely —_— ~

“M NotWithstanding énythj'ng contained in section 10—

(a) where the Collector is satisfied that there is temporary
" shortage of stamps in the district or that stamps of required deno-
minations are not available, he may permit duty to be paid in
cash and authorize the officer-incharge of the treasury on produc-
tion of a challan evidencing payment of duty in the Government
. ) treasury or sub-treasury, to certify by endorsement on the
g instrument or instruments the amount of duty so paid in cash;

(b) where the State Government considers itexpedient so to do,
it may, in any district, permit duty to be paid in cash and
authorize any officer, to receive payment of duty in cash and to
certify by endorsement by means of a Franking machine on the
instrument or insruments the amount of duty so paid in cash.”

Amendment of 4. In section 47-A of the principal Act—

section 47-A
(a) in sub-section (1) for.the words, “of conveyance, exchange, gift,
settlement, award or trusi” the words ‘“om which duty is chargeable
on the market value of the property” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (2) for the words “of conveyance, exchange,
gift, settlement, award or trust” where they occur for the first time,
the words ““on which duty is chargeable on the market value of the
property” and for thesaid words where they occur for the second
time, the words “‘of such instrument” shall be substituted ;

(¢) inZsub-section (3); for the words “of conveyance, exchange, gift,
settlement, award or trust,” the words “of the instrument> shall be
substituted ;

i i S



PRS-

(d) in sub-section (#) for the words, “f conveyance, exchange, gift,

scttlement, award or trust,’

where they oceur for the first tim3, the

words “on which duty is chargcable on  tae market value of the
property” and for the sid words, whare they oczar for the second

time, the words

(¥

“of such instrumeni”” shall b2 suhstitured.

In Schedule I-B to the principal Act I—

(a) in Article - 5, in clause (¢), in the column relating to the propet

stamp duty, for the words “Six

rupees” shall be substituted ;

rup3es” the words  “‘One hundred

(b) in Article 15, in the coiumn relating 10 propsr stamd duty, for

the words set out in column 1 below, the words sst ouf

against them

in column 2 below shall be substituted, namely —

CoLumnN |

One rupee and filty paise
Three rupees ¥

Five rupees and fifty paise
Eleven rupees

Sixteen rupees and fifty paise

Twenty-two rupees
Twenty-seven rupees and fifty paise

Thirty-three rupees
Thirty-eight rupees and fifty paise

Forty-four rupces
Forty-nine rupees and fifty paise
Fifty-five rupees

COLUMN 2

Two rupees.
.. Four rupees.
_ Six rupees and twenty-five  paise.
.. Twelve rupees and fifty paise.
Eighteen rupses and seventy-five
paise.
Twenty-five rupecs.
.. Thirty-one  rupees and twenty-fiv 9
paise.
.. Thirty-seven rups3 and fifty puiss.
.. Forty-three T1up23s and ssveaty-five
paise.
.. Fifty rupses.
Fifty-six rapse;and twanty-five paise *
Sixty-two rupzss and fifty paise.

oce

)

Twenty-seven rupees and fifty paise .. Thirty-one rups and twaaty-five

(¢) in Article 25 :—

paise.

~

(i) in clause (a), in the column relating to the description of
instrument, for the words “five rupees” the words “fifty rupees’’

shall be substituted ;

(i) in clause (b), in the column relating to the propet stamp
duty, for the words “Five rupees” the words “ffty rupees” shall

be substituted.
(d) in Artiele 35—

1(i) in clause (@), in sub-clauses (i), (i), (iv) (), (vi) and (vii)
in the column relating to propet stamp duty, for the existing entries,
the following entries shall be substituted, pamely :—

in sub-clause (ii)

in sub-clause (iil);

in sub-clause (iv)

in sub-clause (V)

—

“The same duty as a conveyance (no. 23), for

a consideration equal to three times the
amount or value of the average annual

rent reserved.”

«“The same duty as a conveyance (no. 23), for

a consideration equal to four times the
amount or value of the average anpual rent
reserved.”

“The same duty as a conveyance (no. 23), for

a consideration equal to five tim3s the
amount or value of the average annual rent
reserved.”

“The samc duty as a conveyance (no. 23) for

a consideration equal to six tim3s the
amount or value of the average anannal
remt reserved.”

Amendment of
Schednle 1-B




#

| gt W srETHTOT TAE, 20 W, 1992

in sub-clause (vi) “The same duty as a conveyance (no. 23), for
‘a  consideration cqu:sl to - ten times the
amount or value of the average annual
rent reserved.”

in sub-clause (vii} “The same duty as a Conveyance (no. 23), for
a consideration cqual to one-third of the
whole amount of rent . which would be
paid or delivered in respect of the first
fifty vears of the lease.” -

(i) after explanation (3), the following explanation shall be
inserted, namely :—-
“(4) The aggregate amount at which tolls are let, whether
payable in Jump sum or instalments, shall be deemed to be
premium for the purposes of this Article.” -

() in Article 48, afrer clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :— -

“(ee) When irrevocable Thesame duty as a conveyance (no. 23)
authority is given on the market wvalue of the
to the attorney to property forming subject of such
sell immovable authority™,

properiy.

6. (1) The Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 1991
Is horeby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under
the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-section (L),
shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions
of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the provisions of this Act were

ip foree at all material times.

By order,
NARAYAN DAS.
Sachiv.

froegegofro-aodfo 327 Ay (f&'k’?(}}u{ﬁ}84;_199‘3_.35@ (Fa)




NG, 427 (X VI-V-1—1(KA) 25-1997
Dated Lucknow, July 27, 1908
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of indix, ihe
- Governor is pleased o order the publication of the following English teanslation of the Bhartiva Suuunp
§ (Uuar Pradesh Sanshodhan), Adhinivam, 1997 (Unar Pradesh Adbiniyam Sankhva 22 of 1998) as passed by
£ the Uttar Pradesh Legislatur2 and assented o by the President on July 18, 1998 -
I

&

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 1997
(0.1, Act No. 22 of 1998)
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesi: Legislature)
AN
ACT

Jurther to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application ro Ustar Pradesh,

‘ [T 1S HEREBY enacted in the Forty-eight Year of the Republic of India
i as [ollows :—

L. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment) Short title.

E Act, 1997 extent and

; commencement
(2} It shail extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

(3) 1t shall come into force on such date as the State Government may. by
titication, appoint in this behall




12 I TR AR W72, 27 HATE, 1998

e
Amendment of 2. In section 33 of the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 hereinatier relerred 10 as the
sceiion 33 of s i < T - isti i ‘ i ‘
Actno 11 of 1rmupa] Act, in sub-section (5), after the existing proviso the following Pro?gigmmu

1899 be inseried, namely = —

“Provided further that with the prior permission of the Staie Government an
action under sub-section (4) or sub-section (5) may be taken after a period of
four years but before a period of eight years {rom the date of execution of the
instrument.”

Amendment of 3. In section 35 of the principal Act, in clause (@) of the PrOVigYor the words

section 35 “five rupees, or, when (en times the amount of the proper duty or deficient portion
thereo!l exceeds five fupecs, of a sum equal to ten times such duty or portion:” the
following words shalll be substituted, namely —

. "a sum equal (O ten times the amount of the proper duty or deficient

. portion thereot;”
"Omission of 4. Scction 39 of the principal Act shall be omitred.
section 39 ) )
Amendment of 5. In section 40 of the priucipal Act in sub-section (1),—

section 40
(a) forclavse {b) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—-

“(b) il he is of opinion that such instrument is chargeable with duty
and is not duly stamped, he shail require the payment of the proper duty
or the amount reqaired to make up the defliciency together with a penalty
of an amount not exceeding ten times the amount of the proper dutly or
of the deficent portion thereof:”

(b) after the existing proviso the following proviso shall be inserred,
namely :—

“Provided further that no penalty shall be levied unless the party
concerned has been given a reasonable opportanity of being bheard.”

Substitution of 6. For scction 47-A of the principal Act, the following scction shall be
section 4T-A - wbstituted, namely —
“47-A (1) If the market value of any nroperty which is the subject of any
Under valuation instrument, on which duty is chargeable on market
of the instrument  yalue of such property, as set forth in such instrument.
is less than even the minimum vatue determined in accordance with the rules
made under this Act, the registering officer appointed under the Registration
Act, 1908 shall, before registering the instrument, refer the same to the
Collector for detenmination of the market valoe ol such property and the proper
duty payablc thegeon.

(2) On reecipt of a reference under sub-section (1) the Collector shall,
after giving the partics a reasouable opportunity gof being heard and after
holding an inguiry in such mauner ns may be prcsf{'ibcd by rules made under
this Act, determine the market value of the property which is the subject of
such instrument and the proper duty payable thercon.

(3) The Coliector may, suo moty, or on a reierence from any court or from
the Commissioner of Stamps or an Additional Commissioner of Stam ps ora
Deputy Commissioner of Stamps or an Assistant Commissioner of Stamps or
aay officer authorised by the State Government in that benalf, within four
years from the date of registaation of any instrument on which duty is
chargeable on the market value of the property, 1ot already referred to him
under sub-section (1), call for and examine the instrutaent for the purpose of
satisfying himsell as (0 the correctness of the market vaue, of the property




I IR SFHTHRT T2, 27 IS, 1998

Ameandment of
section 64

Amendment of
scction 73-A

- Amendment of
section 74

Omission of

which is the subject for of such instrument, and the duty payable thereon, and
the il after such examination he has reason (o betieve that the market value of such
1ail property has not been truly set foith in such instrument, he may determine the
market vatue of such property and the duty payable thereon -
ian Provided that, with Ahe prior permission of the State Government,
1of an action under this sub-section may be taken afier a period of four
the years but before a period of cight years from the date of registration
of the instrument on which duty is chargeable on the market vatue of
wwds the property. : ' '
-ion (4) If on enquiry under sub-section (2) and examination under sub-section
the (3) the Colicctor finds the market value of the property :—
(1) truly set forth and the instrument duly stamped, he shall certify by
ient cndorsement ihat it is duly stamped and retumn it to the person who made
the reference; '

(i) not truly set forth and the instrument not duly stamped he shall
requirc. the payment of proper duty or the amount required to make up
the deficieticy in the same (ogether with a penalty of an amount not
exceeding four time. the amount of the proper duty or the deficient
portion thereof.

futy (5) The instrument produced before the Collecter under sub-section (2) or
futy under sub-section (3) shall be deemed to have come before him in the
alty performance of his functions.
y or (6) In case the instrument is not produced within the period specificd by the
Collector, he may require payment of deficit stamp duty, if any, together with
ted, penalty on the copy of the instrument in accordance with the procedure laid
down in sub- sections (2) and (4).”
arty . 7. In section 64 of the principal Act, for the words, “with fine which may
' extend (o five thousand rupees,” the words “imprisonment for a terin which may extend
to three months or with fine which may extend to ten thousand rupecs or with both™
tbe - shall be substituted. '
8. In section 73-A of the principal Act :—
any ,
kel (a) for sub-section ( 1) the following sub-section shall be substituted,
ent, namely :—
ules . _ o . -
ion “(1) Where the Coliector has reason to believe that any instrument
the chargeable to duty has not been charged at all or has been incorrectly
st charged with duty leviable under this Act, he or any other officer
authorised by him in writing -in this behalf may cnter upon any
premises where the Collector has reason 10 believe that any registers,
inll, books, records, papers, maps, documents or proceedings relating to or in
mij connection with any such instrument are kept and to inspect them, and
.1;‘;;. to take such notes, copies and extracts as the Collector or such officer
decms necessary.”
(b) in sub-scction (2) after the word “papers” the word “maps” and after lht}
m““ word “notes” the word “copies” shall be inserted. '
:lo: 9. In section 74 of the principat Act, for clause (c), the foliowing claisc »shall
1:0111' be substituted, namely :—
y is “(c) the duties and rcmungralion of and the fees chargeable from
him such person.” '
eof : 10. Scction 78 of the principal Act shall be omitted.

erty

section 78




vi oo S ES— : 314 I8
id RESEERLA) ST 1:'\—352, 27 \_gﬁ;(xg, 1908

Amundt:mn_ﬁ of t1. In Schedule 1-B to the principal Act, hereinafler referred 10 as the
Articie | of -
Schedule 1-B

‘ said
~y o 3 f 1 e { g e, N M H Ty
Schedule, in Aricle [{Acknowledgement) in the Columu retting to the “description of

et angt? - words Crwe Iy gt r(fs ” i
mstrument _[0/ the words “twenty rupees” the words “one thousand rupees”, and in the
column relating (o the ‘Proper Stamp Duty” for the words “Fiiy y paise” the words “ten
rupees” shall be substituted. ' '
SuITstilulion of - 12, In the said Schedule, for Article 4 ¢ Affidaviv), the lollowing Article shall
Articie 4 be substituted, namety — y '
“q4 AEFFIDAVTT, including an affirmation or Ten rupees
declaration in the case of persons by law allowed (0 affirm or
, dectare instead of swearin g, '
Exemptions
Affidavit or de¢laration in writing when made—
() as a condition of enrolment under the Army Act, 1950, the Airforce
Act, 1950, or the Navy Act, 1957, or 4
(b) for the sole purpose of enabling any person (0 teceive any pension or
charitable atlowance. o
Amendment of 13. In the said Schedule, in Article S {Agreement or Memorandum of an
Article 5 Agreement,— )
(a) in clause (a), in the column ralating to the “proper stamp duty” for
the words “Sixty naye paisc” the words “ten rupees” shall be substituted,

‘ (b) in clausc (b) in the column relating to the “proper starmp duty” for
the words “forty five rupees, thirty naye paise for every Rs. 10,0007 the words
“One thousand rupees, ten tupees for every Rs, 20,000 shall be substituted.:

(¢) for the existing clause (b-1), the following clauses shatl be
substituted, nanely;—

“(b-1) I relating (o the sale ol animmovable  The same duty as on
property where possession is not admitied 1o comveyance [No. 23 clause
have been delivered nor is agreed to be delivered — (a) | on onc half of the
without exceuting the conveyance : : amount of consideration

‘ as .set forth  in o the
» agreement.”

Provided that when conveyance in pursuance

of such agreement is executed. the duly paid

under this clause in cxcess of the duty payable

: under clause (¢f shali be adjusted owards the

t . total duty pzlyahlc'un the conveyance.”

| “(h-2) It rcizuiiug to construction of a  The same duty as a
; ) buiiding on a land by a person other than the conveyance [No. 23 clausc
! ' owner or lessee of such land and baving a (a)f] for a consideration

stipulation that alter construction, such building - egpal to the amount or
shall be held joinly or severally by that other  value of the land.

person and the owner or the lessee, as the case '

may be, ol such land, or that it shall be sold

Jointly or severally by them or that a part of it

‘shall be held Jointly or scverally by them and the

remaining part ticreof shall be sold jointly or

scycrgilly by them,

Lxplanations—Eor the purposes of this clavse ——
(1) the expression “land” shadt include things attached to the carth, or

permanently fastened 0 anyibing wianliced to the carth,




ST TR ST A, 27 e, 1998 ' i3

_—
said (2} the expression “lessee” shall mean a holder of a {ease in
wm ol perpetaity or for a period of thirty years or more.
n the (3) the expression “building™ shall mean a building having more than
fen oue flat or office accommodation or both and the expression “flac” shail
have lhe meaning assigned 1o it in the Uttar Pradesh Ownership of Flas
shall Act, 1975.” _
14, In the said Scheduie, in Articie 6 (Agreement relating to deposit of title Amendinent of
deeds, pawn or pledge) in clause (2), for sub-clause (q); the following sub-clause shall Article 6
be substituted, namely :—
“(a) if such loan or debt.is tepayable on demand or more than three months
from the date of the instrument evidencing the agreement :
or For every Rs. 1000 or part thercot of the amount of loan
ce X s bl 3
or debt. ['wenty rupees
n or Explanation—For the purposes of clause (1) of this Article, any letter, note
or memorandum or writing, relating 1o the deposit of title deeds whether
f an written or made before, or at the time of, or after, the deposit of titile deeds is
k € g - . . | .
effected, and whether it is-in respect of the fisst foan or any subsequent loan,
such letter, note, memorandum or wriling shall, in the absence of any scparaic
Y r - - -
Joi agreement relating (o deposit of title deeds, be deemed to be an instrument
cvidencing an agreement relating to-the deposit of title deeds.”
, :
Jor . . . - . .
fd 5. In the said Schedule, in Article 9 (Apprenticeship deed) in the column Amendment of
ords . R " ticke ¢
/- refating o the “proper stamp duty” for the words “Twelve rupees” the words “Twenty  Atticle 9
rupees” shalt be substituted, o
I be- »
16. In the said Schedule, in Article 10 (Articles of Association of a companyl.  Amcndment of
. . . . 5 e A gfieds §
on in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty” for the words “Three hundred rupees™  Article 10
ause the words “Tive hundred rupees” shall be substitured.
« A
the A7, 1o the said Schedule, in Article 12 (Award), in clause (h), in the column Amendiment of
. . , . - ver o Gela 1)
ion refating to the “proper stamp duty” for the words “One rupec and lifty naye paise™ the  Articke 12
the words “Fen rupees” shall be substituted.
I8. - In the said Schedule, afier Article 12, the following Article shall be Insertion of New
. Ariicie 122/
inserted, namely (— Article 12-A
“12-A. Bank Guarantee—Guarantee deed executed
by a Rank as a surety 1o secure the due performance of
a contract or the due discharge ol a liability for every Fifty
§ a Rs. 1000 or part thercof rupees.”
ase . . . . . Bt -
) 19. In. the said Schedule, for Article 15 (Bond), the foltowing Article shall be Substitution of
tion ) ) ’ Article 15
{ or substitted, namely :—

“15-BOND as defined by section 2(5) not beilig a Debenture (No. 27)();"(!
not being otherwise provided for by this Act, or by the Court Iees Act. 1870.

Where the amount or value sccured does not exceed
Rs. 100/-.

Ten rupees
Where it exceeds Rs. 100/~ but docs not exceed
Rs. 1,000/-.

Scventy rupees

and tor every additional Rs: 1,000 or part thereo! in
excess of Rs. 1000. '




/\mex;dn‘);‘nt of 20. In the'said Schedule, in Article 17 (c;mwllauon) i the cotumn refating

A ‘l. o [ 4% I L had

rucie to the “proper stamp duty Jor the words “T'wenty-five rupees the words “one hundred
rupees” shalt be substitured.

16 ITR G297 ST T2, 27 g, 1998

Amendment of 21 In the said Schedule, in Article 18 (certificate of sale), in the column

Article 18 relating 1o the “proper stamp duty” for the word and figure “No. 23” the words and
figure “No. 23 dduxc (@) shall be substituted.

Amendment of 22, In the said Schedule, in Article 19 (Centificate or other Document), in
‘ticle 1€ “ " “ gy
Article 19 the column rcldunu to the “proper stamp duty” for the words “F ilty paisc” the words
“one rupee” shall be substituted.

Amendmentof 23. In the said Schedule, in Article 20 (Chartered Party), in the column
Article 20 relating to the “proper stamp duty” for the words “Six rupees” the words “Ten rupees”
shall be substitured. ’

Substitution”of 24. In the said Schedule, Jor Article 23 (Conveyance) the lollowmﬂ Article

Article 23 qpan be substituted, namely :— i

“23. CONVLEYANCE as defined by section 2(10Y not being a Transfer
charged or exempted under No, 62—

(a) if relating 0 immovable property where the
amount or value of the consideration ol such
conveyance as set forth therein or the market value of
the immovable properfy which is the subject of such
conveyance, whichever is greater does not exceed

Rs. 500/-, .
Sixty rupees
Where it exceeds Rs. SO0/- Onc hundred and
Ctwenty-live
but does not exceed Rs. 1,000/- rupees

One hundred and
twenty-five
or part thereot in excess of Rs. 1,000/- rapeces

and for every Rs. 1,000/-

Provided that the duty
payable shail be rounded off to
the next multiple of ten rupees.

(b} il relating (0 movable property-where the
amount or.value of the consideration of such
conveyauce as set forth mcruu dms not exceed
Rs. 1,000/-.

Twenty rupees

and for cvery Rs. 1,000/- B _ ‘ Twenty rupees
- or part thereof in excess of Rs. 1,000/~
EXEMPTION —
| _Assignment of copy- rwhl in musieal worl\s by resndq{ t of, or st publxshul

m Indm - _

Explanation :—Tor the puqm\u of this Article, in the case of an agreement (o
scit an immovable property, whére possession is delivered before the cxecution or at the
time of execution, o is agreed o be delivered without cxecuting (he conveyance, the
agreement shall be deemed to be a umwyanw and stamp duty thereon shall be payable

accordingty
Provided that the provisions of section 47-A shall nuatatis mmamhv dpply
Ao such agreement : .




—
ting
fred

umnn
and

), in
awds

Biteli]
ees”

ticle

sfer

JT LT FFYRY Te, 27 G, 1998

17

Provided further that when Conveyance in pursuance of such agrecment is

total duty payable on the conveyance,

25. In the said Schedule, for Article 24 (copy or extract) the followm«' Article
shall be substituied. lmmclv —

any public officer and not chargeable under the law for the tune being in force
relating 10 court-fees—

(i) if the ori ginal was not chargeable with duty or if the Ten rupees
duty with which it was chargeable does not exceed ten rupees:

(i) in any other case not falling within the provisions Ten rupees

of Section 6-A.

EXEMPTION —

make or furnish'for record in any public office or for any public purpose:

(B) Copy of, or extract from, any register relating to births, baptisms,
namings, dedicau'om marriages, divorces, deaths or burials,”

26. In the said Schedule, in Articlc 28 (Delivery order in respect of goods), in
the column relating to the “description of instrument” for the words * ‘twenty rupees” the
words “onc thousand rupees” and in the column refating to the “proper stamp duty” for
the words “Fifty paise” the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted.

27. In the said Schedule, in Article 29 (Divorce) in the column relating 1o the
“proper stamp-duty” for the words. *“T' wenty-tive rupees”. the word “Fifty rupees” shall
be substitured. '

28. In the said Schedule , in Article 31 (Exchange of Property), 32 (Further
charge) and 33 (Gift), in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty” for the word
and figures “No. 23" wherever occurring, the words and figure “No. 23 clause (a)” shall
be substiruted. '

; 29. In the said Schedule, for Article 34-A (instrument), the following Article
‘§ shall be substituted, namely :(—
“34—A. INSTRUMENT coxreé!ing a purely clerical error
"in an instrument chargeable with duty and in respect of which ‘
the proper duty has been paid. ) ' Ten rupees”

30. In the said Schedule, in Articlc 35 (]_,c{:(se)——(a) in clause (a), in sub-clauses

@ii), (iii), (iv), (v), (vi), (vii) and (viii), in the cblumn relating to the “proper stamp

duty”, for the word and figyre “No. 23" wherever occurring the words and figurc “No. 23

clause (a)” shall be substituted;

(b in clauée {(b), in the columa relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the

word and figure “No. 23" the words and figure “No. 23 clause (a)"shall be substituted:

(c) in clause (¢}, in the column relating to the*proper stamp duty” for the word
and figure “No. 23” the words and figure “No. 23 clause (a)”, and for the-words “Five
1pees” the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted:

_executed, the stamp duty paid on the agreement shall be adjusted towards the

“24. Copy or Extract certified to be a true-copy or extract by or by order of

Amendment of
Article 24

(a) Copy of any p:ipcr which a public officer is expressly rcqui‘red by law to N

Aunendment of
Article 28

Amendiment of
Article 29

Amendment of
Article 31, 32,
33

Substitution of
Article 34-A

Amendment of
Article 35




18

ST IR AU T, 2797, 1998

Amendment of
Article 36

Améudment of
Article 39

Ameundment of
Article 40

Amendment of
Article 41

{d) after the existing proviso, the following proviso shafl be inserted,

namely ;—

“Provided further that where the lease purpose 1o letting of a building or fla
for a term noy cxceeding five years, the duty shall, subject to & minitnum of
rupecs one hundred and a maximum of rupees ten thousand, be chargeable at
the rate of two per cent of the whole amount of the rent which would be paid

‘or delivered for the entire term of the lease and the amount of fine or premium
or monicy advanced, if any, as set forth in the k;ase and it shall be rounded off
to the next multiple of rupees ten.” AR
" (e) after explanation (4, the following e:kpiai;ation shall be inserted,
namely :— : s ' ' :

“(5) For the purpose of second proviso .mg;vexpressions “building” and

“flat™ shall have the meanings fespectively assigned to them in explanation.

(3) to clause (b-2) of Article 5.”

31. In the said Schedule, in Article 36 (Letter of Allotment of shares) in (he
column relating 1o (hc “proper stamp duty”, for the words “Fifty paise” the words “one
rupee” shall be substitued; : ' B

- 32, In the said Schedule, in Article. 39 (MEMORANDUM OF-

ASSOCIATION OF A COMPANY),— o _

(a) in clause (a), in (he coluinn relating to the “proper stamp-duty”, for the

words “Two hundred rupees”, the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be
substituted : R :

(b)In clause (b), in the column relating to the “proper stamp-duty”, Jor the
words, “five hundred rupees”, the words “one’ thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

33. In the said Schedule, in Article 40 (Mongage—deed),—é

(a) in clause (a), in the columa relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the *

words and figure “No. 23" the words and tigure “No. 23 clause (a)” shall
be substituted. :

a3
(b) in ctause (c), in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty™, for the
words “Two rupees and twenty five naye paisc” wherever occurring the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted.

34. In the said Schedule , i Article 41 (Mortgage of a crop)—

(a) in clause (a),—

(iy in the column relating to the “description of instrument”, for the word
and figure “Rs. 200", wherever occurring, the word and figure “Rs. 6000”
shall be substituted: ‘

(i) in the column refating to the “proper stamp duty” for the words
“Thirty five nayc paise” wherever occuring, the words “Ten rupees™ shall be
substituted;

(b) in clause (b),—

() in the column refating to the “description of instrument” for the word
and figure “Rs. 100" wherever occurring,-the words and figure “Rs. 3000
sball be substistuted '




rted,

 flat
in of
ile at
paid
rium
1 off

ted,

and
ition

the
‘one

OF

the
be

the

the .

1all

the

ds -

rd
)! id

I IR STETH T, 279w, 1998

(i) in the column {eiating to the “proper s(amp duty”, for’ the words.
A “Sixty Naye paisc” wherever Occurring, the words “Twenty rupees™ shall be
substituted. R e

35. In the said Schedaule, in Article 42 (Notarial Act)'in t}he(i:olﬂmn relating o

the “proper stamp duty”, for the words “Three rupees and fifty naye paise” the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted. - : S

36. In the said Schedule in Article 43 (Note or Memorandum),—

() in the column relating to the “description of instrument”, for the words
“Twenty rupees™, wherever occurring, the words “Two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted; L _ R :

A () in clause (@), the column relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the
- words “One rupee™ the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted- ,

- (© m cladﬁc (b), in the column ‘rclating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the

words and figure “seventy five rupees; one rupee for every Rs. 10,000, the

words and figure “one thousand rupees; ten rupees for every Rs. 20,000” shall

be substituted. ‘ ' ' _ s

37. In the said Schedule, in Article 44 (Note of Protest) in the column relating

10 the “proper stamp duty”, for the words, “Threc rupees” the words “Ten rupees” shall

bc; substituted.

» 38. In the said Schiedule, in Article 45 Partition in the column relating to the
“proper stamp duty”, for the words, “five rupees”, wherever occurring, the words “ten
rupees” shall be substituted.

39. In the said Schedule, in Article 46 (Partnership),—

(a) in part A, for the word and figure “Rs. 4000”, wherever occurring, the
word and figure “Rs. 10,000” shall be substituted; :

(b} in part ‘B, in the column relating 1o, the “proper stamp duty”, for the
words and figure “the same duty as a Boud (No. 15) for Rs. 1,000”, the words
“onc hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

-40. Tn the said Schedule, in Atticle 48 (Power of Attorney),—

(a) in clause (a), in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the
words “Three rupees” the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the
words “Ten rupees™, the words “T'wenty rupees™ shall be substituted;

(¢) in clause (c), in the cohyﬁm relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the
word and figure “No. 23" the! words and figure “No. 23 clause (a)” shall be
substituted: . ‘ '

(d) in clause (ce), in the column, relating to the “proper stamp duty”, Jor
the word and figure “No. 23" the words and figure “No. 23 clause (a)” shall be
substituted,

Amendment‘;of .

-Article 42

Amendment of -
Article 43

Amendment of
Article 44

Amendmént of
Article 45

Amendment of
Article 46

" Amendment of

Articlc 48

41. In the said Schedule, in Article 50 (Protest of bill or note), in the column  Amendment of

- " 4, * 'ti 50
- relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the words “Five rapees” the words “ten rupees Atticle
- shall be substituted. ‘ e




20

SO R SR AL, 27 A, 1998

Amendment of
Article 51

Amendment of
Article 54

Amendment of
Article 57

Amendment of
Article 58

Amendment of
Article 60

Substitution of
Article 61

Amendment of
Article 62

42. In the said Schedule, in Article 51 (Protest by the Master of a shfp), in the
column relating 1o the “proper stamp duty”, for the words “five rupees”, the words “Ten
rupees” shall be substituted. ?

43. In the said Schedule, in Article 54 (Re-conveyance of Mortgaged Property)
in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the word and figure “No. 23"
wherever occurring the words and figure “No. 23 clause (a)” shall be substituted. -

44. In the said Schedule, in Article 57 (Security-Bond or Mortgage-Deed),—

(a) in clause (a), in the column relating to the “description of instrument”

Jor the word and figure “Rs. 1000”, the word and figure “Rs. 100" and in the
column relating (o the “proper stamp duty”, for the words and figure “The
same duty as a Bond (No. 15) for the amount sccured” the words “Ten rupees”
shall be substituted:

‘ (b) in clause (b), in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the
words and figure “The same duty as a Bond (No. 15) for Rs. 1000” the ‘words
“One hundred rupees” shall be substituted. )

45. In the said Schedule, in Article S8 (Seulement),
relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the words “five rupees”, the words “ten rupees” -
shall be substituted.

in part A, in the column

46. In the said Schedule, in Article 60 (Shipping Order), in the column
- relating (o the “proper stamp duty”, for the words “Fifty paise” the words “Ten rupees”
shall be substituted.

47. In the said Schedule, for Article 61 (Surrcader of lcase), the following
. Article shall be substituted, namely :—

“61. SURRENDER OF LEASE

The same duty as a Bond (No. 15) for a
consideration of Rs, 1000 or the duty with
which such lease is chargeable whichever is
less:

Provided that the duty payable shall be
rounded off 1o the next multiple or ten rupees.

, EXEMPTION
Surrender of lease where such lease is exempted from duty.”

48. In the said Schedule, in Article 62 (Transfer),—

/ (a) for Clause (b), following clause shall be substituted, namel yi—

“(b) of debentures, being marketable securities
- whether the debenture is liable to duty or not, except

debentures provided for by section 8;

When the value of the share or the face amount of

the debenture does not exceed Rs. 500; “Ten rupees
Where it exceeds Rs. S00 but does not exceed Rs., .
1,000; : ‘ Twenty rupees

4




IO R SEHRYT e, 27 qATE, 1998 21

and for every Rs. 500 or Ten rupees

in the
part thereof in excess of Rs. 1,000 ;

“Ten
(b) in clause (¢),—
perty) (i) For sub-clause (i), the following sub-clause shall be substitruted
). 237 namely :—
- (i) if the duty on such The duty with which - such bond,
) — bond, amortgage deed or policy mortgage-deed or policy is chargeable : -
does not exceed one hundred Provided that the duty payable
ment” rupees ; shall be rounded off to the next multiple
in the of ten rupees” ;
“The (i) in sub-clause (ii), in the column relating to the “proper stamp duty”
pees”’ Jor the words “Seventy-Five rupees” the words “One hundred rupees” shall
be substituted, and after the proviso the following proviso shall be.inserted, -
ir the at the end namely :(—
words “Provided futher that the duty payable shall be rounded off to the next
multiple of ten rupces.”; ‘
slumnn (c) in clause (d), in the column relating o the “pfoper stamp duty”, for the
ipees” words “Sixty—seven rupecs and Fifty paise” the words “One hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;
viumn (d) in clause (&), in the column relating to the *“proper stamp duty”, for the
pees” Words “Thirty-four rupees or such smaller amount as may be chargeable under
clauses (b) and (c) of this Article”, the words “seventy rupees” shall be
wing substituted.
49. In the said Schedulc, in Article 63 (Transfer of lease), in the column Amendiment of
. relating to the “proper stamp duty”, for the word and figure “No. 23" the words and All‘?le 63
6 b figure No. *23 clause (a)” shall be substituted.
or a
. with 50. Tn the said Schedule, in Articte 64 (Trust), in part A, in clause (b), in the ;\\l‘}cl;fll?z‘l“ of
ver is §  column cclating 1o the “proper stamp duty”, for the words “Threc rupees the words U P
| “Ten rupees” shall be substituted.
all be k 51. In the said Schedule,, in Article 65 (Warrant of goods), in the column :net;dtgzut of
r" e ” “rgr rticle OF
pees. . relating to the “proper stamp duty” for the words “Three rupees”, the words “Ten e
rupees” shall be substituted.
By order,
/ ~ Y.R. TRIPATHI,
‘ Pramukh Sachiv.

o 0 o fro 7o tho 79 o PIITH—28-7.98—(@40—850—(@eX (Ho arto )/ T2 |

/




Jerx TIW NATATN AXE, 27 WS, 2001

Short title,

extent and
commence-
ment,
Amendment of
SChedule 1-B
of Act no. 1!
of 1899, :

No. 972 (2)/XVII-V-1—-1 (KA)-2/2801
- Dated Lucknow, ' April 27, 2001

. In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Acticle 348 of the
Congstitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of

. the following En’glishl translation of the Bhartiya Stamp (Uttar Pradesh
Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 200! (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 9 of

2001) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assemted to by the

- President on April 25, 2001 :—

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH’ AMENDMENT)
' o ACT, 2001 |

" (U."P. Act Nc. 9 oF 1999)

{As passzd by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature

AN . '

Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to

= T R

 further 1o anend the Indian
Uttar Pradesh. . , L
IT S HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-seeond Year ef the Republic of India
as follows ;— . , = S
1. (1) This Act may
Amendment) Act, 2001. , ‘ ,
~ (2) It shall extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesk.
(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State Governmest
may, by notification. appoint in this behalf. ‘
2. In Schedule 1-B of the Indian Stamp ‘Act, 1899,—
. (@) in Article 17-4, in the column relating to “Proper Stamp Duty"
for tbe words “Two hundred and fifty rupees” the words “Five
. hundred rupees’’ shall be substi tuted; ! s o
(b) in Article 17-B, in the clouma relating to *“Proper Stamp
Duty”, jor the words ¢‘Five hundred rupeces”, the words “Two
thousand rupees” shall be substituted; :
(¢) in Article 35 (Lease),— _ : . A
(f) in clause (a), for sub-clauses (vi), (vii) and (viii) the
following clause shall be substituted, namely :— :
. “(vi) Where the lease pur- The same duty as a Conve-
ports to be for a term exceed-
ing thirty years or in perpetuity
or does not purport to be for
any definite term,

be called the ‘Indian'."Stampk (Uttar Pradesh

a consideration equal to the
market value of the property

- which is the subject of the
lease.” - ‘

(ii) for clauses (b) and (c) the following clauses shall be
substituied, namely :— o _ :
“¢(b) Where the lease is granted for a fine or premfum or
for money advanced and where no rent is reserved y—

(i) Where the lease The same duty as a Gonve-
purports to be for a term yance [No. 23 clause (a)] for
not exceeding thirty years; consideratfon equal to the

amount or value of such fine
or premium or advance as
set forth in the lease,
The same duty as a Conve-
yance [No. 23 ¢lause (a)] for
“a consideration equal to the
market value of the property
which'is subject of the lease.

- (¢) Where the lease is granted for a fine or premium or
for money advanced in addition to rent reserved,—
(i) where the lease The same duty as a Conve-

purports to be for a term yance [No. 23 clause (2)] for
" not exceeding thirty years; a considerationequalto the

_ (i) Where the lease
purports to be for a term
exceeding thirty years 3

yance [No. 23 clause (a)] for




QT AN JAIATIW TR, 27 VI, 2001

amount or value of sech fine
or prémium or advance as
-set forth in the lease, in
addition to the duty .which
would have been payable on
such lease, if no fine or pre-
‘mium or advance had been
paid or delivered:

Provided that in a cdse
when an agreement to lease
isstamped with the adva-
lorem stamp required for
lease, and a lease in pur-
suance of such agreement -
is " subsequently executed,
the duty on such lease shall

S - not exceed fifty rupees.

(ii) Where the lease The same duty as a Conve-
purports to be for term yance [No. 23 clause (a)] for
exceeding thirty yedrs; a consideraiion equal to the

‘ market value of the property .
which is subject of the lease,”

(fil) Explanation (5) shall be omitted.

3. (1) The Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 2000 Repeal and
is hereby repealed. o o : tavings

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act, asamended by the Ordinance’
-referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been done or taken
under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by
this Act as if this Act were in force at all material times. - : :

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Stamp duties chargeable under Article 17-A and Article 17-.B of Schedule I-B of tha’
Indian Stamp Act, 1899 were revised as back as in the yeart 197t. It was also poticed that
in order to avoid due payment of stamp duty on instruments of lease, the amount of
premium was -being shown very low. There are with a view to augmenting the financial
resources of the State as_also to prevent the evasion of stamp duties chargeable on instru-
ments of Lease, it was decided to amend Articles 17-A, 17-B and 35 of the said Schedule to
provide for,_ ’ . o ‘

(a) enhancing the stamp duty from two hundred and fifty rupees to five hundred
rupees chargeable on the instrument of the certificats of enrolment under section 22 of
the Advocates® Act, 1961 issued by the State Bar Council of Uttar Pradesh;

(b) enhancing the stamp duty from five hundred rupees to two thousand rupees
chargeable on the instrument of certificate of practice as Notary under sub-section (1)
of section 5 of the Notaries Act, 1952, orendoresement of renewal of such certificate
under sub-section (2) of the said section 5 ; o : : '

(c) making stamp duty chargeable on the instrument of Lease for a term exceed.
ing thirty years on the market value of the property to be leased. ’

. Since the State Legislature was not in sesSion and immediate legislative action was
necessary to implement the aforesaid decision, the Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Amend-

ment) Ordinance, 2000 (U. P. Ordinance no. 18 of 2000) was promulgated by the
Governor on December 29, 2000, ¢+ ' \ .

This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance.
' " By order,
Y. R. TRIPATHI,
Pramukh Sachiv.

\eqeb 20 10-~Co fo 17 TT0 fraro—~(169) —2001~-85¢ (q%0) 1




R R Rl

No. 2608 (2)/XVII-V-1—1 (KA) 25-200]
Dated Lucknow, November 15,2001

— s mmsTEaT

NOTIFICATION

lescu LANEQUS

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Bharatiya Stamp
(Uttar Pradesh Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2001 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 38 of 2001) as
passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the President on November 8, 2001.

THE INDIAN STAMP (UTTAR PRADESH SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 2001
(U.P. Act No. 38 of 2001)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]

AN
ACT
futrther to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to Uttar Pradesh.

IT 15 1ErEBY enacted in the Fifty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

. (1) This Act may be called the Indian Stamp’ (Uttar Pradesh Second
Amendment) Act, 2001.

(2) It extends to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the dfficial Gazertte, appoint in this behalf.

2. In section 2 of the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act, — .

(a) for sub-section (14), the following sub-section shail be substituted,
namely : — :
"(14) ‘Instrument'—'Instrument’ includes every document and
record created or maintained in or by an electronic storage and retrieval
device or media by which any right or liability is, or purports to be,
created, transferred, limited, extended, extinguished or recorded;"

Short title, extent
and
commencement

Amendment of
section 2 of Act
no. 2 of 18§99




6 FOR URY MRV TToIE, 15 IR, 2001

(b) after sub-section (14), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely : -

"(14-A) 'Instrument of Gift'—'Instrument of Gift' includes an
instrument whether by way of declaration or otherwise, for making or
accepting an oral gift;"

(c) after sub-section (22), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
" namely:— '

"(22-A) 'Public Officer'—'Public Officer' means a Public Officer as
defined in clause (17) of section 2 of the Code of Civil procedure, 1908
and includes every officer working in connection with the affairs of any
of the following of organizations, namely:—

(a) any statutory body or authority constituted under any
Uttar Pradesh Act;

(b) a Financing Bank' or 'Central Bank' as defined in clause
(k) of section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Co-operative Societies Act,

1965;"
Amendment of 3. In section 29 of the principal Act,—
section 29 o
(a) in clause (a), after the words and figures, "No. 40 (Mortgage deed),”
the words and figure, "No. 43 (Note or Memorandum)" shall be inserted,
- (b) after the clause (f) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—
» 4 "(ff) in the case of an Instrument of Gift, by the donee".
Amendment of 4. In section 31 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words, "such
section 31 amount not exceeding five rupees and not less than fifty paise as the collector may in
each case direct", the words, "such amount as may be fixed by the State Government by
notification in the Official Gazerte", shall be substituted.
A"\éﬂdl:g"l of 5. In section 40 of the principal Act, affer sub-section (1), the following sub-
section )

sections shall be inserted, namely:—

"(1-A) The Collector shall also require, alongwith the amount of deficit
stamp duty or penalty required to be paid under clause (b) of sub-section (1),
the payment of a simple interest at the rate of one and half per cent per mensem
on the amount of deficit starrp duty calculated from the date of the execution of
the instrument till the date of actual payment:

Provided that the amount of interest under this sub-section shall be
recalculated if the amount of deficit stamp duty is varied on appeal or revision
or by any order of a competent court or authority.

(1-B) The amount of interest payable under sub-section (1-A) shall be
added to the amount due and be also deemed for all purposes to be part of the
amount required to be paid.

(1-C) Where realisation of the deficit stamp duty remained stayed by any
order of any Court or authority and such order of stay is subsequently vacated,
the interest referred to in sub-section (1-A) shall be payable also for any period
during which such order of stay remained in operation.

s ecns e e R R

(1-D) Any amount paid or deposited by, or recovered from, or refundable
to a person under the provisions of this Act, shall first be adjusted towards the
deficit stamp duty or penalty outstanding against him and the excess, if any,
shall then be adjusted towards the interest, if any, due from him."

6. in section 42 of the principal Act,—

{a) in the heading for the words and figures "sections 35, 40 or 41", the
words ang figures, "sections 35, 40, 41 or 47-A" shall be substituted

(b} in sub-section (1), for the words and figures “section 40 or secticn
41" the woids and fignies, "seciion 40, section 41 or section 47-A" shall b
substituied.




I U ST TWE, 15 ATHER, 2001

7. In section 47-A of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely:—

(1) (a) If the market value of any property which is the subject of
any instrument, on which duty is chargeable on the market value of the
property as set forth in such instrument, is less than even the minimum
value dztermined in accordance with the rules made under this Act, the
registering officer appointed under the Registration Act, 1908 shall,
notwithstanding anything contained in the said Act, immediately after
presentation of such instrument and before accepting it for registration
and taking any action under section 52 of the said Act, require the person
Jiable to pay stamp duty under section 29, to pay the deficit stamp duty as
vomputed on the basis of the miniraum value determined in accordance
with the said rules and retugn the instrument for presenting again in
accordance with section 23 of the Registration Act, 1908.

(b) When the deficit stamp duty required to be paid under clause
{a), is paid in respect of any instrurent and the instrument is preseated
again for registration, the registering officer shall certify by endorsemeat
thereon, that the deficit stamp duty has been paid in respect thereof and
the name and the residence of the person paying them and register the
same.

" (¢) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provisions of
this Act, the deficit stamp duty may be paid under clause (a) in the form
of impressed stamps containing such declaration as may be prescribed.

(d) If any person does not make the payment of deficit stamp duty
after receiving the order referred to in clause (@) and presents the
instrument again for registration, the registering officer shall, before
registering the instrument, refer the same to the Collector, for
determination of the market value of the property and the proper duty
payable thereon."

(b) in sub-section (3), the following explanation shall be inserted,

namely:—

"Explanation:~The payment of deficit stamp duty by any person
ander any order of registering officer under sub-scction (1) shall not
prevent the Cotlestor from- initiating proceedings on any instrument
under subt-sectien (3)."

{(c) after sub-section (4); the following sub-sections shall be inserted,

namely:—

"(4-A) The Collector shall also require alongwith the deficit stamp
duty or penalty required to be paid under clause (ii) of sub-section (4), the
payment of a simple interest at the rate of one and half per cent per
mensem on the amount of deficit stamp duty calculated from the date of
the execution of the instrument till the date of actual payment:

Provided that the amount of interest under this sub-section shall be
recalculated if the amount of deficit stamp duty is varied on appeal or
revision or by any order of a competent court or authority.

(4-B) The amount of interest payable under sub-section (4-A) shall
be added to the amount due and be also deemed for all purposes to be part
of the amount required to be paid. ’

~ (4-C) Where realisation of the deficit stamp duty remained stayed
by any order of any court or authority and such order of stay is
subsequently vacated, the interest referred to in sub-section (4-A) shall be
payable also for any period during which such order of stay remained in
operation.

(4-D) Any amount paid or deposited by, or recoverad from, or
refundable to, a person under the provision of this Act, shall first be
adjusted towards the dificit stamp duty or penalty cutstanding against him
and the excess, if any, shall then be adjusted towards the interest, if any,
due from him.”’ )

Amendment of
section 47-A




8 JAY TSI RO Toie, 15 TaH=R, 2001

Amendment of 8. n section 56 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following sub-
section 56 section shall be inserted, namely :-- ‘

“(1-A) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provisions of
this Act, any person including the Government aggrieved by an order of the
Collector under Chapter-1V, Chapter-V or under clause (a) of the first proviso
to section 26 may, within sixty days from the date receipt of such order, prefer
an appeal against such order to the Chief Controlling Revenue Authority, who
shall, after giving the parties a reasonable opportunity of being heard consider
the case and pass such order thereon as he thinks just and proper and the order
so passed shall be final:

Provided that no application for stay of recovery. of any disputed amount
of stamp duty including interest thereon or penalty shall be entertained unless

the applicant has furnished satisfactory proof of the payment of not less than
one third of such disputed amount:

Provided further that where the Chief Controlling Revenue Authority passes an
order for the stay of recovery of any stamp duty, interest thereon or penalty or for the
stay of the operation of any order appealed against and such oider results in the stay of
recovery of any stamp duty, interest thereon or penalty, such stay order shall not remain
in force for more than thirty days unless the appellant furnishes adequate security to the

_satisfaction of the Collector concerned for the payment of the outstanding amount."

Amendment of 9. In section 62 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words, “shall, for

section 62 every such offence, be punishable with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees”,
the words, "shall, for every such offence, be punishable with imprisonment for a term
which shall not be less than one month but which may extend to six months and with
fine which may extend to five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECT AND REASONS

Wiih a view to preventing the evasion of stamp duty and ensuring realisation thereof . it has been
decided to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 in its application to Uttar Pradesh mainly to provide for,—

(«) including the "Electronic storage device” within the definition of "Instrument”,
(b)-defining the expression "lnstrument of Gift" and "Public Office",
(¢) clarifying the chargeability of stamp duty on the instruments of "Note or Memorandum"”,

(d) empowering the State Government to fix, by notification, the fee under sub-section (1)
of section 31, o :

(e) the procedure for dealing with the instrument of conveyence etc. if undervalued,

¢ limitation of sixty days for an appeal against the order of the Collector under Chapter-1V,
Chapter-V or under clause (a) of the first proviso to section 26. )

The Indian Stamp (Uttar Pradesh Second Amendment) Bill, 2001 is introduced accordingly.

By order,
Y.R. TRIPATHI,
Pramukh Sachiv.

flovtiogoflo—To o 571 ATIA (%o)—{1439}—2001——597—-aqua/m€|
fiordogofio—To o 195 o fARTTo—2001-(1440)—830—FFYER / HIHHCT |




	1971UP10FirstPage.pdf
	1971UP10.pdf
	UP Act 10 of 1971.pdf
	UP Act 20 of 1974.pdf
	UP Act 49 of 1975.pdf
	UP Act 19 of 1982.pdf
	UP Act 32 of 1985.pdf
	UP Act 23 of 1988.pdf
	UP Act 22 of 1990.pdf
	UP Act 11 of 1992.pdf
	UP Act 22 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 9 of 2001.pdf
	UP Act 38 of 2001.pdf


