The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis and Zila Parishads
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972

Act 7 of 1972

Keyword(s):
Agricultural Produce, Broker of Dalal, Market Area, Sale, Specified
Agricultural Produce, Purchase

Amendments appended: 11 of 1979, 4 of 1981, 27 of 1982, 1 of 1983, 18 of 1983,
20 of 1984, 14 of 1985, 16 of 1986, 18 of 1988, 22 of 1989, 3 of 1990, 11 of
1990, 16 of 1991, 21 of 1991, 2 of 1993, 6 of 1994, 2 of 1995, 5 of 1997, 7 of
1999, 10 of 2001,

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




/387
IO RY Y e qodt afafe (seawiias syaeq)wfuiam, 1972 7
(v w3w wfafmw &= 7, 1972)
[ ware siw faar afeag A fatw 4-1-72 o war sar i faam g d R g
10-1-72 §o ot ds= & &&pa foat 1] v c” e
[ ‘wra wrafaaw & WASE 200 ¥ wada wemaw W feAtw 1917430 T ),
$o # wipla 9T ¥ qUT IAT AT VB KAWRY Gw7E § fgqiw 22-1-72 o (ﬂaér 1 g a
Y srwrfaa gwr o ]  saq, @99
T W T T W wfafiraw, 196 4 F wTT S ¥ forw EE R

afafran
ARG ORI & ariad a¥ & fr=fafeq afafmy aaman soar & —

1z wfafran sat Rw gfe s oot afufy (sovwrtos gaan)afufom, e @m
1972 sgarda )

2—(1) fAiF 30 wQAY, 1971 ¥ I 9w FY Iara wod) afufmw, 1964  wody afwfi &
(Fd writ 9w wfafram sgroard) 3 Seamw, A ad ) wafs F g agaroa qweA & @y
% 9 afafaa &Y ar7 13 & qdi7 fraifag sy afafy o a &, @@d @ & weqrf
AT qEH &Y, 74 WS §iy F Y o I feAiw ) AT qr M S AN A 9wy
wifya fear sy freafafaa el & sl @3 gu wordt i, wafqg—

(%) swa afufma & fd a0 & O3 g WY, waq afufy, afz 21 @),
¥ gumafa, S wWTAT T9T WS HIA-HI 92X 9 T @ AR ;

(=) ot & &% afufa, SoF wwaf aon STaumafy & ot afwsre, s
aur e 99 fadt & faen wfde & fafga ol st ool ot feqa @
w9 frar afwege gra & 9T o, frsare awn arew fear smo,
W e foen afege, Sar ot waae F sqE wifea ), fafe A ofie §
ufafa ar Iaer gwmfe war se-waafa @@ sToar ;

(1) T gE¥ Rl am a1 e aRet Fodw @@ go, o
afygz fagd sfonr awgra ¥ sq@ & arfesdl sferd Fovae
g ¥HC gE wiuwrd #1, G wdl 6 sfieei 3 wilw, 9 ag g
& 3faa wwd, Aed g aad ffkse fmd sifesrd A sfaffm scamm 85

() TST GTHER FAA-ART O A9 A afegear o @ oy @

i Iqae, faad seria o rfafan & et avary & s, afemre
1 IqF FAAT A QO wAW A0F & ¥ Freifeq 557 w7 9wy @ §, feg
fora® areax g 98, IO A S, 9 I qdAdt vy wvag fedt ot
sl & fag araws oraig@a sy

(2) smara (1) & & (w) FA07 I ) 1) 935 sfagan Q@ frg
I & TR FATAH o1, TS FaarT Je9 ¥ wdw weT ¥ anw, 59 it eI wv @
Y, JEH QT §F AT QHEE Swtns TAl &, % ¥ o0 5w Ahg o N g3y od=
Tt R, W AT a B 18 a2 o s fraifa a frar s, e § wwfe a9
¥ faeti & QR afeewrd ar sfgradl 3 wita |F gu Y gRN, ot g wea 3 O
gz gx w3ty R & ¥ fgagaa &, g 5@ s#¢ w1 91 afesr ar sfirga
weafraa afrgaar ¥ sty 9gd #Y 749 fray a1a 3 duaan o1 sfewa o e

33— R FfY @A AR afafq (wewwfas seear) gy, 1971 SWC 83w
wagera froe far srar 89 WY Hedr
15, 1971 &

Fraa,

[SErg e wrn & faaen & fad pon faaiw 5-1-72 §o &1 qowrdy s
noz dfed ) ]

- - Puice U5 Paise
> QHo Yo Go——To flo 306 T (Ao )—1972--1,855 (Ho) 1| -



T'HE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI | SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1879
‘ - [U. P. Act No. 11 oF 1979] ' 4
'utho‘ritat,ive English Text of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti
‘SAlpkalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1979, (Uttar. Pradesh
" Adhiniyam Sankhya. 11 of 1979] :
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972 '

follows :— - : , ,
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan ‘Mandi
amitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1979.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on December 27, 1978.

2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “one year”, the words “two years” .shall
be substituted and be deemed always to have been substituted. :

(For Statement of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh Gazette (Bxtraordinary),
dated March - 24, 1979). ; ‘ )
i (Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on March 26, 1979 and
by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on March 29, 1979} .
(Received the assent _of the Governor on March 730, 1979, under Article 200 of the

Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, dated Mareh 31, 1979).

It 15 HEREBY enacted in the Thirtieth Year of the Republic of India -aS‘.

Constitution of India and was published in Part I () of the Legislative Supplement of the -

Short title and
commencemont.

Amendment_of
section 2 of U.P.
Act 7 of 1972,



Validation

Ropeal and
savings.

froTmogofio—qodto 206 IO (far::ro)éz 9—10—7‘9—(2468)—1979—18‘37+50 'Ss;»(i'tyg':o), v

deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions of the
- principal Act as amended by this Act as if +his Act were in force at all material

2

3. Notwithstanding anything contained in the principal Act, or any other
law for the time being in force, anything done or purporting to have been done,
or any action taken or purporting to have been taken, or any order made or
purporting to have been made (including any tax levied or fee charged) by—

(i) the ad hoc committee constituted in accordance with clause (a)
of subsection (1) of section 2 of the principal Act in the market areas

where such committees have been constituted before the commencement 4
of this Act; and - Vi
(i) the District Magistrate in the market areas where no such com-
‘ mittees have been constituted before such commencement ;
shall be deemed to be and always to have been as valid as if the provisions of -
this Act were in force at all material times. : ' fu

#

4. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik g p]
Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) 'Adhyadesh, 1979, is hereby repealed. Danc
: : o of 19
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under 1

the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the said Adhyadesh shall be -

times.

I :



No. 812(2)/XVII-V—1-23-81
Dated Lucknow, March 31, 1981

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, 3
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar 3
Pradesh Zila Parishad Aur Mandi Samiti (Karyakal Ka Vistar) Adhiniyam, 1981 (Uttar 3
Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 4 of 1981) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented J

to by the Governor on March 31, 1981

THE UTTAR PRADESH ZILA PARISHADS AND MANDI SAMITIS :
(EXTENSION OF TERM) ACT, 1981 '

[U. P. Act No. 4 oF 1981]
(As passed by the ditar Pradesh Legisiaiure)

AN
ACT

further to extend the life of the Uttar Pradesh Zila Parishad (Arfjmkul’ih-
Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1977, and the Ultar Pradesh Krishs Utpadan

andi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, and to validate

the actions taken or purporting to have been taken under the lasty

mentioned enactment,

It 1s HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-second Year of the Republic of In"_'

as follows :— .
Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Zila Parishads and Mandj
Samitis (Extension of Term) Act, 1981, L

Amendment of 2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Zila Parishads (Alpakalik Vyawastha)}
section 2 of U.P. Adhiniyam, 1977, in subsection (1), for the words and figures “31st day ofj
Act no. 15 of March,” 19817, the words and figures “3lst day of March, 1982" shall be

o substituted. :
Amendment of 8. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitil

section 2 of U.P. '(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act no. 7 of Jg , in sub-section (1), for the words ‘*one year”, the words “two years”

1972. shall be substituted, and be deemed to have been substituted with effect fromj
March 5, 1981.




e e

i

| FET I3M HATITO! AAE, 31 AT, 1981

4, Notwithstanding anything contained in the principal Act or other
law for the time being in force, anything done or purporting to been
'done.oranyactiontakenorpmportingtohavebeentaken,oranyorder
de or jng to have been made '(including any tax levied or fee
A ",'yDisuictMagEsu‘ate,orliyanyoﬁeu'upcdyﬁdeyﬁimmder
clause (c)’ of sub-section '(1)) of section 2 of tliz&ﬁndpal Act shall be deemed
to be and always to have as valid as if provisions of this Act were
in force at all material times.

By order,
G. B. SINGH,
Sachiv.’

Validation.

91 0gw 07 #ft 0-~Y ot0 2 TaA (fgo)—~1-4~81~( 2 )-1981-2045 (Awe) 1




S i S i

No. 2647(2)[XVII—V-1-1-(Ka)-4- 82
Dated Lucknow, September 22, 1982

s [N parsuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
12 Govainor is plz1s2d to order the publication of the following English translation of the
Fitie Pradzsh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam,
932 (Uitar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 27 of 1982) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature
ni asszated to by the Governor on September 15, 1982:

Short title and
smmencement.

Amendment of
sction 2 of U.P.
J£t no. T ﬂf !gTI.

Repeal and
avings,

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS (ALPA-
KALIK VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1982

(U. P. AcT No. 27 oF 1982)

[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN '
ACT

further to 1m2nd the Uttar Pradzsh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik

Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972

IT is gereBY =21acted in the Taiciy-third Year of the Republic of India as
follows : '

1. (1) This Act, may bz z1ill=d the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Sin'tis {Alpikilik Vywwastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1982.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on February 20, 1982.

2. In szction 2 of the Uttar Praiesh Krishi Utpidan Mandi  Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, in sub-section (1), for the words “two
vears”, the words “‘three years” shall be substituted. '

3. (1) Th Utir Poadash Krishi Urpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vy:visthi) (Siashodhan) (Dwitiya) Adhyadesh, 1982, is hereby repealed.

{3) Ny v :hstinding sach rap2al, anything done or any action taken under
the 3 17 3915 »f th2 A<t raferred to in section 2, as amended by the Ordinance
c3fariad 14 in sab-szetion (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under
9 2y 25391 ling nrovisions of the said Act, as amended by this Act, as if the
5 yvisians of this Act ware in foree at all material  times.

By order,
G. B. SINGH,

Sachiv.

EC e

U.P. Ordi-
nance no. 14
of 1982.



No. 813/XVII-V—1-1(Ka)-5-83

Dated Lucknow, March 4, 1983
In pursnance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar
Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1983

(Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 1 of 198 3) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and
assented to by the Governor on March 4, 1983:

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS (ALPAKALIK
VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1983

(U. P, Acr No. 1 oF 1983)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
ACT

further 1o amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha)
Adhiniyam, 1972

IT 1s HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-fourth year of the Republic of India as follows:

Short title. I. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhinivam, 1983,
Amendment of 2. Insection2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis

:j:ﬂwn I? ;?fijgl:E (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, in sub-section (1), for the words
0 : ";hree years”, the words “three years and three months” shall be substituted.

By order,
G. B. SINGH,
Sachiy.

Troud oy offo—q oo 337 &T0 (f4&T0) —5-3-83-—( 3882)— 1983900 (A=0) 1



- GATIRE FHER 0eE, 21 fEEaT, 1983 3

No. 2706(2)/XVII-V-1—1Ka--17-83
Da;edeucknow,‘Sép‘tember 21, 1983

1N pursuance of the provisions of < ) A ) C . )
India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation

of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mardi Semiti (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Dwitiya
. Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1983, (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 18 of 1983) as passed by
the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to the Governor on September 20, 1983 .

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIES (ALPAKALIK
VYAWASTHA) (DWITI YA SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1983
. (U.P. Acr No. 18 or 1983)
(As passed by the Ultar Pradesh Legislature)
, AN :
ACT

ﬁlrrhei to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpandan Mandi Samities (Alpakalik- VyaWastha)
Adhiniyam, 1972

LT Is HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi ~ Shert titiz and
Samities (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodtan) Adhiniyam, 1983. commencement.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on May 23,7j1983.

2.. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samities sa‘g;ﬂ“di“g;‘hf’{,

(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter to be referred to as the Act no. 5
“pringipel Act,— : ' of 1972. -

() for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted
namely ;- ;

“(1) With effect from the date of commencement of the Uttar Pradesh
Krishi U padan Mandi Samities (Alpakalik Vyawastha) {Dwitiya
Sanshodban) Adhinjyam, 1983, the provisions of - the Uttar Pradesh.
Krishi Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyam, 1964 (hereinafter referred to as the
said Adhiniyam), shall for a period of one year or until the constitution
of an eclected Mandi Samiti under section 13 of the said Adhiniyam,
whichever is earlier, have effect in relation to every market area which
existed on the date of such commencement or declared to be so during
the said period, subject to the following provisicns, ramely :—

(a) Except as provided in clause (¢), all powers, functions and
"duties of a Market Committee shall be exercised, performed and
discharged by an ad hoc committee to be nominated by the State
Government ;

(b) The ad hoc committee referred to in clause (a) shall consist
of eleven members, one of whom shall be designated as the Chair-
man; and out of the members, one member each shall be from
amongst commission agents and traders carrying on business in the
market-area, as evident from the licence of the market committee
and five from amongst producer members of market area

(c) The State Government may at any time replace any member
of the ad hoc committee by making a fresh nomination in his place ;

o {d) Subject to the previsions of this section, the ad Aoc committee
_—. shall be deemed for all purposes to be the Market Committee 3

gysamd (€) The ad hoc committee skall not transfer or acquire any immo-
- vable property without prior permission of the Director of Maundis,
;‘; 198 Uttar Pradesh, Lucknow ;

(f) If there is a difference of opinion amongst the members of
the ad hoc committee the decision of the majority shall prevail ;

(2) The State Government may from time to time, by notification,
make such incidental and consequential provisions, including pro-

visions for adapting. modifying or suspending, in whole or in part,
i Ve f e s vdalane ~F tha caid Adhinivam . bt nat

k-"{y

f clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitation of -




SHT W TG AT, 21 FAAET, 1983

(#) Until the nomination of ‘ad hoc committee unc-r clauses (a)
and (b), the arrangement in force immediately before t1 commence-
ment of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Sa. ‘ties (Alpa-
kalik Vyawastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1943, for the
exercise, performance and discharge of the powers, functions and
duties of a market committee shall continue; ’

(i) The District Magistrate shall with effect from thg date of the
nomination of the ad hoc committees under this section, cease to
exercise all powers, functions and duties of the Market Committee
or its Chairman and Vice-Chairman, and any officer specified by the

District Magistrate to exercise any such powers, shall also, with

effect from the said date, cease to exercise them.”

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the word “‘clause (4)” the word “‘clause {g)”
shall be substituted. ’

Repeal and 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samities (Alpakalik
seyings. Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1983, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under
the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance referred. to
in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corres-
ponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the
provisions of this Act were in force at all matenial times.

By order,
G. B. SINGH,
Sachiv,

@0 TH 0 F 09T 0T 0 41- 231 ATO (ﬁaro)-——(izsx)wlssz»mo (F%0)

U.P.Ordi §
nance §
no. 29 of g
1983.




No. 2036(2)/XVII-V-1—1(Ka)-15-1984 '
Dated Lucknow, October 1, 1984

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the} Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the
Uttar. Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi (Shanshodhan) Adhinivam, 1984 {Uttar Pradesh Adhi-
niyam Sankhya 20 of 1984), as passed by the Uttar Pracesh Legislature and assentcd to by the

Governor on September 29, 1984

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDLLAWS
: (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984

[U.P. ACT No. 20 oF 1984}
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legisla ture)

AN
ACT

further to améfrd the Utrar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (A{pakafik

Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972 and the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan M:m_di .

Adhiniyam, 1964,
IT 1s HERERY enacted in the Thirty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :— v
CHAPTER |
. Preliminary

L (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Laws (Amendment) Act, 1984,

(2) Section 2 shall be deemed to have come into force on May 21, 1984,
section 3 shall be deemed to have come into force on October 4, 1983,
section 4 shall be deemed to have come into force on June 11, 1984 and the
remaining sections shall come into force at once. i

CrarTER 11

Amendn;enr of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
V vawastha) Adhinivam, 1972

2. "In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, in sub-section (1), for th¢ words
“one year™ the words “‘two ‘years” shall be substituted.

Cuar1er 111

Amendme}rt of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyar:, 1964

3. In section 23-A of the Krishi Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyam, 1964 (here-
inafter referred to as the principal Act), for sub-section (2), the following sub-
section shall be substituted, namely —

“(2) Subject to the provisions of sub-section (2-B)—

(a) every person, other than a Government setvan{, serving in
any committee on deputation, who holds a post comprised in the
cadre referred to in sub-section (1), and

Short title and
rommencement.

Amendment of

section 2 of U.P,
Act no. 7 of
1972,

Amendment of
section 23-A  of
U.P. Act no, 25
af 1964, -



\

-

TR AW AT TAE, 1 TRAT, 1984

Amendment of
section 40,

Repeal and
 saving.

(b) every Government servant, serving in any committee.on
deputation on a post in the said cadre, who is not found to be
unsuitable, suitability being determined in such manner as may be
laid down in regulations,” = - , o

shall on and 'from‘,the;‘dzite' of the constitution . of the séid.cadre (here-'

inafter in this section to be referred to as the said date) become mem-

ber of the cadre -on the terms and conditions mentioned in sub-section
(2-A) . Lo o '

(2-A) Every person, who becomes a member of the cadre under sub- -
section (2) shall hold office by the same tenure, at the same remuner-
ation, upon the same terms and conditions, “and. with the same rights
and privileges as to pension, gratuity and other matters as he could
have been entitled to on the said date but for the constitution of the
cadre and shall continue to be so entitled until his employment as a
member of the cadre is terminated or until his remuneration or other
‘terms and conditions of service are revised or altered by the Board
under or in pursuance of any law or in accordance with any provision
which for the time being governs his service.

(2-B) Nothing contained in sub-section (2) shall apply to a person
who, by notice in writing, given to the State Government, ' within such
timé as the State Government may, by general or special order specify
intimates his intention of not becoming a member of the said cadre,

(2-C) The services of an employee, under a committee, who opts
‘against absorption, shall stand terminated on the ground of abolition
of post and, on such - terinination, he shall be engitled to receive from
the concerned committee ccmpensation equivalent to— o

(@) three months emoluments in case of permanent employee;
(b) one month’s emoluments in case of tempor‘ary employee;.

(2-D) A Government servant serving in any committee on deputa-
tion on any post in the cadre, referred to in sub-seéction (1) who opts
against absorption or who is not found suitable, shall be reverted to his
parent department and, if having regard to his seniority, a post is not
available for him in the parent department his services shall stand
terminated with effect from the date of the order of reversion. on the

~ ground of abolition of post and, on such termination, he shall be
entitled to receive, from the State Government, compensation equi-
valent to the amount mentioned in sub-section (2-C)”.

4. In section 40 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1) the following
sub-section shall be substituted namely :—
. “(1) The State Government may make rules for carrying out the
purpose of this Act.”
o ‘ - CHAPTER IV
Miscellaneous
S. . (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpcdan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik

Vyawastha) (Sansh-dhan) Adhbyadesh, 1984 and the Uttar Pradesh Krishi
Utpadan Mandi (Amendment) Ordinance, 1984, are hereby repealed. ’

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any ‘action taken under
the Acts referred to in Chapters IT and IIl as amernded by the Ordinances
referred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken
under the corresponding provisions of said Acts as amended by this Act as if
the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.

By orcer.
B. L. LOOMBA;
Sachiv.

ﬁo@oqo G 0--gqof0 161 @0 (Faerr0)——(2206)——1984~-750 (AF0) 1 -




No. 1342(2)/XVII-V-1—1(KA)-21—1985
Dated Lucknow, August 7, 1985

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the
. Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhi-

niyam, 1985, (Uttar Pradsh Adhiniyam Sankhya 14 of 1985), as passed by the Uttar Pradesh
Legislature and assented to by the Governor on August. 5, 1985-

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYALWAS'[H&} tSANSHﬂDHAN} ADHIN]YAM, 1985

. (U. P. Acr No. 14 or 1985)

' (As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
_1‘1%96@ AN
further to amend the Uttar Fradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyawastha) Adhinivam, 1972 _ '
1T 1S HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:— :
Short title an!’ 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Commencement  Ga itis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1985,
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on May 22, 1985,
Amendment of 2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
section 2 ol

U.P. Act no. 7 (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the princi-

of 1972 pal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “two years” the words “three years”
v . shall be substituted

Repeal  and " 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpaddn Mandi .

; Samitis (Alpakalik
SAvIing

Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1985, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred
to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the

corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if the
provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.,

By order,
B. L. LOOMBA,
Sachiv,

TT0NT07 097T0—0 0970 108870 (Fare)——(1534)—1985-—g00 (5% 0) |

T

et 0 AR

ki Bl i

e R




No. 1631 (2) JXVILV-11 (KA)-27-1986
. Dated Lucknow, September 9, 1986

In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitu--
tion of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication: of the following
English translation of the Uttar Pradesh = Krishi, Utpadan Mandi Samiti
(Alpkalik Vyawastha) Sanshodhan Adhiniyam, 1986 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam
Samkhya 16 of 1986) as passed Dy the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to
by the Governor on September 8, 1986. :

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1986
. (U. P. Act Np. 16 oF 1935}
(As passed by the Uttar' Pradesh Legislature)
: - ACT _
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972
IT 1s HEREBY enacted in the Thirty Seventh Year of the Republic of India as
follows:— _
Shert title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
commencement  Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1986,
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on May 21, 1986.
wras vl 5 In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis

section 2 of (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the princi-
U.P.. Act no. T pal Act, in sub-section (1, for the words “three years™ the words “four years™

of 1972 shall be substituted. _ .
A 3) (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis Alpakalik
grﬁﬁ? = ~ Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1986, is hercby repealed. ( .lﬁ Hk

(2) Notwjt!:standing such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred
to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if the
provisions of this Act were in force at all material times. ' o

By order, -
'S, N. SAHAY,
Sachiv.

&ﬁqﬁqnﬂu-qm"rﬁ 707 Twad (fz0)~~(1519)-—1986~~1830 (R%0) |.- -




No. lQTU{Z}XVII-V-l-—I[KA} 14-1988
Dated Lucknow, October 15, 1988

- . In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the Govarnor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the
Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Maadi Samiti ( Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam,
1983 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 18 of 1988) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legis-
lature'and assented to by the Governor on October 15, 1988 : :

. THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN. MANDI SAMITIS |
' (ALPAKALIK VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) -
ADHINIYAM, 1988 :
- (U. P. Acr No. 18 or 1988)1
{4s passed by the U. P. Legislature]
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis '(Alpakalik
i Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972 : . b
IT 13 HEREBY, enacted in the Thirtyminth Year of the Republic of India -
- as follows:— : : :

L]

Short title and 1, (I’ This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesk Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Commencement  Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1988, : v

m}-ltﬂmﬂbeﬂeemedtnhmwinm'forman]mﬁ. 1988.

mendment of 2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradeth Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitie

o 157; (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the princi-

Grasdiis pal Act, in subsection (1), for the words “five years” the words “six years”
shall be substituted- and be deemed always to have been substituted,

Repeal and ~3.- (I){ The: Uttar Pradesh’ Ktishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik (.3, c

Saving Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1988, is hereby repealed. ' pe 193:

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken

. under the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance
- referred- to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken
under the- corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this

Act, as if the provisions-of this Act were in force at all material times. = -

' | By order,

S. N. SAHAY, e

Sachiy.

Yo ¥W07 09Y 0 goxYo 122 /o fawro - (1791)--17-10-88-—1988-- 856 (Aw0) 1

f &
AN e — i-aaliiy 2 - F

I LR S R -




i
“Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
"seckion 2 of U.P
Act no.7 of 1972

Repeal” anu
saving

9 0TR 07 0% 0——T 0 dto 152870 (fagr0)--(2361)—~1989—~850 ( wo) | _

No. 1913 (2) /XVILV—I-1 (KA} 27-1989
~ Dated Lucknow, October 6, 1989
IN pursuance of the provisions ol clause {5) of Article 348 of the Consti-

‘tution of India, the Governor s pleascd to order the publication of thel

following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha)' (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1989 (Uttar Pradesh
Adhiniyam Sankhya 22 of 1989) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature
and assented to by the Governor on October 6, 1989. '

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS (ALP-
KALIK VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1989
[U. P. Act no. 22 oF 1989)
(ds passed by tie U. P. Legislaturey,
: . AN
- ACT .
SJurther to amend the Uttar Prodesh Krishi Utpaden Mandi Samitis

(Alpkalik Vyawastha) Adkiniyam, 1972.

IT 1s HEREBY enacted in the Fortieth Yeer of the Republic of India ag
follows :—.

(1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandj
Samitis (Alpkalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1989.
- (2) Ttshall be deemed to have come into force on June 6, 1989,

2. Insection 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpkalik Vyawastha) Aflhiniyam. 1972 hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act in sub-section (1), fgr the words “of six years” the words “up to December
31, 1989” shzll - be substituted and be deemed always to have been supstituted.

M

3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpkalik
Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1989, is hercby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under .
the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in
sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the corres-
pending provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if the
provisions cof this Act were in force at all material times. '

egc

By order,
NARAYAN DAS,
Sachiv.




F T ey T T A TS (R

No. 275 (2) /XVII-V-1-1 (KA -2-1990
Dated Lucknow, January 20, 1990

In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Consti-

-, tution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the Et:blimﬁan of the|

~. "™ following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh i Utpadan Mandi
Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1990 (Uttar Pradech
Adhiniyam Sankhya 3 of 1990) as passéd by the Uttar * Pradesh * Legislature
and assented to by the Governor on January 20, 1990.

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYAWASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 1990

(U. P. Act No. 3 of 1990)
[As pessed by the Us P, Legislature]
AN
ACT

further to aﬁ:md the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakaltk
_ Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972.
It 1s HEREBY enacted inthe Fortieth Year ¢f the Republic of India as
follows —

Short title and 1. (1) This Act niay be.called the Utltar Predesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi

commencement  Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawasthe) (Sanshcdhan) Adhiniy: m, 1950,
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on December 30, 1989,
Amendment ¢f 2. Insection2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis

section 2 of (Alpakalik Vyawastha}.ﬂdhini m, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the
U.P. Act 0. T pripcipal Aect, in sub-section (1), for the word and figures “December 31,

of 1972 1980” the words and figures “June 30, 1990°* shall be substituted.
Repeal and 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpaddn ‘Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
saving Vyawastha) (Dwitiya Sanshedhen) Adhyadcsh, 1989, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anyt hing done or any acfion taken
under the pro visions of the principel Act as amended by the Ordinance refe-
rred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under
the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended bythis Act asif
the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times. -

By order,
' NARAYAN DAS,
;| _ : g . Sachiv.
Y ouw 07 07 07 ot 0 232 Ao (faar0) —(3687)=—~1990-—850(#F0) |

- e e p——




No. 1627(2)/XVII-V-1—1 (KA)28-19%0
Dated Lucknow, June 30, 1990

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of tbe Constitution cf India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the
Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodban)
Adhiniyam, 1990 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 11 of 1990) as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on June 29, 1990.

TIE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITES
(ALPAKALIK VYAWASTHA) (DWITIYA SANSHODHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 1990

%

(U. P. Act No. 11 of 1990)
(As passed by the U. P. Legislature)

AN
Act

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972.

T 1s HEREBY enacted in the Forty-first Year of the Republic of India
as follows :—

Short title 1. 'This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan
Mandi Samitis  (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodhan)

Adhinivam, 1990.

Amendment of 2. 1In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi

section 2 of U.F. samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, in_sub-section (1),
or the word and figures “June 38, 1996” tie word and' figures “Dessmber
31, 1990 shall be substituted.

By order,
NARAYAN DAS, °
Sachiy.




[ R

No. 434(2)/XVII-V-1—1 (KA)-4-1991
Dated Lucknow, March 22, 1991

(Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 16 of 1991) as “passed by  the Uttar Pradesh Legislature
and assented to by the Governor on March 20, 1991,

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHIY UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK WAW;&STHA) {SANSHDDHAN} ADHINI?AM, 19431
(U. P. Act No. 16 OF 1991)

[As passed by the U, p. Legislature]

AN
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh  Krishi Utpadan Mand; Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972

IT 18 HEREBY enacted in the Fortysecond Year of the Republic of India
as follows :— ;

Short title and .. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan
i i N ¥ PR (Alpakalik * Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1991,

(2) Tt shall be deemed to have come into force on December 31, 199,

wné?‘b 'on 2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis

ﬁ?m VIT of (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter  referred to as the

1972 principal Act,” in sub-section (1), for the word and figures “December 31,
1990” the word and figures “June 30, 1991” shall be substituted ,

Repeal and saving 3. (I) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1990, is hereby repead.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ordinance
referred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken

under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this
Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.

By order,
NARAYAN DAS,
Sachiy.

oqFoT0 Mo~goGto 353 7Ty (Faar0)—- (3794)— 1091~ g5, (%o) v

dU.P.
Grm?‘m
ot
"1590



No. 1513 (2} XVIT-V-i—1 (KA) 22-1991
- Dated Lucknow, August 17, 1991

Iﬁ_pﬁ:suanc& of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of

India, the Governor is pleased to order the Publication of the folowing English translation of . -
* the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodhan)

 Adhiniyam, 1991 (Uttar Prml'-:sh_}’hlhinijnm Sankhya 21 of 1991) as by passed the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the. Governor on August 17,1991 : :

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
. (ALPAKALIK VYAVASTHA) (DWITIYA SANSHODHAN)

! g - ADHINIYAM, 1991,

[U.P. Acr Ne, 21 or 19917
(As passed 0y the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
. e ;

- ACT

further to amend The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mand; Samitis (Alpakalik
g ~ _ : Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1977.
IT IS HEREBY ena

cted in the Forty-second Year of the Republic of India,

-as follows :— = : '
Short title and  © g . (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan
Commencement: - kf.ndi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhinivam, M9].

_ (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on June 30, 1991.
Amendment of

a tUP 2. Insection 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
Sf:;‘:]’f&l of  (Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the principal |
T N Act, in sub-section (1)y for the word and figures “June 30, 1991” the word
: - and figures “December 21, 1991 shall be subsrituted.
Repeal  and 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
savings

: Samitis. (Alpakalik y.p.
Vyavastha) (Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1991 is here

by repealed., ﬂrdin;(fﬁ.

: (2) Notwithstanding such re;l)eal, anything done or any action taken nﬂiqm _
under the provisions of the principal Act, a5 amended by the Ordingnce

- referred to in sub-section (1), Shall be deemed to have been done or taken

under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended. by this
Act, as if the provisions of thic Act were in force at all material times.

A | By order,
s NARAYAN DAS.
Sackiy.

w"rdqautgbﬁu—qnq’fu_ 139 w0 (fravo)—- (1222)-1991-g50 (Aw0) 4




%q-geq——268 PR PRI I

*ﬁfﬁﬂ'ﬁ g W@f!ﬁf ¢t. sw
gred=r Fo TAe Ho—41 .5;
m@wz%wmfz

- faemt afcfime
AET— 1, T2 (F)
(ST waw afafw) 1G5 (50
{ @, Tl 3 wiw, 1995 [/ 0 €/732
oz §a 13, 1915 UF §FQ WA

UTTAR PRADESH SARKAR
VIDHAYI ANUBHAG-1 "
No. 553/XVII-V— 1-1(KA)1-1993
Dated Lucknow, April 3, 1993
NOTIFICATICN
' Miscellaneous
The followmg President’s Act enacted on April 3, 1993 is published
for general information:
THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYAWASTHA) AMENDMENT ACT, 1993
(PresIDENT’S AcT No. 2 oF 1993)
Enacted by the Prasident in the Forty-fourth Year of the
© ° Republic of India.
AN
ACT
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyawasthc) Adhiniyam, 1972. v
-In exercise of the powers conferred by secticn 3 of the Uttar Pr?desh
State Legisisture (Delegation of Powerk) Act, 193, the President is plezsed J
to enact as follows (—
- 1. (1) This Act mz2y be called the Uttsr Pradesh Krishi Ut;:«‘d?n Mandi Short title and
Samitis (Alpakalik Vywastha) Amendment Act, 1993. commencement.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come inte feyree on the 16th day of
January, 1993. '

~




2 , TR WA AGE 3 WY, 1993

| ik
ti f 2. Inthe Uttar Pradesh Krishi UtpadanMan di Sam;tls (Arpakel

iﬁ&‘fﬁé‘uﬁf g);; Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, for section2, the following section shall be

. 2 72

m?o 1°of 1972 substityed, namely :

2. (1‘)" With effect from the date of commencement of thg

" Temporary Provi- Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Simitis
X stcc;ns regarding (Alpakalik Vyawastha) Amendment Ordinance,
Smimistration 1993, the provisions of the Uttar Pradesh

Krishi Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyam, 1964 (hereinafter referred to
as the said Adhiniyam) shall, for a period of one year form the
date of such commencement or until the constitution of an
elected Mandi Samiti under section 13 of the said Adhiniyam,
whichever is earlier, have effect in relation to every market
area which existed on the date of such commencement or which is

declared to be so during the said period, subject t6 the followmg
provisions, namely :—

(a) notwithstanding anything contained in the said
Adhiniyam, every Ad-hoc Committee constituted under this
Act (as it existed immediately before the date of such
commencement) shall stand dissolved, and the Chairman and
every other member of such Committee shall cease to hold
their respective offices :

'(b)' all powers, functions and duties of the Committee, i
its Chairman and Vice Chairman shall be vested in, and be
exercised, performed and discharged by the District

- Magistrate of the district in which the Principal Market
Yard is situate, and such District Magistrate shall be deemed

in law to be the Committee, its Chairman or Vice Chairman
as the occasion may require ;

(¢) subject to any general or special order of the State
Government, such District Magistrate may, subject to such
terms and conditions as he may think fit to impose, delegate
all or any of the powers conferred on him by clause (b) to
any officer specified by him in this behalf ;

(d)” the State Government may from time to time by
notification in the Gazette, make such incidental or conse-
quential provisions, including provisions for adapting,
modifying or suspending, in whole or in part, the operation
of any provisions of the said Adhiniyam, but not affecting ;
the substance, as may appear to it to be necessary or i
desirable for any of the foregoing or connected purposes.

(2) Every notification issued under clause (d) of sub-
section (1) shall as soon as may be, after it is issued, be laid
before each House of the State Legislature, and the provisions
of sub-section (1) of section 23-A of the Uttar Pradesh General y.p.
Clauses Act, 1904 shall apply as they apply in respect of rules A‘;‘y}“
made by the State Government under any Uttar Pradesh Act”. "

Reposl  and 8. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpa- Ocf i1}
Saving knlik Vyawastha) Amendment Ordinance, 1993 is hereby repealed.



p.poaet7
of 1972

R R

U I TR KA s@, 3 9, 1093

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpa-
kalik Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972 as amended by the said Ordinance
ghall be deemed to have been done or taken under the said Adhlmyam,

‘as amended by this Act.

SHANKER DAYAL SHARMA,
President.

B. R. ATRE,
Joint Secretary to the Govt. of Indid.

Reasons for the Enactment

The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyam was enacted
in 1864 (25 of 1964) to provide for regulation of sale and purchase of

agricultural produce and for the establishment, superintendence and

oontrol of markets in Uttar Pradesh. Section 13 of the Adhiniyam

provides for constitution of market committee, other than the first

committee constituted by nomination, which shall consist of elected
representatives of Local bodies, commission agents, producers and

nominated members representing Food Corporation of India, Central

Warehousig Corporation, State Warehousing Corporation and the State
Government. As the elected Mandi Samitis under section 13 of the
1964 Adhiniyam could not be constituted, this section was amended by
the TUttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyawastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, which provided for exercise, performance
and discharge of all powers, functions and duties of the market committee

by an ad-hoc committee to be nominated by the State Government

till the constitution of elected Mandi Samitis under the 1864 Adhiniyam.

‘The provisions of 1972 Adhiniyam were substituted by the Uttar
‘Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyawastha)

(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1980 which provided for dissolution of ad-hoc

"Mandi Samitis and vesting of all powers, functions and duties of the

committee, its Chairman and Vice-Chairman in the District Magistrate.
The 1980 Amendment was repealed by an Amendment to the principal

" Act in 1983 and the position as prevailed just after the 1972 amendment
“was restored.

2. The system of ad-hoc committees has been continued since

1983 by way of  Ordinances by the State Government. The Ilast such

Ordinance was promulgated by the Governor of Uttar Pradesh on

"20th November, 1992 extending the arrangements till 30th June, 1993.
“The said Ordinance could not be laid in the State Agsembly as the

Assembly did not meet after the 29th November, 1992 till its dissolution
on 6th December, 1992 when the State was placed under the President’s

‘Rule as per provisions of Article 356 of the Constitution. To avoid a

vacuum In the administration of market committees a Presidential

‘Ordinance namely the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitig

(Alpakalik Vyawastha)' Amendment Ordinance, 1893 (Ord. 11 of 1992)

‘was promulgated on 16th January, 1993,

3. Parliament has under Article 357(1) (a) of the Constitution
-conferred on the President the powers of the legislature of the State of

Utter Pradesh to mske laws vide the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature



O AW AEHTLN MHE, 3 %§T, 1993

(Delegation of Powers) Act, 1993. It has, therefore, been decided te
replace the said Ordinance No. 11 of 1993 by a Presidential enactment.

4. Under the proviso to sub-section (2) of section 3 of the Uttar
Pradesh State Legislature (Delegation of Powers) Act, 1993, the
President shall before enacting any President’'s Act, consult a Committee
constituted for the purpose consisting of the members of both the Houses
of Parliament. As the said Committee has not so far been constituted
and the matter is very urgent in nature and the time left is very short,
it is proposed to enact the measure without reference to the Committee,
‘ NIRMALA BUCH,

Secy. to the Govt. of India,.
Ministry of Rural Development,.

(Department of Rural Development). -
By order, i
N. K. NARANG, --’
Sachiv.
puk
TH
o qgo g0 Mo-~gofo 3 are (faer0)—(6)~1993- 850 (Fx0) b - A

196/




No. 603 (2)/XVII-V-1—1 (KA)-1/1994
Dated Lucknow, April 2, 1994

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 148 of the Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleaszd to order the publication of the followiag English translation of the
Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samiti (Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam,
1994 (Uttar Pradesh Adhinivam Sankhya 6 of 1994) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature

and assented to by the Governor on Mrch 31, 1994,

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYAVASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADRINIYAM, 1994

[U. P. Act no. 6 oF 1994]

[4s passed by the U. P. Legislature] ot
AN '
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Predesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972.

IT 1S HErERY enacted in the Fortv-fifth Year of the Republic of India
as follows — =

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan ‘Mandi
Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhinivam, 1994.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on January 15, 1994,

2. For scciion 2 of the Utitar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyavasthaj Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely —

«3. (1) With effect from the date of commencement of the Uttar
Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik

T en Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1994, the
B ardi provisions of Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan

recarding - o .

administration Mandi Adhinivam, 1964 (hereinafter referred
of Mandi to as the said Adhinivam), shall for a period of one
Samitis year or until the constitution of an elected Mandi

Samiti under section 13 of the said Adhiniyam, whichever is
earlier, have effect in relation to every market area which eXisted
on the date of such commencement or declared to be so during
the said period, subject to the following provisions, namely —

(@) except as provided in clause (), all powers. functions and
duties of a Market Committee shall be exercised, performed
and discharged by an ad-hoc commitlce to be nominated by
the State Government -

(b) the ad-hoc committee referred 1o in clause (4) shall consist
of cleven members, one of whom shall be designated as the
Chairman; and out of the members, one member shall be from
amongst the commission agenis and iwo from amongst the
traders carrying on business in the market ared. as evident from
the licence of the Markst Cemmittee and eight from amongst
the producer members of market area !

Short title and
commencement

Substituted of
section 2 of U, P,
Act no, 7of 1972



~ AE N FINNS  WgeIATS N 4 eTTT g e Tatuscgy e

Repeal and
sav}):gs

| RoTA0T0TN0-—~T0 0 ¢ w0 (fAq70)~=(6)~—1994-=850 (fw0)

3.
Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1994 is hereby repealed.

under the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub.
section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the correspon- -
ding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the
provisions of this Act were in force at all material times. ¢ A

period of not less than thirty days extending in its one session” or

(¢) the State Government may, at any time, replace any
member of the ad-hoc committee by making a fresh nomi.
nation in his place;

(d) subject to the provisions of this section, the ad-hoc
committee shall be deemed, for all purposes, to be the Market -
Committee:

(e) the ad-hoc committee shall not transfer or acquire any:
jmmoveble property without prior permission of the Director
of Mandis, Uttar Pradesh, Lucknow ;

(f) if there is a difference of opinion amongst the members
of the ad-hoc committec, the decision of the majority shall prevail;

(g) the State Governmeni may, from time to time, by noti-
fication, make such incidental and consequential provisions, in-
cluding provisions for adapting, modifying or suspending, in whole 3
or in part, the operation of any provisions of the said Adhiniyam,
but not affecting the substance, as may appear 1o it t¢ be nece-
ssary or desirable for any of the foregoing or connected purposes;

(h) until the nomination of ad hoc committee under clauses (q)
and (b), the arrangement in force immediately before the commen-
cement of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis-
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1994 for the
exercise, performance and discharge of the powers, functions
and duties of a Market Committee shall continue;

(i) the District Magistrate, shall with effect from the date of
the nomination of the ad hoc committees under this section, cease
to exercise all powers, functions and duties cf the Market
Committee or its Chairman and Vice-Chairman, and any officer
specified by the District Magistrate t0 exercise any such powers,
shall also, with effect from the said date, cease to exercise them.

(2) Every notification issued under clause (g) of sub-section (1)
shall as soon as may be, after it is issued be laid before each
House of the State Legislature, while it is in session, for a total

more than one successive sessions, and shall, unless some later date is
appointed take effect from the date of its publication in the Gazette,
subject to such modifications or annulments as the two Houses of
the Legisiature may during the said period agree to make, so,
however ihiat any such modification or annulment shall be without
prejudice to the validity of anything previously done there under.”

(1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakaljk |

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken

By order,
N. K. NARANG,
Sachiv.



- L w1 SR R e Ny = » -
i RS R " o
-

e w b wION ARL D RYIEN-1- “L(KA)17-1995
"~ Dated, Lﬂckmnr, February 13, 1995

In pursuance of the provisionsof clause (3]"01‘ Article 3434}F the Constitution of Ind'a the
Governor is pleased to order the pubhcatmﬂ of the fnilﬂwmg English translation of the
Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (A!Pﬂkapk ¥Yyavstha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam
1995 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 2 of '1993) as passed by the Utiar Pradash '
Legislature and ¢ssented to by the” Governor on e bru&ry 11, 1995,

"THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI YTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS (ALPA-
KALIK VYAVASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 1995

.+ (UsP.AcT No. 2 oF 1995) _
" " (As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature) 7
: ' AN
ACT
further to amend the Uﬂar Pradesh X rufn Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972 :

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Furty-smth Year of the Republic of India
as follows :—

Short title and 1. (1} This Act may bl;‘: call-ﬂd the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
commencement  Gq mitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1995,

(2) It shall be decmed to have come into force on January 15, 1994,

il

»

Amendment of 2. In Section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samms
Section 2 '-"I{E (Alpakalik Vvavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, heremafter referred to as the prmcl-
U{;rp-g‘;;* ©.7  pal Act, in sub-section (1) for the words * “one year” the words “two years’
S shaH be substituted. -
Repeal and (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpﬂda.rt Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik V. P. Ordi-
Savings ‘J’yava&tha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1995 is hereby repealed. pance No, 5

of 199
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken .

under the provisons of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance

referred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken

under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as amended by this
. Act as if the prc-ﬂsmns uf‘ this Act were in foroe at all material times.

By order,
N. K. NARANG,
Pramulkh Sachiv.

Wt om0 70 No-gedte 2?9mufwn--{35r5]-1gas-ssu {ﬁ'q:n) 3




No. 1088 2WXVIE-V-1—1 (KA) 6- 1997
Dated Lucknow, July 31, 1997
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause' (3) of Article

_pleased to order the publication of the following English transtation of the Untar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samil
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) ( Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1997 (Utar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 5 of 1997) as passed by th
Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented (o by the Governor on July 30, 1997,

34R of the Constitution of India, the Governor i

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIK VYAVASTHA) (SANSHODIIAN) ADHINIY AM. 1997
( U.P. ACT No. 5 OF 1997)

[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legistature|
AN
ACT.
Jurther to amend the Unar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhinivam, 1972,

ITIS HEREBY cnacted in the Forty-cighth Year of the Republic of India as tollows ;—

Short title L. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis

and commen- (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1997.

cement : ‘
{2) It shall be deemed to have come into force o January 15, 1996.




TT TR SEHRY T, 31 AR, 1997

2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik  Amendient
Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act, in sub-scction  ©f section 2

(1), for the words “for a period of two years”, the words and figures * till December 31, g(f’ ”7‘:) lﬁc‘
1998" shall be substituted. , 1972

- 3. Tor the removal of doubts it is hereby declared that the powers, functions  Validation
and duties of the Market Committee, its Chairman and Vice-Chairman, vested in the
District Magistrate undcer séction 2 of the principal Act inmediately before Januvary 15,
1996, shatl be decmed to have validly continyed to be vested in the District Magistrate
untill the nomination of ad hoc Cowmmittec under the aforcsaid section or the
coustitution of an elected Mandi Samiti under section 13 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi
Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyam, 1964 and anything dong or any action taken by the District
Magistrate in exercise, performance and discharge of the said powers, functions and
duties at any time on or after January 15, 1996, shall be deemced to be valid as if the
provisions of the principat Act as amended by this Act were in force at all material
times. ‘

QI‘C{itx?x(ncc 4. (1) The Uuar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) Repeal and
2400 1997 (sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 1997 is hereby repealed. savings
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal anything douc or any action taken under the
provisions of the principal Act as amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-section
(1), shall be deemed 0 have been done or-taken under the corresponding provisions of

the principal Act as amended by this Act, as if the provisions of this Act were in force
at all material times,

By order?
R. D. MATHUR,
" Pramukh Sachiv.

frogaogofto—Toto 109 o RHTH-1-8-97~859)- 1997850 (FR/AHIZ) |




T —

- ~No. 625 (2)/XVIL-V-1—I (KA)2/1099
Dated Lucknow, March 16, 1999

I~ pursuance of the Frovision of clause (3) of Articls 348 of the Consiitution, of
India, the Qovernor is pleased to order the publication of the following Fngiish
translation of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Uttpadan Mandi Sami'i (Alpakalik Vyavastha)
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam. 1999 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 7 of 1999) as passed
by the Uttat Pradesh Legislatare and assented to by the Governor on March 16, 1999,

-~ .—THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MA NDI SAMITIS
~ (ALPAKALIK VYAVASTHA) (SANSHODHAN)
ADHINIYAM, 1999 -
[U.P.AcTNo. ToF1999]
(4s passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
- . AN
ACT

farther 10 amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishl Utpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik ¥yavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, ?

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Fiftieth Year of the Republic of Iadia
as follows :— .

Short title and 1. (1) This Aot may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan
commeacemend  Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1999,

(2) It shall be deemed to have come Into force on Decomber 31, 1998,
Amendment. of d

ety oy 2, In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis.
U.?. Actno,7 (Alpakelik Vyavastha) Adbiriyam, 1972, bereinafter referred to as the prin-
of 1972 .cipal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words and figures “till December 31,

1998’ the words and figures “till December 31, 2000 shall be substituted,

3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadin Mandi Samitis (A lpakalik
Vyavastha) (Sanshodban) Adhyadesh, 1998 is hereby repealed,

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action talen
under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the
Oidinance referred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done

. or taken under the cﬂrresiFondiug provisions of the principal Act as
1

amen<ed by this Act, as if the provisions of this Act were in force st all
materialtimes,

Repeal and
Savings

By order,
G. S. PANDLY,
Vishesh Sachiv,
4 0@ 0FON 9~ 00 281 aro, (fgaro) —{2437) = 1999~ 850 {d=s) 1




TAT IIN FUIEIL AHE, 30 kA, 2001 8

" Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by thy Govar 1or oa Aprll 30, 2001 aloagwith :
the Statment of Objzcts and Reasons thereto i— ‘

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAMITIS
(ALPAKALIR VYAVASTHA) (SANSHODHAN)
" ADHINIYA N, 2001 ‘

- (U, 2. Acr N, 10 or 2001)
[As} passzd by thz Uttar Pradesh LegiSlqtare}
, AN
ACT -~

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Upadan Mandi Samitis
. ( Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adpinfyam, 1972 :
It 1s mEREBY cnacted fn the Fifty-second Year of theZRepubliciof
- India as follows i— o

1. (1) This Act ‘may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan = Short title aad
Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastba) (Sanshodban) Adhiniyam, 2001. Sonmencement

(2) Itshall be deemed to have come into force on December 27, 2000.

i

2. In section 2 of the yttar Ptédcsh Krishi' Utpazian Mandi Samitis Amendment of
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinaftor referred to as the Secg“ 2 of
principal Act, in sub-section (1) for tbe words and figures “till December 31, Sf‘ 357?& mo. ¥

. 2000” the words a}nd figures ¢tiil December 31, 2001‘" shall be substituted.

3. (1) Thz Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan-Mandi Samitis (Alpakam " Repeal - ang
Vyavistha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2000 is hereby repeated. “f saviogs . g
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action ta al
pnder the provisions of the priacipal Act, as amended ty the Ordinance
referred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken
wnder the corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as ainended by this
- Act, as if this Ast were in force at all material imes, '

’ By order,
Y. R. TRIPATHI,
Pramukh_Sachiv,

e st s

STATEMENT 'OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan'Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam,
1972 (U. P. Act no, 7 of 1972) was amended by the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1997 (U.:P. Act no. 50f1997) to
provide that till December 31, 1998 or ustil the constitution of an elected Mandi Samiti
undér section 13 of the Utttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Adhiniyam, 1964 whichever
s earlier, all powers, funcions and duties of the Market Co mmittees shall be exercised, per-
formed and discharged by an eleven member ad-hoc Committee to be nominated by the
State Government and until the nomination of such ad-hoc Committee all powers, functions
and duties of a Market Gommittee, its Chairman and Vice-Chairman shall be exercised,
pthOrméd and discharged by the District Magistrate, The said period was extended from
December 31, 1998 to December 31, 2000 by the Uttar Pradesh Krishi 7tpadan Mandi Samitis
(Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1999. Since the said ‘arrangement was to
expire on Décember 31, 2600 and the electionof Market Committees could not be held, it was
decided to extend the period of the said arrangement till December’ 31, 2001 by making
amendment in the sgid Adhiniyam of 1972. _ ,

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative. action was
necessary to implement the said decision, the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi
Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2000° (U. P. Ordinance no. 18
of 2600) was promulgated by the Governor on December 27, 2000. C

This Bill isintroduced jto replace the aforesaid Ordinance.

*Qoua0g0fta~qo o 24 arofmro-—~(205)—2001 -850 (RAwo0) !

rmew




ao B K .- e R PR TS E N
- i w el e P TR L S N S LR e
T IR SN TYREETT AT A S TR

ﬁmmawurm 17ﬁmm 2002

3

mﬁ%ﬁwuﬁimnm%ﬁ;wgaﬁmﬂw%mamﬁﬁnmw 2003 OF
FEY 3N 1 SE, 2002 B AT IED AR e AT N1 Bo itk srfafat St A
ﬁ#%%ﬁaﬁw?z%m@hﬁmﬁrﬂwaﬁm@aﬁmml

Wwﬂﬁwm@m@mﬁﬁm mshaﬂ)ﬁmzﬁzooz
g?wﬁaﬁ?mm%‘l

F

No. 1768 (2/XVII-V-1 -1HKA) 29:2002
“Dated Lucknow September 17, 2002

N pursuance of the provlsmns of clause (3) of Aurticle 348 of the Conshtunon of India, the

Govemor is p]eased to order the pubhcanon of the followmg Engllsh ‘translation of the Uttar Pradesh'

: _Knshl Utpadan Mandi Samiti {(Alpakalik Vyawastha) (Sanshodhan), Adhlmyam, 2002 (Uttar Pradesh
-Adhiniyam Sank.hya 17 of 2002) ‘as passed by ‘the Ulta.r Pradesh Leglslatum and assented 1o by the
_ Governor on September 13,2002:—

THE UTTAR PRADESH KRISHI UTPADAN MANDI SAM[TIS (ALPAKALIK

VYAVASTHA) (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIY AM, 2002
‘ " T (UP.ACTNO. 17 OF 2002)
" {As passed by _fhe Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
ACT S

. further 1o amend the Uttar Pradesh Km‘h: Uapadan Mandx Samitis Mlpakahk
" Vyavastha) Adhmgmm 1972, s .

IT 1S ‘HEREBY enacted in the Flﬁy-thlrd Year of the Republlc of lndla as

Fl

~ follows:— .

L. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Uzpadan Short lide  and
Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavasd'la) (Sanishodhan) Adhiniyam, 2002. commencement

. (2) hushall be deemed to have come mto force on December 24
2001. .
' 2. In section 2 “of the Uttar Pradesh Knshi Utpadan Mandi Amendment . of
. Samitis (AIpakallk Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972, hereinafier referred to as section 2 of U.P.
the’ prmapa[ Act, in sub-section (1) for the words and fi igures ““till Am:"h”gn
" December 31, 2001"" the words and figures ““till March 31, 2003 shall '
be subsmuted

3. For the removal of doubts it" is hercby declared that the Validation
pOwers functions and duties of a Market Committee, its Chairman and
Vice-Chairman, vested in the District Magistrate concerned under
section 2 of the principal Act immediately before January 1, 2002, shall be
deemed to -have validly continued to be so vested in such District
Magistrate and anyihing done or any action -taken by the District
Magistrate in exercise, performance and discharge of the said powers,
functions and duties at any time on or after January i, 2002, shall be
“deemed to be valid as if the provisions of the principal Act as amended by
this Act were in force at all material times. :

UP. 4. (1) The Utar Pradesh Knshl Utpadan Mandi Samilis Repeal and saving

Ordinance  (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2001 is hereby repealed.



4 | TR OYRY SHERT e, 17 faawEr, 2002

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the
Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
done or taken under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as

amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all
melerial times.

By order,
R-B. R.AO1

Sachiv.
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) Adhiniyam, 1972 (U.P.
Act no. 7 of 1972) was amended by the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik
Vyavastha) (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 1997 (U.P. Actno. § of 1997) to provide that till December 31, 1998
or until the constitution of an elected Mandi Samiti under section 13 of the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan
Mandi Adhiniyam, 1964 whichever is earlier, all powers, functions and duties of the Market Committees
shall be exercised, performed and discharged by an eleven member ad-hoc Comminee to be nominated by
the State Government and until the nomination of such ad-hoc Committee, all powers, functions and
duties of a Market Committee. its Chairman and Vice-Chairman shall be exercised, performed and
discharged by the District Magistrate. The said period was extended from December 31, 1998 to
December 31, 2000 by the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha)
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1999, and from December 31, 2000 to December 31, 2001 by the Uttar Pradesh
Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha} (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2001.

Since the aforesaid arrangement was to expire on December 31, 2001 and the election of Market
Comminees could not be held, it was decided to extend the period of the said arrangement till
December 31, 2002 by amending the said Adhiniyam of 1972.

Since the State Legislature was not in session the Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandl Samitis

(Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2001, (U.P. Ordinance no. 25 of 2001) was

.- promulgated by the Governor on December 24, 2001 to implement the aforesaid decision. The said

Ordinance no. 25 of 2001 was lapsed afler expiry of six weeks from March 8, 2002 the date of
proclamation of President’s rule in the State and the Parliament being in session.

It has now been decided to amend the aforesaid Act of 1972 to extend the 1erm of the aforesaid

arrangement till March 31, 2003 and to validate the things done and actions taken by the District
Magistrates on or afier lanuary 1, 2002,

The Uttar Pradesh Krishi Utpadan Mandi Samitis (Alpakalik Vyavastha) (Sanshodhan)
Vidheyak, 2002 js introduced accordingly.

flordogofle—Teldlo 598 WSIMA ([Ra)-2002—(1372)--597 (&1 / HTHRTE) |
RotBoYoflo—Teho 170 IMa fAIN—2002-(1373)-850 -(TFga s / ITHAZ) |



	1972UP7.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 1972.pdf
	UP Act 11 of 1979.pdf
	1981UP4
	UP Act 27 of 1982.pdf
	UP Act 1 of 1983.pdf
	UP Act 18 of 1983.pdf
	1984UP20
	UP Act 14 of 1985.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 1986.pdf
	UP Act 18 of 1988.pdf
	UP Act 22 of 1989.pdf
	UP Act 3 of 1990.pdf
	UP Act 11 of 1990.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 1991.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 1991.pdf
	President Act 2 of 1993.pdf
	UP Act 6 of 1994.pdf
	UP Act 2 of 1995.pdf
	UP Act 5 of 1997.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 1999.pdf
	UP Act 10 of 2001.pdf

	2002UP17.pdf



