The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and Pension)
(Amendment) Act, 1981

Act 10 of 1981

Keyword(s):
Pension, Conveyance, Leader of Opposition, Facilities, Assembly, Speaker,
Chairman, Legislative Council, Allowance

Amendments appended: 13 of 1984, 21 of 1984, 28 of 1985, 13 of 1986, 22 of
1986, 21 of 1987, 17 of 1988, 15 of 1991, 13 of 1992, 16 of 1994, 4 of 1997, 27 of
1998, 30 of 1998, 25 of 2000, 27 of 2000, 10 of 2004, 21 of 2005, 7 of 2006, 11
of 2008

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




IAT WA FAAW THE, 14 7AW, 1981

34

TRET
]

R

THE UTTAR PRALESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLU-
MENTS AND PENSION) ( AMENDMENT) ACT, 1981

[U. P. Acr nNo. 10 or 1981]
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT

to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments and
Pension) Act, 1980.

1T 1S HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-second Year of the Republicﬂ of India
as follows:— :

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’
Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1981, :

2. In section 4  of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emolu-
ments and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act, for
the words “five hundred rupees”’, the words “one thousand rupees®” shall be
substituted.

3. In section 13 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) Every person who is entitled to a pension under Chapter VIII

shall also be entitled to a free non-transferable bus-pass and the provi-

d sions of sub-section (1) shall, mutatis mutandis, apply to every such
W person as they apply to a member.”

4. 1Insection 15 of the'principal Act, for the words “thirty rupees”, the
words “forty rupees” shall be substituted.

5. After section 21 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :—

“21-A (1) The Leader of Opposition shall, throughout the term of his
office, be provided with a suitable conveyance purchased
and maintained at public expense in accordance with
the rules made in that behalf.

Conveyance.

(2) The Leaders of Opposition shall be entitled to such other facili-
ties as may be prescribed by rules made in this behalf.”

6. The existing section 24 of the principal Act shall be renumbered as
sub-section (1) thereof, and gaffer sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the
following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :(— :

*(2) Every person who has, for the first time, become entitled to a
pension with effect from January 1, 1981 by virtue of—
(i) the Explanation to sub-section (1), or
~ (ii) his membership of the Assembly or Council as defined in
; clause (a) of section 23,

shall also be entitled to a pension, at the rate specified in the said
sub-section (1) for the period commencing from January 1, 1977 and
ending on December 31, 1980.”

By order,
G. B. SINGH,
Sachiy.

90T 07 0t 0-~q 00 38 (TATT) —-14~-4-8 1~~( 150)~~1981~-20,45 ‘(ﬁm) {

Short title,

Amendment of
section 4 of U. P.
Act 237of 1980.

Amendment of
section 13.

Amendment of
section 15.

Insertion of sec-
tion 21-A.

Amendmens of
section 24,




No. 943(2)/XVI-V—1-1(Ka)-T1-1984
Dated Lucknow, May 11, 1984 : . i

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Ar"tfc_[e 348 of the Constitution of India,
- the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the

o Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyaon Ki Upalabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan)

Adhiniyam, 1984 (Uttar Pradesh Adhipiyam Sankhya 13 of 1984), as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legiglature and assented to by thf.j Governor on April 29, 1984, : . _
'THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLUMENTS AND -
5 , . PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984 ' :
- (U-P. Act No. 13 of 1984)
: 5 5 (A5 passed by the Utrtar Pr&dégﬁ.ﬁeg:’&f_murq]
e e T e AN e R e
| _ ACT VR, R, T
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislgture (Member’'s Emoluments
. MR R sl and Pension) Act, 1980 .-
IT1s HER'EBY-cnac;ed in the Thirty-fifth year'of the Republic of India as follows -:

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Member’s  Short title.
Emoluments and P»:nsiqn) (Amendment) Act, 1984, - :

. 2. Insecction 4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Member’s Emoly- Amendment of
ments and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act. for the ffﬂﬁ“'? 4 of U.P,
- words ““one thousand rupees” the words “one  thousand two hundred and fifty {55, 23 of
rupees’’ shall be mbsrfmred. - _

Y

3. Insection 14 of the principal Act for clause (), the following clause shall se‘zt?:;‘dﬁe"t 2
be substjtuted namely — . g } )

. “(d) for journey for attendance in any meeting called by or under the

~authority of the Speaker of the Lok Sabha or the Chairman of the Rajya

Sabha or the Speaker of the Legislative Assembly or as the case may be

the Chairman of the Legislative Council of any other State or by the . .

Indian Institute -of Parliamentary Studies or organised otherwise in

connection with constitutional studics or any seminar or study course : - -




Bﬁtﬂa'!ﬂ wartvrmz lwt, 1 084

- Amendment of
section 15.

Amendment of
section 23,

- ‘Amendment of

. section 24.

Insertion of
section 24-A.

. . Amendment of
i section 25.

Amendment 6f '

‘ sectlon 26.

qoTa0q0q0~-T 0 fto 31 O (faam) (46 3)=~1984~—850 (&%0) |

21.

5.

7.

8.

Provided that siich member is nommated to a,tten” S
- Spedker as defificd ifi Clatis€ (n) of § Section 2 bt the €
“in clause (b) of the said section;

Provided further that ‘not more than two mEmEers hall ated
for atténdance in any such medtiig and no such nommaktfogcsll?:ljla{)e: v

“méde for more thaii twiee in 4 year.”
1it section 15 of the prmclpal Act;—

(a) f5i the words “forty rupées” the words sixty rubeég” sliélf
substitutedy

(b) afier clause (v), the followrng clauses shall be inserted, namely

“(v-a) the allowance shall also be payable to a member for his:
visits to Lucknow as Chairman of any committee in connection
with the work of such. committee, othier than the meeting of such
committee. in case no such allowance is -othefwise payable to, him

under any other - provision of this section provided that no such
allowance’ shall be pagable for mare than two visits in a calendar
month and for more than two days per such visit ;

i

(v-b) the allowance shall also be payable for -attendance in
any meetmg,semlnar or study course referred to-. 1n clduse - (d) of i

section 14;”
In section 23 of the prmcxpal Act Jor clause (a), the followmg clause

shall be substituted and be deemed always to have been substituted, namely:—

“(a) the expression ‘Assembly’ or - ‘Couneil’ - ‘shall include the

United Provinces -Legislative Assembly or the United Provinces
Legislative Council respectively :—

(i) which was constituted and functioned as such under the Gov-
ernment of India Act, 1935, either before or after the commencement
of the Indian Independence Act, 1947 ;

(ii) which functioned as a House of the provrsronal Legislature for

the State uhder the Constitution of Indid.”
In section 24 of the principal Act;—
(@) for the words “three hundred rupees” the words “ﬁve hundred

rupees’ shall be substmted and

(5).in tite prov:so feithe words “five huhdred rupees th”e word
“seven hundred and fifty 1upees” shall be substituted.

Afte; sectron 24 of the prmcxpal ‘Act, the following sectlon shall be
inserted, namely .

“24:A. Where 4 person becomes entltled to pension or addltlonal

Conditions , . of pension under this Act on the ground that
‘pensioh payable ~ * hé has served asa member of the Assembly
to certain persons. ~or Council,, constituted or in existence before

Januaryl 1946 such pension or addrtronal pension, as ‘the case may
be, shall be deemed to' be admissible to such person vnth effect from
Januaryl 1977

In section 25 of the principal Act,—
(a) in clause (a) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words
“‘seven hundred and fifty rupees™ shall be substituted ; ~

(b) in clause (8), for the words “five hundred - rupees” the words

“seven hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;and

(¢) in clause (c) for the ‘words “five frandred rupees” the words,

“seven hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted.

In section 26 of the principal Act; for the wo ¢
wherever occurring, the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees shall be

substltuted

s “five Hiufidred rupees

" By order,
. Sachiv..

¥
.

e
-

i+

il




- gectiom 16 of

No. 2043(2)/XVII-V-1—1(Ka)25-1984
Dated Lucknow, October 1, 1984 .

. I pursnance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
" the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the
Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension), (Dwitiya
Shansodhan) Adhiniyam, 1984 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 21 of 1984), as passed by
the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on Sgptember 30, 1984,

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLU-
" MENTS AND PENSION) (SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984

\ [U.P. Act no. 21 of 1984} |
{ds.fa.ssad by the Uttar Pradesh Legis fa}mg)

AN
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legis!dmre-(ﬁfembers" Emoluments
- - and Pension) Act, 1980 - :

AT 18 HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-fifth Year of 'the Republic of India as

: " follows :—. _ . | . §
© Short tide, - 1. 'This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State’ Legislature (Member’s - 3
: " Emoluments and Pension) (Second Amendment) Act, 1984. - b 8 2

. Ameadment of 2. In section 16 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’_ molu-

U P.Actno.23  ments.and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act,—
. - . (a) in sub-section (2)— S

(i). the words “referred to in sub-section (1)” shall be omitted;
. (ii) for. the words “at the prescribed rate” the words “at the rate
of three hundred rupees per mensem” shall be substituted;




N A "‘mmammm,l m,wu

(b) after sub-sectlon (2) and before the Explanatlon, the followmg
sub sectlon shall be mserted namely—-— : — ,

“(3) Where a- member is. provided with an a\ccommodatton the
T " standard rent whereof is less than three hundred rupeés per men-
* " sem,the difference thereof shallbe paid to such-member as compen- -
. .satory accommodation alLowance and where the standard rent of
- the accommodation so provided is more than the said- amount, the
o ‘,'dlﬁerence be chargeable from the’ member oo _

3, In ‘section” 17 of the prmmpal Act, in, sub-sectlon 1),—
(@)-in clause (¢) for the words “every such”; the word‘ “any” shail
-be- substituted; .. . o S AR ,
_(b) clause. (d) shall be omztted ~

7 4, Notw1thstandmg anything to the contrary contamed in any other law
- for ‘the time . being in force, the provisions of section 16 of the principal Act

-

Amendment of _ o

sectxon 17.

:\-"’

Transxtory
provlsxo ..

» asamended by this Act shall "also apply in‘relation_to the period from June 9 -
1980 to the commencement -of thlS Act, as 1f such provnslons were. in force at

'all materlal times.
' By ordor';

‘.. Sachiv.

i ‘76940 T

-

'B.L.LOOMBA, .




No. 1678(2)/XVIL-V-1—1(KA)36-1985
Dated Lucknow, September 17, 1985

In pursuance of the provisicns ¢f clause (3) cf Article 268 ¢! the Censtituticn of India,
the Geverrer is pleescd 1o order the publicaticn cf the fellewirg Erglich trapslaticn ¢f the
Utt ar Firdesh Rejyva Vidkan Mardal (Sadasycn Ki Upletdhiyen Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan)
Ad hirivem, 1$85 (Utier Fizdesh Adbiniyem Serkhva 28 cf 1985) as passed by the Ultar
Pr acdosh Legislature ard assenfed to by the Governcr on September 17, 1985,

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLU-
MENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1985

. : (U. P. AcTt No. 28 OF 1985)
lq?’foé " (As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legisluture)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members: Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980

[T 1s HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-sixth Year of the Republic of India
as followsz—- .

ghort titte and . Lo (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
sSmmenderrent. (Members” Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1985,
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on March 9, 1985,
Amendnent. of 3. In section 24 of the Utiar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’

section 24 of U.P. ~ Emeluments and Pension) Act, 1989, -

Ao 2N ok 1550 (a) in sub-section (1), the Eaplanaiion shall be re-numbered as
Explanation I and afrer the Expiapation 1 as so re-numbered the
following Explanation shull be jnserted, namely -

“Explanation L --Where a porson has served as 2 member of the
Assembly, constitutad in the yeer 1980, for o term which falls short
of five years by a period not exceedine three months, then such
persen shali, for the purpose of this section, be deemed to have
served as a member for five veus,”

() in sub-section (2), in clause (1) for ihe word “Explanation™ th,
word and figure “Explanation 17 k=il be substitntod. N

By order.
B. 1. LOOMBA,
Sochin

Tova3 oaro-—00 To v Wo (HF26) ~—~(1922}-1985--~850 (RF 0}

o

e e iy e A




L R L

No. 770 (2) /X VILV-1—1 (KA) -23-1986
Dated Lucknow, April 5, 1986

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Consti-
tution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
. following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal
- .|(Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1986
¢ {Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 15 of 1986) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh
. Legislature and assented to by the Governor on April 5, 1986.

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS' EMOLU-
MENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1936

[U. P. Acr no. 13 oF 1986]
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)

AN
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980

IT 15 HERERY enacted in the Thirty-Seventh Year of the Republic of India
as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be calied the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
KMembers’ Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1986.

(2) This Act shall be decmed to have come into force from April 1, 1986,

2. In section 2 of the Uutar Pradesh State Légis]ature {(Members’ Emolu-
ments and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act,
after clause (1), the following clause shall be inserted, namely—

“(ii) ‘member of family’ in rclation to a member of Assembly or
Council, whether or not he holds any office referred to in clause (i},
means his or her spouse, son, daughter, father, mother, brother or sister,
residing with and wholly dependent on such member ;”

%. In section 4 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand twao

hundred and fifty” the words “one thousand and six hundred” shall be subsii-
tuted. : .

4, For seciion b of

the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely— i

“5.  Subject to the provisions of this Act..every member of the Assembly

or the Council, whether or not he holds any office referred

Railway coupcas to in clause (i) of section 2, shall be provided, in the
manner prescribed, with railway coupons of such value, not exceeding
twenty-five thousand rupees, per annum as may be used by such member
for himself and for the members of his family for travel by any railway

in any class at any time within or outside Uttar Pradesh in accordance
with such principles as may be prescribed.

Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
section 2 of U.P.
Act, no. 23 of
1980

Amendment of
section 4

Substitution of
section 5




e R
1 e wz S O e, s ede, 1086
o Exptanstzon——'l‘he value of xaﬂway CDuPOl‘lS for ]oumeys by rmlway
~ réferred to in this section shall from time to time be determmed by the State
- _V:quersment in consultatlon thh the Rallway PBoard.” : K ;
Gmis?sis‘on"' of 5 Sectlon 6 of the prmcxpal Act shall be omztted
mn R o X 3
m‘ of 6 In section 7 of the prmcxpal Act the words m ﬁx'st class» shall be
; omztted , :
”2&1:& 80 " A 7. Section 8 of the prmmpai Act shall be omztted
m“ﬁmm of 8. For section 9 of the punmpal Act, the followmg section shaﬂ be substi-

tuted namely—

“9.. The raxlway coupons referred to in sectxon 5, may, in the manner
prescribed, be used by every member who holds any
Mo s kerb%tc office mentioned in clause (i) of section 2, for himself
,,pea "~ and members of his family for travel in any railway in
any class at any time within or outside Uttar Pradesh for

purposes otherwise than in dtscharge of official -duties.”

Omission  of 1
sections 11 and 12 9. Sect1ons 1 and 12 of the pr1nc1pal Act shall be omitted.

Insertonof new 10, In the prmupal Act, after Chapter VI, the foltowmg chapter shall be

Chapter VEA 1 certed. namely—

“Chapter VI-AL

_18-A: Every member of the Assembly or the Counc11 whether or not
he holds any. office mentioned in' clause. (i) “of section 2,.

Med acﬂltles - shall be entitled in accordance with such prmaples as-

may be prescribed,— )

(a) to receive a sum of rupees four hundred pex~ mensem in liea
of out-door medical treatment and facilities ~including medicines
provided in a hospital or dispensary established or: mamtamed by
the State Government ; :

(b). to get qccommodatlon and treatment in such hospital, free
of chdrge, for himself and members of bis family who may be:
required to be admitted in the hospital for medical treatment.”

Amendment of  11. In section 21 of the principal Act, for thé~words and ﬁgures 'sec-
section 21 ~ tions 5 and 6 the word and figure “section 5 sball be substituted.
, By order,
’ S. N. SAHAY.
Sachiv.

dtoua 0 o000 279 (frar0)——1986—-850 (| 0)

&

3
1

T




e by b

No. 1710 (2);XVII-V—I-1 (KA)-23-1986
Dated Lucknow, September 24, 1986

In pﬁrsuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of 'th
nglish translation of the

-the Governor i3 pleased (o order the publication of the following E
Uttar Pradesh Rajy2 Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Dwitiya
pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhy2a 02 of 1986), as passed by
geptemoe: 24, 1986

-gapnshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1986 (Uttar
the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governo: on
“THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS' - EMOLU-
! MENTS AND PENSION) (SECOND AMENDMENT) ACT, 1986
[U. P. AcT No. 22 oF 1986]
3 .
(As passed by the U. P. Legislature)

AN

ACT
r Pradesh State Legisiature (Members’
and Pension) Act, 1980
Thirty-seventh year of the Republic of India

e Constitation of India,

further to amend the Utla Emoluments

It s HER.E\BY enacted in the
Short title and

as follows : :
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar pradesh State Legislture (Memberse
Emoluments 2nd Pension) (Second - Amendment) Act, 1986. commencement

(2) It shall come into force at ohce except sections 2, 4,5 and 6 which shell

‘pe decmed Lo have come into foree with effect from April 1, 1986.
2. In the Uttar Predesh State Legislature {Members’ Emulumaﬁts and  Amendment of
JPension) Act, 1980, hereinafter refenied to as the principal Act, in section 15,— ﬁ:;iou 15 'f;{ UEE.
) ; no.
occurring 10 the beginning, the 1980

(@) for the words “Every member”
words “Every member, whether or not he holds apy office referred to
in clause (i) of section 2” shall be substituted, and _
(b) after clause (v-b), the following clemse sh?il be inserted, namelyi—
“(v-c) The said allowance shall, nmotwithetanding anything coR-
tained in the preceding cleuses, be payable in the casc of a member
holding any office referred to 11 clause (i) of section 2 for each day
during the whole of the term in which he holds such office 5

{¢) Clause (vi) shall be omtted.




|
?
|

E

»

T AW FUTEAT AT, 2 4 oL, 1986,

o

n . of -

. .; . . :
section 17-A

Amendment of
section 24

serte

Amendment of

section 25

~ Amendment of
section 26

Amendment of
section 28 -

3. - After section 17 cf the principal Act
d under a new Chapter V-A 5 namely —

, the following section shell be in-

“CHAPTER V-A
Provision of Loan to Members
17-A. The State Gov&nineht mey provide for grant of repeyeble-
Advance to members -~ advance of a sum not exceeding rupees one {akh to any-
person who is a member, whether or not he helds. any office referred
to in clause (i) of section 2, or who has held cffice as & member of the
Assembly or Courcil, sither for constructioh cr purchase of residential.
accommcdation or for purchase of a vehicle in accordance with such.

terms gnd conditions as may be prescribed.” -

4. In section 24 of the principsl Act,—
() for the wotds: “five hundred rupees” the words “seven hundred and-
fifty rupees” sh:ll be substituted ; ‘

(b) in the proviso, for the words “fifty rupees” the words “‘one hun.
dred rupees” and for the words “seven hundred and fifty ruvees” the
words “one thousznd five hundred ard fifty rupees” shell be substituted. .

5. In sectiop 25 of the principal Act,— '

(4) in clause (a), for the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees” the
words “one thousand five hundred anc fifty rupees” shall be substitutd;.

() in cleuse (b), for the words “seven hondred and fifty rupees™ the

- words “one thousand five hundred znd fifiy rupees” shall be substituted ;.

{¢) in clause {¢), for the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees” the..
wotds “one thousand five hundred énd fifty rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In section 26 of the principal Act, for the waids “seven hundred end

fifty rupees”, wherever cccurring, the werds “one theusard five hundred and

fifty rupees” shell be substituted. »

7. In scction 28 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1),the foucwihg«

sﬁb-sec'tion'shall be substituted and be deemed alweys to have beer substituted,.

pamely —.

(1) Where any Government dues (such as rent or charges for accom-
mcdation, telephone dues, etc.) are reported to be outstanding against
a member and eppropriate claims or bills in sypport thereof are received
from the concerned authority, ard such member fails to pay such dues,.
an amount equivelent to such dues, or where any repayable advance
hes been piovided by the Government to a member then an amoufnt
equivelent to such advance or any instalment thereof due from such
member, together with interest, if any, shall be deducted by the Secretary
from the salary crf travelling or deily or compensatory :ccommodétion .
or any other allowance bill of such member.

(1-A) In case of a persoR who has ceased to be 8 member or a person:
who is not a member at the time when ¢ny repayabie advance has been-
provided to him by the Government, the zmount referred to in sub--
section (1) may be deducted from the amount of pensiont or aly other

amount payatle to such person under this Act.” »

By order,
S. N. ' SAHAY
Sachi;f_.

ﬁdqao{oﬁo—-qoﬁo,_g'z aro( faaro)—( 165 5)41986——850 (8% 0) ¢




No. 1156(2)/XVII-V-1-1 (Ka)26-1987
Daged Lucknow, July 31, 1987
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar
Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Sanshodtan) Adhi-
niyam, 1987 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 21 of 1987) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legis-
lature and assented to by the Governor on July 31, 1987.
THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS' EMOLU-
MENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1987
[ U. P. Act No. 21 oF 1987 ]
(As passed by the Utter Pradesh Legislature)
' AN
: ACT
' further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments
and Pension) Act. 1980,
It 1S BERELY enzcted in the Thirty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as

follows :—
Short tils 1. This Act may b called the Uitar Pradesh State Legislature (Members®

i
Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1987.

P T .
e T T

4
=




s

as

s

“eighty-five rupees” shall be substituted. o section1S

four hundred” the words «rupees six hundred” shall be sub.mm:ed

2. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Leglslature (Members Emolu- - Amendment ~
m>ats and Peasion) Act, 1980, hereinafter ‘referred to as the principal Act, in sub- A‘;‘,;“g}‘zi ‘;ff‘,’g‘ls’é
sectlon (1), for the Words “five hundred rupees” the words “eight-hundred and : ‘

fifty rupees” shall be substituted,

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, for the wurds “One thousand and six Amendment o]
hundred rupees” the words “two thousand and six hundred rupees” shall be section4
substituted.

4. In seczion 5 of the principal Act,— Amendment of

, Isection 5
(a) for the words “twenty five thousand rupees” the words “thirty five
thousand rupees’ shall be substituted and be deemed to have been substi-
tuted with effect from June 1, 1986 ;

(b) the fo]lowmg pronSO to the section, so amended, shall be mserted
namely—— : :

‘ “Provxded that out of the rallway coupons to be supplled under thxs o
f‘,sectlon to a member, he shall at his option, be supplied, instead of

~“such value of rallway coupons as he may desire, coupons of equal
- value for travel by air at. any time thhm or outside Uttar Pradesh :
/ m accordance thb sixch‘ prxnclples as, may be prescnbed »

=8 In secnon 15 of the pnncxpal Act for the words “s1xty rupees”the words - Amendment “of

f,‘ 6 In sectxon 18-A of the pnn pﬂAq in clause (a), for the words rupees

0 Ta0 70 F0—T0 W0 103 @r0 (fFam0)——(1811)—1987—850 (&%0) !




No. 1943 (2) fXVII-V-l -1 (KA) 22-1988
Dated Lucknow, October 14, 1988

In pursuance of the pmwslans of glause () of Article 348 of the Consti-
tution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
ﬁollowmg English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal

adasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan "Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan Adhiniyam, 1988
{Ultar Pradcsh thtmf,ram Sankhya 17 of IEIBB} as passed by the’ Uttar Pradesh
Legislature and assented to by the Governor on October 14 1088,

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’
. EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1988

(U.P. Act No. 17 oF 1988)
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)

- AN
ACT

further .-:u amend the -Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980

IT 1s HEREBY enacted in the Th1rt;.-nmth Year of the Republic of Il_::dza
as follows : -1

Short title and - (I) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
commencement . {Members Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1988. :

() It shall be deemed to have come into force on June 1, 1988.

Amendment of . 2. In section 5 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature - (Members'
section 5 of U.P. Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980, for the words “thirty-five thousand

i"?“; no. 23 of . rugees" lﬂc words “th.ll't}" eight thousand five hundred ruPﬂes" shall be
itule :

i

By order,
; §. N. SAHAY,
B . Bachiv., 4

Te THe Ko &"ra—-u dfro 117@g (fauTo)—(1760)—-19838-=850 (AFe) 1



No. 439(2)/XVII-V—]-] (KA)-6-1991
Dated Lucknow, March 22, 1991
IN"pursuance of the provisions of clause {3)‘501‘ Article 348 of the Constitution of
India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation
of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan  Aur Pension. )

(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1991 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 15 of 1991) as passed
by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on March 19, 1991. :

R

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS
EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT)ACT, 1991

fU. P. Acr no. 15 oF 1991}
(A4s passed by the Uttar Prades), Lfgi.sfam}:'re}
AN
ACT

ﬁ:rr.&erl io amend the Uitqr Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments gnd
Pension) Act, 1980,

. IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Forty-second Year of the Republic of India
as; follows—

Shott title and I. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
PO e Bare! Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1991,

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force op January 7, 1991,

Amendment of 2. -Insection 25 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emo-
section 25 of U.P. juments and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act,
Act ng. 23 of 1990, after clause (¢) the following clause shall be inserted and be deemed always to

have been inserted, namely -

“(f) where any person oeéses to be a citizen of Indig ™
. Repeal’  end 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments ang
! saving { Pensfon) (Amendment) Ordinance, 1991, is hereby repealed.

(2} Notwithstanding such repeal, any thing done or any action taken
under the provisions of the principal Act as 8me nded by the Ordinance referred
to in sub-section ( 1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of the priocipal Act, as amended by this Act, as
if the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.

By order,
NARAYAN DAS,
™ Sachiv.

Rogmonodto-—goto 354 ury (fearo)——(3726)~~1991--55 (R=0)

!

Ui Pl
Qrdirance
no, 1 of

1491,



N, 913 (2) XVII—V-1-1(KA)21-1992
Lucknow Dated April 13, 1992

- IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Asiicle 348 of the Constitution of
Iadia, theGavernor is pieased t~ order the publication of the following English translation of
the Uttar Pradesh RajyaVidhan Mandal (Sadasyonki Uplabdhiyan Avr Pension)(Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 1992 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 13 of 1992) as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on April 11, 1992,

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS'
EMOLUMENTS AND PENSIDN}_ (AMI:‘.N!]MENT} ACT, 1992

_ (U. P. AcT Ne. 13 oF 1992)
(As passed by the U.P, Legislature)
o 4 AN
- ACT :
~ further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members
- Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980,

IT 1s HEREBY epacted in the Forty-third Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

R 1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
(Members’ Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1992,

Amendement of 2. In sectien 5 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’

sestion 5 of U.P. Kmeluments and Pension) Act, 1980, for the words “thirty eight

fos0""" 2 ° thousand five humdred rupees per annum” the words “forty five thousand
rupees per arrum for the period from June 1, 1991 to August 15, 1991
and not exceeding fifiy-four thousand rupees per annum from August 16,
1991 shall be substituted, ’ -

' By order,

_ N. R. NARANG,

L EE: ‘ Sachiv.

-

TO0TEOTOo O qQoflyie aro (fauto)— (i74)--1992- 350 (¥=F0) 4




No. 814(2) [XVILV-1—1(RA)24-1994 b
Dated Incknow, May 2, 1994
Ir pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of thed
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication §.
of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhany.
Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan) Adhini-§:
yam, 1994 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 16 of 1994) as passed{
by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor ony
April 30, 1994. o ‘ . §ok |
THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLU-§
MENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1994
(U. P. Acr No. 16 oF 1994) |
[As passed by the U. P. Legislature]
| AN
ACT

fuither to amend the Uttar Pradesh State legislature (Members
Emotuments and Pension) Act, 1980. i

i
IT 1s HEREBY enacted in the forty-fifth Year of the Republie of Indis;
as follows :(— |

o titte 1+ This act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State L&gislatul‘ef
(Members” Emoiuments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1994. i

j



'rs’i

lia

ure

IFL YT FTGIT A5, 2 7S, 1994

In section 5 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’
guments and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the
cipal Act, for the words and figures “not exceeding forty-five
gsand rupees per annum for the pericd from June 1, 1991 to
geust 15, 1991 and not exceeding fifty-four thousand rupees per
qum from August 16, 1991” the words “not exceeding sixty-five

susand rupees per annum’ shall be substituted.

8. Section 15 of the principal Act, shall be re-numbered as sub-
gtion (1) thereof and—

(a) in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered,—

(i) for the words “eighty-five rupees” the words “one
hundred fifty rupees” shall be substifuted ;

(i) clause (V-bb) and clause (V-¢) shall be omitted ;

(b) after sub-section (1) the following sub-sections shall be
inserted, namely—

“(2) Every member shall be entitled to daily allowance at
the rate of one hundred rupees per day for the days during
which he tours for the works in the service of the public
and for which the allowance or incidental charges under
sub-section (1) are not, or may not be, admissible.

- (3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sec-

tion (1), daily allowance at the rate of one hundred rupees
per day shall be payable to a member holding ' any office
referred to in clause (i) of section 2 and the Leader of
Opposition for each day during the whole of the term in
which he holds such office, except such days for which he
claims daily allowance under sub-section (1).”

4. In section 24 of the principal Act, in Jsub-section ), in the
planation-II for the words and figures “in the year 1980” the words

, d figures “in the year 1980 or in the year 1985” shall be substituted.

By order,
N. K. NARANG, »
: B TwE T 3 - Sachiv. E
RIS ) : : g
Rogregodin - 42 Mo 41 Tro fIEr0 -3 0% ragie5 e (FRO)

%

Amendment  of
secticn 5 of U.P,
Act no. 23 of 1980

Amnendment
section 15

Amendment of
section 24



I SR TR T, 20, 1997 L 3

No. 470 (2/XVIL-V-1—1(K4) 5/1997
. " Dated Lucknow, May 2, 197~
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya
Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 1997 (Uttar Pradesh
Adhiniyam Sankhya 4 of 1997) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor
. on May 1,-1997 : ‘ e : : ‘
THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLUMENTS -
: AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1997 :
[U. P: ACT: NO: 4 OF 1997] )
" (As passed by the U: P. Legislature).
, - ACT = - s o
Sfurther to amend the Uttar Pradesh Stqte'Legislarure (Members® Emoluments

and Pension) Act, 1980 ; o o S ‘
. 1T1S HEREBY enacted in the Forty-eighth Year-of the Republic of India
- as follows:~ , T A
1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Leﬁgi_slalure:(jl\/!cmbers’ Short title
Emoluments and Pension) (Amen_dmem) Act, 1997. ' ; o ‘
. 2. Insection4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Meianxjs’ Emoluments Am?“d‘ze“; of
and Pension) Act, 1980, here in after referred to as the principal Act, for the words “two ?ﬁf’w‘: ot ;’0_ 2
thousand and six hundred rupees” the words “three thousand mpees” shall be of 1980
substifuted. ‘ R ‘ .

3. In section 5 of the principal Act— I o ©Amendmentof
. section 5 :

(a) for the words “not exceeding sixty~ﬁve thousand rupees per annum” the
words “not exceeding eighty-five thousand rupees per annum from June 1,
1997" shall be substituted;

(b) after-the exiting proviso the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—
“Provided further that whenever there is an increase in the railway fare of

first class, the State Government may by a notified order make & proportional
increase in the valuc of railway coupons.”

4. In section 15 of the principal Act,— : o Amendment of
) section 1S

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words “one hundred fifty rudecs” the words
“two hundred rupees” shall be substituted ; '

(b) in sub-sections (2) and (3) for the words “one hundred rupees”™ the words
“onic hundred and twenty five rupees” shall be substituted.

5. After Chapter 4 of the principal Act, the following Chapter shall be Insertion of new
inserted, namely:— chapter 4-A

Sé “CHAPTER [V—A
ECRETARIAL ALLOWANCE

15—A. Every member of the assembly or the council, whether or not
Secretarial he holds any of the office referred to in clause (1) of
allowance  gection 2 including the leader of opposition shall be

entitled to receive for the duration of his membership or, as “he case may be,’
during the whole of the term in which he holds such office, secretarial
allowance at the rate of two hundred rupees per month.”




4 o wnﬁsrmmmn'{ 1997

Aln?ndfrleﬂi of 6. In section 17-A of the pnncxpal Act for the words “not exceedmg rupees
section 17-A one lakh” the ‘words “not exceedmg rupees two lakh” shall be substituted. : ‘-
Substitution of 7. For section 24 of the pnncnpal “Act, the followmg secuon sh'ﬂl be-‘ ‘

Section 24 subsmuted namelv ——

“24., Every person who has served asa member of the Asscmbly or .
Pension - the Council for any period shall be entided to a pensnon at the
to  ex-  rate of one thousand two hundred and ﬁfty rupees per moum
wember throughout his tife:

Provided that where any person has aerved as atoresaxd for penod
exceeding one year, he shall be entitled to an additional pension at the
rate of one hundred rupees per month for every (.omplt.u.d year inexcess

L of one year.”
Amendment of 8. In sectipn 25 of the principal Act,— :
section 25  (a) for clause (a), the following clause shall be substztuted namely:—

“(a) where a person is entitled to any pension under the provxsaons of the -
Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of ‘Parliament Act, 1954
and such pension is equal to or cxceeds the amout of pension admxsetble
under section 24" . : “ )
(b) in clauses (b) and (c), for the words “two thousand and fifty rupees”, the
words “the’ amount of pension admnssnble under section 24” shall be -
substituted. : : '

SA“ec‘i‘?gdmzeé“ of 9. In section 26 of the principal Act, for the’ words “mo thousand and fifty -

’ 101 . .

: rupees”, wherever occutmg, the words “the amount of pension admissible under section
24” shall be substituted. S

" By order,

R.D. MATHUR,
Pramukh Sachiv.

o @o o Fo—o dlo 25 o RruIT—(247)—1997—850—(FqEy/aHie) |




No. 1412(2)/XVII-y-1—1 (KA) 10-1998
Dated Lucknow, July 27, 1998

_In pursuance of the provisions of clayse (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of
India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English
translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal (Sadsyon Ki Upalabdhiyan Aur
Pension! (Sanshodhany Adhiniyam, 1998 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Srnkhya 27 of 199g)
?3111’;;56;19 hg_v the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assenied to by the Governor on
uly z2, 1998,

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’
EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 199§

(U. P. Act No. 27 of 1998
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT

Jurther 10 amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislagure (Members® Emoly-
ments and Pension) Act, 1980,

IT 1S HEREBY enacted in the Forty-ninth Yeat of the Republic of India
as follows 3 —

Short title l. This Act may bs called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
(Members® Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Aect, 1998.
Amendment of 2. In section § of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members'

f@f“’nl.,s “53”'55- Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1920, for the words and figures “not excec-

1980 ding eigh'y-five thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 1977,", the
words aad figures “not exceeding forty-five thousand rupe€s per aonum
for the period from June 1, 1990 to August 15, 1991, not exceeding
tfty-four thounsand rupees per amnum for the period from August 16,
1991 10 May 1, 1994, not exceeding sixty-five thousand rupees peraonum
for the period from May 2, 1994 to May 31, 1997 and not exceeding
eighty-five thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 1997"* shall be
sybstituted,

By grder,
YOGENDRA RAM TRIPATHI,
Pramukh Sachiv.

0 wa 1o o-=qo o 82 7T famo—-(846) ~-1998--=850 (dg0) t




4

I Ye9T STATHNT e, 26 Ra=t, 1998

(Uttar Pradesh Adbiniyam Sankhya 30 of 1998) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to

by the govemor on 25 September, 1998.

Short titie

Ameundment of

section 3 of the
U.P. Act No. 23
of 1980

Amendment of
section

Amendment of
section §

Ainendment of
section 13

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND
OFFICERS AND MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS
' (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1998

[U.P. ACT NO. 30 OF 1998]
(As Passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
‘ACT 7
further 10 amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and

Allowances) Act, 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (salaries, allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.

IT IS HIEREBY enacted in the Forty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

PART I

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature members and
Officers and Ministers Amenitics Laws (Amendment) Act, 1998.

PART I

AMENDMENT OFF THE UTTAR PRADESIH STATE LEGISLLATURE (MEMBERS’
EMOLUMIENTS AND PENSION) ACT, 1980

2. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State T.egislature (Members’ Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred toin this part as the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words “eight hundred and fifty rupees”, the words, “two thousand
rupees” shall be substitured. :

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, for the words “three thousand rupees”, the
words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Scction 5 of the principal Act shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1)
thereof and,—

(&) in sub-scction (1) as so renumbered. for the words “not excecding cighty-
five thousand rupecs per anium from June 1, 1997, the words and ligures
“pot exceeding cighty-five thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 1997 and
not exceeding cighty-cight thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 1998,
shall be substituted ;

(b) after sub-scction (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namefy:—

“(2) subject to the other provisions of this Act, every ex-member shall
be provided. in the manner prescribed, with lzulway coupons of such value
nol exceeding ten thousand rupecs per annum as may be used by such
ex-member for himself and for the members of his family and the
provisions of sub-scetion (1) shall smutatis mutandis apply to the railway
coupons supplied under this sub-section.”

S. In section 13 of the principal Act, in sub-scction (4) after the words and
figure “sub-section (1), the words and figure “and sub-section (2)” shall be inseried.

g -

W

t

St
I



d

T 29T AR T, 26 A<y, 1998

6. in section 15 of the principal Act,—

ca) in sub-section (1) for the words “two hundred rupees” the words “two
hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted,
(b) in sub-scctions (2} anst (3), for the words, “one hundred and tweaty-
; five rupees” the words, “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
7. Tn séction 15-A of the principal Act, for the words “two hundred rupees” the
words “one thousand rupecs” shall be substituted.
“

8. In section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (a) for the words, “six

hundred rupees” the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
9. Secction 24 of the principal Act shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1)
thereof, and,— :
| (a) in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered,—
(i) for thc words “one thousand two hundred and fifty rupecs” the
words “one thousand five hundred rupecs” shall be substituted,
(i) in the proviso for the .words “onc hundred rupecs™ the words “two
hundred rupees” shall be substituted,
(b) after sub-scction (1) the lbllowing sub-section shall be inserred,
namely :(—
“(2) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is
also entitled to any other pension such person shall be entitled to receive
the pension under sub-section (1) in addition to such pension.”

10. In section 25 of the principal Act. clauses (a) and (c) shall be omitted.

11. In section 26 of the principal Act, for the words “clause (a) or clause (b) or
clause (¢)”, the words “clause (b)” shafl be substituted.

PART Il
Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers
Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952

12. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1952, herein after referred to in this part as the principal Act, in sub-
section (1) for.the words “rupees one thousand™ the words “two thousand and five
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

13. In section 4 of the Principal Act,—

(él) in sub-section (1), the tds “and also at such other place in Uttar
Pradesh and for such period as may be prescribed by rules to be made by the
State Goverminent in this behalf” shall be omitted,

(b) alter sixb-scc(ion (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, and be
deemed to have been inserted on March 27, 1997 namely,—

“(3) The Speaker and the Chairman shall each be entitled to receive
two thousand and five hundred rupees per month for the maintenance of
his private residencc at his home district with effect {rom the date of his
election as such Speaker or the Chainnan, as the case may be :

Amendment of
section 15

Amendmeat of
section 15-A

Amendment of
Secticn 18-A

Amendment of
section 24

Amendment of
section 25
Amendment of
seclion 26

Amendment of
section 2 of the
U.P. Act No. 11
of 1952

Amendment of
section 4



6 I TG AR 192, 26 Rya=y, 1998

PART-1V

Amendraent of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.

Amendment of 14. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Section 3 of Misceliancous Provisions) Act, 1981,— :

U.P. Act No. 14

of 1981

{a) in sub-section (1) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “two
thouizand and five hundred rupees” sball be substituted,

(b} in sub-section (2) for the words “ninc hundred rupecs” the words “two
thousand two hundred and twenty five rupees” shall be substituted.

=

By order,
Y. R. TRIPATHI,

‘ s Pramukh Sachiv.

Hta Qo Fo oo o 124 R —(1277)—1998—850—FqT HHIT |




. No. 1365 (QJXVII-V-1—I (KA) 21-2000
Dated, Lucknow, May 24, 2000 .

: IN pursnam of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Gan_atitutian' 0
India, the Qovernor 18 pleased to order the publication of the following Englisigs
translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Maadal (Sadasyon Kii Uplabdhiyan Auf
Peasion) (Sanshodian) Adhiniyam, 2000 (Uttar Pradesh Ad hiniyam Sankhya 25 of 2000) asie

" passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legisiature and assented to by the Governor on Muy 22, 2000 8 —

| THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS' % '

Y “EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) AGT, 2000

' | ~ {U. P. AcT No. 25 o 2000]

(4s passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature) '

' - An o
_ ACT .
_ further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Membersg
. Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980. | . ;3
IT 1S RBRReRy enacted in the Fifty-first Year of the Republic of India a

- follows:— - :
' 1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legistaturel

(Members® Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 2000. 8

Stort title
Amsenfetnt of 9. Insection 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Membors'§8
section 2of UP.  pocluments and Pension) Act, 1980, nbereinafter referred fo as CIegg

ﬁ{] s e .ﬂ- principal Act, in clause (g) for the words “first class®’, the words “air-g arf
. conditioned two-tier” shall be substituted. . & ut
. Ameéndment of 3. In sectioa 5 of the principal Act, in sub-section 1), in'mcgcapnf.-_ '_.l r
- section. 5 proviso, for the words ‘“irst class”, the words sair-conditioned two-tier " g
o shall be substjtuted. ' -
Ameodment of < 4. Insection17-A of the principal Act, the following proviso shall be S,
el 19-A. . inserted, namely:— i

sprovided that if the advance granted to any such member for onﬂ'__

purpose and the interest due thereon has been repaid, the member may
T granted advance for the other purpose.” E e g
‘ | gyordet, 1
y. R. TRIPATHI S
pramukh Sachiv.

- fogw ﬂiih\'.ﬂ'H"ﬂn 60 A0 fauro —-(Eaﬂ}—%zﬂﬂﬁ"-ss‘ﬂ._{'l'il‘f_g)t




g —

No. 1367 (2)/XVI}-V-1—-1 (KA)-22-2000 | ‘ :
Dated Lucknow, May 24, 2008° o

IN pursuanoe of the provisions of clause (3) of Articls 348 of the Constitution of -
India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following Boglish '~
translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandal (Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur
Pension) (Dwitiya Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2000 (Uttar Pradesh Adhinlyam Sankhya 27 of

2000) as passed dy the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assonted to by the Governor on
May 22, 2000,

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE &MEMBER&‘
EMOLUMENTS AND PEN?ION, (SECOND AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2000

[U. P, Act No. 27 oF 2000)
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT

further 10 amend the Uttar Pradesh Siate Legistature ( Members®
Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980.

IT 1S HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-first Year of the Republic of India as

follows: —
shert title and 1, (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State | egislature
comm ercement (members” Emoluments and Pension) (Sccond Amendment) Act, 2CCO.
PR (2) It shall come into force on June 1, 20CO.
Amendment of 9. In section 5 of the yttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’
section 3 “{E}‘f’- Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980, in sub.section (1), for the first proviso,
":';alﬂ e of  the following proyiso shall be substifuted, namely :—

=%

«Provided that out of the railway coupons to be supplied under
, this section to &8 member, he shall at his option,—

(a) be supplied coupons of equal value for travel; by air at any
time within or outside Uttar Pradesh; and 5%

(b) be paid an amoung in cash not exceeding three thousand
rupees per month for petrol or diesel for his own vehicle;

instead of such valne of railway coupons as he may desire, in such
maaner as may be presaribed.”
' By order,
Y. R. TRIPATH
Promukh Sachki?-

W ogeEoq ofto—rcoNo 61 Fro fwro —{660}--2000—850 (R¥ o) |




4 TAL TR AT e, 27 WEd, 2004

No. 390 (2)/VUI-V-1—1(KA) 10-2004
Dated Lucknow, February 27, 2004

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of Ji
Governor is picased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Utiar Prades
Vidhan Manda! Sadasya Auvr Adhikari Tatha Maniri Sukh Suvidha Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhis Myar
(Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 10 of 2004) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislatare and ass
by the Governor on February 26, 2004.

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND OFFi(
AND MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2004

(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN
ACT

Sfurther 10 amend the Untar Pradesh State Legislature (Members® Emolum
Pension) Act, 1980 the Untar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and Allo
Act, 1952 and the Untar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscel
Provisions) Act, 1981. ‘

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-fifth Year of the Republic of
follows :—

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature Memb
commencement  (yfficers and Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2004,

(2) It shall come into force with effect from April 1, 2004.
CHAPTER Il

AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR éRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE
(MEMBERS’ EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) ACT, 1980

Amendment of 2. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislatore (Members® Emo’
) mt3 of 2 and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to in this chapter as the principal
of 1980 ™ sub-section (1) for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “three thousand

shall be substituted.

" Amendment of 3. In section 4 of the principal Act, Jor the words “five thousand rupx
section 4 words “seven thousand five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
Amendment of 4. In section 5 of the principal Act,—
section 5 . _ ,

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words and figures “and not ex
eighty-eight thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 1998” the we
figures “not exceeding eighty-eight thousand rupees per annur
June 1, 1998 and not exceeding one lakh twenty thousand rupees pe
from April 1, 2004";

(b) in sub-secion (2),—

(i) for the words “ten thousand rupees” the words “twenty
rupees” shall be substituted,

{ii) in the first proviso, in clause (D) for the words “three
rupees” the words “five thousand rupees”™ shall be substituted.




- I RY FEURY T, 27 GEH, 2004

f}a’:”
the words “two members” the words “five members” shall be substituted.

6. In section 15 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-secion (1) for the words “two hundred fifty rupees” the words
“three hundred rupees™ shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (2) for the words “two bundred rupees” the words “two
hundred fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(c) in sub-section (3) for the words “two hundred rupees” the words “two
hundred fifty rupees” shall be substituted.

7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”
the words “two thousand five hundred rupees” shall be substiruted.

8. In section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (a) for the words “one
thousand rupees” the words “two thousand rupees”™ shall be substituted.

9, In section 24 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”
the words “two thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the proviso for the words “two hundred rupees” the words “two
hundred fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(c) after the first proviso the following proviso shall be inserred,
namely:—

“Provided further that in the event of dissolution of Assembly, the period
from the date of dissolution of Assembly, till the date of first meeting of the
new Assembly, shall be counted for pension purposes of a member who has

been the spcaker of the dissolved Assembly and has continued to be in office as
such during the said period . ‘

(d) after the aforesaid proviso the following Explanation shall be
inserted, namely.— '

“Explanation——Where a person have served as a member of the
Assembly or the Council for a term of six months and above and have not
completed one year then such person shall for the purposes of calculating the
pension, be deemed to have served as a member for one year™.

CHAPTER HI

AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (OFFICERS SALARIES
AND ALLOWANCES) ACT, 1952

10. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1952, hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as the principal Act, in
sub-section (1) for the words “two thousand and five hundred rupees™ the words “five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

11. In section 4 of the principal Act in sub-section (3) for the words “two
thousand and five hundred rupees” the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted:

5. In section 14 of the principal Act, in clause (d), in the second proviso for

Amendment of
section 14

Amendment of
section 15

Amendment of
section 15-A

Amendment of
section 18-A

Amendment of
section 24

Amendment of

section 2 of the
U.P. Act no. 11
of 1952

Amendment of
section 4



SRR Ay 21, W 2004
o CHAP’I‘ERIV o

: 3 , AMENDMENTOF THE UTI‘AR PRADESH MINISTERS ( SAI.ARIES AL[DWANCES AND
i ' NIISCELLANFL)US PROVISIONS) ACT, 1981

12, In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers ( Salanes Allowances and Amendment of

section 3 of U.P.
Miscellaneous Provxsxons) Act, 1981,— Act no. 14 of
‘ . 1981

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words “two thousand and five hundred
rupees” the words “five thousand rupees™ shall be substituted -

(b) in sub-section (2) for the words “two thousand two hundred and
twenty-five rupees™ the words “four thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBIECT S AND REASONS

; ~In vxew of - pncc ise axid inc:ease of mpons‘bihues it has been considered cxpedxem in public
interest {0 revise, the' pay allowﬁnoes, railway coupons and other amenities. admnssnble to the members,
. officers and Ministers of the State Legislature and to increase the pension and railway coupons admissible

’ t0 ex-members. It has tbemfore, been decided to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Leglslamre (Members’
; VBmolumenw and Pension) Act, 1980 and Uttar Pradesh State Leg:slaume (Officers Salaries and Allowances)
‘. § . - Act, 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981
o torewse!heSalmesandalhwmwesandotheranmuesofthemembersandofﬁcerszmdeistexsofthe

'Smeegislamre

i

“ S PramukhSachtv

fogaogodio—godic 975 TR M;(2354)+2004—597;—va)'

Q‘%ioﬁo__goﬂ; 259 Wio Rrll-—(2355)—2004—850—(Fgex/ATHae) |



No. 1031/VII-V-1-1(KA) 26-2005

- - Dated Lucknow, August 11, 2005 _

o I:Hpm'suanceufihemmmﬂ:hmﬁ)ofmkmofmecmmufm&e
i ;GwmmphMWuderﬁewhhmﬂmufﬁcfuﬂngnghmmmdmmmw -
Vidhan Mandal Sadasya Aur Adhikari Sukh Suvidha Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2005 (Uttar Pradesh *
AdhmyamSnnl:hyaZl of2005)upaswdbyﬂ1eummmhnmmdmledtobyﬂm
GovmonAugusth 2005.

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEG]SLATURE MEMBERS AND E)FFICERS
: AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2005 '

~ (U.P. ACTNo. 21 OF 2005) -
- [As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature] ~ = o=
ACT
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members Emoluments

and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and
A.Hownce.r} Act, 1952,

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :-
CHAPTER-I
PRELIMINARY

. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Legislature Members and Short title
_ Officers Amenities Laws (Amendment} Act, 2005.




' Amendment of
section15 .

. Amendmentof

section 15-A

Amendmmt of
section 18-A

Amendment of
sedtion 24

ITR WA SR e, 11 AT, 2005
. - CHAPTER-II
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE - ,,,\
" (MEMBERS’ EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) ACT. , 1980 ’
General - 2. In the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments and
Amendment in Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to in this chapter as the principal Act, for the
UP Actno. 230f yord ““Secretary’’ wherever occurring including definitions the words “Pnncnpa]
1980
Secretary’” shall be substituted.
'Amendment of 3. In section 4 of the principal Act, for the words ‘‘seven thousand five
section 4 hundred rupees’” the words ““fifteen thousand rupees’” shall be substituted.
Amendment of 4. In section 5 of the principal Act,~
section 5 ) :
~ (a) in sub-section (1) for the words and figures ‘‘and not exceeding one
lakh twenty thousand rupees per annum from April 1, 2004’ the words and
figures *‘and not exceeding one lakh twenty thousand rupees per annum from
April 1, 2004 and not exceeding one lakh fifty thousand rupees per annum
from June 1, 2005’ shall be substituted. :
- (b) in sub-section (2) for the words ‘‘twenty thousand rupees’ the
words ““thirty thousand rupees’” shall be substituted. :
. Amendment of 5. For sectlon 13 of the prmcxpal Act the followmg section shall be
section 13 - substituted, namely:—

““13«(1) Every member, when he travels within Uttar Pradesh by the

Uttar Pradesh State Road Transport Corporation Bus including air condition

- or deluxe bus and submits ticket thereof the armount of such ticket shall be

‘paid to him by the Principal Secretary. A 4 .

(2) The facility referred to in sub-section (1) may also be avaaled by a
member for taking one omnpamon with him in the bus. :

(3) Every person. who is entitled to a pension under Chapter VIII shall
be enptled. in the manner prescribed with a free non-transferable pass’ to-
travel ‘at any time within Uttar Pradesh by the Uttar Pradesh State Road -
Transport Corporation Bus without payment of the passenger tax due under

_ any law for the time being in force. -
_ (4) The pass referred to in sub-section (3) may also be used by such
person for taking one compamon alongwnth him in the bus:

Provided that if a person referred to in sub-section (3) travels in an
air-condltlon bus or.a deluxe bus he shall have to bear himself the excess amount of
fare difference.

- 6.In section 15 of the pnncxpal Act, in sub-sectxon [6)) far the words ““three
hundred rupees’” the words *‘five hundred rupees’’ shall be substituted.

7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words “two thousand five
hundred rupees’ the words *‘six thousand rupees’” shall-be substituted. . '

‘8. In section 18-A of the" principal Act, in clause (a) for the words
“‘two thousand rupees’’ the words *‘six thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

9. In section 24 of the principal Act,—

{(a) in sub-section (1) for the words “‘two thousand rupees’’ the words
“‘three thousand rupees’’ shall bc substituted ;

(b) in the proviso for the words ““two hundred fifty rupces™ the words
“‘three hundred rupees’”-shall be substituted.



TR FE IR THE, 11 AR, 2005

10. In section 28 of the principal Act, m sub-section (l-A), the following
proviso shall be inserted at the end, namely:—

“Provided that if any other Government dues are reported to be
outstanding against such person, whether it is for the period of his
membership or for the period he is ceased to be a member shall also be
deducted from the pension of such person.”

CHAPTER-HI .
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE
(OFFICERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) ACT, 1952

11. In section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1952, in sub-section (3) for the words ‘‘five thousand rupees’’ the
words ‘‘ten thousand rupees’” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Amendmentof
section 28

Amendment of
section 4 of the - -
UP. Actno. 11
of 1952

~ In view of pnce rise and increase of responsibilities, it has been consxdered expedlent in public.

interest to revise, the allowances, raxlway coupons and other amenities admnssible to the members, and the =

officers of the State Legislature and to increase the pension and railway coupons admissible to

ex-members. It has therefore, been declded to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Leglslatune (Members -

Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh State Legtslature (Ofﬁcers Salan&s and
‘Allowances) Act, 1952 to revise the allowances and other amenities ‘of the membets,and;oﬂieers of the -

State Legislature.

* The Uttar Pradesh State Leglslature Members and Officers Amenmw Laws (Amendment) Blll, :

2005 is introduced aooordmgly

. Byorder,
- D.V.SHARMA,

flotHogodlo—ToMo 361 IATTH(765)- 2005-597-FYER / ITHIE |
RorHogoflo-ToRo 75 Hio RAERA—(766)- 2005-850-FFYER / ITHHT |



No. 267/VIL-V-1-1(ka)-7-2006
Dated Lucknow, March 17, 2006

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS’ EMOLUMENTS
AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2006

(U.P. Actno. 7 of 2006) o
[A4s passed by the Ugtar Pradesh Legisiature]
AN
ACT
Surther to amend the Ustay Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments
and pension ) Acy, 1980,

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as
follows ;-

Short title L. This Act may be called the Ultar Pradesh State Legislature (Members®
Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) A~ 2nar




t
R R

JOX Y SRR TS, 17 HId, 2006 3

2. In section S of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments Amendment of

and Pension) Act, 1980 hereinafter referred to as the principal Act,— section 5 of U.P.
d s Actno. 23 of 1980

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (b) for the words ‘‘five thousand
rupees’’ the words *‘eight thousand rupees’’ shall be substituted.

(b) after the second proviso the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—

“Provided also that out of the railway coupons to be supplied unde:
sub-section (2) to an ex-member, he shall at his option be supplied coupons of equal
value for travel by air at any time.”’

3. In section 18 of the principal Act for the words ‘‘as may be prescribed’’ the  Amendment of
words *‘and mobile phone as may be prescribed’” shall be substituted. section 18

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The leaders of the parties have in their meeting held on August 8, 2005 decided to increase the
limit from five thousand rupees to eight thousand rupees of the amount which a2 member may on his
option be paid in cash per month for petrol and diesel for his o;vnA vehicle out of the railway coupons
supplied to him and to allow an ex-member to get coupons for travel_ by air out of the railway 'c'oupons
supplied to him . The State Government is of the opinion that the 1me‘mbers may be given mobile phone
facility besides the telephone facility provided to them as it is essential in the modem society. It has, .
therefore, been decided to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Emoluments and
Pensxon) Act, 1980 to implement the decision of the leaders of the Parties and to give mobile phone
facility to the members. B ‘

The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Mémbers’ Emoluments ‘and Pension) (Amendment)
Bill, 2006 is introduced accordingly. -

- l}y order, :
RAM HARI VIJAY TRIPATHI,
Pramukh Sachiv. -

Fogwogpdio—ToNo 2296 AT (R o)—(3395)—2006—597 (HFIEX / IEAE) |

[ NN, U,



No. 5202)/LXXIX-V-1-08-1{Ka)11-2008
Dated Lucknow, March 14, 2008

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitutior of India, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan Mandsl
(Sadasyon Ki Uplabdhiyan Aur Pension) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya
11 0f2008) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on Marcn 14, 2008.

1

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE {(MEMBERS' EMOLIUIMENTS
AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2008
' (U.P. ACTNO. 11 OF 2008)
{As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]  «
AN
-ACT
Sfirther to gmend the Uttar Pradesh State Legisimure (Mentbers® Emoiuments and
Pension} Act, 1980, '

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows

Short titlc and " 1.(I) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’
comincnecoment -
Emolumeats and Pension} {Amendment) Act, 2008.

{2) 1t shall be deemed 1o have come into force on June [, 2008.

Amerdment - of 2. In the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and
section § of LLP. :

Actno.23ar 1980  Pension) Act, 1980, in section 5, in sub section (1) for the words and figures “and not
exceeding one lakh fifty thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 2005" the words and
figures “and not exceeding one lakh [ifty thousand ‘rupees per annum from June I,
2005 and not exceeding two lakh rupees per annum from June 1, 2008 shall be
substituted. ’ ‘

1187 RPH Sa Vidhai Data 2




STATEMENT OF OBJECT ANDREASONS ..~ " _ .7, .

The members of the State Legislature arc entitled to get railway coupons not exceeding one lakh
fifty thousand tupees per annum for rait travel. In view of the cousistent demand of e Siate Legislators it
- has been considered expedient in public interest to increase the annual limit of railway coupons. It has
therefore been decided 10 amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members® Emolumcnts and Pension)

Act, 1980 for the said purpose :
. The Uttar Pradesh State Legu.latu.re (Membcrs Emoluments a.nd Pensmn) (Amendmenr) Blll,' '
2008 is introduced accordingly. =

By order,
S.M.A. ABIDI,
Pramukh Sachiv.

Glo qHo Yo Fo—To o 1187 wm—-(zsza)—zona—égr nfoi—(e ey / JmeHc) |
flogHogotdlo—Todlo 450 o fAemfi—(2629)-2008—850 WRAYTT (FrgeR / anwde) |

1187 RPH sa. vidhai-Data 2




	1981UP10.pdf
	UP Act 10 of 1981.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1984.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 1984.pdf
	UP Act 28 of 1985.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1986.pdf
	UP Act 22 of 1986.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 1987.pdf
	UP Act 17 of 1988.pdf
	UP Act 15 of 1991.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1992.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 1994.pdf
	UP Act 4 of 1997.pdf
	UP Act 27 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 30 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 25 of 2000.pdf
	UP Act 27 of 2000.pdf
	UP Act 10 of 2004.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 2005.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 2006.pdf

	2008UP11.pdf



