
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and Pension) 
(Amendment) Act, 1981 

 
Act 10 of 1981 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Pension, Conveyance, Leader of Opposition, Facilities, Assembly, Speaker, 
Chairman, Legislative Council, Allowance 
 
Amendments appended: 13 of 1984, 21 of 1984, 28 of 1985, 13 of 1986, 22 of 
1986, 21 of 1987, 17 of 1988, 15 of 1991, 13 of 1992, 16 of 1994, 4 of 1997, 27 of 
1998, 30 of 1998, 25 of 2000, 27 of 2000, 10 of 2004, 21 of 2005, 7 of 2006, 11 
of 2008



JTT T ~ B  vmm wa,  1 4 qsidf~, 1 9 8 I 
--.- 

ThE 'CTTAR PRACESH STATE LEGISLA? URE (MEMBERS' EMOLU- 
MENTS AND PENSION) ( AMENDMENT) ACT, 1981 

ACT 
to amend the Uttar Pradeslz State Legislature (Mentbers' Ernoltrments and 

Pension) Act, 1980. 
M - C  '.F. 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-second Year of the Republic of 1 n T  
as follows:- 

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Short title. 
Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1981. 

2. In section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Membersy Emolu- Amendment of 
merits and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act, for ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ & ~ & ' , p s  the words "five hundred rupees", the words 'Gone thousand rupees" shall be 

"(4) Every person who is entitled to a pension under Chapter VIII 
shall also be entitled to a free non-transferable bus-pass and the provi- 
sions of sub-section (1) shall, mutatis mutandis, apply to every such 
person as they apply to a member." 

4. In section 15 of the principal Act, for the words "thirty rupees", the Amendmena of 
words "forty rupees" shall be substituted, seaion 15. 

5. After section 21 of the principal Act, the following section shall Insertion of sew 
be inserted, namely :- tion 21-A. 

"21-A.(l) The Leader of Opposition shall, throughout the term of his 

Conveyance. 
office, be provided with a suitable conveyance purchased 
and maintained at public expense in accordance with 

the rules made in that behalf. 

(2) The Leaders of Opposition shall be elltitled to such other facili- 
ties as may be prescribed by rules made in this behalf." 

6. The existing section 24 of the principal Act shall be renumbered as Amendment d 
sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the section24. 
following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :- 

1(2) Every person who has, for the first time, become entitled to a 
pension with effect from January 1, 1981 by virtue of- 

(i) the Explanation to sub-section (I), or 
(ii) his membership of the Assembly or Council as defined in 

clause (a) of section 23, 

shall also t e  entitled to a pension, at the rate specified in the said 
sub-section (1) for the period commencing from January 1, 1977 and 
ending on December 31, 1980." 

By order, 
G. B. SINGH, 

Sachiv. 

q ~ o ~ ~ q l ~ * O - ~ O q ~ O  38 (~~7)--14-4-81--(150)--1981--20,45 (il.0) I 





4 

~ 

I * 

Amendment of 
section 15. 

Amendment of 
section 23. 

(i) which was constituted and functioned as such under the Gov- 
ernment of India Act, 1935, either before or after the commencement 
of the Indian Independence Act, 1947 ; or 

(ii) which functioned as a House of the provisional Legislature for 
the State bhder the Constitution df Indid." 

Amendment of 6.  In section 24 df the principal Act,- 
section 24. 

(3) for the worth "three hundred rupees" the words "five hundred 
rupees" shall be substiuted ; and 

(b) ih the p:dviso fcr the kords "five huhdred riipees" the word 
"sevea hundred and fifty rupees" shall be substituled. 

lnsertion of 7. After section 24 of the principal Act, the following section shal1,be 

I section 24-A. inserted, namely :- 
"24-A. Where a person becomes entitled to pension or additional 

Conditions of pension under this Act on the ground that 
pensioh paya6Ie he  has served as a member of the Assembly 

I 
to certain persons- or Council, constitclted or in existence before ~ 3anu;ry 1,lS946 such pension or  additional pension, as the case may 

be, shall be deemed to  be admissible to such person with effect from 
January 1, 1977." 

Amendment of 8. In section 25 of the principal Act,- 
! section 25. ~ (a) in clause (a), for the words "five hundred rupees" the words 

"seve~i hundred and fifty rupees" shall be substituted ; 
e (b) in clause (b), for the words "five hundred rupees" the words 

"~eveh huridred and fifty rupees" shall be suhs'titzlte'd ; and 
(c) in clause(c) for the words "five hundred rupees" the wotds 

"seven hundred and fifty rupees" shall be substituted. 

&kndment & 9. In section 26 of the prihcipal Act, for the wo'rds "five huadred rupees" 
section 26. wherever occurring, t"he words "seven huiidretl a6d fifty rupees" shall be 

substituted. 

- 



















Palsion) Act, 1980, hereinafterireferred to as the principal Act, 

I section (I), for the wdrds "five hundrcd rupees" the words "eight-hundred and 
fifty rupees" shall be substituted. 











2. In section 5 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' 
nts and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the 

kcipal Act, for the words and figures "not exceeding forty-five 
&and rupees per a,nnum for the period from June 1, 1991 to 

15, 1991 and not exceeding fifty-four thousand rupees per 
prun from August 16, 1991" the words "not exceeding sixty-five 
asand rupees per annum" shall be substitz~ted. 

3.  Section 15 of the principal Act, shall be re-numbered as sub- 
$on (1) thereof and- 

(a )  in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered,- 
(9 for the words "eighty-five rupees" the words "one 

h 
I- 

hundred fifty rupees" shall be stcbstitzcted ; 
i: 

(ii) clause (V-bb) and clause (V-c) shall be omitted ; 

(ZI) after subsection (1) the following sub-sections shall be 
imerted, namely- 

" (2) Every member shall be entitled to daily allowance at 
the rate of one hundred rupees per day for the days during 
which he torn- for the works in the service of the public 
and fm which the allowance or incidental charges under 
sub-section (1) are not, or may not be, admissfble. 

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-see- 
tion (I),  daily allowance at the rate of one hundred rupees 
per day shall be payable to a member holding any oflice 
referred to in clause (i) of section 2 and the Leader of 
Opposition for each day during the whole of the term in 
which he holds such office, except such days for which he 
claims daily allowance under sub-s&tion (1) ." 

. Ih section 24 o& the principal Act, in sub-section (I), in the 
ion-11 for the words and figures "in the year 1980" the words 

gures "in the year 1980 or in the year 1985" shall be szcBstitwted. 

By order, 
N. K. MARANG, '' 

- 
>* -\*: --. ... 

Amendment of 
saitn 5 of U.P. 
Act no. 23 of 198 0 

Amendme~t 
section 15 

Amendment of 
Sactio n 24 



3 

Dated Lucktow. May 2, 1997 " 

Constitution of India, the 
I of the Uttar Pradesh Rajya 

itiiyam, 1997 XUttar Pradesh 
and assented to by the Governor 

THE U'I1'AR PKADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS' EM OL.UMENTS 
AND PENSION) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1997 

[IJ. P. ACT NO. 4 OF 19971 
(As passed by (he U. PP. Legislature) 

AN 
ACT 

firrther to r r r~nd  tlrr Uttnr Pmdesh Stute Legislatlire (Members' Ernohrnents 
and Pension) Act, 1980 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Forty-eighth Year:of the Kepublic of India 

I .  This Act [nay be called the Uttar Pradesll State Legislalure (Members' Short title 

Emolume~lts zuid Pension) (Amendment) Act, 1997. 

2. In sextion 4 of the Uttar I'radesh State Legislature (Members' Emolumenls Amendment of 
. 

sectio~l 4 of 
and Pensia~) Act, 1980, here in after referred to as the principal Act,fufo, the words "two U.p. Act 23 
thousand and six hundred rupees" the words "three thousand rupees" shall be of 1980 

3. In section 5 of the principal Act, - . Amendment of 
section 5 

(a) for the words "IIO~ exceeding sixty-five thousand rupees per annum" the 
words "not exceeditlg eighty-five thousand rupees per annum froin June 1, 
1997" sltall be subs~ituted; 

(b )  r@er the exitins proviso tl~e following proviso shall be inserted. 
namely :- 

"Provided furtlter that whenever there is an increase in the railway fare of 
fist class, the State Govemrnent may by a notitied order r n l e  a propt~rtiorial 
increase in the valuc of railway coupons." 

4. In section 15 of the principal Acl- Amendment of 
section LS 

(a) in sub-section (I)  for the w'ords "one hundred fifty ruxcs" the words 
"two hundred rupees".shall bt: substirlcted ; 

(b) h sub-sectio~ls (2) and (3) for the words "one hundred n~pces" the words 
"one hundred and twenty five rupees" sl~all be su1)srituted. 

5. Afrpr Chaplcr 4 of the principal Act, the lollowi~~g Chaplcr ~llall be  ase en ion of new 

inserte~i, namely:- chapter 4-A 

"CHAPTER IV-A 

CRETAKUU, ALUlWANCE S l  

15-A. Every ~ne~nber of the assembly or the coGncil, whether or not 
Secretarial lie holds any of Ule office referred to in clause (1) of 
allowa~lce section 2 including the leader of opp>sition shall be 

entitled to receive for Lhc duration of his rnembersiiip or, as he casc may be. 
during whole of the term in wbich he hold\ sucll olficc, secretarial 
allowance at UIC rate of two hundred rupees per month." 



1 -% 

4 3mat?~'d7TlWPT&#2sf,1997 . ! - 4  4 

Amendment of 6. I11 section 17-A of the principal Actfor die words "not exceeding rupees + 
?.,; section 17-A - one lakh" the words "not exceeding mpees two lakh'' sl~all k substituted. 

\ 

Substitution of 7. For scction 24 of the principal Act, the following section shdl be 
Section 24 substituted, ntzmelv:-- 

"24. Every person who has served as a member of the Assembly or 
I'ension the Council for a t y  period s11ail be entitled to a pension at ttie 
l o  ex- rate of one tliousand two hundred and fifty rupees per ~noitth , 

moughout his life: 

Provided that where any person has served as aforesaid for period 
exceeding one year, he shall he entitled to an additional pension at the 
rate of one hundred rupees per month for every conipleted year in excess 
of one year." 

A~nendment of 

section 25 

8.  In sectipn 25 of the principal Act,- 

(n)Jor clause fa), the followirrg clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(a) where a person is entitled to any pe~~sio~l under the provisions of the 
Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of Parliamedt Act, 19-S4 
and sucll pension is equal to or exceeds the atnvut of pension admissible 
under section 24" 

(b) in clauses fb) and (c), for the words "two thousand~md fifty rupees'', the 
words "the amount of pension admissible under section 24" shall be 
substituted. 

9. In section 26 of the principal Acr, for Lhe words "two tliousand and fifty 
mpees", w1iert:ver occurulg, the words "the ainounl of pension admissible urlder section 
24" shall he srrbstituted. 

R.D. MATHIJK, 
Prur~tukh Saclriv. 





(Ultar Pradesli Adhiniyrun Sankhya 30 of 1998) as passed by the IItlar Pradesli Legislature a id  r~ssented to 
by the governor on 25 September, 1998. 

T H E  UI'TAR PRAIIESH S T A T E  LEGISLATURE M E M n E H S  ANII 
OIi'LCICERS AND MINISTEKS AhlIENITIIIS 1,AWS 

(AMIZNDkIENT) ACT, 1998 

I 1U.P. ACT NO. 30 01: 19981 

~ (As Pcrsscrl IIS tlie Urtar Prntlesh Lrgislrl~lr-e) 

Short title 

Amer~dlnellt of 
section 3 of the 
l1.P. Act No. 23 
of 1980 

i\liicil~linc:lt of 
section S 

JiirllrcJr to anlend the Ufiar Prfldesh Stale Legi.rlolure (Mctrzl)ers' Et1~o1runent.r 
and Pension) Act. 1080 ntrtl tile Utiar Pra~iesll Stall) L e g i ~ I ~ t t i r ~  (0SJjc~r.r Scrlnries and 
Allotvnnces) Acl, 1952 crntl tlre U t i ~ r  Prdesli  Ministers (sakrries, cr/k?$l~ances crnd 
Misccll~ineous Yrl)vr.riorls) Act. 196'1. 

17' IS IIIiKEBY coacted in tlie Forty-nirttli Year oT the Republic of Illdin as 

follows:- 

I .  1'1iis Act may hc callcd the Urtar Pradesli State Legislalure ~ne~nbcrs  arid 
Officers and Ministers Aincniries Laws (Ameridmerit) Acl, 1998. 

AMENDMENT UI: 1'1 I1 J 1 Tl- l ' / \ i l  PIIADESI I STA'I'E I.I:GlSI.A'l'~JRE (MEM13ERS' 
I <R.lOi ,I IMliNTS AND I'ENSION) AC'I', 1980 

2. In \cctron 3 ol the Utta Pradesh State i,i.pt\lalurc (Members' Emoluments 
and Pcn\tort) Acl. 1980, 1tctcrtr;~lter referred to In [hi\ pat1 in tfic l'lrncrpal Act, 111 suh- 
sectloll (l),fol- the wolds "etghr hundred arid fifty ~upeer\", the &ords, ''two thousand 
I upees" shall be srib,titlitrtl. 

3. It1 sectiorl 4 of thc principal Act, for the wortls "three thousand rupees", the 
words "five Ihoosiu~d n ~ j ~ e s "  shall be sfrl~sstit~cted. 

4. Scclivti 5 01 tile priltcipal Act sliall he rc-numbered ns sub-seclioll (1) 
t l i e ~ o i  and,- 

(a) in st~h-sc~~iorl ( 1) ,zs so rcnurnbcred..for tltc wol-(Is "ool exccedirig cighty- 
rive diousaud rupee\ pcr anllurn fro111 June 1, IY17." lhc wolds and Pipurcs 
"rloi excecdirip ctyhty-fivc thousald rrrpccs pcr ananrn Sro~rt Juoc 1, 1907 ;uld 
1101 cxcceditlg cighly-ciglll thousand rtipce\ per :~anuln lronl June I ,  Ik)98," 
slid1 he :;lcb~tr/~tt~ci ; 

(h) alter sub-wction (1) the followirlp sub-section shall bc i?z.3rrtet/, 
11anely:- 

"t 2) \ubjecr to the orltcr provisions ol  thir Act, every ex-~nenrber shall 
he prov~rled. 111 thc mariner prcscrihed, with railway couponr of such value 
rtol cxcccd!ng [en tflousand rupecs per alirluln ar\ niay he usecl by suct~ 
cs-lncn~hel lor l~i~iisclf arid for lire nncrribers 01 his lamily atltl llic 
pluvt\ions ot \ub-4cctii)1l (1) shall rrrli/(~rrs I I I I ~ ~ N I I ~ ~ Y  apply to tlie railway 
cstijx)ri\ supplrctl under Illis sub-secliolt." 

5. In scctiori I3 oP the principal Aci, in sub-section (4) c!l)er [he worcls and 
figure "sub-section ( lY,  tllc words md figure "aid sub-section (2)" slid1 be insc>rled. 



6. (11 section 15 ot Ihc ~*riricipal Aa,- hnendmeat of 
section 15 

;:I) in sub- action ( l j f i t  ~ I I C  WO~CIS "LWO iiuiidred nrpce\" tlie words "two 
hundred a~ld fifty ro[sc\" \1ia11 hc .\rr!trritl{tul; 

(b) in sub-\cctiorir 12: ;ui:1 (31, fiw the words, "one Ituntllctl and twenty- 
live rupees" tlic word<. "two lruiidrccl rupces" sliall be .sub.~riturc~d. 

7. 111 section 15-h ol rlrc principal Act,jot- tlre words "two hundred rupees" tlie Amenclment of 
words 'bnc Ujousalld rupees" sli,lll be a~bslrttiteri. section 15-A 

8. In section I%-A of [lie principal Act, in clause (a) .fi)r ttic wortls, "six Amcuclnlent of 
I1und1r.d rupees" tlrc word< "one thousaid rupccs" shall be acD.srirutcd. Section 18-A 

9. Scctiori 24 of thc p~ i~~c ipa l  Act shall be re-aumbered ;IS sub-secti011 (1) A ~ r ~ e ~ i d m c a t  of 

thereof, arid,-- sect1011 24 

(a) in sub-section (I ) as so rc-nurnbcred,- 

(i)jur tlic words "one thousand two Iiundred and fifly rt~pccs" tlie 
words "one tliousarid live hundred rupcs" sliall be a~h.vti~utod 

(ij) in tlre proviso .for. tlie words "one liuiidred rupecs" the words "two 
hundred rupees" shall he n~t)slilute(l; 

(b) after sub-section (1) the Sollowirig sub-section sl:ail be itrserled, 

namely :- 

" (2)  Where ;my person entitlctl to pension undcr sub-section (1) is 
also entitled to arry oUicr penviori such person sliall bc ctititled to receive 
the pensiou uiider sub-scctioit (1) in addition to such peurion." 

10. hi section 25 of tlie principal Act. clauses (a) and (c) shall hc otnirted. Alnendtncrlt of 
sectiotr 25 

11. In section 26of tlic principal Act,./or- the words "clause (a) or clause (b) or Anerttlme~lt of 

clause (c)", tlie wortls "clause (b)" shall bc slib.rtitlrfer1. secllori 26 

Amendment of tile Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers 

Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952 

12. I11 scctioit 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Off'iccrs Salaries and A~ncltd~nent of 
secliorl 2 of the Allowances) Act, 1952, lierein after referred to in this part as the principal Act, in sub- U.l,. Act No. 

secliorl (1)  for the words "nipecs one tliousatld" tlie word$ "two thousand arid five of 1952 
fiundred rupes" sllall be .~ul)stillcted. 

13. In section 4 of Ihc Principal Act,- h~ne~~cl~nent of 
scctiorr 4 

(a) in sub-section ( 1  ), Ihe s "and also at such other placc in Uttar 

Pradesh and for huch pcriocl a y be prescribed by rules to he made by the 
State Go~~enunent in Uiis behalf' sllall bc or~zittecl; 

(b) after sub-sectio~r (2), tlrc followirlg sub-scctiorr sllalt bc insertc~ri, arrd be 
deemed to liave been inserted or1 March 27, 1007 namely,-- 

"(3) 'l'he Speaker and tlic Clidnnari shall each be cotitled to receive 
two Urousand and five liutrdred rupees per montli tllc inaiiitciiance of 
his private rcsidencc at his liotnc district wid1 effect lrorn the date of liis 

elecriori as sucli Speaker or the Chainnm, as tlie case inay he : 



Amendment of tlie Uttar Pradesh Minister3 (Salaries, Allowa~ices and 
Miscellaneous Provisiotis) Act, 1981. 

Amcndmci~t of 14. I n  sectioo 3 of die Utwr I'radesh Mi11i4tcrs (Salaries. Allowances ant1 
Section 3 01 P4isccll~1aeous Pmvi\ions) Aci, 108 1 ,- 
U.P. Act No. 14 
oP 1981 

ia) in sub-seclion (I),for Il~e words "ooc ~housxld rupees" Lhe words "lwo 
tliotls~tid and fivc l~u~ldrecl rupees" sliall k n11)stillilecl; 

(b) it1 hub-scction (2)for- the wolds "nine l~u~idred rupecs".llic words "two 
Llious:u1~1 two hundred and twenty five I upes" sltall be ~~ib~l i l l l l i~d .  

By order. 

Y .  K. TRIl'ATI-11, 

Prnr1114kh S L I C ~ I ~ I ~ .  







9 3  pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of I l l l  

Governor is pleased to order the purbIicadon of &e following English translation of the Utrx ir'radc:< 
Vidhan MmdaPI S,?dasya Aur Adhikari Tatha Mantri Sukh Suvidha Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adtnin~;~;i 
(Uetar M w h  Adhiniyani SanPdrya 10 of 2004) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and 
by the Govcmoa on February 26,2004. 

THE UITAW PRADESH STB'E LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND OI.2-iC 
AND MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS ~AMDJDMENT) ACT, 20!3 

{As passed b y  t l z  Utrar Pradesh Legislature) 

ACT 

f i n l ~ r  to amend tlte Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' El~wiutrt 
Pension) Act, 1980 the Uttar Pradesh State LRgislmre (Oflcers Salaries and Allo 
Act. 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscei 
Provisions) Act, 1981. 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-fifth Year of the Republic of 
follows :- 

Sbort ti* and 

Amendment of 
section 3 of 
U . P A t  no. 23 
of 1980 

Amendment of 
sectioas 

PRELIMINARY 

1. (1) This Act may be catled the UUar Pradesb State Legislature Memb 
Officers and Minnbms Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2004. 

(2) It shall come into force with effect from April 1,2004. 

c m n  
~ M E N T O F ~ E  WAR W H  STAIEL.EG~SL.A~URE 

(MEMBERS' ~ U M E N ' l S  AND PENSION) ACT, 1980 

2. In section 3 of the ~t&Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Eho- 
and Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to in this chapter as the principal 
sub-section (1) for the words "two thousand ~pees" the words "three thousand 
shall be substituted. 

3. In section 4 of the principal Act for the words "the thousand rupc 
words "seven thousand five hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

4. In section 5 of the principal Act,- 

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words and figures "and not ex 
eighty-eight thousand rupees per annum from June 1, 1998" the wr 
figures "not exceeding eighty-eight thousand rupees per annur 
June 1, 1998 and not exceeding one lakh twenty thousand rupees pe 
froan April 1, 2m 

(b) in sub-secion (2),- 
(i) for the words "ten thousand rupees*' the words "twenty 

~ p s "  shall be substituted; 

fii) in Ute rust proviso, in clause {b)  for the words "aree 
NP" the words "five thousand rupees'* shall be substituted 



6. In section 1 5 of the principal Act, - Amendment of 
section 15 

(a) in subsecion (1) for the words "two hundred fifty rupees" the words 
"three hundred N ~ S "  shall be substituted ; 

(b) in subsection (2) for the words "two hundred rupees" the words "two 
hundred fifty rupees*' shall be substituted ; 

(c) in sub-section (3) for Ihe words "two hundred rupees" the words 'two 
hundred fifty rupees" shall be substituted. 

7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for tbe words "one thousand rupees" Amendment of 

the words "two thousand five hundred rupees" s!dl be substi:uted. section 15-A 

8. In section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (a) for the words "one Amendment of 
thousand rupees" the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted. section 18-A 

9. In section 24 of the principal Act,- Amendment of 
section 24 

(a) in sub-section (I) for the words "one thousand five hundred rupees" 
the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(b) in the proviso for the words "two hundred rupees" the words "two 
hundred fifty rupees" shall be substituted ; ' 

(c) after the fust proviso the following proviso shall be inserted, 
namely:- 

"Provided further that in the event of dissolution of Assembly, the period 
from the date of dissolution of Assembly, till the date of first meeting of the 
new Assembly, shall be counted for pension purposes of a member who has 
been the speaker of the dissoivect Assembly and has continued to be in office as 
such during tbe said period ". 

(d) after the aforesaid proviso the following Explanation shall be 

inserted, namely:- 

"~x~lana t ion-where  a person have served as a member of the 
Assembly or the Council for a term of six months and above and have not 
completed one year then such person shall for the purposes of calculating the 
pension, be deemed to have served as a member for one year". 

5. In section 14 of ~e principal Act, in clause (d), in the second proviso for Amendment of 
fie words "two members" the words "five members" shall be subsrituted. section 14 

CHAPTER 111 

AMENDMENT OFTHE VITAR WESH STATE LEGISLATURE (OFFICERS SALARIES 
AND ALLOWANCES) ACT, 1952 

10. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and A m ~ ~ d m e n t  of 
section 2 of the 

Allowances) Act, 1952, hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as the principal Act, in U.p- Act no. 
sub-section ( I )  for the words "two thousand and five hundred rupees" the words "five of 1952 

aousand rupees" shall be substituted 

11. In section 4 of the principal Act in sub-section (3) for tbe words "two knendmentof 
section 4 

thousand and five hundred rupees" the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substifufed.' 



-OF U n A R  ~ A D E S H  MNBIERS ( SALARIES, ALIDWANCU~ AND 
~ ~ ~ C E L L A N E ~ U S  PROVISIONS) ACT, 1981 

12. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesb Ministers ( Salaries, Allowances and Amendment of 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 198 1 ,- section 3 of U.P. 
Act no. 14 of 
1981 

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "two thousand and five hundred 
rupees" the words "five tbousand rupees" shall be substifuted ; 

(b) in sub-section (2) for the words "two thousand two hundred and 
twenty-five rupees*' the wortis "four thousand rupees" shall be subsfifufed. 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 





general 
Amendment in 
U.P. Act no. 23 of 
1980 

Amendment of 
section 4 

Amendment of 
scction 5 

Amesdmcnt of 
section 15 

Amewtment of  
section 15-A 

hmendment of 
section 18-A ' 

Amendment of 
yedim 24 

AMENDMENT OF THE. UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE ' 

(MEMBERS' EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) ACI; 1980 
~"s, 

2. In the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and 
Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to in this chapter as the principal Act,for q e  
word "Secretary" wherever occurring including definitions the words "Principal 
Secretary" shall be substituted. 

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, for the words "seven thousand five 
hundred rupees'' the words "fifteen thousand rupees'' shall be substituted. 

4. In section 5 of the principal Act,- 

(a) in sub-section (1) for the wvords and figures "and not exceeding one 
l a .  twenty thousand rupees per annum &om April 1,2004" the words and 
figures "and not exceeding one l a  twenty thousand rupees per mum fiom 
April 1, 2004 and not exceeding one lakh fifly thousand rupees per annum 
fiom June 1,2005" shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (2) fw the words "twenty t h o h d  rupees" the 
words "thirty thousand rupees'' shall be kbstituted. 

5. For section 13 of principal Act the followipg section shall be 
substituted, namely:- 

"13-(1) Every member, when he travels within Uttar Pradesh by'the 
Uttar Prsdesh State Road Transport Corporation Bus inchrdmg air Gondition 
or deluxe bus and submits ticket thereof the amount of such ticket &all be 
paid to & by the Principal Secretary. 

(2) The facility refixmi to in subsection (1) may aIso be availed by a 
membei for tak i i  ane aanpanion with him $ the btq. 

(3) Eveay person who is entitled to a pension Mder Chapter VIII shall 
be ent iw in the mantlier presmi with a h e  nun-transferable pass' to 
travel'& any h k  withim Uttar Pradesh by the Uttar Pradesh State Road 
Transport Corporation Bus without payment of the-passenger tax due under 
any law'for the time being in force. ' 

(4) The pass n f d  to in s u b d o n  (3) may also be used by such 
person for tsking one companion dongwith him in the bus. . 

Provided that if a person m f d  to in sub-section (3) travels in an 
air-condition bus or a deluxe bus he shall have to bear himself the excess mount of 
fiue kerence. 

6. In section 15 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the words "three 
hundred rupees'' the words "five hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words "two thousand five 
hundred rupees" the words "six tho&d rupees" shall be substituted. 

8. In section 18-A of the' principal Act, in clause (a) fbr the words 
"two thousand rupees" the words "six t i i o m d  rupees" shall be substituted. 

9. In section 24 of the principal A$- 

(a) in sub-section (I) for the words "two thousand rupees" the words 
"three thousand rupees" shalf be substituted ; 

(b) in the proviso for the words "t\vo hundred fifty rupccs" thc word.: 
"three hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 



* 

10. In section 28 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I-A), the following -of 

proviso shall be inserted at the end, namely:- sectiaa 28 

"Provided that if any other Government dues are reported to be 
outstanding against such person, whether it is for the period of his 
membership or for the period he is ceased to be a member shall also be 
deducted from the pension of such h n . ' '  

CHAPTER-111 
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE 

(OFFICERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) ACT, 1952 

I I. In section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and AmarQneatof 

Allowances) Act, 1952, in sub-section (3 ) fw  the words "five thousand rupees" the scdioa40ftht 

words "ten thousand rupees" shali be substimed. UP.Aam. 11 
of 1952 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

In view of price rise and increase of responsibilities, it bas been considered expedient in public. 

interest to rwk, the allowances, railway coupons and other amenities admissibie to the members, and the , 

officers of the !%ate Le@ature and to increase the pension d railway coupons admissible to 

ex-members it has therefbe, been decided to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legishm (Members , 

Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980 and the t !  Prad@ State L@skiture (Ofkers Salaries and 

.Allowancles) Act, 1952 to revise the ailowances and other amenities of the members and offdcas of the 

State Legislature. 

lac Uttar Fradesh stige L&slature Members and Officers' AmmitiestLaws (Amendment) Bill, 





FRR &?T 37VWWI m, 17 Vd. 2006 3 
t 

2. In section 5 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments Arnendnwnt of 
snd Pension) Act, 1980 hereinafter referred to as the principal Act,- section 5 of U.P. 

Act no. 23 of 1980 

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (b) for the words "five thousand 
rupees" the words "eight thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

(71) after the second proviso the following proviso shall be iluerled, 
namely:- 

"Provided also that out of the railway coupons to be slipplied unde: 
sub-section (2) to an ex-member, he shall at his option be supplied coupons of equal 
value for travel by air at. any time." 

3. In sectior? 18 of the principal Act for the words "as may be prescribed" the Amendment of 
words "and mobile phone as may be prescribed" shall be substitzited. seeti011 18 

C 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

The leaders of the parties have in their meeting held on August 8, 2005 decided to increase file 

limit from five thousand rupees to eight thousand rupees of the amount which a member may on his 

option be paid in cash per month for petrol and diesel for his own vehicle out of the railway coupons 

supplied to him and to allow an ex-member to get coupons for travel by air out of the railway coupons . . 
supplied to him . The State Government is of the opinion that the members may be given mobile phone 

facility besides the telephone facility provided to them as it is essential in the modem society. It has,, 

therefore, been decided to arnend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislatme (Members' Emoluments and 

Pension) Act, 1980 to implement the decision of the leaders of the Parties and to give mobile phone 

facility to the members. 

The Uttar Pradwh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment) 

Bill, 2006 is introduced accordingly. 

By order, 

RAM HARI VIJAY TRIPATHI, 

Prarnukh Sachiv. 






	1981UP10.pdf
	UP Act 10 of 1981.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1984.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 1984.pdf
	UP Act 28 of 1985.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1986.pdf
	UP Act 22 of 1986.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 1987.pdf
	UP Act 17 of 1988.pdf
	UP Act 15 of 1991.pdf
	UP Act 13 of 1992.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 1994.pdf
	UP Act 4 of 1997.pdf
	UP Act 27 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 30 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 25 of 2000.pdf
	UP Act 27 of 2000.pdf
	UP Act 10 of 2004.pdf
	UP Act 21 of 2005.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 2006.pdf

	2008UP11.pdf



