
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous
Provisions) Act, 1981

Act 14 of 1981

Keyword(s):
Legislative Assembly, Legislative Council, Family, Maintenance, Minister

Amendments appended: 5 of 1990, 8 of 1997, 9 of 2010, 22 of 2016, 19 of 2019















?atilt q f icc  
 (T) 

(\scu vrat aT1rr4TTr) 

xishcii•l, 05 9T4, 2010 

4)-TF19 14, 1931 Ylcb 

si 	xi .9,4 cr) 

fazwit 3T-tug—I 

TELQ71 3g7/79-R-1-b0-1(i)-b02010 
Cg-TG, 05 WTI. 2010 

3TRRWiT 

f[41 

"ITRU TT iitc-iTg" 	arfa-d-  zoo 	aTzfrg tivt191ci M -471 4 ‘1(t1 	 DEIT9 Husci 

19-41zI at aif1iflTI-TT 4l71-r1 1f4 (1#11tri) ft4g- , 2010 tr1" gikb 03 Trl, 2010.  

‘3971% 779 t 	qT,  dm( cii:vr afe4trli eitsqr 9 19 zolo 	Thct TrthlizliturzirTE49r4 TEr 

et971 ART smf:Om 1r 	:- 

\3cri(ti (1.4 gm 91.15(1 ti 	31T aTNTrtt WiT 4-1711 	- IT ft1-4 (#qfram) 
ST, 2010.

 MT 	ticsttf 9 19 2010) 

[411T 3ccit SibT F4ETN gcr gm getu 
dm{ 	0,nfl ftET9' TFUF (liTt4 q3traitr4f at 17) aTfaig, 1980 at ,3CCIk 

AkK thr4 fon muso (atimifkli 	adrf atEliA) Ganzfrf, 1952 TITI crit sIbT Tit ( 	d-i, 

Cffli 

 

at Atuf ‘iLicirreT) .3TIV4423, 1981 T5J 3TOT Ttql)q7 cbt4 

TITM 	Li 	W164 44 .4 fl-1f6Fi9cr •AfAtril cmiur Tar
34Einzt-q- 	• 
mr(Ntb 

1- ZT aTftfikTTIT 	cr-aw 	 rarg gW1 ti4t4 at 3TrgTh-ift ffErf 	9111F1 11,1 

IMT TtlEN ilf I

1t1 	I 	.1 917.9R-RTioRwr 	/crao 

 

9 cep 7i0410-91 /2008--b 0 

 

 

 
 

 

M-421-tot 

 

 

 
 

 

 

Iffutd,  59f TM-WI 

TM laPircr (item( ATU metaDM 



3cc1. srZto 3111tit14 

(-8.9-41 23 (13.  1980 

eti 8117.1 3 IA 4.46rg 

EmuI ET SET8 

8171 15-8i 

f4a1819 

EFT 24 WI T42*8118 

3cN cre.:81 SiTiTtiNul1 	05 01d, 2010 

87-4.1 26-E8 EN 

q3N1-8 

311V4I4-t 

dal+, CikZ1 thr+-1 ittIff 	Scf (ff4-€11371•Mreff ett NF) alftAZITI, 1980 %-1.  
#q111Tff 

2-..3c0( 	iOrel ft2111 1-1u.8r1 (tiqt.q) EJf  \34rr6;2141.  31It 

.3•711TIFI, 1980 t, FMt *8.  ‘31-armr 	3T1-4r alf4rp:Fr =ire) 	q1(1 3 4,

\wail(' (1) 4 	 RTH tg 	 2Ait .F-44" 7.-Gr R-4

qr-441 

3-7 37f41 -44 t .qm 4 4 TC "4r5,6 r) mit 	P-.117 tr); 

"qTpr F:),[14. q4" 	 Pq4 -r-Elt I 

	

4-1j5r1 alfeltR zft 21W 15-T, .14 	"g e,r9( 	t T-2119- Ue; 

. t,(44" (tq I4 u44 i 

5-171 .3-fiikrjr7 t" ZIRT 	4 	 t)94" 

7-21-19.  R  Rlz-P; 	'>Q11( 11:111" (t4 fair 	. 

6-7 .34f4F-974 11 ZITU 24 4 atrgi<1 (1) 4- 

() 	"s: ulJJ 	 ITT 	,AK -544" Tr.±4 

R-9-54 -r44 

(U) Wqrf ITC14 374 	 P.-IN ITT 5.11 

"end.  4r --cr-2('' 

alfrerf t).  Z.TRT 	 T-Thd tiTlt-ircrAct ETRT t( 

"26--t (1) •441. 	 3-1-e4 t ‘1*1-1 ft-fIT ‘311171k WCF(1.  Thrl 

41I141Pcb 	t ,ticrt .71 tWN 311 	41- 1 34-11:F4 4s1-9-  acit 

a-, a-frt so% t q&N, 	 4s9 	-Frr 

Tic•bd.1( 	t ,rwitri• 

(2) 	R 	 Tt qi6 24 t 372110 (1) t 33- Terff 4zn- 

t Q4) .1{ t.t 	a AIM, t 	t WT4 dti,) ikffkHclkilf 4q1-ff 

t 50% t cithlt '4iikqiikc 	 4p tr tfrr LiRvErt Gmftrit54,41( 

\J114 'II: 

'TT% 	LIR 4%/441 EIRT 3 	 ach-r ap.mr %TM 24 t 

317qM (1) t  	4W9. fii chglt 	q?; 31:11.7T (1) m3TRTRT (2) 

31-tid 	 117'ocbc,It 9tf  

UM 4 4:1 #P1TE/9 

3MT 3:ft 

8i1CPLIT 11 97.  1952 

. 111 8111 2 	Ti•PlE.114 

31E4414-6-1•1 

Wat4T thrq RETT9.  6c1 	 7:0.) a4e4Zfri,. 1952 

TitEF 

8-‘371( sr-?-,vr <1 	 ( 	t 	clf uierr 	g•TWA-Trfr, 

1952 tr. It7.7-1•9 a•Taliq 4 mr4 	 S1re4zrizr cbc1 Nr L zrm 2. 4, ,344Fr (1) 

ca-e4 	q-4t" t T2-TT9.  'TT Ii54 "q1thr Ou1lt 714" tW lt.4 .1 /411 	I 

9-17 .3114ftql7 Thrt 2TRT 	31TtITT,1 (3) 4 	"qt-f ?nr-TT t)44" 

,hu4"  	



'TM ;Its! 314IRIN(31 1R.I1Z. 05 Tir-4, 2010 3 

3Ttz11.4-WC 

TT Ali 	( 	d-f, 'TM 0117 5104 ‘314,514:1) aillAtm, 1981 Z5f14411EF 

10-3MT 	Oc 	̀11.MT alif ST01  ‘344-tr) aiN1 -47, 1981 0 

VT 3 4- 	

	

(t) zglifIT (1) 4 	"ti1-4 Q.11( O‘A"i P49 7 lsd. "c4it6 

aft Otl" 	fe-.4 er4i 

(N) ucitIT7T (2) 11 YrC 	-evil( 5144 	(-41-1 t"TB 

Z717 	rd-.4 .714'1 I 

.3N1 STb1 

381n111 	i 14 

739 1981 t 

3 EIIit1117 

    

	

\3S, F1 	m-rtur 

(1-.4 F4419 sfird i71-41:41 74 GachIncii 74T 4-1.,Wlur 1t 3917:1 td9., 	R tZ0-TRT 

p-lif4.21T34 j stcf (194 A •-i[feTtrf 	Rog' ITT l qyqj  R gofi(I tr4 ‘rlic1-1 4144 11711 

SicTria tlic) F 7:7 N=Pt4e-r ftETT Trt P, 	,i71( 	(lot( 1-̀4Errq 

Trait a-t-c 49.n) ate9-zpi, 1980 Sclt Cfbi tivtI jq9 slu.Scf 	 :Her iif sit)

'aTfeAtrIT, 1952 UZIT %.4t 51t4T R (c1-1, TIT tt C1071' ‘34sP-q) atse-itrEr, 1981 WT #049 chtc:\b 

1:1w1 F4419 rfcg7 	t 74 3Tfbtift4 atu 	 ci-ft,i'wp cr4 	V-tirerctf34 

S9tIrtra -tfl '414 r4T1t1 4 *4  	 Fr& TYzr 

• 	

{-Q1 

Yir aiTT-4 '4)ir TrErr t 	(1.4 ftzTr9 trugR t 7 wall-  Rrt 77,4 wci-41 triticr41

'0 0'67 Ertl-el:11   FA-44. cbt-11 Ll*di zt,  I ‘31cii 6.10 7 tr-c 	 ifitrird-WA F

4-6 41 Rik.qW1 it-4T TFIT t 	WI 1.98o t 	a-Treizrri 4 thrq 	 t A-4.fz

atir 	 j crail4rit t rag tuflaiRch qp zii .51T4t1T9.  P.m -7raT I 

5,141.4t 3147?r ostr Ibtri Tiv-g7 t-14(4 atIT .eTrutrft Ma   	,1-13fttrf 1!it (Ti.Pti.M) 

f4445, 2010 T.-.R111 	,4101 zt I 

38-811 

<12,Y1C116I, 

I 

No. 397(2)ILXXIX-V-1 I 0-1( ka)-10-20

Mucci LUCA710W. Man.b 05. 2010 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Ankle 348 Of the Constitution, the povernor.  is 

leased to order the publicaiion of the fcillowing English translation of the Uttar Pradesh.Rajya Vidhan 

,Maridal Sadasya Aur Adhikari tatha -Maittri Sukli-Spvidha Vidlti (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010 (Uttar 

Pradesh Adhinivatii Sankhya 9'of 2010) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the



3-cfg 	31TIETRui 4 1M-C, 05 RT-4, 2010 

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND OFFICERS AND

MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT. 2010 

(UP. ACT NO. 9 OF 2010) 

[As passed bv the Uttar Pradesh Legislature] 

AN 

ACT 

jiwther to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members E1170h011eniS and 

Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pthdesh Suite Legislature (Officers Salaries and 

Allowances) /la, 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981. 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-first Year.  of Republic of India as follows :- 

CHAPTER-I 

Preliminary 

I. This Act may be,  called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature Members and 

Officers and Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act. 2010. 

CHAFFER-B 

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and 

Pension) Act, 1980 

In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments 

and Pension) Act, 1980. hereinafier referred to in. his chapter as the principal Act. in 

sub-section (1) Ibr the words "three thousand rupees" the words "eight, thousand 

rupees" shall be substituted. 

In section 4 of the principal Act lin-  the words "fifteen thousand rupees" the 

words "twenty two thousand rupees" shall be substituted: 

In 'section 15-A of the principal, Act .fin-  the words "six thousand rupees" 

the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

In section 18-A of the principal Act in clause (a) foil the words "six 

thousand rupees" the words "ten thousandirup.eershall,bestibmingeiL 

In section 24 of the principalAct.in  subrsectitin 

Shoo title 

Amendment of 
section 3 of U.P. 
Act no. 23 of 1980 

Amenthnent of 
section 4 

Amendment of 
section 15-A 

Amendment of 
section 18-A 

Amendment of 
section 24 

Amendment Of 
section 26-A 

(a).  for the words "six thousand rupees" the word "seven thousand 

-rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b) for the words "five hundred rupees"' nppearinw in the firs- proviso. 

the words "seven thousand rupees" shalt be substituted. 

7. For section 26-A of the principal Act the following section shall be 

substituted:.--- 

."26-A (I) If a sitting member, dies during the tenure of his or het

Family 	office. the spouse of such member shall be entitled 

Pension to a family pension equal .to 50% pension inherwis

Admissible to the deceased member at the time of death, for the life-time ot

such spouse. 

(2) If an ex-member, who is entitled to a pension unde
sub-section Cl) of section 24, dies. the spouse of such ex-member shall be 

entitled to • a family pension equal to 50% of pension of such
ex-member at the time of death. for the life-time of such spouse: 

Provided that if the spouse is entitled to a salary under section 3 or a 'pensio

under subrsection (1) of section 24 she/he will .not be entitled to receive family

pension under sub-section (,1) or sub-section (2). 



drk Sf .Y1 31411I-1Rul 	05 'MIL 2010 5 

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers' Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1952 

8. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1952, hereinotier referred to in this chapter as the principal Act, in 

sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees" the words "twelve thousand 

rupees" shall be substituted. 

. 	9. ln section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3) for the words "ten 

thousand rupees" the words "fifteen thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

CHAPTER-1V 

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 

Amendment tiI 

section 2 or Up. 
Act no. I I of 

1952 

Amendment of 

section 4 

10. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and 
Amendment or 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981,- 
section 3 of U.P. 

Act no. 14 or 

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees" the words 1981 

"twelve thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

-(b) in sub-section (2) for the words "four thousand rupees" the words 

"ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

STATEMENT OF 01311ECTS AND REASONS 

The pay, allowances, pension and other amenities admissible to the members and officers of the 

State Legislature and to the ministers have not been revised for a quite some time. In view of the price rise 

and escalation in cost of living it has been decided to revise the same so that they may serve the cause of 

their constituency in a meaningful manner by amending the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' 

Emoluments and Pension) Act:  1980. the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and 

Allowances) Act, 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and Miscellaneous 

_Provisions) Act, 1981. 

It has been experienced that the spouses of deceased members and ex-members of legislature have 

been facing hardship and have been living in penury. In difference to the dignity of office which they have. 

held it has also been decided to provide for making, in the aforesaid Apt of 1980, provision for family,

pension to the spouse of the deceased members and ay-members of the State Legislature. 

The Uttar Pradesh.  State Legislature Members and Officers and Ministers Amenities LaWSI.  

(Amendment) Bill. 2010 is.introduced accordingly: 

By order. 

P.V. KUSFINVAII

Sachir. 

touroz00-70 1:110-1176 th44,1-(t0)-2010-(2497)-597-(tvV41/31Trbt)1 

tOcref0 Ot0-70 410-237 TITO F44141-2010- 2498 -85















         

Thii-titg4T-261 

      

      

    

Sects / 70tft0-91 /2014-16 

   

Frth-rei IMF, wRbT 
ZWT 	irwrf wru wirfam 

WITETRut 

IcIEINJI "4 	let 
tsiu 

(\tcy 5r-ksr arftrftirro 

c41.0.10), tr4R, 27 IPA( 2019 

AN 6. 1941 YEW timq 

.1-c-pf Nita silt.' 
f4zTrzfr arTirrr—i 

(1CQ41 2243/79-1-1-19-1()-16-19 

C'i'5l1\3,, 27 Rti it1, 2019 

3iRriT9T  . 
AAA 

"Intffl5T tin 	EII4" t arl* 200 tGititff thnitik4 TraAA 4 3ccl Or 01.  (4-dff, TffflT 

AT`PTT 376-40 (TATF) Ideich, 2019 it(T4 71WY 3171M-1 ARTR0'4T W:1 tf ITRIPAff W, qT 

1'47T15 26 Neri(, 2019 t 61-111r4 PN t alit 4 dm( SaRT ali1r4A6 rits(ir 19 	2019 

WI 4 ti4km(0r t 7974 7r a1fq7-4r AM gm-rfOm 1}5Err Tffr 

dm( Wat4T 	Olt 3TT a Atut \Ng-ET) (TIQEP-i) aTfernitt, 2019 

(\zit AkRT eTtlft.zrg TICalT 19 9  2019) 

.[*TA dtcR wbr fdtim 'P 	WUtriftff gall] 

dctl 	 srkw 	(dml, Trffr elk mcblui dqq-1 /40 eifirfrzR, 1981 TT 61767 

*NM cbt *1* 

. 

9r(ff  	frm-(4 ati 4 1*•ii*hd 	 :- 

1-(1)q aTftrep:Fr dm( WIRT di 07% m t set ‘syst-E0 
(TisTIEF) aftf4am, 2019 TIT ART I 

(2) 	6 .1cfrelt, 2019 t ATM tin FTC un 

Tri atff 
WR12xf 

490_RPH_Data 4e Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019) 



2 	 ‘3cth wkr 3137V171 I C, 27 \i-H-(H, 2019 

	 srbr 
T47§qt 

14 tri: 1981 Thpi 
ETRT 3 Tr cã1TH 

ttl at{ 
arift 

2-dccit Akg Tit ( 	cfrf, iir all-T sr-414 ,3q.141) azNitriz, 1981 

9TU 3 #, 37EIRT (3) MIT t 71471t 

3-(1) ‘3crit aiRT 	(ai-r, %I'MT tAtfut ‘31-1441.) 
(fPT)trff) eTtilTbT, 2019, Mis,41(1 fkdtrg fttfT v1101 t 

(2) 	It(Trff 	 \34qtf (1) 4 rifttz azzirraw 

trzli TM-1Ra-  irr SFr t \MEW azzfitg 7 Qi wz1 zrr 

t 	Trigrth, Te( azfiftzrgi gm zit zttrgg 	aftkzrzr 

Trg 574 dki.M 	azzitg. 	zrr t zrzli el9Sk T4lit Trit 

aiNikZFT 3COZT 	ellt<41,1 WA 4 ;r7 

\zit 5rkqi 
3{Enrkg wsur 
5 Tff 2019 

dcrN mtzr 	@1-f, 97r * Tel ‘3,4.1-g) azrg, 1981 (cc1k PkW alfePiff 

tits4F 14 Tf 1980, ‘3ccit A-kW ti,Y4 lanOtti,wt t 3T-41 fiait It* t 

741%7 gzzr TOO .1)(4 	azrzazzfrig 1%-gr zrzrr   azirtzri:r t gm 3 t TRIM (3) 4 
Trg--4z tP5 srt .  t, (1,4 	ogr 	Rt t ant ncwiq 1495r azrzwz 	Tr4firg ittfr 

Stir t aztrg 	kg. r zrz tRtr wz 4 tirAlicr g4.* ikTI TT, (1,74 fl(471( akr crrr ft-zit 

r.47111 tit alTzfTT TF rff(7, T(1 t, aTRITT Wit S zritfir 	ezttg azr4 	 qtrT rzrIk'T &RI 

RAT 	 a-4T( *NT '41" agg-t-z Thl TM' cht 	‘ickitglen ezlI rift eirditgvf, 
\Ad' *TM 	altzfTt Th-T riarff 11149 .  35 W711 	77T tittit 	 ITT 1T T-6( 	I tiweQ 

7:16 W44WEI 441 iTzfr 	ft RT 3 	Tftliti (3) 	 fkq \34c1 3lft11W1 4 

itgr qzg, itmltfi 3crti ritzrzi agg-t-z NTrgrg cb<4 	dc-n(qiNctr tr44 	Uj  .T•z• tici; 

tit zrwr 1'07 trigF 	# Te 	atIT dcrci laf;t4Lr 	crir•T 4)(4 	f7 cmid.ittut 

	

wzigrer   aggFR aft 4-ncra (1.-4tric1 ARr \Zit 7t4z zit (kg% (aTMT at-T Crept ‘.344-4) 

(Tiefsii)a-Taft, 2019 (3c1( WkW( aTuftT #Cart 5 	2019) itffl 06 -144.4t, 2019 t si&ifci  

%-zrr zrzrr 

2-7711T \zit-  3:1Th3T Mt (ctrf, WIT t ATtuf ‘ikiw-cir) (TitE17) ittzTT, 2019, 71-49' 

azzirrapz 	mfatqiNcr wz4 	gz:Fgrftra.  itzrr mini WI 
if 

an-dr -4, 

o-II, 

;r5ur ri"44 

490_RPH_Data 4e Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019) 



‘3c1 WaTT 3M1E1W:ri 	, 27 fd-RTRI7, 2019 

No. 2243(2)/LXXIX-V-1-19-1(ka)-16-19 . 

Dated Lucknow, December 27. 2019 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is 

pleased to 6rder the publication of the following English translation of the Mantri (Vetan. Bhatta Aur 

Prakima Upbandh) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2019 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 19 of 2019) as 

passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on December 26, 2019. The 

Gopan Anubhag-1 is administratively concerned with the said Adhiniyam. 

THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND 

MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019 

(U. P. Act no. 19 of 2019) 

[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature Assembly] 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981. 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of India as 

follows :- 

(1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Minister S (Salaries. 

Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Act, 2019. 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on November 6, 2019.- 

In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers -(Salaries, Allowances and 

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 sub-section (3) shall be omitted. 

U.P. Ordinance 	 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Ministers .(Salaries, Allowances and 
no. 5 of 2019 	

Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2019 is hereby 

repealed. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action 

taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the 

Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been 

done or taken under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as 

amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all 

material times. 

Short title and 

commencement 

Amendment of 

section 3 of U.P. 

Act no. 14 of 

1981 

Repeal and 

saving 

194_RPH_Data 4 Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019) 



4 	 ‘icck. 	317fltiRui 1 /44 , 27 1dtjcl& 2019 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act. 1981 

(UP. Act no. 14 of 1981) has been enacted to consolidate and amend the law relating to 'the salaries, 

allowances and other facilities to the Ministers of the State of the Uttar Pradesh. Sub-section (3) of section 

3 of the said Act provides that the salaries.  of every Minister, Minister of State and Deputy Minister shall 

be exclusive of tax payable of such salaries (including perquisites) under any law relating to income tax for 

the time being in force, and such tax shall be borne by the State Government. Since the income tax is being 

paid by every citizen in the State who comes under the ambit of income tax law, the said Ministers shall 

also be responsible for the payment of income tax, Besides the payment of the income tax of the said 

Ministers was being paid by the State Government for the last 35 years. After due consideration it has been 

decided to amend the said Act to omit the said sub-section (3) of section 3, so as to make the said Ministers 

to take there responsibility of payment of income tax themselves. 

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to 

implement the said decision, the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous 

Provisions) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2019 (UP. Ordinance No. 5 of 2019) was promulgated by the 

Governor on November 6,2019. 

2. The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) 

(Amendment) Bill, 2019 is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance. 

By order, 

J.P. S1NGH-11, 

Pram ukh Sachiv. 

1110 cr€010t0—g0t0 490 •I‘3111 —t)-2019—(1241)-599 Alt-ZIT—(TO/ 'ft/el:Wit) I 

4rOVT10Z10110-701-1310 105 TITO Mt/I4t-2019—(1242)-300 CIWEIT— (TO / t0/3Th-rrt)e') I 

490_RPH_Data de Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019) 



     

shq-tICW1-136 ,<D 
.3 ‘0 /7901:n0-91/ 2014-16 

 

    

   

ei* 	 cp•-)zirief 

ffotia We, 76?" Jag 

9N* 
SEAT 

3Wf gbh titebit ZTET IMAM 

affITtigui 	C )• 

4 	Ite 

Nu5 

(\irK 3T-a-zr arf4r441:0 
eitql3;  514141,1, 31 3171WE, 2020 • 

Trrqtrq 9, 1942 Ti7 	11144 

‘icin Itt*E 	 

Thui41 arrn-4-1 

'1t-Q-11 1564 /79-M-1-20-1()-16-20 

c•Ngdth, 31 317R?f, 2020 

3ar-c49-r 

fdti 

MT tffitiNn 	3176-q 200 	3Tt9- 	 9A-C7 4 c-cf 	zi 4-141 	 
2W 3N geruf ucr-4-44)(#"1-9.)TtIi, 2020 fZift 41)4.-1 394.117-1 Smiting) Wg' 3,141f4Tff 
t 'ER fte 26 arTit, 2020 	311* liqirf Mit 311R• 	\lccH Titc41 311e4zfri ‘LICW1 13 TI7 
2020 WI:1 4TrthiTETRur mct 7-4TO rff antrT 5HT WmPicT fThqr 	 

	

SraV   wrffr t wet \34q 	-ET) (T4tEm) 
31fifF4zfrf, 2020 

(\ick-K 311 3IiI1fkN tICV41 13 TM\  2020) 
[tu \Zit AbT ftErrff rrw RI 14ifid geTr] 

acci( AiRT 441 (c1-r, %TfflT at( 51-4,4 	 aTfilffizTR, 1981 Th-T GIRT( 
TitErff ct) 	1kk 

11N 	 

	

,moztf 	*.t*c-ctt4 q4 4 f*.ifAcr eliir4.44 GI-114r 1101 t 
1-(1) Zff 441'449 dcri( srksT Tit (c1 	-r, wv t Tel ‘itichlAT) 

(Tittiff) aTfirrizfli, 2020 Th--6T vum4if I 

(2) rfT alfiTrficli 	tiRT 3 TT ‘34,74-ET, imc 4 TRTDT8 	 tiTTh 
Ilyrr ATIT atf tsf dysITET fk9I15 1 atu, 2020 Sir r 	71441 

189 RPI-1 2020 (Manni vetan Matta) (Adhiniyam) 4e • 



ETRI 4 4 TNTIEN 

2 	 cth SItT 3TRTMTRuT I'M d. 31 3i113, 2020 

\smtwbi 

,3TRATTR eis41 

14 fff 1981 

t1M 3 4 *AIN 

2-tit Srkg a @14, IT- T at( Cet ‘3LIGI4T) alfifftqq, 1981 

an4z17 cbg 71-471, t tiRT 3 4, 37EIRT (1) 4 	ftEr gclt W10T 

rtrrr, 

zr¶ 	srFlta, ki,g a (tick wqr.c) 	kiutr a, ,  

TII aTs17, 2020 	117 FM, 2021 at Ai'dtfig elati 104, it41-49.  W Trffr itT 

TfritzT IWT T51 RN ticot TraTff 	ct i fftI" 

eftzlrf t WU 4 4 7ftTRT (3) ftW7 elit I 

4-(1) ‘icylk At4T Tit On 	-f, 	 stmetut dtiv-g) ‘1c1( Tft 

(itttii) aTalTkRT, 2020 Wi‘gtiti IkTftiff itzfr ulicli 	
4 	2020 

(2) t(4 	 r 	uggru (1) 4 Wiz eTart4r 

	 zrgr kNttira. 	aTfirfkgrr 	‘3,4.0 	eTafrff 	tit chief zrr 

Trzitc 	 trzfgril, 	efgftzwr aiki zrerr TOftrd- 	eTrgikcm 

Tff 	 aTtfr 	zrr t't Trt 	 7r2r711 	 

airgiWr ‘34.1g.  Tr* 	ti4-14f gr 41 

\35, Rzit cbl/(uf 
/ 

\zit AtkTdl @orf, gifflT eh Set ‘it-iovET) alfte4z111, 1981 (dm( iftqf aire4zfli 

tiisif 14 t9 1981), \Rd( 	(Ntf 4-&:ff tOorf, 	aFT figreW tau Rfg 

Tittlrff er)( 	17 aTfgfkgftrff Itzrr 	I TOTE azfli tt gm 3. 	uggm (1) 4 

\3q1.14T W 4  74 441, 04 a, " tft  (t1d4  "R) 	" 4'11  ant 'gra 4  

eTrEkr- qr.4IB 0,11( tgLig sr% Tim t 	c.r)qi( g4 I ‘3ccik gkw ki-g 4 eg-19 

d(k4^{ 	qrt fdk tifIR?&Tr tfa-Tru t(gB r tive4 (itchy 	cfRi 	 14#721 t4tit97 

‘34cvstj air arsf' azg 	TFEIT Rciiti-cf 7ff Itfq-c.14 itilf ITT ft gm 3 t 31:itTRT (1) 4 

Tfwilzm cb(1 zff 	 itzrr qrzr 	c-o:ra,;r- t a, (1.4 a (Fr-dg smrT) 	(1,tr 

MW Aff, 2020 ttMW 411-4, 2021 to Ardlirg tRei 	 it4tWi 	9:ffflT atT1 Fe44'rzi wT 

RN Writ Tithe47 t 1 	c.h)q1( 0)- 1 

tit thri4 Wirff 4-1u5d 	 gr alt( ‘3cici fgf*wr t ffirj, 41(4 t 	vcr forzft 

tiggitr 	qT-4t 3.747 t, 37: tluviici ARE ft9it 11 alh, 2020 t-  \3cc1( Cra-PTa ( 	, 

TfMTatt Atui ‘34c4-ET) .(kteRR) aTulTkPT, 2020 (\zit Abf aTaiRPT TitafT 4 79., 2020) t 	 

ftzu Tp2rr 

2-37)7( zlff 	\ictc-r aTigti-gq ti gm 4 	Trgm (3) 4 	‘34tii t ft \3(71( SftW1 

'tit 114 IC°4a 	r' 	 MTittrtt ear, tiutr 	t (lug TrItrf 

189 RPH 2020 (Mantel 'ratan Bhatta) (Adhiniyam) 4e 



‘icck MtT 3ifiW-TRui I UIC, 31 31TRTI., 2020 
	

3 

fteffrrrIU kitl-Trwzr Tt aTagrItff ft# "ii Ai; TrrIt itu4 	rum in-  ellet-ff for a-Fi 

1T0 3tr1 	-tittimq 4 Re. ztrftwr (At) Tit-041'864 Tf ., 2016 (21.7 	al, cR-M qjq ‘371t 

Sikg 7.7f eiR:0 # 3-071 	 qRT 4 	7197T (3) t ikCel Th-T itzfr WI 5.4 ift"TM 

F 3-47 aTi*E111 t WU 4 t atRIRT (3) 	,311-9 14tclatf 

3-a44117 ‘ittit 1.R4 	(cm, 11T AT Set \39c440 . (#0119.) r4t415, 2020, Tii-C 

eitzfrkPT 	giteiTferff cb(k ah 	aftrA-ggr 4 utri-47*tr49- 	flk6-r <4.A4* fkg 3--ckqtrff 

itzrr Ainr 

to .6-11, 
uici- 

No. 1564(2)/LX.X1X-V-1-20-1(ka)-16-20 

Dated Lucknow, August 31, 2020 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is 
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Mann i (Vetan, 

Bhatta Aur Prakirna Upbandh) (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2020 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 13 of 
2020) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on August 28, 2020. 
The Gopan Anubhag-1, is administratively concerned with the said Adhiniyam. 

THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND 

MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020 

(U.P. Act No. 13 OF 2020) 
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature] 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances 
and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981. 

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Seventy First Year of the Republic of India 

as follows :- 

(I) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, 
Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Act, 2020. 

(2) The provision of section 3 of this Act shall come into force with 
'effect from the date of its publication in the Gazette and remaining provisions 
shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from April 1,2020. 

In sub-section (1) of section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers 
(Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 hereinafter 
referred to as the principal Act, the following proviso shall ,be inserted, 

namely :- 
"Provided that the Chief Minister, every Minister, Minister of State 

(Independent Charge) and Minister of State shall be, from April, 2020 to 
March, 2021, entitled to only Seventy percent of the salary, Constituency 
Allowance and Secretarial Allowance payable to them per month." 

189 RPH 2020 (Mantn vetan Bhatta) (Adhiniyam) 4e 

Short title and 
commencement 

Amendment in 
section 3 of UT. 
Act no. 14 of 
1981 



4 	 ‘3o-1 At11 31-TETWItil 4 11/44 d, 31 317TRTI, 2020 

Amendment of 
section 4 
Repeal and saving 

In section 4 of the principal Act, sub-section (3) shall be omitted. 

(1) The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, 
Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) 
Ordinance, 2020 is hereby repealed. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any 
action taken under the provisions of the principal Act as 
amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall 
be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding 
provisions of the principal Act as amended by this Act as if the 
provisions of this Act were in force at all material times. 

U.P. Ordinance 
no. 4 of 2020 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 
1981 (U.P. Act no. 14 of 1981) has been enacted to consolidate and amend the law relating to the 
salaries, allowances and other facilities to the Ministers of the State of the Uttar Pradesh. Sub-
section (1) of section 3 of the said Act provides that the Chief Minister, every Minister, Minister 
of State (Independent Charge) and Minister of State will be entitled, throughout the term of his 
office, to a salary of forty thousand rupees per month. In view of the special circumstances 
arising out of the Covid-19 pandemic in the State of Uttar Pradesh, it is very necessary to have 
sufficient financial resources available with the State Government. After due consideration, it had 
been decided to amend sub-section (1) of section 3 to provide that the Chief Minister, every 
Minister, Minister of State (Independent Charge) and Minister of State shall, from April, 2020 to 
March, 2021, be entitled to only seventy percent of the salary, Constituency allowance and 
Secretarial allowance payble to them per month. 

Since the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was 
necessary to implement the said decision, the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and 
Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (U.P. Ordinance No. 4 of 2020) was 
promulgated by the Governor on April 11, 2020. 

Further, sub-section (3) of section 4 of the said Act provides that a Government 
residence shall be allotted to a former Chief Minister of Uttar Pradesh at his/her request, for 
his/her life, on payment of such rent as may be determined from time to time, by the Estate 
Department of the State Government. But the Hon'ble Supreme Court, in Writ Petition (C) No. 
864 of 2016 (Lok Parahari through its General Secretary Versus The State of Uttar Pradesh and 
others), has struck down the above sub-section 3 of section 4 of the said Act. In view of this, sub-
section (3) of section 4 of the said Act is proposed to be removed. 

Accordingly, the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous 
Provisions) (Amendment) Bill, 2020 is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance and to in 
corporate the above amendment in the said Act. 

By order, 
I. P. SINGH-11, 
Pramukh Sachiv. 

trOWFOrker0-7011TO 189 .<1 	—2020—(560-599 Attlf—(9)44-1, / €10 /311Wite) 

ttraTena410—W410 147 TEO itift-2020-461)-300 Ardiff—(01-1-101/a0 /3ifth) I 

189 RPH 2020 (Matti vetan Bhatta) (Adhiniyam) de 


