The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous
Provisions) Act, 1981

Act 14 of 1981

Keyword(s):
Legislative Assembly, Legislative Council, Family, Maintenance, Minister

Amendments appended: 5 of 1990, 8 of 1997, 9 of 2010, 22 of 2016, 19 of 2019

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




4 ' TSI g v, 3 WA, 19381

No. 2545(2)/XVII—V¢1—103-81
| , . Dated Lucknow, October 3, 1981 o
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar

Pradesh Mantri (Vetan, Bhatta Agr Prakirna Upabandh) Adhiniyam, 1981 (Uttar Pradesh

Adhiniyam Sankhya 14 of 1981) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by
the Governor on October 1, 1981 -

THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SAL ARIES, ALLOWANCES AND
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT, 1981
[U. P. AcT vo. 14 oF 1981]
( A4s passed by the Uttai Pradesh Legislature )
: AN '
} : Acrt
fo consolidate and amend the law relating | to the salaries, allowances and other

Jacilities to Ministers of the State of Uttar Pradesh.

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-second i Year of the Republic of India
as follows :— '

Short title, 1.~ This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allow-
ances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.
Definitions, 2. In this Act,— '

(@) ‘Assembly’ means the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly;
(6) ‘Council’ means the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council ;
() “family’in relation to a Minister means his or_her spouse, son,

daughter, father, mother, brother or sister residing with  and wholly
dependent on such Minister ; Co ’

(d) ‘maintenance’ in relation to a residence includes the payment of
-local rates and taxes and the provision for water and electricity’ includ-
ing electricity duty ; ‘

() “Minister’ means a member of the Council of Ministers of the
Government of Uttar Pradesh and includes the Chief Minister, a
Minister of State and a Deputy Minister of that State.

Sajary, 3. (1) Every Minister and Minister of State shall be entitled, throughout
the term of his office, to a salary of one thousand rupees per month,

(2) Every Deputy Minister shall be entitled, throughout the terin,of his
| office, to a salary of six hundred and fifty rupees per month.

(3) The salary referred to in sub-sections (1) and (2) shall be exclusive of
the tax payable in respect of such salary (including perquisites) under any law
relating to income tax for the time being in force, and such tax shall be borne
by the State Government.

Residence. 4. (I) Each Minister shall be entitled without payment of any rent to the
use throughol_lt the term of his office and for a period of fifteen days there-

. (2) Where a Minister has not been provided with a residence in accoqunée |
- with sub-section (1), or does not avail of the benefit of the said sub-section,
he shall be entitled to a compensatory allowance at the rate of— o |
(@) three hundred rupees per month in the case of Deputy Minister,
and
(&) five hundred rupees per month in any other case.
Conveyance. 5. (1) Each Minister shall, throughout the term of his office, be provided

with a chauffeur driven motor vehicle which shall be purchased and maintained
at public expense in accordance with the rules made in that behalf.

(2) The terms and conditions for the use of the motor vehicle referred to
in sub-section (1) shall be such as may be prescribed,




I HATIT T, 3 HAAT, 1981

-—

3 Tﬁe motor vehicle
the commencement of
provided.

6. (1) Each Minister other than a Deputy Minister shall be entitled for
.ouriteys ‘wheter by laud, sea or air) performed in connection with the dis-
charge of his official duties to travelling allowance and out of pocket expenses
for himself and the members of his family at such rates and upon such condi-
tions as may be prescribed.

(2) Each Deputy Minister shall be entitled for journeys (whether by land,
- sea or air) performed in connection with the discharge of his official dufies to

 travelling and daily allowance at such rates and upon such conditions as may be
prescribed.

(3) Each Minister shall be entitled to travelling allowance for himself and
the members of his family and for the transport of his and his family’s effects—

{(a) in respect of the journey to Lucknow from his usual place of
residence outside Lucknow for the purposes of assuming office ; and

(b} in respect of the journey from Lucknow to his usual place of resi-
dence outside Lucknow on relinquishing office.

provided to a Deputy Minister at any time

before
this Act shall be deemed to have been

validly

sections (1) to (3), no
allowance shall be payable to a Mlnlster_ I respect of journeys per-

j 7. Every Ministe- shall be entitled and be deemed. always to be entitled
sto theuse of the circuit house, inspection house or other rest houses maintained
‘by the Stete Government without payment of any rent or electricity charges
during the course of jovrneys performed in connection with the discharge of
his official duties. )
8. Every Minister and the members of his family shall be entitled, free of
charge, to accommodation in hospitals maintained by the State Government and

to medical attendance and treatment in accordance with such principles as may
be prescribed. :

9. The date on which any person became or ceased to be a Minister shall
be notified in the official Gazette and any such notification shal] be conclusive
evidence of the fact that he became, or ceased to be a Minister, on that date.

10. No Minister shall during the tenure of his office for which he draws
his salary and allowance, practise any profession or engage in any trade or

undertake for remuneration any employment other than his duties as
Miuister,

11. " Every Minister who is a member of the Assembly or Council, as the
~ase may be, shall continue to enjoy the benefits available to him under sec-
“tons 4, 9, 18 anid Thaptor VUI of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Mem-
Bers” Eanclumeats and “ensinun) Act, 1980, ‘

12. A Minister may, at any time, relinquish the whole or any part of the
salary, allowance or other facilities to which he is entitled by making a written
declaration to that effect : ‘

~ Provided that any such relinquishment may likewise be cancelled by him
at any time with prospective effect.

13. (1) The State Government may,
out the purposes of this Act.

(2) All rules made under the enactment repealed by section 14 and in force
on the date immediately preceding the date of commencement of this Act shall,
in 8o far as they are not inconsistent withthe provisions of this Act, be deemed
to have been made under this Act and they shall continue to be valid and )
effective until they are repealed by new rules made under sub-section (1).

14. The Uttar Pradesh Ministers and Deputy Ministers (Salaries and
Al;owances) Act, 1952, is hereby repealed. ,

by notification, make rules to carry

iy
4

q”rétzqoq\oq”ro-qow"ro 123 g10 (Faaro)——s-lo-si—-(zns)

Travelling
allowance etc.

Use of circuit
houses etc,

" Medical faci~
lity,

Notification of
appointment and
vacancy im the
:)ﬁice of a Minis-.
er,

Prohibition
against practising
any profession etc

Facilities under
U.P. Act 23 of
1980.

Relinquishment
of salary etc,

Rules] making
power.

Repeal .

By order,
G. B. SINGH,
Sachiv.

~=1981-—850 (¥Fo)




AW

IAT AN FATHIL AT, 20 TAGY, 1990

THE UTTAR ‘PRADESH MINISTERS, AND STATE LEGISLATURE,
OFFICERS AND MEMBERS AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 1996
(U.P. Act No. 5 or 1990)

(As passed by the U.P. Legislature)

AN
ACT,
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
~ Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981, the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
(Members’ Emoluments and Pension% Act, 1980  and the U. P. State
Legislature (Officers’ Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952.
It 15 HEREBY enacted in the Fortieth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :— '
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Ministers, and State
Legislature Officers and Members Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act, 1990.

{(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on December 31, 1989,

2. In section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances
and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981, after sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1-A) Each Minister for whose use a residence at Lucknow has
been provided ~under sub-section (1) shall immediately after the
expiration of the period referred to in that sub-section, vacate such
accommodation and an officer authorised by the State Government in
this behalf may take possession of the accommodation and may for
the purpose use such force as may be necessary in the circumstances.

Lxplanaiion—For the purposes of this sub-section ‘Minister’ includes
a person who has ceased to be a Minister, and also includes a person
who was given the status of a Minister.”

8. In section 16 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Mempbers
Emoluments and  Tension)  Act, 1980, after sub-section (L), the  following
subsection shall be inserted, namely v ;

“(1-A)" Every member for whose use accommodation at Lucknow has
been provided under sub-section (1) shall immediately after the expi-
ration of the period referred to in that sub-section vacate such accom-
modation and an officer authorised by the State Government in this
behalf may take possession of the accommodation and may for the
purpose use such force as may be mecessary in the circumstances.

Explanation—For the purposes of this sub-section ‘Member in-
cludes a person who has ceased to be a member.”

4. In the State Legislature (Officers’ Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952,
the existing section 4 shall be renumbered as sub-section ‘(1) thereof and
afier sub-section (1), as so rennmbered, the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(2)- Every person referred to in sub-section (1) for whose use accom-
modation has been provided under sub-section (1) shall immediately
after the expiration of the period referred to in that sub-section vacate
such accommodation and an officer authorised by the State Government
in this behalf may take possession of the accommodation and may ffor
the purpose use such force as may be necessary in the circumstances.”

5. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Ministers and State Legislature Officers

nance pe. 25 and  Members Amenities Laws (Amendment)  Ordinance, 1989, is hereby

repealed.

{2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
under the Acts referred to in sections 2, 3 and 4 as amended by the Ordinance
refeived to in subsection (1), shall he deemed to have been done or taken
under the corresponding provisions of the said Acts as amended by this Act,
as it the provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.

By order,
NARAYAN DAS,
Sachiv.

- fogmonoto—goRo 235 aro(fauro)-(3693)=1890-850 (A%o0))

Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
section 4 of U. P,
Act no, 14 of
1981

Amendment of
section 16 of U.P.
Act no. 23 of
1980

Ameudment of
section 4 of W.P,
Aot no. 11 of
1952

Repeal and saving




CFR 0 ihier v BRETE WG OREA
IWT 930 QAW AE, 2 F, 1997

e e B TRE R
I pursuange.of the provisions of clause(3).of

itwtion of ~

India, the Govgines 18 plesced to order the publication of the. ollowing Esglich translation of
the Uttar Pradesh Mantri Aur Rajya Vidhan Mandal Adpikari Aur 8adasva Sukh-Suvidha
vidhi (Sanshodban) Adhiniyam, 1997 (Uttar Pradesh Ad biniyam Sankbya & of’ 1997)as passed

=

Short title.

Insertion of
New section A-A
in Act No. 14 of
1981.

by the Uttar Pra

. further to amend the Uttar Pradesh,

Legislature (Officers’ Salaries a,n;gugllqwqgges) Act, 1952.

;"@;gtsgnd; Pension) Act, 1980 inter alia.

desh Legislature and assented to by the Goyernor on August 2, 1997 =
THE UTTAR PRADESH Mmﬁrﬁ.l{s:zs;‘ ) STATE Lhimgm'ruma
~ OFFICERS AND ME ABERS AMENITIES LAWS

N1y ACT, 1997 ©
. 581007y

PP PR

radesk Legilanirdi "
- < 'L vl

ters. Sala ies,, Allowances
the Uttar, Pradesp State Legis-
rsion) Att, 1980 and the 'U.P. State

v

and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1
lature (Members® Emolumeénts and P

... WuEREAS the Uttar Pradesh. Ministers (Sglaries, .Allowances,. 3

Miscellancous Provisions) Act, 1981 inter alia provides that each Minister
including Chief Minister. and “Deputy Minister-shdll  be entitled without
payment of any rent-to the.use throughout ghe term of his office and for

~ a period of fifteen days thereafter,of a = ‘s;iaggce;agl_u\cknow which shall

be furnished and maintained at public expence at the prescribed scale;
_~AND, WHEREAS, the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Member’s Emolu-
.proyides that every membor inclu-
ding parlimentry Secretary shall be entitled . without payment of. rent to
the ‘use’ of such accommodation at ,Lu‘?f‘hQWéS.ﬁﬁﬁ _be providéd to him
for the duration of his membershipand §uch" farther period as Tay be
prescribed ; = Lo T
| AND, WHEREAS, the Uttar Pradésh State Legislature (Officers Saldries and
Allowances) Act, 1952 inter alia provides that the Speaker, the Chairman,
the Députy Speaker and thé Deputy Chairman shall each: be entitled to, -
throughout the term of his office a free furnished residenoce at Lucknow ;

.. AND, WHEREAS, it is the duty of the State Government to provide resi-
dences to Ministers, Legislators, Speaker and Deputy Speaker. of the
Legislative Assembly and Chairman and Deputy Chairman of the Uttar
Pradesh Legislative Council; : 3 :

Gowfe 3o P L e I DBy g
... AND, WHEBEAS, to_ensure timely avallaplits
Sgeiker, Dobaty Spuaker, Chitirman, Oophty Chirman &nd Leghlators i
has been comsidered expedient to specify. eertdin accommodations as
Minister’s Tesidence, Speaker’s residence, Chairman's residence; #Deputy
Speaker’s resideénce, Députy Chairman’s: - fesidence and Legislator’s
residence; C . : . ,

TR A

Saiablity of residence to Minister,

Bk

IT 1S HEREBY cnacted in the Fotty-eighth Yéar of thefrepublic 6f India ‘
as follows :— ,

1. This Act may be ca
State Legislature Officers and
Act, 1597,

2. After section 4 of the tt
Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act,

lled the Uttar Pradesh Ministers and
Members Amenities Laws (Amendment)

yUttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries,
1981, the following

~ section shall be inserted, namely :—

d from the commencement of the Uttar Pradesh

“4-A (1) Onan |
) Ministers and State Legislature Officers and

Special " Members Amenities Laws (Amendment)
provisions Act, 1997, the State Government may, Wwith
éiii’aﬁ‘i%wm. a view to ensuring timely availability of resi-
modations dence toa Minister under sub-section (1) of

section 4, by a notified order, specify any

type-VI accommodation or an accommodation in whicha Minister




IRT AW HOEITT AW, 2 T, 1997

was {n occupation at any time, under the control and Management of
the Estate Department of the State Government, as Ministers
residence and an accommodation so specificd shall beallotted toa
Minister only and not to any other person. ' v ,

(2) The State Govetnment, or-an officer authorised by it in this
behalf may, if a person Other than a Minister referred to in sub-
4 is in occupation of an accommodation

section (I-A) of section D 1.C t
specified as Minister’s residence under sub-section (1) on _the  basis of

any allotment order O otherwise, canc:l the aliotment order of
such person, if any, and by mnotice In

yvriting require such person
to vacate the said accommodation within fifteen days from t
m of such notice, and if such person fails

date of service upon hi : ce,. ] ,
‘d accommodation within the said period, an

to vacate the sai
officer authorised by the State Government in this behalf may take
possession of. the accommodation and may for the purpose use such

force as may be necessary in the circumstances”.

tar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’ Insertion _ of
tion shall be  Newsectionlé-A

3. After section 16 of the Ut
in U. P, Act
No. 23 of 1980,

Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980, the following se¢
inserted, namely:—

«16—A (1) Onand from the commencement “of the Uttar Pradesh
: ) . Ministers, and State Legislatares, Officers, and
SPF‘:;?‘ provisions  Members Amenities Laws (Amendment)
;ch“’,;;ggda:i;’;: Act, 1997, the State Government may,
_witha viewto ensuring timely availability of .

accommodation to a member under sub-section (1) of section 16 by a
notifed order, specify any accommodation in the coleny or building
No. 1, A-Block Darulshafa, Vidhayak

named as vidhayak Niwas /
Niwas No. 2, B-Block parulshafa, Vidhayak Niwas No. 3,0.C. R,
Vidhayak Niwas No. 4, Royal Hotel, Vidhayak Niwas No. 5, Mirabai

Marg, Vidhayak Niwas No. 6, Park Road under the control and
management of the Estate Department of the State Government, as
Legistatures’ residence and an accommodation so specified shall be

allotted to 2 member only and not to any other person ;

(2) The State Government, or an officer authorised by it in this
behalf may, if a person other than 3 raember referred to in sub-section
(1~ A) of section 16 is in occupation of an accommodation specified
as Members® residence under sub-section (1) on the basis of any
allotment order or otherwise, cancel the allotment order of such person

uire such person to vacate the said

if any, and by notice in writing req
accommodation within fifteen days from the dafe of service upon him
of such notice, and if such person fails to vacate the said accommod-

ation within the said period, an officer authorised by the State GQovern-
mentin this behalf may take possession of the said accommodation
and may for the purpose use such force as may be necessary in the

circumstances’’,

4. After sect
Allowances) Act,

ion 4 of the U. P. State Legislature (Officers Salaries and Insertion of new
section 4-A, in

1952, the following section shall be inserted, namely ;— U. P. Act No. 11

of 1952. '
d from the commencement of the Uttar Pradesh
Ministers and Sfate Legislature Officers, and
Members  Amenities Laws (Amendment)
certain accom- Act, 1997, the State Government may, with
modaiions a view to ensuring timely availability of
residence to a person referred to in sub-section (1) of section 4, by a
notified order specify any type-VI accommodation or an accommoda-
tion in whicha Speaker or a Chairman or a Deputy Speaker or a

Deputy Chairman:was in occupation-at:any time under the control and -

~ Management of the Estate Department of the State Government as
Speaker’s residence, Chairman’s residence, Deputy Speaker’s residence
residence and an accommodation so specified

or Deputy Chairman’s
shall be alloted to a person as the case may be, referred to in sub-sec-
not to any other person. :

tion (1) of section 4 only, and

««4-A—(1) On an

Special provi-
sions regarding



6 TR AW NG E A, 1997

(2)"Thé stats GoVerfiheatvor van rdfficsrs Authiotissd by it inthis
behalf: may, if*a persobiothet than 4 person réferied té in subsection (2)
of Section 4% iti ocotpatioh of an déconvmodation specifid as Speaker’s
residence, Chairman’s residénte] Deputy Speaker’s iresidénceor Deputy

. Chairman’s residence under sub-section (1) on the basis of any allot-
' ment ofder or otheérwise, - Cantt]*‘the" dllotment: otder ‘of 'suchiperson,
' tlotice'tn writihg teqlire Usuch persén ito vicate the'said

if afy,’and by 1 :

accommodation withif Tiftéén-days'from the daty:of servic aporhim
of such notice, and if such person faifs'to vacatethe sdid: ddcoinmoda-
tion within'the said périod;'dn officE #uthofissd iby the-Staté Govern-
ment in this'behalf ‘may’ take ‘possession: of the'said accomiodation
and may for'the purpose use’ such’ forés as may “be vnecessary in'the

- circumstdnces™.
By ‘éi‘deﬂf*
Pramukh Sachiv.

i ARG D A S b

FordoFodTo~—T oo 117 Ao fruro=~(879)=~<1997<=850 s(ﬁtb«i)f’::r !




;ﬁq‘_m-—74 (@—1) e WFGQ—QHOQWOI?{O / To—

s&cje / Tollo—91 / 2008--10
T/ T U U FRIEa ¥

LCi

I W2 U 2T W

STATYTOY

fEemd) gRRT
A1, 08 (P)
(@R wow o)

TGS, AR, 05 HIE, 2010
WA 14, 1931 UF AW

TR ST WD
feeamd arprT—1

eEn 397 / 79-f3-1-10-1(%)-10-2010
WS, 05 ME, 2010

mau

C O @ HREEC $ e 200 B HAYH TN FARg A I WR9 I e Avsd
mew ol et g @5 gE-glar Ry (defew) Rdws, 2010 w R 03 79, 2010 &
ﬁqﬁmﬁ&ﬁwa’wqﬁﬂaﬁﬁwm9m2010%wﬁmmzﬁ:mﬁ
e B Seia e awm @ -

Wﬁmm%mwmaﬂ?aﬁmﬁamﬁq@-gﬁmﬁm (wisTter)

FiafEm, 2010
(mﬁﬂaﬁﬁmmgﬁzom)
| S I SR Rum wvew zr aia gon |
IR R T Ru wwsw (el A Iuwiern aﬁ?ﬁ%ﬁ) YFTEA, 1980 AT IT
WY Ty fue qvew (afefEl & 3o qw ww) afdfm, 1952 @ SRR mw FH (3@,
T ol gt SuERy) fafrga, 1981 F AWGT §MET F B R
' Ffafra
ww%wﬁaﬁﬁﬁqﬁr@ﬂmﬁwmmo
HEATA-TH
Bt co
1- 7% oRfm e Wy WY e e wew AR vl e W
o gl ARy (GMea) st 2010 s Smem)



L

TR U9 IEIUNYT TUiT, 05 Mid, 2010

STENE- 3
I Ry T R woew (e @ uwtadl ok Yem) affaw, 1980 @
G
T 52 s Z-ywl e U fEm wvew (RERl @ Suatert &R dom
o e, 1980 ®, P g6 s & o @ s Fa own R, a3,
3w (1) § 9 CUF SR BT @ WN W 9= YW R B @ 23
. ST |
4 4 %) T 3-90 FAMER T AW 4 F A= 9%% TR F P WA W a%
“grEY R B8 1@ Y s :
4r 153 7 | 4T TR B AR 15-F 3 9= B TN 5§ | W 9
e | mg T wT @ RY A
g 18-F H 5-ger ARtEE @ 9r 18-% § @vs (F) § 9= ‘B AN w98 &
‘“ﬁ‘”_ ™E W gE (R R SR @ B e,
U7y 24 @1 HIE 6-7e faf 1 g 24 F Juemw (1) §-
(%) 9l “B: TWF TUA7 B W W IE AT AN 59 T
& S
(@)wﬁmﬁ?&ﬁmw tnan"vsqa % WE W OAE
g d@ v Tl W
9 26-% 7@&%@%%26%@?%%%%&%%?@61

Heier &

“26-% (1) A TN # Y & IW FREl owEN e &
aREE TG A ME A Gg P av S A A A7 Ga A
2, mso%%wmﬁsﬁw&mﬁ/waﬂa’nﬁ
EHETT & T -

(2) 9% §Aqd wew, S AT 24 & I9EW (1) F ST G9A
F FE B F IY B AW, & 5 & G I [ed g 99
& 50% B T MENG U3 F O o /o6 AT EFRr A
- .
Ty @ B AR oRi/ael 9rg 3 & S dod a4 24 @

()%eﬁﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁ(&waﬂw , @ @ JUERT {1) & T (2)
maﬁ?ﬁmﬁmmwwﬁm”

FEAG-IH
T R O R e (SRR 3 3a awr we) sfafvam, 1952
Hae
Tt st S swqa‘arwﬁmm( P ® I T W) S,

HE 11 79 1952 -
5 2 o wengy 1952 F. FET o avemg A Y T R e T R, o 2 w«m (1)
§ g odfw A PR F WA W IR CaIE a9 s 1@ R e

am 4 A o-gw sfufER @ a7 4 F, JuEw (3) ¥ 9= ‘aW R T &
‘ s v anE SO BAT /Od THE RS ‘



BAY YT IR 6L, 05 A, 2010 3

i ,
' HAG-TX
e s A (B, S A bt Swea) o, 1981 F Hete

10-T@T R T (3, W S gE SuE) ofum, 1981 i SR
wfafam H= 14

a3 w9 1981 % arq
() Swurg (1) ¥ 9= (O R BW B WA W IR U@ 3w g

Zom 9" 7@ R S |
(@)ww()ﬁﬁ"aﬂww”%wwm“m
R 5" T Y A

v faum Tosd & mwwmﬁmwwaﬁm%ﬁ? wh, JaF @@ I
g@gﬁmeﬁmﬁmngwwﬁmwnIMHWUﬁmm%q@ﬁ
qﬁ;ﬁg@mr@awu’ﬁﬁmmwa%wﬁwmmmm(ﬁmw
Syafat o dom) sfafEE, 1980 ITH MW oY Ram Toew (oRmEd 3 ¥ aw W)
v, 1952 @ FOx e 9 (3aA, W ofR weet Swend) sifufem, 1981 @ HaNET B
o R woaw & wedl GF Rl aw e § G, Gee o o ge-gad @
gt o T P 3 e Prefert 8 ) for ard w9 & 9 6

Qfmmmw%ﬁsmﬁmm%ﬁwﬁmwm%qﬁm
ﬁ%ﬁ%ﬁﬁwﬁaﬁ*mmaﬁmwmmnﬁmﬁ%wﬁg&

i Ry e w2 ﬁswwao%maﬁﬁmﬁm%mm%wm
aﬁrwmﬁ%qﬁm%mmﬁmﬁmﬁmmmmﬁw-ml

Wwﬁm@%mmm@?'mmﬁg@—gﬁm Ry (deie)
A, 2010 qrena R o 8 '

s W,
|l |

No. 397(2YLXXIX-V-1- 10-1(ka)-10-2010
Dated Lu(_knmr Mareh 03, 2010

IN pursuance of the pmvnsaous of c]ause (3} of Aricle 348 of the Constitution, thc Govemor is
piedecd to order the publication of the following English u: anslation of the Utiar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan
.'Mandal Sadasva Aur Adhikari tatha ‘Mantri Sukli-Suvidha Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010 (Uttar
Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 9 of 2010) as pa'_:scd by the Uttar Pradesh Legisiature and assented to by the



TER gel IMERY vate, 05 #rd, 2010

Shan ttle

Amendment of
section 3 of U.P.
Act no. 23 of 1980

Amendment of
section 4

Amendmen of
section 15-A

Amendment of -
section |8-A

Amendment of
section 24

Amendment of
section 26-A

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND OFFICERS AND
MINISTERS AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2010
(U.P. ACTNGC. 9 0F 2010)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh 1, egistaiure]

AN

ACT
Surther to amend the Uttar Pradesh Stare Legislature (Members' Emoluments and
Pension) Act, 1980 und the Uttar Pradesh Sraie Legistature (Officers Salaries ang

Allowances) Act, 1932 and the Utiur Pradesh Minisiers (Saluries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981,

IT1S HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-first Year of Republic of India as follows :-

CHAPTER-I]
 Preliminary
1. This Act may be called the Utlar Pradesh State Legislature Members ‘and
Officers and Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act. 2010,
CHAPTER-IL _
Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Mcmbers’ Emoluments and
Pensmn) Act, 1980

- In secuon, 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members’” Emoluments
and Penslon) Act, 1980. her einafter referred to in his chapter as the principal Act. in
sub-section (1) for the words “three thousand rupees” the words “eight thousand
rupees” shall be subsritured.

3. In section 4 of the principal Act for the words “fifieen thousand rupees” the
words “twenty two thousand rupees” shall be substituted. )

4. In-séction 15-A of the principal, Act for the words “six ihousand rupees”
the words " ‘ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted. '

5. In section 18-A of the prmc:lpa.] Act in clause (a) for the words “six
thousand rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees’ shall be substitured:.

6. [n section 24 of the principal Act..in sub.—sectﬂi?@u (1).-

“f{a} for the words “six theusand rupees” the words “sevem: thousand
'mﬁees” shall be substituted;,.
fb) for the words.“five hundred rupees™ appearing; in the first pmvisd.
the words "“seven thousand: mapees™ shall be: swbs:fi!me
7. F or section 26-A. of the prncipal Act. the followmg section shall be
substitwred, - -

“26-A (1) lfas'm'mg member. dics dhring the tenure of his or her

family ~ office. the spouse of such mwmber shall be cmitled‘

Pension 10 a family pemsion equal 1o 50% pension -ptherwise”
admlwble to the deceased member at lhc time Qf death, for the I:fe—ume c»f
‘such spouse. ‘

(2) i an ex-member. who is eniitled to a pension under
sub-section (1) of section 24, dies. the spouse of such ex-member shall be
cnutled to -a family pension equal to 50% of pension of such
cx-member at the time of death. for the life-ime of such spouse:

Provided that if the spouse is entitled to a salary under section 3 or a pension
undu- sub-section (1) of section 24 she/he will ‘not be entitled to receive famtly
pension under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2).



JER WY IRV SIS, 05 i, 2010

(]

CHAPTIER-I

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers’ Safarics and
Allowances) Act, 1952

g In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Siatc Legislature (Officers Salaries and  Amendment of
seetian 2 of ULP.
Actno, [ 1ol
1952

Allowances) Act, 1952, hereinafter referred o in this chapter as the principal Act. in
sub-section {1) for the words “five thousand rupces” the words “twelve thousand

rupces” shall be substituted.
‘9. In section 4 of the principal Act. in sub-section (3) for the words “ten Amendmentof
thousand rupees” the words “fifieen thousand rupces” shall be substituted. section d

CHAPTER-IV

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981

10. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and Amendmen of

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981~ seetion 3 of UP
Act no. 14 of

(a) in sub-seciion (1) for the words “five thousand rupees” the words 198!
“twelve thousand rupees” shall be substituted; )

{b) in sub-section (2) for the words “four thousand rupees” the words
“ten thousand rupces” shall be substituied.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The pay. allowances. pension and other amenities admissible to the members and officers of the
State Legislature and 1o the ministers have not been revised for a quite some time. In view of the price rise
and escalation in cost of living it has been decided to revise the same so that they may serve the cause of
their constituency in a meaningful manner by amending the Uttar Pradesh State Legislawre {(Members’
Emoluments and Pension) Act. 1980. the Uttar Pradesh Statc Legislaiure (Officers Salaries and
Allbwanccs) Acl. 1952 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries. Allowances and Miscellaneous

Provisions) Act. 1981.

It has been cxperienced that the spouses of deceased members and ex-members of legislature have
been facing hardship and have been living in penury.'In difference to the dignity of ofﬁcé which they have.
held it has also been decided to provide for making, in the aforesaid Act of 1980, provision for family

)

pension to the spouse of the deceased members and gx-members of the State Legislature,

The Uttar Pradesh’ State Legislature Members and Officers and Ministers Amenitics Taws
(Amendment) Bill. 2010 is.introduced accordingly.
By order,

2V KUSHWALA
Sachiv.

qorgog0d0-q0 fo-1176 W—_(%Q)—'m10—(2497)—597—(3?“?10—21'/aimﬁ‘c.')l
SiocEoa0d0-t0 $0-237 |0 Rarli-2010-(2498)-850(F0-& /aTHHE) |



FH-HEAT-191 R FaR—HoTHoo / Tefo—

S&cjo / THiotlo—91 / 2014—16
AU g URE Y FUIEA YT

faurft aRfRre
. AMT—1, @vs ($)
(SR = frf+aw)
aETS, YHAR, 16 Riawr, 2016
HIGUG 25, 1938 P T

IR WY ANA
faemdY srrT—1

=T 1401 / 79-fd-1—16-1(®F)-22-2016
T, 16 iR, 2016

JAfERgET

fafae
‘AT B R $ R 200 % 9N TUU WerRd A S SR HAl (A9, waw
AR st Iue) (Wite) ol 2016 W RAi% 14 RieR, 2016 W AR R A AR T@
ST SR SRR W 22 WY 2016 3 BU § wEAmROr B gEH 39 ARGE gR SERa
R e 2 |
IR gee W= (J5, A SIR Hiet Jus) (W) sifafrm, 2016
(IR Ry e der 22 |9 2016)
[Srr Se) Ry e o @ aiia ga]
IR A W= (I, s AR wPict Jueey) i, 1981 @ SERR
HMYT FA B

AfafEg
AR TR $ ge9ed ay § FefaRea sifafaw sAmr o @ -

1-78 SfFrEE SeR sRw @6 (A, wor o weel oue) (delw) R Tm
=, 2016 Fer SR

400_RPH_2016



IR WS FERY Twie, 16 FAdWy, 2016

qRT 2
e

a3 #
GEICE

aRT 4 H
L

a1 5 &
BEIDE

23X W39 N (I, W ol mert Syse) offufem, 1981 R
qagusErq o AR e T R, #oaRy 2 #-
(%) @8 (%)  gxaq Frefifea @vs =1 Rem s, erq -
“(F-1) ‘FEEEA’ B A I R B g § 21
(@) @ve (1) & &M W el @8 1@ & ST, o -
“(m) ‘ofER’ F ared genE @ Rl = @ d6 7 sEd
oy @ S oo, T, N, R, A oo @ we1 & ¥ o W@
gerE a1 B B e & ol 37 o e enf¥a &
(1) &ve (3) & =M W Frefaied @vs @ Rar S@m, ofg -
“() FHY @ o IR RY FER B APORTE & (6
T ¥ ¥ R o oria T Wl (WEd weR), T A el
39 0 3 I A o ¥
37w M a3 7 Sww (1) oK (2) F W W i
39 URE @ & AR, o -
(1) e, g% =, T FR (@ TR) ok T W e
el ¥ oM e s E9e SR A F 30T & s e |
(2) vd% SU WA orwel weEly # emEe YdE FR @9 S
H $ G B EHAL SN
47 e @ a7 4 3 wE | e @ @ S,
3l -
“4-(1) el AR o T o Rl # e SR 3
ugerq U RA @ ol 3 R weme A Fam-em @, Rl @
T R fae, S 3 ewER o, R R Aeets & orgEr
TR o R gafor AR e fear s
(2) stet gemsst ar feedt w0 A Sua (1) $ TR e ®|m
F e 7 B A, A g8 IR I F AH H ITAT 7 B, T8
% -
(%) gemmsd, N, T W (W 9R) o) T wE @
Reft & o woR 0@ ofy #m; &R
(@) 3wt &t Rafy &, o TR TR A AW,
P T W AR AWl G B EHER S
(3) R Ry 3 R @ g @ o Y W e,
P FLHA A, TF TFR 3 T T Q@ SR T T
Preiita 63 oI @ifvs R @ gam ) st Rear smem
s-q e @ g 5 ¥, SWRT (1) $ @ W FrEiiied e
@ & TR, e -
“(1) g AR 5% @ @ AT @Rl ¥ e & AR
TH R X T 3 R S B oEen & N P w1 R
IO TN T W5 A I T R S e e s



IR UC IFEN Toie, 16 Ryamas, 2016

6~ SAFFH Al 477 6 H,- g% 6 F
(®) v (1) & @ W Preffed Swg @ & o, S
“(1) rerst R % Wl oW wWE el d aeE @

Y A (T, §9E A1 a1y AT EW) B E e 3g 9w R

30 W W AR S o W, I BT A o, amr w8l geat

9 F THAR e |

(@) uamr (2) # Fewr Rar s

(1) SwErr (3) SR (4) B WA W FERfed SRy @ &
ﬁﬁ‘ﬁ,aqu:—

(3) g o wdF T -
(F) T 789 FE F TEEH TGS § T S gEd

e @F § qeTe & 68 9o 6§ §6e § ok

(@) 9= @ FE | @S § TGS 3 a6 AW THE

Fram &= 0% qE1 H S He A,

I A R o ufER @ weRl 3 Y ok o

9 IRAR & weA # aRaeT @ ol aEn-er & s At

(4) S (1) & (3) 7 orafde f5elt @@ 3 a7 gw
et @ B Al w a5 F Aids A\t T @ T g @R
H [ o TE A B e B R AR A qon @1F 96
B
7-911 7, 8, 9, 10, 11 3R 12 % WM W fr=ffed ard @ § 9w 7,8,9,10,
A, oty - : 11 T 12 &
“7- gEEd AR SAE W AT W wdEl B aT B dew § S0

F T ARt & AW R R @ e R @ e R Ren

TG TR G AHE afbe e, i & ar o= Ram @8 &

TERT FA H EHA B |

8-Terl W 5% wAl ol SEP AR F TR TH WX G
HYWE el § e e, 39 Rrerl @ oER o Rt R
7, fafee, aReat iR SR & SRR 2|

9-frg Raiw & B afka e @ @5t a7 @ @ 7 ® o
2, 38 e d sigia B eidm ok $E T siftgET §w o &

e @ Bt [ g8 3§ Reie & g o W5 e @ @ @
T

10- gerEll afed @5 ool wEl & dRm, P Y 98 3w
AR o oeRa e B, qems @ B 3 w0 F o wtal & B
P13 gier 1 AR a1 GREEE 3 R P den T8 $6)

11- gerEl A 5% S o Fuiedid @ a1 9RYg W e @
IR WY T fum ved (weEl @ Suahdar ofiv dem) eifufem,
1980 F URT 4,9,18 IR HAY-AC & AGT Iq@=d Al H IUA
FIAT W ’

12-gemsh ar #ig W=, Rl e, A 0, s A o gieed
Fl, fre 78 e B, Tiodr 1 9@ Rl AT @ AT 56 ol &
fefaa rwom aRT T wET
I Q| #E @ S uEr R R wwE el wwe @ e R

ST & B 1

-



4 IR URY IMHRY Tuie, 16 fHAwR, 2016
IR I FR

T B A 36 OF Ol B agd o { gAdeer T R e 8 ov: el
¥ Ol o e A 3 g § gfe & afe @ gu 9w R fer mn ¥ R S
weo W (A, T ol st ouers) ofifEm, 1981 F M B WA F FHACT B I
o T ST Jueed 7 FU AN A ReRy § o SR W B GTORE o o)

© qer W A gen @ ol & oo 96 0t Rt e @ R & e
ST A STEfed Red 9N & R g9 afafrem § e @ S

TEPER e Ry A (3, s R gt gue) (W) Rdes, 2016 g
fepar smar B

3T 9,
~ e qied |
No. 1401 2YLXXIX-V-1-16-1 (ka)-22-2016
Dated Lucknow, September 16, 2016

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Praesh Mantri
(Vetan, Bhatta Aur Prakirna Upbandh) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2016 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya
22 of 2016) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on
September 14, 2016.

THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS ) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2016
' [U.P. Act No. 22 of 2016]

(As pass‘ed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature)
AN

ACT
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.

IT 1S HEREBY enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as

follows :-

Short title 1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances
and Miscellaneous Provisions)(Amendment) Act, 2016.

Amendment of 2. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and

s Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act, in
section 2,-

(a) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

"(a-1) 'Chief Minister’ means the Chief Minister of Uttar Pradesh;"
(b) for clause (c) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

"(c) 'family’ in relation to Chief Minister or a Minister means his
or her spouse, son, daughter, father, mother, brother or sister residing
with and wholly dependent on such Chief Minister or Minister;"

(¢) for clause (e) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

"(e) 'Minister' means a member of the Council of Ministers of the
Government of Uttar Pradesh and includes the Minister of State
(Independent Charge), Minister of State and a Deputy Minister of that
State."

400_RPH_2016



IR WY IMERY Toe, 16 fuawy, 2016

3. In section 3 of the principal Act, for sub-sections (1) and (2) the following Am-?ﬂdmmt of
sub-sections shall be substituted, namely :- section 3

"(1) The Chief Minister, every Minister, Minister of State (Independent
Charge) and Minister of State shall be entitled, throughout the term of his
office, to a salary of forty thousand rupees per month.

(2) Every Deputy Minister shall be entitled, throughout the term of his
office, to a salary of thirty five thousand rupees per month."

4. For section 4 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be Amendmentof
substituted, namely :- section 4
"4. (1) The Chief Minister and each Minister shall be entitled, without
payment of any rent to the use, throughout the term of his office and for a
period of fifteen days thereafter, of a residence at Lucknow which shall be
furnished and maintained at public expense at the prescribed scale. '
(2) Where the Chief Minister or a Minister has not been provided with a
residence in accordance with sub-section (1) or does not avail of the benefit of
the said sub-section, he shall be entitled to a compensatory allowance at the
rate of -
(a) ten thousand rupees per month in the case of the Chief
Minister, a Minister, a Minister of State (Independent Charge) and a
Minister of State;
-(b) eight thousand rupees per month in the case of a Deputy
Minister.
(3) A Government residence shall be allotted to a former Chief Minister
of Uttar Pradesh, at his/her request, for his/her life time, on payment of such
rent as may be determined from time to time by the Estate Department of the
State Government."
5. In section 5 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1) the following Amendment of

sub-section shall be substituted, namely :- fpction 5

"(1) The Chief Minister and each Minister shall, throughout the term of

his office, be provided with a chauffeur driven motor vehicle which shall be

purchased and maintained at the public expense in accordance with the rules

made in that behalf."

6. In section 6 of the principal Act- Amendment of
(a) for sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be substituted, fpetions

namely :-

"(1) The Chief Minister and each Minister shall be entitled for
journeys (whether by land, sea or air) performed with in connection with
the discharge of his official duties to travelling allowance and out of

" pocket expenses for himself at such rate and upon such conditions as
may be prescribed."
(b) sub-section (2) shall be omitted.
(c) for sub-sections (3) and (4) the following sub-sections
shall be substituted, namely :-

"(3) The Chief Minister and each Minister shall be
entitled to travelling allowance for himself and the members
of his family and for the transport of his and his family's
effects -

(a) in respect of the journey to Lucknow from his
usual place of residence outside Lucknow for the
purpose of assuming office; and

(b) in respect of the journey from Lucknow to
his usual place of residence outside Lucknow on
relinquishing office.



IR Y IEYR0 Toe, 16 faamx, 2016

Amendment of
sections 7, 8,9,
10, 11 and 12

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1) to (3), no
travelling allowance shall be payable to the Chief Minister or any Minister in
respect of journeys performed in the Motor vehicle referred to in section 5 or
any other vehicle belonging to the State Government.”

7. For sections 7, 8,9, 10, 11 and 12 the following sections shall be substituted,

namely :-

"7. The Chief Minister and every Minister shall be entitled to the use of
the circuit house, inspection house or other rest houses maintained by the State
Government without payment of any rent or electricity charges during the
course of journey performed in connection with the discharge of his official
duties.

8. The Chief Minister or every Minister and the members of the family
thereof shall be entitled, free of charge, to accommodation in hospitals
maintained by the State Government and to medical attendance and treatment in
accordance with such principles as may be prescribed.

9. The date on which any person became or ceased to be the Chief
Minister or a Minister shall be notified in the Gazette and any such notification
shall be conclusive evidence of the fact that he became, or ceased to be the
Chief Minister or a Minister, on that date.

10. No Minister including the Chief Minister shall during the tenure of
his office for which he draws his salary and allowance, practice any profession
or engage in any trade or undertake for remuneration any employment other
than his duties as Chief Minister or Minister.

11. The Chief Minister or every Minister who is a member of the
Assembly or Council, as the case may be, shall continue to enjoy the benefits
available to him under sections 4, 9, 18 and Chapter VIII of the Uttar Pradesh
State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1930.

12. The Chief Minister or a Minister may, at any time , relinquish the
whole or any part of the salary, allowance or other facilities to which he is
entitled by making a written declaration to that effect :

Provided that any such relinquishment may likewise be cancelled by him at

any time with prospective effect.”

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The pay and allowances of Ministers have not been revised for a quite sometime. In view of the
price rise and escalation in cost of living, it has been decided to revise the pay and compensatory
allowance, in case of a residence not being made available, by amending the Uttar Pradesh Ministers
(Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.

In view of the security requirements of the former Chief Ministers, it has also been decided to
provide for allotment of official residence to them in the aforesaid Act.

The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment)
Bill, 2016 is introduced accordingly.

By order,
RANG NATH PANDEY,
Pramukh Sachiv.

fomog0dio-u0dio 400 TeT-(RRw)-2016-(957)-599 Sftri-(FEX /& /AHae) |
dowwogodto-codto 94 |0 Farii-19-09-2016-(958)-300 Sl (FIX /A /L) |

400_RPH_2016



PH-ET-261 IR TFR—THoTHolo / Telo
Secjo / Totflo—91 / 201416

AFHH T URT V€ FAIA ¥

QU T9E, ITR He9T
wﬁaﬁuwu:mw@m |
fremt TRt

A1, @vE (@)

(SR < 3rfefram)
AGTS, Yhar, 27 fawER, 2019
' " Uiy 6, 1941 WS WHY

IR U WEA

faermil argwTT—1

& 2243/79-fa-1-19-1(F)-16-18
TGS, 27 TR, 2019
FfORyET . 7
fafaa :
‘AR B HEAUE F ST 200 B AEE ToUd WerRd ¥ IR SRw A (3, W
A it SuseE) (deem) fRdEs, 2019 RrEd M oRAM-1 AERE w9 @ i B, ©
Refi® 26 R, 2019 # swfy wam & ol 98 I Ry wfFEw der 19 § 2019 3
Y A FEEERY G 56 SR g i R e )

I Jowt welt (I, e o st Iuese) (G s, 2019
(I mew srfefm @ 19 99 2019)
[ SRR Wi M Avew s wRa gan)
Wﬁﬂ#ﬁﬁ(&ﬂﬂ,waﬁfmm)aw, 1981 & SR
g w9 # ford -

. IRT TRAY % qwd af § Pefiee oftftem ssRr e g - :
1-(1) 75 IRfEE SO S| = (I, T AR T Juge) oW T SR
(visthe) afferm, 2019 % A S e

(2) 78 6 T, 2019 ' YgwT G TAL AR

490_RPH_Data 4e Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019)




2 TR Y3Y MR e, 27 fam=s, 2019

Wa]fbﬁqqm' S ma R (@, W ol et gue) ofifem, 1081 @
Va3 8, Sue (3) P @ o

14 7 1981 &

4R 3 W HIEA o o

Fro o 3-(1) SwR Ry W (@9, W R g@el guee) SRR

_m (disirerT) oy, 2019, TAEERT P fem S 2 ) FERy T

5 G 2019
(2) T8 e & o gu A gwaw (1) # FRw sremy
2 7y d9fE gw ofifem B ouwddl 3 o @ A wd A
@ T g e, 3@ iR g aw ddife gw e &
wwﬁmﬁ%a@q@maﬁmﬁmmmﬁ%
aﬁﬁw%mamﬁwwﬁﬁmal

. o Wy § (@, W R gt guen) oftfrem, 1981 (SRR W sfufem
HEAT 14 T 1981), IR WA T4 F TR ¥ I, q@ AN I gRwet § weiRe Ay @
A T Helfed &0 & o ofefafe B mr 21 o9 oftfem @ oo 3 &t s (3)
7E IUE ¢ T v W, U9 wel a9 W % 3, oo Mg oTaed @ wafe Reh
Ry & ord9 O 30 W W7 & § aflm o oft W W, T @R g g [
AW | G EET TGN, T &, I A # R & 99 97 97 TeE TRE &7
e o B, 3R I ST A e & PN & & g SaEd 21 3EF R,
TR HEHA @ AR B PR Red 35 99 § T §ER g0 B oS W@ 9 99
Rrer 98 Rftsga B mr @ % 9 3 & g (3) @ s 3 fou ow ofifem #
Hee [ o, Rred [ gw S SR AT R @ SeEiee e T A g

i g R qeew w9 F T8 o ol ow Ry @ @ F0 % R g R
P # T s f, U T BN SRR W W (e, 9w ol st Swe)
(HeMeF) orRE, 2019 (I ST ﬂmﬁﬂmswzow)ﬁaﬁosw 2019 I SEA
T )

2meq‘=ﬁ(aﬂﬂ I ST FHT IuE) (Hsﬁaﬂ)ﬁﬂms 2019, l{ﬂ?ﬁ
amﬁsraﬁnﬁm{ﬁamﬁ%%qg?wﬁaﬁmm%i

- 3T |,
S0 di0 fE-1,
S c I

490_RPH_Data 4e Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019)




WWWW 27 fegwm, 2019

No, 2243(2)/LXXIX-V-1-19- 1(ka)-16-19 .
Dated Lucknow, December 27, 2019

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is

pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Mantri (Vetan, Bhatta Aur
Prakirma Upbandh) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2019 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 19 of 2019) as
passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on December 26 2019. The

Gopan Anubhag-1 is administratively concerned with the said Adhiniyam.

. THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS} (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2019

(U.P. Act no. 19 0f 2019)
[4s passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature Assembiy)

AN
ACT
Surther to amend the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981,

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of India as

follows —

. (O Thls Act may be called the Unar Pradesh Mlmsters (Salaries,

A]lowances and Mlscellaneous Provisions) (Amendmem) Act, 2019,
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on November 6, 2019.-

2. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers «(Salaries, Allowances and

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 sub-section (3) shall be omirted.

U.P. Ordinance 3. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
no. 5 of 2019 Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2019 is hereby

repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the
Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
done or taken under the corresponding provisions of the principal Act as
amended by-this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all

material times.

194_RPH_Data 4 Vidhaika Folder (Adhiniyam_2019)

Short title and

commencement

Amendment of
section 3 of U.P.
Actno. 14 of
1981

Repeal and

saving




IR m ammw e, 27 ﬁ'ﬂ'@'\' 2019
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries,'Al]owances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981

(U.P. Act no. 14 of 1981) has been enacted to consolidate and amend the law relating to-the salaries,
allowances and other facilities to the Ministers of the State of the Uttar Pradesh. Sub-section (3) of section
3 of the said Act provides that the salaries of every Minister, Minister of State and Deputy Minister shall
be exclusive of tax payable of such salaries (including perquisites) under any law relating to income tax for
the time being in force, and such tax shall be borne by the Staie Government. Since the income tax is being
paid by every citizen in the State who comes under the ambit of income tax law, the said Ministers shall
also be responsible for the payment of income tax, Besides the payment of the income tax of the said
~ Ministers was being paid by the State Government for the last 35 years. After due consideration it has been
decided to amend the said Act to omit the said sub-section (3) of section 3, so as to make the said Ministers

to take there responsibility of payment of income tax themselves.

Since the State Leglslature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to
imp]ement the said decision, the Ustar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous
Provisions) {Amendment) Ordinance, 2019 (U.P. Ordinance No. 5 of 2019) was promulgated by the
Governor on November 6, 2019. ' : :

2. The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions)
(Amendment) Bill, 2019 is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance.

By order,
J.P. SINGH-II,
Pramukh Sachiv.

Iﬁowoq\ptﬁo—({otﬁo 490 IoTTA—(fEwe)~2019—{(1241)—599 yfcrai~ (?50./ &0 / ATERT) |
Govaogofio—godto 105 w0 fawTd—2019—(1242)—300 Whr—(T0 / o / ATHRT) |

490_RPH_Data 4e Vidhaika Folder { Adhinivam_2019)




I THER—RioUHoYTo / To
. $=go / Tlolo—91 / 2014—16

I o Oe G2 T

faurdt aRfdree
A—-1, G (P) ’
(SR maw arfdfras)
s . -GS, AR, 31 3, 2020
' ATEIT 9, 1942 U W )
9&R uow W
faEmdy arpATT—

AT 1564 / 79-14-1-20-1(a)-16-20
TG, 31 FAKI, 2020

—————

fafae

ARG BT AR B AT 200 B WA wouwre WEET A IaR wRw HA Qe
WmWW)(W)ﬁm,zozomﬁWW—1mﬁmmﬁmﬁﬁ
%,wﬁw@zém,zozoﬁaw%maﬁﬁv%wﬁwa&ﬁm@wm
2020 B ®Y H FEEERYT P GEee 59 ARG R yHRE e oer 2

SR J& A (3, T oM el guse) (dee)
. , 2020
(SR w2 fdfraw wem 13 w9 2020)
[t SR R ReF Tvsq g g gan _
SR JR9 A= (3, s ol st Juse) fufvE, 1981 @ amRR
geeT F B R |
' SIGERE

ARG TR % Sweaed av § Prafifm oftes sy o & - |

1-1) 7 oftfem SwT My B @, w6 ot wet oye) W o
(Wsire) sifRfEm, 2020 = ) e

(2) 5 afFeEm B R 3 @1 Suer, T ¥ wElRE B A 3 R
8§ IR A SN A S R 1 ol 2020 ¥ va gm @

‘ 189 RPH 2020 (Mantri vetan Bhatta) (Adhiniyam) de - .



2 . SR TS ST e, 31 37T, 2020

s 2-3a¥ wow H:l (3, s ol el oyeea) eftfREm, 1981 R o
134[23'”1$ﬁ T o wE A, B e 3, aqam()ﬁ%ﬂﬁff@?rwaﬁwﬁm
g 3 8§ Al mm
“qg Fe Fr gEr, sOw T, Wﬁ(mﬂw)aﬁrmqsﬁ‘
o SN, 2020 ¥ HE HE, 2021 % HHAE €I @, Frafert &= sl qe
e S % A A S B R e e

AT 4 1 Heler 370 iR B r 4 7 gear (3) P & TR
- FrEm el 4-(1) FOX Wy W (AW, @ & et ) amq%:n_ -
i (qisiem) STy, 2020 ToGET FRfe fhe o ¥ | j::;f

() 23 Freew & % gu @ s (1) ¥ Fffe sy
mwﬁsﬁfﬁaﬁmﬁm%mﬁf%wﬁ?a@ﬁﬁémm
& T B Fad, ga ofatEm gw an ata g e @
wmﬁm&ﬁ%mﬁa@mﬁnﬁmmﬁsﬂ
Sffrm & oudy w0 WEw w8 R 4

TR A FR

 Sw RE W (3, wﬁmwra)aﬁﬁm 1981 (mn%xaﬁérﬁw
e 14 WY 1981), IO WY T B A ¥ A, 7 i o gRwel § W Bl &
aﬂmwmﬁfﬁamﬁ%maﬁﬁuﬁaﬁww%mma&mnﬁw()ﬁ
%W&%%g@ﬁ,mﬁ,wﬁ(wm)eﬁrwﬁmmﬁ
_W-aﬁﬁﬂwwnﬁm%%ﬂéwéﬁlw'ﬁﬂmﬁaﬁﬁsﬂgma
o= A o RO RRMRE @ gen @R g T WER & T T PR HEe
Wﬂmmmaw%lmﬁﬁﬂmwhﬁmmwﬁaumaﬁ:mmu)éf
S F@ 78 I9E fea om f ge W6, e R, o W (@ TAR) R T
qE o, 2020 ¥ AR A, 2021 TF SAE W9 4, Prafed @3 W g dfdE b/ @
T AT s & R s g

@m%mmwﬁﬁm@?mﬁﬁﬁwﬁmm%mgﬁﬁm
TS @ o omavEs o, of T BN Red 11 98, 2020 I I SR A (3,
e AR T SueeH) (Hefe) SR, 2020 (T RN AR HEM 4 T 2020) @ AT
mfmn | | |

zammqa%aaﬁaﬂﬁma%m4a%aqum()ﬁaaawra%ﬁﬁwn%ar%
Mﬁg@ﬁﬁma@awaﬁmﬁ,ﬁém,m,wwiwm

189 RPH 2020 (Mantri vetan Bhatta} (Adhiniyam) 4¢

— | |




WWWW,31GW,2020» | 3l

oI &0 gRe-g9d W SEURd B o A A R @ g X didfed fhar st

R 710 goae e 3 Re @i () WeT-864 9 2016 (o1 6RE, &% FEl W IR

ﬁmwam)ﬁwaﬁﬁmaﬁw4qﬁm&m(3)aﬁﬁmwﬁm%|3ﬁ§ﬁ%€wr@ﬁ
mmﬁw4ﬁwm()ﬁmwmﬁa%a

_ 3@@81’{6«1?9&37%11 (3, W R wEe Juer) (Haﬁaﬁ)ﬁéms 2020, ITRT -
mwﬁar@rnﬁwﬁﬁmaﬁmaﬁﬁmﬁwgwmﬁwﬁﬂﬁﬁﬁm%mg@mﬁ
Rt STr 1 '

=T 4,
Stio o Rz,
W Hfed |
No. 1564(2)/LXXIX-V-1-20-1(ka)-16-20
Dated Lucknow, August 31, 2020

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Manri (Vetan,
Bhatta Aur Prakirna Upbandh) (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2020 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 13 of
2020) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on August 28, 2020.
The Gopan Anubhag-1, is administratively concerned with the said Adhiniyam.-

THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND
MISCELLANEQUS PROVISIONS) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020

(U.P. Act No. 13 OF 2020) _
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]

AN.
ACT

ﬁrther to amend the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances
and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.

IT 1S HEREBY enacted in the Seventy Flrst Year of the Republlc of India
as follows :— ‘

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Short title and
Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Act, 2020. commencement

(2) The provision of section 3 of this Act shall come into force with
effect from the date of its publication in the Gazeife and remaining provisions
shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from April 1,2020.

2. In sub-section (1) of section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers AmF“dglﬂf;iljnp_
(Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 hereinafter ;“;’,"1?3 1;)0{' '
referred to as the principal Act, the following proviso shall be inserted 1981

namely -

. "Provided that the Chief Minister, every Minister, Minister of State
(Independent Charge) and Minister of State shall be, from April, 2020 to
March, 2021, entitied to only Seventy percent of the salary, Constituency
Allowance and Secretarial Allowance payable to them per month." -

189 RPH 2020 (Mantri vetan Bhatta) (Adhiniyam) 4e




/
s
4 IR m SRTHRY THE, ‘31 ST, 2020
Am?"d:’e“‘ of " 3. Insection 4 of the principal Act, sub-section (3) shall be omitted.
section
Repeal and saving . * 4. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, UP Ordinance

. : . no. 4 of 2020
Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment)

Ordinance, 2020 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any
action taken under the provisions of the principal Act as
amended by the Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall
be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding
provisions of the principal' Act as amended by this Act as if the
provisions of this Act were in force at all material times.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Uttar Pradesh Ministers {Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act,
1981 (U.P. Act no. 14 of 1981) has been enacted to consolidate and amend the law relating to the
salaries, allowances and other facilities to the Ministers of the State of the Uttar Pradesh. Sub-
section (1) of section 3 of the said Act provides that the Chief Minister, every Minister, Minister
of State (Independent Charge) and Minister of State will be entitled, throughout the term of his
office, to a salary of forty thousand rupees per month. In view of the special circumstances
arising out of the Covid-19 pandemic in the State of Uttar Pradesh, it is very necessary to have
sufficient financial resources available with the State Government. After due consideration, it had
been decided to amend sub-section (1) of section 3 to provide that the Chief Minister, every
Minister, Minister of State (Independent Charge) and Minister of State shall, from April, 2020 to
. March, 2021, be entitled to only seventy percent of the salary, Constituency allowance and
Secretarial allowance payble to them per month.

~ Since the State Legislature was not in session and 1mmed1ate legislative action was
necessary to implement the said decision, the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (U.P. Ordinance No. 4 of 2020) was

- promulgated by the Governor on April 11, 2020. '

2. Further, sub-section (3) of section 4 of the said Act provides that a Government
residence shall be allotted to a former Chief Minister of Uttar Pradesh at his/her request, for
his/her life, on payment of such rent as may be determined from time to time, by the Estate
Department of the State Government. But the Hon'ble Supreme Court, in Writ Petition (C) No.

864 of 2016 (Lok Parahari through its General Secretary Versus The State of Uttar Pradesh and .

others), has struck down the above sub-section 3 of section 4 of the said Act. In view of this, sub-
section (3) of section 4 of the said Act is proposed to be removed.

3. Accordingly, the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous
Provisions) (Amendment) Bill, 2020 is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordmance and to in
corporate the above amendment in the said Act,

'E-fy order,
1. P. SINGH-II,
Pramukh Sachiv.

QoyHogedio—-Todo 189 YYF—2020— (560)—599 Wermi—(Fragex / & / difrde) |
dogwogodio—Todio 147 W10 REMA-2020-(561)-300 FTI—({BgER / Eho / AHTHE) |

189 RPH 2020 {Mantri vetan Bhatta) {Adhiniyam) 4¢

P




