


Tt T A QUMY 8%, 26 AN, 1999 )

e s e g W By
DS o S g g W S SO (i e o B PR S S B o S T g, (0 et ST s G s BT i s G SR SR GRS san G o S PP s ot s i P P BT e B

No. 782 (2)/XVIl-V-1—1 (KA) 15-1999

q Dated} Lucknow, March 26, 1999

é suanoe of tha provisioas of clause (3) of Articl> 343 of the Cox'ntitntiou_of
l' India I{‘hgufrj};:cro:or is pleassd to order tue publication of the follov!ng English
transiation of the Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam (Sansbodhan) Adhiniyam, 1999
(Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 17 of 1999) as passed by the Jttar Pradesh Legiclature
and assented to by the Qovernof on Marca 25, 1999,

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 1999

(U. P. AcT No. 17 oF 1999)
[4s passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
ACT

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959
and  to make consequential amendment in the Uttar Pradesh Urban
Buildings (Regulation of Letting, Rent and Eviction) Act, 1972,

It 1s Heresy enacted in the Fifticth Year of the Republic of India as
follows 1~

CHarrER—I
Preliminary

.1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Short title
(Amend ment) Act, 1999,

CHAPTER—{!
Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959.

2. Insection 173 of the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act,  Amendment of
1959, hereinafter in this chapier referred to as thé principal Act, .‘;cg;onA ‘:13 o;‘
y N ¢ N S . o Be a0.
(a} in sub-section (1), for clause (b) the following clause shall be  of 1959
subdtitutéd; namely :—
» “b) a w{ifg‘f;étk fevidble if areas where water is supplied by
t he Corpotation;”,
(&) in sub-section (2) for the existing proviso the following previso
shall be substitutcd, panely :—

gt g¥ided that the apprégate of the property taxes shall In
no case Be 1&ss tHidh 22 gﬂefc'éntv and not more than 32 percont of
the anfual value of the bililding or land or both ussessed to such
taxés, so however, thit the géheral tax shall not be less than 10
: rcég‘tgﬁd,ﬂ,o‘! more than 15 percent, the water tax shall not be
oss thdn 7.5 petcent and not more than 12.5 percent, the drainage.
tax shall not be less than 2.5 peroént and not more than
5 percent and the Conszrvancy tax shall not be more than 2 percent ,
of the annual valie.” ' >

ay =1

W
£,

3. Section 174 of the principal Act shall be renumbered as sub- Amendthent of
section (1) thereof, and, section 174

) (a) in sub-section (1) as so renumbered, for clause (b) the
1% following clause shall bs subsrituted, namely :—

19 (b inthe case of a building or land not falling within the
g provisions of clause (q), twelve times the value arrived aton
T multiplying the carpet area of the building, or the area of the
o7 land, by the applicablc minimum monthly rate of rent per square

foot of the carpet area in the case of building or the applicable
minimum monthly rate of rent per square foot of the area ip the
case of 1and, as the case ma y be, an. for this purposc the minimom
. monthly rate of rent per square foot shall be such as may be fixed
oh once in cvery two years by the Mukhya Nagar Adhikari on the
besls of the location of the building ot the land, nature of the




TR AN . e el M W W Ly VD G M W Yy S R A S T

Amendmefit of
section 197

IR SN RVARN AT, 26 AT, 1569

— - - - - EE TGy -

construction v the building, the eircic rats fixed by the collector
jor ihe purposes «f the Indian Stamp Aci, 1899 gnd the curreat
mininum rate of remt in the area for .uch building orland aad
such othier tactors, and in such munnpst, a8 may be prescribed <

T ey

Provided that where the anpual value =fany buﬂdigg would,

by reason of exceptional circumsiances, in the opisnion of the

Corporation, be excessive if caleulated in the aforesald manoer,

the Cceivoraticp may fIx the annual velue at anyless mmount
which wppears to it equitable,

Explenation :—For the putpose o calcuiziion of annual value
the car rct area shall be coleulated as under :—~

() Rooms-full measurer-ent of ‘icrnal dimension;

{(ii) Covered  Verandr h-full  mezsurement of infernal
dimensicn;

(i) valeony, Ceortider, Kitchen and Store-50 pereent
measurement of intornal dimension;

{(iv) Garage-one-fourth measurement of intersal dimen-
si13n;

(v) Arez covered by bathroom, latrines, portico and stair
case shali not form part of the carpet area,

Explanction 11 :— The standard rent, the agreed rent or
tiv repgons hle annizl rent of a hudldin: for the purpeses of
the Uttar Pradesi; Urban Buildings (Regulations of Letting,
ent and Eviction) Act, 1972 shall not be taken Into account
while czlculating the annval value of that building.”

() after sub-section (1),2thed following “sub-section shall bs

inserted, namely :—

+(2) where the Corporation so resclves, the apnual value
for the purposeof assessmen: of property taxes shall,—

{a) in the case of land and owner-occupicd residential
building which is not moie than ten years old, be “eemed t.
be 25 percent less and if it is more than ten years but not
more than twenty years old, be deemed to be 32.5 percent less,
and if it s more than twenty years old, be deemed to be
40 percent less than the annual values determined under
clause (p) of sub-section (1);and % - -« -2 FH# 4

() in the case of residential building let on rent, which
is not more than ten years old, be deemed to be 25 per cent
more, and if it is more than ten years but not more than
twenty years old, be deemed to be 12.5pzr cent more than the
annual value determined under clause (b) of sub-section (i),
and if it is more than twenty years old, be deemed to be
equalto the annual valve determined under clause (3) of
sub-section (1).”

C g 2

4, in section 177 of the principal Act,—

(a) for clause (c), the following clause sha\l.l be substirute s,

namely S

“(cy building solely used as jails, court houses, ireasurics
and svhwuis aiid OICyIs Ot Laa such professionmall voes
tional, technical and medical institutions asare not rtun and
manazed by the (iovernment ;"

EANS RASA L ¥ eia =

(®) ir clause (¢)the word <‘agd’ occuringin the end shall be

omitted ;

(¢) after clavse (f), fthe following cleuses shall be imcerri,

namely :—

“(g} any owncr-occupied resiceniial building constructed on
a plot of jand measuring thirty square me€rs, or having 3
caipes aréa upto fiflcen square molers provided tha! the owaer
therec! does ner own any other building in the crty; and.”



IJQATHIN AT N MR, 26 AiH, 1999

7

e ) m At r — — — —— > —- — ——  — A T o Wy o it tmt e ey e A o Ly —eeb ey emd
A ——— —

4 -

(h) owner occupied residential buildings in any arca which
has been included in the city within the last ten years.’

5 1n seciion 179 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), after
clause (c) the follgwing cla::2 shall b fzierred, namely (—
“(q) if the property is let in pussuaase of - ocder uader the
yttar Pradesp Urban Buildings (Regulations off Lettiag, Reqt aad
Eviction) Act, 1272, from the tenaat.”

6. After section 207 of the principal Act, the followiang sect oa shab
be inserted, namely:- -

«207-A. Notwitistanlingany otper provisions of this Act, the

Optios o deposit owner or occupier primariiy liable for pay-
1072 1 3! {

oslf  zssessment went of tax in resp:ct o a  Tesidenital
prop:rty tax building may himscif assess ev:ry ycar his

liability rogarding the amount of property
tax payable Dy him and in doingso he m2y himself ictefmine the
annaal value of the building in accordanc: with the provisions of
clause () of szction 174, and d:posit the propsrty tax so assessed by
him in such man:er, togsther witha statement of such s2lf assess-
m-=nt in such form, as may be prescribzd.”

7. Inscction 211 of the primcipal Act, in sab-seciion (1), for the
words “‘five years™ th2 words ““twp yaars™ shall be substitured,

8. In seciion 221 of the principal Act, insub-ssction (3) after the
words “*description of propsrty”, the words “‘for such poriod as may be
specified in the orcer’ shall be inserted.

9. After section 221 of thaz princip:l Act,thz folihrwin

ns gnall
bo inserted, namely : — % o

T

€221-4. (1) Where the owner or occupier primarily liable for

Taterest payohle ~ PaYyment of tax in respect of apy premisss

DY >Woer &1 ha3 not pid by the date fixed by the Corpo-
occupicr ‘ation in this bshzalf the tax or a part of the

"ax payable by him under this Act, simple
intercs! at the rate of tw.ive per ceat per annum from the date fixed
for payment of taX upto tie date :f paymeut shall be payable by him
upon the amount that has remained unpaid.

(2) Without prejudice to the provisions of sub-section (1), where

the owner or occupier of any premises has paid tax updet

section 207-A on the basis of his own a:sessment and the tax so paid
is found by ths Corporatiog to bs Isss than the amount of tax payable
by him, simple in‘erest at the rate of twelve ps- cont per annum upon
the amount by which the tax ~o paid falls short of the tax which is
found to b: payable, shall be payzhls by him rom :hs date fized by
the Corporation for paymen' of tax upto the date the amount of such
difference is paid.

221-B. {1) Every owner or ocespier priwmarily liable for payment
Suatement of  Of t2xiunrespect of any premises shail submit
carpet afea and 10 the Corporation 2 statement in respect of
area The earpe! ures of the building, or in respect:

of the area of the land, .5 the case mav be, in

v - -+ - y
quch farm and At ench 400 o0y 3 he n-asoribad i ¢13s hokalf
) Ifihe C

insach mannet 4s may be praseri
submitted under sub-section (1) i:
may part of galc caroet 2vea o huiisiny orany nat of the area of the

¢ ma A ha oo e tadt b s .
land, 35}*‘" i m s’b ey ben coaeealed, the Corpoiction sy
impos> & PENANY net axereding ~na v sang rapes” an the dofauli
jn such MANNCT s Ty ¢ pressihe o ig rhis hohalf”

i, satisfied that the statemsant
ractusy incorroct in s much 2s

1n <ection 503 of T it o .o
10, .“H‘SC‘LS ..,,,,.v.,.?‘\t,’.l?,n' meiset Aet ia tlhase (6) for the words,
i raspect o IRT PUOTCTTT e gy er, - 3oaf the property i sush

tax is payabla DY8 Person entivled « o .. 51 e

wrhstituted.

orporation is, on ny enquiry condected in this Sahalf

Amendment of
ssction 179

tasertion  of
a asw section
207-A

Ameadment of
section 211

Amendment of
section 221

33271 0" 1 v
3e3tid¥s 2rl.A
aad 221-B

angzadment ot



- ‘ sotp Ep Al e v @f TR
3 S AT WA QAR AT, 26 WA, 1999

CHAPTER I

Améndment of the Uttar Pradesh Utban Buildings (Régulation of Letting
Rerit and Eviction) Act, 1972 \

Amendment of 1i. Insection 7 of the Uttar Pradesh Urban Buildings (Regulation ef

::lonng. °fl§" g :  Letting, Rent and Eviction) A, 1972 for the words 2nd figures “in

1572 section 179 of the Uttar Pradesh Nagar Mahapaiika Adhiniyam, 1959
(U. P. Act No. II of 1959) orin section 149 or in any rule made or
notification issued under section 338 of the United Provinces Municipalities
Act, 1916 or in section 14 (1) (¢) of the United Provinces Town Areas
Act, 1914 the words and figure “in section 149 of the Uttar Pradesh
Municipalities Act, 1916” shall be substitmed.

By Order,

Y. R. TRIPATHI,

 Prantukh Sachby.
S

Qo Ta0 30 Ao——go Vo 312 AT FATI0-~(2516)~- 1999~=850 {R@ 0} !



No. 119(2)/XVII-V-1.1 (KA)-37-99
Dated Lucknew, Jamuary 12, 2000

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution
of Indis, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the foilowing English

translation of the Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2000 (Uttar
Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 7 of 2000) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Iegislature and
assented to by the Governor on Janaary 11, 2000, .

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2000

(U. P. Act No. 7 or 2000)
. (45 passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
An :
ACT
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959,
IT 1S HEREBY enacted in the Fiftfeth Year of the Republic of [ndis —

as followsj—
Short title and L. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corpo-
commencement ration (Amendment) Act, 2000,

(2) It shall bs deemed to have come fato force on Qotober 1, 1999,




Gy W@

FoT Stw A waz, 12 I43d, 2000

R B P PR i

2. In sedtion 12 of the Uttar Pradssh Municipfaf Oor,pqraiion
Aot, 1959 hereinafier referred to as tho prinoipal Act, for sub-gection(1)
the following su b-section shall be substituted, namely {—

«(1) The Up Nagar Pramakh shall b> eleoted, assoon as my be,
‘after the election of sabhasads has ben comploted, or, as the case
may be, after ths expiry of the term of ofied of Up Nagar Pramykh,"”

3, Ia sestlon 50 of the princ?;ml Act, after _suB-s’action (3 the

following sub-section shall bs inserted, namoly §— v

“%(2-A) Tho State Qovirnmeat shall, in psultation with the
State Elostion Commission, by notifioation published ia ths Olicial

Gazette, appolat date or dates for elsction of the Up Nagar Pramukh

under sectio1 12and call upon the sabhasads to el>ct ths Up Nigat
Pramukh in accordance with the provisions of this Ac:.”

4. The provisions of soction 50 of the principal Act asamended by
_ this Act shall also apply with respect to the election of the Up Nagar -
‘Pramukh, whose office has been vacant, due to the expiry of his term -of

offics, on the date of the commencoment of this Aot ani any ordsr

or nofification issued by the State Elestion Commission ap>ointing date or

-3
T O oty ¥ W s Wl gty -
Awmendament of
sectioa 12
U. P, Aet 1o. 2
of 1959 :

Amendment of
section 50

_Transitory Pro-
-yigl in )

dates for the elaction to fill sych vacancy, shall stand’ ressinied as ifthe

provisions of the principal Act as aminied by this Act wore ia force
atall material times, B

s, (1) Tae Uttar Praizsh Muaivipal Ce’poration (Amenimz-}nt)-

Rzpeal  angd

ordinance, 1999 is hereby repealed. : _ 7 vings
(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any astion taken
under the principal Act as a mended by the orlinance refsarted to in Sub-
seotion (1), shall ba desmed to have been doa® or takea unler- th®
eorresponding provisions of tha prindipal Act as ameaded by thiz Ast, as
if the provisions of this Act wate in force at all matsrial times,
‘ By order,
Y. R. TRIPATHI,
Pramukh Sachiv,
E

feqEngefo-—godro 249 9o FaT0--(1838)~2000-850 (AW )1



. S T ]
NI s

H
|
i
H

Fapen

hed)

6 - ST W SRS TR, 12 3T, 2004

No. 1233 Q)/VII-V-1-1(KA) 27-2004
Dated Lucknow, August 12, 2004
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
Govemor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh N
Nigam (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2004 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 16 of 2004) as passed by
Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on August 11, 2004 :
THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2004
(U.P. ACTNO. 16 OF 2004)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
: ACT ‘
 further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipdl Covporation Act, 1959.

I'rls HEREBY enacted in the Flﬁy-ﬁﬁh Yw of the Repubhc of India as follows

Shotieand (1) This Act may be. called Ihe—Uttar th Mumcxpal Corporation
”"“me”‘ ‘ (Amendment)Act,2004 L ;

(2) It shall be deemed to have come mto force on Novembcr 21 2002.

General 2. Inthe Uttar Prad&sb Municipal Corporatlon Act, 1959, ‘hereinafter referred
Amendmentin masﬁxeprmcqaalAct,jbrmewords“Mm:hyaNagarAdhikan'” “AparMukhyaNagat
U.P.Actno. T '
of 1959 s

i sk

Ameudmentof . @Inwcbonlﬁofﬂ:eprmclpdAct,

e (a) in sub-sechon (14) for ﬁ:e womds “tomther in thc event ofthe ;
.~ motion of non-confidence having 1 beeamed out witha report whether or
ffnotﬂneUpaNagarPiaﬁukhhas is resign _
. -the provisions of sub-section an read with section 19" the words “in the
,eventofﬂxemotxonofnon—conﬁdencebavmgbeencanwd”slnllbe
(b) aﬂer sub-sectlon (14) the followmg sub-sectmn shall be mserted
namely'—

‘/(14-A) (a) the State Government shall, after considering the
report of the Commissioner referred to in sub-section (14) on merits

shall take decision within one month;

(b) in case the non-confidence motion against a Mayor is rejected
by the State Government, no notice of any subsequent motion of
non-confidence in that Mayor shall be received within a period of one
year from the date of such rejection.”

fc)in (u‘usection {15} for the word “two-third” the word “three-rourth”
shatl be sudharineded;



FAR U< IWERYT 7ie, 12 3T, 2004

(d) in sub-section (16) for the word “two-third” the word “three-fourth”
shall be substituted.

5. In section 25 of the principal Act,- : Amendment of
; section 25

(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (d), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely :-

““(d) is in the service of a State Govemment or the Central
Government or any local authority or any undertaking or body owned
or controlled by the State Government or the Central Government or is
a District Government Counsel or an Additional or Assistant District
Govemment Counsel or an Honorary Magistrate or an Honorary Munsif
or an Honorary Assistant Collector™’. '

(b) in sub-section (4), after clause (i) the followmg clauses shall be
inserted, namely :-

“‘(iii) has created an obstacle in a meeting of the Corporation in
such manner that it becomes impossible for the Corporat:on to oonduct
its business in the meeting or instigated sorhe one to do so; or Sl

(iv) has mxsbehaved with any ofﬂcer or employee of the .
Corporation; or

(v) has directly or indirectly caused any loss or damage to any
propcrtyoftheCoxporauonorabets anyoﬂxerpersontocause suchloss B

or damage; or , ; o
(i) is.convicted for an 1 offence whgch, in the oplmon of the State o
Govemment mvolves moral uupttude SRS

6. Insecuon 1320ftheprmcxpalAct, T

i (a)aﬁemm-secuono) thefollowmgsub-secnonshallbemseﬂed» '
- namely:- |

.~

“(3-A)Nooonuact mvolvmganexpendmxreexoeedmg two Iakh |
mpeesmdno;exeeedmgfourlakhmpe&sshallbemadcbythe
Mumcnpal Comnnssxonerunl&ssnthasheen sancuoned bytbeMayor”,

_ (B in sub-sectxon (4), for the words “ﬂve lakh mpm” the woxﬂs
“e:ghtlakhmpew shallbesubstuuted

N (c) in sub-sectmn (5), for the words ﬁﬁy thousand mpees” the words Lo
o “onelakhnw mdjbrthewords “onelakhrupm” tbe words, “two -
(d) aﬁer sub-secuon (6) the following sub-secuon shall be mserted

namely —_ ‘ - -
“(7) The State Govemment may, by notification in the Gazette,
modify _the monetary limits specified in sub-section (3) or
sub-section (4) or sub-section (5) keeping in view the rise in costs or the
excigencies of work and efficiency of Corporations.’’

7. In section 135 of the principal Act,— Amendment of

) section 135
(a) in the marginal heading for words *‘five lakh rupees™ the words
““eight lakh rupees’” shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (1)~

¢ii for the words “‘one lakh rupees™  the words “two lakk
szl e subsinded.




PR

o T e s o S
:

RN

e N M
s =

8 VR U9 INEIROT Toie, 12 3R, 2004

(ii) the proviso shall be omitted.

(¢c) after sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

*‘(1-A) the Mayor may sanction any estimate not exceeding four
lakh rupees.”

Amendment of 8. In section 136 of the principal Act,-
section 136
(a) in the marginal heading for the words ‘‘five lakh rupees”’ the words
“‘eight lakh rupees’” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (1), for the words ‘“‘five lakh rupees” the words
“‘eight lakh rupees’* shall be substituted;

| — (¢) in sub-section (2), in clause (a) for the words “‘ten lakh rupees” the
T s words “‘sixteen lakh rupees*. shall be substituted.

. Amendmentof . ... 9, Ixrsectlon 177 (}fthe prmcrpal Act,-— ‘

£ = (a) for clause (c) the followmg clause shall be substztuted namely —

*(¢) building solely used as schools and Intermediate colleges -
whether aided by the State Government or not;”’

- (b) ﬁér clause (%) the following clause shall be subrtihaed hémely:-

“(h) residential _buildings occupied by the owner of building,

: wlnch is located in such area which has been mcluded in the limit of
G, .~ .. Corporation within five years or the facilities of roads, drmkmgwawr ‘
T, TR ;andstreethghtpmvrdedmtheama,whrcheverrsearlrer” :

10 For sectlon 207 of the prmclpal Act, the followmg sectron shall bc L
sabstituted nmely~ . T ‘ : '

e “207 The Mumcrpal Commrssmner shall cause areawise mntal rates

sJandanasisessment hstmthecl 'orpartﬂlereoftobe
m“““‘h  prepared” from trme ume in‘acco

- manner prescnbed in the Rules

e “207 B (1) For the purposes’ of annual rental value, thc owner or
s Submission of the the occuyier of every house or land shaﬂ submrt :
- details of houses or- '
: mforasscssmt a pm{:;y retum upto ‘a date as’ may be
ot TR Ce 4

- (2):: Any person farlmg to submit the ' retum referred to in
sub-sect:on (1) without proper reasons shall be liable to pay penaity as may
be prescribed.

. /
(3) The penalty referred to in sub-section (2) may/f*be compounded by
the Municipal Commissioner’’.

Substitutionof ' 12. For section 208 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
section 208 substituted, namely:—

“208-The Municipal Commissioner shall publish the list prepared under
Publication  section 207 in accordance with the .nanner prescribed in
of Tist the rules.”



| R YT SRR THE, 12 3TN, 2004

u.p
Ordinance

no.29 of .

2003

U.P.
Ordinance
no. 20 of
2002

U.P.
Ordinance
no. ot

2003

13. For section 209 of the pnncxpal Act the following section
shall be substituted, namely:—

¢209-The Municipal Commissioner or an officer

Objectionson  authorised by him in this behalf shall

Z;?’pﬁssfd rates dispose off the objections’ in- accordance
with the manners prescribed in the rules.”

14. In section 210 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1) the
following sub-section shall be substituted, namely.—~

‘(1) The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised
by him in this behalf, shall authenticate by his signature the
areawise rental rates and the assessment list of the cxty or any part
thereof, as the case may be.”’

15. In section 213 of the principal Act, Jor sub-section (1) for the
words ‘‘The Executive Committee or a sub-committee thereof appomted

in this behalf,’” the words “The Municipal Commissioner or an officer |

authorised by him i m dus behalf ** shall be substttuted

16. For section 214 of the prmclpal Act, the followmg sectlon‘
shall be substituted, namely'- '

*“214-(1) When any bmldmg is constructed or reconstructed i
obligationto - or any addition is made thereto by an owner -

supply - :

informations “or occupier and the covered area exceeds by

for purpose of more than 25 per cent then it shall be -

amendment compulsory for hlm to subxmt lts mformatlon

to the Mumcxpal Oommnssnoner wnhm sxxty days of the date of

completton or date of ocwpat:on whmchever is earher n the.} B

pmcn‘bea form.

(2) The owners or occuplers, who do not submit

~ information referred to in sub-section (1) without proper reasons,
shall be liable to be punished with fine which may extend to an

amount equal to double of the assessed general tax or Rs. 500.00 3

per day of the delay whichever is less. -

(3) The Municipal Comrmssnoner ‘may compound the
proposed penalty under sub-scotlon 2).”

17 (1) The Uttar Pradesh Mumclpal Corporatlon (Amendment)
(Second) Ordinance, 2003 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action.

taken under the provision of the principal Act as amended by Ordinance
referred to -in sub-section (1), or by the Uttar Pradesh Municipal

Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance, 2002 or by the Uttar Pradesh

Municipal Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance, 2003 shall be deemed to
have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions of principal
Act as amended by this Act as if the Act were in force at all material times.

<

Substitution of
section 209

Amendment of
section 210

Amendment of
section 213

Substitution of
section 214

Repeal and
Savings




10 s o IR YR IERY e, 12 IR, 2004

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

With a view to bringing uniformity with other Corporations of the Country in the names of
certain offices of the Municipal Corporation and making the provisions more effective and practicable
in the present situation, the Uttar i'radesh Municipal Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance, 2002 - ‘;
(U. P. Ordinance no. 20 of 2002) and the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation (Amendment) 5
Ordinance, 2003 (U. P. Ordinance no. 8 of 2003) were promulgated on November 21, 2002 and April 8,
2003 respectively to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959 (U. P. Act no. 2 of 1959).
The provisions of the said Ordinances were replaced by the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporations

* (Amendment) (Second) Ordinance, 2003 (U. P. Ordinance no. 29 of 2003) but it could not be replaced by
an Act of the Legislature and was allowed to be lapsed. Now. it has been decided to amend the said Act

F o RTINS T IO
o e i e

with retrospective effect i, e. with effect from November 21, 2002 to provide for, i:%
. z

1. changing the names of certain ofﬁces of the Municipal Corporatnons, %

2. making provision for more than one Additional Municipal Commissioner in a Municipal °§

- ~ Corporation;
3. removal of Mayor by the State Govemment after eons1dermg the motion of no-confidence %

passed by the three-fourth majority of the total number of the members of the Corporatxon, 7

4. insertion of certain acts which also disqualify a person from being or from being chosen
as the Corporator, a Deputy Mayor or Mayor of a Corporation;

5. mcreasmg fmanc:al Junsdxctlon of the Mayor, the Corporation and the Municipal
Commissioner in relatlon to the executxon of contracts and sanctxon of estimates;

6. changing the procedure of i nnposmon and realization of property tax.
The Uttar Pmdesh Mumcnpal Corporatlons (Amendment) Bill, 2004 is introduced accordmgly

By order,

D V.SHARMA,
Pramukh Sachiv.

RotHogodo—To fo 336 RToT (R=)—2004—(870)—507—(FIER / 3P |
fMlot¥ogotdlo—To o 152 Wlo fAeMo—2004—(871)-850—(B¥ER / IHAT) |



No. 519(2)/LXXIX-V-1-08-1(Ka)-12-2008
Dated Lucinow, March 14, 2008

IN pursuance of the provisions of ¢lause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English-translation of the Utiar Pradesh N2gar Nigam
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 12 of 2008) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh
Legislature and assented to by thé-Governor or March 14, 2008 .

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
(AMENDMENT) ACT,.2008
{U.P. ACTNO. 12 OF 2008)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
ACT
Surther to amend the Urtar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959,

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as -
follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Shon tille
(Amendment) Act, 2008.



4 ,._._,'mmmmmn—'amqﬁzooa

. Amendment of : ,‘ 2. In section 132 af l]:le “Uttar’ Pradcsh Mumc1pal Corpurauon Act, 1959,

" UPfAcind. 2of

section 132 of htn‘emaﬁer referred ta as l.he prmclpal Act,—
1959 . .. .. "'"*,:- - . T . :
. (a) in sub-seclion (3} for the words ‘one lakh rupees' the words ‘Ofteen
lakh rupees’ and for the words ‘five lakh rupees’ the words ‘twenty lakh
‘rupccs shall be substituted.

. ' (b) in sub- secHon (3-A) for the words two lakh rupees lhe worrls ‘ten
Iakh rupees’ and for the words ‘four lakh mpcc:. “the words ‘fificen lakh

. rupees’ shall be substituted. “J -

(c) in sub—sccuon (4) for the words “eight lakh rupees’ the words
‘lwenty lakh rupees” shall be substituted,

(d) in sub-section (5) for the words ‘one lakh rupecs' the words ‘five
lakh rupees’ and for the words ‘two lakh rupees’ the words ‘len lakh rupees’
shall be substituted.

(e} in sub-section (7) for the words “sub-section (3)” the words “sub-
section (3) or sub-section (3-A)" shall be substitured.

Amendment of 3. In section 135 of the principal Act,—
se:lion (35 : .

{a}-in the marginal heading fcr the words ‘eight Takh runces’ the words
‘twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted.

ERTRNE L

{0 W sub-seciion {1) for wne words ‘two lakh rupees” the words ‘icn lakh
fupees’ shall be substituted. f

{¢) in sub-section (1-A) for the words ‘four lakh rupees’ the words
“fifteen lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

{d) in sub-section (2) for the words ‘five lakh rupees’ the words ‘twenty
lakh rupees’ shall be substituted,

(e} after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely —

(3} The State Government may, by notification in the Gazerre, |
modify the monetary limits specified in sub-section (1) or ]
sub-section (2) keeping in view the rise of costs or the exipencies of the -
work and efficiency of Corporation.

-

Amendment of 4. In section 136 of the principal Act,~
section 136

(a} in the marginal heading for the words *eight lakh rupees® the words -
‘twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substiruted.

(b} in sub-scction (1} for the words ‘eight lakh rupees’ the words
‘twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted. '
- {c) in sub-scction {2), in clause () for the words "sixicen lzkh rupees
the words ‘thirty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted.

(d) afier sub-section (2). the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely —
(3) The:Suate Government may, by nolification in the Gazetfe, h__
modify the monetary limits specified in sub-section (1} o
sub-section (2) keeping in view the rise of costs or the exigencies of the¢ <
work and eficiency of Corpuration. A
i
{2
i i
!
b



yds

enty

grred.

nazcitc,

mnﬂ"lam%nwm 14 %, 2008

r,, r_

STATEMENT OF OBJEC"'S AND REASONS

Secuon 132 of the Uttar Pradcsh Mumclpal Corporation Act. 1959 (U.P. Act no. 2 of 1959)

ma.\es certain 1rov151on.s relatmg 16 execution of contracts and sections 135 and 136 make provisions

abont ine eslimates not exceeding cighi lakit rupees aad exee seding cigh: lakh rupees respectively, The

existing provisions of limited amounts in the said sections arc c not sufficient for the implemention of the
. time bound schemes. Al present the costs of the construction materials have been increased and the rales
:' ~ of the Public Works. Deparl.ment have been rcvlsed Under the above circumstances mOre amouni are
E ) reqnlred for the mplemenmuon of certain important schemes financed by the Government of India. It has,
. lherefore bcen decrdcd 1w amend the said Act to provide for increasing finangial jurisdictions of the

' Mumc1pa| Cormmssmncr, the Mayor, the execuuvc_commlllee and the Corporauon etc. in relation to the
l] “
exccution of contracis and sanctions of estimates. ;

The Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation (Amendment) Bill, 2008 is introduced accordingly.

i} st bt

- By order.
S.M.A. ABIDI,

l o - Pramukh Sachiv.
y .

{

\

:i _ . . -
!

1) or |

; of the

1
i

v \\.’Ofds )

1e words

:h p

8 inserted.

ces'

on (
encies

} @
of the flog@oyeflo-Totlo 1185 WO (f¥o)—(2624)-2008—597 WiI~(FMaYER / WIHUT) |
Nogsogedio-Godio 458 MofETd-(2625)-2008—850 MerTi-{FgeR / AT |

268 e vidhai-Nma 2



	1998UP8.pdf
	UP Act 8 of 1998.pdf
	UP Act 17 of 1999.pdf
	UP Act 7 of 2000.pdf
	UP Act 16 of 2004.pdf

	2008UP12.pdf

