The Uttaranchal Emoluments and Pension of State Assembly Members,
Ministers and Officers) (Amendment) Act, 2005

Act 13 of 2005

Keyword(s):
Salary, Pension, Allowances, MLAs, MLA

Amendments appended: 15 of 2005, 9 of 2006

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




DRE IS A,

L T )
s yaiinilnenien R

e

1 AT R e o

-

Y gE—27 (&) .. _ . yeliga diEu-gptn / ov10-30 / 03
{FTets 7, v frerge i)

—_—

ART—1, GO ()
. _ (eaviga Afetr=m)
IEUSH, §EAR, 09 HIEY, 2005 30

WTE 20, 1926 W& WL

1
1

! ) -
- ' faert vd i w14 famr _
A 431 /et vd wada wrd /2005
JEIgA, 09 HRadl, 2005

CICE R

-~

AT BT R B ey 200 @ el ISV HEIGY ) weRiEE RuTT W
gRT iR SexiEre (fam wn wot, Hﬁﬁmaﬁﬁﬂa?ﬁwmsﬁvﬂw)
(eer) faeaw, 2005 WX RS 01-02-2005 F AR W B AR Tw axrAd IR
WEm 13, wzoos$mﬁaﬁwwaﬁvﬁmﬁw'm¥ﬁmmnmaﬁmwﬁl

W(ﬁaﬁﬂmm wﬁﬁawa%rﬁuﬁaﬁmmsﬁ?
Yer) (Gwer) afdifags, 2005 -

(erfirfyait e 13, 9 2005)
(ﬁwaﬁwﬁaﬁwmwﬁa@m

' Wﬁﬁwﬁmﬁm(mvﬂaﬁm&amsﬂvﬂwn arfarfsg™, 1980, SR
o2y g fensy wreg fafRreriiat &) e mor )

rprp_‘rn‘rr P ik o LD - G . S
LY e [T LT ] PR} wansartedTr, IJJL WMAIY MwX) T Al k‘-ll.l -1,

T #IY sl guee) aifaforem, 1081 (e SeRITE ¥ @Rp) 9u7 SN w39 ey fdars weo



B GahsEat e e,

B A o e e e S mi e o 2 s s

2 | SUINgd SMHERY TOE, 09 WHIGY], 2005 30 (AT 20, 1926 UF W)

(mﬁmmﬁm)mmﬁm)arw 2001 &1 Sgd & ufley §
FUT AWT F B ford

s

ARG TR & gagdd g% i fafaias sty gam e @ - .

wiR A
R Ry

NI 4 1

NS &

EIRT 14 &7

R 15 B

g1 15— &1

HINT 18- H1
e

oI 24 T
Lkl eE!

. ﬁ\aaﬁrﬁ'awaﬁmﬁsaﬁmm(z)ﬁ'—

JEFTI—YF

yRE

. () aaaﬁﬁquma(ﬁmmm@nﬁﬂwaﬁmﬁﬁaﬁ

Suaferi siv Yo (utew) sfifrm, 2005 @8 ST
(2) @® uwell sld, 2004 & WA ST
TSI

IR ALY AR G=ur 23, Y 1980 $ GRT 3 FT WelgS
2. VR WY XU fEE Aved (@awl 9 suefaaT sk Sue s,

1980 o, RO s smgrw 3 o A FAfEw we T @, o 3
SET (1) # IR T FER BUd° @ TN W A W R I v
fd amid

3. W afafrEw 9 o 4 ¥ T Ui R U B WM W we Wi

TWR UTg O v wg R SR

IR TH TR PR @ W™F W v 'R ewl” v R
SR 1

o il T 14 B v (6) @ R g v 9 @ e

WER & WH W g 0ig 9 3fF 9e° @ 29 ait

. o ARRE @) gRT 15 A

(a;)mwﬁ)ﬁmﬁﬁmm'ﬁwwwmqﬁm'
& 3 a@#,; - Py

(@) suaRr (2) ¥ wem |7 Wl el $wwwﬁmmmﬁ
@ 3 9T

m)m(a)ﬁwﬁﬁm %Wwwﬁa’rmm
@ fod wEdwy :

.wmﬁﬁmaﬁmw—wﬁmwmm B W W IR 5

BAR uig 6 v v ) SRy

. Y@ At 3 g 18-a & @ve (F) A U e N Ul @ e

W ¥ E R I @ G

. & afafy @) grr 24 3-

(®) Suay (1). ¥ wi= Qﬁm?qra%ﬁmz} D W W W= zﬁm
CwmRY T Y Gl '

-(@)T\’T\fﬁﬁm 7 TR B e W T <l e e v

2a s,



| RS FTARY UTE, 08 BREY, 2005 S0 (AN 20, 1926 & G

(1) W URgE B SR (rEfafEa W el fagn wam,

Faf—
: “geg I8 AR 5 femE = w49 8N @ Ruafy ¥ fFem= gur @ w5
R @ fafr ¥ =) famr e @ "oy vwdeH uw 9 sm@fyr & aoEr
T e & UEe yaiorl @ Rl @ SRt S A e war o7 srens
vl B Y S99 sl @ R 5w vy § 9T gy W e <Er s

@) Sufan e o R FrefaRe e 7 fiar wrdm,
i~ -
“wyediero—wiel 5 fda A v @ wew @ WU N B e A
IHY RS fag ve avf |} o gafyr @ fad o fear 8l 967 59 arr
@ yatemrel T8 wus RN 6 oW wfy 3 @ a9y @ o wew B
@ﬁﬁﬂfﬁm%l"
eI T
TR VoW wivd fau wved (@EfretRal @ 99 qur wd) |
- o, 1952 (e seRiAd W AqR) &1 wleA T
10. IR WU Uy e Aved (afrear @ a9 qour wxY) AR, 1952 aRT2 9T
o, R e 39 semg ¥ g aftR e v 8, O 2 WY wvey (1) W
¥ ez 7Y F9R 979 O vUd° @ WM W ¥R UiY §uR I9d° @ [’}
St |
11. waﬁﬁwaﬁm4aﬂmm(3)#m”ﬂmmamm$ aRT 4 T
WM R UK U sER il v R el eiterT
AR
SR weyr ") (Juq, ww N yHel Susew=) Aferfrad, 1981
(wen STRiEw W Wgw) &1 wened
12. SR WAy A= (@, wen Sl wedlel wusem) siftfem, qes1 9 e smis @
et afal e @1 Ty E, @) uRT 3 H— H‘sf:e.m

(@) Su=mRy (1) 9 7eg € §9IR Uiy 9 U a%wmwwm’lm
v wy R

(@) suEnyT (2) ¥ U 5 woR G Wl Uiy v’ @ R W U CHR,
TR w9 v Bl W
13. 7o gfRrfraw ) g1 6 & suEr (1) ¥ W W W W ok o) R wmsw
W B U W R atrﬂsuo;rﬁ“ﬁ?fﬁﬁwwﬁmnhsoom Wete
aftre a8 ehft @ 23 ST

wﬁamﬁmw(«a@aﬁwmﬁwm
(SoRiad WeeE) sftfram, 2001 /R el o ey
Bl T4T &, $ 9T 3 § [
14, o st @1 ary 34—
W‘Hmmmaﬁaa‘m$waﬁaﬂwﬁ1#mm



besdmaie ey

e A LA A o g iz ——

4 . IFRE SEENY o, 08 BRad, 2005 0 (WIY 20, 1926 TH W)
2q aul AN R TNE TR T B Y BUT @ W W _R
Trard TR v & ¥oQ FUA @ SRR o oY divia |y B
Ay gl B TR T8 @ Yad U Re. By e

asn 4,

an';{o B HE
W@ afia |

No. 431/Vidhayee & Sansadiya Karya/2005
Dated Dehradun, February 089, 2005

NOTIFICATION -
Miscellaneous

iN pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3} of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttaranchal
(Emoluments and Pension of the State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (Amendment)
Bill, 2005 (Uttaranchal Adhiniyam Sankhya 13 of 2005). .

As passed by the Uttaranchal Legislative Assembly and assented to by the Governoron .
February 01, 2005.

THE UTTARANCHAL (EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION OF THE STATE ASSEMBLY
MEMBERS, MINISTERS AND OFFICERS) (AMENDMENT) ACT 2005
(Act No. 13 oF 2005)

~ (As passed by the Uttaranchal State Assembly)

Further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislatur~ (Members Emoluments and Pension)
Act, 1980, the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952, the
Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowancés.and Miscelianeous Provision) Act, 1981 (as appllcab[e
in the Uttaranchal) and The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature {(Member’s Emoluments and Pension
(Uttaranchal Amendment) Act, 2001.

AN
AcCT..

- - . - . o

Itis HEREBY enacled in the Fifty-Fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows

CHAPTER~L
PRELIMINARY _

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called The Ut{aranchal (Emoluments and PenSLon of the
Commencement State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (Amendment) Act, 2005.
(2) Itshall come into force with effect from.April 01, 2004
' CHAPTER--II

AMENDMENT IN SECTION 3 OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE
LEGISLATURE ACT NO. 23 OF 198C

2. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members Emeluments and
Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred te in this Chanter as the principal Act. in
sub-section (1) for the words ‘Two thousand rupees’ the words "Three thousand
rupees’ shall be substituted.



TR AYERYT TS, 09 HRAN, 2005 30 (WTE 20, 1926 UE =) 5

10.

1.

. In section 4 of the principal Act for the words ‘Five thousand rupees’ the words

‘Seven thousand five hundred rupees’ shall be-substituted.

. In sub-section (2) of section 5ofthe pnncrpal Act—-

“For.the words “Ten thousand rupees’ the words “Twenty thousand rupees'
shall be substituted.”

. In section 14 of the principal Act, in clause (d), in the second proviso for the

words ‘Two members’ the words "Five members' shall be substituted.

. In section 15 of the principal Act--

(@) Insub-section (1) for the words ‘Two hundred flfty rapees the words ‘Three
hundred rupees’ shall be substltuled -

(b) In sub section {2) for the words * I;wo hundred rupees’ the words wo iLindred
fifty rupees’ shall be substituted;

(¢) Insub-section {3)forthe words Twe hundred rupees’ the words "Two hundred
fifty rupees’ shall be substituted.

. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words ‘One thousand rupees’ the

words "Two thousand five hundred rupees’ shall be substituted.

. In section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (a) for the words ‘One thousand

rupees’ the words “Two thousand rupees’ shall be substifuted.

. Insection 24 of the principal Act—

{a) Insub-section(1}for the words ‘One thousand five hundred rupees {he words
‘Two thousand rupees’ shall be subslltuted

(b In the proviso for the words Two hundred rupees ' the words-Two hundred fifty
rupees’ shall be substituted;

(c) After the first proviso the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:--

“Provided further thatin the event of dissolution of Assembly, the period from
the date of dissolution of Assembly, till the date of first meeting who has been the
speaker of the dissolved Assembly and has continued to be in office as such
during the said period.”

(d) Afterthe aforesaid proviso the foliowing explanation shall be inserted, namely:~
“Explanation—-Where a person has served as a member of the Assembly for
the term of six months and above and has not completed one vear then such

person shall for the purpose of calculating the pension, be deemed to have served
as a member for the year.”

“CHAPTER-III 4
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE
(OFFICERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) ACT, 1952
(As applicable in the Ultaranchal)

In section 2 of the Utltar Pradesh State Legislaiure {Officers Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1952, hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as the principal Act,
in sub-section (1) for the words Two thousand and five hundred rupees’ the words
‘Five thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.

In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3) for the words ‘Two thousand
and five hundred rupees’ the words ‘Five thousand rupees’ shall be subslituted.

Amendment of
Seclion 4

Amendment of
Section 5

Amendmant of
Section 14

Amendment of
Saclion 15

Amendment of
Seclion 15-A

Amendment of
Section 18-A

Amendment .of
Seclion 24

Amendment of
Section2 ¢

Amendment of
Section 4



6 IR

IRTENTT TWE, 09 WAL, 2005 F0 (A1 20, 1926 A& Hrag)

Amendment of 12.
Sectionq

Amendment of 43,
Section 6

14.

dlog0%0 (3Rog0)

“ o CHAPTER-IV
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES,
ALLOWANCES AND MISCELLANEOUS PROVISION} ACT, 1981
{As epplicable in the Uttaranchal)

In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Saiaries, Allowances and

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 herein referred to as pringipal Act--

(@) Insub-section (1) for the words 'Twe thousand five hundred rupees’ the words
‘Five thousand rupees’ shall be substituted,

(b) In sub-section (2) for the words ‘Two thousand two hundred and twenty five
rupees' the words 'Four thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.

In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section {1) for the words ‘at such rates

and upon such conditions as may be prescribed’ the words "Fiye hundred rupees

per day, which shall not exceed Fifteen thousand rupees in a month’ shall be

substituted. .

' CHAPTER-V

AMENDMENT OF 3.OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE
(MEMBERS EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) (UTTARANCHAE AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2001, HEREINAFTER REFERRED AS PRINCIPAL ACT

in the sub-section (1) of section 3 of the principal Act--
“For the words 'Expenses of diese] equivalent to the amount of Railway Coupon

for Sixty thousand rupees and the balance Thirty three thousand as Railway

Coupon’ the words ‘Expenses of diesel equivalent to the amount of Railway Coupon
for Ninéty six thousand rupees and the balance Twenty four thousand rupees a
Railway Coupon’ shall be substituted.” '

By Order,

[.J. MALHOTRA,.
Principal Secrelary.

- o

13 faendl /68—~2005—85+500 (Fragex /Afvmal) |

nEeey weha



Pl ST TR Y

- e

LTI - E

Yuiiga Wear-30%0/ €10Y10—30 /03

Y G148

(engd=w g W Rame fdw)

QABIEH, AR, 06 ke, 2005 Fo

A 16, 1927 WFH W

ELRECRIIEE]

e} v§ iy ot fawmr
e 479 / faurll w@ wadhr w1l /2005
3gUEA. 06 T, 2005
SHERYEAT
fafaer

—

L AIRE T UiEETT $ Ie9T 200 @ e e WeiRy W gIRiEe Ut e gra
giiRm swRY=a (faams 9= w@gwal, 931 gen sfaefRal ) 9uafern alz dwm=)
(mem wene) fagaw, 2005 w* i wsgwe A K@ oe anla, 2005 @ SRR w9 AR
a8 geRiga SfafAan wer 15, 9 2005 @ W0 § wd—ammrRer @ ol 9 atrggen gro
waTiE fear wwar 21
Saviad (AU Wi e, 93 oo aRmREl B Suer ik e

(T i) SRR, 2005 )
(suviaa sftifras wo 15, 99 2005)

SoxiEe (fem w97 geent, 95 er st @) suaferr sk
IyM) (wetes sfifrgw, 2005) (a6 2005 @ ey e 13) § i
walga @ fad '

SETa
ARG TORISE @ BWd 9 A Suxigd g feE @8R ey
arferfrafie— -



' ol
LR CHUL Mt

2
)
ran

B LN N

PIAT W N .

2 SURIEA JUERY T9E, 06 aid, 2005 o (3F 16, 1927 WF W)

iRy A 1 3w sudEa (Rame v wewl, 94 qen st o
Sydfery s dwE) (e W) AftfEw, 2005 @l WA

S S 2. “gavigel (FEm w7 wowl, ¥A) aun siftaRal @ Suwfmi ok

=ff YerT) (ieler) sfRPRm, 2005 @Y ERT 13 R @ SR
He&qr 13, o )
2005

€HRT 13 BT Sﬂgﬂﬁ,
forrell W _ argo Wo AT,
' yE ufaa |

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3)of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English franslation of the Uttaranchai
{Emoluments and Pension of the State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers} (First Amend-
ment} Bill, 2005 (Uttaranchat Adhiniyam Sankhya 15 of 2005).

As passed by the Uttaranchal Leglslatwe Assembly and assented to by the Governor on
April 06, 2005. :

No.479Vidhayee and Sansadiya Karyal2005
Dated Dehradun, Aprit 08, 2005

NOTIEICATION

Miscellaneous

THE UTTARANCHAL (EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION OF THE STATE
ASSEMBLY MEMBERS, MINISTERS AND OFFICERS)

(F1RST AMENDMENT) ACT, 2005
(UTrARANcmAcT No. 15 Or 2005)

Further to amend the Uttaranchal (Emoluments and Pension of the State
Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (Amendment) Act, 2005 (Act No. 13 of
2005) .

AN

Acr
Be it enacted by the State Assembly of Uttaranchal in the Fifty-sixth year of the
Republic of India as follows:--

Shortlitle 1. This Act may be called the Uttaranchal (Emoluments and Pension of
the State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) {First Amendment) Act, 2005.
Omisslen of -2.“Section 13 of the Uttaranchal {Emoluments and Pension of the State

z‘:‘c“"" 130of Assembly Members, M:nlsters and Offlcers) {Amendment) Act; 2005 shall be

Uttaranchal omitied.”
Act No, 13 of
2005
: By Order,
a l. J. MALHOTRA,
Principal Secretary.

lovogo (AIRog0) 15 Rurfl/137—2005-85+300 (Freqex /dfm@t)y



4 el STETETRYT TWie, 04 WY, 2006 0. (dUTH 14, 1928 Wo WH)

Short iitle
and -
Commencement

General
Amendments in
-U.P. ActNo. 23
of 1980

Amendment of
saectlon 4

Amendment of
section 5

Amendment of
section 13

THE UTTAHANGHAL.(EmOIuments and.Pension.of the State Assembly Menm-
_ bers, Ministers and Officers) (First Amendment) Act, 2006

(UTTAFLANCHAL Act No. 09 orF 2006)

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legrs!ature {(Members, Emolu-
ments and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers
and Allowances) Act, 1952 (as applicable to Uttare_nchat)

AN
- Act

‘Beit enacted by the State Assembly ini the Frﬂy-seventh year of the Republic of
" india as follows:--

Chapter |
Prelrmmary

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttaranchal (Emoluments and Penslon of
the State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (FirstAmendment) Act, 2008.

(2) it- shall corne Into force on the 1stday of November, 2005 except section 4
and 8, which shali come into force on the 1stday of June, 2005 and 1st day of May,
2006 respactively. '

B

Chapter i

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Leglstature (Members, Emoluments
: and Pension) Act, 1980 ' :

2. In the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members Emeltjments and Pen-

~sion) Act,- 1980, hereinafter referred to in this chapter as the principat Act, for the
. word - “Secretary” wherever occurring including definitions the words “Secretary/ "

Principal Secretary" shalt be substituted. .

3. In"section 4 of the principal Act, for the words “Seven thousand five
hundred Rupees” the words “Fiftesn thoudand ru pees" shall he substituted.

“- 4. Insection 5 of the prmczpat Act--

(a) [n sub-section (1) for-the words "Expenses of diesel equivalent io that
amount of Railway Coupon for Ninety six thousand rupees and the balance
Twenty four thousand rugees as Raliway Coupon,” the words “Expenses

- of diesel equivalent to the amount of the Railway coupon for One lac
twenty thousand rupees and the balance Thirty thousand rupees as
. Railway Coupon” shall e substituted.

(b) In sub-section (2) for the words “Twenty thousand rupess” the words
-“Thirty thousand” shall be substituted.

- 5. For section 13 of the principal Act, the followrng section shall be
substituted, namely--

13 (1) Every member shall be entitled i m the manner presenbed with afree
non-transferable pass to travel at any place by the Uttaranchal Transport Corpora-
tion bustincluding air conditioned or deluxe bus without payment of the passenger
tax due under any law for the time being in force;

(2) the facility referred to in sub-section (1) may also be availed by a
member for taking one companion along with in the bus.

(3) Every person who is entitled to pension under chapter Vill shalf be en-
titled in the manner presgribed with a fred non-transferable pass fo travel at any
place by the Uttaranchal Transport Corpotation bus without payment of the passenger

- tax due under any law for the time being in force;




et o i

T

| SRR SR o, 04 WS, 2008 g0 (AU 14, 1928 WH W) 5

{4) the pass referred to In sub-section (3) may also be used by such person
for taking one companlon along with him in the bus :

Provided that if a person referred to in sub-section (3) travels in air
conditioned bus or a deluxe bus, he shall pay himself the excess amount of fare
difference. :

6. in section 15 of the principal Act, in sub section (1) for the words “Three
hundred rupees” the words "Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. -

7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words “Two thousand five
hundred rupees"” the words "Six thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

8. For sub-section (2) of section 16 of the principal Act, the following sub-
section shalt be substituted; namely--

{2) Where a member has not been provided with any accommddati_on, he
shall be entitled to an accommodation allowance at the rate of Three hundred rupees
per month and paid house rent allowance upto April 30 2006 shall not be recovered.”

9. In section 18-Aof the principal Act, in clause (A) for the words “Two thousand
rupees” the words “Six thousand rupees” shall be substituted. ‘

10. In section 24 of the principal Act--

{a) In sub-section (1) for the words “Two thousand rupees” the words” Three
thousand rupees” shall be substituted. :

(b) Inthe proviso for the words “Two hundred fifty rupees” the words “Three
hundred rupees”shall be substituted.

11. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1-A) the following
proviso shall be inserted at the end, namely--

“Provided that if any other Government dues are reported against such person
whether it is for the period of the membership or for the period he is not to a member
shall also be deducted from the pension of such person.”

Chapter--lli

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries
and Allowances) Act, 1952

12. In section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1952, in sub-section (3) for the words “Five thousand rupees” the
words "Ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 15

Amendment of
section 15-A

Amendment of
sub-section (2)
of section 16

Amendment of
18--A

Amendment of
section 24

By Order,

Smt. INDIRA ASHISH,
Sacretary. '

dlogwoyo (3rwogo) 10 faemd /240--2006—100+500 (Brgex /AR )




	13.pdf
	2005UK13.pdf
	2005UK13.pdf
	2005UK15.pdf
	2006uk9.pdf


