
Regd. No. CHD/0093/2009-2011

Baruatta Ginnerunient
EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
Govt. of Haryana

17
L' net t

CHANDIGARH, THURSDAY, MARCH 4, 2010
(PHALGUNA 13, 1931 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT

Notification

The 4th March, 2010

No.  1-HLA of 2010/8.—The East Punjab War Awards (Haryana
Amendment) Bill, 2010, is hereby published for general  information under
proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the
Haryana Legislative Assembly:—

Bill No. 1—HLA of 2010
THE EAST PUNJAB WAR AWARDS

(HARYANA AMENDMENT) BILL, 2010

A

B ox

further to amend the East Punjab War Awards
Act, 1948, in its application to the State of Haryana.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-first

Year of the Republic of India  as follows :-

1.  This Act may be called the Eas t  Punjab War  Awards (Haryana

Amendment) Act, 2010.

2. In section 3 of the East  Punjab War Awards Act. 1948i—

(a) in clause (a) of sub -section (1), for the words "five thousand

rupees",  the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be. subStituted;

and

(b) in sub -section (IA), for the words "five thousand _rupees", the

words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

Price: Rs. 5.00 (855)

Short title.

Amendment of
section 3 of
Punjab Act 22
of 1948.



856 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAR. 4, 2010
(PHGN. 13, 1931 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

In view of the increased cost of living it has become necessary to enhance
the war jagir of every "eligible person" as defined in the Act from five thousand
rupees to ten thousand rupees per annum.

Hence, this Bill.

BHUPINDER SINGH HOODA,

Chief Minister, Haryana.

The Governor has, in pursuance of Clauses (1) and (3) of Article 207
of the Constitution of India, recommended to the Haryana Legislative Assembly
the introduction and consideration of the Bill.

Chandigarh :

The 4th March, 2010.

SUMIT KUMAR,

Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAR. 4, 2010 857
(PHGN. 13, 1931 SAICA)

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

As at present, in terms of the provisions of Section 3 of the East
Punjab War Awards Act, 1948 every "eligible person" is entitled to a war jagir
@ 5000/- per annum. It is proposed to increase the rate to Rs. 10,000/- per
annum. As a result, there will be an additional liability of Rs. 40,90,000/- per
annum on the State Exchequer.



711brel 91111

194 8  t .s.47r4

8i1Zif eof  22  *:1

MT  3 51

,tiat4-r I

858 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAR. 4,  2010
(PHGN. 13, 1931 SAKA)

(vrft-fd 317K)

*P q m f iTITT

2010 WI fdlitiMIOAT 1— T4ocraoRo

10'0714 wi fiRcardcb (*Pti tuff livi)t.44) Nem), 2010

ttMT4i41.814c-1lI4)3011444, 1948,

vRenuif WWI*, 3TItiiVIIRM

4:14 t faz1

Eft10)

lirRV qt )NIVLE . Th- Trat  qt t l4U j tITT

zrg 31141'47d:4-ff

1. r :r 11 tiVR 141Rc1I4) (8RtI1u1i *4 IE4-1) 3Tfe , 2010,

ticocti 1

2. l e tiutio tiiPcMcb 3TRI1714, 1948, siTRI 3

(1) .qu5 " T - T N . \ 71 W W 1" -Vra-4 Wr f f

"TiT 11't Vq4" Vie4 ; .ff21-1

‘34till (1T) 1?f, "tft 6v11.< Trit' "Zr4 "TRi k

W Z)." YI64 * 4 t 4  7 0 4  I.

( )



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAR. 4, 2010 859
(PHGN. 13, 1931 SAICA)

collu4 T.14,cut

u1r9-4 '“oc)- zft 3irmrwt1Trzit t 761T. " 111.)1'UT F" tiTr
"d tiftlitfOu t, qr.R-vipfk "-Ert .o44" qolcm

qt1 Rfl

3TU:, 1T-6  P e f

If t n - 141*

TOT rE4t, Re4le11 I

1-117U 41 1T9' 31767 207 T (1) U2TT (3) 5 3 f -giTuT 4 f l u t i t4 1.7

6144410n 1'417T r  - l i t f4071-W.M. I MF  c t r ,)  0 ,41 fTR-fOWIT i'rit"Tritt4T

t  I

r4u51 44 :

4 +1'4, 2010

tku rriv,
-rfta-1



860 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAR. 4, 2010
(PHGN. 13, 1931 SA1CA)

014-1

I 4 4.sfl4 c5 1-1t1artit6 31fefiz17, 1948, Thct EIRT 3 t 1 -4 4117  R ed- t  3 1 7 1 7

76)W  ""cifq 5,000/- ii4t r grq
Icfr 10,000/- V44 .41ferW cMs) & 4•14014 t 'Pe$' 14Pu114-1 1,04 •o,,14 * E r rf f

40,90,000/- •611 TEi 5Jea f t W 1 1# 11T

46942—H.v.S.—H.G.P., Chd.


