
Regd. No. CHD/0093/2009-2011

HumanaI. citifiliment
EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
© Govt. of Haryana

apette

CHANDIGARH, THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2011
(PHALGUNA 5, 1932 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT

Notification

The 24th February, 2011

No. 1—HLA of 2011/9.—The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances
and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 2011, is hereby published for general
information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of
Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :—

Bill  No. 1—HLA of 2011

THE HARYANA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)

AMENDMENT BILL, 2011

A

BILL

further to amend the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and
Pension of Members) Act, 1975.

Be it  enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-
second Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This  Act may be  cal l ed  the Haryana  Legi s la t ive Assembly Short title and
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2011. commencement.

(2) The provisions of section 12 of this Act shall come into force at
once and the remaining provisions of this Act shall be deemed to have come into
force with effect from the 7th September, 2010.

Price: Rs. 5.00 (735)



Ame ndme n t  o f
long t i t le  of
Haryana Act  2  o f
1975 .

Ame ndme n t  o f
long t i t le  of
Haryana  Act 2 of
1975 .

Insert ion of
sect ion 2A in
Haryana Act  2  o f
1975 .

Ame ndme n t  o f

section 3A of
Haryana Act  2  o f

1975 .

Ame ndmen t  o f
se ct ion 38  o f
Haryana Act  2 o f
1975 .

Ame ndme n t  o f
sect ion 3C of
Haryana  Act  2  o f
1975 .

Ame ndme n t  o f
sect ion  3D  of
Haryana  Act  2  o f
1975 .

Ame ndmen t of
sect ion 4 of
Haryana Act  2 o f
1975 .

Ame ndmen t  o f
sect ion 5 of
Haryana Act  2 o f
1975 .

Ame ndme n t  o f

sect i on 7A of
Haryana  Act  2  o f
1975 .

Insertion of
sect ion 8A in
Haryana Act  2 o f
1975 .

736 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.),  FEB. 24,  2011
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

2. In the long title of the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances
and Pension of Members) Act, 1975 (hereinafter called the principal Act), for the
brackets and words "(Allowances and Pension of Members)", the brackets, sign
and words "(Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members)" shall be substituted.

3. In the short  t i tle of the principal  Act, for the brackets and words
"(Allowances and Pension of Members)", the brackets, sign and words "(Salary,
Allowances and Pension of Members)" shall be substituted.

4. After section 2 of the principal Act, the following section shall  be
inserted, namely:—

"2A. Salary.-- There shall be paid to each member a salary of ten
thousand rupees per mensum.".

S. In section 3A of the principal Act, for the words "fifteen thousand
rupees", the words "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

6. In section 3B of the principal Act,  for the words "three thousand
rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

7. In section 3C of the principal Act, for the words "two thousand five
hundred rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

8. In section 3D of the principal Act, for the words, signs and figures
"Rs. 5,000/-", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

9. In sub -section (1) of section 4 of the principal Act, for the words
"twenty thousand rupees", the words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

10. In sub -clause (ii) of clause (b) of sub -section (1) of section 5 of the
principal Act, for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "one thousand five
hundred rupees" shall be substituted.

11. In sub -section (1) of section 7 A of the principal Act, for the words
"five thousand rupees", the words "seven thousand five hundred rupees" shall be
substituted.

12. In the principal Act, after section 8, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—

"8A. Recovery of Government dues.— If any person to whom any
amount is admissible under this Act, has not paid to the State Government
any amount payable by him on account of any facility provided to him by
the State Government in his capacity as a Minister, Leader of Opposition,



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011 737
(PHGN. 5,  1932 SAKA)

Speaker, Deputy Minister, Deputy Speaker, Chief Parliamentary Secretary,
Par li amentary Secre ta ry or Member,  then notwiths tanding anything
contrary contained in the sanction letter, agreement or mortgage deed, the
amount so due from him, may be recovered from the amount admissible to
him under  this  Act and if  no amount is admissib le or the amount so
admissible is insufficient, in that case, the amount so due, shall be recovered
from him or his legal representatives as arrears of land revenue.

Explanation.— For the purposes of this section, the word "facility"
means facility of whatever nature and includes house/flat building/purchase
advance ,  motor  car  advance,  medical  advance,  r ent  of Government
accommodation, State car, telephone/mobile phone or hospitality charges
given und er  the  pr ovi s ions  of the  Ha rya na  Legi s l a t i ve  Ass emb ly
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1975 (2 of 1975), the Haryana
Legislative Assembly (Facilities to Members) Act, 1979 (9 of 1979), the
Haryana Salaries and Allowances of Minister Act, 1970 (3 of 1970), the
Haryana Legislative Assembly Speaker 's and Deputy Speaker's Salaries
and Allowances Act, 1975 (3 of 1975) and the Haryana Legislative Assembly
(Medical Facil ities to Members) Act, 1986 (19 of 1986) and rules made
thereunder or instructions issued, from time to time." .

13. (1) The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension
Members) Amendment Ordinance, 2010 (Haryana Ordinance No. 11 of 2010),
hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action takt‘
under the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed
have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Repeal and
saving.



738 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Some allowances of the Members of Legislative Assembly and salary of
the Leader of the Opposition which are being provided under the provisions of
'The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act
1975' were enhanced more than two years ago. Keeping in the view the rise in
cost of living and to deal with the problems of general public in the Constituency,
the Government has decided to enhance the Constituency Allowance, Sumptuary
Allowance, Office Allowance, Secretarial Allowance, Daily Allowance and Pension
of Ex-MLAs. Salary of Leader of Opposition is also being enhanced. Further it has
also been decided to insert a new provision for providing the salary to the Member
of Legislative Assembly.

At present some facilities in the nature of House Building Advance / Motor
Car Advance/ Rent of Government accommodation/medical advance/State Car/
Telephone/Mobile phones and hospitality charges are being provided to the
MLAs/Ministers/Speaker/Deputy Speaker/Leader of Opposition/Deputy
Ministers/ Chief Parliamentary Secretaries by the Government under various Acts/
Rules/Instructions. In some cases the recoverable amount, which is due on account
of any facility provided by the Government, can not be recovered from the amount
of allowances/pension admissible to him, in that position, it has been decided to
make provision in The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension
of Members) Act, 1975 by inserting a new Section 8A after Section 8.

RANDEEP SINGH SURTEWALA,
Parliamentary Affairs Minister, Haryana.

The Governor has, in pursuance of Clauses (1) and (3) of Article 207 of the
Constitution of India, recomended to the Haryana Legislative Assembly the
introduction and consideration of the Bill.

Chandigarh :
The 24th February, 2011

SUMIT KUMAR,
Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011 739
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The proposed enhancement of salary of Leader of Opposition, insertion of
a new provision of salary to MLAs and enhancement of allowances will entail an
extra expenditure of Rs.1,80,84,000/- per year on the State Exchequer is detailed
as under:-

1. Salary of Leader of Opposition Rs. 2,40,0001- Per year
Rs. 20000/ -to Rs. 40000/- p.m.

2. Salary of Member of Legislative Rs.73,20, 000/- Per year
Assembly (61 MLAs) Rs. 10,000/ -p.m.

3. Constituency Allowance from Rs. 54,00,000/- Per year
Rs.15000/-to Rs. 20000/ -p.m.
(All 90 MLAs)

4. Sumptuary Allowance of MLAs Rs.14,64,000/- Per year
Rs. 3000/ -to Rs. 5000/ -p.m.
(61 MLAs)

5. Secretarial Allowance of MLAs Rs. 36,60,000/- Per year
Rs. 5000/ -to Rs.10000/-p.m.
(61 MLAs).

However, the expenditure by enhancing the Daily Allowance of MLAs,
and pension of Ex-MLAs can not be calculated.



7 j f j t 9 N w
iTTTPIT

1975 t R OTT-

3TRif*Trf 2 k
/IN wr i ñ q i

1975 t 6R giu:1

37ft7f=4-44 2

TRIITT 7114

lizilErq I

1975 k 6R4rrolt
3iftf41142 4 u m

Ai1f I

1975 t -
31RTMIITI 2 WU

WT *ixilER I

1975 i 1-44iitii1

3af tzli i  2 WTI

3tq 1*ixAtiff

1975 eNitqf

3Ifellf f t 2

371 T *IqN4-11

740 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SA1CA)

2011 N 'Noic r i  *MT  1 -R-4 o To to

6%mutt ftmi i 1 T(tiq'te-1 2i f f r t IV r9) fQqq),2011

toil 4.41-4)
aniftrr, 1975, 'ffit Wit tivIlfct

w-f4 t faq
fdt)qq,

T7t 4iuNive4 4RT al  4 t { i N lu l f f luel Rt( i-viu5ei .Fq
zig 3afffizt1tru

1. (1) -i l-g' 3iltfkz17 6Pziiuir i t g i f f T IM (114i -ti '1MT Mi l etIT-i ) i tetT 9 '

3ifif fizril, 2011, Wg1" rr ttcoof  t I

(2) fil 3TRI1:11711T EIRT 12 "31: 1 0  T i c f  ( I I I 04 MTT 3 T R I f * F i t

714 374ET 7 Ricril3N, 2010 tr WIT-41 utiq41

2. 6Rt iml•  " ItT ri 'il7T ov4i 11'49) 3Tfi111N, 1975 ( f k & *141,

enllq, 4j,ci 3iRrr42pf 4 i rar 71t4 " ( ,4-1<i-4 'i lUT Mil l i Zr -i ) " ch) 16

(11I YiGq wi 7  t R ,  " 0 4 * 4 ct-f, TTT T1T Ihr i ) " Afd-{Qtrft-d-

3. V i  3 1 R A i l i l f t r t t E f k "( i i<144 FM rr r t f f i ) "  cb) toc t ) I Mi l i6.4):

t 7 , " ( j q t 4c 11 , 1T--ffr O r -ff )" q q,, f 4-E r  m t r * ,4 ufatenDcr

.410 !

4. 4.2,c4 31R-Ifkilff f-TRT 2 ' 41-4", 1 ,--11?fRacr Mr 741 W caft, 3r4fq

"ZW .  td q. - -11—T-W \Lig \iqi t g r d iv -f r f \AN v 44 t ,)ct-r

IITTUT9' I"  I

5. v f  3 # 4 f t z t i l ETIV 3 It, "tr&'W  6k4k ,o4 e.  z i € 4 W M' "41'i
6 vIN tg44" lif)v4i1ci f4N .4)0!

6. 11l 3ilit11 zfrf U M  3 U "41-1 6s.e< ,o,44" i f 1T9' “ q i -el

6 ‘4N ot i k " 3QteliNci f krii 4

7. 410{ 3TRrftziff Erm $‘41,4 tit- T it  v44)"

"Liitr  6 ,4 k 4 " 164 vrd-Rwritrd .410



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011 741
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

8. 31RAZITI 1t.T131311#, "5,000/- U21T.Z1-4
\TN A1d-+21Tftf7T RN v110 I

9. vr  3 T R A-zrff m`i irk! 4 3tT-UTZ1 (1)4,  "41 i i 6.1H v -v)-" zi641. eirff
"tf ic410 \ill.< -1- . 111) ..11Rct

10. Ic.r arfe4zrrr WO 5 Thct 311--TRI (1) (U) 31--t-t45 (ii) #,

6‘)1N V 4 i r IGO. tFtriT, " ct) 6,4N tr-M T r i  v- ier i&ed--far it ra

11. 7  3a f f t zP i ETTU 7 ct 31-PERT (1) A-, IN Z1E0 t.

iv-Tri IN tf t f f ,o,44 16,4 lAteind f.4) ,,trq,1-

12. 10 31RIf f izi# ETT 8 t Wq", Thi-iWZgcr ETIT T d r  7 7 4 1-, 31.2fras

"8 f/Wi4' 4164 Met .— 4  c 0 ) 4 UAW f i 3TRrfkzrff i 31titff
3T- 1zr i-Not)k 371t l i t ,  v f ' d t r u 1T,arum,

31:1 4141, -T:rwzraT, Ise4 ti.941q TA a , -i : r f t-a- ITT tiq'f-t1 tftiZiff
31:1a74 TI-ftsTr cmui 5NI ct))i it<cON

i r t  t , 3Rft-T f a-rrq, cP Nzr r 31-----f4-tz 14,41 old
wIi i Ocl wf r tr T IIiT tzr ET..NifOr, zr i t i t zr l i arif t# 3T-4 "

31---1*zr  t r- R-rictr 9 --41 wrcrTf t uerr 4 0)4 I f t  t r-q-u f t  3 T - 17r  l er  t  z r r

vwr -{  zr-O -zr 3rtrzrft7 t, Tf r R k zr •-•<1\m-cr

wif tr  zrr ftRrw 11Ii1;1 i-V 7rcaf t

ETar t --A-ff 1 ,  ' V E T T " ziRrgrztt  t f tar tr rr

i t IN PIT ('i4'4 1-MT MIT t4H) 31t1ftzlli, 1975 (1975 2), 6 P q mr  f o r R

TNT i14TEIT) 3af f tzf rf , 1979 (1979 9), 6R4111111 aci-13i17 IMT
3i f e l l i f f , 1970 (1970 i5T 3), 6R eiluiF ittiff TNT 31/2rff711T \iLlikziaT dcl1 lifft
3ife4z11T, 1975 (1975 T 3) 74T 1.Litu11 WIN TNT fV4)ci11 Rjr4ETT)

3T1Itz4l1, 1986 (1986 T 19) M g 31019. ct i TT7f f iz l i t u t 1414-*P-121 riT

vri41 3rislfiff tt -f r t I f t  *cmir 3 p -Err •%‘1# WPM.

17 / t r A Z  f TfErrichkr 4•1)C,tcP 3Tff1T, 1if ir  3Tf t r i,  i t t 4441 311471
f$7rzrr, MiL111-1/11147F 09' IT i1c4711 MITT I" I

13. (1) 6Reilull ItETTff TNT (11 "MT 1I21T 1171ff) 3112T1tVi, 2010
(2010 WE 6134iurr 3riarrtzr .kitc.111 11), *114) gI.<1 RAU v1R11

(2) f t i-frff .-1 t 3-11-, \ichi 3TUI1t$T g 71211 t i a i cf, cI

3Tf 1izr41- 3T111-ff /Ft cr,1 A-r-d zrr Trt Tfr 3TRrn-zrrr gr, 17rau ' thAc l

36t1IPT i 311M. Tit q))4 6110 TIT 1i t -1.4-ar t q -rvrfr

1975T 6R4110if

31ftirivii 2T1 V131

3V TT 1711VffI

1975 T 6PzifutT

3TIVf4vTi 2 T1 VRT

4 wt il711LT9 I

1975 T 6R411uif

3 2 11
5 TT T TT I

1975 T
3itrfkaR 2 T't ETTZT

7W TT 11ER I

1975 T
3Orrivii 2 ETM

8T" TT •(/.0f s41.111

i t i -f M " M U

arr&



74 2 H A R Y A N A  G O V T .  G A Z . (EX T RA .) ,  FE B. 24, 20 11

(PH G N . 5, 1 9 3 2  S AK A )

Ut n i f T2T cbi lu i i 15T f cptuf

6 R a m T f l a t -9' WITT (flqi-ti ITUT t T 7 )  A A-MT, 1975 I% 1:114t1T9TpTi. #9T

T O W a forrff TNT Twit t -I -15 # 4. .er  q-Et t &MT aver 410N TR 0 1

q.jLf lfl at(13# •9. 111Ri # chk t r i f lv4  \T (cM .)c11 eatraT fd.ETF

- f d l t r i WITT e T 1cc171.< c1,141c14 1171., FfiT U211tftW IT9T

3-1-V Tfq34-11 tYvri # q ' 5T f q.01-4 f 441 t i .)cti edure 6101-k-i 4 1 * 1

t 3#W ft-or  f t i r # 4 1 # 1f t 97TT grqtrm.

‘, W r f u l# f eir #77T

\94-14 3Tv4aTrgafuRT, znini foTrff IT3Trorcar f ti r # f t -41/Tsur

t4N,-Kr)4 Wr4a1/.)cif 1#41014T a f4ErF 4 .1Tr m--1 f i l t ur i t u lzuTP-R171-t 3741T4)I4

1wzrrAf4)mr31-1T97*Hch14) <PN/841 0-Ur taT talA#q ticchN 14-ffr f414- 3arfkzr#1/
fk.4#14<lilt-4 ATaar9TTITT ITaTff .WZTI i i i . < 6 i  t i 4)4. Tr.43-4:11. ,(i ,01)1•<

II414 Thi t 71-4" 4 l T111779. azI #41/4-4F 4  id T r +-aT qT

ticbdr W Ar t -4 ffiaT Trzrr t f 1 iruir ft.TF WITT (i-rq,m ITUf ga 4 7 R)

3T1i1fiz11, 1975 ' 11 U M 8 t  ‘ 34 ,wcf UM 8 Th-T TIMM' Q \sf  ‘,1N I

Turtcr c i

TriTtzr .4)14 Rzriuli

ITRu taw l- r  T  3 T-1 -4 -4- 207 T ,ou4 (1) 7211- (3) T 31-g R u T ,<I‘reiLlIc4

R qiurf Tt11-9 Ti7 fdtzTT. TRIO' cM..) MIT Vi r f f fWqTT RR oi Rv

s2t  t

tiuss9410

24 TT-dt, 2011
f tra  T T R,

WP44 I



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011 743
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

tzT 51114 4

• .)cii edge r't d d d Fdsrr9. TrIR t  d dd v -<mcp

ii1ci irr-dETT9- 4 3.14) A t r e i t c w i flu,44 33R-rk .414 T.z t  6 2 . P

39TITT 1,80,84,000/- To mt-Zi T 3Treit4i 1TR t r t-r r r  : -

1. •)cil Afttfa T acm io 20,000/- T o - 2 ,40 ,00 0/ - Af t 4 14

40,000/- o IfftTit - <fro) AT

2. ft1T8" P1TTi"4-T41 m o m - w o TftNfl o 73,20,000/- A f t 4 1sf

tA• IR (61 T-4"-{4 MA)

3. 1:4t1Tff 7PTT 4. 5 1.MT 15,000/- o 20,000/- O io 54,00,000/- A f t 4 4

AtITRT cm.) AR- ( 7 3ft 90 T1-43,41 T1)

4. *R-c m 3MT 3,000/- o31 5,000/- o o 14,64,000/- uf .4 4

Aft ffi ff  cm4 143- (61 TI-4-f t  0 )

5. *A4)41 ITfiT 5,000/- o t 10,000/- o o 36,60,000/- rd q -Ef

AftTERE dr<4 tiT (61 1--43741 cn))

w4W , rdErrff TTT Trq--f41 15TGIONI vti4 t f kw  T f f r 4 27 114i:14-4711. ct Zt-f

14. 4 -e4 t r chN Lir 31T 1t 31te4TE (g -4 i 1 • I't 39----ef

48331—FL VS—HG Chd.


