Regd. No. CHD/0093/2009-2011

S N 4
Harpang Gouernment Gazette
EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
© Govt. of Haryana :

CHANDIGARH, THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 24, 2011
(PHALGUNA S, 1932 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 24th February, 2011

No. 1—HLA of 2011/9.—The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances
and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 2011, is hereby published for genera!
information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct ¢f
Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :—

Bill No. 1—HLA of 2011

THE HARYANA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)
' AMENDMENT BILL, 2011

A
BiLL

Sfurther to amend the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and
Pension of Members) Act, 1975.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-
second Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Legislative Assembly Short title and
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2011. commencement.

(2) The provisions of section 12 of this Act shall come into force at
once and the remaining provisions of this Act shall be deemed to have come into
force with effect from the 7th September, 2010.

Price : Rs. 5.00 (735)



Amendment of
long title of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
long title of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Insertion of
section 2A in
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section 3A of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section 3B of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section 3C of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section 3D of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section 4 of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section § of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Amendment of
section 7A of
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Insertion of
section 8A in
Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

736 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011

(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

2. In the long title of the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances
and Pension of Members) Act, 1975 (hereinafter called the principal Act), for the
brackets and words “(Allowances and Pension of Members)”, the brackets, sign
and words “(Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members)” shall be substituted.

3. In the short title of the principal Act, for the brackets and words
“(Allowances and Pension of Members)”, the brackets, sign and words *“(Salary,
Allowances and Pension of Members)” shall be substituted.

4. After section 2 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:— '

“2A. Salary.— There shall be paid to each member a salary of ten
thousand rupees per mensum.”. :

5. In section 3A of the principal Act, for the words “fifteen thousand
rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In section 3B of the principal Act, for the words “three thousand
rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

7. In section 3C of the principal Act, for the words “two thousand five
hundred rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

8. In section 3D of the principal Act, for the words, signs and figures
“Rs. 5,000/-", the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

9. In sub-section (1) of section 4 of the principal Act, for the words
“twenty thousand rupees”, the words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

10. In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section S of the
principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “‘one thousand five
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

11. In sub-section (1) of section 7 A of the principal Act, for the words
“five thousand rupees”, the words “seven thousand five hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

12. In the principal Act, after section 8, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“8A. Recovery of Government dues.— If any person to whom any
amount is admissible under this Act, has not paid to the State Government
any amount payable by him on account of any facility provided to him by
the State Government in his capacity as a Minister, Leader of Opposition,



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), FEB. 24, 2011 737
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

Speaker, Deputy Minister, Deputy Speaker, Chief Parliamentary Secretary,
Parliamentary Secretary or Member, then notwithstanding anything
contrary contained in the sanction letter, agreement or mortgage deed, the
amount so due from him, may be recovered from the amount admissible to
him under this Act and if no amount is admissible or the amount so
admissible is insufficient, in that case, the amount so due, shall be recovered
from him or his legal representatives as arrears of land revenue.

Explanation.— For the purposes of this section, the word “facility”
means facility of whatever nature and includes house/flat building/purchase
advance, motor car advance, medical advance, rent of Government
accommodation, State car, telephone/mobile phone or hospitality charges
given under the provisions of the Haryana Legislative Assembly
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1975 (2 of 1975), the Haryana
Legislative Assembly (Facilities to Members) Act, 1979 (9 of 1979), the
Haryana Salaries and Allowances of Minister Act, 1970 (3 of 1970), the
Haryana Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries
and Allowances Act, 1975 (3 of 1975) and the Haryana Legislative Assembly
(Medical Facilities to Members) Act, 1986 (19 of 1986) and rules made
thereunder or instructions issued, from time to time.” .

13. (1) The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension «f
Members) Amendment Ordinance, 2010 (Haryana Ordinance No. 11 of 2010),
hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action take
under the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed
have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Repeal and
saving.



738 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Some allowances of the Members of Legislative Assembly and salary of
the Leader of the Opposition which are being provided under the provisions of
‘The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act
1975 were enhanced more than two years ago. Keeping in the view the rise in
cost of living and to deal with the problems of general public in the Constituency,
the Government has decided to enhance the Constituency Allowance, Sumptuary
Allowance, Office Allowance, Secretarial Allowance, Daily Allowance and Pension
of Ex-ML As. Salary of Leader of Opposition is also being enhanced. Further it has
also been decided to insert a new provision for providing the salary to the Member
of Legislative Assembly.

At present some facilities in the nature of House Building Advance / Motor
Car Advance/ Rent of Government accommodation/medical advance/State Car/
Telephone/Mobile phones and hospitality charges are being provided to the
ML As/Ministers/Speaker/Deputy Speaker/Leader of Opposition/Deputy
Ministers/ Chief Parliamentary Secretaries by the Government under various Acts/
Rules/Instructions. In some cases the recoverable amount, which is due on account
of any facility provided by the Government, can not be recovered from the amount
of allowances/pension admissible to him, in that position, it has been decided to
make provision in The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension
of Members) Act, 1975 by inserting a new Section 8A after Section 8.

RANDEEP SINGH SURIEWALA,
Parliamentary Affairs Minister, Haryana.

The Governor has, in pursuance of Clauses (1) and (3) of Article 207 of the
Constitution of India, recomended to the Haryana Legislative Assembly the
introduction and consideration of the Bill.

Chandigarh : SUMIT KUMAR,
The 24th February, 2011 Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011 739
) (PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The proposed enhancement of salary of Leader of Opposition, insertion of
a new provision of salary to MLAs and enhancement of allowances will entail an
extra expenditure of Rs.1,80,84,000/- per year on the State Exchequer is detailed
as under:—

1. Salary of Leader of Opposition Rs. 2,40,000/- Per year
Rs. 20000/-to Rs. 40000/- p.m.

2. Salary of Member of Legislative Rs.73,20, 000/- Per year
Assembly (61 MLAs) Rs. 10,000/-p.m.

3. Constituency Allowance from Rs. 54,00,000/- Per year
Rs.15000/-to Rs. 20000/-p.m.
(All 90 ML As)

4. Sumptuary Allowance of MLAs Rs.14,64,000/- Per year
Rs. 3000/-to Rs. 5000/-p.m.
(61 MLAs)

5. Secretarial Allowance of ML As Rs. 36,60,000/- Per year
Rs. 5000/-to Rs.10000/-p.m.
(61 ML As).

However, the expenditure by enhancing the Daily Allowance of MLAs,
and pension of Ex-MLAs can not be calculated.



iftray AP @
YR |

1975 & &RAON
P 2 & &
e & Hea |

1975 ¥ ghamm
afafam 2 &
wftra o @t
Hme |
1975 & &Raom
afafrgw 2 9§ g
2% &I @I A

1975 & gRarom
afafrm 2 & g
3F F FWUA|

1975 & gfamonm
afafrm 2 &) awy
3 H HMEA|

1975 ¥ wfRamon
sfrfram 2 Y e
3 & G|

740 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

[9ga srgare ]

2011 &1 fadys Wer 1-Tho Tedo Yo
RO e |7 (A < T der) et e, 2011

RO fer Wy ey T oo dvr)
AR, 1975, F MY wofa
¥ R
e

YR TVRTY & qr93d 99 § gRamon 1o fRurmvesd gr1 fFfr=fifad wa 3
I8 el 8 -
1. (1) ug ffrw sRaon fuw o (@ W= ar dvE) Eeiee
g, 2011, HET S Al & |
(2) T8 fFEw 3 9RT 12 S SUd qRa A BN a3 ARfRm &
I IEY 7 AR, 2010 | AT Y THY TA |
2. sRamn fus o (Wew WO U 9ve) Affrm, 1975 (R, 3=,

T I, & ARfEw FE w8 F Y A 5, e v g daw)” ereet
qen TS} F WM W), (@S a9+, W qen ) B, e aen v uforenfie
T Sa |

3. qa sffrm & 9t fid 4, “@ew wn qen dom)” Ses! g ga)
F WH W, ([ daF, W den 4e)” sraw, e g e ghoeenfia fag
G|

4. I SffEm 3 gry 2 F 91, FreEfafed oy 3@ e, sraf —
2%, AAT—IAG G B TRAY €6 TR VI & A4 B
rrar fe smem 17
5 H& AffE @ aRT 3% ¥, “UE gUR I vl & WH |, 4
TR 9" eg wfaRefa f&T iR

6. W@ I $ ar1 37 §, “dF g9R U’ vEl & W W, Ui
R B wrer wfeeena feg g |

7. 7o R 3 ary 37 4, 4] TR UiE | v0d” A&l W W,
“gig gOIR 9" oI wleenid e S |



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), FEB. 24, 2011 741
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

8. ¥a JRfFrEw o ar1 39 #, “5,000- TW” 3P, RrEA A AT F WM 1075 ¥ sRamon

W, “TH IR 98 o wferenfa fapy S | PR 2 B ar
39 &1 guua|
9. ol AT B aRT 4 B YU-ART (1) F, “INF TR TR TRT F WM 1975 % wlamn

W, “Arefl g9R U8 wreg wfreenfid ey amdr | IR 2 3 AR
4 H1 HOHA|

10. &1 JRFIH A 9/1 5 B SCART (1) F TS (@) & IU9-TWS (i) #, “TD 1075 ¥ sRawn
W"\‘F@”M%“@HW, ‘T IR Ui G $93” veg wfovenfig fhe o) affrm 2 @ s

5 ®1 el
1. o Al &t g/ 78 A ITERT (1) F, “UE TR W7 TR F 1975 ¥ eRamn
WF R, ‘O gAR Ui 9 I v gRwenfia fhe s sfrfrm 2 A g™
7% ¥ GaEA|
12. 4 Affra &, arT 8 & 9re, Frefafad arr & Sl o — 1975 % e

‘o AYERI AT B e — T IS @l o g aftfgs & onflr sfafiem 2 3 am
B¢ YR AT T, W WHR gRT IHBI IS 73, yfauer & v, oremey, 8% & @ S
U w3, Surew, I WHdy Wfue, iy |fie o1 9w @) 3fraa |
Iuere 6t e & RO I gRT PAET DI TR 90 TR Bl
Y 1 Y g 2, A [Pl T, TR W 4% o 7 srafae {6 aa
& yiipd B gU R, TN TH UBR 27 gAY, 39 Iffam & aeflw SEat
ITT IR | age et qon AR P Mo s W T W ™
TSR FTR GRINT JUATG €, I6 T2 ¥, $9 PR 4T G0, Y0 &
IHE & WU H IER A W At gfafafal & axgelt ot

rEAT— T gR1 & WA & fog, Cgfaar” v ¥ aifmg § gRamon
fum= wwr (g W aen Yer) rfafam, 1975 (1975 @ 2), gREN fQuE
|1 (W Yfaan afefrra, 1979 (1979 &1 9), AN w3 d97T AR W
AR, 1970 (1970 & 3), ERAOT fAen= W01 Sreaed g IUrEdsl I Wl
fafam, 1975 (1975 @1 3) a1 RN faur™ W (wewg fafear gim)
AffraH, 1986 (1986 BT 19) TAT I 3EfF ¢ TV 470! I FHE-TT W®
SR el & Syl & o &) 8 fedt off www it g qun s Wi
foTan, T PR, SHABAAETET B A1 FEhR TR (7 |

13. (1) ERATT QUM G (GG 71 9U7 GIF) HINEA SISy, 2010 fRww @i
(2010 T ERATON I |E&AT 11), 39 g7 FAfya fpan wiran 21 amgf |

2) W FRET & 81 g N, I FARY gRT JAT FORE, HA
sffEm & onfla A 18 HIS T @1 A T FRATE, 39 AR g7 T A g
aftfraw & orfls & 1 P 9 W B T Farg gwsh S|



742 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011
(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

IR9dl TAT HRUN & fFavor

gRamon e @ (e war U dv) AffE, 1975 § MAEETEER A
gfauer 9 g a9 §) & P9 49 &) ¥ @ afdd ol | gd Fei v |
gt axgel @t Fal 7 g 3fg F IR T SR F a1 yiue 7 fRQum an
FSH & fam T &0 w3, FehR 91, Srtad w1, idy we o 8 e s g
Aaqd wel H Uea § gfg - &1 fotg forn @ | 5 ufioe & 99 & oAt qgr@ ot
o <@ ¥ U AfRe fum W wewl @ 999 WM A &g N T waw
e & fofy foran ma 2

T WY emerIuTs, ERImn e ewape gEtRiR shaiae
Wy Ffa@yA gfquer @ e |91 JeRll B I8 FAMMIey ROEST Aarey
faRTa/ AP eaT SRR FRSAGAAAZA BT § FebR w1 =1 sifafvamyy
fraqiferadl & wreumMreR YeTF {641 S 181 §1 &8 Al § el § WoR
ERT ¥&T9 @Y T S HON @ aget B qIaE 3= 98 WA J @ e o
Tadr | 3w Rufa § gw fofy forar wan & fF eRamon Qe @ (G s od 93m)
IR, 1975 Bt URT 8 F U TRT 8% HT e el Y |

"ty s A, gRamm |

ARG ¥ GRAUE F FPDT 207 F WIS (1) qAT (3) F ATH H IAATA
3 glaron fur a1 | 39 e & IRE 9 a0 39 W fER A @ Rwi
& el

IuINTE Jfa A,
24 BRI, 2011 g



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 24, 2011 743

(PHGN. 5, 1932 SAKA)

oty s

‘ Far wfyoer 3 Taifad 999 9fE, R e 9ERl @ 99 YSH 1§ Y
TR UTAEH 9 I WAl @) 3fg F Heawy 98 F WO WA 9ig @

AR 1,80,84,000/- Fo Uiy a¥ F AfaRed WR wem —

1. AT UfIuel &1 I99 To 20,000/- J
40,000/~ Fo UfHTE HI W

2. fum a1 we=l &t 10,000/ %o ufy #E
I 3 W (61 TIH! DY)

3. AU 9w &5 9= 15,000/~ Bo | 20,000/- Bo  Bo

gfertrd &R o) (ft 90 Tt B

4. THIY WIAT 3,000/~ Bo F 5,000/~ To
i TR TR (61 TSR BN

5. Wiy w7 5,000/~ o / 10,000/~ Bo
AN R IR (61 G| @)

o

o]

o 2,40,000/- gfa ad

73,20,000/- gfy o

54,00,000/- ufa oo

14,64,000/- ufa ¥

36,60,000/- ufar ad

e, farem Wt wel @1 T S e & W @ ayd 9ew ot ier
H eladl & SR AN AT JRIRe Td Pt 1o T A S Fhet |

48331 —H. V.S —H.GP, Chd.



