
Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015–2017 

 
Haryana Government Gazette 

EXTRAORDINARY 

Published by Authority 
© Govt.  of   Haryana  

156-2015/Ext.]   CHANDIGARH,  TUESDAY,  SEPTEMBER  1,  2015  (BHADRA  10,   1937  SAKA)              

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT 

Notification 

The 1st September, 2015 

No.12-HLA of 2015/ 73/13764.— The Haryana Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Bill, 

2015, is hereby published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of  the Rules of 

Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :- 

 Bill No.  12- HLA of  2015.                 

 

THE HARYANA VALUE ADDED TAX (SECOND AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015 

A  

BILL 

further to amend the Haryana Value Added Tax Act, 2003. 

 Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic 

of India as follows:- 

 

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Act, 2015. Short title. 

2.  In sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Haryana Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (hereinafter called 

the principal Act),- 

I.      after clause (o), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 

‘(oo)  “electronic governance” means the use of electronic medium for,- 

(i) filing of any form, return, annexure, application, declaration, certificate, 

memorandum of appeal, communication, intimation or any other document;  

(ii) creation, retention or preservation of records;  

(iii) issue or grant of any form including statutory declaration form, order, notice, 

communication, intimation or certificate; and 

(iv) receipt of tax, interest, penalty or any other payment or refund of the same 

through Government treasury or banks authorized by the Government 

treasury;’; 

II. for clause (w), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- 

‘(w) “input tax” means the amount of tax actually paid to the State in respect of goods 

sold to a VAT dealer, which such dealer is allowed to take credit of as actual 

payment of tax by him, calculated in accordance with the provisions of section 8;’. 

Amendment 

of section 2 of 
Haryana Act 

6 of 2003. 

Price : Rs. 5.00 (2241) 



 

 

2242 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 

Amendment of 
Section 8 of 

Haryana Act 6  

of 2003. 

3. For section 8 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “8.   Determination of input tax.- (1) Input tax in respect of any goods purchased by 

a VAT dealer shall be the amount of tax actually paid to the State on the sale of such goods 

to him and shall, in case of a dealer who is liable to pay tax under sub-section (1) of section 

3 or, as the case may be, makes an application  for  registration  in time under sub-section 

(2) of section 11, include the tax paid under this Act  and the Act of 1973 in respect of 

goods (except capital goods) held in stock by him on the day he becomes liable to pay tax 

but shall not include tax actually paid in respect of goods specified in Schedule E used or 

disposed of in  the circumstances mentioned against such goods: 

Provided that where the goods purchased in the State are used or disposed of partly 

in the circumstances mentioned in Schedule E and partly otherwise, the input tax in respect 

of such goods shall be computed pro rata: 

Provided further that if input tax in respect of any goods purchased in the State has 

been availed of but such goods are subsequently used or disposed of in the circumstances 

mentioned in Schedule E, the input tax in respect of such goods shall be reversed. 

(2)  A tax invoice issued to a VAT dealer showing the tax charged to him on the 

sale of invoiced goods shall, subject to the provisions of sub-section (3), be a proof of the 

tax paid on such goods for the purpose of sub-section (1). 

(3)  Where any claim of input tax in respect of any goods sold to a dealer is called 

into question in any proceeding under this Act, the authority conducting such proceeding 

may require such dealer to produce before it in addition to the tax invoice issued to him by 

the selling dealer in respect of the sale of the goods, a certificate furnished to him in the 

prescribed form and manner by the selling dealer and such authority shall allow the claim 

only if it is satisfied after making such inquiry, as it may deem necessary that the 

particulars contained in the certificate produced before it are true and correct and in no case 

the amount of input tax on purchase of any goods in the State shall exceed the amount of 

tax in respect of the same goods, actually paid under this Act into the Government treasury. 

(4)  The State Government may, from time to time, frame rules consistent with the 

provisions of this Act for computation of input tax and when such rules are framed, no 

input tax shall be computed except in accordance with such rules.”.  

Substitution of 
Section 15A of 

Haryana Act 6 

of 2003. 

4. For section 15A of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “15A. Provisional assessment.- If an assessing authority has reason to believe on the 

basis of documentary evidence available with him that a dealer has evaded or avoided 

payment of tax under this Act, he may after giving the dealer a reasonable opportunity of 

being heard, determine for any period of the current financial year and any time within a 

period of six months from the date of detection, the taxable turnover of such a dealer on 

provisional basis to the best of his judgment and assess him to tax accordingly. The amount 

of tax so assessed shall be payable by the dealer in accordance with the provisions of 

section 22. Every deposit of tax under this section shall be adjustable against the liability of 

the dealer in assessment made under section 15.”. 
Amendment of 

Section 16 of 
Haryana Act 6  

of 2003. 

5.        In section 16 of the principal Act,- 

(i) for the words “three years”, the words “six years” shall be substituted; and 

(ii) in the explanation, for the word “is”, the words “has been” shall be substituted. 

Substitution of 
section 17 of 

Haryana Act 6  

of 2003. 

6. For section 17 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

“17.  If in consequence of definite information which has come into its possession, the 

assessing authority discovers that the turnover of the business of a dealer has been under 

assessed or has escaped assessment or input tax or refund has been allowed in excess in 

any year, it may, at any time before the expiry of eight years following the close of that 

year or within three years from the date of final assessment order, whichever is later, after 

giving the dealer a reasonable opportunity, in the prescribed manner, of being heard, 

reassess the tax liability of the dealer for the year for which the reassessment is proposed to 

be made and for the purpose of reassessment, the assessing authority shall, in case the 

dealer fails to comply with the  terms of the notice issued to him for the purpose of 

reassessment, have power to reassess to the best of its judgment. ”. 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 2243 

 

7. In the second proviso to sub-section (1) of  section 34 of the principal Act, for the words 

“three years”, the words “six years” shall be substituted. 

Amendment 

 of section 34  

of Haryana  
Act 6  of 2003. 

8. After Chapter X of the principal Act, the following Chapter shall be inserted, namely:- 

“Chapter-XA 

Electronic governance 

 “54A. Implementation of electronic governance.— (1) Notwithstanding anything 

contained in this Act or the rules framed thereunder, the Commissioner may, by an order, with the 

approval of State Government, implement electronic governance for carrying out the various 

provisions of this Act and the rules framed thereunder. 

 (2) Where an order has been passed under sub-section (1), the Commissioner may, amend 

or introduce forms for returns, applications, declarations, annexures, memorandum of appeal, 

report of audit or any other document which is required to be submitted electronically.  

 (3) The Commissioner may, for reasons to be recorded in writing, extend or reduce the 

period prescribed under the Act and the rules framed thereunder for electronic governance. 

54B. Automation.— (1) The provisions contained in the Information Technology Act, 

2000 (21 of 2000) and the rules framed and directions given thereunder, including the provisions 

relating to digital signatures, electronic governance, attribution, acknowledgement and dispatch of 

electronic records, secure electronic records and secure digital signatures  and digital signature 

certificates, shall apply to the procedures under this Act and rules framed thereunder for 

electronic governance. 

 (2) Where any return, annexure, report of audit, document, application, form including 

statutory declaration form, certificate, communication or intimation  of a dealer is received 

electronically through the official website, such return, annexure, report of audit, document, 

application, form including statutory declaration form, certificate, communication or intimation 

shall be deemed to have been submitted by such dealer with his consent.  

 (3) Where a certificate of registration, order, form including statutory declaration, 

certificate, notice or communication is prepared on any automated data processing system and is 

sent to any dealer, then the said certificate of registration, order, form including statutory 

declaration, certificate,  notice or  communication shall  not be required to be personally signed 

by the Commissioner or any other officer subordinate to him and the certificate of registration, 

order, form including statutory declaration, certificate, notice or communication shall not be 

deemed to be invalid only on the ground that it has  not  been personally signed by the 

Commissioner or any other officer subordinate to him.  

Insertion of 

Chapter XA in 
Haryana Act 6  

of 2003. 

9.  In section 60 of the principal Act, for the words and signs “website 

www.haryanatax.com”, the words “official website” shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 
section 60 of 

Haryana Act 6 of 

2003. 

10.   (1)  The Haryana Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2015 (Haryana 

Ordinance No. 3 of 2015), is hereby repealed. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the said 

Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done or taken under this Act. 

Repeal and savings. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

2244 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

I. Section 2(1)(w) of the Haryana Value Added Tax Act, 2003 defines “input tax”.  “Input  tax” means the 

amount of tax paid to the State by the purchasing dealer to the selling dealer and the purchasing dealer takes credit 

thereof in accordance with the provisions of Section 8 of the Act. The purchasing dealer in order to claim input tax 

submits a form VAT ‘C’ 4, a declaration obtained from the selling dealer as a proof of purchase of goods. It is seen 

that in some cases where the selling dealer does not deposit its tax liability into the Government Treasury, even then 

under the existing provisions of Section 8, the purchasing VAT dealer can not be denied the benefit of input tax credit 

on the ground that selling VAT dealer has not deposited the tax. 

 In order to deny undue advantage of payment of input tax in cases where no tax is actually paid to the 

Government, it is desired to insert the words, “actually” in Section 2(1)(w) , Section 8(1) and Section 8(2). Further  in 

section 8(3) the following is desired to be added: 

“and in no case the amount of input tax on purchase of any goods in the State shall exceed the amount of 

tax in respect of the same goods, actually paid under this Act into the Government Treasury.” 

II. Sections 15-A, 16, 17 and 34 of the Haryana Value Added Tax Act, 2003, relate to provisional assessment, 

assessment of unregistered dealers, re-assessment and revision of assessed cases. Limitation period has been 

prescribed under these sections within which the assessments or revisions have to be completed. The State 

Government has decided to extend the limitation period for provisional assessment, assessment of unregistered dealer, 

reassessment and revision cases so that the cases of builders, developers could be reassessed or revised in accordance 

with the judgment of Hon’ble Supreme Court in the case of L&T Limited. Further, Hon’ble Lokayukta has also 

desired that limitation period may be increased by the Government to bring the cases, within limitation of assessment, 

reassessment and revision. 

III. The Excise and Taxation Department is in the process of implementation of electronic governance of the 

procedures prescribed under the HVAT Act and Rules, 2003. The registration, amendment, cancellation, applications, 

notices, returns under the computerization system will be submitted online. In order to implement the electronic 

governance clause (oo) is desired to be added to section 2(1) to define “electronic governance”. A new chapter ‘XA’ 

is desired to be inserted to the Haryana Value Added Tax Act, 2003. Section 54A, 54B are inserted in the proposed 

new chapter. Section 54 A enables the Commissioner to implement electronic governance for carrying out the various 

provisions of this Act and Rules framed thereunder. Amendment in section  60 is also proposed by substituting 

“website www.haryanatax.com” with “official website” to make it compatible  with the electronic governance.  

In order to give effect to the above decisions, since the State Legislature of Haryana was not in session, the 

Haryana Ordinance No. 3 of 2015 was issued by the Governor of Haryana vide notification No. Leg.9/2015 published 

on 3rd August, 2015. 

In order to give effect to the above decisions it will be necessary to regularize the Haryana Value Added Tax 

(Amendment) Ordinance , 2015 (Haryana Ordinance No. 3 of 2015).  

Hence, this Bill.          

 CAPTAIN ABHIMANYU, 

 Excise and Taxation Minister, Haryana. 

 

____________ 

Chandigarh: RAJENDER KUMAR NANDAL, 

The 1st September, 2015. Secretary. 

 

http://www.haryanatax.com/


 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 2245 

 
      [izkf/kd`r vuqokn ] 

2015 dk fo/ks;d la[;k 12&,p-,y-,- 

   gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj ¼f}rh; la’kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2015 

gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj vf/kfu;e] 2003] 

dks vkxs la’kksf/kr djus ds fy,  

fo/ks;d 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fN;klBosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 

vf/kfu;fer gks %&  

1-    ;g vf/kfu;e gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj ¼f}rh; la’kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2015] dgk tk ldrk gSA      laf{kIr ukeA 

2-    gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj vf/kfu;e] 2003 ¼ftls] blesa] blds ckn] ewy vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½] dh 

/kkjk 2 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa]& 

       I. [k.M ¼.k½ ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~ %& 

         *¼.k.k½ **bySDVªksfud 'kklu** ls vfHkizk; gS] fuEufyf[kr ds fy, bySDVªksfud ek/;e dk iz;ksx 

djuk]& 

¼i½   dksbZ iz:i] fooj.kh] vuqyXud] vkosnu] ?kks"k.kk] izek.k&i=] vihy dk Kkiu] 

lalwpuk] lwpuk ;k dksbZ vU; nLrkost nk;j djuk ( 

¼ii½    fjdkMZ dk lt̀u] /kkj.k ;k ifjj{k.k ( 

¼iii½   dksbZ iz:i tkjh vFkok iznku djuk blesa oS/kkfud ?kks"k.kk iz:i] vkns'k] uksfVl] 

lalwpuk] lwpuk ;k izek.k&i= Hkh 'kkfey gSa( rFkk 

¼iv½   ljdkjh [ktkus ;k ljdkjh [ktkus }kjk izkf/kd`r cSadksa ds ek/;e ls dj] C;kt] 

'kkfLr ;k dksbZ vU; Hkqxrku ;k mudh okilh dh jlhn(*( 

       II.  [k.M ¼c½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr [k.M izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 

 *¼c½  **fuos'k dj** ls vfHkizk; gS] fdlh oSV O;ogkjh dks foØ; fd, x, eky ds lEcU/k esa 

jkT; dks okLrfod :i esa Hkqxrku dh xbZ dj dh jkf'k] ftldk ,sls O;ogkjh dks ml 

}kjk /kkjk 8 ds micU/kksa ds vuqlkj ifjdfyr dj ds okLrfod Hkqxrku ds :i esa 

ØsfMV vuqer fd;k x;k gS (*A 

2003 dk 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 2 dk 

la'kks/kuA 

3-    ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 8 ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr /kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 

            **8- fuos'k dj dk vo/kkj.k-& ¼1½ fdlh oSV O;ogkjh }kjk [kjhns x, fdlh eky ds laca/k esa 

fuos'k dj] mldks ,sls eky ds foØ; ij jkT; dks okLrfod :i esa Hkqxrku dh xbZ dj dh jkf'k 

gksxh rFkk fdlh O;ogkjh dh n'kk esa] tks /kkjk 3 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu dj Hkqxrku ds fy, 

nk;h gS vFkok] tSlh Hkh fLFkfr gks] /kkjk 11 dh mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds v/khu le; ij iathdj.k ds fy, 

vkosnu djrk gS] blesa ml fnu ftldks og dj Hkqxrku ds fy, nk;h gks tkrk gS] ml }kjk LVkd 

esa j[ks x, eky ¼iwath eky ds flok;½ ds laca/k esa bl vf/kfu;e rFkk 1973 ds vf/kfu;e ds v/khu 

Hkqxrku fd;k x;k dj Hkh 'kkfey gS] fdUrq vuqlwph ³ esa fofufnZ"V eky ,sls eky ds fo#) of.kZr 

ifjfLFkfr;ksa esa iz;qDr ;k O;;u ds laca/k esa okLrfod :i esa Hkqxrku fd;k x;k dj 'kkfey ugha 

gksxk % 

ijUrq tgka jkT; esa [kjhnk x;k eky vuqlwph ³ esa of.kZr ifjfLFkfr;ksa esa Hkkxr% rFkk vU;Fkk 

Hkkxr% iz;qDr ;k O;;u fd;k tkrk gS] rks ,sls eky ds laca/k esa fuos'k dj vuqikr esa laxf.kr fd;k 

tk,xk % 

ijUrq ;g vkSj fd ;fn jkT; esa [kjhns x, fdlh eky ds laca/k esa fuos'k dj izkIr dj fy;k 

x;k gS fdUrq ,sls eky vuqlwph ³ esa of.kZr ifjfLFkfr;ksa esa ckn esa iz;qDr ;k O;;u fd, x, gSa] rks 

,sls eky ds laca/k esa fuos'k dj izfrofrZr fd;k tk,xkA 

 

2003 dk 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 8 dk 

la'kks/kuA 



 

 

2246 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 

 
¼2½  chtd eky ds foØ; ij oSV O;ogkjh ls izHkkfjr dj n'kkZrs gq, mldks tkjh fd;k 

x;k dj chtd mi/kkjk ¼3½ ds micU/kksa ds v/;/khu mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds iz;kstu ds fy, ,sls eky ij 

Hkqxrku fd, x, dj dk lcwr gksxkA 

¼3½  tgka fdlh O;ogkjh dks foØ; fd, x, fdlh eky ds laca/k esa fuos'k dj dk dksbZ 

nkok bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu fdlh dk;Zokgh esa iz'uxr fd;k tkrk gS] rks ,slh dk;Zokgh djus 

okyk izkf/kdkjh ,sls O;ogkjh ls eky ds foØ; ds laca/k esa foØsrk O;ogkjh }kjk mldks tkjh fd, 

x, dj chtd ds vfrfjDr] foØsrk O;ogkjh }kjk fofgr iz:i rFkk jhfr esa mls fn, x, 

izek.k&i= dks vius lEeq[k izLrqr djus dh vis{kk dj ldrk gS rFkk ,slk izkf/kdkjh nkos dks 

dsoy rHkh vuqKkr djsxk ;fn ,slh tkap tks og vko';d le>s] djus ds ckn] mldh lUrqf"V gks 

xbZ gS fd mlds lEeq[k izLrqr fd, x, izek.k&i= esa fn, x, C;kSjs lR; rFkk lgh gSa rFkk jkT; 

esa fdlh eky dh [kjhn ij fuos'k dj dh jkf'k fdlh Hkh n'kk esa bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu mlh 

eky ds lEcU/k esa ljdkjh [ktkus esa okLrfod :i esa Hkqxrku dh xbZ dj dh jkf'k ls vf/kd ugha 

gksxhA 

¼4½ jkT; ljdkj] le;&le; ij] fuos'k dj dh lax.kuk ds fy, bl vf/kfu;e ds 

micU/kksa ls laxr fu;e cuk ldrh gS rFkk tc ,sls fu;e cuk, tkrs gSa] rks dksbZ Hkh fuos'k dj 

,sls fu;eksa dh leuq:irk ds fcuk laxf.kr ugha fd;k tk,xkA**A 

2003 dk gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 15d dk 

izfrLFkkiuA 

4-    ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 15d ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr /kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 

     **15d- vufUre fu/kkZj.k-& ;fn fu/kkZj.k izkf/kdkjh mlds ikl miyC/k nLrkosth lk{; ds vk/kkj ij 

fo'okl djus dk dkj.k j[krk gS fd fdlh O;ogkjh us bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu dj ds Hkqxrku dk 

vioapu vFkok ifjgkj fd;k gS] rks og O;ogkjh dks lquokbZ dk ;qfDr;qDr volj nsus ds ckn] pkyw foRr 

o"kZ dh fdlh vof/k gsrq rFkk vfHkKku dh frfFk ls Ng ekl dh vof/k ds Hkhrj fdlh Hkh le;] viuh 

loksZRre foosdcqf) ls vufUre vk/kkj ij ,sls fdlh O;ogkjh dk djk/ks; vkorZ vo/kkfjr dj ldrk gS 

rFkk rn~uqlkj dj ds fy, mldk fu/kkZj.k dj ldrk gSA bl izdkj fu/kkZfjr dh xbZ dj jkf'k /kkjk 22 

ds micU/kksa ds vuqlkj O;ogkjh }kjk Hkqxrku;ksX; gksxhA bl /kkjk ds v/khu tek djok;k x;k izR;sd dj 

/kkjk 15 ds v/khu fd, x, fu/kkZj.k esa O;ogkjh ds nkf;Ro ds fo#) lek;ksT; gksxkA**A 

 

2003 dk gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 16 dk 

la'kks/kuA 

5-      ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 16 esa]& 

        ¼i½  **rhu o"kZ** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij] **Ng o"kZ** 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd,  tk,axs ( rFkk 

        ¼ii½  O;k[;k esa] **gks x;k gS** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij] **fd;k x;k gS** 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

 

2003 dk gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 17 dk 

izfrLFkkiuA 

6-     ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 17 ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr /kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 

       **17-  ;fn fu/kkZj.k izkf/kdkjh dks ,slh fuf'pr tkudkjh ds ifj.kkeLo:i tks mlds dCts esa vk 

xbZ gS] mls irk pyrk gS fd fdlh o"kZ esa fdlh O;ogkjh ds dkjckj dk vkorZ fu/kkZj.kk/khu gks x;k gS ;k 

fu/kkZj.k ls NwV x;k gS ;k fuos'k dj ;k okilh vf/kd vuqKkr gks xbZ gS] rks og ml o"kZ dh lekfIr ds 

vkxkeh vkB o"kZ dh lekfIr ls iwoZ ;k vfUre fu/kkZj.k vkns'k dh frfFk ls rhu o"kZ ds Hkhrj] tks Hkh ckn 

esa gks] fdlh Hkh le;] fofgr jhfr esa] O;ogkjh dks lquokbZ dk ;qfDr;qDr volj nsus ds ckn] ml o"kZ ds 

fy, ftlds fy, iqufuZ/kkZj.k izLrkfor fd;k x;k gS] O;ogkjh ds dj nkf;Ro dks iqufuZ/kkZfjr dj ldrk gS 

rFkk iqufuZ/kkZj.k ds iz;kstu ds fy,] fu/kkZj.k izkf/kdkjh] ;fn O;ogkjh iqufuZ/kkZj.k ds iz;kstu ds fy, mls 

tkjh fd, x, uksfVl ds fucU/kuksa dh vuqikyuk djus esa vlQy jgrk gS] rks mls viuh loksZRre foosd 

cqf) ls iqufuZ/kkZj.k dh 'kfDr gksxhA**A 

 

2003 dk gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 34 dk 

la'kks/kuA 

7-      ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 34 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds f}rh; ijUrqd esa] **rhu o"kZ** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij] 

**Ng o"kZ** 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 2247 

 

8-   ewy vf/kfu;e ds v/;k; X ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr v/;k; j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~ %& 

**v/;k;&Xd 

bySDVªksfud 'kklu 

            **54d- bySDVªksfud 'kklu dk ykxwdj.k-& ¼1½ bl vf/kfu;e ;k blds v/khu cuk, x, 

fu;eksa esa nh xbZ fdlh ckr ds gksrs gq, Hkh] vk;qDr] jkT; ljdkj ds vuqeksnu ls] vkns'k }kjk bl 

vf/kfu;e ;k blds v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds fofHkUu micU/kksa dks dk;kZfUor djus ds fy, 

bySDVªksfud 'kklu ykxw dj ldrk gSA 

      ¼2½  tgka mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu vkns'k ikfjr fd;k x;k gS] rks vk;qDr] foojf.k;ksa] 

vkosnuksa] ?kks"k.kkvksa] vuqyXudksa] vihy dk Kkiu] ys[kkijh{kk dh fjiksVZ ;k fdlh vU; nLrkost ds 

fy, iz:iksa dks la'kksf/kr ;k izofrZr dj ldrk gS tks bySDVªksfud :i ls izLrqr fd;s tkus visf{kr 

gSaA 

¼3½  vk;qDr] vfHkfyf[kr fd, tkus okys dkj.kksa ls] bySDVªksfud 'kklu ds fy, bl 

vf/kfu;e ;k blds v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds v/khu fofgr vof/k c<+k ;k ?kVk ldrk gSA 

54[k- Lopyhdj.k-& ¼1½ lwpuk izkS|ksfxdh vf/kfu;e] 2000 ¼2000 dk  21½ rFkk blds 

v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa rFkk fn, x, funsZ'kksa esa fn, x, micU/k] blesa fMftVy gLrk{kjksa] 

bySDVªksfud 'kklu] vkjksi.k] vfHkLohd`̀fr rFkk bySDVªksfud fjdkMZ ds izs"k.k] lqjf{kr bySDVªksfud 

fjdkMZ] lqjf{kr fMftVy gLrk{kjksa rFkk fMftVy gLrk{kj izek.k&i=ksa ls lEcfU/kr micU/k Hkh 

'kkfey gSa] bySDVªksfud 'kklu ds fy, bl vf/kfu;e rFkk blds v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds v/khu 

izfØ;k dks ykxw gksaxsA 

¼2½  tgka fdlh O;ogkjh dh dksbZ fooj.kh] vuqyXud] ys[kkijh{kk fjiksVZ] nLrkost] vkosnu] 

iz:i] blesa oS/kkfud ?kks"k.kk iz:i] izek.k&i=] lalwpuk ;k lwpuk Hkh 'kkfey gS] dk;kZy; oSc lkbZV 

ds ek/;e ls bySDVªksfud :i ls izkIr fd;k x;k gS] rks ,slh fooj.kh] vuqyXud] ys[kkijh{kk fjiksVZ] 

nLrkost] vkosnu] iz:i] blesa oS/kkfud ?kks"k.kk iz:i] izek.k&i=] lalwpuk ;k lwpuk Hkh 'kkfey gS] 

,sls O;ogkjh }kjk mldh lgefr ls izLrqr fd;k x;k le>k tk,xkA 

¼3½  tgka iathdj.k izek.k&i=] vkns'k] iz:i] blesa oS/kkfud ?kks"k.kk] izek.k&i=] uksfVl ;k 

lalwpuk Hkh 'kkfey gS] fdlh Lopfyr MkWVk lalk/ku iz.kkyh ij rS;kj fd;k x;k gS vkSj fdlh 

O;ogkjh dks Hkstk x;k gS] rks mDr iathdj.k dk izek.k&i=] vkns'k] iz:i] blesa oS/kkfud ?kks"k.kk] 

izek.k&i=] uksfVl ;k lalwpuk Hkh 'kkfey gS] vk;qDr ;k mlds v/khuLFk fdlh vU; vf/kdkjh }kjk 

O;fDrxr :i ls gLrk{kfjr fd;k tkuk visf{kr ugha gksxk rFkk iathdj.k dk izek.k&i=] vkns'k] 

iz:i] blesa oS/kkfud ?kks"k.kk] izek.k&i=] uksfVl ;k lalwpuk Hkh 'kkfey gS] dsoy bl vk/kkj ij 

voS/k ugha le>k tk,xk fd ;g vk;qDr ;k mlds v/khuLFk fdlh vU; vf/kdkjh }kjk O;fDrxr 

:i ls gLrk{kfjr ugha fd;k x;k gSA 

2003 dk 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 esa 

v/;k; Xd 

j[kukA 

9-     ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 60 esa] **oSclkbZV MCY;wMCY;wMCY;w MkWV gfj;k.kk VSDl MkWV dkWe**] 'kCnksa ds 

LFkku ij] **dk;kZy; oSclkbZV** 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

2003 dk 

gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 6 dh 

/kkjk 60 dk 

la'kks/kuA 

10-   ¼1½  gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj ¼f}rh; la’kks/ku½ v/;kns’k] 2015 ¼2015 dk gfj;k.kk v/;kns’k  

la[;k 3½] blds }kjk] fujflr fd;k tkrk gSA 

        ¼2½  ,sls fujlu ds gksrs gq, Hkh] mDr v/;kns’k ds v/khu dh xbZ dksbZ ckr ;k dh xbZ dksbZ 

dkjZokbZ] bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu dh xbZ ckr ;k dh xbZ dkjZokbZ le>h tk,xhA 

fujlu rFkk 

O;ko`̀fRrA 

 



 

 

2248 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  SEPT.  1,  2015  (BHDR.  10,  1937  SAKA) 

mn~ns';ksa rFkk dkj.kksa dk fooj.k 

1- gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj vf/kfu;e] 2003] dh /kkjk 2¼1½¼o½ ‘fuos'k dj’ dks ifjHkkf"kr djrh gSA ‘fuos'k dj’ ls 

vfHkizk; gS fd Ø; O;ogkjh }kjk foØ; djus okys O;ogkjh ls izkIr jkT; dks Hkqxrku dh xbZ ‘dj’ dh jkf'k rFkk Ø; 

O;ogkjh }kjk /kkjk 8 ds micU/kksa ds vuqlj.k esa ifjdfYir dj ds Hkqxrku ds :i esa ØsfMV fn;k tkrk gS A Ø; O;ogkjh 

fuos'k dj ds nkos ds fy;s fcØh djus okys O;ogkjh ls Ø; eky ds lcwr ds rkSj ij ?kks"k.kk izkIr djds izk:i&x&4 

izLrqr djrk gS A dqN dslksa esa ;g ns[kk x;k gS fd fcØh djus okyk O;ogkjh ljdkjh [kt+kus esa viuh dj nsunkjh tek 

ugha djrk] fQj Hkh /kkjk 8 ds ekStwnk izko/kkuksa vuqlkj Ø; oSV O;ogkjh dks fcØh djus okys oSV O;ogkjh }kjk dj tek 

u djokus ds vk/kkj ij fuos'k dj ds ykHk ls budkj ugha fd;k tk ldrk A  

mu ekeyksa esa tgka ljdkj dks ‘dj’ okLro esa vnk ugha fd;k x;k gS fuos'k dj ds Hkqxrku ds ykHk dks budkj 

djus ds fy;s /kkjk 2¼1½¼c½] /kkjk 8¼1½ rFkk /kkjk 8¼2½ esa ‘okLro esa’ 'kCn Mky fn;k tk,A vkxd /kkjk 8¼3½ esa fuEufyf[kr 

tksM+ fn;k tk, % 

“rFkk jkT; esa fdlh eky dh [kjhn ij fuos'k dj dh jkf'k fdlh Hkh n'kk esa bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu mlh eky 

ds lEcU/k esa ljdkjh [ktkus esa okLrfod :i esa Hkqxrku fd, x, dj dh jkf'k ls vf/kd ugha gksxh A” 

2- gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj vf/kfu;e] 2003] dh /kkjk 15d] 16] 17 rFkk 34 vUrfje fu/kkZj.k] viathd`r O;ogkfj;ksa 

dk fu/kkZj.k] iqufuZ/kkZj.k rFkk fu/kkZfjr ekeyksa esa la'kks/ku ls lEcfU/kr gSA bu /kkjkvksa ds v/khu fu/kkZfjr ,d lhek vof/k 

ds Hkhrj fu/kkZj.k vFkok la'kks/ku fd;s tkrs gSaA jkT; ljdkj us fcYMj] fMoSyij ds ekeyksa esa ekuuh; mPpre U;k;ky; 

}kjk ,y ,.M Vh fyfeVsM ds dsl ds fu.kZ; vuqlkj iqufuZ/kkZj.k ;k la'kksf/kr djus ds fy;s vUrfje fu/kkZj.k] viathd̀r 

O;ogkjh dk fu/kkZj.k] iqufuZ/kkZj.k rFkk la'kks/ku ekeys esa lhek vof/k c<+kus dk fu.kZ; fy;k gSA ekuuh; yksdk;qDr gfj;k.kk 

us Hkh fu/kkZj.k] iqufuZ/kkZj.k rFkk la'kks/ku ds ekeyksa dks lhek vof/k esa ykus ckjs dgk gSA  

3- vkcdkjh o djk/kku foHkkx bySDVªksfud 'kklu dh izfØ;k dks ykxw djus ds fy;s gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj 

vf/kfu;e rFkk fu;e] 2003] esa izko/kku fd;k tkuk gS A iathdj.k] la'kks/ku] jn~n] fuosnu] uksfVl] fooj.kh dEiqVjkbZts'ku 

flLVe ds v/khu vkuykbZu Hkjh tk,axh A bySDVªksfud 'kklu ykxw djus ds fy, /kkjk 2¼1½ esa [k.M ¼u u½ esa ‘bySDVªksfud 

'kklu’ dh ifjHkk"kk tksM+ nh tk;s A ,d u;k v/;k; ‘Hk d’ gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr vf/kfu;e] 2003] esa Mky fn;k tk;s A 

izLrkfor u;s v/;k; esa /kkjk 54d] 54[k Mky nh tk, A /kkjk 54 ds }kjk vf/kfu;e rFkk fu;e ds v/khu cus fofHkUu 

izko/kkuksa dks bySDVªksfud 'kklu }kjk ykxw djus ds fy;s vk;qDr dks l{ke cukrk gSA /kkjk 60 esa Hkh la'kks/ku fd;k tkuk 

gS] ftlds }kjk bySDVªksfud 'kklu dks la;ksT; cukus ds fy, ‘MCY;w MCY;w MCY;w gfj;k.kk VSDl MkV dkse’ dks ‘vkfQly 

oSclkbV’ ds lkFk izfrLFkkfir dj fn;k tk;sA  

 mijksDr fu.kZ; ds vkns'k dks dk;kZfUor djus ds fy;s tcfd gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk dk l= ugh a Fkk jkT;iky] 

gfj;k.kk 2015 dks gfj;k.kk v/;kns'k }kjk vf/klwpuk la[;k ySt 9@2015] 3 vxLr] 2015 dks gfj;k.kk v/;kns'k la[;k 3 

tkjh fd;kA  

mijksDr fu.kZ; dks dk;kZfUor ds fy, gfj;k.kk ewY; of/kZr dj ¼f}Ùkh; la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2015 ¼2015 dk 

gfj;k.kk v/;kns'k Øekad 3½ dks fu;fer fd;k tkuk vko';d gS A  

vr% ;g fo/ks;d A 

 dSIVu vfHkeU;q]  

 †Ö²ÖÛúÖ¸üß ¾Ö Ûú¸üÖ¬ÖÖ®Ö ea=h] gfj;k.kkA 

____________ 

 

p.Mhx<+ : jktsUnz dqekj ukany] 

fnukad 1 flrEcj] 2015- lfpoA  

    

 

   

   

   

53659—H.V.S.—H.G.P., Chd. 


