
(3731) 

 

 

Haryana Government Gazette 
EXTRAORDINARY 

Published by Authority 
© Govt.  of   Haryana  

210-2025/Ext.]   CHANDIGARH,  THURSDAY,  DECEMBER  18,  2025  (AGRAHAYANA 27,   1947  SAKA)              

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA  

Notification 

The 18th December, 2025 

No. 39-HLA of 2025/80/28965.— The Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishment 

(Amendment) Bill, 2025 is hereby published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of  

the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :- 

Bill No. 39-HLA of 2025 

A 

BILL 

further to amend the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments Act, 1958. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-sixth Year of the 

Republic of India as follows:- 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments 

(Amendment) Act, 2025. 

 (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 12th November, 2025. 

Short title and 
commencement. 

 

2. After sub-section (4) of section 1 of the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments 

Act, 1958 (hereinafter called the principal Act), the following sub-section shall be added, namely :- 

            “(5) The provisions of this Act except section 13A shall apply to the shops and 

 establishments employing twenty or more workers and provisions of section 13A of this Act 

 shall apply to the shops and establishments employing less than twenty workers.”.  

Amendment of 

section 1 of 
Punjab Act 15 of 

1958. 

 

3. In section 7 of the principal Act ,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "nine hours", the words "ten hours" shall be 

substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), in the proviso, in clause (a), for the word "fifty", the words  and 

sign "one hundred fifty-six" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 

section 7 of 
Punjab Act 15 of 

1958. 

 



 

 

 

3732 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 

Amendment of 
section 8 of 

Punjab Act 15 

of 1958. 

4. In sub-section (1) of section 8 of the principal Act, for the words “ five hours”, the words  

“six hours” shall be substituted.  

Substitution of 

section 13 of 

Punjab Act 15 
of 1958. 

 

5. For section 13 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be substituted, namely :-  

  “13. Registration of establishments.- (1) The employer of every establishment 

 employing twenty or more workers shall,  within a period of one month from the date of 

 commencement of his business,  submit an application online in such  form, together with 

 such fee and  documents, as may be prescribed, containing- 

(a) the name of the employer and the manager, if any; 

(b) postal address along with GPS location of the establishment; 

(c) name of the establishment; 

(d) number of persons employed in the establishment; 

(e) nature of the business of an establishment; and 

(f) such other particulars, as may be prescribed. 

          (2)  On receipt of an application along with documents and fee, the Inspector shall verify 

the correctness of the application and documents attached thereto and on being satisfied shall issue 

online registration certificate to the employer in such form, as may be prescribed within the time 

limit as notified under the Haryana Right to Service Act, 2014 (4 of 2014). 

 (3) A registration certificate issued under sub-section (2) shall be valid until it is amended 

or cancelled upon closing of the establishment or revoked by the Inspector after verification, on such 

conditions and manner, as may be prescribed. 

          (4) It shall be the duty of the employer to intimate the Inspector online, any change in the 

particulars furnished in the application submitted for registration within a period of seven days after 

the change has taken place, in such form, as may be prescribed. 

 (5) In case of change with regard to the name of establishment, employer, manager and 

work force details, the employer shall make an application for amended registration certificate as per 

the provisions of sub-section (2) and no fee shall be charged for issuance of amended registration 

certificate.  

 (6) The employer shall intimate to the Inspector online about closing of the establishment, 

within thirty days of closing. The Inspector shall, on receiving the information and being satisfied 

about the correctness, remove the name of such establishment from the register of establishment and 

cancel the registration certificate. 

 (7) In case of any contravention of, or failure to comply with the provisions of this section, 

the employer shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than three thousand rupees but may 

extend to ten thousand rupees for the first violation and in case of second violation,  he shall be liable 

to a penalty which shall not be less than five thousand rupees but may extend to twenty-five thousand 

rupees: 

  Provided that in case of continuous subsequent violation, the competent authority, as 

 specified by the Government, may impose penalty at the rate of five hundred rupees for every 

 day.  

  13A. Intimation of establishment employing less than twenty workers.- The employer 

 of every establishment employing less than twenty workers shall, within a period of one 

 month from the date of commencement of his business, submit online intimation to the 

 Inspector in such form, as may be prescribed. The employer providing intimation shall be 

 provided a Basic Information Performa ID Number.”.         

Amendment of 

section 19 of 
Punjab  Act 15 

of 1958. 

 

 

 

6. In sub-section (3) of section 19 of the principal Act, for the words and figure “section 21 of 

the Indian Penal Code”, the words, figures and brackets “clause (28) of section 2 of the Bharatiya 

Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Central Act 45 of 2023)” shall be substituted. 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 3733 

7. For sub-sections (5) and (6) of section 20 of the principal Act, the following sub-sections 

shall be substituted, namely :-  

  “(5) In case of any contravention of the foregoing provisions of this section, the 

 employer of an establishment shall be liable to a penalty not exceeding five hundred rupees 

 for every day during which the contravention occurs or continues. 

          (6) If any person with intent to deceive, makes, or causes, or allows to be made, in 

 any such record, register or notice as aforesaid an entry which is to his knowledge false in 

 any material particular, or wilfully omits or causes or allows to be omitted from any such 

 record, register or notice an entry required to  be made therein, he shall be liable to a penalty 

 which shall not be less than three thousand rupees but may extend to ten thousand rupees 

 for the first violation and in case of second violation, he shall be liable to a penalty which 

 shall not be less than five thousand rupees but may extend to twenty-five thousand rupees: 

   Provided that in case of continuous subsequent violation, the competent authority, as 

 specified by the Government may impose penalty at the rate of five hundred rupees for every 

 day.”.   

Amendment of 
section 20 of 

Punjab Act 15 of 

1958. 

8. After section 20 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be inserted, namely:- 

  “20A. Appointment letter.- Every employer of an establishment shall furnish 

 to all his employees with the letter of appointment, having affixed the photograph of 

 employee and obtain acknowledgement thereto. 

  20B. Identity card.- Every employer of an establishment shall furnish to every worker 

 an identity card containing such particulars, as may be prescribed.”. 

Insertion of 

section 20A and 

20B in Punjab 
Act 15 of 1958. 

 

 

 

9. For sub-section (2) of section 21 of the principal Act, the following sub-section shall be 

substituted, namely:- 

  “(2) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) or wilfully obstructs the 

 inspecting authority in exercise of the powers under this Act or conceals or prevents any 

 employee in an establishment from appearing before or being examined by the authority, 

 shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than three thousand rupees but may extend 

 to ten thousand rupees.”. 

Amendment of 

section 21 of 
Punjab Act 15 of 

1958. 

 10. For section 26 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely :-  

           “26. Penalties.- Subject to the other provisions of this Act, whoever contravenes any 

 of the provisions of this Act or the rules made thereunder and no penalty has been provided 

 for such contravention in this Act, shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than 

 three thousand  rupees but may extend to  ten thousand rupees for the first violation and in 

 case of second violation, he shall be liable to a penalty which shall not be less than five  

 thousand rupees but may extend to twenty-five thousand rupees: 

   Provided that in case of continuous subsequent violation, the competent authority, as 

 specified by the Government may impose penalty at the rate of five hundred rupees for every 

 day.”.          

Substitution of 

section 26 of 

Punjab Act 15 of 

1958. 

11. (1) The Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025 

(Haryana Ordinance No. 4 of 2025), is hereby repealed.  

 (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the said 

Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under this Act. 

Repeal and 

savings. 

 

 

  



 

 

 

3734 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

In pursuance of the Government’s objective to reduce compliance burden, promote industrial growth, and align 

the labour laws with contemporary work practices, a review of selected provisions of the Punjab Shops and Commercial 

Establishment Act, 1958 has been undertaken. The proposed amendments seek to enhance operational flexibility, ensure 

gender equality, strengthen workers’ welfare, and facilitate ease of doing business. 

It is proposed to insert a new sub-section under Section 1 of the Act to cover shops and establishments employing 

twenty or more workers, while those with fewer than twenty workers will be governed only by Section 13-A. The 

amendment seeks to ensure better protection of workers in larger establishments and simplified compliance for smaller 

units, thereby promoting balanced labour reforms and ease of doing business. 

To promote efficient business operations and ensure better working conditions, certain amendments relating to 

working hours in shops and commercial establishments are also proposed. 

Under Section 7, the daily working hours may be increased from nine to ten hours while retaining the overall 

weekly limit of forty-eight hours. Additionally, provisions may be amended to increase the permissible limit of overtime 

work per quarter from 50 hours to 156 hours, enabling shops and commercial establishments to meet peak business 

demands more efficiently. 

It is proposed to amend Section 8 to increase the maximum period of continuous work without rest from five to 

six hours.  

It is proposed to substitute Section 13 to make registration and fee submission fully online, streamlining 

procedures and easing compliance. Online intimation of establishment closure will be mandatory to ensure accurate 

records. Establishments with twenty or more workers will register upon reaching the threshold, while those with fewer 

than twenty workers must submit online intimation within one month of commencement and receive a Basic 

Information Performa (BIP) ID. Enhanced penalties for non-compliance will strengthen accountability and 

enforcement. 

It is proposed to amend sub-section (3) of Section 19 of the principal Act to substitute the reference to “Section 21 

of the Indian Penal Code” with “Section 2(28) of the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Central Act 45 of 2023)”, aligning 

the Act with the updated central legislation. 

It is proposed to substitute sub-section (6) of Section 20 to decriminalize the provision and increase the fine for 

violations. This amendment will reduce the burden of prosecution for minor infractions while ensuring stricter financial 

deterrence, promoting compliance in a more balanced and efficient manner. 

It is proposed to insert a new sub-section under Section 20A of the Act to make the issuance of appointment 

letters to all workers mandatory at the time of employment. This will ensure formalization of employment, promote 

transparency, and safeguard workers’ rights.  

It is proposed to increase the penalty amounts under Sections 21 and 26 of the Act. This will enhance deterrence 

against violations, promote timely compliance by employers, and strengthen enforcement of statutory provisions, 

thereby ensuring better protection of workers and smooth functioning of establishments. 

Since the Haryana Legislative Assembly was not in session, immediate legislative action was required to give 

effect to the proposed amendments in the Haryana Shops and Commercial Establishments Act, 1958. The reforms 

introduced through the amendment are integral to the State Government’s ongoing initiatives for Ease of Doing 

Business, decriminalization of minor regulatory offences, and labour law modernization. Any delay in the 

implementation could adversely affect the momentum of business facilitation and the State’s compliance with national 

EoDB benchmarks. Moreover, the amendment rationalizes working hours, introduces digital registration processes, and 

removes imprisonment provision measures that are essential to provide clarity, certainty, and relief to business 

establishments and workers alike. Therefore, in public interest and to ensure continuity of reform without administrative 

or legal vacuum, it was necessary to promulgate the Ordinance immediately under Article 213(1) of the Constitution of 

India, rather than await the session of the Haryana Legislative Assembly. Now, the Bill of the same is being introduced 

in the upcoming session of Haryana Legislative Assembly.  

 Hence, the amendments need to be incorporated in the Act. 

 

 ANIL VIJ, 

 Labour Minister, Haryana. 

      

  

Chandigarh:  RAJIV PRASHAD, 

The 18th December, 2025.  Secretary. 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 3735 

[izkf/kd`r vuqokn] 

2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;k 39&,på,yå,å 

gfj;k.kk nqdkukr rFkk okf.kfT;d çfr"Bku ¼la'kksèku½ foèks;d] 2025 

gfj;k.kk nqdkukr rFkk okf.kfT;d çfr"Bku vfèkfu;e] 1958 

dks vkxs la'kksfèkr 

djus ds fy, 

foèks;d 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgÙkjosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; foèkkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 

vfèkfu;fer gks %& 

1-  ¼1½ ;g vfèkfu;e gfj;k.kk nqdkukr rFkk okf.kfT;d çfr"Bku ¼la'kksèku½ vfèkfu;e] 2025 dgk 

tk ldrk gSA 

 ¼2½     ;g 12 uoEcj] 2025 ls ykxw gqvk le>k tk,xkA 

laf{kIr uke rFkk 

çkjEHkA 

2-  gfj;k.kk nqdkukr rFkk okf.kfT;d çfr"Bku vfèkfu;e] 1958 ¼ftls] blesa] blds ckn ewy 

vfèkfu;e dgk x;k gS½ dh èkkjk 1 dh mi&èkkjk ¼4½ ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr mi&èkkjk tksM+h tk,xh] 

vFkkZRk~%& 

  Þ¼5½ èkkjk 13d ds flok; bl vfèkfu;e ds micaèk chl ;k mlls vfèkd deZdkjksa dks 

 fu;ksftr djus okyh nqdkuksa vkSj çfr"Bkuksa ij ykxw gksaxs vkSj bl vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 13d ds 

 micaèk chl ls de deZdkjksa dks fu;ksftr djus okyh nqdkuksa vkSj çfr"Bkuksa ij ykxw gksaxs A** 

1958 ds iatkc      

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 1 dk 

la'kksèkuA 

3-  ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 7 esa]& 

¼i½    mi&èkkjk ¼1½ esa ÞukS ?k.Vksa** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij] Þnl ?k.Vksa** 'kCn çfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs( 

rFkk 

¼ii½   mi&èkkjk ¼2½ esa] ijUrqd esa] [k.M ¼d½ esa] Þipkl** 'kCn ds LFkku ij Þ,d lkS NIiu** 

'kCn çfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 7 dk 

la'kksèkuA 

4-  ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 8 dh mi&èkkjk ¼1½ esa] Þikap ?k.Vs** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ÞNg ?k.Vs** 'kCn 

çfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 8 dk 

la'kksèkuA 

5-  ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 13 ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr èkkjk,a çfrLFkkfir dh tk,axh] vFkkZRk~%& 

  Þ13- çfr"Bkuksa dk iathdj.k-&¼1½ chl ;k mlls vfèkd deZdkjksa dks fu;ksftr djus okys 

 çR;sd çfr"Bku dk fu;kstd] vius dkjckj ds çkjEHk dh frfFk ls ,d ekl dh vofèk ds Hkhrj] 

 ,sls ç:i esa] ,slh Qhl vkSj nLrkostksa] tks fofgr fd, tk,a] ds lkFk v‚uykbu vkosnu çLrqr 

 djsxk] ftlesa fuEufyf[kr C;kSjs fn, tk,axs& 

¼d½  fu;kstd ;k çcUèkd dk uke] ;fn dksÃ gks( 

¼[k½  çfr"Bku dh th-ih-,l- vofLFkfr lfgr Mkd&irk(  

¼x½  çfr"Bku dk uke( 

¼?k½  çfr"Bku esa fu;ksftr O;fDr;ksa dh la[;k( 

¼M-½  çfr"Bku ds dkjckj dh ç—fr( rFkk 

¼;½  ,sls vU; C;kSjs] tks fofgr fd, tk,aA 

 ¼2½ nLrkostksa vkSj Qhl ds lkFk vkosnu çkIr gksus ij] fujh{kd] vkosnu vkSj mlls layXu 

nLrkostksa dh ;FkkFkZrk dh tk¡p djsxk vkSj larqf"V gksus ij fu;kstd dks ,sls ç:i] tks fofgr fd;k 

tk,] esa gfj;k.kk lsok dk vfèkdkj vfèkfu;e] 2014 ¼2014 dk 4½ ds vèkhu ;Fkk vfèklwfpr le;&lhek] 

ds Hkhrj fu;kstd dks v‚uykbu iathdj.k çek.k&i= tkjh djsxkA  

 ¼3½ mi&èkkjk ¼2½ ds vèkhu tkjh fd;k x;k dksÃ iathdj.k çek.k&i= rc rd oSèk jgsxk] 

tc rd la'kksfèkr ugÈ fd;k tkrk ;k çfr"Bku ds cUn gksus ij jí ugÈ dj fn;k tkrk ;k fujh{kd 

}kjk tk¡p ds i'pkr~] ,slh 'krks± ij vkSj ,slh jhfr] tks fofgr dh tk,] esa çfrlagj.k ugha fd;k tkrkA 

  

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 13 dk 

çfrLFkkiuA 



 

 

 

3736 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 

  ¼4½ fu;kstd dk ;g drZO; gksxk fd og iathdj.k ds fy, çLrqr fd, x, vkosnu esa fn, 

x, fooj.kksa esa fdlh ifjorZu dh lwpuk] ifjorZu gksus ds lkr fnu ds Hkhrj] ,sls ç:i] tks fofgr fd;k 

tk, esa] fujh{kd dks v‚uykbu nsA 

 ¼5½ çfr"Bku] fu;kstd] çcUèkd ds uke vkSj dk;Zcy fooj.kksa ds lEcUèk esa ifjorZu ds ekeys 

esa] fu;kstd] mi&èkkjk ¼2½ ds micUèkksa ds vuqlkj la'kksfèkr iathdj.k çek.k&i= ds fy, vkosnu djsxk 

vkSj la'kksfèkr iathdj.k çek.k&i= tkjh djus ds fy, dksÃ Qhl çHkkfjr ugÈ dh tk,xhA 

 ¼6½ fu;kstd] çfr"Bku ds cUn gksus ds ckjs esa] cUn gksus ds rhl fnu ds Hkhrj fujh{kd dks 

v‚uykbu lwfpr djsxkA fujh{kd] lwpuk çkIr gksus ij vkSj mldh ;FkkFkZrk ds ckjs esa larq"V gksus ij] 

çfr"Bku ds jftLVj esa ls ,sls çfr"Bku dk uke gVk nsxk vkSj iathdj.k çek.k&i= dks jí dj nsxkA 

 ¼7½ bl èkkjk ds micUèkksa ds fdlh Hkh mYya?ku] vFkok dh vuqikyuk djus esa vlQy jgus ds 

ekeys esa] fu;kstd] çFke mYya?kuk ds fy,] ,slh 'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks rhu gtkj :i, ls de 

dh ugÈ gks ldsxh fdUrq nl gtkj :i, rd dh gks ldsxh vkSj f}rh; mYya?kuk ds ekeys esa] og ,slh 

'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks ik¡p gtkj :i, ls de dh ugÈ gks ldsxh fdUrq iPphl gtkj :i, rd 

dh gks ldsxh% 

  ijUrq yxkrkj mÙkjxkeh mYya?kuk ds ekeys esa] ljdkj }kjk ;Fkk fofuÆn"V l{ke 

 çkfèkdkjh] çR;sd fnu ds fy, ik¡p gtkj :i, dh nj ls 'kkfLr vfèkjksfir dj ldsxkA 

  13d- chl ls de deZdkjksa dks fu;ksftr djus okys çfr"Bku dh lwpuk-& chl ls de 

 deZdkjksa dks fu;ksftr djus okys çR;sd çfr"Bku dk fu;kstd] vius dkjckj dks çkjEHk djus 

 dh frfFk ls ,d ekl dh vofèk ds Hkhrj] fujh{kd dks ,sls ç:i] tks fofgr fd;k tk,] esa 

 v‚uykbu lwpuk çLrqr djsxkA lwpuk nsus okys fu;kstd dks ,d ewy lwpuk çi= vkÃ0Mh0 

 la[;k nh tk,xhAßA 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 19 dk 

la'kksèkuA 

6-  ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 19 dh mi&èkkjk ¼3½ esa] ÞHkkjrh; n.M lafgrk dh èkkjk 21ß 'kCnksa rFkk 

vadksa ds LFkku ij] ÞHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk dsUæh; vfèkfu;e 45½ dh èkkjk 2 ds [k.M 

¼28½ß 'kCn] vad rFkk dks"Bd çfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 20 dk 

la'kksèkuA 

7-   ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 20 dh mi&èkkjk ¼5½ rFkk ¼6½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr mi&èkkjk,a 

çfrLFkkfir dh tk,axh] vFkkZRk~%& 

  Þ¼5½ bl èkkjk ds iwoZxkeh fdlh Hkh micUèk ds fdlh mYya?ku ds ekeys esa] fdlh çfr"Bku 

 dk dksÃ fu;kstd] ,sls çR;sd fnu] ftlds nkSjku mYya?ku gksrk gS ;k tkjh jgrk gS] ds fy, 

 ,slh 'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks ik¡p lkS :i, ls vfèkd dh ugÈ gks ldsxhA  

  ¼6½ ;fn dksÃ O;fDr] èkks[kk nsus ds vk’k; ls] ;Fkk iwoksZDr fdlh ,sls vfHkys[k] iath ;k 

 uksfVl esa ,slh dksÃ çfof"V] djrk gS ;k djokrk gS ;k djus dks vuqer djrk gS] tks mldh 

 tkudkjh ds vuqlkj fdlh rkfRod fof’kf"V dh –f"V ls feF;k gS] ;k fdlh ,sls vfHkys[k] iath 

 ;k uksfVl ls mlesa fd, tkus ds fy, visf{kr fdlh çfof"V dk tkucw>dj yksi djrk gS] ;k 

 yksi djokrk gS vFkok yksi djus dks vuqer djrk gS] rks og çFke mYya?ku ds fy, ,slh 'kkfLr 

 ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks rhu gtkj :i, ls de dh ugÈ gks ldsxh] fdUrq nl gtkj :i, rd 

 dh gks ldsxh vkSj f}rh; mYya?kuk ds ekeys esa] og ,slh 'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks ik¡p 

 gtkj :i, ls de dh ugÈ gks ldsxh] fdUrq iPphl gtkj :i, rd dh gks ldsxh% 

  ijUrq yxkrkj mÙkjxkeh mYya?ku ds ekeys esa] ljdkj }kjk ;Fkk fofuÆn"V l{ke çkfèkdkjh 

 çR;sd fnu ds fy, ik¡p lkS :i, dh nj ls 'kkfLr vfèkjksfir dj ldsxkAßA 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 esa 

èkkjk 20d vkSj 

20[k dk j[kk 

tkukA 

8- ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 20 ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr èkkjk,a j[kh tk,axh] vFkkZRk~%& 

  Þ20d- fu;qfDr i=-& fdlh çfr"Bku dk çR;sd fu;kstd vius lHkh deZpkfj;ksa dks fu;qfDr 

 i= nsxk] ftl ij deZpkjh dk QksVks fpidk gksxk rFkk mldh ikorh çkIr djsxkA 

  20[k- igpku i=-& fdlh çfr"Bku dk çR;sd fu;kstd çR;sd deZdkj dks ,d igpku 

 i= nsxk] ftlesa ,sls fooj.k 'kkfey gksaxs] tks fofgr fd, tk,aAß 

 

 



 

 

 

 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 3737 

9- ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 21 dh mi&èkkjk ¼2½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr mi&èkkjk çfrLFkkfir 

dh tk,xh] vFkkZRk~%& 

  Þ¼2½ tks dksÃ Hkh mi&èkkjk ¼1½ ds micUèkksa dk mYy?kau djrk gS ;k bl vfèkfu;e ds 

 vèkhu 'kfDr;ksa dk ç;ksx djus esa fujh{k.k çkfèkdkjh dks tkucw>dj ckfèkr djrk gS vFkok 

 çfr"Bku esa fdlh deZpkjh dks çkfèkdkjh ds lkeus mifLFkr gksus ls ;k çkfèkdkjh }kjk ijhf{kr 

 fd, tkus ls fNikrk gS ;k jksdrk gS] rks og ,slh 'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks rhu gtkj 

 :i, ls de dh ugÈ gks ldsxh fdUrq nl gtkj :i, rd dh gks ldsxhAßA 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 21 dk 

la'kksèkuA 

10- ewy vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 26 ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr èkkjk çfrLFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZRk~%& 

  Þ26- 'kkfLr;k¡-& bl vfèkfu;e ds vU; micUèkksa ds vè;èkhu] tks dksÃ Hkh bl vfèkfu;e 

 ;k blds vèkhu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds fdlh Hkh micUèk dk mYya?ku djrk gS vkSj bl vfèkfu;e 

 esa ,sls mYya?ku ds fy, fdlh 'kkfLr dk micUèk ugÈ fd;k x;k gS] rks og çFke mYya?ku ds 

 fy, ,slh 'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h gksxk] tks rhu gtkj :i;s ls de dh ugÈ gks ldsxh fdUrq nl 

 gtkj :i, rd dh gks ldxh vkSj f}rh; mYya?ku ds ekeys esa] og ,slh 'kkfLr ds fy, nk;h 

 gksxk] tks ik¡p gtkj :i, ls de dh ugÈ gks ldsxh fdUrq iPphl gtkj :i, rd dh gks 

 ldsxh% 

  ijUrq yxkrkj mÙkjxkeh mYya?ku ds ekeys esa] ljdkj }kjk ;Fkk fofuÆn"V l{ke çkfèkdkjh 

 çR;sd fnu ds fy, ik¡p lkS :i, dh nj ls 'kkfLr vfèkjksfir dj ldsxkAß 

1958 ds iatkc 

vfèkfu;e 15 dh 

èkkjk 26 dk 

çfrLFkkiuA 

11  ¼1½ gfj;k.kk nqdkukr rFkk okf.kfT;d çfr"Bku ¼la'kksèku½ vè;kns'k] 2025 ¼2025 dk gfj;k.kk 

vè;kns'k la[;k 4½] blds }kjk] fujflr fd;k tkrk gSA  

 ¼2½ ,sls fujlu ds gksrs gq, Hkh] mDr vè;kns'k ds vèkhu fd xÃ dksÃ ckr ;k dh xÃ dksÃ 

dkjZokÃ] bl vfèkfu;e ds vèkhu dh xÃ ckr ;k dh xÃ dkjZokÃ le>h tk,xh 

fujlu rFkk 

O;kof̀ÙkA 

 

  



 

 

 

3738 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.,  (EXTRA.),  DEC.  18,  2025  (AGHN.  27,  1947  SAKA) 

mn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk fooj.k 

ljdkj ds mís';ksa ds vuq:i] ljdkj ds vuqikyu Hkkj dks de djus] vkS|ksfxd fodkl dks c<+kok nsus vkSj Je 

dkuwuksa dks vkèkqfud dk;Z çFkkvksa ds vuq:i cukus ds mís'; ds vuq:i] iatkc nqdkukr vkSj okf.kfT;d çfr"Bkuksa vfèkfu;e] 

1958 dh p;fur èkkjkvksa dh leh{kk dh xÃ gSA çLrkfor la'kksèkuksa dk mís'; lapkyu esa yphykiu c<+kuk] cM+s çfr"Bkuksa esa 

Jfedksa dh csgrj lqj{kk vkSj NksVs çfr"Bkuksa ds fy, ljy vuqikyu lqfuf'pr djuk] iathdj.k vkSj 'kqYd Hkqxrku iwjh rjg 

v‚uykbu djuk] Jfedksa ds dY;k.k dks lq–<+ djuk vkSj O;olk; djus esa vklkuh dks c<+kok nsuk gSA 

la'kksèku ds rgr vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 1 ds varxZr ,d u;k mi&[kaM lfEefyr djus dk çLrko gS] tks mu nqdkuksa 

vkSj çfr"Bkuksa ij ykxw gksxk ftuesa chl ;k mlls vfèkd deZpkjh dk;Zjr gSaA chl ls de deZpkfj;ksa okys çfr"Bku dsoy 

èkkjk 13A ds rgr fofu;fer gksaxsA ;g la'kksèku cM+s çfr"Bkuksa esa Jfedksa dh csgrj lqj{kk vkSj NksVs çfr"Bkuksa ds fy, ljy 

vuqikyu lqfuf'pr djsxk] ekewyh mYya?kuksa ds fy, vfHk;kstu dk cks> de djsxk] ftlls larqfyr Je lqèkkj vkSj O;olk; 

esa vklkuh dks c<+kok feysxkA 

çHkkoh O;kolkf;d lapkyu dks c<+kok nsus vkSj csgrj dk;Z ifjfLFkfr;ksa dks lqfuf'pr djus gsrq] nqdkuksa vkSj okf.kfT;d 

çfr"Bkuksa esa dk;Z le; ls lacafèkr dqN la'kksèku Hkh çLrkfor gSaA 

èkkjk 7 ds rgr] nSfud dk;Z ?kaVs ukS ls c<+kdj nl ?kaVs fd, tkus dk çLrko gS] tcfd lkIrkfgd dqy lhek  

48 ?kaVs cuh jgsxhA èkkjk 7 ds rgr] =Sekfld vksojVkbe dh vfèkdre lhek 50 ?kaVs ls c<+kdj 156 ?kaVs djus dk çLrko 

gS] rkfd çfr"Bku mPp O;kolkf;d ekaxksa dks dq'kyrkiwoZd iwjk dj ldsaA èkkjk 8 esa yxkrkj dk;Z dk vfèkdre le; ikap 

?kaVs ls c<+kdj Ng ?kaVs djus dk çLrko gSA 

èkkjk 13 dks çfrLFkkfir djus dk çLrko gS rkfd iathdj.k vkSj 'kqYd Hkqxrku iwjh rjg v‚uykbu fd;k tk lds] 

çfØ;kvksa dks ljy cuk;k tk lds vkSj vuqikyu dks lgt cuk;k tk ldsA çfr"Bku can gksus dh v‚uykbu lwpuk vfuok;Z 

gksxh rkfd fjd‚MZ lVhd jgsaA chl ;k vfèkd deZpkfj;ksa okys çfr"Bku fuèkkZfjr lhek ij iathdj.k djsaxs] tcfd chl ls 

de deZpkfj;ksa okys çfr"Bku ,d eghus ds Hkhrj v‚uykbu lwpuk nsaxsA vuqikyu u djus ij c<+kÃ xÃ naM jkf'k tokcnsgh 

vkSj çorZu dks etcwr djsxhA 

mDr vfèkfu;e dh èkkjk 19 dh mi&èkkjk ¼3½ esa ÞHkkjrh; naM lafgrk dh èkkjk 21ß ds LFkku ij ÞHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 

¼dsaæh; vfèkfu;e 45] 2023½ dh èkkjk 2¼28½ß dk mYys[k djus dk çLrko gS] ftlls vfèkfu;e dks dsaæh; dkuwu ds v|ru 

çkoèkkuksa ds vuq:i cuk;k tk ldsA 

èkkjk 20 dh mi&èkkjk ¼6½ dks çfrLFkkfir djus dk çLrko gS rkfd blds çkoèkku dks vijkèkeqDr fd;k tk lds vkSj 

mYya?ku ds fy, tqekZuk c<+k;k tk ldsA bl la'kksèku ls ekewyh mYya?kuksa ds fy, vfHk;kstu dk cks> de gksxk vkSj foÙkh; 

fuokjd mik;ksa ds ekè;e ls vuqikyu c<+sxkA 

èkkjk 20A ds varxZr ,d u;k mi&[kaM lfEefyr djus dk çLrko gS rkfd lHkh Jfedksa dks fu;qfDr i= çnku djuk 

vfuok;Z gksA ;g jkstxkj dh vkSipkfjdrk lqfuf'pr djsxk] ikjnÆ'krk c<+k,xk vkSj Jfedksa ds vfèkdkjksa dh lqj{kk djsxkA 

èkkjk 21 vkSj 26 ds rgr naM jkf'k c<+kus dk çLrko gSA blls mYya?kuksa ds çfr fuokjd çHkko c<+sxk] fu;ksDrkvksa 

}kjk le; ij vuqikyu lqfuf'pr gksxk vkSj dkuwuh çorZu lq–<+ gksxk] ftlls Jfedksa dh csgrj lqj{kk vkSj çfr"Bkuksa ds 

lqpk: lapkyu dh lqfoèkk feysxhA 

pwafd gfj;k.kk foèkku lHkk orZeku esa l= esa ugÈ Fkk ,oa iatkc nqdkuksa vkSj okf.kfT;d çfr"Bkuksa vfèkfu;e] 1958 esa 

çLrkfor la'kksèkuksa dks ykxw djus gsrq rRdky foèkk;h dkjZokÃ vko';d FkhA la'kksèku ds ekè;e ls fd, x, lqèkkj jkT; 

ljdkj dh O;kikj djus eas lqxerk igy] NksVs jsxqysVjh vijkèkksa dks vijkèk dh Js.kh ls ckgj djus vkSj Je dkuwuksa ds 

vkèkqfudhdj.k ds ç;klksa ds vfHkUu vax gSaA dk;kZUo;u esa fdlh Hkh çdkj dh nsjh O;kikj lqxerk dh xfr vkSj jkT; dh 

jk"Vªh; O;kikj djus es lqxerkekudksa ds vuqikyu dks çfrdwy :i esa çHkkfor djrhA blds vykok ;g la'kksèku dke ds 

?kaVksa dks rdZlaxr cukrk gS] fMftVy jftLVªs'ku çfØ;k,a 'kq: djrk gS] vkSj tsy dh ltk ds çkoèkkuksa dks gVkrk gS] tks 

fctusl laLFkkuksa vkSj etnwjksa nksuksa dh Li"Vrk] fuf'prrk vkSj jkgr nsus ds fy, t:jh gSA blfy,] tufgr esa vkSj 

ç'kklfud ;k dkuwuh [kkyhiu ds fcuk lqèkkj dh fujarjrk lqfuf'pr djus ds fy,] gfj;k.kk foèkkulHkk ds l= dk bartkj 

djus ds ctk; Hkkjr ds lafoèkku ds vuqPNsn 213 ¼1½ ds rgr vè;kns'k tkjh djuk vfuok;Z FkkA vc bl foèks;d dks 

gfj;k.kk foèkkulHkk ds vkus okys l= esa is'k fd;k tk jgk gSA  

bu la'kksèkuksa dks vfèkfu;e esa 'kkfey djus dh t:jr gSA 

 vfuy fot] 

 Je eU=h] gfj;k.kkA  

   

p.Mhx<+ : jktho izlkn] 

fnukad 18 fnlEcj] 2025- lfpoA  

   

12295—H.V.S.—H.G.P., Pkl. 


