
fgekpy izns'k X;kjgoha fo/kku lHkkfgekpy izns'k X;kjgoha fo/kku lHkkfgekpy izns'k X;kjgoha fo/kku lHkkfgekpy izns'k X;kjgoha fo/kku lHkk    

vf/klwpuk 

f'keyk&4] 26 vxLr] 2009 

la[;k fo0l0&ySt&xojueSaV fcy@1&la[;k fo0l0&ySt&xojueSaV fcy@1&la[;k fo0l0&ySt&xojueSaV fcy@1&la[;k fo0l0&ySt&xojueSaV fcy@1&40404040@2009@2009@2009@2009----&&&&&&&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa dk;Z 
lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e 140 ds vUrxZr fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isa'ku½ 
la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2009 ¼2009 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 24½ tks vkt fnukad 26 vxLr] 2009 dks fgekpy 
izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZlk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr 
fd;k tkrk gSA 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
¼xkso/kZu flag½] 

lfpo] 
fg0 iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 

&&&&&&&& 
 

2009 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 242009 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 242009 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 242009 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 24    

fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2009fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2009fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2009fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2009    

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir :i esa½ 

 fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk vfèkfu;e 
la[;kad 8½ dk vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;d Afo/ks;d Afo/ks;d Afo/ks;d A    

 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds lkBosa o"kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vfèkfu;er gks %&& 

    1111---- laf{kIr ukelaf{kIr ukelaf{kIr ukelaf{kIr uke----&&&&&&&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke] fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs 
vkSj isa'ku½ la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2009 gS A 
 
    2222---- /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku----&&&&&&&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½ vfèkfu;e] 
1971 ¼1971 dk 8½ ¼ftls blesa blds i'pkr~ ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** fufnZ"V fd;k x;k gS½ dh èkkjk 3 dh 
mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa ^^vkB gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^iUnzg gtkj #i;s** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A 
 
    3333----    /kkjk/kkjk/kkjk/kkjk    4&[k dk izfrLFkkiu4&[k dk izfrLFkkiu4&[k dk izfrLFkkiu4&[k dk izfrLFkkiu----&&&&&&&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4&[k ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk 
tk,xk] vFkkZr~ %&& 
 
    ^^4&[k fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk^^4&[k fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk^^4&[k fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk^^4&[k fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk----&&&&&&&&izR;sd lnL; dks chl gtkj #i;s dh nj ls fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk 

izfrekl lanRr fd;k tk,xk A**A 

    4444---- /kkjk 4&[k/kkjk 4&[k/kkjk 4&[k/kkjk 4&[k[k [k [k [k dk izfrLFkkiudk izfrLFkkiudk izfrLFkkiudk izfrLFkkiu----&&&&&&&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4&[k[k ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr 
/kkjk j[kh tk,xh] vFkkZr~ %&& 
 
 ^^4&[k[k dk;kZy; HkRrk^^4&[k[k dk;kZy; HkRrk^^4&[k[k dk;kZy; HkRrk^^4&[k[k dk;kZy; HkRrk----&&&&&&&&izR;sd lnL; dks ikap gtkj #i;s izfrekl dh nj ls dk;kZy; HkRrk 

lanRr fd;k tk,xk A**A 

    5555---- /kkjk 5 dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 5 dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 5 dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 5 dk la'kks/ku----&&&&&&&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5 dh mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds izFke ijUrqd esa ^^lkr 
gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A 
 
    6666---- /kkjk 6&d/kkjk 6&d/kkjk 6&d/kkjk 6&d----dddd---- dk la'kks/ku dk la'kks/ku dk la'kks/ku dk la'kks/ku----&&&&&&&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6&dd esa ^^lfpoh; Mkd lqfo/kkvksa 
vkSj** rFkk ^^lfpoh;] Mkd lqfo/kk,a** 'kCnksa dk yksi fd;k tk,xk A 
 



    7777---- /kkjk 6&[k dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 6&[k dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 6&[k dk la'kks/ku/kkjk 6&[k dk la'kks/ku----&&&&&&&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6&[k esa]&& 
 
  ¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ^^ikap gtkj #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #i;s** 'kCn j[ks 

tk,axs( vkSj 
 
  ¼[k½ [k.M ¼³½ ds izFke ijUrqd esa ^^nks lkS #i;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^pkj lkS #i;s** 'kCn 

j[ks tk,axs A**A 
 

&&&&&&& 
 

mn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku    

 fuokZg O;; vkSj mu ;Fks"B [kpks±] tks jkT; fo/kku lHkk ds ekuuh; lnL;ksa dk tuizfrfuf/k ds 
:i esa tuthou dh fofHkUu ekaxksa ds dkj.k mixr djus iM+rs gSa] esa rhoz o`f) ds dkj.k mudh fo|eku 
miyfC/k;ksa lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa esa la'kks/ku dh yxkrkj  ekax jgh gSA blfy,] fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk 
¼lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isU'ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 esa la'kks/ku djuk vko';d le>k x;k gSA 

 ;g fo/ks;d mi;qZDr mÌs';ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gSA 

izse dqekj /kwey]izse dqekj /kwey]izse dqekj /kwey]izse dqekj /kwey]    
eq[; ea=hAeq[; ea=hAeq[; ea=hAeq[; ea=hA  

f'keyk--------------------------------------------             

fnukad------------------------vxLr] 2009- 

 
&&&&&&&& 

    
foÙkh; KkfoÙkh; KkfoÙkh; KkfoÙkh; Kkiuiuiuiu    

 fo/ks;d ds [k.M 2 ls 7 ds vf/kfu;fer fd, tkus ij jktdks"k ls izfro"kZ yxHkx 120 yk[k #i, 
dk vfrfjDr vkorhZ O;; gksxkA 

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu    

&'kwU;& 

Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu jkT;iky dh flQkfj'ksaHkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu jkT;iky dh flQkfj'ksaHkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu jkT;iky dh flQkfj'ksaHkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu jkT;iky dh flQkfj'ksa    

[th0,0Mh0 QkbZy ua0 th0,0Mh0&lh ¼Mh½ 6&1@2007] 

 fgekpy izns'k dh jkT;iky] fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isU'ku½ la'kks/ku 
fo/ks;d] 2009 dh fo"k;oLrq ds ckjs esa lwfpr fd, tkus ds i'pkr~] Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds 
v/khu] fo/ks;d dks fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir djus vkSj ml ij fopkj djus dh flQkfj'k djrh gSaA 

&&&&& 
bl labl labl labl la'kks/ku fo/ks;d }kjk lEHkO; izHkk'kks/ku fo/ks;d }kjk lEHkO; izHkk'kks/ku fo/ks;d }kjk lEHkO; izHkk'kks/ku fo/ks;d }kjk lEHkO; izHkkfor gksus okys fgekpy izns'k fo/for gksus okys fgekpy izns'k fo/for gksus okys fgekpy izns'k fo/for gksus okys fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ds ¼kku lHkk ds ¼kku lHkk ds ¼kku lHkk ds ¼lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj 

isU'kuisU'kuisU'kuisU'ku½½½½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk 8½ ds micU/kksa ds m)j.k vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk 8½ ds micU/kksa ds m)j.k vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk 8½ ds micU/kksa ds m)j.k vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk 8½ ds micU/kksa ds m)j.k    
    

    3333----    osru vkSj izfrdjkRed HkÙkkosru vkSj izfrdjkRed HkÙkkosru vkSj izfrdjkRed HkÙkkosru vkSj izfrdjkRed HkÙkk----&&&&&&&&blesa vUrfoZ"V 'krks± ds v/khu jgrs gq, izR;sd lnL; dks bl 
vf/kfu;e ds iznÙk gksus dh rkjh[k ls ;k mlds yksd izfrfuf/kRo vf/kfu;e] 1951 ds v/khu lE;d :i ls 
fuokZfpr ?kksf"kr fd, tkus dh rkjh[k ls ;k ;fn ,slh ?kks"k.kk fjfDr gksus ls igys dh xbZ gks] rks fjfDr 



gksus dh rkjh[k ls] bu nksuksa esa ls tks Hkh ckn esa gks] izfr ekl vkB gtkj #i;s dh nj ls osru vkSj ikap 
gtkj #i;s dh nj ls izfrdjkRed HkÙkk lanÙk fd;k tk,xkA 
 
 ¼2½ X X X X  
 ¼3½ X X X X  
 
 ¼4½ blesa blls iwoZ vUrfoZ"V fdlh ckr ds gksrs gq, Hkh fdlh lnL; dks fdlh ,slh vof/k ds] 
ckjs esa] ftlds nkSjku ;g rRle; izo`Ùk fdlh fof/k ds v/khu fof/kd fujks/k esa ;k] dksbZ osru vkSj 
izfrdjkRed HkÙkk lanÙk fd;k tk,xkA 
 
 Li"Vhdj.kLi"Vhdj.kLi"Vhdj.kLi"Vhdj.k----&&&&&&&&bl iz;kstu ds fy, fof/kd fujks/k ds vUrxZr fdlh fuokjd fujks/k ls lEcfU/kr 
fof/k ds v/khu fujks/k ugha gSA 
 
 4&[k[k4&[k[k4&[k[k4&[k[k----    dk;kZy; HkÙkk vkSj pkyd HkÙkkdk;kZy; HkÙkk vkSj pkyd HkÙkkdk;kZy; HkÙkk vkSj pkyd HkÙkkdk;kZy; HkÙkk vkSj pkyd HkÙkk----&&&&&&&&izR;sd lnL; dks ikap gtkj #i;s izfrekl dh nj ls 
dk;kZy; HkÙkk vkSj pkj gtkj #i;s izfrekl dh nj ls pkyd HkÙkk fn;k tk,xkA^^A 
 
 5555----    lq[k lqfo/kk,alq[k lqfo/kk,alq[k lqfo/kk,alq[k lqfo/kk,a----&&&&&&&&¼1½ lnL;] lHkk dh cSBd ds LFkku ij] fj;k;rh njksa ij ,sls fuokl LFkku 
dk gdnkj gksxk tks /kkjk 7 ds v/khu fu;eksa }kjk fofgr fd;k tk,A 
    
 ¼2½ izR;sd lnL; ,d VSyhQksu vius fuokZpu {ks= ds fdlh Hkh LFkku ij ;k vius LFkk;h fuokl 
ds LFkku ij] ;fn ,sls LFkku ij ,slh lqfo/kk lk/kkj.k njksa ij vkSj dksbZ vfrfjDr O;; mixr fd, fcuk 
miyC/k gS] ;k f'keyk esa] tSlk Hkh mlds }kjk fofufnZ"V fd;k tk, laLFkkfir djkus dk gdnkj gksxk vkSj 
laLFkkiu ds LFkku ds ,sls fofufnZ"V fd, tkus ds i'pkr~ ,sls VSyhQksu ds izFke laLFkkiu ds fy, izHkkj 
vkSj izfrHkwfr&fu{ksi vkSj okf"kZd fdjk;k jkT; ljdkj }kjk ogu fd;k tk,xk vkSj vU; lHkh O;;] os tks 
fd LFkkuh; ;k okg~; dkyksa ls lEcfU/kr gSa] lnL; }kjk lanÙk fd, tk,axs % 
 
 ijUrq ,sls lnL;ksa dks] tks bl mi&/kkjk ds v/khu VSyhQksu laLFkkfir djk,xk izfrekl lkr gtkj 
#i, dh nj ls VSyhQksu HkÙkk lanÙk fd;k tk,xk % 
 
 ijUrq ;g vkSj fd ;fn dksbZ lnL; mlds fuokZpu {ks= esa fdlh Hkh LFkku ij ;k mlds LFkkbZ 
fuokl LFkku ij ;k f'keyk esa VSyhQksu laLFkkfir ugha djrk gS] rks mls izfrekl nks lkS #i;s dh nj ls 
VSyhQksu HkÙkk lanÙk fd;k tk,xkA 
 
    6&dd] osru vkSj izfrdjkRed] fuokZpu {ks=h;] lfpoh;] Mkd lqfo/kkvksa vk6&dd] osru vkSj izfrdjkRed] fuokZpu {ks=h;] lfpoh;] Mkd lqfo/kkvksa vk6&dd] osru vkSj izfrdjkRed] fuokZpu {ks=h;] lfpoh;] Mkd lqfo/kkvksa vk6&dd] osru vkSj izfrdjkRed] fuokZpu {ks=h;] lfpoh;] Mkd lqfo/kkvksa vkSj VSyhQksu HkÙkksa vkSj Sj VSyhQksu HkÙkksa vkSj Sj VSyhQksu HkÙkksa vkSj Sj VSyhQksu HkÙkksa vkSj 
vU; ifjyfC/k;ksa dk vk; dj ls vioftZr gksukvU; ifjyfC/k;ksa dk vk; dj ls vioftZr gksukvU; ifjyfC/k;ksa dk vk; dj ls vioftZr gksukvU; ifjyfC/k;ksa dk vk; dj ls vioftZr gksuk----&&&&&&&&bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu lnL; dh lans; osru vkSj 
izfrdjkRed] fuokZpu {ks=h;] lfpoh;] Mkd lqfo/kk,a vkSj VSyhQksu HkÙkk vkSj  mls vuqKs; ifjyfC/k;ka vk; 
dj ls vioftZr gkssaxh tks jkT; ljdkj }kjk lans; gksxkA 
 
 Li"Vhdj.kLi"Vhdj.kLi"Vhdj.kLi"Vhdj.k----&&&&&&&&jkT; }kjk lans; vk; dj dh jde vk; dj ds fy, fu/kkZfjr vk; dh izFke LySc 
gksxh] vFkkZr~ bl jde ds fu/kkZj.k esa lEcfU/kr lnL; dh vk; ds vU; lzkrksa dks fxurh esa ugha fy;k 
tk,xkA 
 
 6&[k&&6&[k&&6&[k&&6&[k&&    
     ¼1½ izR;sd O;fDr dks] ftlus&& 
   ¼d½ fo/kku lHkk ds lnL;] ;k 
   ¼[k½ Js=h; ifj"kn~ lnL;] ;k 
   ¼x½ Hkkxr% fo/kku lHkk ds lnL; vkSj Hkxr% {ks=h; ifj"kn~ ds lnL;] ;k 
   ¼?k½ ¼1½ ifV;kyk vkSj iwohZ iatkc jkT; la?k ds rRdkyhu jkT; dh fo/kku lHkk( 
     ;k 



    ¼2½ rRdkyhu iatkc jkT; dh fo/kku lHkk] ;k 
    ¼3½ rRdkyhu iatkc jkT; dh fo/kku ifj"kn~( ;k 
    ¼4½ Hkkxr% ,d vkSj Hkkxr% nwljh ds lnL; ftUgsa iatkc iquxZBu vf/kfu;e] 

1966 ds /kkjk 5 ds v/khu fgekpy izns'k esa tksM+s x, iw.kZ {ks= ;k mlds Hkkx 
dk izfrfuf/kRo djus ds fy, fuokZfpr ;k ukefufnZ"V fd;k x;k gS] 

 
   ¼³½ Hkkxr% fo/kku lHkk ds lnL; vkSj Hkkxr% ;FkkfLFkfr] ifV;kyk vkSj iwoÊ iatkc 

jkT; {ks= ds rRdkyhu jkT; ;k rRdkyhu iatkc jkT; dh fo/kku lHkk ds lnL; 
ds :i esa ikap o"kZ rd fdlh vof/k ds fy, lsok dh gS] izfrekl ikap gtkj #i, 
isU'ku lanÙk dh tk,xh %  

 
    ijUrq tgka fdlh O;fDr us ikap o"kZ ls vf/kd vof/k rd mi;qDr :i ls lsok dh 

gS] og mls izR;sd o"kZ ds izfrekl nks lkS #i, dh vfrfjDr isU'ku lanÙk dh tk,xh] 
fdUrq o"kZ ds Hkkx dks ,d o"kZ ds :i esa laxf.kr fd;k tk,xk % 

 
 ijUrq ;g vkSj fd iwoZxkeh ijUrqd ds v/khu lans; vfrfjDr isU'ku ds vo/kkj.k djus ds fy, 
vof/k dh lax.kuk djrs le;] fgeokf/kr {ks= ¼vle:i {ks=½ esa lekfo"V fuokZpu {ks=ksa ls fuokZfpr 
lnL;ksa dh n'kk esa] tgka fuokZpu vke pquko ds fy, fu;r fnu ds i'pkr~orÊ fdlh Hkh fnu djok, tkrs 
gSa ;k djok, tk ldsaxs] ml rkjh[k] ftldks vke pquko esa fo/kku lHkk ds fy, fuokZfpr lnL;ksa dks 'kiFk 
fnykbZ tkrh gS vkSj og rkjh[k ftldks] fgeokf/kr ¼vle:i {ks=½ ls fuokZfpr lnL;kssa dks 'kiFk fnykbZ 
tkrh gS] dh e/;orÊ vof/k dh Hkh x.kuk dh tk,xhA 
 
 Li"Li"Li"Li"Vhdj.kVhdj.kVhdj.kVhdj.k----&&&&&&&&in ^^fgeokf/kr {ks= ¼vle:i {ks=½** ls fdUukSj vkSj ykgkSy ,oa fLirh ftys rFkk 

pEck ftyk esa rglhy ikaxh vkSj HkjekSj vfHkizsr gSaA 
 
 ¼2½ tgka mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu isU'ku dk gdnkj dksbZ O;fDr&& 
 
  ¼i½ jk"Vªifr ;k mi&jk"Vªifr ds in ds fy, fuokZfpr fd;k tkrk gS ;k fdlh jkT; ds 

jkT;iky ;k fdlh la?k jkT; {ks= ds iz'kkld ds in ij fu;qDr fd;k tkrk gS( ;k 
 
  ¼ii ½ fdlh jkT; ;k la?k jkT; {ks= dh fo/kku lHkk ;k fadlh jkT; dh fo/kku ifj"kn~ ;k 

fnYyh iz'kklu vf/kfu;e] 1966 ¼1966 dk 19½ dh /kkjk ¼3½ ds v/khu xfBr fnYyh 
egkuxj ifj"kn~ dk lnL; cu tkrk gS( ;k 

 
  ¼iii ½ osru ij dsUnzh; ljdkj ;k fdlh jkT; ljdkj ds v/khu ;k dsUnzh; ljdkj ;k fdlh 

jkT; ljdkj ds LokfeRok/khu ;k fu;U=.kk/khu fdlh fuxe esa ;k LFkkuh; izkf/kdj.k esa 
fu;ksftr ;k jkT; ljdkj] fuxe ;k LFkkuh; izkf/kdj.k ls vU;Fkk dksbZ ikfjJfed ikus 
dk gdnj gks tkrk gS ( 

 
 rks ,sslk O;fDr ,slh vof/k ds fy, ftlds og ,slk in /kkj.k fd, jgrk gS ;k ,slk lnL; cuk 
jgrk gS] ;k ,sls fu;ksftr gS ;k ,sls ikfjJfed dk gdnkj cuk jgrk gS] mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu isU'ku 
ikus dk gdnkj ugha gksxk % 
 
 ijUrq tgka ,sls O;fDr ,sls in /kkj.k djus ;k ,slk lnL; jgus ;k ,sls fu;ksftr jgus ds fy, 
lans; osru ;k tgka ,sls O;fDr dks lans; [k.M ¼iii ½ esa fufnZ"V ikfjJfed fdlh Hkh n'kk esa mi&/kkjk ¼1½ 
ds v/khu ml lans; isU'ku ls de gS] og ,slk O;fDr ml mi&/kkjk ds v/khu isU'ku ds :i esa dsoy 
vfr'ks"k dks izkIr djus dk gdnkj gksxkA 
 



 ¼3½ tgka mi /kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu isU'ku ikus dk gdnkj dksbZ O;fDr dksbZ vU; isU'ku ikus dk Hkh 
gdnkj gS ogka ,slk O;fDr] ,slh vU; isU'ku ds lkFk&lkFk mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu] isU'ku izkIr djus dk 
gdnkj gksxkA 
 
 ¼4½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds iz;kstu ds fy, o"kk±s dh la[;k lax.kuk djus esa ml vof/k dh Hkh x.kuk 
dh tk,xh ftlds nkSjku fdlh O;fDr us eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkÙks ¼fgekpy izns'k½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971  
dk 3½ esa ;Fkk ifjHkkf"kr ea=h ds :i esa ;k fo/kku lHkk ds v/;{k ;k mik/;{k ;k la?k jkT; {ks= ds v/;{k 
ds :i esa lsok dh gSA 
 
 ¼5½ tgka mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu isU'ku ;k isU'ku ysus ds gdnkj O;fDr dh e`R;q gks tkrh gS 
rks%&& 
 
  ¼i½ mldh iRuh@ifr vius thou dky esa ;k iqufoZokg i;ZUr( ;k 
  ¼ii ½ ;fn ,sls O;fDr dh iRuh@ifr ugha gS rks O;Ldrk dh vk;q vfHkizkIr djus i;ZUr] 

mldh lUrku vkSj iqf=;ksa dh n;kk esa muds fookg i;ZUr] vuqKs; isU'ku ds 50 izfr'kr 
dh nj ij isU'ku ysus ds gdnkj gksaxs % 

 
 ijUrq tgka bl mi&/kkjk ds v/khu ,d ls vf/kd O;fDr isU'ku ysus ds gdnkj gksa rks ,sls lHkh 
O;fDr mDr  isU'ku dks leku va'k esa ysus ds gdnkj gksaxsA 
 
 ¼5&v½ bl /kkjk esa fdlh ckr ds izfrdwy gksrs gq, Hkh] tgka dksbZ O;fDr mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ;k 
mi&/kkjk ¼1&v½ ds v/khu isa'ku ysus dk gdnkj gks x;k gksrk] fdUrq Qjojh] 1989 ds lkrosa fnu ls iwoZ 
mldh e`R;q gks tkus ds dkj.k og ,slh isU'ku ugha ys ldk ogka mldh iRuh] ifr] vo;Ld larku ;k 
vfookfgr iqf=;ksa mi&/kkjk ¼5½ ds v/khu isa'ku ysus dk gdnkj gksasxs] ekuksa fd  ,slk O;fDr Qjojh] 1989 
ds lkrosa fnu dks thfor FkkA 
 
 ¼6½ bl /kkjk esa fdlh ckr ds izfrdwy gksrs gq, Hkh tgka dksbZ O;fDr mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds v/khu 
isU'ku ysus dk gdnkj gks x;k gksrk] fdUrq fnlEcj] 1976 ds bDrhlosa fnu ls iwoZ mldh èR;q gks tkus ds 
dkj.k og ,slh isU'ku ugha ys ldk] rks&& 
 
 ¼i½ mlds thou dky esa ;k mlds iqu% fookg djus i;ZUr mldk ifr@iRuh] ;k  
 ¼ii½ ;fn ,sls O;fDr dk ifr@iRuh ugha gS rks mldh vo;Ld lUrku O;Ldrk dh vk;q izkIr 

djus ds i;ZUr vkSj iqf=;ksa dh n'kk esa muds fookg djus i;ZUr] 
 
 ml jkf'k ds cjkcj isU'ku tks ,sls O;fDr us isU'ku ds :i esa izkIr dh gksrh] ;fn og fnlEcj] 
1976 ds bdrhlosa fnu dks thfor gksrk ;k rhu lkS ipgrj #i;s dh jkf'k izfr ekl] bu nksuksa esa ls tks 
vf/kd gks] ysus dk gdnkj gksxk@gksxh % 
 
 ijUrq bl mi&/kkjk ds v/khu rhu lkS ipgrj #i;s dh mPprj lhek tuojh] 1986 ds pkSchlosa 
fnu ls ekpZ] 1988 ds bDrhlosa fnu rd dh dkykof/k dh isU'ku ds fy, ykxw ugha gksxh % 
 
 ijUrq ;g vkSj fd tgka mi&/kkjk ds v/khu ,d ls vf/kd O;fDr isU'ku ds gdnkj gksa rks ,slh 
lHkh O;fDr mDr isU'ku dks cjkcj fgLlksa esa yssaxsA 
 
 ¼7½ izR;sd  O;fDr dks tks bl /kkjk ds v/khu isU'ku@dqVqEc isa'ku ysrk gS ;k isa'ku@dqVqEc 
isa'ku ysus dk gdnkj gS] vuqKs; isU'ku@dqVqEc ias'ku ds vfrfjDr] mlh nj ls isU'ku ij egaxkbZ jkgr 
lanÙk dh tk,xh tks jkT; ljdkj ds vU; isU'ku Hkksfx;ksa dks vuqKs; gSA 
 

&&&&& 



 
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT 

 
Bill No. 24 of  2009 

 
THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANC ES AND 

PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2009 
 

(AS  INTRODUCED IN  THE  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY) 
 

A 
 

BILL 
 

 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of 
Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971). 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Sixtieth Year of the 
Republic of India as follow :— 
 
 1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2009. 
 
 2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (8 of 1971) (hereinafter referred to as the 
"principal Act"), in sub-section (1), for the words "eight thousand rupees", the words "fifteen 
thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 
 
 3. Substitution of section 4-B.—For section 4-B of the principal Act, the following section 
shall be substituted, namely :— 
 
 "4-B. Constituency allowance.—There shall be paid to each member a constituency 

allowance at the rate of twenty thousand rupees per mensem.". 
 
 4. Substitution of section 4-BB.—For section 4-BB of the principal Act, the following 
section shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
 "4-BB. Office Allowance.—There shall be paid to each Member an office allowance at 

the rate of five thousand rupees per mensem.". 
 

 5. Amendment of section 5.—In section 5 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), in first 
proviso, for the words "seven thousand rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be 
substituted. 
 

 6. Amendment of section 6-AA.—In section 6-AA of the principal Act, the words and sign 
"secretarial, postal facilities and" and "secretarial, postal facilities" shall be omitted. 
 

 7. Amendment of section 6-B.—In section 6-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (1)— 
 
  (a) for the figures "5000" , the figures and sign "10,000"  shall be substituted.; and 
 
  (b) in clause (e), in the first proviso, for the figures and signs "200/-" , the figures and 

signs "400/-"  shall be substituted. 



 
________ 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 
 

 Due to sharp increase in the cost of living and the considerable expenses which the Hon'ble 
Members of the State Legislative Assembly as a public representative has to incur on account of 
various demands of the  public life, there has been persistent demand for the revision of their 
existing emoluments and amenities. This has necessitated the amendments in the Himachal Pradesh 
Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971. 
 
 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives. 
 

PREM KUMAR DHUMAL, 
Chief Minister. 

Shimla : 
The...................August, 2009. 
 

_________ 
 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 
 

 Clause 2 to 7 of the Bill, when enacted, will entail additional recurring expenditure out of 
the State  Exchequer to the tune of Rs. 120 lakhs per annum approximately. 
 

________ 
 

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION 
 

_______ 
 

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207 O F THE 
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA 

 
[GAD File No. GAD-C (PA) D (6)-1/2007] 

 
 The Governor of Himachal Pradesh after having been informed of the  subject matter of the 
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 
2009 recommends, under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and consideration 
of the Bill in the State Legislative Assembly. 
 

________ 
 
EXTRACT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THE HIMACHAL PRADESH L EGISLATIVE 
ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS) ACT, 1 971 (ACT NO. 8 OF 
1971) LIKELY TO BE AFFECTED BY THIS AMENDMENT BILL.  
 
 Section-3 Salaries and Compensatory Allowances.—(1) Subject to the condition herein 
contained, there shall be paid to each Member a salary at the rate of eight thousand rupees and 
compensatory allowance at the rate of five thousand per mensem with effect from the 
commencement of this Act or from the date on which he is declared duly elected under the 
Representation of the People Act, 1951 (Act No. 43 of 1951), or if such declaration is made before 
the vacancy occurs, from the date of occurrence of vacancy which is later. 



 
 (2) XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX 
 (3) XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX 
 (4) Notwithstanding anything hereinbefore contained no salary and compensatory 
allowance shall be paid to any member in respect of any period during which he was under legal 
detention under any law for the time being in force.  
 
 Explanation.—The legal detention for this purpose does not include detention under any 
law relation to preventive detention. 
 
 4-B. Constituency secretarial and postal facilities allowance.—There shall be paid to 
each member a constituency, secretarial and postal facilities allowance at the rate of  1[ten 
thousand] rupees per mensem:] 
 
 2[XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX] 
 
 4-BB.  Office Allowance and Driver Allowance.—There shall be paid to each Member an 
office allowance mat the rate of five thousand rupees per mensem and Driver allowance at the rate 
of four thousand rupees per mensem. 
 
 6-AA. Compensatory constituency, secretarial postal facilities and telephone 
allowances and other perquisites to the exclusive of income tax.—The salary and compensatory, 
constituency, secretaial, postal facilities and telephone allowances payable to a Member and other 
perquisites admissible to him, under this Act, shall be exclusive of the income tax which shall be 
payable by the State Government. 
 
 Explanation.—The amount of income-tax payable by the State, would be first slab of the 
income assessed for income tax i.e. in assessing this amount, the other sources of income of the 
member concerned shall not be taken into consideration. 
 
 6-B Pension.—(1) There shall be paid a pension of Rs. 5000 per mensem to every 
person who has served for any period up to five years as,— 
 
 (a ) a member of Assembly; or  
 (b) a member of the territorial Council; or  
 (c) partly as a member of the Assembly and partly as member of the Territorial Council; 

or 
 (d) a member of— 
  (i) the Legislative Assembly of the erstwhile State of Patiala and east Punjab States 

Union; or 
  (ii ) the Legislative Assembly of the erstwhile Punjab State; or 
  (iii ) the Legislative Council of the erstwhile Punjab State; or 
  (iv) partly as a member of the one and partly as a member of the other; 
 
 who has been elected or nominated to represent the whole or the part of  the areas added to 
Himachal Pradesh under section 5 of the Punjab re-organisation Act, 1966. 
 
 (e) partly as a member of the Assembly and partly as a member of the Legislative 

Assembly of erswhile State of Patiala and East Punjab State Union or the Legislative 
Assembly/Council of the erstwhile State of Punjab, as the case may be : 

 



 Provided that where any person has served as aforesaid for a period exceeding first term, 
there shall be paid to him an additional pension of Rs.  200/-  per mensem for every year in excess 
of period of the first term, provided that for this purpose, the fraction of a year shall be counted as 
one year: 
 
 Provided further that while reckoning the period for the determination of the additional 
pension payable under the preceding proviso in the case of members elected from the 
constituencies comprised of Snow-bound area (non-Synchronous area) where the elections are or 
may be conducted on any day subsequent to the day fixed for the general elections, the period 
intervening the date on which the oath is administered to the members elected to the Assembly in 
the general elections and the date on which the oath is administered to the members elected from 
the Snow-bound area (non-Synchronous area) shall also be counted. 
 
 Explanation.—The expression "Snow bound area (non-Synchronous area)" means the area 
ccomprising Kinnaur, Lahaul and Spiti district and Pangi and Bharmour tehsil in Chamba district. 
 
 (2) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1),— 
  (i) is elected to the office of the President or Vice-President or is appointed to the 

Office of the Governor of any State or Administrator of any Union Territory; or 
 
  (ii ) becomes a Member of any Legislative Assembly of a State or a Union Territory or 

Legislative Council of State or the Metropolitan Council of Delhi constituted under 
section 3 of the Delhi Administration Act, 1966; or 

 
  (iii ) is employed on a salary under the Central Government or any State Government or 

in a Corporation owned or controlled by the Central Government or any State 
Government or local authority or becomes otherwise entitled to any remuneration 
from State Government, Corporations or local authority. 

 
such person shall not be entitled to any pension under sub-section (1) for the period during which 
he continues to hold such office or as such member or is so employed or continues to be entitled to 
such remuneration: 
 
 Provided that where the salary payable to such person for holding such office or being such 
member or so employed or where the remuneration referred to in clause (iii) payable to such person 
is in either case less than the pension payable to him under sub-section (1) such person shall be 
entitled only to receive the balance as pension under that sub-section. 
 
 (3) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is also entitled to any 
pension, such person shall be entitled to receive the pension under sub-section (1) in addition to 
such other pension. 
 
 (4) In computing the number of years for the purposes of sub-section (1), the period during 
which a person has served as a minister, as defined in the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers 
(Himachal Pradesh) Act, 1971 or the Speaker or the Deputy Speaker of the Assembly or the 
Chairman of the Territorial Council shall also be taken into account. 
 
 (5) Where any person who draws pension or is entitled to draw pension, under sub-section 
(1), dies,— 
 
  (i) his/her spouse during his her life time or till he she remarries; or 



  (ii ) if such person leave no spouse his minor children till they attain the age of majority 
and in case of daughters till they get married; 

 
shall be entitled to draw pension at the rate of 50% of pension as admissible to such person : 
 
 Provided that where more than one person becomes entitled for pension under this sub- 
section all such draw the said pension in equal shares. 
 
 (5-A) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this where a person would 
have been entitled to draw pension under sub-section (1) or sub-section (1-A) of this section but for 
his death before the 7th day of February, 1989 he could not draw such pension, his spouse, minor 
children or un-married daughters shall be entitled to draw pension under sub-section (5), as if such 
person was alive on the 7th day of February, 1989. 
 
 (6)   Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this section, where a person 
would have been entitled to draw pension, under sub-section (1) but for his death before the 31st 
day of December, 1976 he could not draw such pension— 
 
  (i) his/her spouse during his/her life time or till he/she remarries; or 
   (ii ) if such a person leaves no spouse, his/her minor children till they attain the age of 

majority and in case of daughters till they get married;  
 
shall be entitled to draw pension equal to a sum which would have been drawn by such a person as 
pension under this section as if  such person was alive on the 31st day of December, 1976 or the 
sum of rupees three hundred and seventy five per mensem, whichever is higher: 
 
 Provided that the upper limit of rupees three hundred and seventy five shall not apply for 
the pension under this sub-section for the period from the 24th day of January, 1986 to the 31st day 
of March, 1988: 
 
 Provided further that where more than one person becomes entitled to pension under this 
sub-section, all such persons shall draw the said pension in equal shares. 
 
 (7) Every person who draws pension/family pension or is entitled to draw pension/family 
pension, shall in addition to the pension/family pension admissible under this section, be paid 
dearness relief in pension at the same rates as is admissible to other pensioners of the State 
Government. 

________ 
 

 
 

 

    
 
 
 
  
 


