
7479jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds bdlBosaa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns”k fo/kku lHkk }kjk
fuEufyf[kr #i esa ;g vfèkfu;fer gks%&&

1-1 -1 -1 -1 - bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke “kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~
eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky; ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½  la”kks/ku vfèkfu;e]
2010 gS A

2 -2 -2 -2 -2 - “kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky;
¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½ vf/kfu;e] 2009 ¼ ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ ^^ewy
vfèkfu;e** dgk x;k gS ½ dh /kkjk 5 esa]&&

¼d½ [k.M (vii)  dk yksi fd;k tk,xk A ;

¼[k½ [k.M (xi) ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr [k.M vUr% LFkkfir fd;k
tk,xk] vFkkZr~ :—

“(xi -d) izk;kstd fudk;@fo”ofo|ky;] fo”ofo|ky; ds fy,
iw.kZdkfyd fu;fer deZpkfj;ksa dh fu;qfDr djsxk
rFkk deZpkfj;ksa dk osru] izR;sd ekg deZpkfj;ksa ds
cSad [kkrs esa tek fd;k tk,xk ;”;

¼x½ [k.M (xviii)  ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[kk tk,xk]
vFkkZr~ :—

2010 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 362010 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 362010 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 362010 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 362010 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 36

“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky; ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky; ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky; ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky; ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky; ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½
la”kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2010la”kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2010la”kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2010la”kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2010la”kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2010

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir #i esa½

“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky;     ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½
vfèkfu;e] 2009 ¼2009 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 20½ dk la”kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;dfo/ks;dfo/ks;dfo/ks;dfo/ks;d A

laf{kIr uke A

/kkjk 5 dk
la”kks/ku A

2009 dk 20



7480 jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

“(xviii) dsUnzh; ljdkj ds fofu;ked fudk;ksa vkSj dsUnzh;
ljdkj }kjk le;&le; ij tkjh ekudksa vkSj fofu;eksa
dks iw.kZ djus ds i'pkr~ rFkk jkT; ljdkj dk fo”ks’k
vuqeksnu izkIr djus ds i”pkr~ egkfo|ky;] laLFkk,a]
vkWQ dSEil dsUnz] vkWQ “kksj dsUnz vkSj v/;;u dsUnz
LFkkfir djuk ;k nwjorhZ f”k{kk izkjEHk djuk;”; vkSj

¼?k½ [k.M (xix) esa fo”ofo|ky; ds iz;kstuksa vkSj mn~ns”;ksa ds fy,
nku] migkj vkSj vuqnku izkIr djuk rFkk” “kCnksa vkSj fpUg ds
LFkku ij “ekrk&firk vkSj Nk=ksa ds flok; nku] migkj vkSj
vuqnku izkIr djuk rFkk fo”ofo|ky; ds iz;kstuksa vkSj
mn~ns”;ksa ds fy,” “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axs A

3 -3 -3 -3 -3 - ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 9 ds [k.M ¼?k½ esa ̂ ^olh;rsa]** “kCn vkSj
fpUg ds i”pkr~ vkSj ^^nku** 'kCn ls iwoZ ^^ekrk&firk vkSj Nk=ksa ds flok;**
“kCn vkSj fpUg vUr% LFkkfir fd, tk,axs A

4 -4 -4 -4 -4 - ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 26 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds [k.M ¼N½ dk
yksi fd;k tk,xk A

5 -5 -5 -5 -5 - ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 31 dh mi/kkjk ¼4½ ds i”pkr~
fuEufyf[kr ubZ mi/kkjk vUr% LFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~ %&&

^^¼5½ fo”ofo|ky;] i”pkr~orhZ o’kksZa esa fo|eku ikB~;Øeksa esa] u,
Nk=ksa dks izos”k nsus ds fy, ;k u, ikB~;Øe izkjEHk djus ds
fy,] tks iz;kstu ds fy, xfBr fujh{k.k lfefr dh flQkfj”k
ds v/;/khu gksaxs] jkT; ljdkj dk iwoZ vuqeksnu izkIr djsxkA
;g vfUre o’kZ ds Nk=ksa ds cSp dks izos”k fn, tkus rd ykxw
jgsxk A **A

6 -6 -6 -6 -6 - ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 32 esa “kCn ^^,d ekl** tgka&tgka ;s
vkrs gksa] ds LFkku ij ^^rhu ekl** “kCn j[ks tk,axs A

/kkjk 9 dk
la”kks/ku A

/kkjk 26 dk
la”kks/ku A

/kkjk 31 dk
la”kks/ku A

/kkjk 32 dk
la”kks/ku A



7481jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

7 -7 -7 -7 -7 - ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 40 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ^^dqyifr ls
ijke”kZ ds i”pkr~** “kCnksa dk yksi fd;k tk,xk A

8. ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 41 dh mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds ijUrqd esa
“iUnzg o"kZ”  “kCnksa ds LFkku ij “iPphl o’kZ” “kCn j[ks tk,axs A

/kkjk 40 dk
la”kks/ku A

/kkjk 41 dk

la”kks/ku A



7482 jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

mís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFkumís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku

“kwfyuh ck;ksVsDuksykWth ,oe~ eSustesaV lkbZaflt fo”ofo|ky;     ¼LFkkiuk vkSj fofu;eu½
vfèkfu;e] 2009 ¼2009 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 20½ fo”ofo|ky; dks ekun~ mikf/k;ka ;k vU; fo|k
lEcU/kh mikf/k;ka iznku djus vkSj nwjorhZ f”k{kk izkjEHk djus ds fy, l”kDr djrk gS] fdUrq
fo”ofo|ky; vuqnku vk;ksx ds fn”kk&funsZ”kksa ds vuqlkj nwjorhZ f”k{kk vkSj vkWQ dSEil v/;;u
dsUnzksa dks vioftZr fd;k tkuk gS A blds vfrfjDr ;g Hkh leqfpr le>k x;k fd izkbosV
fo”ofo|ky;ksa dks ekun~ mikf/k;ka ;k vU; fo|k lEcU/kh mikf/k;ka iznku djus ds fy, l”kDr u fd;k
tk, A blds vfrfjDr ;g Hkh vko”;d le>k x;k fd jkT; esa izkbosV fo”ofo|ky;ksa dks djus okys
leLr fo/kkuksa esa ,d:irk ykbZ tk, A blfy, iwoksZDr vf/kfu;e dks mi;qDr :i ls la”kksf/kr djus
vkSj nwjorhZ f”k{kk rFkk ekun~ mikf/k;ka ;k vU; fo|k lEcU/kh mikf/k;ka iznku djus ls lEcfU/kr vf/
kfu;e ds micU/kksa dk yksi djus dk fofu”p; fd;k x;k gS A blds vfrfjDr ;g Hkh vko”;d
le>k x;k gS fd jkT; ljdkj }kjk Qhl lajpuk dks vuqeksnu iznku djus ds fy, ,d ekl dh
vof/k ;qfDr;qDr ugha gS] D;ksafd izkbosV fo”ofo|ky;ksa }kjk izLrqr dh xbZ Qhl lajpuk ls lEcfU/
kr izLrkoksa dk ijh{k.k djus vkSj tkap djus ds fy, ;qfDr;qDr le; dh vko”;drk gksrh gS] blfy,]
;g fofu”p; fd;k x;k gS fd ljdkj dks izkbosV fo”ofo|ky;ksa dh Qhl lajpuk dks vuqeksnu iznku
djus ds fy, rhu ekl dk le; vuqKkr fd;k tk,A  blfy, iwoksZDr vf/kfu;e esa la”kks/ku fd,
tkus vko”;d gks x, gSa A

;g fo/ks;d mi;ZqDr mn~ns”;ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gS A

bZ'oj nkl /kheku]bZ'oj nkl /kheku]bZ'oj nkl /kheku]bZ'oj nkl /kheku]bZ'oj nkl /kheku]
                                                             izHkkjh eU=h A

/keZ”kkyk %
rkjh[k%-----------------------------------] 2010

&&&&&&&

foRrh; KkiufoRrh; KkiufoRrh; KkiufoRrh; KkiufoRrh; Kkiu

&”kwU;&

&&&&&&&

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh KkiuizR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu

&”kwU;&



7483jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Sixty-
first Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Shoolini University of
Biotechnology and Management Sciences (Establishment and Regulation)
Amendment Act, 2010.

2. In section 5 of the Shoolini University of Biotechnology and
Management Sciences (Establishment and Regulation) Act, 2009 (hereinafter
referred to as the “principal Act”),—

(a) clause (vii), shall be omitted.;

(b) after clause (xi), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(xi-a) the sponsoring body/university shall appoint full time
regular employees for the university and the salary of the
employees shall be deposited in the bank account of the
employees every month;”;

(c) for clause(xviii), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

Short title.

Amendment
of section 5.

20 of 2009

BILL No. 36 of 2010

THE  SHOOLINI  UNIVERSITY   OF  BIOTECHNOLOGY   AND  MANAGEMENT
SCIENCES  (ESTABLISHMENT   AND  REGULATION)  AMENDMENT

BILL, 2010

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)

A

BILL

to amend the Shoolini University of Biotechnology and Management Sciences
(Establishment and Regulation) Act, 2009 (Act No. 20 of 2009).



7484 jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

“(xviii) to set-up colleges, institutions, off-campus centres,
off-shore campus, study centres or to start distance
education, after fulfilling the norms and regulations
of the Central Government Regulatory Bodies and
Central Government, issued from time to time, and
after obtaining the specific approval of the State
Government;”; and

(d) in clause (xix) after the words “and grants”, the words “except
from parents and students” shall be inserted.

3. In section 9 of the principal Act, in clause (d), after the word
and sign “donation,”, the words and sign “except from parents and students,”
shall be inserted.

4. In section 26 of the principal Act, in sub-section(1), clause
(g) shall be omitted.

5. In section 31 of the principal Act, after sub-section (4), the
following new sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(5) The University shall seek prior approval of the State
Government for admitting new students in subsequent years
in the existing courses or for starting new courses which shall
be subject to recommendations of the inspection committee
set up for the purpose. This shall be applicable till the first
batch of final year students are admitted.”.

6. In section 32 of the principal Act, for the words “one month”
wherever these occur, the words “three months” shall be substituted.

7. In section 40 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the
words and signs “after consultation with the Vice-Chancellor,” shall be omitted.

8. In section 41 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), in the
proviso, for the words “fifteen years”, the words “twenty five years” shall be
substituted.

Amendment
of section 9.

Amendment
of section 26.

Amendment
of section 31.

Amendment
of section 32.

Amendment
of section 40.

Amendment
of section 41.



7485jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

STATEMENT   OF  OBJECTS  AND  REASONS

The Shoolini University of Biotechnology and Management Sciences (Establishment and
Regulation) Act, 2009 (Act No. 20 of 2009) empowers the University to confer honorary degrees
or other academic distinctions and to start distance education, but as per guidelines of  the University
Grants Commission, the distance education and off campus study centers are to be discouraged.
Further, it has been considered appropriate not to empower the Private Universities to confer
honorary degrees or other academic distinctions. Further, it has also been considered necessary to
bring uniformity in all legislations governing Private Universities in the State. Thus, it has been
decided to amend the Act ibid suitably and to delete the provisions of the Act relating to distance
education and conferment of honorary degrees or other academic distinctions. It has further been
considered necessary that the period of one month is not reasonable for grant of approval of fee
structure by the State Government for the reason that the proposals relating to fee structure submitted
by the Private Universities requires reasonable time for examination and scrutiny, therefore, it has
been decided that the Government may be allowed three months time for the grant of approval of
fee structure of the Private Universities. This has necessitated amendments in the Act ibid.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

ISHWAR  DASS  DHIMAN,
Minister-in-Charge.

DHARAMSHALA:
The.....................2010.



7486 jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 20 fnlEcj] 2010@29 vxzgk;.k] 1932

FINANCIAL  MEMORANDUM

—Nil—

___________

MEMORANDUM  REGARDING   DELEGATED  LEGISLA TION

—Nil—

__________


