fum= war afare™

fBryet—4, 5 30, 2012

T faoHo—fao—wRapR faes / 1—19 / 2012—Ramael y<er faum= 9w & ufhar vd
PR FaTed IHae, 1973 @ W 140 @ I=Fid fedrad UQe foume 91 (9l @ Ao iR
URE) eReE AU, 2012 (2012 @1 faRe Adie—24) S oMo fAid 5 emWid, 2012 @I
fedree uaw faur |9 d RRenfUd 81 gar €, Fd—AERe B Fared s—Ioud d gfad bR
ESRIACRERIRSIGIRE

MY ERT,

M= RE,

RICES
feareare weer faem | |

2012 &1 faerI® A&aid 24
fRarae Uey faum 91 (Wl @ vl &R UvH) HeeE fadasd, 2012
(foem & # qRenfid w9 H)

e uew fauq 9w (Wel & W &R UeE)  iffm, 1971 (1971 &1 S aw
TAgid 8) BT 3R AYeH o_1 & forv fadgs |

TR TTORSY & foRdged a9 # fRarad u<er foum awr gry fA=foilRad wu # g8 srfafaafaa
Bl

1. << a9 fRfw &1 dferg 9W fRama uew fauE e (Wewil & W
IR ) Hees srfafE, 2012 ®

2. ORI 3 & 9OEE— RAmEd uew fQu 9 (el & v iR UeE)  erfarfrm,
1971 (1971 &7 8) (NI S 3A Uwdlq ol MR H7T A1 &) o ORI 3 & IUIRT (1) H
“Trgg BOIR WUV Il & WIH TR I §9IR WU Ieg W G |

3. ORI 4 & FOEE.—Td ARAFTH & aRT 4 & STERT (1) B @ue (i) § g @
[UY” TGl B I W "TH FOIR wUU" e W S0 |

4, ORI 4—F G GUE—FA IJIAFTH B ORT 4—F H ‘99 TIR WU ARl B
R R U g9IR WUy 6] G S |

5. ORI 5% Pl HARH—A AT & gR_1 5-F ¥ 'UHh TR Uid Al wIY” &
% M R U FOR HIT Ieq W G |

6. ORI 6—F @& FUNEA.—Td ARTIH B gRT 6T &I IWIRT (1) # "digg sOIR
FUY” I@] B WRIF TR “ABRE IR WU G Y S0 |




Il R RN BT B

frate =g IR 9 IO w=l, S oy g 99T & A 9eil Bl SH-ufafaer &
®Y H [ Siigd @I A= 70 & BROT [SWIT BRA IS ©, H digdl | g D DR IAD]
e Sudferl ok gE—gfaumsil § Hed & TIaR AN @ 7 sy, fREEd uew
O 1 (el & 9 ok UR) QiffRe, 1971 H WA BRAT SMavIS: FHST AT & |

Iz fags Sudad Sgawdt @ gfd @ forw ® |

U9 HAIR g,
g 7l |

o s

feRIs & 9vs 2 9 6 & JIAIMT FU I R ITRY A Udy T 3.30 HRIS
[YY BT ARG AT T BT |

___‘QFq__
IRA & WfE™ & Fgees 207 & N Iogured ot RywiRy

CHUSIwEd Fo ShovoSio— (S1) 5-1/2011)

RAEd Uee & IouTe, fAdad ueer faum 991 (el @ ¥ iR U=E) e
I, 2012 @1 AvgeRg & IR 4 G BT IH & I, YR & AfdhE & s 207 B
31, faerge @1 faum avr § qrIenfid & iR 39 W R o @ RieiRer & € |

BILL NO. 24 OF 2012

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2012

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of
Members)Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971).



BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Sixty-third Year of
the Republic of India as follow:-

1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
(Allowances and Pension of Members ) Amendment Act, 2012.

2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative
Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (8 of 1971) ( hereinafter referred to as
the “principal Act”), in sub-section (1), for the words “fifteen thousand”, the words “ twenty
thousand “ shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in
clause (ii), for the words “five hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 4-B.—In section 4-B of the principal Act, for the words
“twenty thousand”, the words “thirty five thousand” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 5-A.—In section 5-A of the principal Act, for the words “one
thousand five hundred”, .the words “three thousand > shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 6-B.— In section 6-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the figures “14000, the figures and sign “18,000” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to sharp increase in the cost of living and the considerable expenses which the Hon’ble
Members of the State Legislative Assembly as a public representative has to incur on account of
various demands of the public life, there has been persistent demand for the revision of their
existing emoluments and amenities. This has necessitated the amendments in the Himachal Pradesh
Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

PREM KUMAR DHUMAL,
Chief Minister.

Shimla:
The April, 2012.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Clause 2 to 6 of the Bill, when enacted, will entail additional recurring expenditure out of

the State Exchequer to the tune of Rs.3.30 crore per annum approximately.



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

—NIL—

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207 OF THE
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA

(GAD File No. GAD-C (D)-5-1/2011)

The Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having been informed of the subject matter of the
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill,
2012, recommends, under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and
consideration of the Bill in the State Legislative Assembly.




