
fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

f'keyk&4] 5 vizSy] 2012 
 

 la[;k fo0l0&fo0&ljdkjh fo/ks;d@1&19@2012-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa 
dk;Z lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e 140 ds vUrxZr fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj 
isU'ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2012 ¼2012 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad&24½ tks vkt fnukad 5 vizSy] 2012 dks 
fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZ&lk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ bZ&jkti= esa eqfnzr djus 
gsrq izsf"kr fd;k tkrk gSA 
 

vkns'k }kjk] 
xkso/kZu flag] 

lfpo]  
fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkkA 

 
&&&&&&&&  

 
2012 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 24  

 
fgekpy izns’k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa’ku½ la’kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2012 

 
¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir :Ik esa½ 

 
       fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½  vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk vfèkfu;e 
la[;kad 8½ dk vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds  fy, fo/ks;d A 

 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds frjlBosa o"kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :Ik esa ;g vf/kfu;fer 
gks%& 
 
 1- laf{kIr uke-&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds  HkRrs 
vkSj  isa'ku½ la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2012 gS A 
             
 2- /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku-& fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isa'ku½  vf/kfu;e] 
1971 ¼1971 dk 8½ ¼ftls blesa blds i'pkr~ ^ewy vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 3 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ +esa 
^^iUnzg gtkj :i,**  'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^chl gtkj :i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A  
 

 3-  /kkjk 4 dk la'kks/ku-&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 dh mi/kkjk  ¼1½ ds [k.M ¼ii½ esa  ßikap lkS 
:i,Þ 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d gtkj :i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A 
 
     4-  /kkjk 4&[k dk la'kks/ku-& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4&[k esa ßchl gtkj :i,Þ 'kCnksa ds  
LFkku ij ßiSarhl gtkj :i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A 
 
   5- /kkjk 5&d dk la'kks/ku-&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5&d  esa ß,d  gtkj ikap lkS :i,Þ 'kCnksa 
ds LFkku ij ßrhu gtkj :i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A 
 
 6-  /kkjk 6&[k  dk la'kks/ku-&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6&[k dh mi/kkjk ¼1½  esa  ßpkSng gtkj 
:i,Þ 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ßvBkjg gtkj :i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 



mn~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku 
 

 fuokZg O;; vkSj mu ;Fks"V [kpksZa] tks  jkT; fo/kku lHkk ds ekuuh; lnL;ksa dks tu&izfrfuf/k ds 
:Ik esa tu thou dh fofHkUu ekaxksa ds dkj.k mixr djus iM+rs gSa] esa rhozrk ls o`f) ds dkj.k mudh  
fo|eku miyfC/k;ksa vkSj lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa esa la'kks/ku dh  yxkrkj ekax jgh gS blfy,] fgekpy izns'k 
fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isU'ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 esa la'kks/ku djuk vko';d le>k x;k gSA 
 
 ;g fo/ks;d mi;qZDr mn~ns';ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gS A 
     

        izse dqekj /kwey] 
        eq[; eU=h A 

f’keyk %----------- 
 
rkjh[k %---------------------vizSy] 2012- 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
 

foRrh; Kkiu  
 

        fo/k;sd ds [k.M 2 ls 6 ds vf/kfu;fer  fd, tkus ij jktdks"k ls izfro"kZ yxHkx 3-30 djksM+ 
:Ik, dk vfrfjDr vkorhZ O;; gksxk  A  
     

&&&&&&&&  

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku  lEcU/kh Kkiu 

&&&'kwU;&& 

Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds v/khu jkT;iky dh flQkfj’ksas  

 ¼th-,-Mh-QkbZy ua0 th0,0Mh0&lh ¼Mh½ 5&1@2011½ 

 
 fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky] fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkRrs vkSj isU'ku½  la'kksèku 
fo/ks;d] 2012 dh fo"k;oLrq ds ckjs esa lwfpr fd, tkus ds Ik'pkr~] Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds 
v/khu] fo/ks;d dks fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir djus vkSj ml ij fopkj djus dh flQkfj'k djrh gSa A 

&&&&&&&& 
BILL NO. 24 OF 2012 

 
THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY  (ALLOWANCES AND  

PENSION  OF  MEMBERS)  AMENDMENT  BILL,  2012 
 

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY) 
 

A 
 

BILL 
 
further to amend the Himachal  Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of  

Members)Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971). 



 BE it enacted by the Legislative  Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the  Sixty-third Year of 
the Republic of India  as follow:- 
 
    1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
(Allowances  and  Pension  of   Members ) Amendment Act, 2012. 
  
 2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative 
Assembly (Allowances and  Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (8 of 1971) ( hereinafter  referred to as 
the  “principal Act”), in sub-section (1),  for the words  “fifteen  thousand”,  the words “ twenty 
thousand “ shall be substituted. 
 
      3. Amendment of section 4.—In  section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in 
clause (ii), for the words  “five hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted. 
  
         4.  Amendment of section 4-B.—In section 4-B of the principal Act,  for the words  
“twenty thousand”, the words “thirty five thousand” shall be substituted. 
 
         5. Amendment of section 5-A.—In section 5-A of the principal Act,  for the words  “one  
thousand five  hundred”, .the words “three  thousand ” shall be substituted. 
 
  6. Amendment of section 6-B.—   In section 6-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the figures  “14000”, the figures and sign “18,000” shall  be substituted. 
 

_____________  
 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 
 
 Due to sharp increase in the cost of living and the considerable expenses which the  Hon’ble 
Members of the State Legislative Assembly as a public representative has to incur on account of 
various demands of the public life, there has been persistent demand for the revision of their 
existing emoluments and amenities. This has necessitated the amendments in the Himachal Pradesh 
Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971. 
 

 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives. 
 

      PREM KUMAR DHUMAL, 
                Chief Minister. 

 
Shimla: 
The _______ April, 2012. 
 
 

___________ 
 
 
 

FINANCIAL  MEMORANDUM 
 

 Clause 2 to 6 of the Bill, when enacted, will entail additional recurring expenditure out of 

the State Exchequer to the tune of  Rs.3.30  crore  per annum approximately.  



MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION 
 

—NIL— 
 

___________ 
 
 

RECOMMENDATIONS  OF  THE  GOVERNOR  UNDER  ARTICLE  207  OF  THE  
CONSTITUTION  OF  INDIA 

 
(GAD File No. GAD-C (D)-5-1/2011) 

 
 The Governor  of Himachal Pradesh,  having  been informed of the subject matter of the 
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 
2012, recommends, under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and 
consideration of the Bill in the State Legislative Assembly. 
 

____________ 
 
 


