2025 &1 fAera® W 10

fearae v fu w1 omwe IR SummE A9 (W9EM) fRAPws, 2025

(faem s 7 QRewnfia wu )



ﬁmmﬁmwmﬂaﬁ?wumﬂaﬂ(#mw)m,zozs
qvel @ @Y

it Am |

gRT 3 BT FIEA |
UNT 4 BT G |
URT 10—% &1 G |

AW N~




10

15

2025 @1 faeras w&@d 10

ferrae v R war omene v Sumnm a9 (wWeee)
feam, 2025

(faemr e & qrenfia v #)

fewraet wew faems e areaer aiv urzer aaw afifigy 1974
(1971 @1 RfYTw H&iw 4) B AR e B @ forv RRTE |

AR TR & BeeRd a¥ & Reraa wwr fum w9 gro
fFrfaRed w1 & ag sRfafa -

1. =9 R @1 St 99 fRard vy fum wwr ey s ==
3R Iuregy da (W) R, 2025 1

2. fearge <y faum 9w eeger 3R Surege 9d+ sy, o™ 5 @
1971 (S o gwab v e iR mw%)aﬁmaﬁ— R

(@) IUERT (1) # "I TR’ TR B WH W TGS
IR’ TR @ N |

(@) SUERT (1-%) & ©IF ) Frefalea w@r arm, serfq—

“(1—) AETET BT da, JIBR AMATH, 1961 BT IRT 40
@ WG B @S (5) B I IURT AT I
Yadih B MR W TAH 3, 2030 ¥ URH & g
g% Uid quf & UTATq 961l SiTgT |

(1—bep) 3reder U BOIR YU AN Ui I W
B¢ P BHGR BT 3R

(1) SYERT (1—@) # “gaFd BOR” Wea] & R W “Th A
T BOR” UG T TG |



URT 4 &7
[ |

gRXT 10— -

Calitica i,

3. o R @GRt 4 -

(®) IR (1) NGOG AR Yeal B I W 4+
BAR’ ¥ W WU |

(@) IWIRT (1) B I R frferfad war s, serfq—

“(1—) IUTEHET BT A, 3MABR IRfTH, 1961 B R
40 P WG & Wug (5) B A UL AT
YERHIA ADTD D MR TR YIH 30, 2030 | TRA
I §U WS Uid a8t B TeEq qGHT ST |

(1—p) SuTeer Uid §WIR B YA HfTgRep el ATt
P BT THIR B 3R

(M) SWRT (1-%) ¥, “gaR gOR’ IR 3 WH W TS
N EN R ¥ X WO |

4.

ol A9 o g7 10-F H—

(@) SUuRT (1) §—

)

(1)

IR G 0" <L B W R BE dE
TR AR W A1 |

YR (1) D W Wb B I W [foriad
[GT STQT, SFeqid—

MR W W BN g iy fpeldiier woR
TN W A 3FRe T B ag v @
Hfedaq Er @ fieax & | ek

10

15

20



@) fda wgs d AR da R @ B e
W OB AN WA e @ G |

(@) SR (2) A "wEle gwR WY B @I 0 g
BUIR UG W@ g |

|
|
|
i




Rl R Bt B wer

| fate @ra & diaar @ afa & sror RurE i amer M IUmgE AT A 1971
q WY BT WD G g7 R |

ue fugs Suded Swd A g @ farg 2

faerges @ SIugwl @t sRfafid fby oM ¥ woey W) amn Y g sfiRe
19l @y siaferd 8N, T 3udT A IHM TE AT o W R |

yaargforg faems gl e



T @ WREN B w207 @ omit wrouwer @ RuwRet
(@ o Shogodlo—wo-Lo(e)-3 /2025)



fewraet wRw Rem i omam s wumme dqw (W) Rdge, 2025

fesraret sraer fer weir seer MR wurener A affram, 1971 (1971 @1 aifRifgE
HRATH 4) BT IR GO B B forw RAegs® |

Gafier Rz gag)
q& 7 |




T wuwd RRue g e ywfda @Y o Ruma wiw R e aenm

- IR Summs doq IR, 1071 (1971 B afePram wenie 4) 3 9wl B
TENT |

IRT:

3. I B Aq AfR—(1) remer wRAWE R BuR wuy 4 @ @ dq7 el
SO el A & AR v R D forg, Rererer wawr e W (weedt @ oy ot
=) rfRfay, 1971 BV °RT 4 B JU—4RT (1) D @g (i) # 7o fafifée a7 gz war ura
FX BT EHIR BN |

(1—) Sremer HfoMIT O/ B9TR BT @Y R W RS 91 9 B B gHEN
R e

(1—@) 3T Yg™d BOR YU UfHN &Y ¥ @ HobR Wil U &9 T 2HEN
L =N

(1=7) SuERT (1) 3R (1—w@) # srafde fadt ad @ & §U Y, SRy (1) AR
- (1) @ 3T I P WG I 3R ThR WY B, WA 3, 2020 § WRET B oA

U% 99 & A @ fofg, BRI TR (HIfds—19) Fdamd FemmRY § S~ ISt
@ g &g, 919 afoRrd 9@ o9 g srg |

(2) orEHe BT IHSH! USTEN B SRM U WHR gRI Rel # Fges garod
Te far STe fred STReTTT BT MR WS WRBR T8 BRI | 0T WRHR 9N IS
| 3el A e B NI ¥ g o 9 e @l ol b e 1 iged et 9 veR
P argen A we |
| 4. IUTELE BT AT AfE—(1) SuTRgE MR THETR FAR IW Bl R A AT
R ST Wt erafy @ SR, wele e @ forg, fRwEe wew U W (el @ s
i e P, 1971 @) ORT 4 @ SUERT (1) B @Us (i) W g AR o W, s
U @R P EHER BN |

(1—a) SuTezE FfH Urd BoTR Ul @ ax B HRIGRS Hl A B BT EDIR
- ey



(1—@)wwmﬁmvmmmaﬁﬂﬁmwmmm%
BT | )

(1) SwuRT (1) 3R (1- @)ﬁaﬁiﬁﬁafﬁ?ﬁm%ﬁé‘g’mﬁw()
(1-3) @ el Suremer @Y Wy A AR HehR W B, GIH A, 2020@{%@-,}3}\
TP a¥ 3 3 @ fory, SR AR (difds—19) wdard Hgmrﬁﬂmm%
@1 i Bg, O wfonrd 9@ e far S|

(2) SUTereE Y I HeTale @ R T WRER GRT el # (3w wehs
T oA S e SRTT @1 SR 19T WRBR d8d B A1 ID 9ae § T 6
|l vUd i e W oMiE Y W O Wod WReR R @, ded a1 e
WPR I8 SHS IUTeAe 7 @ A TG W TE R & 3\fe B 9ol 93 e
yed Al 99 e © gl

W —S e e Hera @ forg safterd w9 § Rl A8 & aft gw
fare @ fog amafed e @1 qMe R 1@ | TE 593 wEE @ e 2 et

10—, oMM gRT a1 AN gRT W e W Frged aE—(1) e
1 JUTZET U1 YSTAf & SR 307 HGHE @ T AT A S SR SHET S@H 3
FETAAT B B Y IS T IS S a0 fHe afy B 9y e o amy e 4
o & et gRT A1 Ay AR g A9 & AR a1 qrew A R g1 oy B 97w R o
@ R T PR BT §HER BN AR 98 TS elig ad § gR o vuy & afeas vl
@ I, 39 THR ST IIAd 2 & 7RgfS @1 ewer, T & TS T 9 Rwe
1 fdell & WRgd FA W, BN

URw SRl gRT B TS AT R T IR ART I B ARHeH IR B 9 IR
A e 1 grft:

TRy TE IR & fpeht o focfra o & @ vt g ar arg anf gwr @7 3 ER
DI S ATH B I T A YA AR oG $UY | IfH 8} enfh |



IS SN B Jalor B g qa e A R gel, 9 afaa
AP 3 AR g Wl sfaifa g o g (g afo &1 /8|

2) Wﬁ,mamﬁvwa@wﬁuw@ﬂwmﬁ%mwﬂﬂm
m@m@maﬁnm@ﬁwsmmﬁwwﬁs@nﬁﬁﬂuaéeﬁmrﬁ?{@rt{a‘

wﬁﬁa%mmﬁwaaﬁwwm,mmaﬁmﬁﬁmmﬁw
f&ar e |

wﬂw.—ww%mﬁq@ammmwma%ﬁmmﬁm
smw(%ﬂmm)aﬁﬁw,zoooﬁW7m%FmamﬁHmwm$ﬂ%
IR I=) AR, 1971aﬁwe$aeﬁq,wmuaéﬁmﬁmmmm
mﬁmﬁnﬁwﬁwmmaﬂnﬁmﬁfﬁwﬁ%ml



AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

BILL NO. 10 OF 2025

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)



THE HIMACHAL PRADES

H LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPE

AKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

Clauses:
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of section 3.
3. Amendment of section 4.
4. Amendment of section 10-A.




Bill No. 10 of 2025

THE l!l\l_A(‘HAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of
1971).

BEit enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh n
the Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follow:—

1. This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative short title.
Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries (Amendment) Act,
2025.

2. Tn section3of the Himachal PradeshLegislative Assembly Amendment
Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred of section 3.
to as the “principal Act”),—

(a) insub-section (1), for the words “eighty thousand”, the words
10 “ninety five thousand” shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted,
namely:—

"(1-A) The salary of the Speaker shall be increased after

every five years commencing from 1% April, 2030 on the
15 basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of

Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.



Amendment
of section
4.

Amendment
of section
10-A.

(©)

(a)

(b)

©

4.

(1-AA) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive
compensatory allowance at the rate of five thousand rupees
per mensem."; and

in sub-section (1-B), for the words “ninety five
thousand”, the words “one lakh fifty thousand” shall be
substituted.

In section 4 of the principal Act,—

in sub-section (1), for the words, “seventy five
thousand”, the words “ninety two thousand” shall be
substituted;

for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted,
namely:—

"(1-A) The salary of the Deputy Speaker shall be increased
after every five years commencing from 1st April, 2030 on
the basis of cost inflation index provided under clause (v) of
Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.

(1-AA) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled to receive
compensatory allowance at the rate of five thousand rupees
per mensem."; and

in sub-section (1-B), for the words “ninety five
thousand”, the words “one lakh fifty thousand” shall be
substituted.

In section 10-A of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh
rupees” shall be substituted;



(11)  for the first PTOViso, the followin
, the £ shall he substituted,
namely: -

“Provided that the €xpenses of journey by taxi shall be

On actual basis but per kilometer Charges shall not exceed

more than twenty fiye Tupees and within the maximum

limit of six lakh rupees:”; and

() in the second proviso, for the words

“four lac rupees”
the words “six lakh rupees”

shall be substituted: and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty five thousand”,
the words “fifty thousand” shall be substituted.




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to sharp increase in the cost of living, it has been considered necessar Y to amend

i prs‘\'m‘ms of the Himachal Pradesh 1.egislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker s
- Act. 1971.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

L SHIMLA
The March, 2025.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Provisions of the Bill when enacted will involve an additional recurring expenditure of
approximately 35 lakhs on the State Exchequer, however, the same cannot be exactly quantified.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

-Nil-



MENDATIONS OF THE Gy,

LRNOR UNDER A g
CONSTITUTION o o A ICLE 207 O g

RE(‘OM

» Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having be
?itmdeb‘h Legislative Assembly Speaker’s
jchal b

s recommends under article 207 of the
2020 1€

bly.

4

——

1
Rill.

S Salaries (Amendment)
a, the introduction and

seration of the Bill in the Legislative Assem
~ONSIL er

-

\




ADESH LEGISLATIVY, sq.; -

HAL PRADESH ] S (AME I EMBLY SppAKpg o AND
m:,/:r(iw' SPEAKER'S SALARIES (AMENpypa [) BILL, 2075
pE

-1
lH]a
A

BILT,

to amend the Himachal Prade.vh
£rther
urt

Legisiatiye Assembly Speaker’s and
. ker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971),
A S‘Ew(ﬁﬂ A

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU )
Chief Minister

-7ARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
: Pr. Secretary (Law).

,2025.




E‘\"rRA(TT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE
- ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES ACT, 1971 (ACT
~ NO. 40K 1971) LIKELY TO BE AFFECTED BY THIS AMENDMENT BILL.

Sections:

3. Salary etc. of the Speaker.—(1) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive a salary
at the rate of eighty thousand rupees per mensem and an allowance for each day during the
whole of his term at the same rates as are specified in clause (ii) of sub-section (1) of section

4 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act,
1971.

(1-A) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive compensatory allowance at the rate of
five thousand rupees per mensem.

(1-B) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive sumptuary allowance at the rate of ninety
ve thousand rupees per mensem.

(1-C) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) and (1-B), the salary and
umptuary allowance payable to the Speaker under sub-section (1) and (1-B), shall be reduced

y thirty pergept. for a period of one year commencing from the 1% April, 2020, to meet the
xigencies arising out of Corona Virus (COVID-19) pandemic.

(2) 'The Speaker during the term of his office shall be provided by the State Government,
free furnished house at Shimnla, the maintenance charges of which shall be borne by the State
overnment. The State Government may also allow him to continue in free occupation of the
ouse for a period not exceeding fifteen days from the date of his ceasing to be the Speaker.

'4. Salary etc. of the Deputy Speaker.—(1) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled
receive a salary at the rate of seventy five thousand rupees per mensem and an allowance
oreach day during the whole of his term at the same rates as are specified in clause (ii) of sub-

tion (1) of section 4 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension
fMembers) Act, 1971.

f (IA) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled to receive compensatory allowance at the
¢of five thousand rupees per mensem.




(1-B) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled to receive sumptuary allowance 2t th,
of ninety-five thousand rupees per mensem. i,

(1-C) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) and (1-B), the Salar
sumptuary allowance payable to the Speaker under sub-section (1) and (1-B), shal] pe n 0
by thirty percent. for a period of one year commencing from the 1st April, 2020 t, meetctfi
exigencies arising out of Corona Virus (COVID-19) pandemic.

(2) The Deputy Speaker during the term of his office shall be provided by the Sy
Govemnment, a free furnished house at Shimla, the maintenance charges of which shal] e bon
by the State Government or in lieu thereof he shall be paid such allowance not exceeding thrp
hundred rupees per mensem as the State Government may fix. The State Government Mmay aly'
allow him to continue in free occupation of the house for period not exceeding fifteen days fmr'
the date of his ceasing to be the Deputy Speaker. |

Explanation.—The Deputy Speaker shall not become liable personally for any paye.
in case the standard rent of the house allotted to him for residence exceeds one hundred g
fifty rupees per mensem.

10-A. Free transit by railway or by air or by taxi.—(1) The Speaker and t:
Deputy Speaker during the term of their office shall be entitled to travel at any time by railwa
or by air by any class within or outside the Country or by taxi outside the State and within t
Country alongwith his family or any person accompanying him to look after and assist hir
during travel and shall be entitled for the reimbursement of actual expenses so incurred o

production of tickets or bills of such journey performed, subject to a maximum amount of fou
lac rupees in each financial year:

Provided that the expenses on journey by taxi shall not be more than ten percent of t
maximum amount of four lac rupees:

Provided further that the aggregate amount payable for the journey performed b!
railway or by air or by taxi in a financial year shall not exceed four lac rupees.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this sub-section, the expression “family” shall me’
the spouse, their unmarried son(s) and daughter(s) including unmarried adopted son and daught*

(2) The Speaker and Deputy Speaker, as the case may be, shall be entitleq for &
advance not exceeding rupees twenty five thousand on his request to undertake such jou™”



und the advance so paid shall be adjusted before the closing of financial year, failing which the
ontire advance shall be recovered from his salary and allowances in lump-sum.

Explanation.—For determining the aggregate amount under this section, the amount so
incurred in the same financial year on journey by railway or by air or by taxi under section 7
of the Salaries and Allowance of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000 (11 of 2000) or

under section 6 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of
Members) Act, 1971 (8 of 1971) shall be taken into account.





{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Form", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Form", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }


{ "type": "Document", "isBackSide": false }

