
�
������ ����	
�������
�
� ����������	
�������
�

� ���������������
������	�����	��� ����������

������ ����������� �!�����"!� �!������#��$��
�#% �!���&	��'��(���	
��)����*�+,-.�
�+,-.����	
������
�)����	
��)��������/ %�0�-1��

� � �

��������� ��	
�������� ���� ������� 
������� � ��������� � �������
���� ��� ��!� 
�����"��#�

$% ��&' �( ��
���)�*��+�% ���,% ��-������.�

� � / 01� / ���2� 
����%�� ���) ��� ���
�� 3 % �&-4��5�6� ��������� ��	
�������� ���� �������


������� ���������� � �������
���� ��� ���2� 7���8��� ��������� �� ������
��� �9�
�����"��#� $%��&' �( �


���)��
�:%�����������
�6���
�:%�;�%�<�

� � /% ���� � ������� �= ��>�% �� � ��
��������-� 
�"��%�01� ��������� ��>��

, %����
���)�*��%��? �
������������ �������, ���
��0@A�

� � -2� ���34��$� � ������ ���#��$� ��5����
�.A� 7�9� ? � � � ������
��
����2� ��������� ��	
���������

���� �������
�����������������7$%��&' �( 9�� � ������
����BC���D�%���������������!%��&.�

� � 7B9� E�� 8� 
������� ����-� ' �F����= ����� � BC�G��� � 
���HI�� ��*!;�% �� J �;��

� �����
�:% �6����,������!% ��&�
�������/�����3 '�� �% �������? ���K )�L�-�J�;��� ������!%��&.��

� � +2� 6��� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� ��������� ��	
�������� ���� �������� 
������� ����������

� �������
���� ��� ��� 7���8��� ��������� �� ������
��� �9� 7/ 01� / ���2
����%�� 
��K * �

� �������
��
��% ���3 L�1-M ��L�6%�9��E��-�' �F����= % �01�A�

� � (i) �N
��K
��������,�����K' �O �����N�D�� �'�% ��5��NP
��������,�����K ' �O �����N�

D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � (ii) N/ '�R���ST%�����,�����K' �O ����N�D�� �'�% ��5��N��*
��������,�����K' �O ����N�

D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � (iii) � N+�%��� *��U% �� P
������ ��,��� ��K '�O ����N� D�� � '�% ��5�� N
��K���� *��U�

��K '�O ����N�D�� �'�% �������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � 62�8�����5����7 	��&	��'��(.A�
��K *�� �������
��% ��G��-�'�F����= %�01�A��



��

�

� � 7�9�7�9��-�3 ' �'�F����= %�01��VV��*
��������, �����K' �O ����WW�D�� �'�% ��5��

XWD�� ���������, �����K' �O ����WW�D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K-Q������!%��&<���

� � 7B9� 7B9��-�3 ' �'�F����= %�01��VVY ��������,�����K ' �O ����WW�D�� �' �%��5��XW/ '�R�����

��,�����K' �O ����WW�D �� �'�% �������2�'�F$���K -Q������!%��&<�

� � 82� .��� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� 
��K *� �� ������
��%�� ���-� ' �F����= % �� 7B9��-�

3 '�' �F����= % �01�� NZ ���� ��K ��� P
������ 0-����N� D�� � ' �%��5�� N+�%��� ��, ��� 0 -����N�

D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � .2� 1��� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� 
��K *� � �������
��% ��  ��-� ' �F����= % �� 7�9��-�

3 '�' �F����= % ��7D 9�� �[ ��01��NZ ������K���P
������0-����N�D�� �'�% ��5��N+�%�����,���

0-����N�D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � 12�19���5����7 	��&	��'��(.A�
��K *��� ������
��%�� D �'�F����= % �01�A�

� � (i) � NY �� ������ ��,��� ��K '�O ����N� D�� � '�% ��5�� N
��K
����ST%��� ��,���

��K '�O ����N�D�� �'�% �������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&<�
��������

� � (ii) ND�� �������,�����K ' �O ����N�D�� �'�%��5��ND��) ���*��U���K '�O ����N�D�� �

' �%�������2�'�F$���K-Q������!%��&.��

:2�1; ���5����7 	��&	��'��(.A�
��K *��� ������
��%�� [ �'�F����= %�01�A�

7i9� 7�9��-� 3 '�' �F����= % �01� VV��*
������ ��,��� ��K ' �O ����WW� D�� � '�% ��5��

VVD�� �������,�����K '�O ����WW�D�� �'�%�������2�'�F$���K -Q������!%��&<�

7ii9� 7B9��-� 3 '�' �F����= % �01� VVY ������ ��, ��� ��K ' �O ����WW� D�� � ' �%��5�� VV/ '�R�����

��, �����K '�O ����WW�D �� �' �%�������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&.�

� � <2� 1=� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� 
��K *� � �������
��% ��  \� '�F����= %�� 7B9��-�

3 '�' �F����= % �01�� NZ ���� ��K ��� P
������ 0-����N� D�� � ' �%��5�� N+�%��� ��, ��� 0 -����N�

D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � >2�1(���5����7 	��&	��'��(.A�
��K *�� �������
��% �� ( �'�F����= %��7�9��-�3 '�' �F����= % ��

7D 9� � �[ ��01�� NZ���� ��K ��� P
������ 0 -�����56���N� D�� � ' �% ��5�� N+�% ��� ��,���

0-�����56���N�D�� �' �%�������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � �C2�:�����5����7 	��&	��'��(.A�
��K *��� ������
��%��8��-�'�F����= %�01�A�

� � (i) � NY ����*�!� ��,��� ��K' �O ����N� D�� � '�%��5�� N
��K
������ ��,���

��K '�O ����N�D�� �'�% �������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&<�
�������



��

�

� � (ii) N���
������ ��, ��� ��K' �O ����N� D�� � ' �%��5�� N+�%��� *��U� P
������ ��,���

��K '�O ����N�D�� �'�% �������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

--2�<�����5����7 	��&	��'��(.A�
��K *�� �������
��% ��]��-�' �F����= % �01�A�

7i9� 7�9��-� 3 ' �'�F����= % �01� VV��*
������ ��, ��� ��K' �O ����WW� D�� � '�% ��5��

VVD�� �������, �����K ' �O ����WW�D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&<�
�������

7ii9� 7B9��-�3 ' �'�F����= %�01�VVY ��������, �����K '�O ����WW�D�� �'�% ��5��VV/ '�R�����

��,�����K' �O ����WW�D �� �'�% �������2�'�F$���K -Q������!%��&.�

� � -+2� >��� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� 
��K *� � �������
��% �� ���-� ' �F����= %�� 7B9��-�

3 '�' �F����= % �01�� NZ ������K���P
������0 -��I�N�D�� �' �% ��5��N+�%�����,���0-��I�N�

D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

� � -62� -,��� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� 
��K *� �� ������
��%�� �C��-� ' �F����= % �� 7�9��-�

3 '�' �F����= % ��7D 9�� �[ ��01��NZ ������K���P
������0-����N�D�� �'�% ��5��N+�%�����,���

0-����N�D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.��

-82� -+��� ��5����7 	�� &	��'��(.A� 
��K*� � �������
��% �� �B��-� ' �F����= % �� 7B9��-�

3 '�' �F����= % �01�A�

7i9� 7[ 9� � �[ ��01� VV/ ' �R����� ��K' �O �WW� D�� � '�% ��5�� VV
��K
������ ��K '�O �WW�

D�� �'�% �������2�' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&<�
�������

7ii9� 7( 9�� �[��01��VV+�%�����,��%��P%�����K ������K' �O ����WW�D�� �'�% ��5��

VVD��) �����, �����K '�O ����WW�D�� �'�%�������2�'�F$���K -Q������!% ��&.�

7iii) 
�K% �*��-� ' ���������%�01� ND��)��� ��, ��� ��K '�O �����N� D�� � '�% ��5��

VVD��) ��� ��, ��% �� P%��� ��K���� ��K '�O �����WW� D�� � ' �%�������2�

' �F$���K -Q������!% ��&.�

7iv) D��) ���-� '���������% �� �����
������ ? � 
�������� ' ���������
����2� ��-;������!% ��&��

D �% ���@A��

� � �N�*1%�-� '��������� ��>�%�� Y �K ��6��� '�F
���%�� ���%�����%�01�� ^ ������

� �����K	 ���%������01�_ ��
�������
���$�������2�+% �6���
��Y �K -̀ �LI��a �
��

��K �% �O ���������b����01�3 5% ����K�(% �&01��^ ������[*�1������2�+%�6���
�:% ���!�

+��' ���#� +�%��� � ����!� P% ��� ��, ��� ��K '�O ����� � ��� �������

� Y ����6������!% ��&.N�



��

�

� 	'��� �!������#��$�����7  �!��� �?��

�

� '�F������� Q-
���� �
��Y �c �� 
�H�d% �01� ����"��#� Y �H�d��
�6%�.� 
���e �
���$F�����

��	
��������� ��>�� ��	
�������� 
������� 3 ' �� ��	
�������� ���� ��� 
������� ������������2� � Y ����

��*� �%�� '�;"�!;\���
�:� *1.� ^ % �&;�%��� ���� ���� 
������( �� � ������� ^ $a ��� �������� 
�Y ����

� ���������� / �������� ' �;"�!��c ��6� ��������� ��	
�������� ���� ������� 
������� ����������

� �������
������� ���2��$% ��&' �( �
���) ��
�:% ����
�4��
��%���'�;�= f��L�6% �.�

�

� ^ % �&;�%��? �,%��-������.�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



��

�

� @����AB��������#�5�

�

� '�F���,�����F
����%��'�F$�
�"����!����
�������E.�C���K -g���K '�O �����^h ����
�H�d
�:�

3 �`������%�.��

�

=	�C������)��%�

���e �
���$F�����

�
�
� D 2�E���5�����
� �������% �i��
� ���������, %�������� ���
�
�
�



��

�

����"�	
��
����������������� �!�����"!� �!������#��$��
�#% �!�����F�)�����*�->.1���

�->.:��������� ������F�)������.��� 	�CG#���
� ��

� � xx   xx   xx 
62� ����H %����&5�)������� ���#��$� �������� �!�� ���"!� �!��20� 
���e �
���$F����
�;�� ' �F$�

$������
��K
��������, �����K '�O ������
�������' �F$���K � j���	
�;��
���Y ���������/' �R���ST% ���
��,�����K '�O ��������� ��
����2�' �
�$�
���)�����!% ��&.��� *1%���' �F$�
�"����!�+�% ���*��U% ��
P
��������, �����K '�O �����^$a����������������2���Y ��'�
�$�
���)�����!%��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
82� �������� F���� �!��20� 7�9� ' �F$���K� j� ��	
������ � �����K ���� �����% �01� ��
��k�

� ������
���� / ���
�� ������� 
������� ����� �����
�����% �� � ���
������ ������� �
�������
�����
�����Ql��� �
���
����2� � ����*�� �a �
�� � �a �� �����Ql��� �
���% �� � % �0�� ��*
������ ��, ���
��K '�O ����� %���% �01� 
����� ��( �� �������������2� ' �) �����*�� Y ����!��m
���6������!%��&.� ? �
3 '�' �F����= % �� 
��-���� +% �6��L�%�� �
���
�:� �����, ���� Y ��%�%�� � �a�� ,�$�������2�
, �-������!% �&*1.�

7B9� �����Ql��� �
�����!� � %�L�6� 
����� � �(�� ��������!� Y ����!��m� ��	
����� � �����
��
�
���% �01��� � ���n���3 % �&-4������ �����6�������,���L�%��� �a��� ��������01���>���������
�:�

��K������K-c �������2������Ql���K5������!%��&.���
�����'�F$�$��������
���% ���
��Y �c ��
�������
��oH �p���6� 
������� ��a�� �
���% �01� /���
�� ��K-����� , ������ 
������� �
��Y �c ��6� Y ������
��,�����K' �O �������������Y ����!��m
���6������!%��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
.2��������� �? ���� �����I��
�% �!��20�xx   xx   xx 
7B9� ' �F$���K � j� ��	
�;�K � '�F$� $������ Z ���� ��K ��� P
������ 0 -����� ' �̀ �K F-LI�

[ LI����
����% ��
�Y �����������������2�' �
�$�
���)�����!% ��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
12� ��������� ���#��$� ���������J� ���	��)��� ��)�K�����	�� �L�M �!��20� 7�9� ' �F$���K� j�

��	
������ G��-� ' �F����= % �� 7�9��-� 3 '�� '�F����= %�� 
������� ���-� ' �F����= %�� 
��-����� �
����
� �����6� Y ��	�������% �� �
���� 
������� 
�K -̀ ����� ��;��� ���� �%��%�01�� ? � 
��������

�H�d������2����%������
���)�*��� %�q��6������!% ��&��D �% ���@A�

�7D 9� �������
�:� ���%������ 
���)��
�� Z ���� ��K ��� P
������ 0 -����� ' �̀ �K F-LI�
� �L�6����Y �	d������6���
��k�
�K -̀ �����������5��� 5\%��' �̀ �K F-0���� �L�<�

xx   xx   xx 
�192� ��N%� �������� �!�� ���"!� �!��20� '�F$���K � j� ��> �� ��	
�;�� '�F$� $��5��

Y �� ������ ��,��� ��K' �O ����� ���� ��� 
������� '�F$� 
�"����!� D�� ����� ��, ��� ��K' �O �����
^ $a ���������
����2����% ������
���) �����!%��&.�

xx   xx   xx 



��

�

1; 2� ��N%� �������� �!�� F���� �!��20� 7�9� ' �F$���K� j� ��	
������ � �����K ���� �����%�01�
��
��k��� �����
�� ��/ ���
���������
����������� ������
�����%��� ��
������� �������
�������
�����
�����Ql��� �
���
����2� � ����*�� �a �
�� � �a �� �����Ql��� �
���% �� � % �0�� ��*
������ ��,���
��K '�O ����� %���% �01� 
����� ��( �� �������������2� ' �)�����*�� Y ����!��m
���6������!% ��&.� ? �
3 '�' �F����= % ��
��-����+% �6��L�%���
���
�:������,���� Y ��% �%����a��� ��������%�&6������!%��&�

��������%����
��-*�'�����% ��,\�-= �
�:������, ���� Y ��% �%��,�$6����Y �	 d��/ ������!%�&*1.��

7B9� �����Ql��� �
�����!� � %�L�6� 
����� � �(�� ��������!� Y ����!��m� ��	
����� � �����
��
�
���% �01��� � ���n���3 % �&-4������ �����6�������,���L�%��� �a��� ��������01���>���������
�:�

��K������K -c �������2������Ql���K 5������!% ��&.��
�����' �F$�$��������
���%���
��Y �c ��
�������
��oH �p���6� 
������� ��a�� �
���% �01� /���
�� ��K-����� , ������ 
������� �
��Y �c ��6� Y ������
��,�����K' �O �������������Y ����!��m
���6������!%��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
1=2���N%��������� �? ���� �����I��
�% �!��20�7�9���>���������
�:��' �F$���K � j���> ��

��	
�;�K �� �����6���K ���
�%��
�K -̀ ������������2�+% �6������!% ��&.�
7B9�' �F$���K� j���>����	
�;�K �'�F$�$������Z������K���P
������0-�����' �̀ �K F-LI�

� �L�����
����%��
�Y �����������������2����%������
���)�����!% ��&.��

xx   xx   xx 
1(2� ��N%�������������#��$� �����������	��)��� ��)�K�����	���L�M �!��20� 7�9�' �F$���K � j�

��>�� ��	
������  [ � ' �F����= % �� 7�9��-� 3 '�� ' �F����= % �� 
�������  \� '�F����= %�� 
��-���� �
����
� �����6� Y ��	 �������%�� �
���� 
������� 
�K -̀ ����� ��;��� ���� �%��%�01� ? � 
����� ���

�H�d������2�'�
�$�
���)�*��� %�q��6������!% ��&��D �% ����A�

7D 9� �
����
�K -̀ �����������5��� ����'�( \% ��' �̀�K F-LI���L�������Z������K ���
P
������ 0-�����56���� Y �H �d% �01�� � %����2� �������
�:� ���%������

���)�����!% ��&.��

xx   xx   xx 
:2� � ��� �������� �!�� ���"!� �!��20� � '�F$���K� j� 3 ' �� ��	
�;�K � 
���\��� Y ����*�!�

��,�����K' �O ��������� ���
�������
�r����� ��
��������, �����K '�O �����^$a���������������2�
���%������
���)�����!% ��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
<2�� ����������� �!��F���� �!��20� 7�9�' �F$���K� j�3 ' ����	
��������
��k��� �����
�� ��

/ ���
���������
����������� ������
�����% �����
������� �������
�� �����
������ �����K���������%�01�
�����Ql��� �
���
����2� � ����*�� �a �
�� � �a �� �����Ql��� �
���% �� � % �0�� ��*
������ ��, ���
��K '�O �����% ���%�01�
�������( ��� ������������2�'�) �����*��Y ����!��m
���6������!%��&.� � ? �3 '��
' �F����= %��
��-����+%�6��L�%���
���
�:������,���� Y ��% �%��a ��� ��������%�&6������!%��&�
�������
� %����
��-*�' �����% ��,\�-= �
�:������, ���� Y ��%�%��, �$6����Y �	 d��/ ������!% �&*1.�

7B9�������Ql����
�����!�� % �L�6�
�������(��� �������!�Y ����!��m���> ����	
������ �����
��
�
���% �01��� � ���n���3 % �&-4������ �����6�������,���L�%��� �a��� ��������01���>���������
�:�

��K������K-c �������2������Ql���K5������!%��&.���
�����'�F$�$��������
���% ���
��Y �c ��
�������



��

�

��oH �p���6� 
������� ��a�� �
���% �01� /���
�� ��K-����� , ������ 
������� �
��Y �c ��6� Y ������
��,�����K' �O �������������Y ����!��m
���6������!%��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
>2� � � ��� �����O � ��� ���� �I��
�% �!��20� � 7�9� � ��> �� �������
�:� '�F$���K � j� 3 ' ��

��	
�;�K �� �����6���K ����
�K -̀ ������������2�+%�6������!%��&.�
7B9� � ' �F$���K� j� 3 ' �� ��	
�;�K � '�F$� $������ Z ���� ��K��� P
������ 0 -��I��

��
����%��' �̀ �K F-LI�� �L�����
����%��
�Y �����s*������������������2�' �
�$�
���)�����!% ��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
-,2� � � ��� ��������� ���#��$� ��N%� ���������J� ���	��)��� ��)�K�����	�� �L�M �!��20� � 7�9��

' �F$���K � j� 3 '�� ��	
������ ]��-� '�F����= % �� 7�9��-� 3 '�� ' �F����= % �� 
������� ���-� ' �F����= % ��

��-���� �
���� � �����6� Y ��	�������%�� �
����
������� 
�K -̀ ����� ��;��� ���� �%��% �01�� ? �

����� ���
�H �d������2����%������
���)�*��� % �q��6������!%��&��D �% ���@A�

7D 9� � �
���
����
�K -̀ ����� ������5�� �������
�:� ���% ������
���( %�� Z ���� ��K���
P
������0-�����' �̀ �K F-LI6����Y �	 d��� ��\%��' �̀ �K F-0���� �L��

xx   xx   xx 
-+2���5����	�PQ����� ����5�)�)�7 ����#��$�R #����
�#% �!��20�xx  xx  xx 
7B9� � ����n��� 
��
�Y ���%�� 
��-L�� ' �F
���� 
���) ��
��� '�F$���K� j� ��	
������ ��>��

��	
������a �
��3 '����	
����.�
� 7D 9� ��T0��� 
��K*��� 
���)�L�%�� '�F�����= �5�6� ^ � ��T0��01� *� ���, ���
�� 3 ���
���
% �J�������+�%���' �F�����= �%���% ��D��)���"�#��!�Y ����!��m
���6������!% ��&@�
� �7[ 9�����������
��K*���' �F�����= �
���( %���' �F$�tL�K -,�-�;��/ '�R�������K' �O ��
������
��T*��% �����!�Y ����!��m
���6������!%��&.�
� 7\9�,
�����% ��
��K *���
���)��
��' �F�����= ��!6��� �a��'�F�����= ��!����% ������
���(%��
+�% ���% ���% ��
�������+�% ���P%���-�+�%���� ���% �"��#�
�������� �a ��' �F�����= �������%�� ���%�01�
� '�u �������� 3 �`�% �01� ,
���6� ��� '�( \%�� ,
���������� '�) �����*��
Y ����!��m
���6������!% ��&<�
� 7( 9� ' �F�����= %�� ����5�6� 
������� �����
�:%�-� ��b��% �01� 3 5% ����K���m
�� '�F$�����!�
+�% �����, ��% ��P% �����K������K '�O ��������� ������5��Y ����!��m
���6������!% ��&@�
� '��������� ��>�%�� Y �K ���� 
���)��
�� ' �F
������� ���%�� ������01� ' �F�����= % �� � ���5��

������� �����
�:% �-� ��b��% �01� 3 5% ����K���m
�� '�F$� � ����!� D��)��� ��, ��� ��K '�O ������
� �������������6������!% ��&@�
� 
����K �� ' ��������� �����'�$�� ��	
��� ��>�� ��	
�� � a �
�� 3 ' �� ��	
������2� ��> �%��
� $h ����%��� ' �;�= f\%�� ���%�� ������01�� �
������2� ��>�%�� �$h � D �% ��� '�;�= f\% ��a��
�
�� ��6����� �����%����*�� ���% �"��#�Y �= 
����2�
�����F�'�)�����*��Y ����!��m
���6������!% ��&.�

xx   xx   xx 
�
�

�����;�
���% �Fc �* ������, ������s% ����� �����K �����v 8������K ���8�CA' �F$�����B]��-�
���H I���BC���



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SIXTH SESSION 

(ADJOURNED MEETINGS) 
 

THE KARNATAKA MINISTERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES 
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015 

 (L.A. Bill No. 16 of 2015) 
 

  

 A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and 

Allowances Act, 1956. 

 Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ministers 

Salaries and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957) for the 

purposes hereinafter appearing; 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the                           

sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 

Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2015. 

(2) Sections 3, 7 and 11 shall be deemed to have come into force on 4th 

day of March 2014 and other provisions shall come into force at once. 

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Ministers Salaries 

and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957), (hereinafter referred to 

as the principal Act),  in section 3,-  

(i) for the words "thirty thousand rupees" the words, "fifty 

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii)  for the words "twenty five thousand rupees" the words, " forty 

thousand rupees" ; and  

(iii)  for the words "one lakh fifty thousand rupees" the words, "three 

lakhs rupees" shall be substituted. 

3. Amendment of section 4.- In section 4 of the principal Act,- 



 2

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “fourty thousand rupees”, 

the words “eighty thousand rupees”  shall be substituted; 

(2)  in sub-section (2), for the words, “ten thousand rupees”, the 

words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the principal Act,  in 

sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres " the words, 

"one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act, 

in sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", 

the words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

6. Amendment of section 6A.- In section 6A of the principal Act,-   

(i) for the words "sixteen thousand rupees", the words "thirty five 

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and 

(ii) for the words "eighty thousand rupees", the words "two lakhs 

rupees" shall be substituted. 
 

7. Amendment of section 6B.- In section 6B of the principal Act,-  

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “forty thousand rupees”, the 

words “eighty thousand rupees”  shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words, “ten thousand rupees”, the 

words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

8. Amendment of section 6C.- In section 6C of the principal Act, in 

sub section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres ", the words " 

one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

9. Amendment of section 6D.- In section 6D of the principal Act, in 

sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the 

words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

10. Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the principal Act,- 

(i) for the words "fourteen thousand rupees", the words "thirty 

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and 



 3

(ii) for the words "sixty thousand rupees", the words "one lakh fifty 

thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

11. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the principal Act,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the 

words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "ten thousand rupees" the 

words, "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

12. Amendment of section 9.- In section 9 of the principal Act, in 

sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the words 

"one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

13. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the principal Act, in 

sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred fifty litres", the 

words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

14. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the principal Act, in 

sub-section (2),- 

(i)  in item (b), for the words "twenty rupees", the words "thirty 

rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii) in item (d), for the words "one thousand five hundred rupees", 

the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(iii)  in first proviso, for the words "two thousand rupees", the words 

"two thousand five hundred rupees" shall be substituted; 

(iv)  after second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

"Provided also that in case of tour outside the state where 

he has stayed in a hotel or registered establishment providing 

boarding and loadging at scheduled rates, he shall be entitled 

for daily allowance of rupees five thousand per day subject to 

production of bills." 

 

 



 4

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASON 

 

 There is a considerable increase in the cost of living.  The salary and 

allowances to the Chief Minister, Ministers, Ministers of State and Deputy 

Ministers have not been revised since a long time.  Therefore, it is 

considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and 

Allowances Act, 1956 for revision of salary, house rent allowance, 

sumptuary allowance, conveyance allowances etc.,  

 

Hence, the Bill. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 5

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 
 

 

 There will be an approximate annual expenditure of Rs. 3.50 Crores 

by the proposed measure.  

 
 
 

SIDDARAMAIAH 
Chief Minister 

 

 

P. OMPRAKASHA 
Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 

 



 6

ANNEXURE 
Extract from the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances, Act, 

1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957) 
 

xx   xx   xx 
   

3. Salaries of Chief Minister and Ministers.- There shall be paid to 
the Chief Minister a salary of thirty thousand rupees  per mensem and to 
each Minister a salary of  twenty five thousand rupees per mensem. They 
shall also be paid a sumptuary allowance of one lakh fifty thousand rupees 
per annum.  

xx   xx   xx 
  

4. Residences of Ministers.- (1) Each Minister shall be entitled,  to 
the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his 
term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or in lieu 
of such furnished residence to a house rent allowance at the rate of fourty 
thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-
section shall be furnished on such scales, and the plinth area thereof shall 
not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed. 

(2) In a residence used by a Minister who is entitled to a house rent 
allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by 
the State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for 
official purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of ten thousand 
rupees

 
per month for maintenance and upkeep of residence and for layout 

and maintenance of gardens included in such residence. 

                xx                    xx                      xx  
5. Conveyances for Ministers.- xx            xx               xx  

 

(2) There shall be paid to each Minister a conveyance allowance equal 
to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per mensem. 

xx                    xx                      xx 
 

6. Charges payable by the Minister and the Government.- (1) Each 
Minister shall in respect of the residence and motor car allotted for his use 
under sub-section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable to pay the 
following charges, namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of 
the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government  

xx                    xx                      xx 
 

6A. Salaries of Ministers of State.- There shall be paid to each 
Minister of State a salary of sixteen thousand rupees per mensem and a 
sumptuary allowance of eighty thousand rupees per annum 

 

xx                    xx                      xx 
 

 



 7

6B. Residences of Ministers of State.- (1) Each Minister of State shall 
be entitled, to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore 
throughout his term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately 
thereafter, or in lieu of such furnished residence to a house rent allowance 
at the rate of forty thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided 
under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales, and the plinth 
area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.  

 (2) In a residence used by a Minister of State who is entitled to a house 
rent allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be 
furnished by the State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to 
be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of ten 
thousand rupees per month for maintenance and up keep of residence and 
for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.  

 

xx                    xx                      xx 
 

6C. Conveyance for Ministers of State.- (1) The State Government 
may provide a suitable motor car for the use of each Minister of State.  

 

(2) There shall be paid to each Minister of State a conveyance 
allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres  of petrol  per 
mensem.  

xx                    xx                      xx 
 

6D. Charges payable by the Minister of State and the 
Government.- (1) Each Minister of State shall in respect of the residence 
and motor car allotted for his use under sub-section (1) of section 6B and 
section 6C, be liable to pay the following charges, namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of 
the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government 
 

xx                    xx                    xx 
 

7. Salaries of Deputy Ministers.- There shall be paid to each Deputy 
Minister a salary of fourteen thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary 
allowance of sixty thousand rupees per annum. 

xx                    xx                    xx 
 

8. Residences of Deputy Ministers.- (1) Each Deputy Minister shall 
be entitled to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore 
throughout his term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately 
thereafter or in lieu of such furnished residence to a house rent allowance at 
the rate of forty thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under 
this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales and the plinth area 
thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed. 

(2) In a residence used by a Deputy Minister who is entitled to a house 
rent allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be 
furnished by the State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to 
be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of ten 



 8

thousand rupees
 
per month for maintenance and up keep of residence and 

for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence. 
 

xx                    xx                    xx 
 

9. Conveyance for Deputy Ministers.- (1) The State Government may 
provide a suitable motor car for the use of each Deputy Minister.  

 

(2) There shall be paid to each Deputy Minister a conveyance allowance 
equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per mensem. 

xx                    xx                    xx 
 
 

10. Charges payable by the Deputy Minister and the Government.-(1) 
Each Deputy Minister shall in respect of the residence and motor car 
allotted for his use under sub-section (1) of section 8 and section 9, be liable 
to pay the following charges, namely:—  

 

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the 
cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government. 

 

xx                    xx                    xx 
 

12. Travelling and other allowances on tours.-   
                  xx         xx                    xx 

 
(2) While touring on official business every Minister, Minister of State and 

Deputy Minister shall be entitled,—  
 (a) for journeys by train to two times the single fare of the highest class 

available in the train:  
(b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at twenty rupees per kilometre; 
 (c) for journeys by air, to one and one-fifth times the single fare paid for 

such journeys 1[and to the prescribed insurance premium for insurance 
against accidents during such journeys; 

 (d) to daily allowance at one thousand five hundred rupees per day for 
the days of journey and for the days of halt at any place:  

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily allowance 
shall be at two thousand rupees per day for the days of journey and for the 
days of halt at any place:  

Provided further that if a Minister, a Minister of State or a Deputy 
Minister is treated as a State Guest, he shall be entitled only to one-fourth of 
the daily allowance for the period for which he is treated as a State Guest. 

 
 

xx                    xx                    xx 
 
 
 
 
 

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, P7, W.D. , Copies 750, 28th March, 2015 


