
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À¸À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÉÊzÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉ 

ºÀ£ÉßgÀqÀ£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2022 
(2022gÀ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-05) 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ಃౙ  ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല  
෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ เඒಯಕ. 

 ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬  ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  
ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ඝ౬  (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 5) ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ 
෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

 ಇൿ, ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ౱ൢ ರඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  เඋನ෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ 
෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

 1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ 
๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2022 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ  2022ರ  ಏඪ౳ ฯ 1ඡ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 2. 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1956ರ (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 5) (ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ 
ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං), 3ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i)  "ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಎಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ" 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (ii) "ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಅರವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 (iii)  "෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "කฤౙ  ಲౘದ ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 3.  4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,-  

 (1) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , ``ಎಂಭൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ `` ಒಂൿ 
ಲౘದ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;   

 (2) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , ``ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
``෩ವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 4. 5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , 
"ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಎರഴ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 5.  6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
(ಎ) ಘಡದย౵ , "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಎರഴ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 6.  6ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 



2 

 
 (i)  "෩ವ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨   

 (ii) "ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

7.  6෈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6෈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(i) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ಎಂಬൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ ``ಒಂൿ 
ಲౘದ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ ``෩ವൡ౨  
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 8.  6๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , 
"ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿඞฆ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 9.  6ല ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 6ല ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎ) 
ಘಡದย౵ , "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆಗัಜಂತ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿඞฆ 
ยೕಟฆಗัಜಂತ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 10.  7ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 7ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i)  "෩ವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 (ii) "ಒಂൿ ಲౘ ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಎರഴ ಲౘ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

11. 8ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 8ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(i) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ಎಂಬൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
``ಒಂൿ ಲౘದ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

(ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵  ``ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
``෩ವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 12. 9ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 9ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ , 
"ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑಡ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿඞฆ ยೕಟฑಡ" ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

  13.  9෈ ຄಸ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ๳ಪბഷ.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 9ಎ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ 
෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “9෈. ෨ಖ౲ ෱ൟ౳ , ෱ൟ౳ , ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳  ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  
ಭ൤౲ ಗಳย౵  ກಚ౞ ಳ.- ෨ಖ౲ ෱ൟ౳ , ෱ൟ౳ , ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳  ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  
ಭ൤౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ಆർಯ ൤คಡ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961ರ 48ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ เವರൕಯ ಘಡ (v)ರ ಅലಯย౵  
ಉಪීඌಸมದ ෍ว ಏคಃ ๰ಚ౲ ಂಕದ ಆඋರದ ෬ว 2023ರ ಏඪ౳ ฯ 1ඡ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ 
ඩ౳ ฏಭ฿ಜ ಪ౳ ൟ ಐൿ ವಷბಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ ກಚ౞ ಳ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 14.. 10ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 10ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ 
(ಎ) ಘಡದย౵ ನ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ "ಒಂൿ ๬เರದ ಐൿඞฆ 
ยೕಟฆ" ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

15. 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 



3 

 
(i) (෈) ಘಡದย౵ ನ ``෩ವൡ౨  งඩ෵’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ ``ನಲವൡ౨  งඩ෵’’ 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ii) (ല) ಘಡದย౵ ನ ``ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ ``ಎರഴ 
๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗಳ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(iii) ෮ದಲඡ ಪฏൡಕದย౵  ``ಎರഴ ๬เರದ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ ``෩ฆ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ’’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 (iv) ෩ರඡ ಪฏൡಕದย౵  “ಐൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ ``ಏำ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



4 

 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 

 

 ಪ౳ ๯౨ ತ ೧ೕವನ ඛವბಹ൏ ๅಚ౞ ದย౵  ๬ಕ๠ౣ  ກಚ౞ ಳ฿ಜං. ෨ಖ౲ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ, ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ, 

ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ൽೕಘბ౽ಲൽಂದ 

ಪคಷౙ ค๭ฆโൽಲ౵ . ಆದ౪ คಂದ, ๸ಬಳ, ಮච෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ , ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ , ฿ಹನ ಭ൤౲ ಗำ ಇ൞౲ ൽಗಳ 

ಪคಷౙ ರൕಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ඝ౬   ൟൿ౪ ಪല 

෥ഴโൿ ಅವಶ౲ ๅಂൿ ಪคಗ൐ಸมಜං. 

 

 ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಈ เඒಯಕ. 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 



5 

 
ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ౳  

 

 ಪ౳ ๬౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ౱ ಕ ಕ౳ ಮൽಂದ ಪ౳ ൟ ವಷბಃౙ  ಅಂർ೩ 25.40 ಆೕഔ งඩ෵ಗಳ 

ಆವತბಕ ๅಚ౞  ಉಂഓಞโൿ.  

 

 

§¸ÀªÀgÁd ¨ÉÆªÀiÁä¬Ä 

ªÀÄÄRåªÀÄAwæ 

 

 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð(¥Àæ) 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À ¸À̈ sÉ 

 

 

 

 



6 

 
ಅඝීಧ 

ಕකბಟಕ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ರ 

(1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 5) ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗ 

xx   xx   xx 

3. ෨ಖ౲ ෱ൟ౳ ಯವರ ಮൡ౨  ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ.- ෨ಖ౲ ෱ൟ౳ ಯವคಡ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ 
ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ෱ൟ౳ ಗัಡ ෥ກ෴ನ ನಲವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳವඝ౬  ඩವൟ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  ಅಲ౵ ං, ಪ౳ ൟ ವಷბಃౙ  ෩ฆ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ 
ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ಸಹ ඩವൟ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

4. ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ඛ฿ಸಗำ.- (1) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ, ෍ಂಗิฆ ನಗರದย౵  ತಮ౱  
ಅඌ౽ฃವඌ ಇฆವ ತನಕ ಮൡ౨  ඛಕಟ ತฆ฿ಯದ  ಅರವൡ౨  ൽನಗಳ ಅವඌಯವฉಡ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ 
ඛ฿ಸವඝ౬  ಬಳಸฤ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸದ ಬದยಡ ಎಂಭൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ 
ದರದย౵  ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಈ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 
ಒದಜಸมದ ඛ฿ಸโ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ ಅಂಥ ෦ൟಯඝ౬  ෦ೕರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ . 

(2) ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸಃౙ  ಬದมಜ ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ ಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ ಬಳ๯ವ ඛ฿ಸದย౵ , 
ಅඌಂತ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳ ಬಳಃಛಜ, ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ಅಂಥ ಅಳ൤ಯย౵  ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ෩ฆ 
ಆೕൕಗಳඝ౬  ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತತัಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  ಅವฆ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ, ඛ฿ಸದ ඛವბಹൕ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౷ ಚ౟ ൤ಛಜ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ඛ฿ಸದย౵  ಇฆವ ൧ೕಟಗಳ เක౲ ಸ ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಛಜ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ಭ൤౲ ಡ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

5. ෱ൟ౳ ಗัಡ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲ ಗำ.-  xx   xx   xx 

(2) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ෱ൟ౳ ಟ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಡ ಸಮකದ 
฿ಹನ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ඩವൟ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

6. ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗำ.- (1) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  
෱ൟ౳ ಗำ, 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಮൡ౨  5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ, ಅವರ ಬಳಃಛಜ 
ງ೉ಃ෴ದ ඛ฿ಸ ಮൡ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽คನ ๸ීಧದย౵ , ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ๅಚ౞ ಗಳඝ౬  ๸ർಯ 
෥ಡฤ ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 (ಎ) ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ഴವ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಜಂತ ກ೉౞ ಡ෴ಜ 
ತಮ౱  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ಬั๭ದ දജ౳ ೕยನ ෍ว; 

xx   xx   xx 

  6ಎ. ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ.- ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಡ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗัಡ ෩ವ൤౨ öÊൿ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  ಪ౳ ൟ ವಷბಃౙ  ಎರഴ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗಳ ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ ವඝ౬  
๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

6෈. ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ඛ฿ಸಗำ.- (1) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ, ෍ಂಗิฆ ನಗರದย౵  ತಮ౱  
ಅඌ౽ฃವඌ ಇฆವ ತನಕ ಮൡ౨  ඛಕಟ ತฆ฿ಯದ ಅರವൡ౨  ൽನಗಳ ಅವඌಯವฉಡ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ 
ඛ฿ಸವඝ౬  ಬಳಸฤ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸದ ಬದยಡ ಎಂಭൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ 
ದರದย౵  ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಈ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 
ಒದಜಸมದ ඛ฿ಸโ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ ಅಂಥ ಅಳ൤ಯർ౪ ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅದರ 
෬ฤඩಯದ เ๭౨ ೕಣბโ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ ෦ൟಜಂತ ກ೉౞ ಡ ಇರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ .  



7 

 
(2) ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸಃౙ  ಬದมಜ ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ ಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶  ಸ೉ವฆ ಬಳ๯ವ ඛ฿ಸದย౵ , 

ಅඌಂತ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳ ಬಳಃಛಜ, ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ಅಂಥ ಅಳ൤ಯย౵  ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ෩ฆ 
ಆೕൕಗಳඝ౬  ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತತัಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಅವฆ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ, ඛ฿ಸದ ඛವბಹൕ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౷ ಚ౟ ൤ಛಜ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ඛ฿ಸದย౵  ಇฆವ ൧ೕಟಗಳ เක౲ ಸ ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಛಜ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ಭ൤౲ ಡ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

6๭. ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗัಡ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲ ಗำ.- (1) ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ, ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ฃಜ౲  
෱ൟ౳ ಟ ಬಳಃಛಜ ๰ಕ౨ ฿ದ ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ರඝ౬  ಒದಜಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಟ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍วಡ 
ಸಮකದ ฿ಹನ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

xx   xx   xx 

6ല. ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౽ბರ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗำ.- (1) 
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ, 6෈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಮൡ౨  6๭ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅವರ 
ಬಳಃಛಜ ງ೉ಃ෴ದ ඛ฿ಸ ಮൡ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽คನ ๸ීಧದย౵  ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ๅಚ౞ ಗಳඝ౬  
ඩವൟ ෥ಡฤ ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ,- 

(ಎ) ಅವರ ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ಅಗತ౲ ಪല๭ದ දജ౳ ೕฯ ෍ว෷ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ 
ยೕಟฆಗัಜಂತ ກೈ౞ ದย౵ , ಅದඝ౬  ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

xx   xx   xx 

7. ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ๸ಬಳಗำ.-  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಟ ෥๭ಕ ෩ವൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ๸ಬಳ ಮൡ౨  ฿๞ბಕ ಒಂൿ ಲౘದ ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ಆൟಥ౲  ಭ൤౲ ಗಳඝ౬  
๸ർಯ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

8. ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಗಳ ඛ฿ಸಗำ.- (1) ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ෷, ತಮ౱  ಅඌ౽ฃವඌ 
ಇฆವ ತನಕ ಮൡ౨  ඛಕಟ ತฆ฿ಯದ ಅರವൡ౨  ൽನಗಳ ಅವඌಯವฉಡ ෍ಂಗิฆ ನಗರದย౵  
๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸವඝ౬  ಬಳಸฤ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸದ ಬದยಡ ಎಂಭൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ದರದย౵  ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  ಈ ಉಪ 
ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಒದಜಸมದ ඛ฿ಸโ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ಅಳ൤ಯർ౪ ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  
ಅದರ ෬ฤඩಯದ เ๭౨ ೕಣბโ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ ෦ൟಜಂತ ກ೉౞ ಡ ಇರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ . 

(2)  ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತ ඛ฿ಸಃౙ  ಬದมಜ ಮච ෇ലಡ ಭ൤౲ ಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶  ฃಜ౲  ಸ೉ವฆ ಬಳ๯ವ 
ඛ฿ಸದย౵ , ಅඌಂತ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗಳ ಬಳಃಛಜ, ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ಅಂಥ ಅಳ൤ಯย౵  ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ 
෩ฆ ಆೕൕಗಳඝ౬  ๯ಸ೧ౠ ತತัಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  ಅವฆ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ, ඛ฿ಸದ ඛವბಹൕ ಮൡ౨  
ಸ౷ ಚ౟ ൤ಛಜ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ඛ฿ಸದย౵  ಇฆವ ൧ೕಟಗಳ เක౲ ಸ ಮൡ౨  ඛವბಹൕಛಜ ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳ ಭ൤౲ ಡ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

9.  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಡ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲ ಗำ.-  (1)  ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಟ 
ಬಳಃಛಜ ๰ಕ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ರඝ౬  ಒದಜಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2)  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಟ ಪ౳ ൟ ൟಂಗำ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฑ ಸಮකದ දജ౳ ೕฯ 
෍วಡ ಸಮකದ ฿ಹನ ๷ಲಭ౲  ಭ൤౲ ಯඝ౬  ඩವൟ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

10.  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ಡ෎౽ದ ๅಚ౞ ಗำ.-  (1)  
ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ, 8ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಮൡ౨  9ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅವರ 



8 

 
ಬಳಃಛಜ ງ೉ಃ෴ದ ඛ฿ಸ ಮൡ౨  ෮ೕഓฆ ౽คನ ๸ීಧದย౵ , ಈ ෨ಂൽನ ๅಚ౞ ಗಳඝ౬  
๸ർಯ ෥ಡฤ ಬದ౫ ฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

(ಎ)  ಅವರವರ ෮ೕഓฆ ౽ฆಗัಡ ಸ౽ბರโ ๸ർಯ ෥ലದ ಒಂൿ ๬เರ ยೕಟฆ 
දജ౳ ೕฯಜಂತ ກ೉౞  ಬಳ๭ದ දജ౳ ೕยನ ෍ว 

xx   xx   xx 

12. ಪ౳ ฿ಸದย౵ ฆ฿ಗ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಇತฉ ಭ൤౲ ಗำ.- xx  xx  xx 

(2) ಅඌಂತ ವ౲ ವ๻ರದ ෬ว ಪ౳ ฿ಸ ෥ഴ฿ಗ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಬ౯  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ, ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ 
ಅಥ฿ ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಗำ. 

 (ಎ) ซยನ ෩ಲಕ ෥ಡมದ ಪ౳ ෴ಣಗัಛಜ ಆ ซยನย౵  ಲಭ౲ เฆವ ಉತ౨ ಮ ದ೬ბಯ 
ಒಂൿ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ದರದ ಎರಡರಷౣ ಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 (෈) ರ๲౨ ಯ ෩ಲಕ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ ෥ലർಗ ಪ౳ ൟ ౾สೕ෦ೕಟคಡ ෩ವൡ౨  งඩ෵ ರ๲౨  
෭ฤ ದರಃౙ  ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (๭) เ෥ನದ ෩ಲಕ ෥ഴವ ಪ౳ ෴ಣ౽ౙ ಜ, ಅಂಥ ಪ౳ ෴ಣಃౙ  ๸ർಯ ෥ലದ ಒಂൿ 
ದರದ ಮൡ౨  ಒಂൿ ಐದඡ ಒಂൿ ූಗದ๠ౣ  ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ಪ౳ ෴ಣಗಳ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಅಪಪತಗำ 
ಉಂഓದย౵  เ෫ಛಜ ඛಗൽಪല๭ದ เ෥ಉൡ ಪഷಯฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (ല) ಪ౳ ෴ಣದ ൽನಗัಛಜ ಮൡ౨  ෴โඃ ಸ౩ ಳದย౵  ಉัൿಆำ౶ ವ ಪ౳ ൟൽನಃౙ  ಎರഴ 
๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳ ൽನಭ൤౲ ಗัಡ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಪฏൡ, ฃಜ౲ ದ ຄರಡ ෥ഴವ ಪ౳ ฿ಸಗಳ ๸ದಭბಗಳย౵  ಪ౳ ෴ಣದ ൽನಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  
෴โඃ ಸ౩ ಳದย౵  ಉัൿಆำ౶ ವ ಪ౳ ൟ ൽನಃౙ  ಎರഴ ๬เರದ ಐൿඞฆ งඩ෵ಗำ 
ൽನಭ൤౲ ෴ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಮ ౨ൢ  ಪฏൡ, ෱ൟ౳ , ฃಜ౲  ෱ൟ౳  ಅಥ฿ ಉಪ ෱ൟ౳ ಯವರඝ౬  ฃಜ౲ ದ ಅൟ൮ಗึಂൿ 
ಪคಗ൐๭ದ ๸ದಭბಗಳย౵ , ಅವರඝ౬  ฃಜ౲ ದ ಅൟ൮ ಎಂൿ ಪคಗ൐๭ඈಥ ಅವඌಛಜ ൽನಭತ౲ ದ 
౽ฤූಗದ๠ౣ  ಹಣವඝ౬  ෥ತ౳  ಪഷಯฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ౶ ವฃಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

xx   xx   xx 

 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

¸ÀPÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, «PÁ À̧¸ËzsÀ WÀlPÀ, ¨ÉAUÀ¼ÀÆgÀÄ, ¦7, PÁ¸ÀÆ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 500, 21£ÉÃ ¥sÉ§æªÀj 2021 



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY  
TWELFTH SESSION 

THE KARNATAKA MINISTERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES 
(AMENDMENT) Bill, 2022 

(LA Bill No. 05 of 2022) 
 

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances  
Act, 1956.  

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries 
and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957) for the purposes hereinafter 
appearing;  

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy-third year of 
the Republic of India as follows:-  

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2022.  

(2) It shall come into force with effect from 1st day of April ,2022.  

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and 
Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957), (hereinafter referred to as the 
Principal Act), in section 3,- 

 (i) for the words "fifty thousand rupees" the words, "seventy five thousand  
rupees" shall be substituted;  

(ii) for the words "forty thousand rupees " the words, "sixty thousand rupees"; 
and  

(iii) for the words "three lakhs  rupees" the words, "four  lakhs fifty thousand 
rupees" shall be substituted.  

3. Amendment of section 4.- In section 4 of the Principal Act,-  

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “eighty thousand rupees”, the words “one 
lakh twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;  

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words, “twenty thousand rupees”, the words 
“thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the Principal Act, in sub-section 
(2), for the words " one thousand litres " the words, "two thousand litres" shall be 
substituted.  



2 
 

 

5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the Principal Act, in sub-section 
(1), in clause (a), for the words " one thousand litres ", the words "two thousand 
litres" shall be substituted.  

6. Amendment of section 6A.- In section 6A of the Principal Act,-  

(i) for the words "thirty five thousand rupees", the words "fifty  thousand 
rupees" shall be substituted; and  

(ii) for the words "two lakhs rupees", the words "three lakhs rupees" shall be 
substituted. 

 7. Amendment of section 6B.- In section 6B of the Principal Act,-  

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “eighty thousand rupees”, the words “one 
lakh twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;  

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words, “twenty thousand rupees”, the words 
“thirty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  

8. Amendment of section 6C.- In section 6C of the Principal Act, in sub 
section (2), for the words "one thousand litres", the words "one thousand five 
hundred litres " shall be substituted.  

9. Amendment of section 6D.- In section 6D of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), in clause (a), for the words "one thousand litres", the words "one 
thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted.  

 10. Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the Principal Act,-  

(i) for the words "thirty thousand rupees", the words "fifty thousand rupees" 
shall be substituted; and 

  (ii) for the words "one lakhs fifty thousand rupees", the words "two lakhs  
rupees" shall be substituted.  

11. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the Principal Act,-  

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "eighty thousand rupees", the words "one 
lakh twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and 

 (ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "twenty thousand rupees" the words, 
"thirty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.  

12. Amendment of section 9.- In section 9 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words "one thousand litres", the words "one thousand five 
hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

13. Insertion of new section 9B.- After section 9A of the Principal Act, the 
following shall be inserted, namely:- 



3 
 

 

“9B. Increase in Salary and Allowances of the Chief Minister, the 
Minister, the Minister of State and the Deputy Minister.-  The salary and 
allowances of the Chief Minister, the Minister, the Minister of State and the Deputy 
Minister shall be increased after every five years commencing from 1st April, 2023 
on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of Explanation to 
section 48 of the Income-tax Act, 1961.” 

 14. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), in clause (a), for the words ""one thousand litres", the words "one 
thousand five hundred litres" shall be substituted. 

 15. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2),-  

(i) in clause (b), for the words "thirty  rupees", the words "forty rupees" shall 
be substituted;  

(ii) in clause (d), for the words "two thousand rupees", the words "two 
thousand five hundred rupees" shall be substituted;  

(iii) in first proviso, for the words "two thousand five hundred rupees", the 
words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted;  

(iv) in the third proviso for the words  “rupees  five thousand ” the words 
“rupees seven thousand ” shall be substituted.  

 

 

 



4 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. The salary and 

allowances to the Chief Minister, Ministers, Ministers of State and Deputy Ministers 

have not been revised since a long time. Therefore, it is considered necessary to 

amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances Act, 1956 for revision of 

salary, house rent allowance, sumptuary allowance, conveyance allowances etc., 

 

Hence, the Bill. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



5 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 

 

 
 
 

 

 There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rs. 25.40 

crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure. 

 

                              
BASAVARAJ BOMMAI 

Chief Minister 
 
 

 
 

M.K. VISHALAKSHI 
Secretary (I/c) 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



6 
 

 

ANNEXURE 

Extract from the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances 
Act, 1956.  (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957) 

xx   xx   xx 

3. Salaries of Chief Minister and Ministers.- There shall be paid to the Chief 
Minister a salary of  fifty thousand rupees per mensem and to each Minister a 
salary of forty thousand rupees per mensem. They shall also be paid a sumptuary 
allowance of three lakhs rupees per annum. 

 xx   xx   xx 

4. Residences of Ministers.- (1) Each Minister shall be entitled, , to the use of a 
furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his term of office and for a 
period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or in lieu of such furnished residence to 
a house rent allowance at the rate of eighty thousand rupees per mensem. The 
residence provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales, and 
the plinth area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed. 

 (2) In a residence used by a Minister who is entitled to a house rent allowance in 
lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the State 
Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official purposes. 
He shall be entitled for an allowance of  twenty thousand rupees per month for 
maintenance and upkeep of residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens 
included in such residence 

 xx   xx   xx 

6. Charges payable by the Minister and the Government.- (1) Each Minister 
shall in respect of the residence and motor car allotted for his use under sub-
section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable to pay the following charges, 
namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of One 
thousand litres of petrol paid by the Government. 

 xx   xx   xx  

6A. Salaries of Ministers of State.- There shall be paid to each Minister of State a 
salary of thirty five thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of two 
lakhs rupees per annum . 

xx   xx   xx 

6B. Residences of Ministers of State.- (1) Each Minister of State shall be entitled, 
x x x , to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his 
term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or in lieu of such 
furnished residence to a house rent allowance at the rate of eighty thousand rupees 
per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on 
such scales, and the plinth area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be 
prescribed.  

(2) In a residence used by a Minister of State who is entitled to a house rent 
allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the 
State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official 
purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of twenty thousand rupees per 



7 
 

 

month for maintenance and up keep of residence and for layout and maintenance of 
gardens included in such residence 

xx   xx   xx 

6C. Conveyance for Ministers of State.- (1) 

xx  xx   xx 

(2) There shall be paid to each Minister of State a conveyance allowance  equal to 
the cost of One thousand litres of petrol per mensem. 

xx   xx   xx 

6D. Charges payable by the Minister of State and the Government.- (1) Each 
Minister of State shall in respect of the residence and motor car allotted for his use 
under sub-section (1) of section 6B and section 6C, be liable to pay the following 
charges, namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of One 
thousand litres of petrol paid by the Government. 

 xx   xx   xx 

7. Salaries of Deputy Ministers.- There shall be paid to each Deputy Minister a 
salary of thirty thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of One 
lakh fifty thousand rupees per annum. 

xx   xx   xx 

8. Residences of Deputy Ministers.- (1) Each Deputy Minister shall be entitled x x 
x to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his term of 
office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter or in lieu of such 
furnished residence to a house rent allowance at the rate of eighty thousand rupees 
per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on 
such scales and the plinth area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be 
prescribed. 

 (2) In a residence used by a Deputy Minister who is entitled to a house rent 
allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the 
State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official 
purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of twenty thousand rupees per 
month for maintenance and up keep of residence and for layout and maintenance of 
gardens included in such residence. 

xx   xx   xx 

 

9. Conveyance for Deputy Ministers.- (1)  

xx   xx   xx 

(2) There shall be paid to each Deputy Minister a conveyance allowance equal to the 
cost of One thousand litres of petrol per mensem. 

xx   xx   xx 

10. Charges payable by the Deputy Minister and the Government.- (1) Each 
Deputy Minister shall in respect of the residence and motor car allotted for his use 
under sub-section (1) of section 8 and section 9, be liable to pay the following 
charges, namely:—  



8 
 

 

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the cost of One 
thousand litres of petrol paid by the Government. 

12. Travelling and other allowances on tours.-(1)   

                             xx                       xx                      xx                                                          

(b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at thirty rupees per kilometre; 

xx   xx   xx 

(d) to daily allowance at two thousand rupees per day for the days of journey and 
for the days of halt at any place:  

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily allowance shall 
be at two thousand five hundred rupees per day for the days of journey and for the 
days of halt at any place:  

Provided further that if a Minister, a Minister of State or a Deputy Minister is 
treated as a State Guest, he shall be entitled only to one-fourth of the daily 
allowance for the period for which he is treated as a State Guest. Provided also that 
in case of tour outside the state where he has stayed in a hotel or registered 
establishment providing boarding and loadging at scheduled rates, he shall be 
entitled for daily allowance of rupees five thousand per day subject to production of 
bills. 

xx   xx   xx 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  

 
 

 

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 21at February, 2022, P7, W.D. , Copies 500 


