
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÉÊzÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£Á®Ì£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ (ಎರಡ  ಪ ) ಯಕ, 2022 

(2022gÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-30) 
 

 ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ ಅ ಯಮ, 1964  ಮತ  ಪ  ಡ  ಒಂ  

ಯಕ. 

 ಇ  ಇ ಂ  ಬ ವ ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ ಅ ಯಮ, 
1964  (1964ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 12) ಮತ  ಪ   ಕ ದ ಂದ; 

 ಇ  ರತ ಗಣ ಜ ದ ಎಪ ರ  ವಷ ದ  ಕ ಟಕ ಜ  ನ ಡಲ ಂದ ಈ 
ಂ  ಅ ಯ ತ ಗ :- 

 1. ಪ  ಸ  ಮ  ಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅ ಯಮವ  ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ 
(ಎರಡ  ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 2022 ಎಂ  ಕ ಯತಕ . 

 (2) ಇ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ಚ ಯ ಲಕ ಪ ಸಬ ಥ ಂಕ   

 ಬರತಕ . 

 2. ಪ ಕರಣ 95ರ ಪ .- ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ ಅ ಯಮ, 1964ರ (1964ರ ಕ ಟಕ 

ಅ ಯಮ 12) (ಇ  ಇ ಂ  ಲ ಅ ಯಮ ಂ  ಉ ೕ ಸ ) 95  
ಪ ಕರಣದ ,-  

 (1) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ಬದ  ಈ ಂ ನದ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ :- 

 “ (2)  ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ ಯ  

ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಅದರ  ಗವ   ಇತರ 

ಉ ೕಶ  ಬದ ಸ  ಇ ದ , ಆತ  ಸಬ ಥ ೕ ಯ  ಒಂ  ಅ  
  ಅ ಯ  ಸ ಸತಕ  ಮ ,- 

 (i) ಕ ಟಕ ಪಟ ಣ ಮ  ಂತರ ೕಜ  ಅ ಯಮ, 1961 (1963ರ ಕ ಟಕ 

ಅ ಯಮ 11)ರ ಉಪ ಧಗಳ  ಧಪಟ  ಯ ಧದ  ಕ  
ಪ ಕ ಸ ದ ಸ  ನ  ಷ ಪ ದ ಬಳ  ಅ ರ  ಬದ ವ ಯ  

ೕ ದ  ಆಗ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅ ಯ  ಯ ಸ ದ ಲ ದ ವ  ಒಳಪ  ಅದ  
ಬದ ಸ  ಎಂ  ಸತಕ  ಮ  ಅ ಯ ೕ ಯ ಂಕ ಂದ ಏ  

ನಗ ಳ  ಅದಕ ರ  ಅ ೕದ  ಆ ಶವ  ರ ಸತಕ : 

 ಪ ,  ಅ ಯ ೕ ಯ ಂಕ ಂದ ಏ  ನಗ ಳ  ತನ  
ಣ ಯವ  ೕಡ  ಮ  ಈ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ  ಆ ಶವ  ಡ  ಫಲ ದ 

ದಭ ದ    ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ  ಅ ೕದ ಯ  ೕ ಂ  
ಸತಕ  ಮ  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅ ಯ  ಯ ಸ ದ ಲ ದ ಯದ ತ ಯ 

ಯ ಸಬ ಥ ೕ ಯ  ಅದ  ಪ ೕಕ ಸತಕ  ಮ  ರ ಸತಕ . 



2 

 
 (ii) ಸ  ನ  ಪ ಕ ಸ ವ ದಭ ದ  ಅಥ   ಸ ೕಯ ೕಜ  
ಪ ಶದ ರ  ಬ ವ  ಧಪಟ  ರಗ  ಅ ಯ  ೕಕ ದ ಂಕ ಂದ 

ಹ  ನಗ ಳ  ತಮ  ಅ ಯವ  ಸ ಸತಕ .  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7) ರ 
ಅ ಯ  ಯ ಸ ದ ಲ ದ ಯ  ಒಳಪ , ಧಪಟ  ರಗ  ಸ ದ 
ಅ ಯ  ಒಳಪ  ಅ ಯ ಅ ರ  ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ  ಅ ೕದ ಯ  

ೕಡತಕ : 

 ಪ , ರಗ  ಸದ  ಹ  ನಗ ಳ   ಅ ಯ ಸ ಸ ವ 

ದಭ ದ , ಅ ಗ ರ ಸದ   ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ  ಧಪಟ  ರಗ ಂದ 
 ಆ ೕಪ  ಇ ಲ ಂ  ಸತಕ : 

 ಮ  ಪ , , ಅ ಯ ೕ ಯ ಂಕ ಂದ ವ  ನಗ ಳ  

ಈ ಬ  ತನ  ೕ ನವ  ೕಡ  ಮ  ಆ ಶವ  ರ ಸ  ಫಲ ದ ದಭ ದ  
  ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ  ಅ ೕದ ಯ  ೕ ಂ  ಸತಕ  

ಮ  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅ ಯ  ಯ ಸ ದ ಲ ದ ಯ  ಒಳಪ  
ಯ ಸಬ ಥ ೕ ಯ  ಅದ  ಪ ೕಕ ಸತಕ  ಮ  ರ ಸತಕ . 

  (iii) ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ   ಅಥ  ತ  ೕಷ  ವ ಲಕ ಅಥ  

ಅ  ಸ ವ ಲಕ   ಬದ ವ  ಂ ದ   
ನ  ಯ  ಈ ಬ ನ ಸದ  ಆ ಶವ  ರ ಪ  ಆ ಸತಕ .  

ಪ ವತ  ಲ  ಏ ದ  ಯ ದ  ಅದ  ಸ ರ ಡ  ೕ  
ಳತಕ .  ಅ  ಸ ವ ಲಕ ವ ಯ ಧದ  

ತರ ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ  ಪ ಯ ೕ ಯವ  ಆ ಯ  

ಸ ರ  ೕ  ದ  ಆ ಶ ಡಬ . 

 (iv) ಸ  ಬ ನ ಒಂ  ಗವ  ತರ ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ   

ೕ ದ ದಭ ದ  ಬದ ವ  ೕ ದ ಗದ ಗ  ಗಳ    ಪನ, 

ಯ ವ ವ  ಮ   ಖ ಗಳ ಇ  ಅ ೕ ದ  ಪ ವತ  ವ  ನ  (Pre 

Conversion Sketch) ಅ  ಬದ ವ  ಅ ಂ  ಸ  ಕ ಯ ರತಕ :  

 ಪ ,  ಪನ, ಯ ವ ವ  ಮ   ಖ ಗಳ ಇ  ಅ ರ  
ನ  ಅ  ಸ ದ ಂಕ ಂದ ಹ  ನಗ ಳ  ಪ ವತ  ವ  ನ ಯ  

ಅ ೕ ಸ  ಫಲ ದ ಅಥ  ರಸ ದ ದಭ ದ  ಅ ರ  ದ ಪ  
ಅದ  ಅ ೕ ಸ ಂ  ಸತಕ  ಮ  ಯ ಸಬ ಥ ೕ ಯ  

ಅ ೕದ ಯ  ೕಡತಕ . 

 (v) ಅ ರ  ತನ  ೕಷ  ಅಥ  ಅ ನ  ಯ  ತರ 

ಬಳ  ಬದ ಸ  ೕ ವ   ವ  (Granted Land) 

ಆ ಂ  ವ , ಬದ ವ  ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ತ ಗಳ ಮ  ಅ ತ 
ಡಕ ಗಳ ( ಲ  ಗಳ ವ ವ ಯ ಧ) ಅ ಯಮ, 1978 ಅಥ  ಕ ಟಕ  

ಯ ಯಮಗ , 1969 ಅಥ  ಸ ರ  ಲ ಲ  ರ ವ  
ಗಳ  ಧ ಗ  ಮ  ಷರ ಗಳ  ಉಲಂ ದ   

ಅಂಥ ಅ ಯ  ರಸ ಸತಕ . 



3 

 
 (vi) ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ ನ ಬದ ವ ಯ ಆ ಶ , ಕ ಟಕ ಪಟ ಣ ಮ  ಂತರ 

ೕಜ  ಅ ಯಮ, 1961 (1963ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 11)ರ ಉಪ ಧಗಳ  
ಯ  ಸ ಕ ತರ ಬಳ ದ  ರ , ಂಕ ಮ  ೕಂದ  ಇ  

ಅ  ಬದ ವ ದ ಯ ಗ  ಯ  ಸ  ಚ ಳ  
ರಣ ಗತಕ ದ ಲ . 

 ಪ , ದ ಣ ಕನ ಡ ಯ , ಕಟ ಡಗಳ ಣ ಅಥ   ಅಥ  ಗಳ 
ಣ   ತ ಲದ  ಯ ವ   ಒಳಪ ,- 

 (ಎ) ಕ ಟಕ  ರ ಗಳ ಅ ಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 10) ರ 
48ಎ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ  ,  ಅಥ   ಯ ಅ ೕಗ ರ  

ಂ ತ ದ ಅಥ  ಂ ದ  ರ ದ ವ ; ಅಥ  

 ( ) ಕ ಟಕ  ರ ಗಳ ಅ ಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 10)ರ 
77  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ   ಪ ದ ವ , 

 - ಈ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ  ಅಗತ ದ ಅ ಮ ಯ  ಪ ಯ  ಮ  ಅದರ  
ಅಡಕ ದ  ಏ  ಇ , ತಹ ೕ ರ  ಸಬ ಥ ನ ಯ  ವ  

ೕ ೕ  ಕ ದ ತ ಯ ಮ  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅ ಯ  ಯ ಸ ದ ಲ ದ 
ಯ  ಒಳಪ  ಅಂಥ  ಅಥ  ಅದರ ಗವ   ಇತ  ಉ ೕಶ  

ಬದ ಸಬ .” 

 (2) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (3), (4), (5) ಮ  (6)  ಡತಕ . 

 (3) ಉಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಬದ  ಈ ಂ ನದ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ , ಎಂದ :- 

 “(7) ಯ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ  

ಯ  ತರ  ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳಸ  ಅ ಮ  ಗ ಅಥ  ಈ 
ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಅ ಮ  ೕಡ ಂ  ಗ  ಈ ಬ  ಜ  
ಸ ರ  ರ ಸಬ ಥ ಯಮಗ  ಒಳಪ , ಲ ಲ  ಅ ಥ ಲ ವ  

ಯ ಡ  ಅಗತ ಪ ಸಬ . ಆ ತ ಯ 83  ಪ ಕರಣದ (2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ  
ರ  ಅಂಥ ಯ   ಯವ  ಸತಕ ದ ಲ .” 

 3. ಪ ಕರಣ 96ರ ಪ .- ಲ ಅ ಯಮದ ನ 96  ಪ ಕರಣದ ,- 

 (i) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (1)ರ ,- 

 (ಎ) “  ಕ ಷನರ ಅ ಮ  ಇಲ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತ ಯ “ಅಥ  95  ಪ ಕರಣದ 
(2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ  ಉಪ ಧಗಳ  ಉಲಂ  ಅಥ   ಅಥ  ತ  ಅ ಡ  

ೕಷ ಯ ಧ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗ , ಅಂ ಗ  ಮ  ಆವರಣಗಳ  ಸತಕ ; ಮ  

 ( ) “ಒಂ  ರ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದ  “ಒಂ  ಲ  ಗ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ . 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ,- 

 (ಎ) “ಒಂ  ರ ಗ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದ  “ಒಂ  ಲ  ಗ ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ ; ಮ  

 ( ) “ಇಪ ೖ  ಗ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದ  “ಎರ  ರದ ಐ  
ಗ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ  ಪ ೕ ಸತಕ . 

 

  



4 

 
ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಮ  ರಣಗಳ  

 

 2021-2022ರ ವಷ ದ ಆಯವ ಯ ಷಣದ  ದ ಪ ವ ಗಳ   ತರ  ಮ  

ತರ ಉ ೕಶ   ಪ ವತ ಯ  ಸರಳ ದ  ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ 

ಅ ಯಮ, 1964 (1964ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 12)ರ 95  ಮ  96  ಪ ಕರಣವ   ಮತ  

ಪ   ಅವಶ ಕ ಂ  ಪ ಗ ಸ . 

ಆದ ಂದ ಈ ಯಕ. 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 



5 

 
ಆ ಕ ಪನ ಪತ  

 

ಪ ತ ಸ ತ ಕ ಕ ಮ   ನ ಚ ವ  ಒಳ ಂ ಲ . 

 

 



6 

 
ಪ ೕ ತ ಸನ ರಚ ರದ  ಪನ ಪತ  

ಡ 2 ಪ ೕ ಸ  ಉ ೕ ವ 95  ಪ ಕರಣದ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ಈ 
ಡದ ಅ ಯ ,- 

(i)      2  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ ,-  

(ಎ) ತರ ಉ ೕಶ   ಕ ೕಷನ  ಅ ಯ  ಸ ವ 
ನದ  ಯ ಸ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ರವ  ೕ ತ .  

( )  (2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ (i)  ಡದ ಪ ಕ ಮ  (ii)  ಡದ 
ಎರಡ  ಪ ಕ   ಬಳ  ಬದ ವ  ಅ ನವ  

ೕ ಂ  ಸತಕ  ಮ  ಅದ   ಕ ೕಷನ  
ೕಕ ವ ಮ  ರ ವ ನದ  ಯ ಸ  ಜ  

ಸ ರ  ಅ ರವ  ೕ ತ .   

( ) (2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ (iv)  ಡದ ಪ ಕ  ಅ ರನ ನ ಯ  
ಅ ೕ   ಮ  ಅದ   ಪನ, 

ಯ ವ ವ  ಮ  ಖ ಗಳ ಇ  ರ ಸತಕ  
ನದ  ಯ ಸ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ರವ  ೕ ತ .   

( )  2  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ (iv)  ಡದ ಪ ಕದ ( )  ಅಂಥ 
ನ ಯ  ತಹ ೕ ರ  ವ  ೕ ೕಸ  ಕ ದ  

ಯಮಗಳ  ರ ಸ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ರವ  ೕ ತ .   

 (ii)  ಪ ೕ ಸ  ಉ ೕ ವ 95  ಪ ಕರಣದ (7)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ  
(2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ  ಯ  ತರ ಉ ೕಶ  
ಅ ಮ ದ  ಯಮಗಳ  ರ ಸ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ರವ  

ೕ ತ .    

 

ಪ ತ ಸನ ರಚ ರದ ಪ ೕಜ  ಯ ಸ ಪ .  

  

 

Dgï. C±ÉÆÃPÀ 

PÀAzÁAiÀÄ ªÀÄAwæ 

 
 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

 

 



7 

 
ಅ ಧ 

ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ ಅ ಯಮ, 1964ರ  
(1964ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ  12)ಉದ ೃತ ಗ 

X X           XX           XX 

83. ಯ ಣ ಯದ ೕ , ತರ ಯದ ಪ ವತ  ಮ  ಲ  
ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಯ ಬಳ ಯ  .- (1) ಈ ಅ ಯಮದ ಲಕ ಅಥ  
ಅದರ  ಅನ  ಉಪ ದ , ಈ ಅ ಯಮದ   ಯ 
ಬ  ಸ ವ ಯವ , ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಆ  ಬಳ ದ  
ಗಮ  ಧ ಸತಕ  ಅಥ  ಧ ಸ ಂ  ಸತಕ . 

(2) ಯವಲದ ಇತರ  ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ ಅಥ  ಬಳ ವ 
 ಯ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬದ ಂಡ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ದ , ಅದ  

ಯವ  ಮ  ದ  ಅಥ  ಯವಲದ ಇತರ  ಉ ೕಶ  
ಯವ  ಧ ದ , ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳ ಥ ಯ ಬ  

ಯ ಸಬ ಥ ದರಗಳ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ ಯಮಗ  ಒಳಪ , ಆ ಯ ಬ  
ಯವ  ಯ ಡತಕ .  

(3)  ಯ , - 

 (ಎ) ಸದ ಮ ಗಳ ಉ ೕಶ ; 

 ( )  ಅಥ  ಜ ದ ಉ ೕಶಗ ; ಅಥ  

 ( ) ಇತರ  ತರ ಉ ೕಶ  

- ಬಳ ದ  , ಈ ಅ ಯಮ  ಭ ದ  ದ  ಯ ದ  
 ಅ ಯಮದ ಅಥ  ನ  ಆ ಯ  ಸ ವ ಮ  

ಧ ದ ಅಥ  ಧ ಸ ಂ  ದ ಯವ , ಈ ಅ ಯಮದ  ಏ  
ಇದ , (4)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಉಪ ಧಗ ಗ ರ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಪ ವ ತ ದ  

ರ , ಈ ಅ ಯಮ  ಭ ವ ಲದ  ವ ದರದ ಪ ರ ಸ ೕ ಅಥ  
ಸಬ ೕ ಅದರ ಪ ರ  ಂ ವ ಯತಕ . 

(4) ಯವಲದ ಇತರ  ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳ ದ   , 
ಈ ಅ ಯಮ  ಭ ದ  ದ  ಯ ವ  ಅ ಯಮದ ಅಥ  

ನ ಲಕ ಅಥ  ಅ ಗಳ  ಕ  ಯ ಡ ವ 
ಯವ  ಸಬ ೕ ಅಥ  ಸ ೕ ಅಂಥ ಯವ , 

ಯ ಸಬ ಥ ಯಮಗ ಗ ರ  ಅಂಥ ಕ ಯದ ಬಲ ನ 
ಐದರಷ  ಸಮ ದ ಬಲಗ  ಜ  ಸರ ರ  ಯ ದರ ಲಕ 
ಪ ವ ಸಬ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ ಪ ವತ ದ  ಅಂಥ  ಅಂಥ ಕ 

ಯ ಂದ  ಇರತಕ . 

(5) ತಹ ೕ ರ  ಅಥ  ೕಜ  ಅ , ಈ ಬ  ಯ ಸಬ ಥ 
ಯಮಗ ಳಪ , ಯ  ವ  ಯ ಬಳ ಯ  ಲ  

ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಪ ಸಬ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ  ಪ ತ ಉ ೕಶ  ಅದ  
ಬಳ ವ ಅಥ  ಬಳಸ  ಯ ವ  ವ ರನ  ಅಥ  ಇತರ ವ ಯ  ಪ  
ಕ ಮದ ಲಕ ರ ಡಬ . 

X X           XX           XX 

95. ಯದ ಯ ಬಳ ಗ  ಮ  ಯದ ಯ  ಇತರ 
ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳ ವ ಬ ನ ನ.- (1) ಕಟ ಡಗಳ  ಕ ವ ಅಥ  ಗಳ  
ಅಥ  ಗಳ  ವ ಬ  ತ ಲದ  ಯ ವ   ಒಳಪ , 

ಯದ ಧ ರ ದ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ ಯ 
ಅ ೕಗ ರ , ಆ ಯ  ಉತಮ ವ  ಡ  ಅಥ   ದ 



8 

 
ಉ ೕಶ  ಆ ಯ   ಅ ಲಕರ  ಬಳ  ದ ,   

 ಕಟ ಡಗಳ  ಕಟ ,  ಅಥ  ಗಳ  ಸ ,   
ರ ಗಳ  ಡ  ಅಥ  ತನ  ಕರ ಂದ, ರ ಂದ, ಏ ಂಟ ಂದ ಅಥ  ಇತರ 

ಸಮ ತ ಪ ಗ ಂದ  ಕಟ ಡಗಳ  ಕ ಸ ,  ಅಥ  ಗಳ  
ಳ  ಅಥ    ರ ಗಳ  ಸ  ಹ ಳವ . 

ಪ ,  ಯ ಸಬ ಥ ಗ ಷ  ೕಣ  ಒಳಪ ,  ಕ ದ 
 ಕಟ ಡ  ಅಥ    ಆತನ ವ ಯ ಕಡ ಹತ ಂತ ರತಕ ದ ಲ . 

ವರ .- ಈ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಉ ೕಶ  "  ಕಟ ಡ" ಅಥ  "  " ಎಂದ , 
ತನ ವಸ  ಬಳ ದ ಅಥ   ಪ ಕರಗಳ  ಇ ವ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳ ದ ಮ  

ಗಳ  ಕ ಕ  ಬಳ ದ ಜ ೕ  ಂ ಂ ವ ಅಥ   ಯ 
ಒಂ  ಗದ  ದ ಮ  ಮ  ಈ ಮ ಯ  ತ  ತನ  ಸ ಂತ ಉಪ ೕಗ  
ಬಳಸತಕ   ಅದ   ವ ಯ ಅಥ  ಏ ಯ ಜ  ಚ ವ ಗ  

ೕಡತಕ ದ ಲ . 
(2) ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ 
ಯ  ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಅದರ  ಗವ  

 ಇತರ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬದ ಸ  ಇ ದ , ತ ಲದ  ಯ ವ  
ನ  ಏ  ಒಳ ಂ ದ  ಅವ  ಅ ಮ   ಕ ಷನ ಅ ಯ  

ಸ ಸತಕ .  ಕ ಷನ  ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಉಪ ಧಗ  ಮ  ಈ ಅ ಯಮದ  
ದ ಯಮಗ  ಒಳಪ  ಅ ಮ ಯ  ಕ ಸಬ  ಅಥ  ಕ ಂ   

ಆ ೕ ಥ ಷರ ಗ  ಒಳಪ  ಅದ  ಡಬ . 
ಪ ,  ಉ ೕಶ  ಲ ಪನ ದ ಅಥ  ಂ ದ   

 ಕ ಟಕ ಪಟ ಣ ಮ  ಂತರ ೕಜ  ಅ ಯಮ, 1961ರ (1963ರ 
ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 11) ಅ ಯ  ಸ   ಅ  ಕ  ಪ ಕ ಸ ವ 
ಸ ೕಯ ೕಜ  ಪ ಶ ಳ  ಇ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ ಪ ವತ  ಅಂಥ 

ಸ  ನ  ಷ ಪ ದ  ಬಳ ಯ ಉ ೕಶ  ಅ ರ ದ  ಪ ಕರಣದ , 
ಅದ  (7)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಅ ಯ  ಯ ಸ ದ ಯ  ವ ದ  
ಒಳಪ  ಅ ಮ ಯ  ೕಡ ಂ  ಸತಕ . 

ಮ  ಪ , ದ ಣ ಕನ ಡ ಯ  ಕಟ ಡಗಳ ಣ  ಅಥ  ಗಳ  
ಅಥ  ಗಳ  ದ   ತ ಲದ  ಯ ವ  

 ಒಳಪ ,  ( ಂ ) , ತ  ಅಥ  ಯ   
ಅ ೕಗ ರ ,- 

 (ಎ)  ಕ ಟಕ  ರ  ಅ ಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 10) ರ 
48ಎ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಅಂಥ ಯ ಅ ೕಗ ರ ಂ  ೕಂದ ದ ಅಥ  

ೕಂದ ಗ ದ ವ  ಅಲ ದ ; ಅಥ  
 ( )  ಸದ  ಅ ಯಮದ 77  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಪ ದ ವ  

ಅಲ ದ , 
ಈ ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಅಗತ ಪ ದ ಅ ಮ ಯ  ಪ ಯ  ಮ  ಅದರ  ಏ  

ಒಳ ಂ ದ , ತಹ ೕ ರ  ಗ ತ ಅ  ನ ಯ  ಆ ಬ  ಂ ತ  
ೕ  ಕ ದ ತ ಯ ಮ  ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ  ಗ ಪ ದ ಡವ  

ಗ ತ ೕ ಯ  ಯ ದ   ಇತರ ಉ ೕಶ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  
ಅಥ  ಅದರ ಗವ  ಪ ವತ  ಡಬ . 

(2ಎ) ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ 
ಯ  ಅ ೕಗ ರ , 2008ರ ಂಬ , 31  ಂ , (2)  ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದ 
  ಕ ಷನ ನ ಅ ಮ  ಪ ಯ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಅದರ ಗವ  

ಸದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬದ ವ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ ಬದ ವ ಯ  ಸಕ ಮ ದ  
ಇ ದ , ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ ( ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 2011  ದ ಂಕ ಂದ 
ಒಂ  ವಷ ದ ಅವ ಳ  ಪ ಸಬ ಥ ಅ  ನ ಯ , ಲ   

ಡ ಂ   ಕ ಷನ  ಅ  ಸ ಸತಕ . ಅಂಥ ಅ ಯ  ೕಕ ದ 



9 

 
  ಕ ಷನ , ಈ ಅ ಯಮದ  ಏ  ಒಳ ಂ ದ , ಆದ  ತ ಲದ  

ಯ ವ  ಇತರ ನ ಉಪ ಧಗ  ಒಳಪ  ಮ  
ಪ ಸಬ ಥ ಷರ ಗ  ಒಳಪಟ   ಅಂಥ ೕ ಯ , ಅವಶ ಕ ಂ   

ಅಗತ ಪ ಸಬ ಥ ವ  ಜ ಪ ದ   ರ ಯ ತ ಯ 
ಅಂಥ ,- 

 (i)   ಸ ಕ ಒಳಚ  ಅಥ   ಹ ನ ಗ ದ  ಇದ ; 
 (ii) ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅಥ  ಅಥ  ಜ  ಸ ರದ ಅಥ   ಸ ೕಯ 

ರದ  ಒ ತನ ಅಥ  ತ ಣದ ವ ರ  ದ;  
(iii)ಪ ತ ಅಥ  ಪ ತ ರ ಗ , ಒಳ ನ ಅಥ  ರ ನ ವ ಲ ರ ಗ , 

ೕಯ ಗ , ಅಗ ೕಕರಣ  ಪ ದ ಗ   ಪ ತ ವ ಲ 
ರ ಗಳ ಗ  ಮ   ಗ , ಂ ಗ , ಸ ಹ  ಪ  ಪದ  

ೕಜ ಗ , ಪಕ ಗ  ಮ  ಇತರ ಗ ಕ ಲಭ ಗ  ಅಥ  ವ ಜ ಕ 
ಕಯ ಗ  ಅ  ಅಡಚ  ಉಂ  ದ ; 
 (iv)  ಅರಣ  ದ ; 
 (v)  ಬ  ವ   ಅ ರ  ಅದರ  ಹ  ಇರ ದ ; 

 (vi)  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಉ ನವನಗ , ಆಟದ ನಗ , ಕ  ಪ ಶಗ  
ಅಥ   ಕಯ ಗಳ  ಒದ ಸ  ೕಸ ದ ; 

(vii)  ಅಥ  ಕಟ ಡ  ಅಕ ಪಕ ದವರಸ  ಮ ಯ ೕ  ಹ ೕ ವ 
ಚ ಗ ,  ಏ  ಪ ಶಗ , ನ  ತ  ಅಥ  ನ   ಮ  ಗ  

ಂ ಂ ದ  ಅಥ  - ನ   ಗ ದ ಳ  ಇದ ; 
(viii) ಪ ಕ ರಕಗ , ನ ಣಗ    ಧ ಗ  

 ವಲಯ ಧ ಗಳ  ಷ ಪ ದ ಧ ಗಳ  ಎತರ ಇಂ ೕ  
ಇರ ಂ  ಷ ಪ ದ ಬ ಂಧಗ  ದ  ಬಳ  ದ ; 

(ix) - ನ   ಗ  ಅಥ  ಅ  ಮಕ ಕ ಮಗ ವ 
 ಅ ಮ  ಅ ಣ  ಇರ ದ ; 

(x) ರತ ಸ ರದ ಪ ಸರ ಮ  ಅರಣ  ಲಯದ ಕ ವ  ವಲಯ 
ಧ ಒಳಪ ವ ಪ ಶದ ದ ; - ರ  ದ ತ ಯ 

ಸಕ ಮ ಸಬ  ಅಥ  ಸಕ ಮ ಸ  ಕ ಸಬ ; 
(xi)  ಬಳ ಯ  ಬದ ವ   ಆ ವ ಉಲಂಘ ಯ  

ಧ ದ  ಮ  ಕ ಟಕ ಪಟ ಣ ಮ  ಂತರ ೕಜ  ಅ ಯಮ, 1961ರ 
14ಎ ಪ ಕರಣ  ಅ ರ ; ಅಥ  

(xii) ಎರ  ಮಹ ಗ ಂತ  ಮಹ ಗಳ  ಂ ವ  ಕಟ ಡ  
 ಅ  ಯ ವ  ಂ ದ ,- 

(ಎ) ಅಂಥ ಕಟ ಡದ ರಚ ಯ ರ  ಬ  ಕಟ ಡ ಇಂ ೕಯ ಂದ ಪ ಣ 
ಪತ ವ  ಪ ಗ;    

 
( ) ಅ ಮಕ ಇ ಂದ ಆ ೕಪ  ಇಲ  ಪ ಣಪತ  ಪ ಂ ದ        

- ಸಕ ಮ ಸತಕ . 
(xiii) ಅಥ  ಕ ಟಕ  ಯ ಅ ಯಮ, 1964ರ  ೕ ದ 

ಅ ೕ ತ ಸ  ö◌ಯ್ ನ ಅಥ  ಹ  ಪ  ವಲಯದ  ಅನ ತ 
ಅ ಅಥ  ಣ ದ ; ಮ  

(xiv) ಪ ಸಬ ಥ  ಇತರ ಧ  ಒಳಪ ದ ,                                  
- ರ  ದ ತ ಯ ಸಕ ಮ ಸಬ  ಅಥ  ಸಕ ಮ ಸ  

ಕ ಸಬ . 
(2ಎಎ) 2008ರ ಂಬ  31  ಂ  ಸದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಪ ವತ  ಅಥ  

ಬಳ ಯ  ಬದ ವ  ಡ ಂ  ಪ ವ , ಅಂಥ ಅನ ತ 
ಪ ವತ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ಯ  ದ ಬದ ವ ಯ  ಸಕ ಮ ದ  

ೕ ದ ಅ ರನ  ಇರತಕ . 



10 

 
(2ಎಎಎ) ಎ  ಅಂಥ ಪ ವತ ಗಳ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ಯ ಬದ ವ ಯ  

ಸಕ ಮ ಸ ಗ ಅಥ  ಅ ರ  (2ಎ) ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಷ ಪ ದ 
ಅವ ಳ  ಅ  ಸ ರ ದ , ಶಪ ದ  ಅಥ  ಅ  ಂ  ಬಳ ಯ ದ ಂಥ 

 ತ ದ  ಗತಕ  ಮ  ಅದ  ದ ಚ ಗಳ  ಯ 
ಗ ಂ  ಅಂಥ ವ ಂದ ಗ ಸತಕ : 

(3) ಪ ವತ  ತ ಲದ  ಯ ವ  ಉಪ ಧಗಳ  
ಫಲ ತ  ಅಥ  ಅ  ವ ಜ ಕ ಉಪದ ವವ ಂ  ಥ  ಅಥ  

ಅ  ವ ಜ ಕ  ತ ಲ  ಅಥ  (4)  ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಸಬ ಥ 
ಷರ ಗಳ  ಸ  ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಅಸಮಥ  ಅಥ  ಇಷ ಪ ಲ ಂಬ 

ರಣದ   ಕ ಷನರ  ಪ ವತ  ಅ ಮ ಯ  ಕ ಸಬ . 
(3ಎ) xxx  
(3 ) xxx  
(4) ಆ ೕಗ , ರ  ಮ  ಕಯ ಗಳ  ದ  ಮ  ಕಟ ಡದ 

ಶನಗ ಂ  ಬಳ ವ   ಅ ೕ ಅಲ , ಶನಗಳ ಅಳ , ವ ವ  
ಮ  ಶನಗ  ಪ ಶ ಇ  ಅ ೕಗ ರರ ಆ ೕಗ  ಮ  ಕಯ  
ಸ ಂ ತ / ಸ ಂ  ಅಥ  ಆ ಸ ಳ  ಕ  ಮ  ಪಟ ಣ ಮ  

ಂತರದ ೕಜ  ಅಥ  ಕಟ ಡಗಳ ಕ  ಧಪಟ   ನ 
ಉಪ ಧಗಳ  ಉಲಂ ಲ ಂ ದ  ಖ ತಪ ವ ಸ  ಪ ವತ  ಬ  
ಷರ ಗಳ  ಸಬ . 

(5) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ(2)ರ  ಅ ಯ  ಸ ಗ, ಅ  ತ ದ ಂಕ ಂದ 
 ಂಗಳ ಅವ ಳ   ಕ ಷನ  ತನ  ೕ ನವ  ಅ ರ  

ಸ  ತ ದ , ಂಡ ಅ ಮ ಯ   ಡ ಂ  
ಸತಕ . 

(6)  ಕ ಷನ   ಷ  ದಭ ದ  ಅನ  ದ ರ , 
(2)  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ   ಅ ಯ  ಅದ  ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಸ ದ ರ  

ನ  ಡತಕ ದ ಲ . 
(6ಎ) ದ ಣ ಕನ ಡ ಯ , ಡ  ಯ    ಯ ೕ ಲ 

ನ  ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ದ 
 ಯ  ಕ ಟಕ ಯ ( ಪ ) ಅ ಯಮ, 1981  ದ 

ಂಕ  ಂ  ಇತರ  ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಪ ವ ದ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ದ , ಅದರ ನ 
 ಕಟ ಡ  (   ಅಲದ) ಂ ಂ ವ ಯ  ಬಳ ದ ಆ 

ಯ  ಅಂಥ ಕಟ ಡದ ಣದ ಪ ಶ  ಪ  ೕರ ದ , ಅಂಥ 
ಂಕ ಂದ ಪ ಮ , ತರ ಉ ೕಶಗ  ಬಳ ದ  

ಅ ಮ ಸ ಂ  ಸತಕ . 
(7) ಯ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ವ  
ಯ  ಯ  ದ  ಉ ೕಶ  (2)  ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ  

ಅ ಮ  ಗ ಅಥ  ಸದ  ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪ ಕಗಳ  ಪ ವ ದ  
ಅಥ  (5)  ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅಥ  (6ಎ) ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಅ ಮ  ೕಡ ಂ  

ಗ,  ಕ ಷನ , ಈ ಬ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ರ ಸಬ ಥ 
ಯಮಗ  ಒಳಪ , ಯ  ಯ ಡ  ಅಗತ ಪ ಸಬ . ಆ ತ ಯ 

83  ಪ ಕರಣದ (2)  ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ರ  ಅಂಥ ಯ   
ಯವ  ಸತಕ ದ ಲ . 
(8)  ಅ , ಕ ಗ ,  ಸ ಳಗ , ಜ  ಸ ರ  

ಅ ೕ ದ ಹ ಣ ೕಜ  ಅಥ  ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ೕಟ ಯ 
ಉ ೕಶ   ಯ  ಪ ವ ದ  ಅ ಮ ಯ ,  ಅ , 

ಕ ಗ ,  ಸ ಳಗ , ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ೕ ದ ಹ ಣ 
ೕಜ ಗ  ಅಥ  ದ ರ ೕಟ ಯ ಉ ೕಶ  ಕ ಟಕ  

ರ ಗಳ ಅ ಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ 10) ರ 109  ಪ ಕರಣದ  



11 

 
 ಯ  ಖ ೕ ದ  ೕ ದ ಅ ಮ  ಪ ಸಬ ಥ 
ಡವ  ಯ ದ  ಒಳಪ   ಡ  ಎಂ  ಸತಕ . 

ವರ .- ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಉ ೕಶ , “ಅ ೕಗ ರ” ಎಂ  ಲ ರ 
ಅಥ   ರ ಎಂ ದ  ಒಳ ತ . 

(9)  ಯ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ   ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ದ ಯ  
ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಕ ಟಕ ಕ   ತ ಣ ಅ ಯಮ, 2011 (2012ರ 
ಕ ಟಕ ಅ ಯಮ, 8)ರ  ಉಪ ಖ ಜಗಳ ಗ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಕ  

 ಚ ವ ಗಳ  ವ ಯಮಗ  ಅ ರ  ಉಪಖ ಜಗಳ 
ಗ ಯ   ಷ ಪ ರ  ಅಥ  ಷ ಪ ಸ ರ , ಅಂಥ ಗ  ಉ ೕಶ  
ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಅದರ  ಗವ  ಪ ವ ಸ  ಇ ದ , ಅಂಥ 

ಯ ಪ ವತ  ಅನ ಯ ವ ಡ ಂ   ಕ ೕಷನರ  ಅ  
ಸ ಸತಕ , ಅಂಥ ಅ ಯ  ಸ ದ  ಸದ  ಅ ಯಮಗಳ  , ಸ  

ಲಸಗ  ಅ ಮ ಯ  ಪ ದ  ಒಳಪ  ಅಂಥ ಯ ಪ ವತ  
ಅ ಮ ಯ  ೕಡ ಂ  ಸತಕ . 

(10) ಯ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ   ಯ ಅಥ   ಉ ೕಶ  
ಂ ದ  ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಅಂಥ ಯ  ಅಥ  ಅದರ ಗವ , 

ಸ ರದ ಆ ಶ : ಇಎ  21 ಎ  2014 ಂಕ:22.05.2014ರ  2014-21ರ ಕ ಟಕ 
ರಶ  ೕ  ಅ ರ  ಜ  ಮ  ಂದ  ಸ ರ  ಅ ೕ ವ ಮ  ಸ ಮ 

ರ  ಅ ೕ ದ ರಶ  ಉ ದಕ ತ ವ  ವ ಉ ೕಶ , 
ಬದ  ಬಳ  ಡ  ಬಯ ದ , ಇದ  ಯ ಡ ದ ಪ ವತ  ಡ 
ಮ  ದ  ೕ ಗಳ  ವ  ಡ ದ , ಅಂಥ ಎ  ಇತರ ೕ ಗಳ 

ವ  ಒಳಪ , ವ ಉ ೕಶ  ಅ ಮ ಯ   ಡ ೕ ಆ 
ಉ ೕಶ  ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಅದ  ಬಳ ವವ , ಅ ಮ   ಎಂ  

ಸತಕ . 
X X           XX           XX 

96. ಯದ ಯ  ಅ ಮ  ಇಲ  ಇತರ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳ ದ  
ಡ.- (1) ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ದ  

ಯ   ಕ ಷನರ ಅ ಮ  ಇಲ  ಅಥ  85  ಪ ಕರಣದ (5)  
ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ  ಯ ದ ಅವ  ದ  ಂ , ಇತರ ಉ ೕಶ  
ಪ ವ ದ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ದ ,  ಕ ಷನ  ಅ ೕಗ ರನ  ಮ   
ಪ ವತ  ದ  ಜ ರ ವ ವ ಯ  ಡ   ಪ ವ ದ 

ಂದ ರ ಡಬ  ಮ  ಅದರ  ದ  ಕಟ ಡವ  
ಅಥ  ಇತರ ಣವ ,  ಕ ಷನ  ಕ ಂ   ಥ ತ 

ೕ ೕ  ಟ  ತ ಯ  ಕ ದ , ಅ  ೕ  ಅಥ  ಡ  
 ಗತಕ . ಅ ೕಗ ರ  ಮ  ಪ ವತ  ಜ ರ ವ 

ವ , ಈ ಬ  ಜ  ಸ ರ  ಡಬ ದ ಯಮಗ ಳಪ  ಒಂ  ರ 
 ೕರ ಥ  ಕ ಷನ  ಸಬ ಥ ಡ  

ಗತಕ . 

(2) ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ದ  
ಯ , 95  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ದ ಆ ಶವ  ಅಥ  ದ ಷರತ  

ಉಲಂ   ಉ ೕಶ  ಪ ವ ದ ,  ಕ ಷನ  ಅಂಥ ಉಲಂಘ  
ಜ ರ ವ ವ , ೕ ೕ ನ  ವ ದ ಸ ಜಸ ಅವ ಳ  ಆ 

ಯ  ಅದರ ಲ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳಸ ಂ  ಅಥ  ಷರ ಗಳ  ಸ ಂ  
ವ ೕ ೕ  ಡಬ ; ಮ  ಯ  ಅದರ ಲ ಉ ೕಶ  ಬಳಸ  

ಧ  ಅಥ  ಷರ ಗಳ  ಸ  ಧ   ಕಟ ಡವ  
ಕ ,  ಅ ತವ  ಚ , ಅಥ  ಅಗತ ಸಬ ದ ಇತರ 

ಕ ಮಗಳ  ಳ  ಅಂಥ ೕ ೕ ನ  ಅಂಥ ವ ಯ  ಅಗತ ಪ ಸಬ . ಜ  
ಸ ರದ ಆ ಶಗ ಳ  ಅಂಥ ಉಲಂಘ  ಒಂ  ರ ಗ  ೕರ ಥ 



12 

 
ಡವ  ಮ  ಅಂಥ ಉಲಂಘ  ಂ ವ ವ ಪ ಂ  ನ  ಇಪ ೖ  

ಗ  ೕರ ಥ ಮತ  ಡವ   ಕ ಷನ  ಸಬ . 

(3) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ  ವ ವ  ೕ ೕ   ಆ ೕಆ ವ  
ೕ ೕ ನ  ವ ಅವ ಳ  ಆ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ   ಕ ಷನ  

ಆ ದ ಕ ಮಗಳ  ಳ  ತ ದ   ಕ ಷನ   ಅಂಥ ಕ ಮಗಳ  
ಳ  ಬ  ಅಥ  ಕ ಮ  ಡಬ  ಮ   ಗ 

ತ ದ  ಖ  ಯದ ಯ  ವ  ವ ೕ ಯ  ಅಂಥ 
ವ ಂದ ಅ  ವ ೕಯ ರತಕ . 

(4)  ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಏ  ಒಳ ಂ ದ , ಯದ ಧ ರ  ಆ ವ ಅಥ  
ಯದ ಉ ೕಶ  ಂ ದ  ಯ   ಕ ಷನ ನ ಅ ಮ  

ಇಲ  ಅಥ  95  ಪ ಕರಣದ (5)  ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ  ಪ ದ ಅವ  
ದ  ಂ  ಅಥ  95  ಪ ಕರಣದ  ರ ದ ಆ ಶವ  ಅಥ  

ದ ಷರತ  ಉಲಂ  ಇತರ  ಉ ೕಶ  ಪ ವ ದ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ದ , 
 ಕ ಷನ , ಪ ಸಬ ಥ ಯಮಗ  ಒಳಪ  ಮ  ಕಟ ಡಗಳ 

ಣ ಅಥ  ಗ   ಗಳ  ದ   ತ ಲದ  
ಯ ವ   ಒಳಪ , ಮ  ಪ ದ ಧ ಗ  ಮ  

ಷರ ಗ  ಒಳಪ ,  ಪ ಶಗ  ಅಥ   ಉಲಂಘ ಗ  ಅಥ  ವ 
ಉ ೕಶಗ ,ಪ ವತ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ ಯ  ಡ ೕ ಆ ಧ ಉ ೕಶಗ  

ರಬ ಥ ಪ ದ ತವ  ಯ ದ  ಅಂಥ 
ಪ ವತ  ಅಥ  ಬಳ   ಡಬ . 

X X           XX           XX 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

¸ÀPÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, ¸ÀÄªÀtð «PÁ À̧¸ËzsÀ, ¨É¼ÀUÁ«, ¦7, PÁ¸ÀÆ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 500, 19£ÉÃ r¸ÉA§gï, 2022 



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY  
FOURTEENTH SESSION 

THE KARNATAKA LAND REVENUE (SECOND AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022 
(LA Bill No. 30 of 2022) 

 

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964. 

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 
1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964), for the purposes hereinafter appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy third year of 
the Republic of India, as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Land Revenue (Second Amendment) Act, 2022. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by 
notification, appoint.  

2. Amendment of section 95.- In the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964, 
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in  
section 95,- 

(1) For sub section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(2) If any occupant of a land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture 
wishes to divert such land or any part thereof to any other purpose, he shall 
submit an affidavit along with an application to the Deputy Commissioner in the 
manner as may be prescribed and if the diversion is sought,- 

(i)  In accordance with the use specified in the Master Plan duly published for 
the concerned land under the provisions of the Karnataka Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of 1963), then the same 
shall be deemed to have been diverted subject to payment of prescribed fee 
under sub-section (7) and the Deputy Commissioner shall issue the order 
of approval accordingly within seven days from the date of receipt of the 
application: 

 Provided that, in case the Deputy Commissioner fails to give his decision and 
issue the order under this sub-section within fifteen days from the date of receipt of 
the application, the approval for diversion for use shall be deemed to have been 
granted by the Deputy Commissioner and the same shall be certified and issued, 
after payment of fee prescribed under sub-section (7), in the manner as may be 
prescribed. 

(ii) In case the Master Plan has not been published or the land is falling outside 
the local planning area, then the concerned authorities shall furnish their 
opinion within fifteen days from the date of receipt of the application. The 
Deputy Commissioner shall issue the approval for diversion for use as per 
the application, subject to the opinion furnished by the concerned 
authorities and subject to payment of the fee prescribed under sub-section 
(7): 



2 
 

 

Provided that, in case no opinion is furnished within the said period of fifteen 
days, it shall be deemed that the concerned authorities have no objection to the 
said diversion of land for use as per the application. 

Provided further that, in case the Deputy Commissioner fails to give his 
decision and issue the order under this sub-section within thirty days from the date 
of receipt of the application, the approval for diversion for use shall be deemed to 
have been granted by the Deputy Commissioner and the same shall certified and 
issued in the manner as may be prescribed subject to payment of fee prescribed 
under sub-section (7). 

(iii)If any diversion is obtained with a false or wrong declaration or affidavit 
under this section, in addition to the criminal liabilities, the same shall be 
null and void upon order in this regard by the Deputy Commissioner. The 
conversion fee, if remitted, shall stand forfeited to the Government. The 
land whose diversion for non-agriculture use was obtained by a false 
affidavit, the Deputy Commissioner may also issue an order for forfeiture 
of the said land to the Government. 

(iv) In case a part of the survey number is sought to be diverted for non-
agriculture use then prior pre-conversion sketch, approved by the Survey 
Settlement and Land Records Department, identifying the metes and 
bounds for the part sought to be converted, shall be mandatorily filed 
along with application for diversion: 

Provided that, in case the Survey Settlement and Land Records department 
fails to approve or reject the pre-conversion sketch within fifteen days from the date 
of receipt of application for the sketch of the applicant, it shall be deemed to be 
approved as prepared by the applicant and the approval shall be issued in the 
manner as may be prescribed. 

(v) In case the applicant in his declaration or affidavit stated that the land 
sought to be diverted to non-agriculture use is a granted land then the 
Deputy Commissioner shall reject the application if the diversion 
contravenes any provisions of the Karnataka Scheduled Castes and 
Scheduled Tribes (Prohibition of Transfer of Certain Lands) Act, 1978 or 
the Karnataka Land Grants Rules, 1969 or any other terms and conditions 
of the grants issued by the Government from time to time. 

(vi) No order of diversion under this section shall by itself lead to increase in the 
guidance value of the diverted land as notified by the Department of 
Stamp and Registration unless the land is put to actual non-agricultural 
use as under provisions of the Karnataka Town and Country Planning Act, 
1961  (Karnataka Act 11 of 1963): 

Provided that, in Dakshina Kannada District, subject to any law for the time 
being in force regarding erection of buildings or the construction of wells or tanks, 
an occupant of dry (punja) land, wet land or garden land who is not,- 

(a) a person registered or liable to be registered as an occupant of  
such land under section 48A of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 
(Karnataka Act 10 of 1962); or 



3 
 

 

(b) a grantee of such land under section 77 of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 
1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962), may without obtaining the permission 
required under this sub-section and notwithstanding anything contained 
therein, divert such land or part thereof to any other purpose after sending a 
prior notice to the Tahasildar in such form as may be prescribed and subject 
to payment of fee prescribed under sub-section (7).” 

(2) sub-sections (3), (4), (5) and (6) shall be omitted. 

(3) For sub-section (7), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(7) When any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture is 
permitted or is deemed to have been permitted under this section, to be used for 
any purpose other than agriculture, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such 
rules as may be made by the State Government in this behalf, require the payment 
of a fee as notified from time to time. No assessment shall be leviable on such land 
thereafter except under sub-section (2) of section 83.” 

3. Amendment of section 96.- In the Principal Act, in section 96,- 

(i) in sub-section (1),- 

(a) after the words “or used for any other purpose without the permission of 
the Deputy Commissioner” the words, figures and brackets“or in violation of any 
provisions of sub-section (2) of section 95 or based on false or wrong affidavit or 
declaration,” shall be inserted; and 

(b) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “one lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted. 

(ii) in sub-section (2),- 

(a) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “one lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted; and 

(b) for the words “twenty-five rupees” the words “two thousand five hundred 
rupees” shall be substituted. 

 



4 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

To give effect to the proposals made in the Budget Speech for the year 2021-

2022 and to simplify the land conversion process for the non-agricultural purpose, 

it is considered necessary further to amend the section 95 and 96 of the Karnataka 

Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964). 

Hence the Bill. 

 

 

 

 

 

 



5 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 
 

 There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.  

 

 
 

 



6 
 

 

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION 

Clause 2: 
Sub-section (2) of section 95 sought to be substituted under this 

clause,-  

(i) sub-section 2,- 

(a) empowers the State Government, to prescribe the manner 

regarding submission of application to the Deputy Commissioner 

for the non-agricultural purposes; 

(b) the proviso to clause (i) and second proviso to clause (ii) of sub-

section (2) empowers the State Government to prescribe the 

manner regarding deemed grant for diversion and same shall be 

certified and issued by the Deputy Commissioner; 

(c) the proviso to clause (iv) of sub-section (2) empowers the State 

Government to prescribe the manner regarding deemed approval 

for the sketch of the applicant and same shall be issued by the 

Survey Settlement and Land Records Department; 

(d) item (b) of the proviso to clause (vi) sub-section (2) empowers the 

State Government to make rules for sending a prior notice to the 

Tahsildar in such form; and 

(ii) sub-section (7) of section 95 sought to be substituted under this 

clause, empowers the State Government to make rules to 

prescribe the payment of fee for permission of non –agricultural 

purpose under sub-section (2). 

 

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character. 

 

R. ASHOKA 
Minister for Reveue 

 
 

 
M.K. VISHALAKSHI 

Secretary 
Karnataka Legislative Assembly 

 
 
 



7 
 

 

ANNEXURE 
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA LAND REVENUE ACT, 1964 

(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964) 
 

XXX   XXX   XXX 
 

83. Manner of assessment, commutation of non-agricultural assessment and 
prohibition of use of land for certain purposes.—(1) Save as otherwise provided by or 
under this Act, the land revenue leviable on any land under this Act, shall be assessed or 
shall be deemed to have been assessed, with reference to the use of the land for the 
purpose of agriculture.  

(2) If any land held or used for any purpose other than agriculture be diverted or 
used for the purpose of agriculture, such land shall, notwithstanding that it was exempt 
from assessment or was assessed with reference to any purpose other than agriculture, be 
liable to the payment of land revenue at such rates and subject to such rules as may be 
prescribed in this behalf, as for land used for the purpose of agriculture.  

(3) Land revenue leviable on any land and assessed or deemed to be assessed under 
any enactment or law in force before the commencement of this Act, with reference to the 
use of that land,—  

(a) for purpose of dwelling houses;  

(b) for industrial or commercial purposes; or  

(c) for any other non-agricultural purpose, shall, notwithstanding anything 
contained in this Act, continue to be levied at such rate at which it was levied or was 
leviable as at the commencement of this Act, unless such assessment is commuted in 
accordance with the provisions of sub-section (4).  

(4) Where in respect of any land used for any purpose other than agriculture, 
assessment payable annually was leviable or has been levied by or under any enactment or 
law in force before the commencement of this Act, such assessment may, in accordance 
with such rules as may be prescribed, be commuted by payment to the State Government 
of an amount equal to five times the amount of such annual assessment, and on such 
commutation such land shall be exempt from such annual assessment.  

(5) The Tahsildar or a Survey Officer may, subject to such rules as may be 
prescribed in this behalf, prohibit the use for certain purposes of any land liable to the 
payment of land revenue and may summarily evict any holder or other person who uses or 
attempts to use the same for any such prohibited purpose. 

XXX   XXX   XXX 
95. Uses of agricultural land and the procedure for use of agricultural land for 

other purpose.—(1) Subject to any law for the time being in force regarding erection of 
buildings or construction of wells or tanks, an occupant of land assessed or held for the 
purpose of agriculture is entitled by himself, his servants, tenants, agents, or other legal 
representatives, to erect farm buildings, construct wells or tanks, or make any other 
improvements thereon for the better cultivation of the land or its more convenient use for 
the purpose aforesaid.  

Provided that the farm Building or farm House so erected shall not be more than ten 
percent of his holding subject to maximum of such extent of land as may be prescribed.  



8 
 

 

Explanation.- For the purpose of this sub-section “Farm Buildings” or "Farm house" 
means a house attached to a farm and constructed in a portion of an agricultural land, 
used for the residence of the agriculturist or used for the purpose of keeping agricultural 
equipments and tethering cattle. The house shall be used by farmer for his own use and it 
shall not be let out for commercial activities to any individual or agency. 

 (2) If any occupant of land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture wishes to 
divert such land or any part thereof to any other purpose, he shall  notwithstanding 
anything contained in any law for the time being in force apply for permission to the 
Deputy Commissioner who may, subject to the provisions of this section and the rules 
made under this Act, refuse permission or grant it on such conditions as he may think fit.  

Provided that in case of any agricultural land assessed or held for the purpose of 
agriculture, falling within the Local Planning Area for which the Master Plan has been duly 
published under the Karnataka Town and Country Planning Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of 
1963) and such land and such diversion is in accordance with the purpose of land use 
specified in such Master plan. The permission therefore shall be deemed to have been 
granted subject to payment of fine prescribed under sub-section (7). 

Provided further that in Dakshina Kannada District, subject to any law for the time 
being in force regarding erection of buildings or the construction of wells or tanks, an 
occupant of dry (punja) land, wet land or garden land who is not,— 

(a) a person registered or liable to be registered as an occupant of such land under 
section 48A of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962); or 

 (b) a grantee of such land under section 77 of the said Act, may, without obtaining 
the permission required under this sub-section and notwithstanding anything contained 
therein, divert such land or part thereof to any other purpose after sending a prior notice in 
that behalf, in the prescribed form to the Tahsildar and paying in the prescribed manner, 
the fine prescribed under sub-section (7). 

(2A) Where any occupant of land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture has 
diverted such land or part thereof to residential purpose without obtaining the permission 
of Deputy Commissioner under sub-section (2), prior to 31st day of December 2008 and 
desirous to get such diversion be regularised, shall, apply 8 [within the period of one year 
from the date of commencement of the Karnataka Land Revenue (Amendment) Act, 2011  
in such form, alongwith such fee and penalty, as may be prescribed, to the Deputy 
Commissioner. On receipt of such application, the Deputy Commissioner may, 
notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, but subject to the provisions of any other 
law for the time being in force and subject to such conditions and in such manner as may 
be prescribed, on production of such evidence as he may require it to be necessary and 
after an enquiry, regularise or refuse to regularize except where such land,- 

(i) lies in the line of natural drains or course of valley;  
(ii) belongs to the State Government or an authority owned or controlled by the 

State Government or any local Authority;  
(iii) coming in the way of existing or proposed roads, inner or outer ring roads, 

national high ways, by pass over ring roads including those proposed for 
widening and railway lines, tram ways, mass rapid transit system projects, 
communications and other civic facilities or public utilities;  



9 
 

 

(iv) is a forest land;  
(v) belonging to another person over which the applicant has no title;  
(vi) (vi) is reserved for parks, play grounds, open places or for providing any civic 

amenities;  
(vii) or building is abutting to neighbouring property, storm water drains, tank bed 

areas, river course or beds and canals or below the high tension electric line;  
(viii) use is against height restrictions specified in zoning regulations for heritage 

monuments, aerodrums and Defense Regulations; 
(ix) not conforms to any clearance from high-tension lines or fire protection 

measures;  
(x) is in the area covered by the Coastal Zone Regulations of the Ministry 

Environment and Forest, Government of India;  
(xi) regularisation of violation in respect of change of land use shall be made as 

far as may be in accordance with section 14A of the Karnataka Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1961;  

(xii) or development in respect of any building having more than two floors shall be 
regularized unless,- 
(a) a certificate from a Structural Engineer is produced regarding the 
structural stability of such building;  
(b) a No Objection Certificate is obtained from the Fire Force Department.  
 

(xiii) or unauthorised development or construction made in agricultural zone of 
approved Master Plan or green belt area declared under Karnataka Land 
Revenue Act, 1964; and  

(xiv) is covered under any other prohibition as may be prescribed:  
 

(2AA) Burden of proving that the diversion or change of land use was made for 
residential purpose prior to 31st day of December 2008 shall lie on the applicant who seeks 
regularisation of such unauthorised diversion or change of land use.  

(2AAA) All such diversions or change of land use which are not regularised or where 
applicant does not apply within the time specified in sub-section (2A) shall be liable to be 
demolished or brought back to their earlier use and expenses incurred thereon shall be 
collected from such person as arrears of land revenue.  

(3) Permission to divert may be refused by the Deputy Commissioner on the ground 
that the diversion is likely to defeat the provisions of any law for the time being in force or 
that it is likely to cause a public nuisance or that it is not in the interests of the general 
public or that the occupant is unable or unwilling to comply with the conditions that may 
be imposed under subsection (4). 

(3A) xxx 

(3B) xxx 

 (4) Conditions may be imposed on diversion in order to secure the health, safety and 
convenience, and in the case of land which is to be used as building sites, in order to 
secure in addition that the dimensions, arrangement and accessibility of the sites are 
adequate for the health and convenience of occupiers or are suitable to the locality and do 
not contravene the provisions of any law relating to town and country planning or the 
erection of buildings.  



10 
 

 

(5) Where the Deputy Commissioner fails to inform the applicant of his decision on 
the application made under sub-section (2) within a period of four months, from the date of 
receipt of the application, the permission applied for shall be deemed to have been granted.  

(6) Unless the Deputy Commissioner shall, in any particular instance otherwise 
direct, no application under sub-section (2) shall be recognised unless it is made by the 
occupant.  

(6a) In Dakshina Kannada District, Kodagu District, and Kollegal Taluk of Mysore 
District where any land assessed or held for purposes of agriculture has been diverted or 
used for any other purposes, before the date of commencement of the Karnataka Land 
Revenue (Amendment) Act, 1981, the land so used together with the land appurtenant to 
any building (other than a farm house) therein, not exceeding three times the built area of 
such building, shall with effect from such date be deemed to have been permitted to be 
used for purposes other than agriculture.  

(7) When any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture is permitted under 
sub-section (2) or is diverted under the provisos to the said sub-section or is deemed to 
have been permitted under sub-section (5) or sub-section (6a), to be used for any purpose 
unconnected with agriculture, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such rules as may 
be made by the State Government in this behalf, require the payment of a fine. No 
assessment shall be leviable on such land thereafter except under subsection (2) of section 
83. 

 (8) The permission for diversion of agricultural land for industrial development, 
educational institutions, Places of worship a Housing Project approved by the State 
Government, or for purpose of Horticulture under this section shall be deemed to have 
been granted when permission for purchase of agricultural land is accorded under section 
109 of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962) for industrial 
development, educational institutions, Places of worship, a Housing Project approved by 
the State Government, or for purpose of Horticulture as the case may be subject to the 
payment of fine as may be prescribed. 

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, “occupant” includes a mulgeni tenant 
or a permanent tenant.  

(9) whenever any occupant of land assessed or held for purpose of agriculture wishes 
to divert such land or any part thereof for the purpose of quarrying of minor minerals, 
whether specified or non specified in accordance with the rules governing quarrying of 
minor minerals or stone crushing activity under the Karnataka regulation of stone crushers 
Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 8 of 2012), shall make an application along with the fine 
applicable to the Deputy Commissioner for diversion of such land. On such application, the 
permission for diversion of such land shall be deemed to have been granted subject to 
obtaining lease or licence or working permission under the said enactments.  

(10) If any occupant of any agriculture land assessed or held for the purpose of 
agriculture wishes to divert such land or part thereof for the purpose of setting up of solar 
power generation in accordance with Karnataka Solar Policy 2014-21 issued in G.O EN 21 
VSC 2014 dated 22.05.2014 which has been approved by State and Central Government 
and which has been approved by the Competent Authority, the permission applied for 
conversion of such land shall be deemed to have been granted for that purpose so long as 



11 
 

 

they use for purpose for which permission is granted subject to payment of the conversion 
fine and all such other fees payable if any, in this regard. 

XXX   XXX   XXX 

96. Penalty for using agricultural land for other purpose without permission.— 
(1) If any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture be diverted or used for any 
other purpose without the permission of the Deputy Commissioner, or before the expiry of 
the period prescribed in sub-section (5) of section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may 
summarily evict the occupant and the person responsible for the diversion from the land so 
diverted and any building or other construction erected thereon shall also, if not removed 
after such written notice as the Deputy Commissioner may deem reasonable, be liable to 
forfeiture or to summary removal. The occupant and the person responsible for the 
diversion shall also be liable to pay, such penalty not exceeding one thousand rupees as 
the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to the rules made by the State Government in this 
behalf, direct.  

(2) If any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture has been diverted for 
any other purpose in contravention of an order passed or of a condition imposed under 
section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may serve a notice on the person responsible for 
such contravention directing him, within a reasonable period to be stated in the notice, to 
use the land for its original purpose or to observe the condition; and such notice may 
require such person to remove any structure, to fill up any excavation or to take such other 
steps as may be required in order that the land may be used for its original purpose, or 
that the condition may be satisfied. Subject to the orders of the State Government, the 
Deputy Commissioner may also impose on such person a penalty not exceeding one 
thousand rupees for such contravention and a further penalty not exceeding twenty-five 
rupees for each day during which such contravention continues.  

(3) If any person served with a notice under sub-section (2) fails within the period 
stated in the notice to take steps ordered by the Deputy Commissioner under that 
subsection, the Deputy Commissioner may himself take such steps or cause them to be 
taken; and any cost incurred in so doing shall be recoverable from such person in the same 
manner as an arrear of land revenue.  

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, when any land assessed or 
held for the purpose of agriculture has been diverted or used for any other purpose without 
the permission of the Deputy Commissioner or before the expiry of the period prescribed in 
sub-section (5) of section 95 or in contravention of an order passed or of a condition 
imposed under section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such rules as may be 
prescribed and subject to any law for the time being in force regarding erection of buildings 
or construction of wells and tanks, and subject to prescribed terms and conditions, 
compound such diversion or use, on payment of the prescribed amount, which may be 
different for different areas or for different contraventions or for different purposes for 
which the diversion or use is made. 

XXX   XXX   XXX 

 
 

 
 

Govt. Press, Suvarna Vikasa Soudha, Belgavi, 19th Dec, 2022, P7, W.D. , Copies 500 


