Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

CHOE NMQ
KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 QUMD a0, 2021 26681 03
A58l (e 10 wa 03rd July 2021
¥ IJ; 1196 efloymo 19 m“,\’fc? 1949
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 19th Mithunam 1196
Saturday 1943 @GR HUOIWIo 12
12th Ashadha 1943
CHO8 MVABHHID
wl@a (Plwa Mldanrem-ail) aidia ]
all22emoalmo
M 9559/6e165.m512/2020/@no. @lojaimama oo, 2021 eyo0el 2
1196 alinymo 18

1943 @ratou9o 11.

2021  =yeeel 100 OlOG] 6508  0WAdeRd  All8oenineq |SoTle
®I9¥  alO@M  BAWIMMIT  ©alom|mMeIRs8)®S  @nolalleelssnd]l  @IMNoad

(@IMl@LEQ|SICMYIM].

1NAIBENNS OB 18000,

aLoglal ag)o. Od.,
TVOatal|@B TV50] (Dl@do).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021-9£1 75-20 MmN 633l

2021-081 608 DM, 30QUSS], @Y% ©®I¥1e108] UMW (6BEWG)

&390l

@0® OlojeRfleslend  ag)$lelOiloensde  TVOAICNVOODI@  BHO8  WAIBGRNA

Qilgoenioee ]SO @).

1998-6£1 808 DQ, BI53AUSS], MY H®IYIEI08] ce:UAMIW] BB

6RAVDI aIgRMO®IMI8s
&30}
a303alonad

afl0le,.—2020-0e1 6508 D, B:031USS], MY OMISIENS] eunmIul (6REUNGI)
®dSlmmmy  (2020-0e1  37) 2020 =meorl 3-00 OIOG]  6HO8  VAIBENA

aflgoenioeq]sioml@lo}malmoelo;

2020 @] 2400 OO G2IGMM  EHOS  ALOMOIM  MIVATLEIOS
MLCIASMNGILIOD (EITIMI® &30AAIMMAVINT ald0o MVoNIM MIWAMVEIHS G0}
@B OBMZAUOMBIMB8 6303 enilad MlwaaveId @PAIMGlelesmalmyo

aIOQRIBNMMIMYo Bl @IMOEI0;

@IN@® aa3lmadamileel aljainunsud mleimldomom@lmol 2020-6e1 6608
D, 03188, ™ 6®I%leNg]l seunmIW] (6EELMI) sodalmmaY (2020-ee1 65)

2020 0aigoeni@ 26-00 BIO®I 6608 NAIGERHA Qilgoenioeq |S)OmlalojMm@Imoelo;

2020 awllmoeni@ 31-00 @@ G2IBMM GHO8 MVMNIM MIWATVEWINS
amemsmomlee 2021 28mMaldl 8-00 BI® @YOoEla] 2021 223maIdl 22-00 IO
@OQINVOM2|ERAODW EHOS MVOMNIM MIVANVE@OS MVEIASMOMILo (@ISO
&03UIMAMilMiald:®o MeMNIM MIATVE@IANS B0} BYEQ BBIENBNUOMMBIMSS
630} enil@d mlameclcd @AMl flesymalmyo aIOOBNM@IMYo

Slomloymmlmoelo;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




@INV@® &3almnadmileel aljainunsdud Mleimldomm @lmoil 2021-6e1 66,08
DO, H053U8E], @9 OMISleNgl caunmlwl (6cEVGI) sodalmmmy (2021-ee1 16)

2021 eanEnRIA] 9-00 BlOG 6508 NAIBERA QilgoenioeysyOmIloM@Imoelo;

2021 ¢a@ 24-00 BT @YOoEla] 2021 233613 10-00 GG EPAIAVIM] 2| BHOS
MLOMNOM  MIWAMVEWIHS TVEIASMBLIOND ([ ITO®  303WIMMAIM]  aldh0o
MoMNOM MIVAMVEWIDS &0} BB  OBIEMAURMOIMB8 803  6nilad

W@aMEDI@ GRAIMGlQ{leemM@IMie aldq@OBHM@IMIe dSl@IMIOM@ImMmoeRo;

ROOMOMINY BOEMALISM@AS 213-00 @PMB2JG0 (2)-00 GUEMWo (aF)) Daleemb
@000  EINV®  &dlmmdadlay 2021 eieerl  5-00 @@ (@ldenielje

L@ OO @IMILI0;

@o®  aedallmmdavleel  alQINGud  MleImBOmOdIClealm  aldHo

6)6)0_I034'_SGGY3(!?) @61’]’30(6)&6)@(“’)@(]0)0&1&0;

608 MLOMNIM MIWANVE TVEMASMOTILIEOCM@IMOLI0 @IM VMO MSals]
a)S}BHOMED® G@YQIUDIMIBIIM MJaNal0IEBRUd Mlelaileneemzary 608 NQIRENAHS)

@6NI0RLIMODIBlBNM @IMILI0;

DG |0Ud, BRMIMIM, BIOOODIONG BOeMALISMOS 213-00 @PMYBgJ3o (1)-00
QUEMWEI®I00  M@He]s  @oWlB00630d  alldle@ouls] 608  wWaIdeNAE

0694 |0 B3N Qil8oenIoeq |SIomIML—

1. 2lO)HOEa|0lo (0100oBAI0.—(1) 0D &30l 2021-601 GHOS DY,

035188l ®¢ 6®o¥1e108] MW (6B BoBUIMAMY ag)m Gald alOJo.

(2) o® 2020 =MoLl 300 OOl (@I UM

@)(O&(O)@(H(%SQ@@OM.

2. 1998-0e1 17-00 @QBQ MITBLLIBHNIV] GEENMI_6).21Q)6)0 JESENBGIET).—EDD

&edSlmmmy dlelaileldlesimm ooeiom 1998-6e1 6HO8 0D, ©053U8Sl, OF
02%le1dgl coaunmldl  @:glay (1998-ee1 17) (D@IMIEUdHO (@IWIM  BRYBY
ag)aMI6M al00NAUBlEe|SId) 3-00 Qlda{lGd alE0nBdUdlajldlemnmm GREUNGIGUdHE)

ailew@mo@] @ Ioenielmienz0ldlaanan@oem).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




3. 4-00 Q) I8 BRNTI.—(IWIM BVB:FIOE! 4-00 Qldsa |@d,—

(1) (1)-00 9alQid) @ “EITIMOTVo @Y ©)atd QflMo” ag)M QIOBE)BUBHE)

ald00 “E@IM@OMo al@INe@I 0}ald AflMo” ag)M QAUDBNGUD B2IBBHHENIMILNY;

(2)  (2)-00 Dol {l@ “60600 MOTVARE a@BS ©al” a)ID QUILEEBUDHE)

ald0o “630600 MOV al®IME®T ®Yat” ag)ON AUIBENGUD GalBELHENBDI6N);

(3) (3)-00 9alIB)a{l@d “60600 MOTVAIY0 oB Oad Qll@Mo” ag)IM QAUOBEBUBHE)

ald0o “&0600 MMV al®IMer®] ot Afl®o” ag)M QAUIBEGUD CaIBBHLHENIMILENT;

(4) @-00 2al0IB[l@  “@PoVOBOOMIM @M &BO)} @B ag)m
QIOBNBUBHE) aldh®o “BoUIBRIVOMING af)9alOBlera] LOMAIMOMIM GIEIMOW

O a)aM QUIBNGUD GalBBHHENBMIGM).

4. 0398010 8$101086e130—(1) 2021-081 GHO8 MY, B0QUSS], O H@IYIRIOS]

eaHaMIWl (6cRVW®) sodalmmMMS (2021-6e!1 16) @M@ 03oss I dlea;amy.

(2) @RErReOM 0GIESIDVOMIMBOMOM®YH, (EINTO® BIAWINMAY (@ I8000
6ERNT  ©21Q)6a]S @WIm  ABHIBHIFMD  S2UDDEMO  ©2DD@I]
HSHO)MES)MMEMO @YW  oBOOBIEo  BIOVGAD  2f)SIOMEMO  af)SIOM®IV]
B0}MS} M EMI BYD aBOMERIEI0 MSalSIe™O, M 830BAUIMABMY (@18:000 GRRWD)
6219003 (@1WOmM @ BGlad51$l@d 6) 21D O@ICWI 2)S}OMD@ICI

B 0YO6)|ESEIBMIE).

@Olal MaOMAE 6000,
NIBEYE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No. 9559/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 2nd July, 2021

18th Mithunam,1196
11th Ashadha, 1943.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (75 of 2021).

By order of the Governor,

SADIQUE M. K.,
Special Secretary (Law).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2021-ee1 6808 0Q, 050188l @¢ emIslens]
eHamIW] (6cEL®I) @adIMadMY” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 75 OF 2021

THE KERALA BAMBOO, KATTUVALLI AND PANDANUS LEAF WORKERS’
WELFARE FUND (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2021

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic of
India.

AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act, 1998.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’
Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (37 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor
of Kerala on the 3rd day of July, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala
during its session which convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020
(65 0f 2020) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 26th day of September, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which convened on the 31st day of December, 2020 and during its session
which commenced on the 8th day of January, 2021 and ended on the 22nd day of January,
2021;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021
(16 of 2021) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 9th day of February, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which commenced on the 24th day of May, 2021 and ended on the 10th day
of June, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of

India the said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 5th day of July, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala

Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 3rd day of July, 2020.

2. Act 17 of 1998 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act,
1998 (17 of 1998) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the

amendments specified in section 3.
3. Amendment of section 4—1In the principal Act, in section 4,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words

“fifteen rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “seven rupees per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees per month” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (3), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words

“fifteen rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (4), for the words “an amount equal to the amount contributed”,
the words “an amount equal to the seventy five percentage of the amount contributed” shall be

substituted.

4. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’
Welfare Fund(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (16 of 2021) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to have been done or any
action taken or deemed to have been taken under the principal Act as amended by the said
Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended by

this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202}z Digitally signed by Salim A
Thisisadigitally signed Gazette. Date:2021.07.03 04:04:31 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




		2021-07-03T16:04:31+0530
	Salim A




