q, 9.-108-9ed-09-11.

& U ARl S €16
qfides, & UR wHG 22/153,
fedion 10-1-06 BRI o T
e S1eh SR ) Qe STRTa
ek gR1 A9 S & T 1.

U 176 ] e, eReR, Tl 26 A 2010—3F 5, W 1932

faum T gfgare™, qeges
Aiqre, feiss 26 @/ 2010

. 7385 FHUIT-2010.—FEA9RY Fe W & ufar qen e werer wesf Frem 64 % sl % wer H, ey
- foum W W= e, T e e (TeieR) fag, 2010 (FHi 13 T 2010) S faur @ H e 26 T, 2010
1 I e T Wwaﬁu@mésmwﬁfmﬁww%

el T &. U
wE 9,
‘ TEYRY faur w9l
eyt faeen
(FHF 3 G R0%0)

TeAURET FAeT Wl Ew S, N e Uy (Heie ) fagesk, Rogo.
forera-

wigg .

YR 3 I G,
YRT ¥ T GIMEA.
YT ¥~ B G,
N ¥-@ o T,
ST %71 T T
T & T T,
U &-F 1 GUNYA
N §-F 1 I,
YN &~ T WA,
YT \s ST WINEA,

N R R

Pa-ae]
Paan e

351



352 HEYeY USqH, feaia 26 W 2010

TeaweyT fadaes

. (¥ %3 T Rog0)
TEAYQYT foer wur Waw daw, yww qur 9y ((6eite )
fagae, 0%o0.

HEIFTT ferem AT wEEr Yo, N Ao Yo srfufEm, 22\9?@%#@%%%@%&&%

R TR % geRded oY menRy fuF-wved gR frefafed w9 4 98 st o —

e A, 2. TW sifufrm s s T weawe faum g gewr A, s gon e (i) srfyfrm,
R0%0 B, ‘

YT 3 T G, R. AN fauM | e A, W don Yem sifufrm, 9wl (shHi @ T gjw3) (S 39
T T e Al F A @ FRE ) @ a3, W A R e F e w e e
TR T Tenfig fRd s

O T W, % A SAfufRm w ur s H, R aRE §9R w9 ¥ T W, v Ao g e T
aTT ¥X-% w7 ¥. q& Al w5 g/ v-= §, v 9n R T ¥ W R, e g g o et
ORT ¥-W w7 & T I w5 a v, v S TR T % T W e R g v e
ST -1 ST AT, & T il &t a0 ¥ & W W, frEfafag ug T Y S, i —

el . YT I W w9 BN S99 vk el e fean s,

qRTY T T . W@ IfufE B U o F wm W, frfafen o enfa 5 s steiq—

AT : Y TS wEE w9 w9 YR S ann e e s,

°TT §-% T ¢. ge fafEm # U g-% 9 Ium () #—

Heirer,

(@) wem g W“@%W‘v‘q@f”%WW,’W”WWW”WWW;
(F)  vom TegE H, ue A | TR W e W veg e W v wenfya T S,

UL R T Afuf # uR &-w H, weg i TR TR ¥ wE W, v Ui B v Tl
URT &-T WI Ro. A AfUfTT I ar &-71 H, ¥reg ‘1 TR T F TUM T, e 9 wR w90’ i

&IRT \9 T HSer, 2. T Sifufam & ur o F 39 (2) ¥, v AT TR T F WA W, R 0 5R
T wifd fohy g, .



Teyeyl e, fediw 26 A 2010 352 (1)

3.l TH FRUT H weH

T € & Al H HE T F BN de evEs € T § R wewsy fum oun 9o S, 96 ad 9ve
SAfufTam, (R0 (kA @ B gjwr) W T HYIHR gRI fauM W % el ¥ da9 awn w6 gfy w1 S

R. o Ty fadad weE €.

sirrer ' =¥, srirerar s
feaiw 38 A, Rogo. . YRYIHE T,

“HfgyH & STIEdT Y0 F e ToAU gRI ST .

IEEERSIEE

wEfad fadasw & WUE 3, 3, %, 4, §, 9, ¢, ], R0 W 2% W wwdlow wEuME fRY S % uiom e T
Y WY STER: T 9,3R,3%, 000/~ (¥ WA FUS ITARNE @ THAT TR) Fael w1 anad] B
T 3T, '
2. T, . vt
nmﬁmﬁm,ﬂm

T, ST qE Ae e WA, TEhRY B S S qoner, o ¥ i e weiiia—2010.



& U AR S ST
H. ¥.-108-HI9@-09-11.

qRded, % 9 wH% 22/153,
et 10-1-06 g1 g yEA
ST STk 79 o e STera)
Tk gRI 9! S F faw s,

[

FHE 179] I, wfeR, feqis 27 o 2010—9% 6, T 1932

fafr s et el foreme
A, femtes 27 tn‘af 2010

. 2063-127-3FRE-3 (W.).—9RA & WfIUM F T 348 F WU (3) F RO H, weaww faum
. W e o, W adn Yo (dere) faess, 2010 (FHIE 13 W 2010) 1 ST STqER TAe % wiftwR @

TEYSY & TSI & AT W gl SRR,
TSI UTed, TR |qiad.

357



358 geayey ey, feiw 27 A= 2010

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 13 or 2010

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA PENSION
. (SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2010

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Clauses :
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of Section 3.
3. Amendment of Section 4.
4. Amendment of Section 4-A.
5. Amendment of Section 4-B.

6. Substitution of Section 4-C.

7. Substitution of Section 5. i
8. Amendment of Section 6-A.
9. Amendment of Section 6-B.
10. Amendment of Section 6-C.

- 11 Amendment of Section 7.



HeAYRy TSiuH, fedisn 27 HrE 2010 358 (1)
MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 13 oF 2010.
THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
. PENSION (SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2010
A Bill Further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha

Pension Adhiniyam, 1972. i

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India
as follows:——

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha  Short title.
Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010.

2. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Amendment of
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “nine ~ Section 3.
thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “‘sixteen ~ Amendment of
thousand rupees” shall be substituted. Section 4.

4. In Section 4-A of the Principal Act, for the words “seven thousand rupees”, the words “tenl  Amendment of
thousand rupees” shall be substituted. Section 4-A.

, 5.In Section 4-B of the Principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “four  Amendment of
thousand rupees” shall be substituted. Section 4-B.
6. For Section 4-C of the Principal Act, the following section éhall be substituted, namely :~—  Substitution of
Section 4-C.
“4-C. There shall be paid to every member orderly allowance at the rate of five thousand O rderly
rupees per mensem.”. allowance.
7. For Section 5 of the Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely :—  Substitution of
Section 5.

“5. There shall be paid to every member Bus Travelling Allowance at the rate of two hundred
fifty rupees per mensem.”.

8. In sub-section (1) of Section 6-A of the Principal Act,—

(1) in the first paragraph, for the words “six thousand rupees”, the words “seven thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

(ii) in the first proviso, for the words “two hundred rupees”, the words “three hundred
rupees” shall be substituted.

9. In Section-6-B of the Principal Act, for the words “three thousand rupees”, the words
“five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

10. In Section-6-C of the Principal Act, for the words “three thousand rupees”, the words
“five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

11. In sub-section (1) of Section 7 of the Principal Act, for the words “three thousand rupees”,
the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Bus Travelling

Allowance.

Amendment
Section 6-A.

Amendment
Section 6-B.

Amendment
Section 6-C.

Amendment
Section 7.

of

of

of

of



358 (2) neryey TSIy, feqis 27 | 2010

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to inflation in recent years, it has become necessary to enhance the salary and allowances of the members
of the Legislative Assembly by suitable amendments in the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

2. Hence this Bill.

Bhopal :

Dated the 26th March, 2010.
Dr. NAROTTAM MISHRA

Member-in-Charge.

Frref=reh, TGRS R Aol STEH SR, WISy 5RI YIS S qEuner, SToe | gfia e yEiEa—2010.





