. 9.-108-{I9R1-09-11.

e de "Rl Sd T
qffed, & 9 A 22/153,
fedier 10-1-06 BRI qd YT
s gleh o i qd SrerEr
2% g A9 o % A ergAa.

wHiE 177 T, AR, fedis 26 WE 2010—¥F 5, T 1932

faqur T wfbare™, Teey
fiyre, femie 26 @€, 2010
S 73881%%17%2o1o~nwﬁmﬁmamé€mawmﬁam?ﬁaﬁﬁw64%3@%%%13

TRy atenel we Iareder wd war wiauel fafy (dener) fadask, 2010 (FHHi® 14 € 2010) S faum @ §
fedier 26 T, 2010 1 T 2N ©. SR Y G ¥ fA wefa fR S €

<. . . U

‘g—g@ W;
Heagey faam |4

353



354 : aeyeR IS, femieh 26 91 2010

Heayey fasae

SRl Q¥ | Ro%o0

HEAYQYT TEAST AAT SUILTR TS YaT WU S qom W= fafy
(H3irem ) fadmen, Rogo.

FETICYT STSAY T IUTSALT (AT T 4w ) arferfiremm, 203 S WeamR e -stser e whiwan
(S e o) bR, 93¢0 W ek wNfie WY ¥ Rade,

YRA TR % sFEed ¥ § weqwdw fyym-ved g Srefatad w9 8 P

Aufmafia 8 —
wfam . ' z.wﬁaﬁmmﬁfwmnwﬁmawaawwwa@ﬁmﬁma%awwfafu
(W%Ff) C‘HﬁTﬁW, Q090 %
YiT—Uh
FETCRT ALY AT IuTEA (FTT Tl e ) T, 920 (WA 9 T L9R)
T dviem,
4RT 3 T HNE R. HEAYCY ey T IUIeAE (I AU W) stfafam, 2WR (FHIw R0 T 1]WR) (?ﬁsﬁ
mm{aaﬁrﬁm%w@ﬁﬁw%)ﬁmqﬁ,m“ﬁ?m"%wmw“mm”
RT3 T HIN. 3. A sHfufem &t a3 9 —

(T&w)  SUum (R) H, o=t ‘St s’ aen “‘ow aeR! ¥ R W, IE e TR
g g SR e e e S,

(R IR () § 7= A T ® W W IR IR e I R e
({7 3w (3) F W= wEm W F e w, v e W i fey e,

qAT—3r
ARy faum-see e wfawer (a9 aur www) sfufem, 940 (HHIE ¢ | ¢R¢o)
W dyiteE,
U 3 T I, ¥, wEAyRy faum-vead Tl ufauel (Ia9 e ) sfafm, e3¢ (AR ¢ T 23¢0) (S
wﬁﬁmwﬁuﬁw%w@ﬁ%@%)Eﬁ?wzﬁ,w“#ﬁm”%wm,w
“Tu e wenfam faw S,
BT ¥ T iehter o T sfufem v H—
(TF)  39uRl (2) # wsg A TR F wE R, v CiE e el Ry S,
(&) 39N () #, v “aRE TR ¥ WH W W e T i faeu S,
() - 3wum (3) ¥, weg Vuiw W F WE W, v “ara @iy feu sird.



s

Heqyey Ty, feqis 26 A€ 2010 ’ 354 (1)
3T T HIUN T R

B 81 %k a6 H YRR %k RRU AT STEYAF Bl W T R TeASy seAw aor SueAey (a9 q«1 WWi)
sfafm, RuR (FHIE v T jWR) R weawey fgum-desd dar wiowy (J@w @ wwan) eifufrem, e¢o
(hHish ¢ § R’¢o) H THfAq TUIYA ik ALAUQY SIeAy, IUEHE qel A1 Wfaud w99 daad R aw A s
HI ST,

R. o1 7% fadus @ €.

gIare BT T fasw
feaiw Re @, o030, T Ge,

“Hfgy % STTERE 0w & oTHH TSuUE g STRifaa.

~

fasita Fmu=

yeifad fades & @ue R, 3, ¥ W o # ymifad weud f&Y SM % siommesy = v W wiaed
STAMT: TIY 9,%0,000/~ (T O TG S19 TIR) Fael &1 A foeig YR ST

3T T . u’amﬂ
9@ afes,
! v Teryey faum g

s, yraaET HEor ae TEe G, Aeaucy R O wea JEoned, Hive § gk au sl —2010.



Sl wuis el TedeH
. 9.-108-H9I-09-11.

@ 4R ORI e
uffed, % UN wHIE 22/153,
fets 10-1-06 B0 qd gram
SRR €T 5 1 g4 Srereh)
I BRI S S % fae A

HHE 180 qiure, WHER, e 27 9 2010—39 6, WF 1932

fafy ok faurt = faym
o, et 27 w1 2010

. 2064~ 128ma(m)~mmé;ﬁfaaﬁ%aﬁas48%m(3) % ST H, HEAYRW afeas
e SwreAy wd A gfoe fafy (i) fadas, 2010 (wHiE 14 W 2010) W SHEST AR TSAUE ¥ MR
¥ TIGERT YR feren St -

qwmasma%qmﬁamaﬂéwr{
AT ATEE, W Giaa,

359



360

wegSe N9y, feiw 27 W 2010

Short tfitle,

Amendment of
Section 2.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Amendment of
Section 4.

MADHYA PRADESH BIiL
No. 14 07 2010

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHYAKSHA TATHA UPADHYAKSHA EVAM NETA
PRATIPAKSHA VETAN TATHA BHATTA VIDHI (SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2010

A Bili Further fo amend the Madhya Pradesh Adhyakshe Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetap Tatha
Bhatta) Adhiniyan:, 1872 and the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mardal Neta Pratipaksha
(Vetan Tatha Bhatta) Adhinivam, 1980,

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty first Year of the Republic of India
as followsi—

1. This Act may called the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksh Evam Neta Pratipaksha
Vetan Tatha Bhatta Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010.

PART 1
Amendment fo the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatia)
Adhinivam, 1972 (No. 27 of 1972)

2. In Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)

- Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 27 of 1972). (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “nine

thousand ", the words “ten thousand” shall be substituted.
3. In Section 3 of the Principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “nine thousand™ and “six thousand”, the words “thirteen
thousand” and “ten thousand” shall respectively be substitited;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “twelve thousand”, the words “eighteen thousand” shall
be substituted;

(iil) in sub-section (3), for the words “five hundred”, the words “eight hundred” shall
be substituted;

PART 11
Amendment to the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mandal Neta Pratipaiksha (Vetan Tatha
Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1980 (No. 8 of 19803,

4. In Section 3 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mandal Neta Pratipaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta)
Adhiniyam, 1980 (No. 8 of 1980). (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words “nine
thousand” the words “ten thousand” shall be substituted.

5. In Section-4 of the Principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “nine thousand” the words “‘thirteen thousand” shall be
substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “twelve thousand”, the words “eighteen thousand” shall
be substituted;

(iii) in sub-section (3), for the words “five hundred”, the words “eight hundred” shall
be substituted.



gergey sy, fediem 27 W 2010 360(1)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

.Due to inflation in recent years, it has become necessary to enhance the salary and allowances payable to the
Speaker, Deputy Speaker and Neta Pratipaksha of the Madhya Pradesh Legislative Assembly by suitable amendments
in the Madhya Pradesh Adhyaksha Tatha Upadhyaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 27 of 1972) and
the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Mandal Neta Pratipaksha (Vetan Tatha Bhatta) Adhiniyam, 1980 (No. 8 of 1980).

2. Hence this Bill.

Bhopal :
Dated the 26th March, 2010
Dr. NAROTTAM MISHRA
Member-in-Charge

s, STEE M YERU a9 S qenl, weade g IS S gRenerd, sire | 9 qen IemitE-—-2010.





