39 JeEIEe www.govtpressmp.nic.in 9
ff TRA A R <1 "aa .

FHE® 505 | e, EaR, feie 24 FamR 2011—SWEET 3, T 1933

faum 9w wieae™ qeayey

oruret, e 24 Taw=R 2011

. 24417-f9.9.-faum-2011. —TegRy foum 9 & 9fwen 9o = dued 9wt 9 64 & Iuedl & 9o
T Aeyey Y-UsEa wfed (deied) fadas, 2011 (FHIF 31 99 2011) H faum wa F w24 o, 2011 @
LY N ¥, SHEERW w g % fau i T s

TIEHR Ui
yq@ dfeE,
qeyey faum g

TeAUey fadaeh

HHIE 3L T R0

AW Y-Trored |igar (Hyied ) fadees, 2028

forera-g=ht
e . ,
2. wiarm .
2. YR R W WA
3. HRI 30 T M,
%, YR 3% T I
4. R 34 W I,

1009



1010 TeAYey o9, et 24 Ta=R 2011
g

& WW 3% 1 ENEA

o, YR %€ 1 GIE.

¢ URI %9 H G

Q. HN ¥R I HIEA.
0. YR Yo T TATH.

2% YN 4 W HIMEA
R N 4R AT HRA.
3. UT 43 1 HWARA.
Y. U WY H T,

. HRT WO T G
&, URI G- BT ST EATT,
2%, N 4R T TN,
3¢, NI \9¢ T BT ML
2. URT ¢} 1 GINEA.
Ro. N RY W gIEl WML
W YUW {¢ H WA

R U RR I BEAT ML
3. HRT o0 Thl TATIA.
R¥. U 2R e HIEA
. R Q¢ T HIMEA.
Q8. YR ¢30 T WM,
o, ¥R {3R I HIMEA.
¢ YT 233 T TAT.
K. YN L¢3 T HMEA.
30, g Q93 hT HIMEA,
3% UMW o0 H HAEA.
IR UR RRY H G,
33. Y 3% HT G,
3%, UW (3 FH WA
34 U ¥ N EREA.
38 U %9 K EWEA.
3, N ¥¢ T H9E.
3¢. U Yo H HEA.
3% U W3 I HEA
Yo. YT W\ T FYA.



TEYRS TeTH, e 24 TR 2011

1010 (D)

ey fagaen

AR 3% T 3028

HEAYSYT Y- Higar (Hyne ) fagaeh, 08¢
TLAYYT Y-TTET WiEaT, Q]uk Tl ST |yl & &g fadreen.

HRA TR & Jred o H HeayRyl faum-dea g frfafed w0 # a5 sfufafm@ g —
R, 39 SAfufrem w1 wfira T werwRw oo dfed (Seiem) afufteam, 0% €

R HEYRY -TNE Wi, /4] (FHIE R0 T 2]uR) (S THH T wvEN o stfufm &
9 8 e ®) & a3 w suem (R) H, @ve (W) % uven, Fefafed @ve ot
fepen ST, @verfe—

() aeR 7ea! 9 AfIa § R W Sifufm, ¢’] (R¢RR H ) F A §AIY
7T ALY TR o AFTeeis fagial o1 s STH1 a9 36k gAdern fem, Reoo
% 3T Tl g1 SN FohT T Areste fasial o STger feifid 9fa =1 qes;".

3. A wfafm & U’ 30 Y IUEW (1) H, v oy, ITEve SAfudRl, A deHeRr
F WM W I wawet 91 Sugve i’ wnfud fen S|,

¥, q& Ufad & 9/ 3% °, e (M) ¥ v C'uue WM W, WK U g9 wiyd
fpg =,

. T STfufEm @ urT 3w SUURT (3) H, g CereEd’ % M W, OIS ot vY-un
F 9y aes’’ wnfya feew wmd

& WA SIfufmm & 91 38 1 39U () H, Ul o & TM W, Sied wWifud fean Se wE
ez frefafed weges S S, stafq—

W T TEHR B, TR 1 Tegel ars % SR i @ e v fag o W SRy
T had @9 & 919 Y& fRan S,

. g1 SAfufem & o/ ¥E F @ue (%) ¥ v, ofw i wIme ' sfrean fafiewn T, 2R0¢
(RRo¢ H E. R) & TN |, W, 37w 3R s ufedm arfuftem, 983 (283 &I 38) wfyd
[E2S L

¢. qa ifafam &t am we H,—

(&) @ve (F) ¥, w5 ' Tareh¥ i7"’ & wr W, o ' feq ! senfua forg d;
(8  wvs (@) H, v e fe ! % wm i, v darette fam ! wenfud T S
() @og (M) #H, W e T % i R, v re fe ! wenfud feRu S
(FR)  9YH TG & N R, Frafatea =g wenfad e s, srefq—

g T oY, e o favg odia &t S Wl R, gy -Ueed dfed (EieE)
siffram, 022 % WA B % g4 o T /), oei U@ He # orde sk stfuftam
& qd i diea § Svsfid qaa-m F offR TRw S S,

wiare W,

YRT ] RT WIIEF.

YT o

gRT 3%

AT 34

gRT 3§

gIT ¥§

TN

gT ¥

Al

& T

&HT

&7

T

&7



1010 (2) TEAYRST 19, fedieh 24 e 2011

UL 2. A SfufEm & um w] H, 3NN () F W W, FEfafed suum wefd o,
e, C‘FMH:—

““(3) eThRY B A o YT, et Wik 39 oY =i, ek fon faeg ot 1t R R, gfe
T TR, SHH HIHR HL TR 91 39 Sl Tt 71 U1 Afafied e o gahm st fos
AR 9id 1 & fou 5% STevTs 9ue:

g I8 T o1t mftrerrdt, SO srefiveer fordt T etfusit g1 ARl @i, F9er & fag
gfaufya 72f Som:

T 9 3R fF meyRy o -Tees dfean (Henee) sifufad, 3022 % Y9d € % 9@ &, 99
& A, S ot a1 gadteror wiftemfEt grn srefeey Toea stfuemiiial 1 wfadfia
fru T €, T Tog At g g e fafafyea frg s, .

8T 4o THT T, go. & AufTEm I U yo F WM W, Frfafea yw wenfua #t S, sterfq:—

e, “yo (3) Tved frEl ot T won @ = ferelt verER g1 fET Y EEd W A FHereRk Al
FReE AR fordt ot wma wagon § fordt T A @ s et fea s g
B a1 Tt Ut shrefemel ot forer seres erefirey feprdt Torear fyer il 5T S oTIew i
foren s gt 2, ofR foed #iE erdiar 7 gt 21, ofiR Afs w15 waita g &1 b srefiwey
T SR —

() 7 U sifumf 1 wEm fean € S gw dfem g sud fifed 7 ) E w1, W
(@) 39 yeR Fifed #t 7 I & w@m w9 A oEwd @R, W

(M) 7 o e w1y WA W aifafugel @ gRam sifafrea # R,

Tl HUS 1 holdel I Seiae ATUER el § UH S7es o GHT S9] 98 Sfaq 9He:

T HUSH A7 FeTaed AT Seterad SR, 38 )T o 31efA foh T fopelt svewn o = wrfamE! &
3TIeRA H foret foameren o fafree w01 ot fordt st & WewR 721 o =1 39 T
e, fgama swi f,—

(F) @ IRy, A 9% HUSHA ® TR FT STEET H 96 U&HR & a1 § fHa
T B, FEaedl o Sifam w9 ¥ e oRar ), A

(@) & TRy, I 98 Jg9 Wl §, = i fawern a1 39 TEHR FI, fFaw faeg
g R o e, sToitE &ifa i o

() AUSd I hora? 1 Sgiered SR 39 O & 2nefiH, frdt T ety #, foraes fasg =
at AU B A1 ITF SRy fRE v i &y ordfid Bl 7Y, S WwR e
HET AT Y T IS

(3)  Tore e & wHer fre TdeToT s gure At B Wi w e TE g,
Toarg et for Ut srfare] genfeafa qusa o1 wofe 1 s sifyetd grT wufia &t
TS 2.

(¥)  gAQer & fou wE sTaeT—
(F) 39 dfgar & oo sriieria fodl smew & faws;
(@) W %0 F YN sgew K & fRdl smew & faeg;




TeAYY o, feAid 24 TEmR 2011

1010 (3)

(M & 7w 9% mved & W 7 F iR ywga 9 e mn @), ww W/
IERIRSILIF

TR el T TRy, foreh fareg Tiern 1 maeH TEd fonan =T @1 ¥, HeAuRy -
dfgar (Feited) aifufem, 2022 F wgd €9 F @ TR T €, owi W@ W
T e, TRy W aNE § e feF & o wew femar s

(w)  fordt oft STRY b1 TS0 § Tl Tk I &1 foha SITQ A 3tel TR S i) do
T fedars TR T o ! At 7 6§ TE 81 3R 3% YA 1 e A | e
B

(8) 33U (R) ¥, srafde farddt sma & &1 gu ofi—

(TH) &1 39N (R) & 140 forelt 7t & dely o wrdanfeal Aoed g IR 1 T
i, 9%i 39 oy § waet O dea SfEH g FIE wRA® T8 6] ST

() el SR (2) & e fordt ol & dey o wdarfedal woee] W Seed
IftRt g IRY &1 T BI, 981 3H 9 & ¥ U@ Al & dey H Huey,
Ffed, oy A S AT g A % oifen faer g o @ faxa
W O T Friafedt 999 o T A1 TE SRy WG g, S T aw
sfaa w3,

THHIOT. — 39 4 & FIISH & {0 0 Tora fYsi) Aued & Feley gueg s, ',

2R, 7@ AfufTy ®t ¥ 4 F STER () F WgF b, @vE () #, v TS T3 w
WA W, v '9e fe'! wnfua feu e qen qoi fovm % uve e wnfua feen Se e sus
gyar, frfafe e sia et fea s, etefq —

TR TRt U 3w, Forersh o foreag grfeleiena o eyrees wagd fhan s @1 §, 3eamew 9q-
T dfem (Feie) sifufrm, R028 & 9gd g1 & o ke w7 7, 9% UH e |
AR, 3TRSl i dR@ 9 el T & X wgw fovan s,

R, A AfufEm # a4 H,—
(T#w)  3TEE () H gul faum & o W, Sier wfua fear s ei 3wes qeen frefafed
T o= wenfua foran S, ererfq—

"oty TR W FToES, T AR H, I 9 9 Afuw % fau o ermett gen & akie
T, S oft g g, 8T e s

() IuEW () H quf form & TUH W, Fer wenfud e s ok 3w gee fefated
YLk 31 eenfua feman sTTg, e —

"t Rw w1 FToTE, & AR H, dF " stfus F fa sl geeE w6 ake
Toh, St off g 7, T Uem s,

R3. gA AT ® oar1 43 H, e, of a1 wEE sfoee fafieym TR, 2Ro¢ (RRo¢ W

g Ly

g 4R

gT 43

@i R)" F M W UE, 37 9o HEF IR afufrr, 9283 (%63 &I 38) ' Tofyq fpn  WEER

STd iR veg ‘Al & WM W, wse ¢ yAfd e qen g’ wenfug fey S,

@l

&=

T



1010 (4)

Heqyeel U9, feAiew 24 =R 2011

T 4% <hl WYL

TAHEUT T wiew
EERIN

T 49 &RT

T 4 &I

IMer,

¥, qa AfufEm ®t o’ G & e R), frefafea g wenfa a5 S, sweid—

“uy, 38 stemm | siafdy fored ana % 210 g o UE e srefenfedt S AradE - wigdn
(HeNe) fufEm, 2092 & T € % Sieh g o) Tore SiferRRY 3 wHel gAder
¥ <ifera 2, TX o nfuei) RS9 wehR AT Smart qen fafafyea w6t st 9 fR
7g weieA sifufrem ita gt v gen ElL .

tu. qo sAfufram w5 am wo 3, —

(TR) 3991 (R) #, =< “'Sy@vg ffyerl’ & W W, I T WaR wennfua
[ETESILS
() IIYR (3) a4 (¥) H @ Fwar S,
e&. ot AfufEm F O’ we-F % TeEm, Frefafe e st @ S stei—

“ue-m. (1) T8 dfear # safdy frdt o % g gu o, fuifta oI w6 e S -
TTEd SIS o T o5 ST o Rt IRas1 & Jarsm & fore swi # w1
T TR TH & @ F AR H T B

() STHN (1) F FAIeH & fou, soes fedeg safaal o1 gTarE o1 JFRgH o 51 5
I A T W, S R e sTevdes 9HE, 1 % uveErd fafiEd s fh deitia
W & T T STH 1 RS .

TEHTUT, — 3 9T % TASH & o, gad SO a1 oY ST ¥ 9t 1o 2 S gaw, oy aen
e o ot STRIFEH, R008 (008 FTRW) i URTY I SYLRT () F G (F)
F ITEUS (TF) q () § 3% fog few mw €.,

Q. FE SAUEE o ¥R 4R HI ITUW (2) H, WU (F) ¥/ (¥) & WH R, Fefafea @vs

Tofya ferw g, sterfq:—

“(w) P TR YR e (W BIE) & YAISH & [T STEN ST U ThS A A & @
w feerq §;

(@) Fram-TE F fou wmE F ' F s
(M Srefore EeE F forg ST

(=) sienfre weeE ¥ fag suE;

(¥  afofaes JEsE & fag 3w,

(=) @ AR et (fafrmm ik faem) sfufEm, (30 (/4R 1 &) & 19 & sidatla
T T2 T ST T % g & A

(®) ST T (F) 9 (3) # fafafde forn o yaemt & fi= yesml & fag saam. .



TEYRY T, i 24 FawR 2011 1010 (5)

<. qA AT &t urr we w1 9w S, ST 8¢ T BT
.

R O sfufem &t uw e} H— g 4% WD
(isilal.

(TH) 399N (¥) & WM R, Frafafad suam et & s, qe90iq:—

“(¥) TR iy yEem & faw swEm w T 9f W st fafr ar k% s sE T
el % orur fre feean smom. '

() TR (&) F A9 R smU,

Ro. 7 Afufrm & 9/ Qw F1 & fewen ST 4T R T TSR
SIEIN
Q. Ha Afufrm &t oW /¢ & WH R, frafafad a@ wenfia &t S, stefq— ST ]¢, T TG,

“R¢. il WSH & fog STt S @ et w5 staa fufo gwa ¢ # fiu e fagial ok st frafo,
Frefert & eTaR wnfor qen frer feran smam ofR TR Sy w@iem & fag swm S sn @
ftrt =, 3fea frafor g w) & 27efi sTe T et & STER, fraa feran s, ™.

R. A AfufEm &t 4w /] @1 @ fwa S ST ]R T Tl
S

3. o AfufEm & a1 goo F wH R, Frefafaa um wenfim &t S, SAdig;— T Y00 W
WA,

200, T Yfil Wl TR H, 5 o Frefor foreht TR weeH % fag frn st €1 e 7R gvteor % v
oy ¥ 31 FruRRor gderor & ik qd foman s gt o, o Fruivor s for gm0 oy Sfem Fefor =
GrTfor fema e B, Y f R qe , T Y-S A T %, S G % e g e e
T E, TG T A fren S oF qen o= it i <N ¥, 39 -TSE A1 e F, S
TR % ek g 34 7Y, 98 T | eI g |, @ fruior iy yfe w g g, 19 9
TSIEE 91 TFTF & € T % feam 9 qen o oftwdl &t qen ¥, T o-Ta O oA &%
@‘s’ﬂﬁés%wﬁﬁaaﬁwm:

T S8l HF F TS & fog aifta frd an & 9% uRE 51 91 36F OURE & 99 W He
off T i GuR foman o 7Y, o-i W@ wn w1 i 3@ g e fwen smom = i

&% GUR foran &) 7t T e
6. A Hfufrm w1 ouaR 228 w SUE (R) H, U (T ¥ WF W, UK T TR amr g3k @
4. qo YA T G ¢ H IUEN () H, UK TH TR K WE W, T TH TR grr gre W
. A AYFEM ® w930 H, v ‘v F WM W, WK Td TR W@ oamr g3o @t



1010 (6)

[yl N9, el 24 Fam=R) 2011

gRT 3 T
HleH.
T 233 &7
T,
YT HT TETAT
.
gRT  ¢¥3 &Y
e,
gRT QYR T
HIITeH,
YT Roo T
T,
ST RR9 T
yirer,
gTT  R3¥ W
Hoer.

o, gt Afufaw ot urr 3R H, v ‘T TR F WH W, TR 'TE TR

¢. 7d srfufam w1 U ¢33 & wN R, frAfafas aw wfa st s, sveid—

“933. dfe frd) dedicier #1 98 ydia 1 55 1S smen foreht o =t forelt waren WTe wee, 9
71 I fH o STaTe S H g Srerdl § a1 s fordt Tet v o1 Ste Wl
1 STe1 S H, S U 238 % i Tt fafrea 1 fawa w1 e, stgen uedt €, A 9w
W =nen & fau STReErh =fad #1 S8 5eR #1 3IRw T Wb iR, I tw =t 3w
RV 1 U F Y A I ST LT I g2 GhT SR IHF g2 9H & @ 0o
g T YA R q01 T A, Tedierer & W& fafea sew & o1, forad
el % qel iR ufifeufen o wem faran e B, Ut i @ Qi €6 S ]9 §eIR
T qF I & HHRL

R, & afufram &t ot 9¥3 H, v fem & WM W, w4t wenfya feg S,

30. o SIfufram & 9 Qur H,—

(TF)  SUNE (¥) H, T S TSR T O T W, e ¢ U =rvafda yfit % ISR g w5

() SR (4) F, veg Y TR T R T W, v ¢ U sTafda i & e ged
=g gfaea qen veg, ¢ U H e O T W, IS ¢ U TR w9 wnfie e S,

3¢, 9o fufag &t Ui Qoo H, e (I @ F wH |, v 'F TR wifte e ST
3R, A oifufam ot g/ u ¥, v Ve F i W, T T R

33. & Ifufem &t ¥ 3% H,—

(TH)  SUHRI (R) & wF W, Frefafed seam wanfya w5t s, seiq—

“(R) Trear sk =1 9TEy U H yeRifye foran Srom SR a9 w6t gl @ sifvftEa
HT & IEN W ITEvE AfUE g sifam w9 fan smom.
(A 3R () F W R, Frefafea seum wenfid w s, st
“(3) TE sifan TR use i ww wfa U deEa & wEled # ot S

() 39ER (3) % vvEn, Frefatea soum wenfag ot s, stafq:—

(%) T | G SR IR T4 THARH H A FH 9§ FH Q) fqe wewll & agAd
Y A Fehed W, TGV MUHR], Fogex &1 8 3FAfd 9 a1 T forelt <=
F v w9 o aw sfaa amd,—

(%) =R T # 9fafE § oRads w&= g,



[earyes IS, fedis 24 TR 2011 1010 (7)

() uwerfe & sfaf frear e & afyed &1 @@ w9 & fau frar
T &1 foelt afafE & e sifafea <oer ea 9fa sifufafaa s= e,

3%, qa Afufrad & um k39 H,— O R30I
(TH)  SUHRI (R) I &9 fefar s
() 39YR (3) % N R Frefafaa g onfid s S, stufq—

“(3) T dfew F o A Ty frawt ¥ et WA gU, FeRy, SUEN (R) %
gue (@) # aftid ff = 39 W * Fa Ffuw ot & w7 wfae 9w
Tiea T & IvEE, SUEW (R) H aftfa et swa Wea yfe 1 et gee,
o, e, s, sTeadre, former, meTfaeers, denensh % fmiu @ o=
fordl S SwErh afEsmell & fou, S o T WER 5 S| @i S,
Fqafid HT qHh:

g SUER (1) H Afofa wEE % faw gere vt 78 ofd TR ot =faa ) Fiten wese
% fau Sguafda ar syefeq 7=l =t s,

() S9um (3) % wveEw, feafafea ur oid:wenfua &t s, stefq—

“¥) e TUNT (2) W SeoifEa wESE & fog geeR @ @t T afi @, U faem
3R e TREEE S TSY TR % @i w € A orgefed ¥, fRg
SUHRT (3) & e e ot R, syvady srufterd &1 o ¥, @ hoRy, Ut
forehedl TR 79T HHTET R AN o I SR eie ufEreredl | 3wt frar st
1 gfid A % fore auges & @t yft STy o6t o W sft 39 SR 1 e
3T WG g, T WS * faw yft srgafia s s

3y, ol AU Y URT %2 B ITUR (%) H, T UiE TR F M W, ek VU IR’ aWT %% wT

36 HA SffufEm &1 9 #,— gT Y9 ®T
Hemer.

(Tw) 399N (9) 8§, v ‘g & WH R, I IR TR wfya few ;
(]) 39U (\9) % W 1 A faan S,

39, o Afufee = 9 R¥e H— T ¥ T
woirer,

(TF)  I9UR () H, osg Ui R e & T W, visg ¢ Qe exfirsnfig ofF F SR o
o1 o1 gfaea’’ o vee g TR & T W, weg ¢ T s W e 9 v ek
T Mﬁamm” & qamsﬂq,

() UER (R) A foFam s



1010 (8) Ty To9H, fEAh 24 Fa%R 2011

(@) S (R-U) H, s ‘I I WA R, vss w7 O’ Tfud fee i,
HRT 4o T 3¢. T AfufEm B uR ue H,—
wyirer.

(TF) 399 (8) § v ‘O " & wWE W, v < geR wenfya T

(@) STER (R) ¥ v i TR w997 % W R, = U 4ft F 9eIR e & o
gicea " e Ty ST

() I9W (R) % Iigs 1 @ foran

URT R4y T 3R, ot stfufae &t gy u3 #, v Ui TR R WA W, U ue gSsR e fey
e, ST,

gRT WY AT %o, el AU 1 ¥R Y §, WU (F) B WIS (F-2) & &Y § [ThAiwd fean smg o
Hirer. 39 YER YAhHifEd @ug (F-2) & gd Trefafaa T gue ofq:wenfia e, s, steriq—

() ST TR SN fordt safa o Wi o o ST (2) W ST TR sifueR % ey
ﬁﬁéﬁrﬁw;’i
STERE! SR HNUT AT HEH
TS WIHE! T TRl § R w, 99 WER & 'R W 9fF & Afuwl ¥ defua faast § =mtokE
F, TER Yff F oyl o YHmu F W FW, GEH q0 7Y ST A, IR FHENG -Tee # REed e
@ < qd1 JAH & foemAm IvEe i Tifaa w6 aw o gfg F & g ¥ Asuky -Usa gied, 2]ul
(AT 0 T 2R’4R) W Hfaua Fuie warfad €. ohenfier qen s9 ST ufesell # werdd w1 g9 S @l
gfte ¥ R oo AR forn w1 @ Heifta qon frear oo & ot siid & gen erfufafiaa = d aen o= 9ft & =auada
Y ddfya foemm Susdl ot fR @ s & fau ot 39 sifufem 8 wgfed deiem wwafaa €.
. fatmw #) ger fasimard frergan §:—
() @vE }—yfH = IR Y Herae gRI SR ANiGRieh TGl o STIHR Sfaeia fahan s,
(R) T8 3—TBHICRR, TS/ AHel! i, erefseell &1 ofafta =ei i

(3)  WUS §—oTEd Wl Y AT % SIF Yt ISR 1 @Y Wied ke iF T2 TS R ST Fel.

(¥) IO % SO hee TSed AUSd gRI G S Hehl,
(b))  @UE }—3Tiid, qAfdeR aun gdam & fore oa-die &9 & T §.
(8)  @US Qo—IE Aen Ffquft &l feran sam.

(9)  WUE 33—V I e T 9R | 9 0 9 At & fan wufia w2 feen s,



Teyes eI, {24 TR 2011 1010 (9)

(¢)

(R)

(%0)

(22)

(*R)

(q®)

(%)

(q4)

(r&)

TUE Q& R ¥R—T TR 7R frisft el 3 o= o 4 stfuerl | weifem faarei & =mafotaa & feg
T TR BT WIerRa e a1 B, W@ wwell § fafae =maem o stfuemfiarn afsi =t 7 .

Gug Qu—Muifa v-Tewa 1 enen Y- Uea ST 5T a1 Y ST & Y IWI H @ S o
Sl ¥R TH $ @M H IR T 37 BT

GUg ¢ —Y-Twed & Truito & ferg, wfy uft &, srvads =, fam & yasm, fuftes s, st
YIS, AT FAISH, T YIeH a1 317 Fasm! § qraiiead fohar ST,

Gug J¥—YfH % TR I F MER W -T7ea & Faio & fow susiy gamefae fe m €.

WUE Y, RE, RY, ¢, 1], 3o, I, 33, 3¥, 3, 3¢, IR, Yo AU ¥ -Higar # foemm oA & U=l FY
e foran e © qen 3 gfg i E € qen sifusewor 3R fh % o1ay e % AEE! § AN Hi A
%1 Y1 & TR god ¥ Sl TR,

GUS 34— T FT TEHMA F qU1 FHeaed F 74 Aot ¥, ITGUS AR H, UM & KR o= w5
wiaftedl o weR gfteds w3 % e € 39 aifafiea seerfea oft = sifufafea &0 & fog wivea
ERIRICIES

WU 3§ —FFR h, TS i gy aen R woes H srfufafea o= fi & R wfow © sifte &1 e
S STERT gfEsEe % foe sgafda s % T wiftend feen T R,

TUE 3§ —harded I, Far wae H ifufafaa i o, T faswra qen st afEsmet & fag, it
fo < SwRitt ufismnd w= ¥, s frear etfuet o6t gftd e & Tore wmges & 1 o sifoma s e
R, YT F F fare wiferepa e e B

3T HT WIfenHes Ty qen o1 yha & ¥, former forg fordt voedieror ot stavashar 781 &,

. om: e fadww wEa R

iaTe

wyor fdg ant

qEE R TR, Ro22. qRETHF TEE.

TR, ITEHE g0 991 e Th, Fevcy g e HE YEened, e ¥ gfkd den wERiE—2011



TH J9HES www.govtpressmp.nic.in ¥
off TR wie faran 1 g .

f

% 536 ] e, YR, i 30 FawR 2011—3TUEHET 9 W 1933

fafy ok faurh & fawm
ofrore, i 30 Fawr, 2011
. 7026-405-SFRIG-31(W.).—9RA & WA F TS 348 F GUL (3) F ITHU U, HEAYSY 4-TrEd
dfea (deier) faumes, 2011 (FHEF 31 T 2011) &1 ST TTAR TTA & WIUHR ¥ TAggRl Wehriema fohan

T R

HEYRRT & TSI & AW & a0l SRR,
AT A1, TR Gied.

1071



1072 TeAYey Uodd, feAid 30 TR 2011

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 31 or 2011.

THE MADHYA PRADESH LAND REVENUE CODE
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2011

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Clauses :
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of Section 2.
3. Amendment of Section 30.
4.  Amendment of Section 34.
5.  Amendment of Section 35.
6.  Amendment of Section 36.
7.  Amendment of Section 46.
8. Amendment of Section 47.
9, Amendment of Section 49.
10. Substitution of Section 50.
11.  Amendment of Section 51.
12.  Amendment of Section 52.
13.  Amendment of Section 53.
14. Substitution of Section 54,
15. Amendment of Section 57.
16. Insertion of Section 58-B.
17. Amendment of Section 59.
18. Deletion of Section 78.
19.  Amendment of Section 81.
20. Deletion of Section 97.
21. Substitution of Section 98.
22. Deletion of Section 99.
23. Substitution of Section 100.
24.  Amendment of Section 119.
25. Amendment of Section 128.
26. Amendment of Section 130.
27. Amendment of Section 132.
28. Substitution of Section 133,
29. Amendment of Section 143.
30. Amendment of Section 172.
31. Amendment of Section 200.
32. Amendment of Section 227.
33. Amendment of Section 234.
34. Amendment of Section 237.
35. Amendment of Section 241.
36. Amendment of Section 247.
37. Amendment of Section 248.
38. Amendment of Section 250.
39. Amendment of Section 253.

I~
=

Amendment of Section 257.



qegyey Uoigd, fediem 30 Taw=R 2011

1072(1)

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 31 or 2011.

THE MADHYA PRADESH LAND REVENUE CODE
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2011

A Bill further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code, 1959.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-second year of the Republic
of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code (Amendment) Act,
2011.

2. In sub-section (1) of Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code, 1959
(No. 20 of 1959) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), after clause (o), the following clause
shall be inserted, namely :—

“(0oa) “Market Value” means the value of land assessed according to guidelines issued
by the Collector under the Madhya Pradesh Bajar Mulya Margdarshak Siddhanton
ka Banaya Jana Tatha Unka Punrikshan Niyam, 2000 made under the Indian
Stamp Act, 1899 (No. 2 of 1899);”.

3. In sub-section (1) of Section 30 of the Principal Act, for the words “A Collector, a Sub-
Divisional Officer, or a Tahsildar”, the words “A Collector or a Sub-Divisional Officer” shall be
substituted.

4. In section 34 of the Principal Act, in clause (c), for the word “fifty”, the words “one
thousand” shall be substituted.

5. In sub-section (3) of Section 35 of the Principal Act, for the word “apply”, the words
“apply along with his affidavit” shall be substituted.

6. In sub-section (1) of Section 36 of the Principal Act, for full stop, the colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that each party may be granted not more than three adjournments during the
entire hearing of the case and each such adjournment should be granted only
with cost.”.

7. In clause (a) of Section 46 of the Principal Act, for the words, figures and bracket “the
Indian Limitation Act, 1908 (IX of 1908)”, the words, figures and bracket “the Limitation Act,
1963 (36 of 1963)” shall be substituted.

8. In Section 47 of the Principal Act,—

) in clause (a), for the words “forty-five days”, the words “thirty days” shall be
" substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the words “sixty days”, the words “forty-five days” shall be
substituted;

(iii) in clause (c), for the words “ninety days”, the words “sixty days” shall be

substituted;

Short title.

Amendment
Section 2.

Amendment
Section 30.

Amendment
Section 34.

Amendment
Section 35.

Amendment
Section 36.

Amendment
Section 46.

Amendment
Section 47.

of

of

of

of

of

of



1072(2) YRy TSy, i 30 TawR 2011

(@iv) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that where the order, against which the appeal is being preferred, made before
the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code (Amendment)
Act, 2011, in such case appeal shall be entertained within the time limit provided
in the Code prior to this said Amendment Act.”.

Amendment of 9. In Section 49 of the Principal Act, for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be
Section 49. substituted, namely :—

“(3) After hearing the parties, the appellate authority may confirm, vary or reverse the
order appealed against, or may take such additional evidence as it may consider
necessary for passing its order :

Provided that the appellate authority shall not remand the case for disposal by any Revenue
Officer subordinate to it:

Provided further that all such cases which have been remanded to the sub-ordinate Revenue
Officers by the Appellate or Revisional Authorities before the commencement of
the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code (Amendment) Act, 2011 shall be heard
and decided by such Revenue Officer.”

Substitution of 10. For section 50 of the Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,
Section 50. namely :—
Revision. “50. (1) The Board may, at any time on its motion or on the application made by any party

or the Collector or the Settlement Officer may, at any time on his motion, call for the record of
any case which has been decided or proceeding in which an order has been passed by any Revenue
Officer subordinate to it or him and in which no appeal lies thereto, and if it appears that such
subordinate Revenue Officer.—

(a) has exercised a jurisdiction not vested in him by this Code, or
(b) has failed to exercise a jurisdiction so vested, or
(c) has acted in the exercise of his jurisdiction illegally or with material irregularity,

the Board or the Collector or the Settlement Officer may make such order in the case as
it or him thinks fit:

Provided that the Board or the Collector or the Settlement Officer shall not, under this
section, vary or reverse any order made, or any order deciding an issue, in the
course of the proceeding, except where,—

(a) the order, if it had been made in favour of the party applying for revision to the
Board, would have finally disposed of the proceedings, or

(b) the order, if allowed to stand, would occasion a failure of justice or cause irreparable
injury to the party against whom it was made.

(2) The Board or Collector or the Settlement Officer shall not, under this section vary or
reverse any order against which an appeal lies either to the Board or to any Revenue Officer
subordinate thereto.



[eqyey N9, foid 30 FawR 2011

1072(3)

(3) A revision shall not operate as a stay of proceeding before the Revenue Officer except
where such proceeding is stayed by the Board or the Collector or the Settlement Officer, as the
case may be.

(4) No application for revision shall be entertained.—
(a) against an order appealable under this Code;
(b) against an order to the Settlement Commissioner under section 210;
(c) unless presented within sixty days to the Board:

Provided that where the order, against which the application for revision is being presented,
made before the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code
(Amendment) Act, 2011, in such case revision shall be entertained within ninety
days from the date of order.

(5) No order shall be varied or reversed in revision unless notice has been served on the
parties interested and opportunity given to them of being heard.

(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1),—

(i) where proceedings in respect of any case have been commenced by the Board under
sub-section (1), no action shall be taken by the Collector or the Settlement Officer
in respect thereof;

(ii) where proceeding in respect of any such case have been commenced by the Collector
or the Settlement Officer under sub-section (1), the Board may either rafrain from
taking any action under this section in respect of such case until the final disposal
of such proceedings by the Collector or the Settlement Officer, as the case may
be, or may withdraw such proceedings and pass such order as it may deem fit.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section all Revenue Officers shall be deemed to
be subordinate to the Board.”.

i1. In clause (iii) of the proviso to sub-section (1) of Section 51 of the principal Act, for
the words “ninety days”, the words “sixty days” shall be substituted and for full stop, the colon
shall be substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that where the order, against which the application for review is being presented,
made before the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code
(Amendment) Act, 2011, in such case review shall be entertained within ninety
days from the date of order.

12. In Section 52 of the Principal Act,—
(1) in sub-section (2), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that the execution of order shall not be stayed for more than three months at
a time or until the date of next hearing, whichever is earlier.”;

Amendment of
Section 51.

Amendment of
Section 52.



1072(4)

Heggey Toge, feqies 30 TR 2011

Amendment of
Section 53.

Substitution of
Section 54.

Pending revisions

Amendment of
Section 57.

Insertion of
Section 58-B.

Half of the
assessed land
revenue shall be
payable for
holding used
exclusively for
the purpose of a
project of micro
and small
enterprise.

Amendment of
Section 59.

Deletion of
Section 78.

(i) in sub-section (3), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely -—

“Provided that the execution of order shall not be stayed for more than three months at
a time or until the date of next hearing, whichever is earlier.”;

13. In Section 53 of the principal Act for the words, figures and bracket “Indian Limitation
Act, 1908 (IX of 1908)”, the words, figures and bracket “ Limitation Act, 1963 (36 of 1963)”
shall be substituted and for the word “review”, the words “review and revision” shall be substituted.

14. For Section 54 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,
namely :(—

“54. Notwithstanding anything contained in this chapter, all proceedings pending in revision
before any Revenue Officer immediately before the coming into force of the Madhya Pradesh Land
Revenue Code (Amendment) Act, 2011 shall be heard and decided by such Revenue Officer as if
this amendment Act had not been passed.”.

15. In Section 57 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “Sub-divisional Officer” the words “State Government”
shall be substituted;
(i1) sub-sections (3) and (4) shall be deleted.

16. After Section 58-A of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely :(—

“58-B. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Code, only half of the assessed land
revenue shall be payable in respect of a holding upto two hectares used exclusively for the purpose
of a project of micro and small enterprise.

(2) For the purpose of sub-section (1), the Collector shall, after affording reasonable
opportunity of being heard to the persons interested and after making such enquiry as he may
deem necessary, decide that the concerning holding is of project of micro and small enterprise.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this Section, the micro enterprise and small enterprise shall
have the same meaning as assigned to them in sub-clause (i) and (ii) of clause (a) of sub-section
(1) of Section 7 of the Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises Development Act, 2006 (No. 27 of
2006).”.

17. In sub-section (1) of Section 59 of the principal Act, for clause (a) to (e), the following
clauses shall be substituted, namely :—

“(a) for the purpose of agriculture of such farm house which is situated on holding
of one acre or more;

(b) as sites for dwelling houses;

() for educational purpose;

(d) for industrial purpose;

(e) for commercial purpose

€] for the purpose of mining under a mining lease within the meaning of the Mines
and Minerals (Regulation and Development) Act, 1957 (No. 67 of 1959);

(2) for purpose other than those specified in items (a) to (f) above.”.

18. Section 78 of the principal Act shall be deleted.



Hegesl T, faqie 30 TR 2011

1072(5)

19. In Section 81 of the principal Act,—
0] for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely —

“(4) the fair assessment on land used for non-agricultural purpose shall be fixed in
accordance with the rules made under section 59.”;

(ii) sub-section (6) shall be deleted.
20. Section 97 of the principal Act shall be deleted.
21. For Section 98 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely :—

“98. The fair assessment of lands used for agricultural purpose shall be calculated and fixed
in accordance with the principles and restrictions set forth in Section 81 and lands used for non-
agricultural purpose shall be fixed in accordance with the rules made under section 59.”.

22. Section 99 of the principal Act shall be deleted.
23. For Section 100 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“100. In the case of lands which are being assessed for a purpose with reference to which
they were assessed immediately before the revision, the assessment so arrived at exceeds, in the
case of agricultural land one and a half times the land revenue or rent and in the case of other
lands six times the land revenue or rent payable immediately before the revision the assessment
shall be fixed at one and a half times such land revenue or rent in the case of agricultural land
and at six times such land revenue or rent in the case of other lands:

Provided that where an improvement has been effected at any time in any holding held for
the purpose of agriculture by or at the expense of the holder thereof, the assessment of such holding
shall be fixed as if the improvement had not been made.”.

24. In sub-section (1) of Section 119 of the principal Act, for the word “twenty-five”, the
words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

25. In sub-section (2) of Section 128 of the principal Act, for the words “one rupee”, the
words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

26. In Section 130 of the principal Act, for the word “fifty”, the words “one thousand” shall
be substituted.

27. In Section 132 of the principal Act, for the word “one thousand”, the words “ten
thousand” shall be substituted.

28. For Section 133 of the principal Act, the following Section shall be substituted, namely :—

“133. If a Tahsildar finds that any obstacle impedes the free use of a recognised road, path
or common land of a village or impedes the road or water course or source of water which has
been the subject of a decision under section 131, he may order the person responsible for such
obstacle to remove it and if such person fails to comply with the order, may cause the obstacle
to be removed and may recover from such person the cost of removal thereof and such person
shall be liable, under the written order of a Tahsildar stating the facts and circumstances of the
case, to a penalty with may extend to ten thousand rupees.”.

Amendment of

Section 81.
Deletion of
Section 97.
Substitution of
Section 98.

Fair assessment.

Deletion of
Section 99.

Substitution of
Section 100.

Fixation of fair
assessment at the
time of revision.

Amendment of
Section 119.

Amendment of
Section 128.

Amendment of
Section 130.

Amendment of
Section 132,

Substitution of
Section 133.

Removal of
obstruction.



1072(6)

YRy TS, & 30 T’ 2011

Amendment of
Section 143.

Amendment of
Section 172.

Amendment of
Section 200.

Amendment of
Section 227.

Amendment of
Section 234,

Amendment of
Section 237.

29. In section 143 of the Principal Act, for the word “ten”, the word “hundred” shall be
substituted.

30. In Section 172 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such diverted land” shall be substituted,

(i) in sub-sction (5), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such diverted land” and for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

31. In section 200 of the Principal Act, for the words “two hundred”, the words “two
thousand” shall be substituted.

32. In Section 227 of the Principal Act, for the word “twenty”, the words “one thousand”
shall be substitated.

33. In section 234 of the Principal Act,
(i) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(2) A draft of the Nistar Patrak shall be published in the village and after ascertaining
the wishes of the Gram Sabha, it shall be finalised by Sub-Divisional Officer.”;

(ii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) A copy of the Nistar Patrak so finalised shall be kept in the office of the Gram
Panchayat.”;

(iii) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(4) On a resolution passed by the Gram Sabha by a majority of not less than two
thirds of the members present and voting, the Sub-Divisional Officer with the
prior sanction of the Collector and also after making any such inquiry as he
deems fit, may,—

(a) inter se change the entries in the Nistar Patrak;

(b) record additional unoccupied land under any entry in the Nistar Patrak for
fulfillment of further Nistar rights of villagers.”.

34. In section 237 of the Principal Act,—
(i) sub-section (2) shall be deleted,
(ii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) Subject to the rules made under this Code, the Collector after securing the land
mentioned in clause (b) of sub-section (1) to minimum two percent of the total
agriculture land of that village, may divert such unoccupied land as mentioned
in sub-section (1) into abadi or for construction of roads, state highways,
national highways, canals, tanks, hospitals, schools, colleges, Goshalas and any
other public utility projects as may be determined by the State Government:



TEAYT TS, fedi 30 =R 2011

1072(7)

Provided that the land set apart for the purposes mentioned in sub-section (1) shall
not be diverted and allotted to any person for agriculture purpose.;

(iii) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted; namely :—

“(4) When it becomes indispensable to divert the land set apart for the purposes
mentioned in sub-section (1) for such development and infrastructural projects
which are owned or approved by the State Government but not covered under
sub-section (3), the Collector, after satisfying himself on alternatives available
and also on obtaining land of equivalent area for fulfilling the same Nistar
rights from the concerned project, may divert the land for such purposes by

passing a reasoned order to this effect.”.

35. In sub-section (4) of Section 241 of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand”,
the words “fifty thousand* shall be substituted.

36. In Section 247 of the Principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (7), for the word “double”, the words “four times” shall be substituted;
(ii) proviso to sub-section (7) shall be omitted.

37. In Section 248 of the Principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such encroached land” and for the words “twenty rupees”,
the words “five hundred rupees in non urban area and two thousand rupees in
urban area” shall be substituted;

(ii) sub-section (2) shall be omitted,

(iif) in sub-section (2-A), for the words “three months”, the words “six months” shall be
substituted.

38. In section 250 of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (6), for the words “two hundred and fifty”, the words “two thousand”
shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (9), for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “twenty per centum
of the market value of such land” shall be substituted;

(iii) proviso to sub-section (9) shall be omitted.

39. In section 253 of the Principal Act, for the words “five thousand”, the words “fifty
thousand” shall be substituted.

40. In section 257 of the Principal Act, clause (a) shall be renumbered as clause (a-1) and
before clause (a-1) as so renumbered, the following new clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(a) any decision regarding any right under sub-section (1) of section 57 between the State
Government and any person;”.

Amendment of
Section 241.

Amendment of
Section 247.

Amendment of
Section 248.

Amendment of
Section 250.

Amendment of
Section 253.

Amendment of
Section 257,



1072(8)

TAYeY Uy, e 30 FawR 2011

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

With a view to adjudicate revenue cases expeditiously, to provide for adjudication of disputes regarding rights
in land at the level of the State Government, to check wrongful alienation of government land, to promote micro
and small enterprises by giving them concession in reassessed land revenue and to revise and enhance the existing
provisions of fines, certain amendments are proposed in the Madhya Pradesh Land Revenue Code, 1959 (No. 20
of 1959). Also to restructure to existing provisions regarding preparation of the Nistar Patrak and diversion of Charnoi
and other land as recorded under any head of the Nistar Patrak to facilitate the establishment of industrial and
public utility projects, suitable amendments are also proposed in the said Act.

2. The salient features of the Bill are as follows —

6y
@
3

4
®)

(6)
0
®)

®

(10)

an

12

(13)

14)

Clause 2-Market value of the land to be determined as per the guide lines issued by the Collector.
Clause 3-Tehsildar not to transfer revenue cases to sub-ordinates.

Clause 6-Only three adjournments each with cost may be granted to each party during the hearing
of the revenue cases.

Revision applications can be heard only by the Revenue Board and Collector.

Clause 9-Time limit for appeal, review and revision to be reduced to forty five days, sixty days
and sixty days respectively.

Clause 10-No case shall be remanded.
Clause 13-Execution of orders shall not be stayed for more than three months at a time.

Clause 16-and 42-To authorize the State Government to adjudicate the disputes regarding rights
in land between the State and private persons. The jurisdications of the Civil court to be barred
in such cases.

Clause 17-Half of the assessed land revenue to be payable for land holdings upto 2 hectares used
exclusively for micro and small enterprises.

Clause 18-Diversion of agricultural land to be reclassified into dwelling purpose, educational
purpose, industrial purpose, commercial purpose, mining purpose and other purposes for assessment
of land revenue.

Clause 24-Provisions for assessment of land revenue based on the market value of the land to be
incorporated.

Clauses 25, 26, 27,28, 29, 30, 32, 33, 34, 37, 38, 39, 40 and 41-To revise and enhance the existing
provisions of fines in the Code and also to link the quantum of fines in cases of encroachment
and illegal diversion to the market value of the land.

Clause 35-Sub Divisional Officer to be authorized for bringing about inter-se changes in the entries
of the village Nistar Patrak as well as to enter additional unoccupied land in the same with the
consent of the Gram Sabha and with the prior sanction of the Collector.

Clause 36-Collector to be authorized to divert the charnoi land in excess of 2% and also other
land recorded in the Nistar Patrak for public utility projects only.



[egey TS, el 30 =R 2011 1072(9)

(15) Clause 36-Collector to be authorized to divert the land recorded in the Nistar Patrak for such
development and infrastructure projects that are not public utility projects by obtaining land of
equivalent area for fulfillment of the same Nistar rights.

(16) Other amendments are consequential and minor in nature which call for no explanation.
3. Hence this Bill.

Bhopal :
Dated the 19* November, 2011. KARAN SINGH VERMA

Member-in-Charge

frei=res, oo gRu a1 AEA W, TeTIey gRT WS i HRUIed, AiMe 9 Hisd 99 TEiia—2011.





