T AT www.govipressmp.nic.in q
f SR de e s e 2.

wHIE 142] qiure, TEaR, i 29 7 2012—=F 9, WH 1934
faum v wfaareE, geaucy

ai9rE, feqie 29 7 2012

%. 8746-Ta.9.-faum-2012. —meycw faum w1 & ufsean qen & deree ded f9m 64 & 3uadl & weH o
Heyy () (Heied) fadwss, 2012 (Wi 11 T 2012) < faum @w # feaiw 28 @ 2012 1 qrEenfd gam
¥, SR H g % g yemifya T s R

TAFAT TS
@ g,
Heayeyl faum T

283



284 TewEy Tas, T 29 °E 2012

qeauyT fagaes

AR 28 T R0%R

TeAYRIT 9 ( Wlerd ) fagkmes, o9
forer- e,

g, Gftrd M iR iy
. & W @ HeeE
3. UW 3 R YA
¥, YN ¥-F H A,
YN ¥ H FEA,
& YR 4 T GINEA.
. U & T HAHA.
¢ UW R~ I WA
Q. YW -7 =T 3.
0. NI Qo T HHIEA.
2. HNT 2% T WAL
. U - H WM.
3. U ¥ H GRTEA
¥, U 2 T HIMEA.
4. HRI ¢ T HINEA.
& M Ro T HIMYA.
QY HRT ¥ T FINEA.
R¢. U ¢ FH HINEA.
R, U ¥3 K GEIEA
" Q0. R ¥§ W GYIEAL
2. HRT %9 T G
. U 43 B HAEA.
3. U W9 T TN,
¥, N \wo T HINEA.
. UNT g W WG,
6. STIHHT L H GG,
o, STTEET R H HUEA.



HEYRyl U9, famfed 29 A= 2012 284 (1)

ey faegaeR

i 2 WY R02R
HAYIYT 9 (EWole ) fadaen, j09R
TeyRY A AfufTEm, RooR @ R Wylifta e ¥g fadas

NRd TR & fvgasd o o neawey faum-dea g fefafea v o 9w sifufmafa ) o—
2. (2) T8 sfufrm =1 dfdwa 9@ weraey 92 (fed dwem) atfufem, Q093 ©. wfera w3

(R) (%) 39 WeNyA fufom #9023 F @US (BF) & SUEY 2 ST, Y00} H YA
BT HHE S
(@) T8 99YA Ifufam &t umT 8 & WU (IN) F Iy ¢ 37U, 008 W 32 TTH,
ool TF YW U HHAY WU,
() 39 wEA At F AW ITEY ¢ 1, R0 W I wI

R. HEAWRW FE ATUFRW, 003 (FHIH 0 F R00R) (S 399 T0F W U sifufrm & 9m  gea, o =7
¥ fifde ¥) & geq oid & wm W, frefataa geq o wenfia faa sy, svefq— woler,

ey TS B O F AR 9 i W, WeHl W R oK w5 o W SR 9
A W R % IgUR v Atufrem

3. 7 At &t U)o 3 H— o 3 IR,
(TF) Suur (3) H—
(%) @8 (F) & WA W, FrAfafaa @ve wnfia feu s, srafq:—
“(=) foum emyed, arﬁrmva»‘{;
(F &) HHew, Fivrsgs w3

(@) @ve (F) #, vt 3R 1 &9 fva ST we wve (V) % WA W, Mefaied e
Tfyq forq S, sverfq:—

“(w) g, aftias w5 ok
()  HUuH g8, !

() 394w (R) ¥, 7reg ' g anforfres #R % T W, v ¢ engaa Ao+, fomi
R, anfvrfsges o)’ wenfya fFa o efik

() 3w (3) & W |, frafafee Suumr wenfra =) S, stefq—

“(3) omgw, aifufe @Y, foRiv oTgaa, anfoiiaes o, Semerss, anfoifsrs & aen
A AH, efoioreh o wogul T 9 39 wAE w1 wAm I q
I A w7l HI U B S 39 Afufan gR A 39 i ST
T T € M 3E i fvg T ¥ s v el ¥ fog 59 siffm
#, e % uf ford T fopelt off Frdw B T aref wmEn Smom fE o fad
ST, ATOITaeh Y, HTeTeh, aies T q9 TR R, AvIieds 6T 6
ufa ferm g frdw €.




284 (2) Tegyey Teras, fears 29 A 2012

ST ¥-F T ¥, qd AUMHT w9 ¥-% H, I () & wE R), fAfafaa suamn wenfia s oS,
Wﬁ%ﬁ'. ag]'kt__

(3) oUW ¥§ H SUUW (§) F e emed W, ordid Wig, SOl g wEd fRT T
e & PR N four 0 & wwE T8 oty & a4 dF | Yue feew
I FHAEY & T T ey Wikd Y W IR Iyde oiE, 39 onew H faffde
TWIH & SH wAEY F iR o1died o e o

W W& U et 1 Fraer T srey H faffdw T w6t Se sty & i
T o W 2, =l erdia oS, =R 3R 3w ffrw v e g s
R R TE FYH 8 91 W fF ede % fwer § faera =i % SR 786
BT T, TH &I wramaty § stia &1 fafwew g1 @ gfe == s

aRT ¥-" W . HE IrUfEm w U ¥-w W, SuEW (3) % W W, frEfaiad STem wefta et S,
T, Tt —

“(3) T ®IH GIAE W @] ST IS BT e A1 FIE A GSH TR yho # S
T A § gafa g1 fSee #=, o v wia wt ga uf, S fE g
o & TYRor TRt g 10 6 TR B, TE g v 9 ATus A B, e
FL GHT SR eremer, TRl fodiy weor & fwer & o dfm ey wewn 9
feet a7 arelt oy @ fea s T o o1avds €9 9 Ush <ias 98

ST & AT HEA. € & fufem &t gy H, Sua (R) #, weg VS Suum % o1 @ A feen S,

o & T TR, v, 7o FAfufEm # 9| g W, STE () H, e anE A % WM W, I, aRE Helvet
e’ ety feu =,

YT R-& T <. HA Afufrm =1 a -9 ﬁ,—

e,

(Tw)  S9UW (%) H, Teg SR i um 37 F T W, vsE, ofF ofiT o7eR w3 3R
a7 3 &' e feu S,

@) 39 (W) H, ol faum % e W, wer st e s iR 39 avem, frefated
TgE SISl I, Sfefd—

g Tl B e, S T kA @ w1 R T R fe
T % SR U T W AR e w e orgRa W ¥, WA & Ieie e
9 F9 F fon smom. "

YT R -7 T 37e: Q. Ho stfufaw &t 9 ]-@ & wER fFrefafad o/ st w5 s, sgiq—

ESICEN
“R-T. W& WAt G © WY T WA T Y.

. (%) T UREgThd ALY U59 # ed A1l gR | ST SH a9l T8 01 W R 6,
o for o9 TR sferger gm0 fafidese =y, e 6 < 8 o



gegyey UeTad, feaisw 29 O 2012

284 (3)

i el =t o1 forelt s frmfan, S qeey U9 &SI A1 SRl SRAR il

(@)

m

(=)

(=)

(=)

&, W = fodt 0 =afim & 7 & gdy § ®Ig & 29 &l 8L

Qe (F) % 17 Ifugfaa @ = g gfafie & 9 eiggE-R % wlaH
(3) ¥ faffde X @ W | o IgUeia .

SRt @1 el Wi et e T R, A Shdet AW AE w1 et v fea
T ¥, FEl 7l W oyEfad g 9 WS ISR .

Sl I, "I % W % T % fRE A g @ S S g, 9@t Aqn
Ry qEE e W R SgURIII B

&t A, R Ao g Ueg % el R e 8 TS & fia fedt e
H A T & AR fFR o T F TR Tl wm w9 U R
Tordlt o | TS o AT foRdlt of T @i fofeg T | BT A1 U9 6 I’
fordt T 9 T=a & i et o o & foog o Tsa & d9 H
I &9 | gt fopan ST ', 98t T % fi a0 9 de6iba e
T A <F B

A o ST 916l I o1 99 <afed 3ra |y yiagenal g fafea ge9 9 St
= T TEE W

TR (]) F ST X F YAM w1 gl ww diagTeRdl OE Ofa #, S fw
fafea =1 S, @& &1 ASEHa FOOm

g afc ufiagehdl, @ ST ST @ AI6 61, 917 29 & 14 Aida o1 ¥ R-@ &

- ()

(=)

(m

31 aiferrifed (TRIee) @ €, @ U dfagTsal § 39 SUaR & 18R
WrEdiwa g9 w1 e & 6 S,

Hig TIEIRd AR A1 H13 afcehiied (TRIe) o fafar st st 7 fadt
oftagTehal |, 3V TR (3) F A FX FH P F H UREN IEEE T,
qr T T & i 6t fEe o1 gran won =1 v Afg o aon T Fremafy & oW
M, 34 T FH & 3 o g foean s, Sieh f fafea &t S,

@rE (%) & I o Faa TF A g geaus =9 & offa) a1 i<y
SR TE I & STJshA H o1 9Rd U9 &9 & amel Fafd & o1 qwu ° faswa
foran S ®, =1 U@ Ter @ forgert o & fafmio @ ydews § 39l fean wen
B q91 39 TR FfHa o1 yeitra 7ra & meryey U % a1 sl sman
e SAI0ST o SRA W A1 WA T &1 % ARl Al o STgd | fasea fean
S &, = forgen fordt wam % fafmfon & g faran san € ofk 39 weR fAfHa
T T U {-T & I H AW fFa1 S 8, Haftd 98 W X & Heoiy
o < foran ST A e TR Smam.

g (%) & A & &1 a1 Fad T 98 W & ey H fopen Srwm =
S fohan ST, S Teayey U & fieR 1 siaisia SR wd anforsd o 3Tshd
T 9a T &9 % 9 % orwn ¥ fawa fRu w T % foma o
W 9 R




284 (4)

Heqyes TeT9d, fediw 29 A 2012

g7

g0

T

) (=)

(@)

(m

(=0

(%)

(W)

(8)

(9)

STUYEd A1 1 s e 91 W S 91 2 & A Fis WrEied s
®, W UW R-W % e afcewifed (TRiee) wig wer Tt 8, g aftas e
F WA TEAM F o T n H A SUER () F ST T W B HAA BT

g (%) & A WH H wAd N W, ATERd AR A allcihiicd
(TRiee) wori fafar, afge=mdl o a1 &t Heldl 1 TF YAO-99 U0 T8990
Afa A, S fw fafeq =t s, Sd o,

T I FHA T TH-T, GEgTmal F U0 GHEgER % Gay d T W F qiFa
HT 3T=31 R vyafw e B 3R 39 UER FE TE WH SHE g iE Ofa
o, St 1 fafeq = S, wamEfea =) S

WEIFa = @ afewifea (TRies) woq fmia, @ve (F) & o1efia wdt
& T U E AfaeE % w9 W W ST ST (3) F ot Fedfe w9 9
TR fEe # e & S &l

WrEisa =M a1 aifcsifed (TRes) wed fmla, @vg (%) & o1dH wdt
St g T A TET RON S IYER (3) F 1A wiedf ©9 9 STRd e
F Y & AfafE &l

IUUT (3) F e fde, Suum (¥) & e < ufdn @i 3@ erfufem & efim
T W F foeg gurafea =t sma.

T AYMIT & ITEY, ITUW (R) & F¥H FF YaE T SR IRagTwal @,
JUTEvId qRadT |fgd o] &

TR TEHTUT—

T YR % gANH & ol —

()

(@)

m

‘et g e ], ergEt-) A fafifde 9w,

‘e A | eifia €, HieX wm erfufem, 2’¢e (FIE 4R T 2’¢e) & oY
% STl wig A AM, e fedl T8 9 @ dam gor 9fiwfea g

“aRagTerat”’ @ o1fla ¥, fedt WX 9 g HeyRy R TST 6 H W 98l |
TR A6 1 IRaeT 6 den |Aafew.

Ro. Tl AUl 1 9w g0 H—

() wsg AR i 93" F WH W, @ ke N 9 AW B, K, fF SR ey

(=N

“ar-3 R 9m 3 % e feu S,

I9URI () H @us (W) # Sugve () w1 o fww S



ey TS, foqis 29 A 2012 284 (5)

(d9)  39ur (3) = wvEE, Frefafed Suam siazenft w g, stefq —

“(e-w) 3uEm (1) H ofafde fRd yfaga 9 F g0 gu o, wnffa, fagg o=t @
fogq o1 o1 fogq oot & saaed H 3udi fee U wia o dey H 39Em (R)
o T 4 gfowd & W R IR foren Smam, afe far et o o, —

() 7Ry T F i fawa @ fa= fed yor foan s
(@) 9 WK Hl, T TR 5N ARy U9 & X S99 o fhan S €;

(1) YA GER F1 1 fhd o9 1 S Aemey T & i Yoo & fmio, duro
T Gaead H Iy & o foeen s €

(9) T~9 R &I, 39 TER R 3949 ¥g fovan smn €5

(%) Tordlt Tt wiftreror &Y, T8 WifysRtor g0 geaifia ardeiiaes e ot | an fedt
IR TS 91 G @ & g e o o § Sudm % e feen
S

(=) TRt Fuw I, TEAey T & i 3uat yfy &1 = & fad ot oftem o
AN HEE H AT IR qH w1 IS HIHROTH A WA H U F A
feran <mar .7

22, A Afufem oam g #, IR (7) H, e ol ofw -3 F WM W, R, ofF 4T Ry FT
R 1R Y ar-3 e um 3w wifie feu S e,

R WA Ut & ¥R -% H, IUER (R) H, @ve (W) °, 9o fom % WH W Red aw 2w T
wifya T = ok s9a e Frafafes wegs siasenfoa foea s, stefq — elrer,

Y R FIE WTEIFa ST URT R8I SUNR () F SysYl F ot fdt od § sifvre
FHE T AT ST H TR U F WfagE F ol e wa 8§, O TR S & i,
¥R R0 % TS % TIER R S,
3. o SAfuf=Em & 9| QY H,— gRT ¥ &®T
HIer.
(TH) TUE () H—

(F) @8 (&) §,—

(2) vt 3R fF “9r-3"" & TWIF W, v, ok qor e um-3 i wm 3-w"
TiYa e

(R) 3H@UE (R), (¥) 3R (8) ¥, v iR 3fd "' oggai-R" & WH R, I iR
st foreg ot & i orgga-) ", Tnfaq fg <,

(3) 3UETE (4-T) & @9 fea ST



284 (6) TEYsl TN, &t 29 1 2012

(¥) IwEvE (%) & UvEwM, fgdia 3990 #, wree, siw aur ser (o-|) " w1 @

fepan wm;

(@) @ve (W) AR Gvs () H, e iR ofF ' 9m-3 "' & W W, s, 3E q91 3eR
‘-3 SR 9 3-%"' wenfyg few )

() IUYR (¢ ) AR ITUW (L F F) T, Tee iR ik ' ur-3"" & ©IF T, I 3ok
qgqr &R -3 & widg few W

() 39 (2 &% %) & e, Frfafed Syurd siaeenfia & S, sl —

“(g ® @) T fERE 9 wdl % et wa g, s f fafka w6 S, Sel o+
FEIFd =t STgE-3 % -3 & § 9o fafafde wfaw o @1, gemsw
T % iR W o9 AN Q, IV FE FF qIaH F IvE HF FA T,
3R 39 YR FT HI T WFlaE 79 w1 qeawey T % fiw fawa w §,
T g% TH SIFTd T &1 U & 1vma T 1 e &1 gran Tt Gfa o qen U
FHAE & @, St w5t fafeq W, wEm @ 39 W e & A erEm
T .

(3F M) I9AR () ¥ siafdw et ufaga o & 1 gu oft ofix UQ frsf-rl qem ordf
% e wd gy, 1 TR fafeq 9 Sd, w8 B TREiRd Al Heawew
T & AR T o M § 39 0 X & JaE & I9an,—

() fagd o= #1 I H@ T 3R 30 THFR HF & T8 o o &H,—
() ALIYRY T & +ffay,—

(%) 9IRA WHR B I§ WHR gRT I G;

(") Wwﬁmﬁm%ﬁm—ﬂﬁﬁiﬁ%ﬁﬁ% TR 91 HEeE |
W*ﬁ"'{%ﬂ,

(7) T WER HI IH WHR g I TG;

(=) frelt T wiftersor o6, R mifveor g genfia ardete wie odw § @
fordt IR Ta a1 Wi Rl & o= s # od # ST R9;

(%) Tordl e &I, AeAYRY U9 & Hfiat 39+ qf =1 {6 & fod o @i
Ao =9 wes H oW IuS 4fF w ST W HRm H oW e o
3T ¥, “

fasra @ =1 yoR 9 fawa fean sman &

(R) faga =i 9 = erggEi-R # faffde 7@ & fafmion @ geeron o @1 o/
& ford 39 fren s ® iR 39 R fafqfia =0 weiera @ @fwa 1@
AR UG & e A1 iRisda SR a1 anforsa & oA | a1 9Nd
& U9 & & wed frafa & oty # fosa fRan sman ;@

(3) Togd oot & i ur g8 F vl g =ifva e & fafmio a1 yews
T/ fard 3o foen s € o) g9 R fafafifa = vdwpd w9, @ &
T &9 & @ frafa & ergen o fasea fean s € @



gyl To9d, fedis 29 A4 2012

284 (7)

(T

(%)

I AT & M-3R -3 & H fafafde ma § fioey srpge-R 9 fafafds ama
A T, TR, ST IR IR o T R § 3N 39 UHR %A fRY T mmE
I IFART AT I TRy ot ok IAed H o ser & qen 3w yeR Senfea fagg
Sell, —

YR g & ey, —

(F) 9N R H I TWHT g 394 TY;

(@) 9Rd &R & o 5 @ w6 od % o, dure @ d=ad |

EELtu %ﬂ;

(M) T WEHR & 39 WHR N IIH }q;

(=a) Tt vara wiveto ® U8 Wit g dunfia aesife Wie da A o fe

SR TS I gesig {9 & o | B od # 39 1q;

(&  frdt T I, A9USY TG & fiw 3T o =) {59 & fod o gt

()

T I 91w H A WA o F ITS bt swien H oA wed # U R,

fasra 9 f9= wor 9 fawg fear s & @

(R) Ut gfifeerfadl ) S S Symug () H 7 T 8, 3 qeEey U & it
fawa @ fa= y=aR @ fawa fom s ©;

I A F -3 @ -3 &% ° Ay aa @ i egeE-) # faffds am,
HI HAT T AR TH WHR I a1 T Ot w1 G, Wi, ST SR SA% gl
% &9 H fagq S & I, Iy a1 faawer #F fow sudm w sy e
ST %,

9 I8 UY ST o =] T 310 T ! Fae, o1 2 v Ofa o qen Ot swromaty & iy, St

(TH)

(@)

it fafed =1 STE, 0T A1 37 T FW & fad ergam fwan smom.

IFEUS (Th) & 7 (), (R) R (3), 3u@E () HI 7L (), 7 ITWUE (AH)
4 fifds v =1 <o |, X

3ggue () &t 7e () H File 7ra 1 gwn #, S W@ W F wF I, A HW
H BIgHY, & 4 v 9 tfue g

(3% ¥) ¥ el aen wdf & erendiv W g, W T fafsd =1 S, sl i doeiea

SR SYH-R & 9F-3 & H gararifcy N o T2, qeauey Us & i
TH o AR § I8 3 3R F PIIH F I8 F9 I 8, R 30 Y61 %4
fora T S9a ok Ui &1, HeayRy T & it fashg e ¥, o« 9% U e
FHL DI R 6 AT H wt Ro &1 <ren wE Afa § aon O ety & 9w,
St T fafed =t S, wEm A 3 W wH F el e e S,




284 (8) [eryey qod, feqis 29 7 2012

(2% ) @ el aen vl & sveaeld @d gy, S o fafeq =1 s wei #18 Wi
SN, ATLH-R & 9M-3% H i€y g o Aeavsy U9 & i TE e
ANV IH AP F F PAE F IvEd H FA €, K, —

(F) T YFR Ha THT TC AU H 0 W T F TR Tma s © ;@
(@) W UHR FHA T O W w30 et % fafrin § o € o 36 wen

faffHa st =1 7ea yew U9 & +fiex o1 sfawieedta SR = anforsy o STIH
Ao vy & T &9 & a9 g & oqen # faska & g,

T9 98 UQ A o H1 UM & 3w IR & o F1 grer T Afa H qon T Fenaty F
iR, Sieft o fafeq &1 S, o @0 38 T W & fod o9 fvan Smom. ™

(2% =) 3 Frefrl gor vl & sremee @R gy, W T fafea & S, St i
=, STIEE-R & 9M-3 & H faffde fomr, 7o ww v= & i) W@ o= =
Y I @ W F PAH & I9ER HT B ¢, W, —

(F) 38 YR w7 fou T fomr &1 ey T & 9| fawa s §; o

(@) 39 YR % fHy T forar o1 39 39R wHi= & fafmin & = § iR 338 9=r
fafafifa w1, Teayey T59 F JiaR a1 =i SR @ aiforsg & 1A
T uRa & T &9 % 9l Frafa & orgwn # faswa wwar ¥

q9 98 T A H 1 W & 3d = 1 e &1 gen o §fa § aen 0 sty &
ff|, St for fafea 1 S, =om o0 38 T & & foau srgem foean S

(FR) IR () ¥, w=g qen ofw ‘-3 W WA |, I, eﬂ%ﬁamam“ﬂmasﬂt
9-3%" weriua fee W

(9=) I9UN (3) & WA W, FAfafea s9ar i &6 s, stefg o —

“(3) Fordia AU B 3 U % S ot R &t e Ut Ofg H, St i fafea
&t 9T, 39 Sifufrm & o1efw o g fasra X arfufam, Qjus (QRUETT W¥)
% T ITH g T A, =AW R i & HeR gurEifea @t st eiv sifad
&1, g I |, gyEmaed a9 ¥ 3 w5 maﬁim%n@w@m%m
3 FQrA ST

T F% A W R, s Hefya foxfta o ot wwife 9 < o & ovam ot sremmntsa
® W T, UORE % w9 H yeH &l S

(¥F) 39EW (&) ﬁ,w(w)%wwﬁwﬁw@amwﬁaﬁmmy sref—

“(u) 39 T & ey, foge fad, sise a1 S99 S ufd 398 el g9R 9 etfues
%, iR formem yam erglad 9% % @ifed 9% a1 9% g a1 U-Si1Et 91 g




[ergey Tora, feais 20 7= 2012

284 (9)

YO 91 R % GUS (9) &k wEEw (9) § iy dereeiil % ddy o, ge aurise
Y WYAM ST 108 1 ST foRan T wwen s

¥, el ATUFEA 1 a0 0 W, I9ER (3) H, ek Vi W w0 il W W % e W,
g ' USRSt o fafea @6t s, ! wenfug fo <,

. qo SAfufrm &t ur g¢ H, 39U (%) ) @ (9) H, v U g W W, v i
2&. T oM &) ¥ R0 H, 39uW () H, K i AR % wE W, g A hove
Teqrfya T S,

Ru. I sful=Em &t 9 % H, 394N (22) H, @S (W) ¥, 3yEve (d4F) H, v ' dEmer,
aIfvrfgs ' & M W, 7 R e, arfuiers e, e, aifvifs sy wenfaa faey s,

<. A AfUfEm 1 a/ 3¢ H, ITUR (1) H, U8, HIYH a4 3R ' WE (V) ' F WH W, K,
FIger a1 18R, @IS (B) AN @ (W) ' wernfyq fhw =,

R g fufra ) oy s 1, 39u (R) H, wss e & e R, e FRYere a1 e we e
TTTYa fep ST,

Ro. He Sfufrm =Y o we H,—

(T&F) 399 (R) H foemm 9oge 8 ool faum & oM W sieq senfua faean e aen 6
v, frefafed otqe srer S, e —

g ¥ ft fF 9 wo & el T forelt oY & foeg &g erdia, e Asawew
T & WS A1 R U/ W B STURT (%) & 36y & AR ifspa fman
T g, fafeq Ofa o, wenfrafa Tws o1 W & 9o oreum e | afuwfa
@ g e Wiyt % wua WEgd & S g,

() 39 (¢) #, @ve (F) #H, foermm s ¥ qof form & e W wied @i fwen
Y q91 39k qver, FAfafad e sidenfua fran s, stefq -

T e T odta wifveer], forelt otdia &1 e w@ & 9d, T oik ==, St

& g8 sfaa w8 = g, o fufor wifbsrt 1 o Si= o qen 9% afitom

1 gfgae e Wiyt 1 31 % few € wam s

() SR (¢) 3R (R) H o=t are 9’ F WH W, = 9RE Favel 99’ wenfig
oy T,

. A AT A ar we H,—

(&) 39u () 3R () § 9= "8 99" & WM W, < '‘v8 Havel 7E’' iy
[EQESILS

YRT ¥\ <Rl



284 (10) Ty qords, fedid 29 9 2012

(F) 399 (y) H, w8 ' Hares, anfvifas w7 % WE W, g e oge, et
A HArdAS, aifviicgs w7 wrfig few S

gT 43w R, A AfufEa & 9 w3 H°, 3TE () & v W, Freafated suur it s,
TITEM. stefq i—

“(R) (%) erdied e g oiftE fopw e Swum (2) # fidE fedt sy @ wfua e,
I A B T F TR R et ordiat e 1 39 IRW H, Suk R
fog oTdia =t ST ©, TEEAT 1 AR @ T 9 o foaw & i, orfia 9
F Ted H 390 ormiw fafy & WRaM wed w1 Wi w1 gy Sl ST,

(@) srdia o€ g uiia fre T swam (R) # ffds frd sew 9 safeq =,
I AMd F AfA H GRS e odid S w39 enew &, fme R
foes oTdia 1 ST ©, WET & e 9 e figg & iy, ordia & 9199 & 989
o, 394 st fafy & 9Ram wed o wfem wed w3 g R S

gT v T R3. T SrfulEd & " o H, 3TER (R2) % WEN, Frafafed suum sfd i @l S,
e 3?%:—-‘

(L) (F) T um o sfafdy fre gfaga 9 & € gu o, S =t sifye = e (W)
% A4 e Ayt W #, Afg iieRta foran e § o 3uu (8) % @ue (1) & oA g H
g e & foran rn &, Ak 39 (¢) A (Ro) F o SR Wit % AR & A H TS
gfayfa & &9 # aedifaa vfayfa =1 swfadseis do TRed wq@ #t 9 T, 9 IReewal & e §
AT AT A1 W Wi I A1 AE h! T H TR

(@) afg 398w (¢) A1 (R0) F 31 WA MW F faeg F1E ordie, W ¥g & I8N () &
A THA H S T, qSIER (8) F @IS (M) A TR GUE (F) F T wRqa T wfayfa @
sryfeewia S TR ITUNT (¢) a1 (Ro) o 1A IFRW Wi & favg srdia & fafe a=
[HEANNS 8T i ST, .

gRT Yo H/T . Aty =71 oﬁ,—
e ¥ {4 LU

(T) 39 (@) #, @wre () ¥, 98 99 & G’ & wH W, v agrdyg oy, g
IR Fheivel A wifya fR SIg;

() 3uEm () H, faoum W & WA R, fefafes wge wnfia fea S,
3—'12]‘7?[\ —

e Rt SRt % eTaed W Ui feelt 9 % eTew o qAfdeieR 99 aeh TRl TR S,
59 e o T = &, feF 19 oy & [Afdds § ufdga §9 9 g9ad
W I WA ¥, GOR & Yy erawt Wt < fean e

g e fo Al qAfdeled omee = & X H i 4 Fafa €, @ oY% 59 U@R 9
STTAIGT U F % qw HT HY W H FH RO



YRy IN9, feqis 29 7 2012

284 (1D)

4. o SAfHH ®l Ui v H, ITUR () H, WU (FE) H WU (TH) F w1 H [huifEd
forn wIq, @ik 39 WER THERT @ve (T @) ¥ wd, frefafed mve siqwfe ey o, O

A ﬂfﬁ\:—

ll(g:.

W) IUUR (R) & WUE F & JdH fooelt v 9 Fraa 4ff & qeg & frufon, =g
Afa oad = vyam fmia wd w1 afedwifed sugm iR o8 Ofa 9o somEfy
o urr /- F I9UW (%) & o1 fre afemsifea wam foafar gro e
F ot Ree o1 e ffan smem o1 39 orEn T s

(TT) 4R -7 F ITUN () & @ (F) & AT wedl &1 y&wy, a8 Ofd fad w8

YREgTRdl IR {71 ® TN () F I W a1 WrgiFd g, g8 fa
a1 swrenaty fEd g R (1) & 9 (3) & oA fedt Wi em
o ferelt wiererifora swiam Ffar gra fee =1 <an faven Som o 39 e fan
S, R S 3 9 aret wHoT O 6 9&, 9% 37 e 3@ wra faen o
T g7 Gfa 9 9 -7 &1 IUER (%) F FHH w1t TR Rt wm ) aEetea
forar smam; .

6. o AfufEd =t sTE- H,—
(T)  STwdi 23 3R S0 Hdftm wfafsdl & wm w, frefafeaa swmis ok 3T

Yeifya wfafsei wonfya &t S, etafq :—

23, foea Sel—<e HeayRy T F o) fawa A fa=1 wr | fomra o S €

(&)

()

e A WOHR ] ALYSY o9 & fiX 39 TR g 39T &g fosa foran
Tri'l?ﬂ%;

o YA TR &1 A1 fohelt Yed e & W & fmten, durer 91 gered o
HEYRY U % @ Iudm g o e W §;

59 T WHR &1 59 TR gN fasma fean s @

S Tt Tt Wikt o6t U Wit g0 oTRfea st e oegd o
1 Rl R Tl A1 WS REe & o wd H orqd § Ay 9
F iR s =g fasa feen s §;

ol forelt ek i AEuRY U & fiw 3wt i & fie & ol o g
H A AN FwR H A IH YA F IS H H H A Swemer § 9 ¥
WMW%”;

ATFHIR $¢ & qEE, HiaH () H, I ' Afafes 37 Yo (f99 Hew i Hie)
afufTam, 2jul (2]ue I 4¢) &I Hem ITgge, St foa aifufmm, R08) (Ro0R] &1
¢) % gUEETE B & ki | ud o) o, § faffde Sfawm = A e o

ITHHH ¥Q h GG, wiem () H, v AfdiE IR gew (e wea
) AU, U9 (2]Ue HT u¢) T HUd g, S fam sifufvm, 3039
(RO ¢) & FHERNA B 1 aii@ ¥ gd o] off, o faffde s’ &1 @
fepan e

(|R) I Yo 3N THY Heifya Hfafill, og-o¥-R00§ H 3%-03-R000 & TeA faemm,

gRT v &7

FAHHA-¢ HT
YT



284 (12)

Heyeyl e, T 29 A 2012

& o R, Freafafean swmie iR sl dafia wfafeat wenfag @t S, stafqe—

" o TR - T = srfafHa, stfirnfye = smetfrenfia en aremg seur frad fane, famm,

fowe a1 A} wiinfaa €, 9 R i SR Yo s o, fofg vra
EC I -CUI A B A

(i) ITHAE €2 % WHW, wiem (3) H, v ‘oller oIk e’ % wH |, w e

3R T 1 Wil e fee S

(B7) STIRARR 93 F TTE, Tl (1) H, vse, ao1 Figs ' foimard iR fgu fo=s d swim

T 37 Tl I (TEY 3R e T Bigw) ' F WH W, K, 71 wigd farder
Toen w@ feu glivm fowem o foftr 9 @ 399m g 9t ot wd SqereA (WX
Fl Brewy) Fod wfivfaa T T8 9=T S o= w9 § oia: foeher w@ fgu fawn
T 3w B, (fg 9 &1 ¥g ST €19 Ot 97 URY @ siewt’’) e
e <Td;

FTYA-3 T e, g sfufrem ® orgEr-7, H—

Hyile.

(W) 9o o, —

(%)

(@)

(M

(%)

(®

)

(3)

(0

STHRAF 4 T o TEE, Hiaw (R) H, foomm wfafd & wm w, Fefafed ot
Toifya i S, el —

“ gt YRR & wHE TR o (HThTA ) /Arge 3HifET e (T § E) ded
ﬁ{{an;

STRAIE ¥ F SR IUY wefua wfafsal #1 <fg faa g

ITFATH 3¢ F FEE, FHiem (R) H, foemm wfafy % wm v, fefafea wfafy
wfyd &1 S, el —

" egfhtre @ agge I @ = st wrmht @ fafia srfeesd, =men, awen
R TTEl, el ok s 91 wifes ¥ ffdq sifeed, &R s e (1 9 '

FTHAF 3¢ & TG, Hiam () H, faoam afaft & wm v, Frefafaa sfafy
Toifyd Y S, SAufd —

“ipfam S erqgEt-2 H fafafds &l

STTFAIR LR % wEE, wiaw () #, wlafy (¢) ¥ v AE F wWE W, 1R
“Hre"" wfia fean S

ATHEHIR W F UvEN, Frafaiad s iR sey Heifd wfafiat oiq et
FH WG, A —

X3 1’.

w3 TaEd w'

SRR WU F T, HiAd (R) H, Ty (22) F wvam frefataa sfafs sia:
Ty & S, erufq i—

‘(22 H) Tegfafrm wdew iR wiem’;

~ S

ATFAE W & qvEr, Frefafaa sriwdis ok S99 weEfaa wfafat siawenfia
F W, Al —
“uo TER TEW IR Afed Jufr W'




ey o9y, feais 29 A 2012

284 (13)

(%)

(=1

(2)

ST €2 % @, Hiad (3) ¥, faomm vfaly & wom w frafatag afafs
wfyd ot S, 7l i—

42, Wiiee, B AU WS 19l e, whid, feey, e, st iy, Wuew &R
YTa frg, (37 anr wfea) "

FATFARR €3 & TTEN Fefafed sgwais o suq defuq gfafsa ofa:zenfua
Ea) g, ?ﬁﬂﬁ —

‘g3 & o @ @ ded Y
82 @ IR T Y

ATRATE 6 & H, U AR fEuet ok feves’’ & wH W, we ¢ Hreer
fa=El, dave ik wrau’’ wenfie fey o

(@) =T F wF R, Fefafe am wenfyg fag S, stelq —

()

(=N

llm_ﬁq

UM 2aied ®/E, S s faspast sifufam, 2’ug (2j4E o1 9¥) & um
¥ & @Us (J-9) # fafféy fwa ™ i &

S HIaE $fR TR A STgEl W IUA w v fame sty R?
1 o foran s €.
S I R TR H BISH 3T TR NGL/FARE ufgdl W e 23
T vg fauare wwfet ot fawa fea 2.
Fol A » 23
e faaor yoret & \es ¥ 9= T S 9 “

AT A1 HhvE RV Hiex I S R T weeEn, sifergeen g, fafifds 24
oy

ISl A (T qen T SR AeEd 9 i) e w stfufem Y
F A F HI FW HE, IR T B 3R WX W BIE 0T
X @ o =g 7 8.

“grr-dE %

I (e NTE TR AR g g H Sigai) R

e R

=

fold ool (erggei-¢ 9 fafifike =1 seay) “



284 (14) HeAyey 99, feais 29 | 2012

¥ Rfaek 119, FTTe Upfas 9 @l Affad #@ gu 3
Y Rk R4
& forr 3

(@) 9r-=r ¥, Fem () ¥, faemm wfafy & wm w, feafafea wfafs
FY S, A —

‘o Tl T, S ergE-g oo T orgg ok et v wm ¥ wftfaw w6

oo
TG : ¢ AE, R0%R rerarit
TRATF TS

“Hfgum & IT=sg R0 T U USgue gr erRifda’’

yeafsa fafy fafor & deiy o 399

JEfad HeAuey 92 (Heyd) faiues, 09’ ¥ o wvel ¥ g faursd uiwdl w1 yadsa fea s @R,
IR feror fegER § —

()  @TE (&) —INd 92 g oM & MR 9% T &1 wemay § 9fg feg 9m

(R) @I R-T()(A)—TE o M ad I F YU 50 IR HT GEY WS

(3) @8 {(R)—HEE RegTewd gN WL FIC S

(%) @Wug (3)—UEHd =AM A difetehifend wod Fafar g7 & &1 Ui & e &1 gan f6a S 'Y

(W)  @U8 R(¥)(W)—F HI HI H FHU-9F o fHT w1

(8) @Ug (¥)(M)—H FI FHddl ! T & FAERH fFY S

()  @us (A (F @)W Fd AR F [ R e & e o7 7 A

(¢) wug 23(dH) (F M—EFd Ul g A & & JaE & 9w GEd S & wa-fawa
(ERESIES

(R) WU (TA) (F ) —IHH-3 F 3% # faffde o ve, I R awm w f@e 1 g
[ERESIES

(20) @IS () (F ©)—YHI- & 9M-3%F H faffde o, t<gum R e 3 ez &1 <@ f7a s

(22) @E 3(M) (2F F)—HgA-R F 9r-3% H fafafde A fomt | owm 9= f&e &1 gan fwd s

(3R) W8 0(T&H)—T&F HaUE T R ARG WA aret WiF & goet offa fovd s

(R3) @UE (T @) —arfdasifed yaa fmia g ewe == & &1 g f53 5/, aon

(%) @ (T MR/ fFY I gt ufdn =1 garEeH 63 s

F ey # 99 99 SR, S 9T e F gL

Frdsreh, T TR q ored O, Heauty g MEE I g Enerd, e 9 fEd gen g —2012.



T JEERS www.govtpressmp.nic.in 9
off g @it fran < g 2.

HHih 144 ]

I, TeaR, ferais 29 wE 2012—39 9, & 1934

fafy o faurh =@ faum
frare, feie 29 A= 2012

. 1872-122-FFRA-31(WL. ), — YR & GfAUM F T 348 F WIS (3) F AT H, Aoy o9 (HHA)
fadmes, 2012 (FHI® 11, B 2012) 1 FIST oFaE T & WiYSR ¥ Taggr wemifv fRar S 2.

Clauses :
1.

%N oL W

11.
12.
13.
14.
15.

THYRY & ToUA F AH F qA] SRIER,
TAT ITEd, TR Fi=a.

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 11 orF 2012.

THE MADHYA PRADESH VAT (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2012

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Short title and commencement.
Substitution of long title.
Amendment of Section 3.
Amendment of Section 4-A.
Amendment of Section 4-B.
Amendment of Section 5.
Amendment of Section 6.
Amendment of Section 9-B.
Insertion of Section 9-C.
Amendment of Section 10.
Amendment of Section 11.
Amendment of Section 11-A.
Amendment of Section 14.
Amendment of Section 17.
Amendment of Section 18.
287



qeqyey N9, et 29 A" 2012

288
16. Amendment of Section 20.
17. Amendment of Section 24.
18. Amendment of Section 28.
19. Amendment of Section 43.
20. Amendment of Section 46.
21. Amendment of Section 47.
22. Amendment of Section 53.
23. Amendment of Section 57.
24, Amendment of Section 70.
25. Amendment of Section 71.
26. Amendment of Schedule 1.
27. Amendment of Schedule II.

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 11 or 2012.

THE MADHYA PRADESH VAT (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2012

A Bill further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002,

Short title and
commencement.

Substitution of
long title.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-third year of the Republic of
India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vat (Amendment) Act, 2012.

(2) (a) The provisions of clause (vi) of Section 13 of this amending Act shall be deemed
to have come into force from Ist August, 2009;

(b) The provisions of clause (iv) of Section 26 of this amending Act shall be deemed to
have come into force from Ist April, 2006 to 31st March, 2007;

(¢) The remaining provisions of this amending Act shall come into force from lst April,
2012.

2. For long title of the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002 (No. 20 of 2002) (hereinafter referred
to as the Principal Act), the following long title shall be substituted, namely :—

“An Act to levy tax on sale and purchase of goods tax on buildings and tax on goods carried
by road in the State of Madhya Pradesh.”.

3. In section 3 of the principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (1),—
“ (a) for clause (a), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

(a) Special Commissioner of Commercial Tax;
(aa) Director of Commercial Tax;”;

(b) in clause (), the word “and” shall be omitted and for clause (g), the following
clauses shall be substituted, namely:-

“(g) Inspector of Commercial Tax; and

(h) Taxation Assistant.”;



Hegyey T, femis 29 | 2012

288 (1)

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “The Commissioner of Commercial Tax”, the words
“ The Commissioner of Commercial Tax, the Special Commissioner of
Commercial Tax” shall be substituted; and

(iii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :-

“(3) The Commissioner of Commercial Tax, Special Commissioner of Commercial Tax,
the Director of Commercial Tax and the Additional Commissioner of
Commercial Tax shall exercise all the powers and perform all the duties
conferred or imposed on the Commissioner by or under this Act throughout
the State and for this purpose any reference to the Commissioner in this Act,
shall be construed as a reference to the Special Commissioner of Commercial
Tax, the Director of Commercial Tax and the Additional Commissioner of
Commercial Tax.”.

4. In section 4-A of the principal Act, for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall
be substituted, namely:—

*(3) On an application under sub-section (6) of section 46, the Appellate Board may, after
considering the merits of the application made by the dealer, pass an order of
stay for a period of three hundred and sixty five days from the date of such
order and the Appellate Board shall dispose of the appeal within the said period
of stay specified in that order:

Provided that where such appeal is not so disposed of within the said period of stay as
specified in the order of stay, the Appellate Board may, on an application made
in this behalf by the dealer and on being satisfied that the delay in disposing of
the appeal is not attributable to the dealer, extend the period of stay till decision
of appeal.”

5. In section 4-B of the principal Act, for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall
be substituted, namely :- .

“(3) The Chairman or any other member of the Appellate Board may, sitting singly,
dispose of any case which pertains to a dealer whose total amount of tax, interest
and/or penalty as computed by the assessing authority in the case does not exceed
rupees one lac and the Chairman may for the disposal of any particular case,
constitute a special bench consisting of three or more members, one of whom
shall necessarily be a judicial member and one an accountant member.”.

6. In section 5 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), the words “under the said sub-section”
shall be omitted.

7. In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “twelve months”, the
words “twelve calendar months” shall be substituted.

8. In Section 9-B of the Principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (4), for the word and figure “Part III”, the words, figures and letter
“Part-III and Part-III A” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (5), for full-stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the

following proviso shall be added, namely:-

Amendment of
Section 4-A.

Amendment of
Section 4-B.

Amendment of
Section 5.

Amendment of
Section 6.

Amendment of
Section 9-B.



288 (2) ALY S, Tai 29 AE 2012
“Provided that the purchase value of goods, on which tax under the Act has been paid at
the time of purchase and no input tax rebate is admissible on such purchase,
shall be deducted from the capital value of the building.”.
;ﬂsertigﬂc of 9. After section 9-B of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
ection 9-

Tax on goods
carried by road.

namely: —

“9-C (1) (a) Every transporter shall be liable to pay tax on such goods, as the State
Govemment may, by notification specify, carried by road in the State of
Madhya Pradesh :

Provided that no tax shall be payable in respect of the goods belonging to a person other
than a dealer or a builder who carries on business in or outside the State of
Madhya Pradesh.

(b) The tax shall be levied on freight at the rate specified in column (3) of Schedule 1II,
against the corresponding entry of the goods notified under clause (a).

(c) Where no freight is charged or only token freight is charged, the tax shall be levied
on the normal freight prevalent on the route.

(d) Where the goods are carried by a motor vehicle owned by the owner of the goods,
the tax shall be levied on the normal freight prevalent on the route.

(e) Where goods are carried by a motor vehicle from any place outside the State to any
place within the State or from any place within the State to any place outside
the State or from any place outside the State to any other place outside the State
but through the State or from any place within the State to any other place within
the State but through the intervening territory of another State, the tax shall be
payable in respect of the freight relating to the distance covered within the State.

(f) The person in-charge of a motor vehicle carrying the goods shall carry with him a
receipt in the prescribed form issued by the transporter.

(2) Bvery transporter liable to pay tax under sub-section (1), shall get himself registered in
such manner as may be prescribed:

Provided that if the transporter is owner, registered under section 17 or enrolled under section
9-B, of the goods being carried, such transporter shall not be required to register under this
sub-section.

(3) (a) A registered dealer or an enrolled builder who gets his goods carried by a transporter
after payment to him tax under sub-section (1), shall claim or be allowed in such manner and
within such period as may be prescribed, rebate of the amount of such tax.

(b) The rebate under clause (a) shall be claimed or be allowed only in respect of the tax on
freight relating to the goods which are sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh or in the course
of inter-state trade or commerce or in the course of export out of the territory of India or to the
goods consumed in the manufacture or processing of goods and the goods so manufactured or
processed are sold within the state of Madhya Pradesh or in the course of inter-state trade or
commerce or in the course of export out of the territory of India or to the goods consumed in
the construction of a building and tax is paid under section 9-B on the building so constructed.

(¢) The rebate under clause (a) shall be claimed or be allowed only in respect of the tax on
freight which is part of the sale price of the goods sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh or



[EYey Tovd, foiw 29 A 2012

288 (3)

in the course of inter-state trade or commerce or in the course of export out of the territory
of India.

(4) (a) Every consignor or consignee, who is a dealer registered under section 17 or a builder
enrolled under section 9-B, of goods notified, shall deduct tax payable under sub-section (1) from
the amount payable by him to the transporter for carrying the goods.

(b) On deduction of the amount under clause (a), the registered dealer or the enrolled builder
shall issue a certificate of deduction of tax to the transporter in such form and manner as may
be prescribed.

(¢) The certificate of deduction of tax shall constitute a goods and sufficient discharge of
the liability of the transporter to pay tax in respect of such transaction and the amount so deducted
shall be adjusted by him in such manner as may be prescribed.

(d) The registered dealer or the enrolled builder shall retain as refund the amount
deducted under clause (a) which is equal to the amount of rebate notionally admissible under
sub-section (3).

(e) The registered dealer or the enrolled builder shall deposit the amount deducted under
clause (a) which is over and above the amount of rebate notionally admissible under
sub-section (3).

(5) The rebate under sub-section (3) shall be adjusted towards the amount payable under
sub-section (4) and the tax payable under the Act.

(6) The provisions of this Act shall mutatis mutandis apply to a transporter who is liable
to pay tax under sub-section (1),

Explanation.— For the purpose of this section,—

(a) “Goods” means goods specified in Schedule II;

(b) “Motor vehicle” means a motor vehicle, including trailer when attached to any
such vehicle within the meaning of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988, (No. 59 of
1988);

(c¢) “Transporter” means the person transporting goods in or through the territory of
the State of Madhya Pradesh by a motor vehicle.”.

10. In section 10 of the principal Act,

(i) for the word and figure “Part-III” Wherever they occur, the words, figures and letter
“Part-IIT and Part-III A” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (1), in clause (b), sub-clause (ii) shall be omitted;
(iii) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—
“(1A) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sub-section (1), tax under
sub-section (1) shall be levied at the rate of 5 percent in respect of electrical
energy or the goods consumed in the generation of electrical energy, as the

case may be, if the electrical energy is sold,—

(a) otherwise than by way of sale within the State of Madhya Pradesh;

Amendment of
Section 10.



288 (4) Heyey Tead, fediss 29 A 2012

(b) to the Government of India for consumption by that Government within the
State of Madhya Pradesh;

(¢) to the Government of India or a railway company for consumption in the
construction, maintenance or operation of railway within the State of
Madhya Pradesh;

(d) to the State Government for consumption by that Government;

(e) to any local authority for consumption in public street lamps or lamps in any
market places or other places of public resort maintained by such authority;

(f) to an agriculturist for consumption in pumping of water for irrigation of his
land or in chaff cutting or in crushing or treating the produce of his land
within the State of Madhya Pradesh.”;

Amendment  of 11. In Section 11 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the word and figure
Section 11. “Part-III", the words, figures and letter “Part III and Part-IIl A” shall be substituted;

Amendment of

Section 1LA. 12. In Section 11-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for full stop, the

colon shall be substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that if a registered dealer makes an application for refund of excess amount
deducted under sub-section (2) of Section 26 or deposited in a year, the
assessment of such dealer shall be made in accordance with the provisions of

Section 20.”.
Amendment of

Section 14. 13. In Section 14 of the principal Act,

(i) in sub-section (1),—
(a) in clause (a),—
(1) for the word and figure “part-1II"°, the words, figures and letter “Part III and
Part-IIT A” shall be substituted;
(2) in sub-clauses (2), (4), and (6) for the word and figure “Schedule II”’, the words
and figure “Schedule II other than electrical energy” shall be substituted;

(3) sub- clause (5-b) shall be omitted;

(4) after sub-clause (6), in second sub-division, the bracket, figure and letter
“(5-b)” shall be omitted; :

(b) in clause (b) and clause (e), for the word and figure “part-1II"’, the words, figures
and letter “Part-1II and Part-IIT A” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (1A) and (1AA), for the word and figure “Part-11I’, the word,
figure and letter “part-IIT A” shall be substituted;

(iii) after sub-section (1AA), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1AB) Subject to such restrictions and conditions -as may be prescribed, where a
registered dealer purchases natural gas as. specified in Part-IIT A of Schedule
II within the State of Madhya Pradesh from another such dealer after payment
to him input tax, and sells the natural gas so purchased within the State of



qeqgey TeTad, e 29 7 2012

288 (5)

Madhya Pradesh, he shall claim or be allowed in such manner and within such
period as may be prescribed, input tax rebate of the amount of such input
tax.

(1AC) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sub-section (1) and
subject to such restrictions and conditions as may be prescribed, where a
registered dealer purchases within the State of Madhya Pradesh from another
such dealer after payment to him input tax,—

1 Electrical energy and the electrical energy so purchased,—
(1) is sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh otherwise than by way of sales,—
(a) to the Government of India for consumption by that Government;

(b) to the Government of India or a railway company for consumption in the
construction, maintenance or operation of railway;

(c) to the State Government for consumption by that Government;

(d) to any local authority for consumption in public street lamps or lamps in any
market places or other places of public resort maintained by such authority;

(e) to an agriculturist for consumption in pumping of water for irrigation of his
land or in chaff cufting or in crushing or treating the produce of his land
within the State of Madhya Pradesh;

(2) is consumed for/in the manufacture or processing or mining of goods specified in
Schedule II other than electrical energy and the goods so manufactured or
processed or mined are sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh or in the
course of inter-state trade or commerce or in the course of export out of the
territory of India; or

€)) is consumed for/in the manufacture or processing of goods declared tax free
under section 16, other than electrical energy, and the goods so manufactured
or processed are sold in the course of export out of the territory of india;

(i1) goods specified in Schedule II, other than the gobds specified in Part-1II and Part-II1
A of the said Schedule and plant, machinery, equipment and parts thereof, and
the goods so purchased are consumed or used in generation of electrical energy
and electrical energy so generated,—

(1) is sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh otherwise than by way of sales,—

(a) to the Government of India for consumption by that Government;

(b) to the Government of India or a railway company.for consumption in the
construction, maintenance or operation of railway;

(¢) to the State Government for consumption by that Government;

(d) to any local authority for consumption in public street lamps or lamps in any
market places or other places of public resort maintained by such authority;



288 (6) eIyl US4, feqis 29 1" 2012

(e) to an agriculturist for consumption in pumping of water for irrigation of his land
or in chaff cutting or in crushing or treating the produce of his land within
the state of Madhya Pradesh;

(2) is sold in the circumstances not covered in sub-clause (1) above and otherwise than
by way of sale within the State of Madhya Pradesh;

(iti) goods specified in Schedule IT other than the goods specified in part-III and Part-III
A of the said Schedule, and the goods so purchased are consumed or used as
plant, machinery, equipment and parts thereof for/in generation, transmission or
distribution of electrical energy,

he shall claim or be allowed in such manner and within such period as may be prescribed,
input tax rebate of the amount of such input tax,

(i) in case of goods referred to in items (1), (2) and (3) of sub-clause (i), item (1) of
sub- clause (i), and sub-clause (iii); and

(ii) in case of goods referred to in item (2) of sub-clause (ii), which is in excess of 5
percent of the purchase price, net of input tax, of such goods;

(1AD) Subject to such restrictions and conditions as may be prescribed, where a
registered dealer purchases diesel and petrol as specified in Part-III A of
Schedule IT within the State of Madhya Pradesh from another such dealer after
payment to him input tax, and sells the diesel and petrol so purchased within
the State of Madhya Pradesh, he shall claim or be allowed in such manner
and within such period as may be prescribed, input tax rebate of the amount
of such input tax.

(1AE) Subject to such restrictions and conditions as may be prescribed, where a
registered dealer purchases tendu leaves as specified in Part-1II A of Schedule
II within the State.of Madhya Pradesh from another such dealer after payment
to him input tax, and

(a) sells the tendu leaves so purchased within the State of Madhya Pradesh; or

(b) consumes the tendu leaves so purchased in manufacture of bidi and the bidi
so manufactured is sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh or in the course
of inter State trade or commerce or in the course of export out of the
territory of India,

he shall claim or be allowed in such manner and within such period as may be
prescribed, input tax rebate of the amount of such input tax.”.

(1AF) Subject to such restrictions and conditions as may be prescribed, where a
registered dealer purchases timber as specified in Part-III A of Schedule II
within the State of Madhya Pradesh from another such dealer after payment
to him input tax, and

(a) sells the timber so purchased within the State of Madhya Pradesh; or

(b) consumes the timber so purchased in manufacture of ready to use furniture and
the furniture so manufactured is sold within the State of Madhya Pradesh
or in the course of inter-State trade or commerce or in the course of export
out of the territory of India,



AEYY U, T 29 °E 2012 288 (7)
he shall claim or be allowed in such manner and within such period as may be
prescribed, input tax rebate of the amount of such input tax.”’;
(iv) in sub-section (2), for the word and figure “Part-III”, the words, figures and letter
“Part-III and Part-IIT A shall be substituted;
(v) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The input tax rebate by a registered dealer under this section shall be adjusted in
such manner as may be prescribed towards the tax, interest and penalty payable
by him under this Act or under the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of
1956) and the balance, if any, shall be carried over for adjustment towards
tax, interest and penalty payable in the subsequent year :

Provided that the input tax rebate, which remains unadjusted even after two years from
the close of the relevant financial year, shall be granted by way of refund.”;
(vi) In sub-section (6), for clause (vii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(vii) in respect of goods, the amount of bill, invoice or cash memorandum of which
exceeds rupees forty thousand, any payment of which has not been made by
crossed cheque or bank draft or pay order or internet banking of a scheduled
bank:

Provided that in respect of the transactions referred to in explanation (d) of clause (u)
of Section 2, payment by book adjustment shall be deemed to be a compliance
of the above requirement;”.

14. In Section 17 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (3), for the words “a registration Amendment of
fee of five hundred rupees”, the words “a registration fee, as may be prescribed,” shall be Section17.
substituted.

15. In Section 18 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (4), in clause (d), for the words “one ~ Amendment of
thousand”, the words “five thousand” shall be substituted. Section 18,

16. In Section 20 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words “ three months”, Amendment of
the words “three calendar months” shall be substituted. Section 20.

17. In Section 24 of the Principal Act, In sub-section (11), in clause (b), in sub-clause (iii), Amendment of
for the word “Director of Commercial Tax”, the words “Special Commissioner of Commercial Section 24.

Tax, Director of Commercial Tax” shall be substituted.

18. In Section 28 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the word, bracket and letter Amendment of
“clause (g)”, the words, brackets and letters “clause (g) and clause (h)” shall be substituted. Section 28.

19. In Section 43 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the word, “Inspector”, the Amendment of
words “Inspector or Taxation Assistant” shall be substituted. Section 43.

20. In Section 46 of the Principal Act :— Amendment of

Section 46.

(i) in sub-section (1), in the existing proviso for full stop, the colon shall be substituted
and thereafter the following proviso shall be added, namely :(—



288 (8) Heqyesl Usivs, fedisr 29 A 2012

“ Provided further that an appeal against an order passed under section 57, wherein
the consignor or consignee of the State of Madhya Pradesh has been authorised
in accordance with the provision of sub-section (14) of Section 57, may, in
the prescribed manner, be filed before the Appellate Authority having
jurisdiction over the principal place of business of the consignor or consignee,
as the case may be.”;

(ii) in sub-section (8), in clause (a), in the existing proviso for full stop, the colon shall
be substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be added, namely:-

* Provided further that the Appellate Authority may, before disposing of any appeal, make
such further inquiry as he thinks fit, or may direct the Assessing Authority to
make further inquiry and report the result of the same to the Appellate Authority.”;

(iii) in sub-sections (8) and (9), for the words “twelve months”, the words “twelve calendar
months” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 21. In Section 47 of the Principal Act,—
Section 47.

(i) In sub-section (1) and (2), for the words “six months”, the words “six calendar months”
shall be substituted;

(ii) In sub-section (5), for the word “ the Director of Commercial Tax” the words “ the
Special Commissioner of Commercial Tax or the Director of Commercial Tax”
shall be substituted.

Amendment of 22. In Section 53 of the Principal Act, for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall
Section 53. be substituted, namely:—

“(2) (a) The Commissioner aggrieved by any order referred to in sub-section (1) passed
by the Appellate Board, may file an appeal to the High Court and such appeal
shall be filed within one hundred eighty days from the date of the communication
to the Commissioner of the order appealed against, in the form of a memorandum

" of appeal precisely stating therein the substantial question of law involved.

(b) A dealer aggrieved by any order referred to in sub-section (1) passed by the Appellate
Board, may file an appeal to the High Court and such appeal shall be filed within
ninety days from the date of the communication to the dealer of the order
appealed against, in the form of a memorandum of appeal precisely stating therein
the substantial question of law involved.”.

Amendment of 23. In Section 57 of the Principal Act, after sub-section (11), the following sub-section shall
Section 57. be inserted, namely :—

“(11 A) (a) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this Section, the check
Post Officer or the Officer empowered under sub-section (5) may release the
goods or the vehicle or carrier alongwith the goods seized in favour of the
transporter, if seized and not already released under clause (c) of sub-section (6),
if adequate security in the form of cash security or irrevocable bank guarantee
of the amount equal to the penalty levied under sub-section (8) or (10) is
furnished.

(b) If an appeal against the order passed under sub-section (8) or (10) is filed udner
sub-section (1) of Section 46, the cash security or irrevocable bank guarantee
furnished under clasue (c) of sub-section (6) or clause (a) above shall not be
appropriated towards the penalty levied under sub-section (8) or (10) till the
decision in the first appeal.”.



Teyey ToTH, feis 29 A 2012

288 (9)

24. In Section 70 of the Principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (ii), for the words “within six months”, the words “as
early as possible, not later than twelve calendar months” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the proviso, the following provisos shall be substituted,
namely —

“Provided that no review of an earlier order passed on application of a dealer shall be
made unless a reasonable opportunity of being heard is given to the dealer
who is likely to be adversely affected by the review:

Provided further that if the application for review relates to reduction of rate of tax,
the Commissioner shall reduce the rate of tax after obtaining approval from
the State Government.”.

.25. In Section 71 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (2), clause (eb). shall be renumbered
as clause (ed), and before the clause (ed) as so renumbered, the following clauses shall be inserted,
namely:-

“ (eb) determination value of land assigned to a building under clause (a) of sub-
section (2), the manner in which a builder shall get himself enrolled and the
manner and period in which input tax rebate shall be claimed by or be allowed
to a enrolled builder under sub-section(4) of section 9-B;

(ec) form of receipt under clause (f) of sub-section(1) of section 9-C, the manner in which
a transporter shall get himself registered under sub-section (2) of Section 9-C,
the manner and period in which rebate shall be claimed by or be allowed to a
registered dealer or an enrolled builder under sub-section (3) of Section 9-C, and
the form of certificate to be issued, the manner in which it is to be obtained
and the manner in which any amount deducted shall be adjusted under sub-section
(4) of Section 9-C;”.

26. In Schedule I to the Principal Act,—

(i) for serial number 13 and entries relating thereto, the following serial number and
entries relating thereto shall be substituted, namely :(—

“ 13. Electrical energy - when sold otherwise than by way of sale within the State of
Madhya Pradesh;

-when sold to the Government of India for consumption by that Government within
the State of Madhya Pradesh; :

-when sold to the Government of India or a railway company for consumption in
the construction, maintenance or operation of railway within the State of
Madhya Pradesh;

-when sold to the State Government for consumption by that Government;
- when sold to any local authority for consumption within the State of Madhya Pradesh

in public street lamps or lamps in any market places or other places of public
resort maintained by such authority;

Amendment of
Section 70.

Amendment of
Section 71.

Amendment of
schedule 1.



288 (10) HeAgesl s, T 29 A 2012

-when sold to an agriculturist for consumption in pumping of water for irrigation of
his land or in chaff cutting or in crushing or treating the produce of his land
within the State of Madhya Pradesh.”;

(ii) against serial number 48, in column (2), the words * Fabrics specified in the First
Schedule to the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act,
1957 (58 of 1957) as it stood prior to the date on which the Finance Act, 2011
(8 of 2011) came into force” shall be omitted;

(iii) against serial number 49, in column (2), the words “ Sugar specified in the First
schedule to the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act,
1957 (58 of 1957) as it stood prior to the date on which the Finance Act, 2011
(8 of 2011) came into force” shall be omitted;

(iv) for the serial number 50 and entries relating thereto, existing between 01.04.2006
to 31.03.2007, following serial number and entries relating thereto shall be
substituted, namely :-

“ 50 Tobacco manufactured or un-manufactured, cured or uncured and tobacco products
including cigarettes, cigars, cheroots and bidis, on which additional excise duty
was leviable, but exempted by the Government of India”;

(v) against serial number 61, in column (2), for the words “iron and steel”, the words
“iron and steel or plastic” shall be substituted;

(vi) against serial number 72, in column (2), for the words “sprinklers and equipments
used in drip irrigation (other than pipe and motor)”, the words “Parts and
accessories (other than motor) specific to the sprinkler system and drip irrigation
system including pipes which are used exclusively for sprinkler and the drip
system (but not used for ordinary works as carriage pipes) shall be substituted ;

Amendment of P
schedule IL' 27. In Schedule II to the Principal Act,—
(i) in part-II, —

(a) against serial number 5A, in column (2), for the existing entry, the following entry
shall be substituted, namely:-

“ all kinds of Compact Fluorescent Lamp (CFL)/Light Emitting Diode (LED) bulb
and tube’;

(b) serial number 14 A and entries relating thereto shall be omitted;

(c) against serial number 18, in column (2), for the existing entry, the following entry
shall be substituted namely:-

*“ Buckets, Ghamela, Tasla and Tagadi made of Aluminium or other material except
precious materials, buckets made of iron and steel or plastic, and crow bar”;

(d) against serial number 34, in column (2), for the existing entry, the following
entry shall be substituted, namely:—

“ Fabrics other than those specified in Schedule I7;



qeyeyl g, feid 29 o 2012

288 (11)

(e) against serial number 51, in column (2), in entry (8), for the word “board” , the
word “mode” shall be substituted;

(f) after serial number 52, the following serial number and entries relating thereto shall
be inserted, namely:—

“53. Khas-khas 57
(g) against serial number 55, in column (2), after entry number 11, the following entry
shall be inserted namely:—
“11 A. Aluminum circles and sheets;

(h) after serial number 57, the following serial number and entries relating thereto shall
be inserted, namely —

“ 57 A Adult diaper and sanitary napkin 57

(i) against serial number 61, in column (2), for the existing entry, the following entry
shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Nuts, bolts, screws and fasterners that is to say— hinges, nails, rivets, cotter, cotter
pins, staples and panel pins, (including their washers)”’;

(§) after serial number 63, the following serial numbers and entries relating thereto shall
be inserted, namely :-—

“63 AP C C poles 5
63 B Photography paper 57

(k) in serial number 84 A, for the words “Sabudana Khichadi and Shrikhand”, the
words “Sabudana Khichadi, Shrikhand and Khakhara” shall be substituted;

(ii) for Part-III, the following parts shall be substituted, namely:-

“ Part-111

Aviation turbine fuel other than those specified
in clause (ii-d) of Section 14 of the Central Sales
Tax Act, 1956 (No. 74 of 1956), —

(i) when sold to aviation companies for fueling at 23
Bhopal and Indore airports

(i1} when sold to aviation companies for fueling 13
at other airports / airstrips other than Bhopal and Indore

Raw opium i3
Kerosene oil sold through Public Distribution System 5
Old or second hand motor vehicle as the 1.5

State Government may, by notification, specify



288 (12) qeyeyl e, feaiw 29 79 2012

5. Capital goods (other than plant and 1.5
machinery and motor vehicle), on which tax under
the Act has been paid at the time of purchase and no
input tax rebate was admissible on such purchase.

Part- IIT A

1. Diesel 23
(other than light diesel oil and furnace oil)

2. Petrol 27
3. Electrical energy (other than specified in Schedule I) 5
4. Natural gas including compressed natural gas 13
5. Tendu leaves 25
6. Timber 137

(iii) in Part 1V, in column (2), for the existing entry, the following entry shall be substituted, namely :—

“All other goods, not covered by Schedule-I and any other part of this Schedule.”.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

In order to implement the tax proposals contained in part II of speech delivered by the Finance Minister
while presenting the budget in the Legislative Assembly for the year 2012-13, and certain other issues that is, to
authorize single bench of Appeal Board to hear the case in which assessed tax, interest and/or penalty is up to
rupees 1 lac, to provide for refund of excess amount deducted or deposited in case of executor of works contract
opting for composition, to increase penalty to discourage the dealers who do not file returns or file returns late,
appropriate amendments are proposed in the Madhya Pradesh Vat Act, 2002 (No. 20 of 2002). Opportunity is also
being taken to rationalize a few other provisions.

2. Hence this Bill.

BHOPAL: RAGHAVII
Member-in-Charge.
DATED THE 28th March 2012

1, WEEE qEu a1 oEd Wi, ey g YHEE heid qEuierd, S d gia aur yefia—2012.



