T AR www.govtpressmp.nic.in 9
fl SRA @re fRar S gt 2.

HHF 151] o, YR, feAiw 30 W 2012—<F 10, T 1934

faum ww wfgeeE, ey
a9, feai 30 | 2012

. 9110/fa.9./faum/2012, —aeraey faam 9w & Wi qon & dwrer g fom 64 % Iuedl & uer o
Hegey faum |Wr weR Aad, s aun UM (deieE) fadeeR, 2012 (i 16 WA 2012) S fawm @ o
et 30 A 2012 W QAT goN ¥, SHEHRY B YA % fau gl e s

TAHIR UL
y9@ |fde,
geayey faum @
qeayeyr faden

FHE L& W 0%

TAYSYT [T TUT WS J, Ul qen g ((HoerT )
fasrer, 093
forerr—g.

wia M.

YR ¥ HT HINYA
YN ¥-T 1 GINEA.
YRT ¥-T1 1 HIMEA.
YR 4 T AN,
N 4-F T G,
YRT &~ 1 HIEA.
ORI §-W HT G,
YT §-71 T GG,

A I N o S A e

301



302

gy TeTad, feqie 30 T 2012

wiere .

YT % T G,

T ¥-T& &T

wyier.
gRT  ¥-T T

&I & T E9ITeE.

AT 4-& T

YT &-%F T
e,

YT &-@ &7

T &-T &7

i,

Yy faees

FAE 2§ T R0

TEAYRYT TaemT 9T 9aw 9d9, 9T q9r 9ot ( GeneT )
fages, 0%

AR TaUM B WS I, WA 9o W erfufem, g]w’ @ @i deifua e ¥q fade,

IR MRS & favgsd o9 A nwyydy faum-ved gwn fefafaas w1 7 9w
rfyfafma 81—

2. 39 sfufam =1 dfta A weauey faum ww 9= A, s oden UvH (HEied)
atfufrem, 093 &

R, WEAUQET el Wt wew 3, s aur Uor eifuftam, g 0R (i © T 2R3 ) (I g
Tk UYE] g T & am § i ¥) @t anr ¢ el et 59 & e W a=sie
T enfua ferdt &G,

3. g1 fufram &t am ¥-wg ¥, v U R o e W vTes e e wenfua feRdr
S,

. e iy &t anr -, vieg Ui TR o e W e e wenfue fedr .
W, W FUFTEH ot arr o H, v uie EY & T WU U g wenfud fedr @,

&, go1 Afuf-ram &t amr w-@ #, 39 (R ) & vy feAfaiea 78 suam sia:tenfud et
e, srat; — | |

“(3) 3| Afufram & SusYl W yfaes TuE ST foAT, et shid Ot aeauer
& TR T WM | gEY W Ok 9 W 9 R §, 9 98 UH 9 %

T argam & foaw &t ufagfd &1 geher g
UG 39 IUURT o e Tt arsmeit st ot Hen ufaed dide 9 ol € grm.
o, Y&t Afuf e it arr &-% H, 3w () W,—

() urifuss TR § v ¢ TR % T W, 9 U e et
fer wmd;

() vuw wigs ¥, v A | o T W, vl e Y wenfia feg W,

¢. I fufm &t ot g-@ ¥, vg 'ui" TR % WM W, v 99 s et
fer <,

Q. o1 fufm &l amr &-7 ®, 91 Uiy TR’ o W WY, TS ‘'9E eR ety
[EQs 1L



Yy g, feqis 30 A" 2012 302 (1)

Il 3R HRON H1 FHUA

B &1 6 auf H GE-TRIG F SR AenRy faum wy F wesl o oqayd el @ f@ S m s, dvA
we ufEr dvA # gfg fran s sravass €1 wen §. wg o fafafima fe e © fr gl @ 3 sweifuEl w6t femfea
FH % g 757 F SR T SRS @ A w0 &) glaw § S, siud, nerey faun w1 e o, W qen UeH
sAfyfm, W (FHIF © T 3Re3) H aeifea deler wefa 2.

R. ;¥ fadaew we@ R

‘*ﬁtﬂﬁ:
TUT Wi
ARG : R HE, 0% YRYIF IS,

"dfaum % STIwg R0 F TN TSI gR eTmifaa .

fa<ig Jru=

T 9T F @WUg R, 3, ¥, 4, §, 9, (U & H FEIad gayr R on % sRonraey T e W) gfaad
SHMA: I R0,00,00, 0oo/~ (TIY S HAS) HH 1 Edl fa<iia 9 AT,

=k, TR TEOT Q1 e A, WYY R WIS HE qEener, Hie | TS ae Feiia—2012.



L Ll www.govtpressmp.nic.in ¥
ff S=7 @re fRar st uehar .

FHHEH 168] o, vifer, fedie 31 99 2012—=9 11, T 1934

fafy i faurdt wrd faam

AT, T 31 AE 2012
%, 1985-129-FHRIG-3(UL.).—¥Rd & WOy & {8 348 &F WIS (3) & W H, HWEWW
foum 9w @ d99, @ qw Yvm (SEieR) fadee, 2012 (FHE 16 T 2012) HT SIS AR TSI F
TR § TaggR T fRar s .

TEYRY & oI & AH Y a9 SRR,
TEI9T O1Ed, ST |ieE,

335



336

Heyey s, fedis 31 a = 2012

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 16 of 2012

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA PENSION

Clauses :

D T

Short title.

Amendment of
Section 4.

Amendment of
Section 4-B.

Amendment of
Section 4-C.

Amendment of
Section 5.

Amendment of
Section 5-B.

(SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2012

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Short title.

Amendment of section 4.
Amendment of section 4-B.
Amendment of section 4-C.
Amendment of section 5.
Amendment of section 5-B.
Amendment of section 6-A.
Amendment of section 6-B.

Amendment of section 6-C.

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 16 of 2012

THE MADHYA PRADESH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2012

A Bill further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972,

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-third Year of the Republic of
India as follows:—

1. This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha
Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012.

2. In Section 4 of the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for the words
“sixteen thousnad”, the words “twenty five thousand” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 4-B of the principal Act, for the words “four thousand”, the words “ten
thousand” shall be substituted.

33

4. In Section 4-C of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten

thousand” shall be substituted.

5. In Section 5 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred”, the words “one thousand”
shall be substituted.

6. In Section 5-B of the principal Act, after sub-section (2), the following new sub-section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“3) Without prejudice to the provisions of this Act, where a member travels by air
within the State of Madhya Pradesh from one place to another, he shall be entitled
to reimbursement of the air fare of such journey:

Provided that the total number of such journeys under this sub-section shall not be more
than thirty four per year.”.



qeqyeyl TN, e 31 "7 2012 336 (1)

3 _ e H . H . Amendment of
7. In Section 6-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), Section GA.
¢ in the opening paragraph, for the words “seven thousand”, the words “fifteen
thousand” shall be substituted;

(i1) in the first proviso, for the words “three hundred”, the words “five hundred” shall
be substituted.

8. In Section 6-B of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten Amendment of
thousand” shall be substituted. Section 6-B.

9. In Section 6-C of the principal Act, for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten Amendment of
thousand” shall be substituted. Section 6-C.

STATEMENT OF OBIJECTS AND REASONS

Due to inflation in recent years, it has become necessary to enhance the allowances, pension and family pension
given to members and ex-members of the Madhya Pradesh Legislative Assembly. It is also decided that air travel
facility be given within the State to the members to execute his responsibilities. Therefore, suitable amendments
are proposed in the Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7
of 1973).

2. Hence this Bill.

Bhopal : GOPAL BHARGAV
Dated the 29th March 2012. Member-in-charge.

Te=es, TSI qEOr o1 SR AR, HeIuRy g WEwd FEE qguned, e ¥ qfid aur geifia—2012.



