T JIUES www.govtpressmp.nic.in
H off e wlre fan s geFa 2.

WAL TS

SHHE 495 ] AT, TeaR, fodiss 6 fEH=R 2012—STEE 15, WH 1934

faym g afearemE, Tsyey

aire, fedie 6 feamr 2012

. 24864-Ta.9.-faum-2012. —aeayes faum 9w & e dur o guer Tl fFa-64 & Sues & uer
T werew g9 wear fAfy (deiem) fagee, 2012 (FEIE 25 9 2012) W faum @ # feAiw 6 fowwwR, 2012 #
MY FIT 8. SHEERY &t G & o gy fohan <imn 2.

989



990 TegRy e, feriw 6 fogmr 2012

Heayeyr fagae

HHR W T 023

HeAUSYT 910 shedruy fAfer (Eomerd ) fageen, o0eR
weauRyr o shearor fafy sifufram, ke @i ol wyifim we ¥ fadas.
I TR & favged oY o meayey faum-ved g frefafed v # g erfufmfma & —

wfre W e . (2) =9 fufay o dfia T\ geayey 99 weaur iy (Feem) sifufram, 09% ©
T,

() 98 TS A TEF YA i aiie ¥ yg™ B
ST R BT e, 2. HEAYIYT 919 weaTuT fafir arfufrem, 9R¢R (. 3% W 2R%¢3 ) (S TEH TWH UYEN

e tfufem & W @ ffde &) &t g R #, @Wug (3) W, Su-wuE (W) §, W= ('TE
TN BT W TUd'’ & WM W, I g9 TR w09 wenfua few ST,

RT ] T I, 3»W3®ﬁwaﬁmqﬁ,_
(T ) 3Uu (R ) & W W, Fofafaa suamn wenfaa =t smg, stefq :—

“(r) afe frer wderd w T A fe vuToT o e § feret detust T H (araiq
SHalt A feavar @@ ) dra @ feadl @ e §, 9 T T wHe g
TAF BE W W (27l 30 T qur 3¢ fewaw @) 37 sifuErT &l u wad
TH HUA BT 3 welieR U8 e o forg FHeeres g dies o8 | | 3 tfuE
St hHT A9 T99 BN :

T Uk 9% W | freieten o s Y TR U IR Ui 6§ | w8l Er.
() Suemr (3) ¥, yut fomm & T W, wie wenfua fear sy sii sae uvs
FrAfaiEa Ui SISt S, 3o :—

"ot QU S 3T qu SRl T WETE B ATl B WIH % Yd HUSH @l 1 A Afues
TRICTATY & UG T ST I & W, TFefrsrer wht uier Wiaerd sl dedrg
YT & ST e 376 BT W i HICTA™ T EF o G JIa & W
a7 gfaera A, S foR | wfaee @ sifues =t @, siftdifum feram wmom -

9T 3¢ T ¥. o Afaf=d #7 um 32 H—

(T&F) SUUR (2) H,—
(F) wrg (&) 4 v ‘v | TR F WE W Ik UE TR TR wenfig
fehw SITG;
(@ wg (F@) ¥ 7 ‘tF TR T F OWH W, v T8 TR v wenfug
[EQES IR
(N wgE E VR VTE W TR WA W, s R geR w9y enfya feg Si;

(B) S9EW (R) H T YY) TR TR % wH W, v oy geR Ul wenfug
fepu S,



qeqyeel eys, & 6 feamat 2012 990 (1)

I ST HRUT HT FA

neyRyl g9 weam fafy srfufmm, e¢x (3. 38 TH RR¢R) * foparawd § wiaud EEiis sisrsa
YT & R ¥, T HfoamAl B ® wW & e A widva geies ywafaa ¥, S fenger € -

(2) H@ efufem s oa@ R (3) (@) # Yedur’’ @ faemm ufome @ ofieifiee faar situftm,
22%9 (2R¥9 T ¥) H HW R (3) (AN) * IUEY & AR GRIfewm fwrar mn & R fw
U=l &1 SUEY 1 A9 oA .

() @ fufrm ot g R ¥4, afiee o @ aer T € qu fed wmm & Rl @), Al gg e
Al & qd e s e ¥ orawe Al € @ gE @l sifafis wEe s s grh o afg
g ol % qd eife s o 3@ & o v afr § S

(3)  H& Ifufmm a3 A, gE w1 @ ¥ gfg & 9 gt

R. o =@ fadgw ywga €.

froTe | wr=y fag

TG 8 FaRR, 02R. qRETHF T,

“dfgu & TR 0l & ITHN TR R oIgRifea. .

faia Jru=

yeafad fadges & @ue ? wd 3 § ffga yreal % fearaa w faee & aifue & sUeR &1 WA, Hed
FI de@ HH @ feafd § s W A 3 wg W STEdl faiE R S

g fafir fmter & d@ew § I

g fadaes & @ve 3 g T weR & g ffm s Rg sfugEm S s Wl uis wm
YeIrEiSH foRar <1 @R

Fredsrs, TTERIE XU Ao oIE W, WA §R1 SR S RO, e § fEa qun yefia—2012.



T 999 www.govtpressmp.nic.in 9
ot e=A dre foman s 9w .

[

wHIE 501 ] W97, YohaR, faish 7 fo@wmt 2012—3TEH0 16, U 1934

fafy et faurht s faum

g, feTe 7 femwR 2012

. 7539-358-FFRIG-3I(T.).—9Nd & HfGaM & e8¢ 348 o WU (3) & IIIE0 H, HeAYSW 49 Hedol
ffa (denym) faees, 2012 (SR 25 §9 2012) W1 SIS TR TSIUEl  WIHHR € Tdggll Wkl foman
ST E.

HEYRY F TS 6 A T U SARIER,
THAYT e, AR dfea.

1001



1002

[eryey Teras, femie 7 fegmr 2012

Short title and
Commencement,

Amendment of
Section 2.

Amendement of
Section 9.

Amendement of
Section 31.

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 25 or 2012.

THE MADHYA PRADESH SHRAM KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN) VIDHEYAK, 2012.

A Bill further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 .

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-third year of the Republic
of India as follows :(—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2012.

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the official Gazette.

2. In Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 36 of 1983)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in clause (3), in sub-clause (b), for the words “one thousand
and six hundred rupees” , the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 9 of the principal Act,—
(i) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :(—

“(2) If the name of the employee stands on the register of an establishment on thirty
working days in a calendar year (that is January to December), the amount of
contribution payable every six months, (that is on 30th June and on 3lst
December) by every employee shall be ten rupees only and by an employer
for each such employee shall be thirty rupees payable every six months :

Provided that the employer’s contribution payable every six months shall not be less
than one thousand five hundred rupees.”;

(i1) in sub-section (3), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that an incentive amount of five percent shall be given to employer on
advance payment of two or more period of contribution before six months
ending of 15th day of July and 15th day of January to the Board and such
percentage of fine shall be imposed as determined by the State Government,
by notification, which shall not exceed ten percent, on payment after ending
of said six month period.”.

4. In section 31 of the principal Act,—
(i) in sub-Section (1),—

(a) in clause (a), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(¢) in the proviso, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “two thousand
rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.



ey Tevs, feqiw 7 fewwsw 2012 1002 (1)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Certain practical difficulties have been experienced in the implementation of the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan
Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 36 of 1983). In order to obviate these difficultics certain amendments are proposed which are
as under :—

(1) The existing definition of “employee has been revised in Section 2 (3)(b) of the principal Act as
per the provision in Section 2 (3)(iv) of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947) so
that employees would get the benefit of the provision.

2) In Section 9 of the principal Act, rates of contribution have been enhanced, and the employer of
an establishment shall deposit an additional fine amount if he fails to deposit the contribution before
the fixed dates and rebate shall be given if amount deposited before fixed dates.

3) In Section 31 of the principal Act, the amount of fine have been proposed to be enhanced.
2. Hence this Bill.

BHOPAL : JAGANNATH SINGH
DATED the 11" November, 2012. Member-in-Charge.

i, STEhd R0 9 SEE O, HeAysst BN O hid Rne, e 9§ giEd a9 geiia—2012.



